REQUEST FOR LEGISLATIVE ACTION Version 6/10/19
Completed by County Counselor’s Office:
Res/@sdNo.: 20573
Sponsor(s): Charlie Franklin
Date: December 7, 2020
e Action Requested
Xl Resolution
[] Ordinance
Project/Title: Awarding a Twelve Month Term and Supply Contract with One (1) Twelve Month Options to
Extend for the furnishing of Auto/Truck Parks (NON-DEALER) for Various County Departments to Factory
Motor Parks of Kansas City, MO; Metro Ford of Independence, MO and Central Power Systems and Services of
Liberty, Mi der the Terms and Conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 30-20.
BUDGET ,
INFORMATION Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year: N/A
To be completed Amount previously authorized this fiscal year: N/A
By Requesting Total amount authorized after this legislative action: N/A
Department and Amount budgeted for this item * (including transfers): N/A
Finance Source of funding (name of fund) and account code number:
N/A
* If account includes additional funds for other expenses, total budgeted in the account is: §
OTHER FINANCIAL INFORMATION:
[] No budget impact (no fiscal note required)
X Term and Supply Contract (funds approved in the annual budget); estimated value and use of contract:
Department: Estimated Use:
Public Works $75,000
Parks + Rec $18,500
Sheriff’s Department $93,500
Prior Year Budget (if applicable):
Prior Year Actual Amount Spent (if applicable):
*Auto Parts will be split between three (3) Term & Supply Contracts with an estimated usage of $93,500.00
PRIOR Prior ordinances and (date): N/A
LEGISLATION Prior resolutions and (date): 17235 (April 5, 2010), 18814 (April 27, 2015)
CONTACT
INFORMATION | RLA drafted by (name, title, & phone): Keith E. Allen, Senior Buyer, 881-3465
REQUEST Department of Public Works and Parks & Recreation all require a Term and Supply Contract to obtain Non-
SUMMARY Dealer Auto and Truck Parts for vehicle maintenance. The Purchasing Department issued Invitation to Bid No.

30-20 in response to those requirements.

A total of Forty-Three (43) notifications were distributed with three responses received and three evaluated as
follows:




Vendor Neme
L Factory Motor Parts Metro Ford Central Power
Itam Name Kansas City, MO Independence, MO Liberty, MO
[ECM For 2005 Ford Explorer, 4.6 liter engine No Bld $955.83 .5350.00
|Fuel Pressuse Regulator for 2007 Ford Crown Victorls, 4.6 liter engine $846.07 $37.25 $657.52
ark Plug Wire Set for 2003 Chevrolet Pickup, 4.3 liter engine, 2x4 $45.04 $92.60 $77.54
Gas Charged Rear Shocks for 2006 F-550 Ford, 6.0 diase] engine, 4x4 x $55.30 $43.62 $126.89
Water Pump for 2008 Ford Crown Victoria, 4:6 cu, In e $55.39 $73.31
[idler Arm for 2006 Chevrolet Trablazer, 4.2 liter engine, 2x4 $72.04 Na Bid $58.21
[tdler Arm for 2006 chevrolet Pickup, 5. liter engine, 4%4 $52.08 No Bid $59.21
|Master Cylinder for 2006 F-550 Ford, 6,01 Iitar enging, 4x8 with hydro boost brake control 3345.71 $181.90 1 $32000
Spark Plug for 2008 Ford Crown Victoria with police package .79 $3.06 $11.27
Headlight far 2006 Chevrolat Trallblazer, 4,2 liter engine, 2x4 $n.73 No fid $80.00
Light Bulb, Mini 1157 [double pack} $1.17 $2.51 $9.86
Light Bulb, Mini 3157 {double pack) i $31.07 8251 $11.27
Lower Rad(stor Hose for 2008 Ford Crown Yicto ria, 4.8 liter engine $18.22 $52,79 $60.62
Pawer Steering Pump for 2002 Ford Crown Victoris, 4.8 liter engine, 2xd $38.99 $121.51 $84.59
Power Stearing Pump for 2010 Ford Escape, 3.0 liter angine, 2x4 $161.08 Electric Steering $177,65
04 Prassure Swikch for 2007 Chevralet Pickup, 4.21 litar engine, 2x4 $50.21 ! No Bid $70.49
|0 Pressure Switch for 2014 Chevrolet Pickup, 5.3 liter engine, 4x4 $89.93 No Bid $84.59
Spark Plug Wire Set for 2003 Ford Expeition, 4.6 Iiter & Ine, 4x4 $5.72 No Bid $25,37
ln%enllneaeltfarzuuhrd Esméi 3.0liter egme, 24 $36.12 $32.60 $26.05
Misc Catalog Order Item: Discount Offered See Attachiment Cost+20% 25%

Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, the Director of Finance and Purchasing recommends the
split award of a Twelve Month Term and Supply contract with One Twelve Month Option to extend for the
furnishing of Auto/Truck Parts (NON-DEALER) for Various County Departments to Genuine Factory Motor
Parts of Kansas City, Missouri; Metro Ford of Independence, Missouri and Central Power Systems and Services
of Liberty, Missouri under the Terms and Conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 30-20.

This award is made on an “As Needed” basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount.
The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual appropriations.

CLEARANCE
X Tax Clearance Completed (Purchasing & Department)
] Business License Verified (Purchasing & Department) N/A ‘
X Chapter 6 Compliance - Affirmative Action/Prevailing Wage (County Auditor’s Office)
COMPLIANCE
[] MBE Goals
(1 WBE Goals NO GOALS ASSIGNED
[] VBE Goals
ATTACHMENTS | Pertinent pages of Bid Received from Factory Motor Parts, Metro Ford, Central Power Systems & Services,
Recommendation from Public Works, Parks + Rec & Sheriff’s Department, Bid-Abstract, Bid Recap
REVIEW

Depattment Directo, Date:
i : 1330
Finance (Budget Approval); APPROVED {| Date:
/ |

!fappk'cable /) By Mark Lang at 1:55 pm, Nov 18, 2020
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Division Manager: [ Dt??‘ 73
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Fiscal Information (to be verified by Budget Office in Finance Department)

O
O

i 5 B

This expenditure was included in the annual budget.

Funds for this were encumbered from the Fund in

There is a balance otherwise unencumbered to the credit of the appropriation to which the expenditure

is chargeable and there is a cash balance otherwise unencumbered in the treasury to the credit of the fund from which
payment is to be made each sufficient to provide for the obligation herein authorized.

Funds sufficient for this expenditure will be/were appropriated by Ordinance #

Funds sufficient for this appropriation are available from the source indicated below.

Account Number: Account Title: Amount Not to Exceed:

This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of
funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as each using agency places its order.

This legislative action does not impact the County financially and does not require Finance/Budget approval.



Resolution #20573
Backup received 12/7/2020

Office of the JACKSON COUNTY SHERIFF
Sheriff Darryl Forté

TO: Keith Allen, Finance and Purchasing Department
FROM: A/Cpt. J. Payne #23, Support Services Division
DATE: 12-07-2020

SUBJECT: Recommendation for Vendor: Metro Ford of Independence

Sir,
Please consider bid No. 30-20 Auto/Truck Parts Non Dealer be awarded to Metro Ford of
Independence.

It is estimated the Sheriff’s Office could spend approximately $93,000.00 annually with this
vendor.

Thank you for your consideration,

A/WW -

A/Cpt. John Payne

4001 NE Lakewood Court Lee’s Summit, MO 64064  Phone: 816-541-8017 Fax: 816-795-1969



Jackson County
Public Works Department

X N/ * ROAD MAINTENANCE 34900 E. Old US 40 Hwy, P.O. Box 160
:”Ss OUQ} Grain Valley, Missouri 64029 -
- (816) 847-7050 phone
(816) 847-7051 fax

MEMORANDUM

TO: Keith Allen, Finance and Purchasing Department

FROM: Matt Willier, Assistant Road and Bridge Administrator, Public Works Department
DATE: October 10, 2020

SUBJECT:  Recommendation for Vendors: Metro Ford, Factory Motor Parts, and Central
Power Systems & Services

Please consider bid No. 30-20 Auto/Truck Parts Non Dealer be split and awarded to Metro Ford,
Factory Motor Parts, and Central Power Systems & Services.

One single vendor does not accommodate every part needed for County equipment. Also, one
vendor may have a cheaper price than the other for certain parts.

It is estimated that Road & Bridge Public Works could spend approximately $75,000.00 annually
between these 3 vendors.

For the reasons above, it has been requested that bid No. 30-20 Auto/Truck Parts Non Dealer be
split and awarded to Metro Ford, Factory Motor Parts, and Central Power Systems & Services.

Thank you for your consideration,

Thank you,

Matt Willier, Assistant Road & Bridge Administrator



JACKSON COUNTY

Parks + Rec
T &8 22807 Woods Chapel Road Michele Newman, Director
IR Blue Springs, Missouri 64015 (816) 503-4800
Mlad MakeYourDayHere.com Fax: (816) 795-1234
MEMORANDUM

TO:

FROM:

DATE:

SUBJECT:

Keith Allen, Senior Buyer, Purchasing
John Johnson, Superintendent, Park Operations

October 29, 2020
Recommendation for Vendors: Metro Ford and Factory Motor Parts

Please consider Bid No. 30-20 Auto/Truck Parts Non Dealer be split and awarded
to Metro Ford and Factory Motor Parts.

One single vendor does not accommodate every part needed for County
equipment. Also, one vendor may have a cheaper price than the other for certain
parts.

It is estimated that Parks + Rec could spend approximately $18,500 annually
between these two vendors.

Parks + Rec’s projected usage during the next twelve months is $18,500.

003-1614-57310

Metro Ford $12,000
003-1614-57310

Factory Motor Parts $ 6,500

Thank you.
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Description Discount %

“ JANCO WIPER PRODUCTS 70.00%
CENTRIC PARTS 68.00%
CHAMPION SPARK PLUGS 45.00%
ACDELCO LESS PARITY PARTS 44.00%
DENSO PRODUCTS 63.00%
DELPHI 56.00%
SEN SEN 68.00%
DORMAN 55.00%
FEL PRO 60.00%
FEDERAL MOGUL 63.00%
FVP FILTERS 68.00%
GOODYEAR PRODUCTS 58.00%
IDEAL HOSE CLAMPS 70.00%
KYB SHOCKS 66.00%
MOOG 65.00%
MOTORCRAFT LESS PARITY PARTS 33.00%
SPLASH WIPER BLADES 76.00%
STANDARD IGNITION 59.00%
WAGNER LIGHTING 72.00%
WAGNER BRAKE 70.00%
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