REQUEST FOR LEGISLATIVE ACTION EXECUTIVE CERCE

JUL 19 2019

Version 6/10/19

Completed by County Counselor's Office: Restand No.: 20208

Sponsor(s):

Tony Miller & Ronald E. Finley July 29, 2019

Date:

SUBJECT	Action Requested Resolution Ordinance	
	Project/Title: Awarding a Twenty-Four Month Term and Supply Contract with Three Twelve Month C Extend for the furnishing of Heavy Equipment Rental for use by the Public Works Department and Part to The Victor L. Phillips Company of Kansas City, MO, Road Builders Machinery and Supply Co., Inc. Kansas City, KS and Murphy Tractor and Equipment Co., Inc. of Kansas City, MO under the terms an conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 32-19.	rks + Rec
BUDGET		
INFORMATION	Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year:	\$
To be completed	Amount previously authorized this fiscal year:	Ф
By Requesting	Total amount authorized after this legislative action:	•
Department and	Amount budgeted for this item * (including transfers):	\$
Finance	Source of funding (name of fund) and account code number:	\$
	Source of fullding (flame of fund) and account code number:	
	* If account includes additional funds for other expenses, total budgeted in the account is: \$	\$
	OTHER FINANCIAL INFORMATION:	
	OTHER THVANCIAE INTORWATION.	
	☐ No budget impact (no fiscal note required)	
	Term and Supply Contract (funds approved in the annual budget); estimated value and use of contract (funds approved in the annual budget);	
	Department: Estimated Use:	ract:
	7,	
	Parks + Rec \$20,000	
	Prior Year Budget (if applicable):	
	Prior Year Actual Amount Spent (if applicable):	
PRIOR	Prior ordinances and (date):	
LEGISLATION	Prior resolutions and (date):	
CONTACT	Thorresolutions and (date):	
INFORMATION	RLA drafted by (name, title, & phone): Katie Bartle, Senior Buyer, 816-881-3465	
REQUEST		
SUMMARY	The Public Works Department and Parks + Rec require a contract for Heavy Equipment Rental. The F Department issued Invitation to Bid 32-19 in response to this requirement.	Purchasing
	Fourteen metifications were distributed and to	
	Fourteen notifications were distributed, and four responses were received. One response was rejected non-compliant with the bid specifications. Three responses were evaluated, and an Abstract of Bids R attached for reference.	for being eceived is
	The Public Works Department and Parks + Rec recommend a split award to ensure availability of renta equipment during the peak busy season.	al
	Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, the Purchasing Department recommends a sp. for the furnishing of Heavy Equipment Rental for use by the Public Works Department and Parks + Revictor L. Phillips Company of Kansas City, MO, Road Builders Machinery and Supply Co., Inc. of Kansas City, MO under the terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 32-19.	ec to The
CLEARANCE	 ☐ Tax Clearance Completed (Purchasing & Department) ☐ Business License Verified (Purchasing & Department) ☐ Chapter 6 Compliance - Affirmative Action/Prevailing Wage (County Auditor's Office) 	

COM	TIANIOR	[] Impa				
COMP	LIANCE	☐ MBE Goals ☐ WBE Goals ☐ VBE Goals	No Goals Assigned			
ATTA	CHMENTS	Recommendation Memo Recommended for Awar	s from Public Works and Parks, Abs	tract of Bids Received, Pe	ertinent Pages of Bids	
REVIE	EW	Department Director:	100-		Date: 7 18-19	
		Finance (Budget Approv	val)		Date: 7/9/9	
		Division Manager:	Dary 8 met	hod	Date: 7.190	
		County Counselor's Off	icer Buyen Campb)	Date: 7/25/19	
Fiscal	Informatio	on (to be verified by B	sudget Office in Finance Depar	tment)		
	This expenditure was included in the annual budget.					
	Funds for this were encumbered from theFund in					
	There is a balance otherwise unencumbered to the credit of the appropriation to which the expenditure is chargeable and there is a cash balance otherwise unencumbered in the treasury to the credit of the fund from which payment is to be made each sufficient to provide for the obligation herein authorized.					
	Funds suffi	cient for this expenditure	will be/were appropriated by Ordinar	nce #		
	Funds suffi	cient for this appropriation	n are available from the source indica	ited below.		
	Account N	Number:	Account Title:	Amount Not to Exceed	:	
X	This award	is made on a need basis a	nd does not obligate Jackson County	to pay any specific amou	nt. The availability of	

funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as each using agency places its order.

This legislative action does not impact the County financially and does not require Finance/Budget approval.

Tractor Tractor Contract Contract Contract Contractor Contract		ITB: 32-19							
DESCRIPTION UNIT GTY AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT MACHINEY 833.6	ļ	COMMODITY: Heavy Equipment Rental		Murpny Tractor	Rental	Victor L Phillips Co.	Road Builders		
235E 888 888 890 900 890 900 890 900 890 900 890 900 890 900 890 900	2		αту	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT
955 1346 1750 2358 818 818 818 900 8 100 8 4 7 6 750 6 7	1.0	-		1000	1498 19	11	3 COP 1		
235E 818 818 818 819 900. 1000.	2.0	Cat 325D		950 %	1326,00		9206		
375." 331. 18 400." 1000." 1005." 1005." 1006." 1000." 1005." 100." 100." 250." 310. 34 400." 250." 310. 34 400." 250." 712. 72 10.83 400." 120." 100." 100." 100." 120." 100." 100." 100." 120." 100." 100." 100." 170." 265." 724." 100." 100." 170." 265." 724." 100." 100." 170." 265." 724." 100."	3.0			700°	835.60				
900 % 100	4.0			3458	331. 83				
preader Pre	2.0			900	18085 E				
preader 100, % 847, 67 750 250, # 485 4 400 300, # 400 300, # 400 100, # 412, # 412, # 412, # 412, # 412, # 412, # 412, # 412, # 412, # 412, # 412, # 412, # 412, # 412, # 412, # 412,	0.9	H195		z .	NoBid		NoBid		
Preader Pre	7.0	H140	*	100	84769		600°3		
Freader Preader Pre	8.0	Cat 450		350.6	485.04		No Bid	10	
preader preader preder pred	9.0	Cat 430		300°	310.34		7		
Preader pre	10.0	Cat CP-563E		650°	712, 72		550."	*	
preader pre	11.0	Volvo SD115		180	645,18	/U. Bid	550.		
preader pre	12.0	Cat RM-300	VI	SeeBid	NoBid	No Bid	1800		
preader (650°- 724" 600°- 1000°- 1	13.0	Cat 12M		3000	1109.5	MOB.Y	750."		
Preader No Bid No Bid No Bid 1000 "	14.0	Cat 938G		1,050	724. "	809	500;		
HF	15.0	Etnyr Chip Spreader		NoBid	No B10	NoBid	NoBid		
HF	16.0	Case 1455B		70. 1°	-	-	38		
HF	17.0	Craftco 125		Vo Bid		>	NOBid		
See Biod W 900, " 500, " 500, " 500, " 500, " 175, " 304, 58 No Bid 6 50, " No Bid No Bid No Bid	18.0	Cat D-6T		300	·	900."	835,18		
HF HF 1.75 = 304.58 NOBICA (6.50 = Norbid 700 = 100	19.0	Cat D6	(Ā	eeBid	≥	900	545.0		ų ų
HF 175 ° 304.58 NOBICA (650.° Norbid 700.° 100.° Norbid Nobid Nobid	20.0	Cat D5		50 00S	652°E	500.6	475 00		
8 100, 50, 50, 100, 100, 100, 100, 100, 10	21.0	Volvo DD38 HF		75.60	304.58	No Brol	375		
Wobid Nobid 575.	22.0	Volvo L70G)	50.5	NoBid	£100°	425.8		
	23.0	Volvo DD138	\.\.\.\.\.\.\.\.\.\.\.\.\.\.\.\.\.\.\.	200°, w	Nobid	Nobid	575.8		
	ĺ								

ITB: 32-19							
Date: 6/18/2019		Murphy	United	Victor L	Road		
COMMODITY: Heavy Equipment Rental		Tractor	Rental	Phillips Co.	_ ≥		
NO DESCRIPTION	UNIT ATY	QTY AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT
CERTIFICATION OF BID OPENING BIDS WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND RECORDED ON: 9 . re (8 . An (9 . BY Le al. A. A. A. C. A. C. A. C. A. C. A. C. A. A. C. A. A. C. A.							



22807 Woods Chapel Road Blue Springs, Missouri 64015 MakeYourDayHere.com

Michele Newman, Director (816) 503-4800 Fax: (816) 795-1234

MEMORANDUM

TO:

Katie Bartle, Senior Buyer, Purchasing Department

FROM:

John Johnson, Superintendent, Park Operations

DATE:

July 9, 2019

SUBJECT: 32-19 Heavy Equipment Rental

Parks+Rec department recommends the split award to the three bidders, Murphy Tractor & Equipment Company, The Victor L. Phillips Company, and RoadBuilders Machinery and Supply Company, for this contract.

Many of the typical pieces of equipment that Parks will rent are needed for emergency repairs or time sensitive projects. During busy times for the vendor, they may not have the equipment available when needed. Having multiple sources allows the Parks+Rec department to be in the best position to deliver necessary services to county citizens.

1602-56670

\$20,000

Capital projects

\$20,000 (pending annual budget approval)

Please let me know if you have questions or need additional information. Thanks



Jackson County Public Works Department

ROAD MAINTENANCE 34900 E. Old US 40 Hwy, P.O. Box 160 Grain Valley, Missouri 64029 (816) 847-7050 phone (816) 847-7051 fax

MEMORANDUM

TO:

Katie Bartle, Senior Buyer, Finance and Purchasing Department

FROM:

Jim Evans, Road and Bridge Administrator, Public Works Department

DATE:

July 1, 2019

SUBJECT:

Recommendation for Vendors:

Roadbuilders Machinery & Supply Co.

Murphy Tractor

The Victor L Phillips Corp.

Please consider Roadbuilders Machinery & Supply Co., Murphy Tractor, and The Victor L Phillips Corp be awarded term and supply vendors for Bid No 32-19 Heavy Equipment Rental for equipment rental services to County Road and Bridge division.

During road construction season, it is challenging to acquire crucial pieces of heavy equipment needed to build roads especially with the seasonal demands. Consequently, one single vendor does not accommodate every piece of needed equipment. Also, one vendor may have a much cheaper rental rate than the other for the same piece of equipment which will save the county money in monthly rental fees.

It is estimated that the Jackson County Road & Bridge division could spend approximately \$60,000 annually for equipment rental.

For the reasons above, it has been requested that Roadbuilders Machinery & Supply Co., Murphy Tractor, and The Victor L Phillips Corp. be awarded term and supply vendors for Bid No 32-19 Heavy Equipment Rental.

Thank you for your consideration,

Thank you,

Jim Evans

STATEMENT OF CONTRACTOR'S QUALIFICATIONS

(Complete in full, Use attachments if necessary) Name of Bidder: The Victor & Phillips Comp Address with Zip Code: 4100 Gardner Are KC, MC 64120 Federal Tax I.D. Number: 44-0390945 Check One: Corporation Partnership Sole Proprietorship If SOLE PROPRIETORSHIP, state name, address and phone number of owner: If CORPORATION: Date of Incorporation: Name of State(s) in which incorporated: President's Name: Vice-President's Name: Secretary's Name: Treasurer's Name: If PARTNERSHIP: Is the Partnership: General Limited Association (Check one) Date of Organization: Name and addresses of all partners: 1. 2. GENERAL INFORMATION: Percent of work to be done under the proposed contract by your own staff: No. of Permanent Employees: 87 Geographical Limits of Operation: MO, KS, OK No. of years in business: Have you ever done business under a different name: Yes No (Check one) If Yes, give Name and Location: Has contractor ever withdrawn or defaulted on a contractual obligation: Yes No (Check one) If Yes, state where and why:

STATEMENT OF CONTRACTOR'S QUALIFICATIONS - Continued

Has Contractor ever been sued for breach of an	ny contract? Yes No	(Check one)			
If Yes, Explain:					
List Completed Contracts within the Past Three	e Years, Including Amount of	Each:			
n/k					
List of Current Contracts, Including Amount of	f Each:				
· ·	i Each.				
R/A					
Customer Reference (state name, address, and phone number):					
List each subcontractor you plan to use if awarded the contract. If no, so state.					
SUBCONTRACTOR'S NAME & PHONE ITEM OF WORK \$ AMOUNT OF CONTRACT MBE/WBE					
n/A					
State any other relevant information concerning	l g Contractor's history, credenti	lals, responsibility and capabilities (If	none, so state):		
r/A			·		
DBE STATUS Indicate status claimed:					
Minority Owned Business (MBE)	YES NO				
African American Latino	Native American As	an Pacific Islander			
2. Woman Owned Business (WBE)	YESNO				
	YESNO				
For consideration as an MBE, WBE or Small B		mantal antity on Minarity Complian C			
must be attached.	asiness, a copy of any govern.	mental entity of williothly Supplier Co	uncil certification		
Prepared by (print or type): Hank O	h/e/ Title:	Corpora le Rentl	Manager		
Signature:		6-18-19	7		

8.0 QUOTATION

NOTE: Equipment listed below are size requirements. If you are bidding an alternative, please list manufacturer and model number of equipment. Attach additional pages if needed.

All equipment bid must meet or exceed the specified model.

ACK EXCAVATOR aterpillar Model 330D, Operating Weight: 71,460 lbs. Ianufacturer & Model: 632 78300 aterpillar Model 325D, Operating Weight: 60,700 lbs Ianufacturer & Model: 722 7800 Ian	800	7,200	1,500
Aterpillar Model 330D, Operating Weight: 71,460 lbs. Ianufacturer & Model: 4300 Aterpillar Model 325D, Operating Weight: 60,700 lbs Ianufacturer & Model: 420		7,200	1. 500
Annufacturer & Model: (23e) (25c) Annufacturer & Model: (23e) (25c)		7,200	1. 500
Annufacturer & Model: (23e) (25c) Annufacturer & Model: (23e) (25c)		1,000	1 1 5(2)
Janufacturer & Model: Tese Tx 290 olvo ECR 235E	750		173
olvo ECR 235E	750	1	
		6,750	1,500
Ignufacturer & Model:		,	
() ()	750	6,750	1,500
olvo ECR 88		47120	14 300
lanufacturer & Model: Tukewihi TB280FR	400	3,600	
olvo EC250 E	700	3,600	1,000
(anufacturer & Model: / ase / x300	Con		
latitudacturet & Model: 7 4 3 6 7 8 800	800	7,200	1,500
YDRAULIC HAMMER ATTACHMENT			
odel H195, Working Weight: 14,520 lbs			
anufacturer & Model:	n/n		
odel H140, Working Weight: 4840 lbs	10/13	1	-
anufacturer & Model OKHDA TOD 200			
anufacturer & Model ORHDA Top 200	750	6,750.	4000
ACKHOE LOADER			
aterpillar Model 450, Operating Weight: 19,600 lbs			
anufacturer & Model: (14 se 5805)	400	2 1/00	
aterpillar Model 430, Operating Weight: 16,670 lbs	700	3,400	1,000
anufacturer & Model: / cse 58050	1/20	3.	1,000
anutacturer & Moder. / 436 (3050)	400	3,400	1,000
ADDED DRUM AND VIBRATORY SOIL COMPACTOR			
aterpillar Model CP-563E, Operating Weight: 25,700 lbs			
anufacturer & Model	11/A		
NEUMATIC TIRE ASPHALT COMPACTOR	16/14		
olvo SD115, 84 inches			
anufacturer & Model:	u.la		
SPHALT RECLAIMER	IC/H		
aterpillar Model RM-300, Operating Weight: 42,470 lbs			
anufacturer & Model	1 /10		
OTORGRADER	10/14	-	
aterpillar Model 12M			
7	Wh		
at	erpillar Model RM-300, Operating Weight: 42,470 lbs nufacturer & Model DTORGRADER	PHALT RECLAIMER erpillar Model RM-300, Operating Weight: 42,470 lbs nufacturer & Model DTORGRADER erpillar Model 12M	PHALT RECLAIMER erpillar Model RM-300, Operating Weight: 42,470 lbs nufacturer & Model DTORGRADER erpillar Model 12M

NO.	EQUIPMENT	PRICE PER DAY	PRICE PER MONTH	DELIVERY
	WHEEL LOADER	TERDAI	MONTH	CHARGE
14.0	Caterpillar Model 938G with 3 yard bucket			-
	W 0 15 15 15 15 15 15 15 15 15 15 15 15 15			1
	Manufacturer & Model: (ase 621	600	5,400	1.500
15.0			1 7	14350
15.0	Etnyre 12" to 24" spreader width, variable head, 4 wheel drive			
	Manufacturer & Model:	1	1	i
	Manufacturer & Model: n/a TRACK LOADER	1/4		
6.0	Case Model 1455B			
	ji i			
	Manufacturer & Model N/A	nla		
	CRACK SEALER	7-7-		
7.0	Craftco Model 125 Super Shot			
	Manufacturer & Model:	11/0		
8.0	DOZER Caterpillar D-6T	A		
0.0	Caterpinar D-61			
	Manufacturer & Model: 145e 2050 M	222		
9.0	Caterpillar D-6	900	8,100	1,500
	Manufacturer & Model: (ase 2050 M	900	8,100	1,500
	BULLDUZER	700	10,700	1,300
0.0	Caterpillar D5 or John Deere 650J			
	W. C. L. Alleria			
-	Manufacturer & Model: 4se 850	500	4,500	1,000
1.0	ROLLER/COMPACTOR Volve Peed Madd PD 2017			1 //
1.0	Volvo Road Model DD 38 HF			
	Manufacturer & Model:	λ.		
	WHEEL LOADER	1/10		
2.0	Volvo L70G			
	Manufacturer & Model: (1412 721	700	1-200	1 4000
3.0	Volvo DD(38		6,300	1,500
		9		
	Manufacturer & Model:	u/A		

Jackson County Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 32-19 Page 18 of 25

Response time for delivery of equipment:	24	Hours
Response time for maintenance request:	24	Hours

SIGNATURE:	DATE: 6-18-19
NAME (PRINT): Hank Ohler	PHONE: 816-241-9290
TITLE (PRINT): Corporate Rental Manager	CELL: 316-655-8590
COMPANY NAME (PRINT) The Licker L Phillips demp	FAX:
E-MAIL ADDRESS (PRINT) HOLLER & ULPCO, COM	
E-MAIL ADDRESS FOR PO'S (PRINT) Hobble & VLPCO, COM	
URL (PRINT): UCPCO, COM	

EXHIBIT F

BIDDER'S EXCEPTIONS TO SPECIFICATIONS OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 32-19

Respondent's attention is directed to Paragraph 4 of the General Conditions of this Invitation to Bid. READ THIS PARAGRAPH

CAREFULLY.

The following exceptions to the Specifications of Invitation to Bid No. 32-19 are requested by the undersigned Respondent: (Use additional pages as necessary.)

REFERENCE PARA # & PAGE #	EXCEPTION REQUESTED	
, o xitadi	EXCEPTION REQUESTED	

Name of Firm: The Vicke Ly	Phillips	Corpus
Signature of Bidder:		, /

STATEMENT OF CONTRACTOR'S QUALIFICATIONS (Complete in full, Use attachments if necessary)

Name of Bidder: RoadBuilders Machinery And Supply Co., Inc.				
Address with Zip Code: 1001 S 7th Street Trafficway, Kan	sas City KS 66105			
Federal Tax I.D. Number: 48-1006280				
Check One: Corporation Partnership Sole Pro	oprietorship			
If SOLE PROPRIETORSHIP, state name, address and phone nur	mber of owner:			
11 11 11 11 11 11 11 11 11 11 11 11 11				
If CORPORATION:				
Date of Incorporation:	Name of State(s) in which incorporated: KS			
President's Name: Bryan McCoy	Vice-President's Name: Gerry Buser			
Secretary's Name: Nicole Argard	Treasurer's Name: Nicole Argard			
If PARTNERSHIP:				
Is the Partnership: General Limited Association (Check one)				
Date of Organization:				
Name and addresses of all partners:				
1.				
2.				
3.				
GENERAL INFORMATION:				
Percent of work to be done under the proposed contract by your ow				
No. of Permanent Employees: 173	Geographical Limits of Operation:			
No. of years in business: 34				
Have you ever done business under a different name: Yes If Yes, give Name and Location:	No (Check one)			
Has contractor ever withdrawn or defaulted on a contractual obligat	ion: Yes No (Check one)			
ii i co, state where and why:				

STATEMENT OF CONTRACTOR'S QUALIFICATIONS - Continued

Has Contractor ever been sued for breach of an	y contract? Yes (No)	(Check one)		
If Yes, Explain:	2			
List Completed Contracts within the Past Three	e Years, Including Amount of	Each;		
List of Current Contracts, Including Amount of	f Each:			
Customer Reference (state name, address, and J	phone number):	THE RESIDENCE TO THE PROPERTY OF THE PERTY O		
List each subcontractor you plan to use if aware	ded the contract. If no so state			
SUBCONTRACTOR'S NAME & PHONE	ITEM OF WORK	\$ AMOUNT OF CONTRACT	MBE/WBE	
#				
State any other relevant information and arrive				
State any other relevant information concerning	g Contractor's history, credenti	als, responsibility and capabilities (If	none, so state):	
DBE STATUS Indicate status claimed:				
1. Minority Owned Business (MBE)	YES NO X			
African American Latino		an Pagiña Islandon		
		an Facilite (stander		
2. Woman Owned Business (WBE) YESNO_X				
3. Small Business	YES_X NO			
For consideration as an MBE, WBE or Small B must be attached.	usiness, a copy of any governi	mental entity or Minority Supplier Co	uncil certification	
Prepared by (print or type): Gerry/Buser	Title:	Vice-President		
Signature: Luy 2-	Date:	6/18/2019	X-mi	
(

8.0 QUOTATION

NOTE: Equipment listed below are size requirements. If you are bidding an alternative, please list manufacturer and model number of equipment. Attach additional pages if needed.

All equipment bid must meet or exceed the specified model.

NO.	EQUIPMENT	PRICE PER DAY	PRICE PER MONTH	DELIVERY CHARGE
	TRACK EXCAVATOR			
1.0	Caterpillar Model 330D, Operating Weight: 71,460 lbs.			
	Manufacturer & Model: Komma ter, PC 300/9/60	1200	9900	
2.0	Manufacturer & Model: Koma Tsu PC 300/960 Caterpillar Model 325D, Operating Weight: 60,700 lbs	1200	7,00	
	Manufacturer & Model: R8ma+8uPC 270/290	850	7500	
3.0	Volvo ECR 235E			
	Manufacturer & Model: Komptsy Pc 228/238 Volvo ECR 88	635	5600	
4.0			000	
	Manufacturer & Model: Komp tsy PC PC88	325	2925	
5.0	VOIVO EC250 E			
	Manufacturer & Model: Komp Isu PC 270/290	850	7500	_
	HYDRAULIC HAMMER ATTACHMENT			
6.0	Model H195, Working Weight: 14,520 lbs			
	Manufacturer & Model: Not AUAS Whole			
7.0	Model H140, Working Weight: 4840 lbs	4		
	Manufacturer & Model NPK GH 10	600	5400	
	BACKHOE LOADER			
8.0	Caterpillar Model 450, Operating Weight: 19,600 lbs			
	Manufacturer & Model: Not AUAI Able	ië.		
9.0	Caterpillar Model 430, Operating Weight: 16,670 lbs			
	Manufacturer & Model: Not AUAIJAble.			
	PADDED DRUM AND VIBRATORY SOIL COMPACTOR			
10.0	Caterpillar Model CP-563E, Operating Weight: 25,700 lbs			
	Manufacturer & Model: Bompa 213	550	1800	
	PNEUMATIC TIRE ASPHALT COMPACTOR	500	1000	
11.0	Volvo SD115, 84 inches			
	Manufacturer & Model: BOMA9 BW 211-213	550	4.800	
12.0	ASPHALT RECLAIMER			
12.0	Caterpillar Model RM-300, Operating Weight: 42,470 lbs	1000	1 2 0 2 2	
	Manufacturer & Model DOMAG 364 K. MOTORGRADER	1800	14800	
13.0	Caterpillar Model 12M		10-	
	Manufacturer & Model: CAT 120 H	750	6200	

NO.	EQUIPMENT	PRICE PER DAY	PRICE PER MONTH	DELIVERY CHARGE
<u> </u>	WHEEL LOADER	1.01.01.01	MONTH	CHARGE
14.0	Caterpillar Model 938G with 3 yard bucket			
	Manufacturer & Model: Komma + Sci WA 270 CHIP SPREADER	500	4200	
15.0	Etnyre 12" to 24" spreader width, variable head, 4 wheel drive			
15.0	Entyre 12 to 24 spreader width, variable head, 4 wheel drive			
	Manufacturer & Model: Not AUAILASIO			
160	TRACK LOADER			
16.0	Case Model 1455B			
	Manufacturer & Model OA terpillar 9531	700	6200	
	CRACK SEALER			
17.0	Craftco Model 125 Super Shot			
	Manufacturer & Model: Not A Upilable.			
	DOZER			
18.0	Caterpillar D-6T			77
	Manufacturer & Model: Komptsu 65 EX	835	7700	
19.0	Caterpillar D-6			
	Manufacturer & Model: Kom A +54 D5/1EX	575	5/00	
	BULLDOZER			
20.0	Caterpillar D5 or John Deere 650J			
	Manufacturer & Model: KomAtsu D39EX	475	4100	
21.0	ROLLER/COMPACTOR			
21.0	Volvo Road Model DD 38 HF			
	Manufacturer & Model: Bompg 138 Ad	275	2300	
	WHEEL LOADER			
22.0	Volvo L70G			
	Manufacturer & Model: Komp + Su WH 200	425	3600	
23.0	Volvo DD138			
	Manufacturer & Model: Bomag 19/AD	575	4950	

Response time for delivery of equipment:	24	Hours	
Response time for maintenance request:	24	Hours	

$ \frac{1}{2}$ $\frac{1}{2}$	
SIGNATURE: / Slease (182)	DATE: 6/18/19
NAME (PRINT): GERALD A. BUSER	PHONE: 913-371-3822
TITLE (PRINT): SR. VILE PAES/600	CELL:
COMPANY NAME (PRINT) ROAD Bulders MACH & Supply	FAX: 913-371 - 38 TO
E-MAIL ADDRESS (PRINT) skorned ye roal builders machi	AETU I COM
E-MAIL ADDRESS FOR PO'S (PRINT) 5 Kennedye roadbuilde	rs Machinery, con
URL (PRINT):	

Signature of Bidder:

EXHIBIT F

BIDDER'S EXCEPTIONS TO SPECIFICATIONS OF

JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 32-19

Respondent's attention is directed to Paragraph 4 of the General Conditions of this Invitation to Bid. READ THIS PARAGRAPH

The following exceptions to the Specifications of Invitation to Bid No. 32-19 are requested by the undersigned Respondent: (Use additional pages as necessary.)

EFERENCE ARA#& PAGE#	EXCEPTION REQUESTED
8.0 PA9	98 16 44 17
	We do Not offer Transportat
7 7	MACH. & Supply Co, Ive

STATEMENT OF CONTRACTOR'S QUALIFICATIONS

(Complete in full, Use attachments if necessary) Name of Bidder: Address with Zip Code: Federal Tax I.D. Number: Check One: Corporation Partnership Sole Proprietorship If SOLE PROPRIETORSHIP, state name, address and phone number of owner: If CORPORATION: Date of Incorporation: Name of State(s) in which incorporated: President's Name: Vice-President's Name: Secretary's Name: Treasurer's Name: If PARTNERSHIP: Is the Partnership: General Limited Association (Check one) Date of Organization: Name and addresses of all partners: 1. 2. 3. GENERAL INFORMATION: No. of Permanent Employees: Geographical Limits of Operation: No. of years in business: Have you ever done business under a different name: Yes No (Check one) If Yes, give Name and Location: Has contractor ever withdrawn or defaulted on a contractual obligation: Yes (Check one) No > If Yes, state where and why:

STATEMENT OF CONTRACTOR'S QUALIFICATIONS - Continued

Has Contractor ever been sued for breach of an	y contract? Yes No	(Check one)	
If Yes, Explain:			
List Completed Contracts within the Past Thre	e Years, Including Amount of I	Each:	
NIA			
List of Current Contracts, Including Amount o	f Each:		
,			
NA			
Customer Reference (state name, address, and	phone number):		
MODOT Sody Sordan	1,000C -	Tammy Michel	
Lees Summed mo	273-12	1-3114	
List each subcontractor you plan to use if awar	ded the contract. If no so state		
SUBCONTRACTOR'S NAME & PHONE	ITEM OF WORK	\$ AMOUNT OF CONTRACT	MBE/WBE
#			
MIA			
State any other relevant information concerning	g Contractor's history, credentia	als, responsibility and capabilities (If	none, so state):
DBE STATUS Indicate status claimed:			
Minority Owned Business (MBE)	YESNO_X		
African American Latino	Native American Asi	an Pacific Islander	
2. Woman Owned Business (WBE)	YES NO <u></u>		
3. Small Business	YESNO_		
For consideration as an MBE, WBE or Small B must be attached.	usiness, a copy of any governr	nental entity or Minority Supplier Co	uncil certification
1/ 1			
Prepared by (print or type):	Officer Till	Pert 1 Marcas	
Prepared by (print or type): Kellie	Nason Title:	Rental Manager	
Prepared by (print or type): Kellie II Signature: Kellie III	Nasan Title:	Rental Manager 5123/19	

8.0 QUOTATION

NOTE: Equipment listed below are size requirements. If you are bidding an alternative, please list manufacturer and model number of equipment. Attach additional pages if needed.

All equipment bid must meet or exceed the specified model.

NO.	EQUIPMENT	PRICE PER DAY	PRICE PER MONTH	DELIVERY CHARGE
11	TRACK EXCAVATOR			
1.0	Caterpillar Model 330D, Operating Weight: 71,460 lbs.			
	Manufacture 8 M 11 7 36 6 C			
2.0	Manufacturer & Model: Decre 3506 Caterpillar Model 325D, Operating Weight: 60,700 lbs	\$1000	25000	
3.0	Manufacturer & Model: Deece 3006	\$950	\$8500	
3.0	Volvo ECR 235E			
	Manufacturer & Model: Deere 2456	\$760	\$ 6300	
4.0	Volvo ECR 88	3 100	3 6300	
	Manufacturer & Model: Derce 856	6000	500	
5.0	Manufacturer & Model: Decrc & SG Volvo EC250 E	\$375	\$3200	
			_	,
	Manufacturer & Model: Deerc 2506	\$ 900	\$ 8000	
	HYDRAULIC HAMMER ATTACHMENT			
6.0	Model H195, Working Weight: 14,520 lbs			
	Manufacture & M. I.I. Van I EVII76		000	
7.0	Manufacturer & Model: Kent FX 475 Model H140, Working Weight: 4840 lbs	91000	\$9000	
	Manufacturer & Model Kent Fx275	\$700	\$ 6000	
	BACKHOE LOADER			
8.0	Caterpillar Model 450, Operating Weight: 19,600 lbs			
			_	
9.0	Manufacturer & Model: Deere 410L	6350	\$3000	
7.0	Caterpillar Model 430, Operating Weight: 16,670 lbs			
	Manufacturer & Model: Decre 310L	\$300	52700	
		300	3.0, 100	
10.0	PADDED DRUM AND VIBRATORY SOIL COMPACTOR Caterpillar Model CP-563E, Operating Weight: 25,700 lbs			
10.0	·			
	Manufacturer & Model: Hamm HIIP	\$650	\$5900	
11.0	PNEUMATIC TIRE ASPHALT COMPACTOR Volvo SD115, 84 inches		100	
11.0				
	Manufacturer & Model: Hamm GRVW180	\$700	\$6000	
12.0	ASPHALT RECLAIMER		-	
12.0	Caterpillar Model RM-300, Operating Weight: 42,470 lbs			
	Manufacturer & Model Wirtgen WR200		5 22,000	
	MOTORGRADER			
3.0	Caterpillar Model 12M			
	Manufacturer & Model: Deerc 6726	51700	S100 500	
	TELL OLDO	-11000	\$10,000	

NO.		PRICE PER DAY	PRICE PER MONTH	DELIVERY CHARGE
110	WHEEL LOADER			CHARGE
14.0	Caterpillar Model 938G with 3 yard bucket			
	Manufacturer & Model: Decre 544L CHIP SPREADER	\$650	\$5800	
15.0				
15.0	Etnyre 12" to 24" spreader width, variable head, 4 wheel drive			
1	Manufacturer & Model:	_	1	
	TRACK LOADER			
16.0	Case Model 1455B			
	~			
	Manufacturer & Model Decre 655%	\$700	\$ 6000	
	CRACK SEALER	4 100	+ acc	
17.0	Craftco Model 125 Super Shot	***		
	TX 810 . 98 8 V 81 0 V X			Ē
-	Manufacturer & Model:	-	-	0
18.0	DOZER			
10.0	Caterpillar D-6T			
į.	Manufacturer & Model: Necco & SGK		EC.	
19.0	Manufacturer & Model: Deere 850K Caterpillar D-6	\$1000	\$9000	
	- was place of			
	Manufacturer & Model: Decre 950K	NIA	\$15,500	
	BULLDOZER	- NIN	412,20	
20.0	Caterpillar D5 or John Deere 650J			
	Manufacturer & Model: Decre 650K	\$500	\$4500	
21.0	ROLLER/COMPACTOR		7 7000	
21.0	Volvo Road Model DD 38 HF		C.24====	
	Manufacturer & Model: Hamm HDIOVY	0,00	0100	
	WHEEL LOADER	\$175	\$1500	
22.0	Volvo L70G			
1				
	Manufacturer & Model: Deere 5441	\$650	\$5800	
23.0	Volvo DD138	DC04	47800	
	11	-		
	Manufacturer & Model: Hamm HDI YOV	\$700	\$ 6000	

CONTINUED

Jackson County Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 32-19 Page 18 of 25

Response time for delivery of equipment:		Hours
Response time for maintenance request:	12	Hours

SIGNATURE: Kelli Mason	DATE: 5-23-19
NAME (PRINT): Kellie Mason	PHONE: 816-483-5090
TITLE (PRINT): Gental Manager	CELL: 816-5204747
COMPANY NAME (PRINT) Murphy Tractor & Equipment	FAX: 816-455-0597
E-MAIL ADDRESS (PRINT) Knasone murphywactor. com	
E-MAIL ADDRESS FOR PO'S (PRINT) Same	
URL (PRINT):	

EXHIBIT F

BIDDER'S EXCEPTIONS TO SPECIFICATIONS OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 32-19

Respondent's attention is directed to Paragraph 4 of the General Conditions of this Invitation to Bid. READ THIS PARAGRAPH CAREFULLY.

The following exceptions to the Specifications of Invitation to Bid No. 32-19 are requested by the undersigned Respondent: (Use additional pages as necessary.)

REFERENCE	
PARA # & PAGE #	EXCEPTION REQUESTED
ΛΛ	

Name of Firm: Murphy bractor + Equipment	2
Signature of Bidder:	