REQUEST FOR LEGISLATIVE ACTION

Completed by County Counselor’s Office:

Res/@¥XNo.: 19437
Sponsor(s): Greg Grounds
Date: March 27, 2017
es
SUBIECT Action Requested
X Resolution
[ Ordinance
Project/Title: Awarding a Twenty-Four Month Term and Supply Contract, with Three Twelve Month Options to
Extend, for the furnishing of Heavy Construction Equipment: Parts, Maintenance and Repair Services for the
Road and Bridge Division of the Public Works Department to the following companies: Berry Companies dba:
KC Bobcat of Blue Springs, Missouri; Murphy Tractor of Kansas City, Missouri ; Viking Cives Midwest of Oak
Grove, Missouri and Crafco/Paving Maintenance Supply of Chandler, Arizona under the terms and conditions of
Invitation to Bid No. 88-16.
BUDGET
INFORMATION Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year: $
To be completed Amount previously authorized this fiscal year: $
By Requesting Total amount authorized after this legislative action: $
Department and Amount budgeted for this item * (including transfers): $
Finance Source of funding (name of fund) and account code number:
* If account includes additional funds for other expenses, total budgeted in the account is: $
OTHER FINANCIAL INFORMATION:
[] No budget impact (no fiscal note required)
X Term and Supply Contract (funds approved in the annual budget); estimated value and use of contract:
Department: Public Works Department Estimated Use: $200,000.00
This RLA only approves the Term and Supply Contract; the funds were already appropriated through the annual
budget adoption. Figures included in the background section are for informational purposes to provide an
estimate of the contract value.
Prior Year Budget (if applicable):
Prior Year Actual Amount Spent (if applicable):
PRIOR Prior ordinances and (date):
LEGISLATION Prior resolutions and (date): 17864, March 19, 2012
CONTACT
INFORMATION | RLA drafted by (name, title, & phone): Barbara Casamento, Purchasing Supervisor, 881-3253
REQUEST
SUMMARY The Road and Bridge Division of the Public Works Department requires a Term and Supply Contract for Parts,

Maintenance and Repair Services for their fleet of Heavy Construction Equipment. The Purchasing Department
issued Invitation to Bid No. 88-16 to meet those requirements.

A total of 27 notifications were distributed and five responses were received, 1 was determined to be non-
response and four were evaluated as follows:

Shop Labor County Location Labor
Crafco, Chandler, Arizona $ 95.00/Hour $ 95.00/Hour
Murphy Tractor, Kansas City, Missouri $110.00/Hour $120.00/Hour
Viking-Cives Midwest, Oak Grove, Missouri $ 90.00/Hour $ 90.00/Hour
KC Bobcat, Blue Springs, Missouri $105.00/Hour $125.00/Hour

Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, the Director of Finance and Purchasing recommends a
Split Award of Heavy Equipment: Parts, Maintenance and Repair Services to the following companies:
Crafco of Chandler Arizona, Murphy Tractor of Kansas City, Missouri, Viking-Cives Midwest of Oak Grove,




Missouri and KC Bobcat of Blue Springs, Missouri. The Split Award will assure that the Public Works
Department fleet of Heavy Equipment will be maintained and repaired as needed.

This award is made on an “as needed” basis and does not obligate Jackson County, Missouri to pay any specific
amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual appropriations/

CLEARANCE
X] Tax Clearance Completed (Purchasing & Department)
Business License Verified (Purchasing & Department)
DX Chapter 6 Compliance - Affirmative Action/Prevailing Wage (County Auditor’s Office)
ATTACHMENTS | The Abstract of Bids Received, a Recommendation Memorandum from the Public Works Department and the
pertinent pages of each recommended vendor’s bid documents.
REVIEW

Department Director: . Date:
i 2D G

Finance (Budget Approval): Date: .—,
If applicable Y7 2 ’%%7

Division Manager: /e Date:
afax/

,3‘61- 4,3 ? ,.?'

County Counselor’s Office Date:




Fiscal Information (to be verified by Budget Office in Finance Department)

] This expenditure was included in the annual budget.
] Funds for this were encumbered from the Fundin
] There is a balance otherwise unencumbered to the credit of the appropriation to which the expenditure

is chargeable and there is a cash balance otherwise unencumbered in the treasury to the credit of the fund from which
payment is to be made each sufficient to provide for the obligation herein authorized.

1 Funds sufficient for this expenditure will be/were appropriated by Ordinance #

] Funds sufficient for this appropriation are available from the source indicated below.
Account Number: Account Title: Amount Not to Exceed:
] This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of

funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as each using agency places its order.

] This legislative action does not impact the County financially and does not require Finance/Budget approval.
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Res. 19437

Jackson County
Public Works Department

¥ \d;,QmQ\ / + ROAD MAINTENANCE 34900 E. Old US 40 Hwy, P.O. Box 160
S$O Grain Valley, Missouri 64029
* (816) 847-7050 phone
(816) 847-7051 fax

MEMORANDUM

TO: Barbara Casamento, Purchasing Supervisor
FROM: Caroline Deihl, Public Works — Road Maintenance
DATE: March 14, 2017

SUBJECT: Bid 88-16, Heavy Equipment, Parts & Maintenance
Barbara, we have evaluated the above referenced bid and the recommendations and
reasons are listed below.

e Murphy — parts for John Deere Equipment, Cat, Case, Volvo. No one else offers
these parts.

* Viking-Cives - repair services for snow plows, snow plows and swivel cylinders
for our snow plows. No one else offers these parts or service.

» KC Bobcat — repair services and parts for bobcat machines. No one else offers
these parts or service.

» Crafco - we have Crafco equipment and they perform winter maintenance
annually on our equipment. No one else offers this service.
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Jackson County Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 88-16
Page 20 of 30

ATTACHMENT 1
BIDDER'S QUOTATION
For
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 88-16

Jackson County, Missouri would like to have quotes and information the following Maintenance & Repair Service Labor {
Rates, Maintenance & Repair Services Offered, New Parts, Remanufactured, Rebuilt or After Market Parts and Pick-Up )
Service. If you provide additional services not listed below, please submit on your company’s letterhead and indicate the

additional services you have available and pricing for the additional services.

Section 1 - MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICE
Quote pricing on hourly rate for labor during regular work hours and overtime work hours. Include days of operation and travel time,
if applicable. Quote pricing for work to be completed in the Successful Contractor’s Shop and/or at Jackson County Locations for
those times when heavy construction equipment requires field service.

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT COSTS

Labor rate (shop), Regular work hours

Shop Days of Operation, regular work hours: Monday-Friday Hourly $95.00/Hr.*
1 Hour. Minimum

1 Shop Hours of Operation, regular work hours: SZOOAM"‘:OOPM_

Labor rate (shop), Overtime work hours

Shop Days of Operation, overtime work hours: N/A Hourly b f

2 Shop Hours of Operation, overtime work hours:

Labor rate (County Location), Regular work hours

Shop Days of Operation, regular work hours: Monday-Friday

Hourly $ 95.00/Hou_r._*
Shop Hours of Operation, regular work howrs: 9:00AM-3:00PM 1 Hour. Minimum

3 Response time to County’s request for service at a County Location: 24 hrs

Labor rate (County Location}), Overtime work hours

Shop Days of Operation, overtime work hours: N/A

Hourly $ |
Shop Hours of Operation, overtime work hours:
4 Response time to County’s request for service at a County Location: hrs
’S[;';t/\'icc:LCl}{\:;%Ta(rlf\‘:ngllﬁgg:z) for service call to a County Location for field 1 mile $0.70/mile
5 ’ Each Way
Travel Charge (if applicable) for service call to a County Location for field .
service, Overtime work hours P mile $
6 e ! N/A
7 Estimate Fee for Repair (if applicable) N/A n/a $

A.) Listail Shop locations including Point of Contact, complete address, phone number, and cell phone number (if applicable)
for each location (add additional sheets on your company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete):

1808 SW Market St. Lee's Summit, MO 64082

_ Gary Zimmerman- 816-525-8755

* Plus $17.50 Environmental Fee




Jackson County Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 88-16
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Section 2 - EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER'S & MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICE OFFERED

A.) List All equipment manufacturers you offer parts, maintenance, and repair services on (add additional sheets on your
company's letterhead if necessary to make bid complete): :

Crafco, Inc. - S

Graco, Inc. o - —
Billy Goat Industries - - -

MultiQuip . N o

B.) List additional services and/or items (menu of additional services and/or items) and pricing for any additional services and/or
itemns you offer the County (add additional sheets on your company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete):

Winter maintenance program for Crafco Equipment November 1-April 30 annually.

2

C.) List number of qualified technicians available for work to be performed in the Successful Contractor’s Shop: &~

D.) List number of qualified technicians available for work to be performed at a Jackson County Location:
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Section 3 — PARTS, NEW

List manufacturer and percentage discount off manufacturers suggested list price you offer the County. If you need additional space,
on your company’s letterhead submit any additional manufacturers and discounts you are offering the County for New parts. NOTE:
If offering no discount, enter a zero or N/A. Leaving a blank indicates a “no bid”.

Parts orders must include freight/shipping on estimate and invoice as separate line item, if any, and may be grouped into one fee for
entire order.

NO MANUFACTURER DISCOUNT OFFERED |
8 | Crafco, Inc. 5 %
9 | Graco, Inc. 5 %
10 %
1 %
12 %
13 %
14 "
15 @
6 *
17 &
18 _ %
19 %
20 %
DESCRIPTION \QUOTE |
21 Delivery of Parts Available (circle one) (YEé or NO
29 | Delivery charge, it applicable ¥ $95:-&)/Hour 1 Hr. Min.
23 | Minimum Order for delivery of parts, if applicable ¥ 1,000.00
24 | Delivery time after receipt of request from the County for parts delivery B 24 hours

Scction 4 —- PARTS, REMANUFACTURED, REBUILT, OR AFTER-MARKET

List manufacturer and percentage discount off manufacturer’s suggested list price you offer the County for remanufactured, rebuilt or
after-market parts. Prior approval by the County is REQURED for the use of Remanufactured, Rebuilt or After-Market Parts. If you
need additional space, on your company’s letterhead submit any additional manufacturers and discounts you are offering the County
for remanufactured, rebuilt or after-market parts, NOTE: If offering no discount, enter a zero or N/A. Leaving a blank indicates a
“no bid”.

NO MANUFACTURER DISCOUNT OFFERED
8 N/A %
9 %
10 %
1 %
12 %
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13 o | i‘
14 3 %
E %
16 _ %%
17 i
18 ]
19 Yo
20 %

Section S — PICK UP SERVICE

The Successful Contractor may be required to pick up different styles and types of equipment for repair. Indicate what type of Pick
Up Services you can offer the County and include pricing for thosc pick up services (If you need additional space. on your company’s
letterhead submit with your bid response any additional information to make your bid complete):

1) Crafco Melter (Unit with Autoloader may require hitch change-out by County for transport
$95.00/Hour 1 Hour minimum for all travel time plus mileage at $0.70/mile each way

2) Graco Line Driver or Striper
3) Billy Goat Blowers and Grazors
4) MultiQuip Packers/Stompers
5) MK Diamond Saws

CERTIFICATION: Si@ra shall be that of the person authorized to represent and bind Bidder’s company.

~
SIGNATURLE: A?/_‘%)t—\_/ DATE: {1/ W /_7_

navi; N. Thomas Kelly { o  bantor typey | pone.002-276-0406

me Vice President NeLtionaI Sales Manager o iy | mosie. 002-363-7698
Paving Maintenance Supply,

company Nami- A Division of Crafco, Inc. prancortyper | rax: 480-961-0513

company aporess: 6165 W. Detroit St. Chandler, AZ 85226 (princuc 1ype) | web aas¥WW.Shoppmsi.com

ani anoress: tom.kelly@crafco.com

(P’rint or 'ype)
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ATTACHMENT 1
BIDDER’S QUOTATION
For
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 88-16

Jackson County, Missouri would like to have quotes and information the following Maintenance & Repair Service Labor
Rates, Maintenance & Repair Services Offered, New Parts, Remanufactured, Rebuilt or After Market Parts and Pick-Up
Service. If you provide additional services not listed below, please submit on your company’s letterhead and indicate the
additional services you have available and pricing for the additional services.

Section 1 - MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICE
Quote pricing on hourly rate for labor during regular work hours and overtime work hours. Include days of operation and travel time,
if applicable. Quote pricing for work to be completed in the Successful Contractor’s Shop and/or at Jackson County Locations for
those times when heavy construction equipment requires field service.

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT COSTS

Labor rate (shop), Regular work hours

Shop Days of Operation, regular work hours: N\a\/\ - F(‘ A ’] 00 %30 Hourly $ \ l O

1 Shop Hours of Operation, regular work hours: WM - €¢v 700 - 3.30

Labor rate (shop), Overtime work hours

28~
Shop Days of Operation, overtime work hours: _Soa - S\M& Hourly $ \

2 Shop Hours of Operation, overtime work hours: O\A‘Szae \\W‘Mu\ \I\A\LG

Labor rate (County Location), Regular work hours

. =
Shop Days of Operation, regular work hours: 1 001 © ?) 4%0 ;Low
. Hourly $ \
Shop Hours of Operation, regular work hours: ‘\V\Q\A, - ‘FC‘
3 Response time to County’s request for service at a County Location: 9\“‘ hrs
Labor rate (County Location), Overtime work hours
Shop Days of Operation, overtime work hours: _So\,-\' - S WA Hourl ; \6800
ourly
Shop Hours of Operation, overtime work hours: Q \)&S\d{_\Ap( W\ \IW\LG
4 Response time to County’s request for service at a County Location: . hrs
Travel Charge (if applicable) for service call to a County Location for field .
5 service, Regular work hours I mile $ 3 ¢ O g
Tra\{el Charge‘ (if applicable) for service call to a County Location for field 1 mile $ % . OS
6 service, Overtime work hours
n/a $

7 Estimate Fee for Repair (if applicable)

A.) List all Shop locations including Point of Contact, complete address, phone number, and cell phone number (if applicable)
for each location (add additional sheets on your company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete):

MYTEC - Yauusss C\M\ Phane - Blle-Ug3-5000

2600 Ne Pacwin €4 fay @ Blle- Y83- 572\

Yomases c\xv\ MO [\l Cell © Rla- uSle- (&f
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Section 2 —~ EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER'’S & MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICE OFFERED

A.) List All equipment manufacturers you offer parts, maintenance, and repair services on (add additional sheets on your
company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete): :

) Ve, A : Croea e
Feling Feailecs, Eo\ae,( BaveC +anilecs, Thlladua  AHacloneAfs,
A c\mc\ \Dr%kmff% Swpccw( Swtwm, G(/VL&S&S. s atassud f“'law"«@

Also  cam  geb ollecwackel  paels 4‘“ Sowce  CAT, Case,

M_QML&_QA

B.) List additional services and/or items (menu of additional services and/or items) and pricing for any additional services and/or
items you offer the County (add additional sheets on your company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete):

C.) List number of qualified technicians available for work to be performed in the Successful Contractor’s Shop: E \ 3

D.) List number of qualified technicians available for work to be performed at a Jackson County Location: \ O
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Section 3 — PARTS, NEW

List manufacturer and percentage discount off manufacturers suggested list price you offer the County. If you need additional space,
on your company’s letterhead submit any additional manufacturers and discounts you are offering the County for New parts. NOTE:
If offering no discount, enter a zero or N/A. Leaving a blank indicates a “no bid”.

Parts orders must include freight/shipping on estimate and invoice as separate line item, if any, and may be grouped into one fee for
entire order.

NO MANUFACTURER DISCOUNT OFFERED
- < 0,
s | Ny packs  discouns  aver\alole G %
9 ) %
10 i
11 Y
12 %
13 %
14 %
15 %
16 %
17 %
18 %
19 %
20 %
DESCRIPTION QUOTE
21 | Delivery of Parts Available (circle one) @ or NO
29 | Delivery charge, if applicable $ 5’0®
23 | Minimum Order for delivery of parts, if applicable $ QSO"O
24 | Delivery time after receipt of request from the County for parts delivery Bhww -2 OWA hours
1

Section 4 — PARTS, REMANUFACTURED, REBUILT, OR AFTER-MARKET

List manufacturer and percentage discount off manufacturer’s suggested list price you offer the County for remanufactured, rebuilt or
after-market parts. Prior approval by the County is REQURED for the use of Remanufactured, Rebuilt or After-Market Parts. If you
need additional space, on your company’s letterhead submit any additional manufacturers and discounts you are offering the County
for remanufactured, rebuilt or after-market parts. NOTE: If offering no discount, enter a zero or N/A. Leaving a blank indicates a
“no bid”.

NO MANUFACTURER DISCOUNT OFFERED
8 e P&d% diccounk  avaald ¢ O %
9 %
10 %
11 %
12 %
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13

%

14

%

15

%

16

%

17

%

18

%

19

%

20

%

Section 5 — PICK UP SERVICE

The Successful Contractor may be required to pick up different styles and types of equipment for repair. Indicate what type of Pick
Up Services you can offer the County and include pricing for those pick up services (If you need additional space, on your company’s

letterhead submit with your bid response any additional information to make your bid complete):

_Bmg;mﬂﬁ‘)\q_ \md\‘vuz} dotks & Loadmﬁ 2onts

SIGNATURE:

CERTIFICATION; Signature shall be that of the person authorized to represent and bind Bidder’s company.

e ) [30/20 17

U
7.7 1

pHONE: & uk-'"% -SN0

NAME: :SP‘CC C} ﬁ“'\/\ i (Print or Type)

-

TITLE: CSS (Print or Type)

womz. Blle -Yslo- b}

rax: Bllo - YB3 - S7)

COMPANY NAME: MV\X\D\AD. ’\’deu( X Eou}ﬂmﬁj (Print or Type)
v o LeY16]

compANY ADDREsS: €40 NE E;_g;[], A Ecll tg“&gs (v MO (printor Type)
Bl

Web Address: t“\%{?‘:}kﬁt‘ﬁ C(c

EMAIL ADDRESS: ﬂ;\o“w E\“ u,q{)\mj'mc}@(; COW\‘ (Print or Type)
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Jackson County Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 88-16
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ATTACHMENT 1
BIDDER'’S QUOTATION
For
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 88-16

Jackson County, Missouri would like to have quotes and information the following Maintenance & Repair Service Labor
Rates, Maintenance & Repair Services Offered, New Parts, Remanufactured, Rebuilt or After Market Parts and Pick-Up

Service. If you provide additional services not listed below, please submit on your company's letterhead and indicate the
additional services you have available and pricing for the additional services.

Section 1 — MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICE
Quote pricing on hourly rate for labor during regular work hours and overtime work hours. Include days of operation and travel time,
if applicable. Quote pricing for work to be completed in the Successfil Contractor’s Shop and/or at Jackson County Locations for
those times when heavy construction equipment requires field service.

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT COSTS

Labor rate (shop), Regular work hours

TOL
Shop Days of Operation, regular work hours: 27 0t~ ~ A< IdAY Hourly $ iy

1 Shop Hours of Operation, regular work hours: 780 # - 3236 241

Labor rate (shop), Overtime work hours

(0.@)
Shop Days of Operation, overtime work hours: _#s weegs O Hourly $ / A I P

2 Shop Hours of Operation, overtime work hours: _#JS Wesgsd

Labor rate (County Location), Regular work hours

Shop Days of Operation, regular work hours:  /ZOAOA Y~ FLIOAY oo
Hourly $ 7

Shop Hours of Operation, regular work hours: <7'¢ 0%~ 3: 3 0 41 é/

2l Response time to County’s request for service at a County Location: hrs

Labor rate (County Location), Overtime work hours

Shop Days of Operation, overtime work hours: /A 8 4A 7 -FA1dAY

oo
Hourl $
S NESIEY) . /O? 0/

4 Response time to County’s request for service at a County Location: hrs

Shop Hours of Operation, overtime work hours:

Travel Charge (if applicable) for service call to a County Location for field

service, Regular work hours 1imile 3 ﬂ// é

5

Travel Charge (if applicable) for service call to a County Location for field .
6 service, Overtime work hours el ) / 1A (
7 Estimate Fee for Repair (if applicable) o A / =

A.) List all Shop locations including Point of Contact, complete address, phone number, and cell phone number (if applicable)
for each location (add additional sheets on your company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete):

35700 L7570 40 Saly Op Etove 710 64I7s~ G GaS oLy [ 5 HoP)
AR (PA1TS) STEVE poriet (%10)5/16-7359 (50Pktyison)  Ase wirris

($16) 556~ 95/ /Szﬂéj/fsma»ﬁfs/
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Se

ction 2 — EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER’S & MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICE OFFERED

A.) List All equipment manufacturers you offer parts, maintenance, and repair services on (add additional sheets on your
company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete); :

SrEL PTTACHELD,

B.) List additional services and/or items (menu of additional services and/or items) and pricing for any additional services and/or
items you offer the County (add additional sheets on your company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete):

SEEATACHE]

C.) List number of qualified technicians available for work to be performed in the Successful Contractor’s Shop: {

D.) List number of qualified technicians available for work to be performed at a Jackson County Location: \5/
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Bid 88-16 Section 2 Equipment Manufacture’s & Maintenance &Repair Service offered.

A. Viking Snow Plows
Viking Plow hitches.
Viking Dump Bodies
Viking Salt Spreaders
Viking Wing Plows
Certified Power Hydraulic Systems.
Force Hydraulic Systems.
Aero Tarp Systems.
Mountain Tarp
Shurco
Roll Rite
Boss Snow Plows
Henke Snow Plows
Henke Wing Plows
Swenson Salt Spreaders.
Varitech
TBEI bodies.
Beau Roc bodies.
Redneck Trailer Supplies.
Buyers Products.
Kuper plow blades.
Valk Plow blades.
Sabre Plow biades.
Whelen Lighting.
Truck-Lite
Peterson
Maxxima
Mailhot Hoists
Custom Hoists.
Cougar Vibrator.
On-Spot Instant Tire chains.
Sno Wheels.
Parkhurst
Ridewell.
John Henry Foster Hydraulics.
B. Viking offers repair services including but not limited to welding, fabrication, trailer repair, hydraulic
system repair, hydraulic hoses and general snow equipment repair.

22956 Highway 61 ¢ Morley, MO 63767 ¢ Phone (573) 262-3545 ¢ Fax (573) 262-3369
35700 B East Old 40 Highway ¢ Oak Grove, MO 64075 ¢ Phone (618) 625-0144 ¢ Fax (816) 625-0151
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ATTACHMENT 1
BIDDER’S QUOTATION
For
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 88-16

Jackson County, Missouri would like to have quotes and information the following Maintenance & Repair Service Labor
Rates, Maintenance & Repair Services Offered, New Parts, Remanufactured, Rebuilt or After Market Parts and Pick-Up

Service. If you provide additional services not listed below, please submit on your company’s letterhead and indicate the
additional services you have available and pricing for the additional services.

Section | — MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICE
Quote pricing on hourly rate for labor during regular work hours and overtime work hours. Include days of operation and travel time,
if applicable. Quote pricing for work to be completed in the Successful Contractor’s Shop and/or at Jackson County Locations for
those times when heavy construction equipment requires field service.

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT COSTS

Labor rate (shop), Regular work hours

~N
Shop Days of Operation, regular work hours: /¥ - | - Hourly $ / ’ 5
1 Shop Hours of Operation, regutar work hours: 8 - 5 B
Labor rate (shop), Overtime work hours
nO
Shop Days of Operation, overtime work hours: M~ = Hourly $ / 65
2 Shop Hours of Operation, overtime work hours: g -5
Labor rate (County Location), Regular work hours
Shop Days of Operation, regular work hours: M- F 214
g Hourly s 125
Shop Hours of Operation, regular work hours: g -
3 Response time to County’s request for service at a County Location: 2 Y hrs
Labor rate (County Location), Overtime work hours
Shop Days of Operation, overtime work hours: _ M - r: 09

_ Hourly $ 1 & 5
Shop Hours of Operation, overtime work hours: _% - 5

4 Response time to County’s request for service at a County Location; 2 '_'t hrs

Travel Charge (if applicable) for service call to a County Location for field 4 00
service, Regular work ho 1 3 [ 2 5
5 s g V) urs Ha‘,)ﬁ H»R
. . . . o o
;l;rrav\;zleC(l)lizg;i I(;i ag/agi;(cit())l::r)sfor service call to a County Location for field il $ /2 5 e
6 ’ Hov R
n/a $

7 Estimate Fee for Repair (if applicable)

A.) List all Shop locations including Point of Contact, complete address, phone number, and cell phone number (if applicable)
for each location (add additional sheets on your company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete):

DAVID REVNWVARE - SERVICE MANAGER ‘ JEFF SiRon ~ PARATE mANAGER
!

KA Sw U5 Hw’\/ L(ﬂ] Suuf 5,5"4',\/&5" MNE é’cf@/g
516299 Heel
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Section 2 — FQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER'S & MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICE OFFERED

A.) List All equipment manufacturers you offer parts, maintenance, and repair services on (add additional sheets on your
company's letterhead if necessary to make bid complete): :

BOoACRT MACHWE PaARTS + ScRVICE

TOWMASTER TRAILER PARTS «+ GezRVILE

MULTI 8 p  PPRTS + SERVICE
BAVDT CH(PpERS PaRTS + SERVICE

HUSQVA’RI\/H Cﬂﬂ/CRETE gﬁ.n/é) 8"9D65 + PN\TS

B.) List additional services and/or items (menu of additional services and/or items) and pricing for any additional services and/or
items you offer the County (add additional sheets on your company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete):

C.) List number of qualified technicians available for work to be performed in the Successful Contractor’s Shop: 7

D.) List number of qualified technicians available for work to be performed at a Jackson County Location: ol
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Section 3 — PARTS, NEW

List manufacturer and percentage discount off manufacturers suggested list price you offer the County. If you need additional space,
on your company’s letterhead submit any additional manufacturers and discounts you are offering the County for New parts. NOTE:
If offering no discount, enter a zero or N/A. Leaving a blank indicates a “no bid”.

Parts orders must include freight/shipping on estimate and invoice as separate line item, if any, and may be grouped into one fee for
entire order,

NO MANUFACTURER DISCOUNT OFFERED
8 BopcerT ) O %
9 %
10 %
3 %
12 7
13 i
14 %
15 %
16 %
17 %
18 7
19 7
20 i
DESCRIPTION QUOTE
21 Delivery of Parts Available (circle one) YES or (NQJ
22 | Delivery charge, if applicable § DeeTivaTe BAsSED
23 | Minimum Order for delivery of parts, if applicable $ Z
24 | Delivery time after receipt of request from the County for parts delivery TBD hours

Section 4 — PARTS, REMANUFACTURED, REBUILT, OR AFTER-MARKET

List manufacturer and percentage discount off manufacturer’s suggested list price you offer the County for remanufactured, rebuilt or
after-market parts, Prior approval by the County is REQURED for the use of Remanufactured, Rebuilt or After-Market Parts. If you
need additional space, on your company’s letterhead submit any additional manufacturers and discounts you are offering the County
for remanufactured, rebuilt or after-market parts. NOTE; If offering no discount, enter a zero or N/A. Leaving a blank indicates a
“no bid”.

NO MANUFACTURER DISCOUNT OFFERED

8 | BobeaT 1 %
0 %
10 %
11 %
12 %
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13 v
14 %
15 &
16 %
17 %
18 %
19 %
20 %

Section S —~ PICK UP SERVICE

The Successful Contractor may be required to pick up different styles and types of equipment for repair. Indicate what type of Pick
Up Services you can offer the County and include pricing for those pick up services (If you need additional space, on your company’s
letterhead submit with your bid response any additional information to make your bid complete):

RotL Back FRULK FEES ARE DESTINATION BASED |

CERTIFICATION: Signature shall be that of the person authorized to represent and bind Bidder’s company,

it é/ X/ 7
SIGNATURE: [ dir, /U A, DATE: RV adl

NAME; pﬁ‘r‘{ e K M © cnA Qr#‘f (Print or Type) | PHONE: 5 /é’ 22 - Hﬂﬁé
{

TITLE: O FPERPT1ONMS M ANAGER (Print or Type) | MOBILE:

COMPANY NAME: k c 6 08 ¢ ‘}T (Print or Type) | FAX: 5/’é - 334/7&,7 {

BLv& 507 ""—’;5
. , Lo 01
COMPANY ADDRESS: X0 ¢ S/ /5 HM/;/ o Mo é“):i'm or Type) | Web Address: K BOBCHT- com

EMAIL ADDRESS! 104"" CLPATHY é/’ K¢ BOOEAT . c.om

(Print or Type)




