### IN THE COUNTY LEGISLATURE OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI

A RESOLUTION awarding twenty-four month term and supply contracts with three twelve-month options to extend for the furnishing of heavy equipment maintenance, parts, and repair services for use by the Public Works Department to Victor L. Phillips Company of Kansas City, MO, Ackley Precision Welding of Oak Grove, MO, American Equipment Company of Kansas City, KS, CTW Electrical Company, Inc., of Greenwood, IN, KCR International d/b/a Diamond International of Kansas City, MO, G.W. Van Keppel Company of Kansas City, KS, K.C. Bobcat of Blue Springs, MO, L & W Service, LLC, d/b/a Midwest Radiator of Kansas City, Missouri, Murphy Tractor & Equipment Company of Kansas City, MO, Olathe Tractor & Equipment of Olathe, KS, Sargent Auto & Diesel of Grain Valley, MO, Summit Auto Electric of Lee's Summit, MO, and Tandem Truck Sales of Oak Grove, MO, under the terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 19-12.

**RESOLUTION #17864**, March 19, 2012

INTRODUCED BY Bob Spence, County Legislator

WHEREAS, the Director of Finance and Purchasing has solicited bids on Invitation to Bid No. 19-12 for the furnishing of heavy equipment maintenance, parts, and repair services for use by the Public Works Department, for the upcoming twenty-four month period, with three twelve-month options to extend; and,

WHEREAS, a total of fifty-seven notifications were distributed, with fourteen responses received; and,

WHEREAS, the Director of Finance and Purchasing recommends that the contracts be awarded to multiple vendors to have parts and services available for a variety of heavy equipment; and,

WHEREAS, award as recommended would result in awards to the following:

BIDDER	LABOR RATE	NEW PARTS <u>DISCOUNT</u>
Victor L. Phillips Company Kansas City (Jackson County), MC	\$105.50 )	10%
Ackley Precision Welding Oak Grove, MO	\$75.00	none
American Equipment Company Kansas City, KS	\$80.00	none
CTW Electrical Co., Inc. Greenwood, IN	no bid	75% used
KCR International d/b/a Diamond International Kansas City (Clay County), MO	\$95.00	15%-25%
G.W. Van Keppel Company Kansas City, KS	\$100.00	10%
K.C. Bobcat Blue Springs, MO	\$75.00	10%
L & W Service, LLC, d/b/a Midwest Radiator Kansas City (Jackson County), MC	\$65.00	none
Murphy Tractor & Equipment Co. Kansas City (Clay County), MO	\$105.00	none
Olathe Tractor & Equipment Olathe, KS	\$88.00	10%
Sargent Auto & Diesel Grain Valley, MO	\$89.72	none
Summit Auto Electric Lee's Summit, MO	\$60.00	none
Tandem Truck Sales Oak Grove, MO	\$68.00	none

now therefore,

BE IT RESOLVED by the County Legislature of Jackson County, Missouri, that award be made as recommended by the Director of Finance and Purchasing, and that the Director be and hereby is authorized to execute for the County any documents necessary to the accomplishment of the award; and,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Director of Finance and Purchasing is authorized to make all payments, including final payment on the contracts, to the extent that sufficient appropriations to the using spending agency are contained in the then current Jackson County budget.

Effective Date: This Resolution shall be effective majority of the Legislature.	ective immediately upon its passage by a
APPROVED AS TO FORM:	County Counselor
Chief Deputy County Counselor	County Counse or
Certificate of Passage	t
I hereby certify that the attached resolut was duly passed on	ion, Resolution #17864 of March 19, 2012, 2012 by the Jackson County s:
Yeas	Nays <u>O</u>
Abstaining	Absent/
<u> 3</u>   ンし   1 ユ Date	Mary Jo Spino, Clerk of Legislature
This award is made on a need basis and does specific amount. The availability of funds for appropriation.	s not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific purchases is subject to annual
March/4,997 Date	Director of Finance and Purchasing

## REQUEST FOR LEGISLATIVE ACTION

Completed by County Counselor's Office: Res/@rd No.: 17864

Sponsor(s): Bob Spence
Date: March 19, 2012

SUBJECT	Action Requested  ☑ Resolution ☐ Ordinance				
	Project/Title: Awarding a Twenty-Four (24) Month Ter Extension Options for the furnishing of Heavy Construction the Road & Bridge Division of the Public Works De Phillips Company (Jackson County) of Kansas City, Mis Oak Grove, Missouri; American Equipment Company (Electrical Co. Inc. (Johnson County) of Greenwood, Ind (Clay County) of Kansas City, Missouri; G.W. Van Kep Kansas; KC Bobcat (Jackson County) of Blue Springs, Marchy Tra City, Missouri; Olathe Tractor & Equipment (Johnson County) of Grain Valley, Missouri; Summit An Tandem Truck Sales (Jackson County) of Oak Grove, Mo. 19-12.	tion Equipment: Parts, Mapartment to the following of souri; Ackley Precision Wwyandotte County) of Kaniana; KCR International Del Company (Wyandotte Missouri; L & W Service Lactor & Equipment Companto County) of Olathe, Kansas; ato Electric (Jackson County)	intenance, & Repair Service companies: The Victor L. Yelding (Jackson County) of Sas City, Kansas; CTW BA Diamond International County) of Kansas City, LC DBA Midwest Radiator ny (Clay County) of Kansas Sargent Auto & Diesel ty) of Lees Summit, Missouri;		
BUDGET					
INFORMATION	Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year:	\$ N/A			
To be completed	Amount previously authorized this fiscal year:	\$ N/A			
By Requesting	Total amount authorized after this legislative action:  Amount budgeted for this item * (including \$ N/A \$ N/A				
Department and	Amount budgeted for this item * (including transfers):  \$ N/A				
Finance	transfers):				
;					
		TO ACCT			
	* If account includes additional funds for other expenses, total budgete	ed in the account is: \$			
	OTHER FINANCIAL INFORMATION:				
	No budget impact (no fiscal note required)				
	☐ Term and Supply Contract (funds approved in the ar Department: Road & Bridge Estimated U	nnual budget); estimated va Jse: \$275,000.00	lue and use of contract:		
	The RLA only approves the Term and Supply Contract; budget adoption. Figures includes in the background see estimate of contract value.	the funds were already appetion are for informational	propriated through the annual purposes to provide an		
	Prior Year Budget (if applicable): \$200,000.00 Prior Year Actual Amount Spent (if applicable): \$140,0	00.00			
PRIOR LEGISLATION	Prior ordinances and (date): N/A Prior resolutions and (date): 16651, 06/06/08				
CONTACT INFORMATION	RLA drafted by (name, title, & phone): Teddy Ballard,	Senior Buyer, 881-3465			
REQUEST	Tent diation of (maile, and, as priorie). Today Buriard,				
SUMMARY	The Road & Bridge Division of the Public Works Deparmaintain their Heavy Construction Equipment. Purchasi	tment requires a bid for paing issued Invitation to Bid	rts and repair service to No. 19-12.		

	A total of 57 notifications were distributed. The following 14 responses v	vere received:	
	BIDDER	LABOR RATE REGULAR HOURS	NEW PARTS DISCOUNT
	Victor L. Phillips (Jackson County), Kansas City	\$105.50	10%
	Ackley Precision Welding (Jackson County), Oak Grove	75.00	none
	American Equipment (Wyandotte County), Kansas City, Kansas	80.00	none
	CTW Electrical (Johnson County), Greenwood, Indiana	No Bid	75% used
	KCR Int'l DBA Diamond Int'l (Clay County), Kansas City	95.00	15% - 25%
	G.W. Van Keppel (Wyandotte County), Kansas City, Kansas	100.00	10%
	KC Bobcat (Jackson County), Blue Springs	75.00	10%
	L&W Service LLC DBA Midwest Radiator (Jackson County), Kansas Cit		none
	Murphy Tractor (Clay County), Kansas City	105.00	none
	Olathe Tractor (Johnson County), Olathe, Kansas	88.00	10%
	Sargent Auto (Jackson County), Grain Valley	89.72	none
	Summit Auto (Jackson County), Chair Valley Summit Auto (Jackson County), Lees Summit	60.00	none
•	Tandem Truck (Jackson County), Oak Grove	68.00	none
	Tandem Truck (Jackson County), Oak Grove	08.00	none
	Pursuant to Chapter 10, Section 1003 of the County Code, Midwest Whee for award.	l of Kansas City, Misso	ouri is ineligible
	recommends the award for the furnishing of Heavy Construction Equipmer Service for the Road & Bridge Division of the Public Works Department of Victor L. Phillips Company (Jackson County) of Kansas City, Missouri; Acounty) of Oak Grove, Missouri; American Equipment Company (Wyand CTW Electrical Co. Inc. (Johnson County) of Greenwood, Indiana; KCR International (Clay County) of Kansas City, Missouri; G.W. Van Keppel C Kansas City, Kansas; KC Bobcat (Jackson County) of Blue Springs, Missouridwest Radiator (Jackson County) of Kansas City, Missouri; Murphy Tr County) of Kansas City, Missouri; Olathe Tractor & Equipment (Johnson Auto & Diesel (Jackson County) of Grain Valley, Missouri; Summit Auto Summit, Missouri; Tandem Truck Sales (Jackson County) of Oak Grove, Invitation to Bid No. 19-12 as the lowest and best bidders.  This award is made on an "as needed" basis and does not obligate Jackson The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual appropriate to the county of the specific purchases is subject to annual appropriate to the county of the specific purchases is subject to annual appropriate to the county of the specific purchases is subject to annual appropriate the county of the specific purchases is subject to annual appropriate the county of the specific purchases is subject to annual appropriate the county of t	to the following companion the following companion Weldington Weldington Tomation of Kansas (International DBA Dian Company (Wyandotte Couri; L & W Service Libractor & Equipment County) of Olathe, Kan Electric (Jackson Cound Missouri; under terms and County to pay any spe	nies: The ng (Jackson s City, Kansas; nond County) of LC DBA mpany (Clay nsas; Sargent nty) of Lees and conditions
CLEARANCE	<ul> <li>         ☐ X Clearance Completed (Purchasing &amp; Department)     </li> <li>         ☐ Business License Verified (Purchasing &amp; Department)     </li> <li>         ☐ Chapter 6 Compliance - Affirmative Action/Prevailing Wage (County)     </li> </ul>	Auditor's Office)	
ATTACHMENTS	Abstract of Bids, Recap of Prices, and evaluation memo from Ms. Kaye M of the Public Works Department	Terkle of the Road & B	ridge Division
REVIEW	Department Director:	Date:	2/2012
	Finance (Budget Approval);  If applicable NIA Aleberas A Ball	Date: 3.13	-12
	Division Manager	Date?	1200
	County Counselor's Office:	Date:	/ -

#### This expenditure was included in the annual budget. Funds for this were encumbered from the \_\_\_\_\_\_ Fund in \_\_\_\_. There is a balance otherwise unencumbered to the credit of the appropriation to which the expenditure $\Box$ is chargeable and there is a cash balance otherwise unencumbered in the treasury to the credit of the fund from which payment is to be made each sufficient to provide for the obligation herein authorized. Funds sufficient for this expenditure will be/were appropriated by Ordinance # Funds sufficient for this appropriation are available from the source indicated below. Account Number: Account Title: Amount Not to Exceed: This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as each using agency places its order. This legislative action does not impact the County financially and does not require Finance/Budget approval.

Fiscal Information (to be verified by Budget Office in Finance Department)

RID: 19-12	9-12		Drake.	The G W	WIL	The Western		_
DENIN	OPENING DATE: 2/7/42		Cornago	Van Konnel	7 CO	The victor L		
COMMO	COMMODITY: Heavy Const Equip: Parts, MA,		Scruggs Equip. Inc.	Vall Neppel	Co. Inc.	Fullips co.	Diamond Inf'i	
& Repair Servs	r Servs							
	DESCRIPTION	UNIT QTY	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	
Labor ra	1 Labor rate, regular work hours		No Gid	100.00	see bid	105.50	95.00	_
Labor ra	2 Labor rate, overtime work hours		ine bid	130,00	see bid	125.00	15 P. O.	
Ö	CERTIFICATION OF BID OPENING							
	BIDS WERE PUBLICLY							
	OPENED AND RECORDED							
(								
 S						-		
	Throck (John							
	CLERK OF THE LEGISLANURE							
<b>)</b>	DOMECHASING	,,,,						

	BID: 19-12 OPENING DATE: 2/7/12			Olathe	Tandem	KC Bobcat	Midwest	Sargent
	COMMODITY: Heavy Const Equip: Parts, MA,			Tractor	Truck		Wheel	Auto
2	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ατΥ	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT
,-	1 Labor rate, regular work hours			\$8.00	68.00	75.60	00.0T	89.72
	2 Labor rate, overtime work hours			कर्त क	102.00	75.00	90.00	89.72
		,						
							,	
						·		
								,
	CERTIFICATION OF BID OPENING							
	BIDS WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND RECORDED							
		1 1,5						
	Khece lax							
	CVERKOFTHE LÉGISLATURE							
	PURCHASING							

BID: 19-12						
OPENING DATE: 2/7/12		Summit	American	Ackley	L&W Services	Murohy
COMMODIIY: Heavy Const Equip: Parts, MA,		Auto	Equipment	Precision	dba Midwest	Tractor
& Repair Servs	ľ	:			Radiator	
NO DESCRIPTION	UNIT   QTY	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT
1 Labor rate, regular work hours		60.00	80.00	75.00	00.39	00.501
2 Labor rate, overtime work hours		we bid	120,00	mo bid	85.06	125,00
				,		
CERTIFICATION OF BID OPENING						
CIEKKOFTHE I FGIS ACIDE						
$\langle \ \ \rangle$						
PURCHASING						

		MURPHY TRACTOR, KCMO	SARGENT AUTO, Grain Valley, MO	OLATHE TRACTOR, Olathe, KS	TANDEM TRUCK, Oak Grove, MO	KC BOBCAT, BSMO	MIDWEST WHEEL, KCMO	SUMMIT AUTO, LSMO
2		PRICE	PRICE	PRICE	PRICE	PRICE	PRICE	PRICE
	Section 1 - Parts, New							
	Discounts Offered	none	none	10%	10% none	10%	10% 18-60%	none
	Section 2 - Parts, Remanufactured, Rebuilt. &							
	Discounts Offered	none	none	10%	10% none	10%	10% 10-20%	none
	Section 3 - Maintenace & Renair Service							
	1 Fee for estimate	J/N	26.92	C/ N 00 03	NIC	7E 00 N/C	C) I	7:0
	2 Labor rate, regular work hours, shop	105.00	89.72	88.00	00 89	75.00	70.00	NO BIG
	3 Labor rate, regular overtime work hours, shop	125.00		89.72 No Bid		75.00	90.00	90.00 No Bid
1	4 Labor rate, regular work hours, County Locations	115.00 No Bid	No Bid	88.00	88.00 No Bid	115.00	75.00	75.00 No Bid
	5 Labor rate, overtime work hours, County Locations	135.00 No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	115.00	95.00	95.00 No Bid
	6 Travel, regular work hours	115.00 hr + 3.05 mi	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.25	45.00	45 00 No Bid
	7 Travel, overtime hours	135.00 hr + 3.05 mi	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.25	45.00	45.00 No Bid
	Section 4 - Pick-In Services							
	Offered	Ves	no	ves	Ves	Ves	Ves	2

RECAP INVITATION TO BID NO. 19-12 HEAVY CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT: PARTS, MAINTENANCE, AND REPAIR SERVICES

					L&W SERVICE			
		DIAMOND INT'L, KCMO	AMERICAN EQUIPMENT, KCK	ACKLEY PRECITION, Oak Grove,	DBA MIDWEST RADIATOR,	G W VAN KEPPEL,	CTW ELECTRICAL,	VICTOR L PHILLIPS,
<u>Q</u>	DESCRPTION	PRICE	PRICE	PRICE	PRICE	PRICE	PRICE	PRICE
	Section 1 - Parts, New							120
	Discounts Offered	15-25%	none	No Bid	none	10%	10% none	10%
	Section z - Parts, Remanutactured, Rebuilt, & After Market							
	Discounts Offered	15-25%	none	No Bid	none	none	75%	10%
	itenace & Repair Service							
		N/C	N/C	N/C	NC	150.00 No Bid	No Bid	NC
7	2 Labor rate, regular work hours, shop	95.00	80.00	75.00	65.00		No Bid	105 50
(7)	3 Labor rate, regular overtime work hours, shop	No Bid	120.00 No Bid	No Bid	85.00		No Bid	125.00
4	4 Labor rate, regular work hours, County Locations	No Bid	No Bid	85.00	65.00	105.00 No Bid	No Bid	115.00
5	5 Labor rate, overtime work hours, County Locations No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	85.00		130 00 No Bid	135.00
Œ	6 Travel regular work hours	7.00	<u>र</u> व र	7:0	75 00	0		
'		200		NO DIG	00.67	75.00 2.50 + labor	No Bid	2.50
	7 Travel, overtime hours	No Bid	No Bid	No Biď	75.00	75.00 2.50 + labor	No Bid	2.50
	Section 4 - Pick-Up Services							
	Offered	no	no	no	yes	yes	OU	yes
ĺ								



# Jackson County Public Works Department

ROAD MAINTENANCE

34900 E. Old US 40 Hwy, P.O. Box 160

Grain Valley, Missouri 64029

(816) 847-7050 phone (816) 847-7051 fax

#### **MEMORANDUM**

TO:

Teddy Ballard, Senior Buyer

FROM:

Kaye Merkle, Resource/Logistics Supervisor

DATE:

March 5, 2012

SUBJECT:

Bid No. 19-12 Heavy Construction Equipment: Parts, Maintenance &

Repair Services

I have evaluated the above referenced bid for Heavy Construction Equipment and recommend all 14 vendors for this contract. Each vendor provides a specific repair\parts service needed by our department.

Funding for these vendors will be taken from the following accounts: 004-1506-56510, 004-1506-56520, 004-1506-57310, 004-1506-57320

I am asking for approval of \$275,000 according to the following:

Victor L. Phillips	\$20,000
Ackley Precision Welding	\$30,000
American Equipment Co.	\$25,000
CTW Electrical Co.	\$15,000
KCR – Diamond International	\$40,000
GW Van Keppel Co.	\$20,000
KC Bobcat	\$10,000
Midwest Radiator	\$5,000
Midwest Wheel Co.	\$5,000
Murphy Tractor & Equipment Co.	\$20,000
Olathe Tractor & Equipment	\$15,000
Sargent's Auto & Diesel	\$15,000
Summit Auto Electric	\$5,000
Tandem Truck Sales	\$50,000