IN THE COUNTY LEGISLATURE OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI

A RESOLUTION awarding twelve-month term and supply contracts for the furnishing of turf chemicals and fertilizers for use by the Parks and Recreation Department to Grass Pad of Olathe, KS, Helena Chemical Company of Shawnee, KS, CWC Chemical, Inc., of Cloverdale, VA, BWI Companies of Lenexa, KS, Reinders, Inc., of Olathe, KS, and Red River Specialties of Shreveport, LA, under the terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 5-12.

RESOLUTION #17841, March 5, 2012

INTRODUCED BY Fred Arbanas, County Legislator

WHEREAS, the Director of Finance and Purchasing has solicited bids on Invitation to Bid No. 5-12 for the furnishing of turf chemicals and fertilizers for use by the Parks and Recreation Department to provide for departmental needs for the upcoming one-year period; and,

WHEREAS, a total of twenty-four notifications were distributed and six responses were received; and,

WHEREAS, the Director of Finance and Purchasing recommends that the contract be divided and awarded to the vendors submitting the lowest bid for each item; and,

WHEREAS, award as recommended would result in awards to the following:

BIDDER	ITEMS RECOMMENDED
Grass Pad Olathe, KS	26, 31, & 32
Helena Chemical Company Shawnee, KS	2, 16, 20, 24, & 27
CWC Chemical Cloverdale, VA	11 & 19
BWI Companies, Inc. Lenexa, KS	5, 21, 22, 25, 28, 34, & 36
Reinders, Inc. Olathe, KS	1, 3, 4, 7-10, 12-15, 17, 23, 29, 30, 33, 35, & 37
Red River	18

Shreveport, LA

now therefore.

BE IT RESOLVED by the County Legislature of Jackson County, Missouri, that award be made as recommended by the Director of Finance and Purchasing, and that the Director be, and is hereby, authorized to execute for the County any documents necessary to the accomplishment of the award; and,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Director of Finance and Purchasing is authorized to make all payments, including final payment on the contracts, to the extent that sufficient appropriations to the using spending agency have been made in the then current Jackson County budget.

Effective Date: This Resolution shall be effective immediately upon its passage by a majority of the Legislature.

APPROVED AS TO FORM: W. Jule Land County County Counselor Certificate of Passage I hereby certify that the attached resolution, Resolution #17841 of March 5, 2012 was duly passed on	· · · ·	
Certificate of Passage I hereby certify that the attached resolution, Resolution #17841 of March 5, 2012 was duly passed on	APPROVED AS TO FORM:	
Certificate of Passage I hereby certify that the attached resolution, Resolution #17841 of March 5, 2012 was duly passed on	Chief Deputy County Counselor	County Counselor
Abstaining	Certificate of Passage	
Abstaining	was duly passed on	<u>ノ /ス</u> , 2012 by the Jackson County
3.12.13 Mary Jo Spino, Clerk of Legislature This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual appropriations. Adams Jo Spino, Clerk of Legislature This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual appropriations.	Yeas	Nays
Mary Jo Spino, Clerk of Legislature This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual appropriations.	Abstaining	Absent <u>3</u>
specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual appropriations. Tubuway 24,202	3 · <i>I ス · I ス</i> Date	Mary Jo Spino, Clerk of Legislature
Date Director of Finance and Purchasing	specific amount. The availability of fo	
	Fubrucury 34,2012	Director of Finance and Purchasing

REQUEST FOR LEGISLATIVE ACTION

Completed by County Counselor's Office:

RestOrt No.: Sponsor(s):

Date:

17841

Fred Arbanas March 5, 2012

SUBJECT Action Requested Resolution Ordinance Project/Title: Awarding a Twelve-Month Term and Supply Contract for the furnishing of Chemicals & Fertilizers for Park Operations Division for the Parks & Recreation Department to Grass Pad Inc., Olathe, KS; Helena Chemical Co. of Shawnee, KS; CWC Chemical Inc of Cloverdale, VA: BWI Companies of Lenexa, KS; Reinders Inc. of Olathe, KS; and Red River Specialties Inc. of Shreveport, LA, under the term and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 5-12. **BUDGET** INFORMATION Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year: \$ N/A To be completed Amount previously authorized this fiscal year: \$ N/A By Requesting Total amount authorized after this legislative action: \$ N/A Department and Amount budgeted for this item * (including \$ N/A Finance transfers): Source of funding (name of fund) and account code FROM ACCT number: FROM / TO TO ACCT * If account includes additional funds for other expenses, total budgeted in the account is: \$ OTHER FINANCIAL INFORMATION: No budget impact (no fiscal note required) Term and Supply Contract (funds approved in the annual budget); estimated value and use of contract: Estimated Use: \$97,700.00 Department: Parks The RLA only approves the Term and Supply Contract; the funds were already appropriated through the annual budget adoption. Figures includes in the background section are for informational purposes to provide an estimate of contract value. Prior Year Budget (if applicable): \$90,700.00 Prior Year Actual Amount Spent (if applicable): \$40,000.00 NOTE: Each year the chemicals and fertilizers used changes. The types and amounts of chemicals and fertilizers used each year depends on the pests, types of diseases, and growing season the previous year. PRIOR **LEGISLATION** Prior ordinances and (date): N/A Prior resolutions and (date): 17565, 04/11/11 CONTACT INFORMATION RLA drafted by (name, title, & phone): Teddy Ballard, Senior Buyer, 881-3465 REOUEST The Parks Operations Division of the Parks & Recreation Department requested a bid for chemicals and **SUMMARY** fertilizers for maintaining Parks Locations. Purchasing issued Invitation to Bid No. 5-12. A total of 24 notifications were distributed with six responses received. The following split of award is recommended to the lowest and best bidder on each item meeting specifications:

	BIDDER	LOW BID/ITEMS RECOMMENDED										
	Grass Pad, Olathe, KS	26, 31, & 32										
	Helena Chemical Co., Shawnee, KS	2, 16, 20, 24 & 27										
	CWC Chemical, Cloverdale, VA	11 & 19										
	BWI Companies Inc., Lenexa, KS	5, 21, 22, 25, 28, 34, & 36										
	Reinders Inc., Olathe, KS	1, 3, 4, 7-10, 12-15, 17, 23, 29, 30, 33, 35, & 37										
	Red River Specialties, Shreveport, LA	18										
}	Tod Ittel Specialies, Smetepott, 211	10										
	NOTE: Park Operations determined the chemical content and recommended use for the alternate bids did not meet minimum specifications so the next best bid is recommended for award on the following items: 4, 5, 8, 14, 20, 29, 34, 35, and 37.											
	Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, 1980 recommends the award of a Twelve Month Term and Supply Fertilizers for the Parks Operations Division of the Parks & FKS; Helena Chemical Co. of Shawnee, KS; CWC Chemical KS; Reinders Inc. of Olathe, KS; and Red River Specialties I conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 5-12 and to the lowest and This award is made on an "as needed" basis and does not oble The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to a	Contract for the furnishing of Chemicals & Recreation Department to Grass Pad Inc., Olathe, inc of Cloverdale, VA: BWI Companies of Lenexa, inc. of Shreveport, LA, under the term and I best bidder meeting specifications for each item.										
CLEARANCE	☐ Tax Clearance Completed (Purchasing & Department) ☐ Business License Verified (Purchasing & Department) ☐ Chapter 6 Compliance - Affirmative Action/Prevailing W	age (County Auditor's Office)										
ATTACHMENTS	Abstract of Bids, Recap of Prices, and Memo from Mr. JD In	gram of the Parks Department										
REVIEW	Department Director:	Date: 2/27/12										
	Thomas (Budget Amaya))	Date:										
	Finance (Budget Approval): If applicable And Ball	3-27-12										
		Date: /										
	Division Manager:	2/39/20/3										
	County Counselor's Office:	Date:										

This expenditure was included in the annual budget. Funds for this were encumbered from the Fund in . There is a balance otherwise unencumbered to the credit of the appropriation to which the expenditure is chargeable and there is a cash balance otherwise unencumbered in the treasury to the credit of the fund from which payment is to be made each sufficient to provide for the obligation herein authorized. Funds sufficient for this expenditure will be/were appropriated by Ordinance # Funds sufficient for this appropriation are available from the source indicated below. Account Title: Amount Not to Exceed: Account Number: This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as each using agency places its order.

This legislative action does not impact the County financially and does not require Finance/Budget approval.

Fiscal Information (to be verified by Budget Office in Finance Department)

ABSTRACT OF BIDS

	OPENING DATE: 1/24/12			Red River	Inc.	inc	, ,
	COMMODITY: Chemicals & Fertilizers -			Specialties) [
5	DESCRIPTION		2	THIOMA	TIMIOMA		TIME
	Grand Total		<u>4</u>	see hid	ruled		see hid
			-				
		·					
					'		
	CERTIFICATION OF BID OPENING						
	OPENED AND RECORDED						
	ON EXPERIENCE AND BY						
	Mary Mary						
	CEERKOPAHETEEGISLATURE		-				
	Madda Madall						
	FURCHASING						

ABSTRACT OF BIDS

		T										NO				\rceil
PURCHASING****	CIERKIONTIFICIEGISLATURE		ON TENED OF BY	つべ ジャップ・サイン・ファイン・ファイン・ファイン・ファイン・ファイン・ファイン・ファイン・ファ	OPENED AND RECORDED	CERTIFICATION OF BID OPENING					Grand Total	DESCRIPTION	Park Operations	COMMODITY: Chemicals & Fertilizers -	OPENING DATE: 1/24/12	BID:5-12
												UNIT				
												QTY				
											seeled	AMOUNT			Products Inc.	Cinromo Tirr
											see hid	AMOUNT			Companies	RWI
											see bid	AMOUNT			Reinders	
		,									see bid	AMOUNT	Distributors	Midwest	American	
												AMOUNT				

RECAP INVITATION TO BID NO. 5-12 CHEMICALS AND FERTILIZERS FOR PARK OPERATIONS

RECAP INVITATION TO BID NO. 5-12 CHEMICALS AND FERTILIZERS FOR PARK OPERATIONS

			-														
RED RIVER SPEC., Shreveport, LA	LINIT PRICE	23.35 No Bid	17.15 No Bid	19.98 No Bid	21.14 No Bid	45.00 No Bid	34.95 No Bid	No Bid	87.00 No Bid								
REINDERS, Olathe, KS	UNIT PRICE	23.35	17.15	19.98	21.14	45.00	34.95	145.00 No Bid	87.00								
BWI, Lenexa, KS	UNIT	26.18	20.82	No Bid	25.66		1.66 No Bid	109.75	87.00								
CWC, Cloverdale, VA	UNIT PRICE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.90	1.66	128.80	1.74								
Ĭ -	UNIT			18.62 No Bid	23.03 No Bid	45.90	No Bid	130.53	87.00								
AMERICAN MIDWEST, KCMO	UNIT PRICE	27.74	18.39		23.03	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid								
GRASS PAD, Olathe, KS	UNIT	No Bid	16.97	16.74	21.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid								
	DESCRIPTION	21-0-10 Plus 25% Dimension which contains 50% Nutrisphere - n - slow 30 release	18-0-4 43% Barracade which contains 50% Nutrisphere - n - slow release	21-14-7 contains Nutrisphere - n - and 32 AVAIL / slow release	21-0-4 Plus 0.2% Merit and contains 50% 33 Nutrisphere slow release	34 Heritage Fungicide	35 Prophesy 0.72G	36 SureGuard	Freehand				•				
	ON.	30	31	32	33	34	35	ဗ္ဂ	37								



Administration Historic Sites Ranger Station Recreation (816) 503-4800 Fax (816) 795-1234

Kemper Outdoor Education Center (816) 229-8980

Fred Arbanas Golf Course (816) 761-9445

Blue Springs Marina (816) 795-1112

Jacomo Marina (816) 795-8888

Longview Marina (816) 966-0131

Special Population Services (816) 763-5130

MEMORANDUM

TO: Teddy Ballard, Purchasing Department

FROM: JD Ingram, Superintendent of Park Operation's

DATE: 02/22/2012

SUBJECT: Park Operations Chemical Bid Information

The low bidder on the following items offered alternate chemicals and fertilizers to the items specified by Park Operations:

Item 4- Garlan 4

Item 5- Talstar

Item 6- Merit 75wp

Item 14- Remedy

Item 20- Induce-Aquatic Sticker

Item 29-32-0-8, 50% Nitrogen from 50% Nutrisphere, slow release

Item 34- Heritage Fungicide

Item 35- Prophesy 0.72G

Item 37- Freehand

Park Operations determined the chemical content and recommended use for the alternate bids did not meet minimum specifications so the next bid is recommended for award.

List of recommended bidders with items recommended for award:

Grass Pad- Items 26, 31, & 32
Helena Chemical- Items 2, 16, 20, 24, & 27
CWC Chemical- Items 11 & 19
BWI Companies- Items 5, 21, 22, 25, 28, 34, and 36
Reinders- Items 1, 3, 4, 7-10, 12-15, 17, 23, 29, 30, 33, 35, & 37
Red River Specialties- Item 18

If you need more information, please contact me.