IN THE COUNTY LEGISLATURE OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI

A RESOLUTION awarding a twenty-four month term and supply contract with three
twelve-month extension options for the furnishing of auto/truck maintenance and repair
services for use by various County departments, to Paul’s Auto, Independence, MO,
Midwest Wheel, Kansas City, MO, Tire Centers, Kansas City, MO, Calibrated Products,
Blue Springs, MO, Abundent Services dba AAMCO, Independence, MO, Landmark
Dodge, Independence, MO, Metro Ford, Independence, MO, Diamond Collision, Grain
Valley, MO, Midway USA Collision, Kansas City, MO, Sargent Auto & Diesel, Grain
Valley, MO, McCorkendale, Biue Springs, MO, Klinginsmith, Independence, MO, Greg'’s
Tire, Independence, MO, MJM Auto, dba Maaco, Independence, MO, Accent Auto, Blue
Springs, MO, Absolute Auto, Grain Valley, MO, Barr's Auto, Independence, MO, Bob
Sight Ford, Lee’s Summit, MO, B&C Truck, Kansas City, MO, Dale’s Auto, Blue
Springs, MO, Eagle Auto, Blue Springs, MO, Grain Valley Muffler, Grain Valley, MO,
Naura dba AAMCO, Blue Springs, MO, Fleming Auto, Blue Springs, MO, Tandem
Truck, Oak Grove, MO, Heartland Automotive dba Jiffy Lube, Irving, TX, KCR
International dba Diamond International, Kansas City, MO, and A&A Industrial, Kansas
City, KS, under the terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 5-11.

RESOLUTION #17554, March 28, 2011

INTRODUCED BY Scott Burnett, County Legislator

WHEREAS, pursuant to Invitation to Bid No. 5-11, the Director of Finance and
Purchasing has solicited formal written bids for the furnishing of auto/truck maintenance

and repair services for use by various County departments; and,

WHEREAS, a total of sixty-seven (67) solicitations were distributed and twenty-eight

(28) responses were received:; and,

WHEREAS, the Director of Finance and Purchasing recommends the award of twenty-
four month term and supply contracts with three twelve-month extension options to the

following vendors, all located in Jackson County unless otherwise indicated, to ensure
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the ready availability of services for a variety of vehicles in various locations throughout

the county:
MAINTENANCE & REPAIR
LABOR RATE/PARTS BODY REPAIR SERVICE OIL
VENDOR MARKUP LABOR RATE CHANGES
Paul’s Auto $70 hr/60% No Bid $27.00

Independence, MO

Midwest Wheel $65 hr/20% No Bid $35.00
Kansas City, MO

Tire Centers $75 hr/25% No Bid $27.00
Kansas City, MO

Calibrated Products $65 hr/25% No Bid No Bid
Blue Springs, MO

Abundent Services dba
AAMCO $65 hr/50% No Bid $29.95

Independence, MO

Landmark Dodge $76 hr/25% $48 hr $26.95
Independence, MO

Metro Ford $69 hr/20% $42 hr $26.95
Independence, MO

Diamond Collision  $65 hr/30% $45 hr No Bid
Grain Valley, MO

Midway USA Collision No Bid $55 hr No Bid
Kansas City, MO

Sargent Auto & Diesel $89.72 hr/20% No Bid $34.95
Grain Valley, MO

McCorkendale $87.99 hr/varies No Bid $29.95
Blue Springs, MO




Klinginsmith $48 hr/25%
Independence, MO

Greg's Tire $75 hr/55%
Independence, MO

MJM Auto dba
Maaco No Bid
Independence, MO

Accent Auto $52.50 hr/35%
Blue Springs, MO

Absolute Auto $78 hr/varies
Grain Valley, MO

Barr’'s Auto $80 hr/50%
Independence, MO

Bob Sight Ford $78.50 hr/varies
Lee's Summit, MO

B&C Truck $45 hr/20%
Kansas City, MO

Dale’s Auto $48 hr/none
Blue Springs, MO

Eagle Auto $80 hr/varies
Blue Springs, MO

Grain Valley Muffler $65 hr/varies
Grain Valley, MO '

Naura dba AAMCO $55 hr/50%
Blue Springs, MO

Fleming Auto $83 hr 30%
Blue Springs, MO

Tandem Truck $68 hr/20%
Oak Grove, MO

$48 hr

No Bid

$40 hr

$47.50 hr

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$48 hr

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$68 hr

No Bid

$25.00

No Bid

$5.25 + parts

$26.94

$38.50

$31.95

No Bid

No Bid

$37.00

No Bid

$24.95

$29.95

$68.00




Heartland Automotive

dba Jiffy Lube No Bid No Bid
Irving, TX
KCR International No Bid No Bid

dba Diamond International
Kansas City (Clay County), MO

A&A Industrial $50 hr/20% $40 hr
Kansas City, KS

and,

WHEREAS, this award is made on an as needed basis and does not obligate the

County to pay any specific amount, with the availability of funds for specific purchases

being subject to annual appropriation; now therefore,

BE IT RESOLVED by the County Legislature of Jackson County, Missouri, that award
be made as recommended by the Director of Finance and Purchasing, and that the

Director be and hereby is authorized to execute for the County any documents

necessary for the accomplishment of the award: and,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Director of Finance and Purchasing is authorized
to make all payments, including final payment on the contracts, to the extent that

sufficient appropriations to the using spending agencies are contained in the then

current Jackson County budget.

$23.99

$23.99

$31.95




Effective Date: This Resolution shall be effective immediately upon its passage by a
majority of the Legislature.

APPRO:D gs T Q%_/ j/) . (%fﬂ%ﬂt@:

Chie Deppty County Counselor County Counfelor

Certificate of Passage

| hereby certify that the attached resolution, Resolution #17554 of March 28,
2011, was duly passed on _, olaaid , 2011 by the Jackson
County Legislature. The votes thereon were as follows:

Yeas 57 Nays O
Abstaining O Absent [
| 4 —stf—| Mcuu,, b%
Date Mary Jo Spino, Clefk ¥f Legislature

This award is made on an as needed basis and does not obligate Jackson County to
pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to

annual appropriations.

_ Paress 2 3 R0/

Date

Director of the artment of Finance




REQiJEST FOR LEGISLATIVE ACTION

Completed by County Counselor’s Office:
Res#OxdkNo.: 17554
Sponsor(s): Scott Burnett

Date: March 28, 2011

SUBJECT

Action Requested
X] Resolution
[C] Ordinance

Project/Title: Awarding a Twenty-Four (24) Month Term & Supply Contract with Three (3) Twelve-Month
Extension Options for the furnishing of Auto & Truck Maintenance and Repair Services for County-Wide use to
the following Companies: Paul’s Auto, Indp; Midwest Wheel, Kansas City; Tire Centers, Kansas City:
Calibrated Products, Blue Springs; Abundent Services DBA AAMCO, Indp; Landmark Dodge, Indp; Metro
Ford, Indp; Diamond Collision, Grain Valley; Midway USA Collision, Kansas City: Sargent Auto & Diesel,
Grain Valley; McCorkendale, Blue Springs; Klinginsmith, Indp: Greg’s Tire, Indp: MIM Auto dba Maaco,
Indp; Accent Auto, Blue Springs; Absolute Auto, Grain Valley; Barr’s Auto, Indp; Bob Sight Ford, Lees
Summit; B&C Truck, Kansas City; Dale’s Auto, Blue Springs; Eagle Auto, Blue Springs; Grain Valley Muffler,
Grain Valley; Naura dba AAMCO, Blue Springs: Fleming Auto, Blue Springs; Tandem Truck, Oak Grove; all
located in Jackson County: Heartland Automotive DBA Jiffy Lube, Irving, TX with locations in Jackson County;
KCR Int’l DBA Diamond Int’l (Clay County), Kansas City, MO; and A & A Industrial* (Wyandotte County),.
Kansas City, KS; under terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 5-11,

BUDGET
INFORMATION
To be completed
By Requesting
Department and
Finance

Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year: $N/A
Amount previously authorized this fiscal year: $ N/A
Total amount authorized after this legislative action: $N/A
Amount budgeted for this item * (including $N/A

transfers):
Source of funding (name of fund) and account code FROM ACCT

number; FROM / TO

TO ACCT

* If account includes additional funds for other expenses, total budgeted in the account is: $
OTHER FINANCIAL INFORMATION:

[] No budget impact (no fiscal note required)

X Term and Supply Contract (funds approved in the annual budget); estimated value and use of contract:

Department: Road & Bridge Estimated Use: $320,000.00

Department: Sheriff Estimated Use: $275,000.00 .
Department: Parks Estimated Use: $ 52,000.00

Department: DTF Estimated Use: $ 5,500.00

Department: Corrections Estimated Use: $ 22,660.00

Department: Pros. Atty. Estimated Use: $ 9,495.00 ,
Department: Facilities Mgmt. Estimated Use: § 2,000.00

Department; Records Estimated Use: $§  300.00

TOTAL $686,955.00

Prior Year Budget (if applicable): $233,700.00

Prior Year Actual Amount Spent (if applicable): $524,000.00

PRIOR
LEGISLATION

Prior ordinances and (date): N/A
Prior resolutions and (date): 16525, 1/28/08 and 16526, 1/28/08




CONTACT

INFORMATION | RLA drafted by (name, title, & phone): Teddy Ballard, Senior Buyer, 881-3465
REQUEST
SUMMARY Departments currently using the vehicle maintenance bids require service. Purchasing issued Invitation to Bid

No. 5-11.

A total of 67 notifications were distributed. The following 28 responses were received:

MAINT & REPAIR BODY REPAIR OIL

BIDDER LABOR/PARTS LABOR RATE CHANGES
Paul’s Auto, Indp $70.00/hr / 60% No Bid $27.00
Midwest Wheel, KC $65.00 hr / 20% No Bid $35.00
Tire Centers, KC $75.00/hr / 25% No Bid $27.00
Calibrateéd Products, Blue Springs $65.00/hr / 25% No Bid No Bid
Abundent Services DBA AAMCO, Indp $65.00/hr / 50% No Bid $29.95
Landmark Dodge, Indp $76.00/hr / 25% $48.00 hr $26.95
Metro Ford, Indp $69.00/hr / 20% $42.00 hr $26.95
Diamond Collision, Grain Valley $65.00/hr / 30% $45.00 hr No Bid
Midway USA Collision, KC No Bid $55.00 hr No Bid
Sargent Auto & Diesel, Grain Valley $89.72/hr / 20% No Bid $34.95
McCorkendale, Blue Springs $87.99/hr / varies No Bid $29.95
Klinginsmith, Indp . $48.00/hr / 25% $48.00 No Bid
Greg'’s Tire, Indp $75.00/hr / 55% No Bid $25.00
MIM Auto dba Maaco, Indp No Bid $40.00 No Bid
Accent Auto, Blue Springs $52.50/hr / 35% $47.50 $5.25 + parts
Absolute Auto, Grain Valley $78.00/hr / varies No Bid $26.94
Barr’s Auto, Indp $80.00/hr / 50% No Bid $38.50
Bob Sight Ford, Lees Summit $78.50/hr / varies No Bid $31.95
B&C Truck, Kansas City $45.00/hr / 20% No Bid No Bid
Dale’s Auto, Blue Springs $48.00/hr / none $48.00 No Bid
Eagle Auto, Blue Springs $80.00/hr / varies No Bid $37.00
Grain Valley Muffler, Grain Valley $65.00/hr / varies No Bid No Bid
Naura dba AAMCO, Blue Springs $55.00/hr / 50% No Bid $24.95
Fleming Auto, Blue Springs $83.00/hr / 30% No Bid $29.95
Tandem Truck, Oak Grove $68.00/hr / 20% $68.00 $68.00
Heartland Automotive DBA Jiffy Lube,

Irving, TX No Bid No Bid $23.99
KCR Int’I DBA Diamond Int’l, ,
(Clay County) KC $85.00/hr / varies $56.00 No Bid
A & A Industrial* (Wyandotte County), KCK  $50.00/hr / 20% $40.00 $31.95

The Evaluation Committee consisting of the following Departments: Road & Bridge, Sheriff’s Office, Drug
Task Force, and Corrections; recommend award to all the bidders so the County would have multiple options for
service depending on Departments’ needs.

Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, 1984, the Director of Finance and Purchasing
recommends the award for the furnishing Auto & Truck Maintenance and Repair Services for County-Wide use
to the following Companies: Paul’s Auto, Indp; Midwest Wheel, Kansas City; Tire Centers, Kansas City;
Calibrated Products, Blue Springs; Abundent Services DBA AAMCO, Indp; Landmark Dodge, Indp; Metro
Ford, Indp; Diamond Collision, Grain Valley; Midway USA Collision, Kansas City; Sargent Auto & Diesel,
Grain Valley; McCorkendale, Blue Springs; Klinginsmith, Indp; Greg’s Tire, Indp; MIM Auto dba Maaco,
Indp; Accent Auto, Blue Springs; Absolute Auto, Grain Valley; Barr’s Auto, Indp; Bob Sight Ford, Lees
Summit; B&C Truck, Kansas City; Dale’s Auto, Blue Springs; Eagle Auto, Blue Springs; Grain Valley Muffler,
Grain Valley; Naura dba AAMCO, Blue Springs; Fleming Auto, Blue Springs; Tandem Truck, Oak Grove; all
located in Jackson County; Heartland Automotive DBA Jiffy Lube, Irving, TX with locations in Jackson County;
KCR Int’l DBA Diamond Int’1 (Clay County), Kansas City, MO; and A & A Industrial* (Wyandotte County),
Kansas City, KS; under terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 5-11 as the lowest and best bidders.

* MBE




CLEARANCE D] Tax Clearance Completed (Purchasing & Department)

[] Business License Verified (Purchasing & Department)

Xl Chapter 6 Compliance - Affirmative Action/Prevailing Wage (County Auditor’s Office)
ATTACHMENTS | Abstract of Bids, Recap of Prices, and evaluation memos from the Evaluation Committee.
REVIEW Date;

\

—3/-4-2//

Department Director: W
NEGrFee
<

Finance (Budget Approval):
If applicable (LI

Datg (aa{ 0

Division Manager: i %{\ /

Date: % Z// :

County Counselor’s Office: v

Date:




Fiscal Information (to be verified by Budget Office in Finance Department)

[
O

4

0 0O

This expenditure was included in the annual budget.

Funds for this were encumbered from the Fund in

There is a balance otherwise unencumbered to the credit of the appropriation to which the expenditure

is chargeable and there is a cash balance otherwise unencumbered in the treasury to the credit of the fund from which
payment is to be made each sufficient to provide for the obligation herein authorized.

Funds sufficient for this expenditure will be/were appropriated by Ordinance #

Funds sufficient for this appropriation are available from the source indicated below.

Account Number: Account Title: Amount Not to Exceed:

This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of
funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as each using agency places its order.

This legislative action does not impact the County financially and does not require Finance/Budget approval.
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RECAP INVITATION TO BID NO. 5-11
AUTO AND TRUCK MAINTENANCE and REPAIR SERVICES

MIDWEST
PAUL'S WHEEL CALIBRATED
AUTOMOTIVE, | COMPANIES, |TIRE CENTERS,| PRODUCTS
Indp, MO KCMO LLC, KCMO INC, BSMO
NO DESCRIPTION U/M PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Maintenance & Repair Services . 4
1|Labor rate, shop, regular hours hour 70.00 65.00 75.00 65.00
2|Parts, new, percentage mark-up rate 60% 20% 25% 25%
Parts, remanufactured, rebuilt, or after
3|market, percentage mark-up rate 60% 20% 25% 25%
4|Estimate fee, if any job 50.00 n/c included n/a
Allow base rate or standard flat fee for
5|menu items yes No Bid - yes No Bid
Tire Services '
6|Remove damaged tire, put on spare each No Bid 75.00 85.00f NoBid
7|Add air only job No Bid 75.00|85.00 + 1.00/tire No Bid
8!Unlock service each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9|Starting service each No Bid 75.00 _ 85.00 No Bid
10| Tow service job No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11|Retread tires, percentage mark-up rate No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid
Retread service for County-owned tires, . :
12|percentage mark-up  |rate No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid
‘ 24-hour Emergency Road Side
13|Assistance, price per trip trip No Bid 75.00 65.00 No Bid
Wheel refurbishing service, hourly shop
14|rate hour No Bid No Bid 25.00 No Bid
15|Wheel refurbishing service per tire . each No Bid No Bid 25.00 No Bid
16(Tire repair each 8.00 No Bid 30.00 No Bid
17 |Stem replacement each 5.00 No Bid 6.00 No Bid
18| Tire mounting each 5.00 No Bid 12.00 No Bid
19|Tire balancing each | 5.00 No Bid 12.00 No Bid
20|Alignment, auto/light truck each 59.95 - 69.95 No Bid . 70.00 No Bid
Body Repair Service _
21|Body repair labor rate, regular hours hour No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
22|Supplies, percentage mark-up rate No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
23|Painting labor rate, regular hours hour No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24|Sublet rate each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
25|Estimate fee, if any job No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Qil Change, Lube, Filter Care, and Wiper Replacment
26|0il change, auto/light truck each 27.00 35.00 27.00 No Bid
27|Fluid check and fill all fluids job [N/C w/oil change Note 1 included No Bid
28|Fuel filter replacement each {40.00 plus parts Note 1 35.00 No Bid
29|Air filter replacement each {2.00 plus parts Note 1 20.00 No Bid
30|Wiper replacement set ]5.00 plus parts Note 1 10.00 No Bid
Note 1. Can not evaluate, no price or price range indicated.
* MBE
* WBE
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RECAP INVITATION TO BID NO. 5-11
AUTO AND TRUCK MAINTENANCE and REPAIR SERVICES

ABUNDENT
A&A SERVICES DBA
INDUSTRIAL | AAMCO TRANS| LANDMARK
SERVICE?*, & TOTAL CAR | DODGE INC, | METRO FORD
KCKS CARE, Indp, MO| Indp, MO INC, Indp, MO
NO DESCRIPTION U/M PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Maintenance & Repair Services
1|Labor rate, shop, regular hours hour 50.00 65.00 76.00 69.00
2|Parts, new, percentage mark-up rate 20% 50% 25% 20%
Parts, remanufactured, rebuilt, or after
3)market, percentage mark-up rate 20% 45% 25% 20%
4|Estimate fee, if any , job n/c 65.00 50.00 n/a
Allow base rate or standard flat fee for
5|menu items ' No Bid yes yes yes
Tire Services
6|Remove damaged tire, put on spare each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7|Add air only job No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8|Unlock service each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9|Starting service each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10| Tow service job No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11|Retread tires, percentage mark-up rate No Bid No Bid No Bid 20%
Retread service for County-owned tires,
12|percentage mark-up rate No Bid No Bid No Bid n/a
24-hour Emergency Road Side
13|Assistance, price per trip trip No Bid No Bid No Bid n/a
Wheel refurbishing service, hourly shop ‘
14|rate ' hour No Bid No Bid No Bid n/a
15|Wheel refurbishing service per tire each No Bid No Bid No Bid n/a
16{Tire repair: each No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.00
17 |Stem replacement each No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.00
18| Tire mounting each No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.00
19|Tire balancing each No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00
20]Alignment, auto/light truck each No Bid No Bid 89.95 69.95
Body Repair Service
21|Body repair labor rate, regular hours hour 40.00 No Bid 48.00 42.00
22 Supplies, percentage mark-up rate 20% No Bid 25% 20%
23|Painting labor rate, regular hours hour 40.00 No Bid 48.00 42.00
24|Sublet rate each 20% No Bid 25% 20%
25|Estimate fee, if any job n/c .No Bid n/c n/c
Oil Change, Lube, Filter Care, and Wiper Re
26| 0il change, auto/light truck each 31.95 29.95 26.95 26.95
27 |Fluid check and fill all fluids job 20.00{ N/C w/oil change n/c 9.00
28|Fuel filter replacement each 35.00 Note 1 _69.00 50.00
29| Air filter replacement each 19.95 Note 1 No Bid 25.00
30| Wiper replacement set 17.50 Note 1 No Bid 20.00
Note 1: Can not evaluate, no price or price ran
* MBE
** WBE
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RECAP INVITATION TO BID NO. 5-11
AUTO AND TRUCK MAINTENANCE and REPAIR SERVICES

DIAMOND
COLLISION & | MIDWAY USA | SARGENT AUTO
FABRICATION | COLLISION & DIESAL
LLC, Grain CENTER, REPAIR, Grain
Valley, MO KCMO Valley, MO
NO DESCRIPTION U/M PRICE PRICE PRICE
Maintenance & Repair Services _
1!Labor rate, shop, regular hours hour 65.00 "No Bid 89.72
2|Parts, new, percentage mark-up rate 30% No Bid 20%
Parts, remanufactured, rebuilt, or after
3|market, percentage mark-up rate. 30% No Bid 20%
4|Estimate fee, if any job n/c No Bid 26.92
Allow base rate or standard flat fee for
5{menu items no No Bid yes
Tire Services
6|Remove damaged tire, put on spare each No Bid No Bid No Bid
7|Add air only job No Bid No Bid No Bid
8|Unlock service each No Bid No Bid No Bid
9Starting service each No Bid No Bid No Bid
10| Tow service job No Bid No Bid No Bid
11|Retread tires, percentage mark-up rate No Bid No Bid No Bid
Retread service for County-owned tires,
12|percentage mark-up rate No Bid No Bid No Bid
24-hour Emergency Road Side
13| Assistance, price per trip trip No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wheel refurbishing service, hourly shop
14 rate hour No Bid No Bid No Bid
15|Wheel refurbishing service per tire each No Bid No Bid No Bid
16|{Tire repair each No Bid No Bid 25.00
17| Stem replacement each No Bid No Bid 25.00
18|Tire mounting each No Bid No Bid 15.00
19|Tire balancing each No Bid No Bid 15.00
20|Alignment, auto/light truck each| ' . NoBid No Bid 89.95
Body Repair Service
21|Body repair labor rate, regular hours hour 45.00 55.00 No Bid
22|Supplies, percentage mark-up rate 30% 25% No Bid
23|Painting labor rate, regular hours: hour 45.00 55.00 No Bid
24|Sublet rate each 25% 25% No Bid
25|Estimate fee, if any job n/c n/c : No Bid
Oil Change, Lube, Filter Care, and Wiper Re
26|0il change, auto/light truck each No Bid No Bid 34.95
27|Fluid check and fill all fluids job No Bid No Bid N/C w/oil change
28|Fuel filter replacement each No Bid No Bid 26.92 and up
29|Air filter replacement each No Bid No Bid No Bid
30|Wiper replacement set No Bid No Bid No Bid
Note 1. Can not evaluate, no price or price ran
* MBE
**WBE
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RECAP INVITATION TO BID NO. 5-11

AUTO AND TRUCK MAINTENANCE and REPAIR SERVICES

HEARTLAND
GEORGE AUTOMOTIVE
McCORKENDALE DBA JIFFY KLINGINSMITH
AUTO SERVICE | LUBE, Irving, BODY SHOP
INC, BSMO TX INC, Indp, MO
NO DESCRIPTION U/M PRICE PRICE PRICE
Maintenance & Repair Services
1{Labor rate, shop, regular hours hour 87.99 No Bid 48.00
2|Parts, new, percentage mark-up rate Note 1 No Bid 25%
Parts, remanufactured, rebuilt, or after
3|market, percentage mark-up rate Note 1 No Bid 25%
4|Estimate fee, if any job 44.00 and up No Bid No Bid
Allow base rate or standard flat fee for
5!menu items yes No Bid No Bid
Tire Services
6|Remove damaged tire, put on spare each No Bid No Bid No Bid
7|Add air only job No Bid No Bid No Bid
8|Unlock service each No Bid No Bid No Bid
9|Starting service each No Bid No Bid No Bid
10| Tow service job No Bid No Bid No Bid
11{Retread tires, percentage mark-up rate- No Bid No Bid No Bid
Retread service for County-owned tires,
12|percentage mark-up rate No Bid No Bid No Bid
24-hour Emergency Road Side
13|Assistance, price per trip : trip No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wheel refurbishing service, hourly shop
14 rate hour No Bid No Bid No Bid
15|Wheel refurbishing service per tire each No Bid No Bid No Bid
16(Tire repair each 15.00 and up No Bid ‘No Bid
17|Stem replacement each 16.00 and up No Bid No Bid
18| Tire mounting each 15.00 No Bid No Bid
19|Tire balancing each | 47.00 per set of 4 No Bid No Bid |
20|Alignment, auto/light truck each 69.95 and up No Bid No Bid
Body Repair Service
21|Body repair labor rate, regular hours hour No Bid No Bid 48.00
22{Supplies, percentage mark-up rate No Bid No Bid 25%
23|Painting labor rate, regular hours hour No Bid No Bid 48.00
24(Sublet rate : each No Bid No Bid No Bid
25|Estimate fee, if any job No Bid No Bid No Bid
Qil Change, Lube, Filter Care, and Wiper Re
26)0il change, auto/light truck each 29.95 23.99 No Bid
27 |Fluid check and fill all-fluids job N/C w/oil change n/c No Bid
28|Fuel filter replacement each 44.00 and up 49.59 No Bid
29|Air filter replacement each Note 1 9.99 and up No Bid
30|Wiper replacement set Note 1 9.99 and up No Bid
Note 1: Can not evaluate, no price or price ran
* MBE
** WBE
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RECAP INVITATION TO BID NO. 5-11
AUTO AND TRUCK MAINTENANCE and REPAIR SERVICES

MJM
AUTOMOTIVE INC
GREG'S TIRE DBA MAACO ACCENT
CENTER, Indp, COLLISION AUTOMOTIVE
MO REPAIR, Indp, MO | INC, BSMO
NO DESCRIPTION U/M PRICE PRICE PRICE
Maintenance & Repair Services
1|Labor rate, shop, regular hours hour 75.00 No Bid - 52.50 and up
2|Parts, new, percentage mark-up rate 55% No Bid 35%
. |Parts, remanufactured, rebuilt, or after :
3|market, percentage mark-up rate 55% No Bid 35%
4 |Estimate fee, if any job n/c No Bid n/c
Allow base rate or standard flat fee for
5|menu items yes No Bid yes
Tire Services
6|Remove damaged tire, put on spare each No Bid No Bid Note 1
7|Add air only job No Bid No Bid Note 1
8|Unlock service each No Bid .No Bid No Bid
9Starting service each No Bid No Bid 65.00
10| Tow service job No Bid No Bid No Bid
11|Retread tirés, percentage mark-up rate No Bid No Bid No Bid
Retread service for County-owned tires, o
12 |percentage mark-up rate No Bid No Bid No Bid
24-hour Emergency Road Side
13| Assistance, price per trip trip No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wheel refurbishing service, hourly shop
14{rate hour No Bid No Bid No Bid
15|Wheel refurbishing service per tire each No Bid No Bid No Bid
16| Tire repair each 18.00 No Bid No Bid
17|Stem replacement each| 18.00 and up No Bid No Bid
18| Tire mounting " |each 10.00 No Bid No Bid
19| Tire balancing each 10.00 No Bid No Bid
20| Alignment, auto/light truck each| 59.95-69.95 No Bid No Bid
Body Repair Service
21|Body repair labor rate, regular hours hour No Bid 40.00 47.50| ,
22|Supplies, percentage mark-up rate No Bid 25% 35%
23|Painting labor rate, regular hours hour No Bid 40.00 47.50
24|Sublet rate each No Bid 25% n/a
25|Estimate fee, if any job No Bid n/c n/c
Oil Change, Lube, Filter Care, and Wiper Re
26|0il change, auto/light truck each 25.00 No Bid 5.25 and up
27 |Fluid check and fill all fluids job | N/C w/oil change No Bid 5.25 and up
28|Fuel filter replacement each| 18.95and up No Bid 15.75
29|Air filter replacement each| 14.95and up No Bid 2,62
30| Wiper replacement set 9.95 and up No Bid 2.62
Note 1: Can not evaluate, no price or price ran
* MBE
** WBE
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RECAP INVITATION TO BID NO. 5-11

AUTO AND TRUCK MAINTENANCE and REPAIR SERVICES

ABSOLUTE BARR'S AUTO BOB SIGHT
AUTOMOTIVE LLC, | REPAIR, Indp, FORD, INC,
Grain Valley, MO MO LsMO
NO DESCRIPTION U/M PRICE PRICE PRICE
Maintenance & Repair Services
1{Labor rate, shop, regular hours hour 78.00 80.00 78.50
2|Parts, new, percentage mark-up rate See Bid 50% |cost + 20%
Parts, remanufactured, rebuilt, or after
3|market, percentage mark-up rate See Bid 50%|cost + 20%
4 |Estimate fee, if any job n/c n/c nic
Allow base rate or standard flat fee for
5/menu items yes no yes
Tire Services ,
6|Remove damaged tire, put on spare each No Bid No Bid No Bid
7|Add air only - job No Bid No Bid No Bid
8|Unlock service each No Bid No Bid No Bid
9(Starting service each No Bid No Bid No Bid
10)Tow service job No Bid No Bid No Bid
11|Retread tires, percentage mark-up rate No Bid . No Bid No Bid
Retread service for County-owned tires,
12 |percentage mark-up rate No Bid No Bid No Bid
24-hour Emergency Road Side
13|Assistance, price per trip trip No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wheel refurbishing service, hourly shop :
14 |rate hour No Bid No Bid No Bid
15|Wheel refurbishing service per tire each No Bid No Bid No Bid
16|Tire repair each 20.00 15.00 18.00
17| Stem replacement each 15.00 15.00 18.00
18| Tire mounting each | 15.00 include balance 20.00f 16.00-19.00
19|Tire balancing each 10.00 60.00
20|Alignment, auto/light truck each 78.00 No Bid 79.95 - 99-95
Body Repair Service :
21|Body repair labor rate, regular hours hour No Bid No Bid No Bid
22|Supplies, percentage mark-up rate No Bid No Bid No Bid
23|Painting labor rate, regular hours hour No Bid No Bid No Bid
24|Sublet rate each No Bid No Bid No Bid
25|Estimate fee, if any job No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oil Change, Lube, Filter Care, and Wiper Re
26|0il change, auto/light truck each 26.94| 38.50 and up 31.95 and up
27|Fluid check and fill all fluids job N/C w/oil change N/C wiloil change | N/C w/oil change
28|Fuel filter replacement each 60.00 and up See Bid 60.00
29| Air filter replacement each 15.00 and up See Bid 26.00
30|Wiper replacement set 13.99 and up See Bid 26.00
Note 1: Can not evaluate, no price or price ran
* MBE
** WBE
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RECAP INVITATION TO BID NO. 5-11
AUTO AND TRUCK MAINTENANCE and REPAIR SERVICES

DALE'S GRAIN
B & C TRUCK | AUTOMOTIVE VALLEY
ELECTRIC COLLISION EAGLE MUFFLER
SERVICE, REPAIR AUTOMOTIVE | LLC, Grain
KCMO CENTER, BSMO| INC, BSMO Valley, MO
NO DESCRIPTION U/m PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Maintenance & Repair Services
1|Labor rate, shop, regular hours hour 45.00 48.00 80.00 65.00
2|Parts, new, percentage mark-up rate 20% none Note 1 25% - 50%
Parts, remanufactured, rebuilt, or after
3|market, percentage mark-up rate 20% none Note 1 50%
4 |Estimate fee, if any job n/c n/c n/c n/c
Allow base rate or standard flat fee for
5/menu items yes no no no
Tire Services
6|Remove damaged tire, put on spare each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7|Add air only job No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8|Unlock service each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9(Starting service each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10| Tow service job . No Bid No Bid ‘No Bid No Bid
11]Retread tires, percentage mark-up rate No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Retread service for County-owned tires, '
12 |percentage mark-up ' rate No Bid No Bid No Bid - No Bid
24-hour Emergency Road Side _
13|Assistance, price per trip trip No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid
Wheel refurbishing service, hourly shop '
14|rate hour No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15|Wheel refurbishing service per tire each ‘No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16| Tire repair each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
17|Stem replacement each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
18| Tire mounting each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
19| Tire balancing each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20|Alignment, auto/light truck each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Body Repair Service
21|Body repair labor rate, regular hours hour No Bid 48.00 No Bid No Bid
22|Supplies, percentage mark-up rate No Bid none No Bid No Bid
23{Painting labor rate, regular hours hour No Bid 48.00 No Bid No Bid
24|Sublet rate each No Bid none No Bid No Bid
25|Estimate fee, if any job No Bid n/c No Bid No Bid
Qil Change, Lube, Filter Care, and Wiper Re
26|0il change, auto/light truck each No Bid No Bid 37.00 No Bid
27|Fluid check and fill all fiuids job No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
28|Fuel filter replacement each No Bid No Bid 75.00 No Bid
29|Air filter replacement each No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid
30|Wiper replacement set | NoBid No Bid 40.00 No Bid
Note 1: Can not evaluate, no price or price ran
* MBE
**WBE
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RECAP INVITATION TO BID NO. 5-11
AUTO AND TRUCK MAINTENANCE and REPAIR SERVICES

TANDEM
NAURA INC* |KCRINT'L DBA TRUCK,
DBA AAMCO DIAMOND FLEMING AUTO |Oak Grove,
- TRANS, BSMO | INT'L, KCMO |CENTER INC, BSMO MO
NO .DESCRIPTION U/M PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Maintenance & Repair Services
1{Labor rate, shop, regular hours hour 55.00 85.00 83.00 68.00
2|Parts, new, percentage mark-up rate’ 50% Note 1 30% 20%
Parts, remanufactured, rebuilt, or after
3|market, percentage mark-up rate 50% Note 1 30% 20%
4|Estimate fee, if any job n/c n/c n/c n/c
Allow base rate or standard flat fee for
5|menu items yes no yes no
Tire Services
6|Remove damaged tire, put on spare each No Bid No Bid 60.00{ No Bid
7|Add air only job No Bid No Bid 40.00f{ No Bid
8|Unlock service each No Bid No Bid 50.00] No Bid
9|Starting service each No Bid No Bid 50.00{ No Bid
10| Tow service job No Bid - No Bid 40.00 + 3.00 per mile No Bid
11|Retread tires, percentage mark-up rate 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid
Retread service for County-owned tires,
12 |percentage mark-up rate 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid
24-hour Emergency Road Side
13|Assistance, price per trip trip . No Bid No Bid 50.00 and up No Bid
Wheel refurbishing service, hourly shop '
14 |rate hour No Bid No Bid 83.00] No Bid
15|Wheel refurbishing service per tire each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16|Tire repair each 12.00 No Bid 15.00{ No Bid
17 |Stem replacement each 12.00 No Bid 17.00{ No Bid
18| Tire mounting each 8.00 No Bid 10.00/ No Bid
19|Tire balancing each 8.00 No Bid 8.00] No Bid
20]Alighment, auto/light truck each 59.99 No Bid 69.95| No Bid
Body Repair Service
21{Body repair labor rate, regular hours hour No Bid 56.00 No Bid 68.00
22 |Supplies, percentage mark-up rate No Bid See Bid No Bid 10%
23| Painting labor rate, regular hours hour No Bid 56.00 No Bid 68.00
24|Sublet rate each No Bid No Bid No Bid 15%
25|Estimate fee, if any job No Bid No Bid No Bid n/c
Oil Change, Lube, Filter Care, and Wiper Re
26|0il change, auto/light truck each ) 24.95and up No Bid 29.95 and up 68.00
27 {Fluid check and fill all fluids job | N/C w/oil change No Bid N/C w/oil change 68.00
28|Fuel filter replacement each 37.50 No Bid 41.50 and up 68.00
29|Air filter replacement each 18.99 No Bid Note 1 68.00
30| Wiper replacement set 19.79 No Bid Note 1 68.00
Note 1: Can not evaluate, no price or price ran
* MBE
** WBE
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Teddy Ballard

From: Kaye Merkle

Sent: Wednesday, March 02, 2011 2:15 PM

To: Teddy Ballard

Subject: Bid No. 5-11
Ms. Teddy,
The referenced bid, Bid No. 5-11 ~ Auto and Truck Maintenance and Repair Services, was evaluated by a group
of users from various county departments set in a round table forum. Collectively we agreed that the services of
each of the 28 vendors would be utilized throughout the term of the contract. Some of these vendors appeal to

one or more departments due to the location of the business, services provided/services required, price, etc. |
therefore recommend approval of all 28 bidders.

My department would like $320,000

Please allot the following for the specified vendors for Public Works

Midwest Wheel $4,000
Calibrated Products $10,000
Tire Centers, LLC $5,000
Landmark Dodge $2,000
Metro Ford $10,000
Diamond Collision $5,000
Midway USA $3,000

Sargent Auto & Diesel $15,000
Greg's Tire Center $10,000
Accent Automotive $6,000
Absolute Automotive  $10,000
B&C Truck $6,000
Dale's Automotive $3,000
Grain Valley Muffler $3,000

Naura/Aamco $5,000
KCR/Diamond Int. $120,000
Fleming Auto $3,000
Tandem Truck -$100,000
Kaye Merkle

PW Road Maintenance

03/02/2011




JACKSON COUNTY DRUG TASK FORCE
Inter-Departmental

Date: 03/02/11

TO: Teddy Ballard, Purchasing Division, Jackson County
FROM: Dan Cummings, Jackson County Drug Task Force

SUBJECT: Auto and Truck Maintenance Repair

Ms. Ballard:

In response to the Group Evaluation meeting for review of bid 5-11, auto and truck maintenance and
repair services, I would recommend approval of all Venders.

Due to the saféty and security issues of the Task Force I would request The Jackson County Drug Task
Force utilize Eagle Automotive, Blue Springs, Missouri for any Vehicle maintenance or repair when

possible.

For 2011 the Jackson County Drug Task Force has budgeted $5,500.00 for maintenance and repair of
vehicles.

Should you need any further information please feel free to contact me.

Dan Cummings
Officer in Charge
Jackson County Drug Task Force

P.O. Box 392 * Blue Springs, Missouri 64015 * Phone: (816) 655-3784 FAX: (816) 224-3360

JCDTF Form #105
Inter-Office Communication
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Teddy Ballard

From: James D. Ingram

Sent: Wednesday, March 02, 2011 7:55 AM
To: Teddy Ballard

Cc: Wayne Shipley

Subject: Auto Truck Maint and Repair Bid NO. 5-11

Teddy,

Parks and Rec attended the recap meeting March 1,2011 and recommend that we approve all as a group. We
estimate spending $52,000......... JD Ingram 03/02/11

03/02/2011
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Teddy Ballard

From: Gregg S. Demo

Sent: Thursday, March 03, 2011 8:47 AM

To: Teddy Ballard !
‘Subject: Group Evaluation Meeting for 5-11 Auto & Truck Maintenance & Repair Service

Teddy,

The Sheriff's Department is requesting that all venders reviewed on 03-01-2011 be approved for use by the
Sheriff's Dept. Since it is not in our 2011 Budget for new vehicles and the majority of our fleet is at 100,000 miles
or over we expect of vehicle repair cost to be approximately $275,000.00.

Gregg

Sgt. Gregg De Mo

Jackson County Sheriff's Department
3310 NE Rennau Dr,

Lee's Summit, MO 64064
816-524-4302 ext. 972218

03/03/2011




