Request for Legislative Action Res. #21314

Sponsor: Megan L. Marshall
Date: June 26, 2023

Completed by County Counselor’s Office

Action Requested: | Resolution Res.Ord No.: 21314

Sponsor(s): Megan L. Marshall Legislature Meeting Date: 6/26/2023

Introduction

Action Items: ['Award']

Project/Title:

Awarding a split contract for a Twelve (12) Month Term and Supply Contract with Two (2) Twelve (12)
Month Options to Extend for the furnishing of Safety Equipment & Supplies for use by Various County
Departments to Anixter Inc., RJ Kool Company of Missouri dba Controlled Environmental Products and
Medline Industries, LP under the conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 23-030

Request Summary

The Public Works and Park + Rec Departments require a Term and Supply Contract for the furnishing of
Safety Equipment & Supplies. The Purchasing Department issued Invitation to Bid 23-030 in response to
those requirements. A total of 730 notifications were distributed, there were (81) document takers with
(4) responses received and evaluated. One vendor does not accommodate every item needed and one
vendor may have a better price than the others for certain items. A Scoring Summary of the Invitation
to Bid, Awarded Bidders Quotation Sheets and the using departments Recommendation

Memos are attached.

Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, the Director of Finance and Purchasing
recommends the award of a Twelve (12) Month Term and Supply Contract with Two (2) Twelve (12)
Month Options to Extend for the furnishing of Safety Equipment & Supplies for use by Various County
Departments to Anixter Inc., RJ Kool Company of Missouri dba Controlled Environmental Products and
Medline Industries, LP based on the lowest and best bids per line items.

This award is made on as “As Needed” basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific
amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual appropriation. The annual
estimated spend for use by various county departments is $30,000.00.

The Jackson County Compliance Portal was checked, status was green/issued and showed an expiration
date of 2023-12-31 for all three awarded vendors.

Contact Information

Department: Finance Submitted Date: | 6/7/2023
Name: John Konon Email: jkonon@jacksongov.org
Title: Buyer Phone: 816-881-3292
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Request for Legislative Action

Budget Information

Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year: SO0
Amount previously authorized this fiscal year: SO0
Total amount authorized after this legislative action: S
Is it transferring fund? No
Single Source Funding:
Fund: Department: Line Item Account: Amount:

lUnexpected End of

Formula

Prior Legislation

Prior Ordinances

Ordinance: Ordinance date:

Prior Resolution

Resolution: Resolution date:
20673 May 17, 2021
19156 May 23, 2016
Purchasing

Does this RLA include the purchase or lease of Yes

supplies, materials, equipment or services?

Chapter 10 Justification: Formal Bid
Core 4 Tax Clearance Completed: Not Applicable
Certificate of Foreign Corporation Received: Yes

Have all required attachments been included in Yes

this RLA?

Compliance

Certificate of Compliance

In Compliance

Minority, Women and Veteran Owned Business Program

Goals Not Applicable for following reason: Less than $50000

MBE: .00%
WBE: .00%
VBE: .00%
Prevailing Wage
Not Applicable
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Request for Legislative Action

Fiscal Information

e This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific
amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as each
using agency places its order.

History

Submitted by Finance requestor: John Konon on 6/7/2023. Comments:

Approved by Department Approver Bob Crutsinger on 6/8/2023 9:49:02 AM. Comments:

Approved by Purchasing Office Approver Barbara J. Casamento on 6/8/2023 10:25:16 AM. Comments:

Approved by Compliance Office Approver Jaime Guillen on 6/8/2023 11:51:14 AM. Comments:

Approved by Budget Office Approver David B. Moyer on 6/8/2023 12:18:08 PM. Comments:

Approved by Executive Office Approver Sylvya Stevenson on 6/8/2023 8:45:56 PM. Comments:

Approved by Counselor's Office Approver Theresa E. Bullington on 6/22/2023 1:17:17 PM. Comments:
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JACKSON COUNTY

Parks + Rec
P& 22807 Woods Chapel Road Michele Newman, Director
HIlILEREN Blue Springs, Missouri 64015 (816) 503-4800
iaandind MakeYourDayHere.com Fax: (816) 795-1234
TO: John Konon, Buyer

FROM: Dianne Kimzey, Deputy Director Parks + Rec

DATE: May 31, 2023

RE: Recommendation for Bid No. 23-030

The Parks + Rec Department is recommending Controlled Environment Products
for bid number 23-030 Safety Equipment & Supplies based on the bids received

for this service.

Estimated total expenses for the Department will be $10,000 for 2023.

Frank White, Jr., County Executive



Jackson County
Public Works Department

X /17/ \)%\ * ROAD MAINTENANCE 34900 E. Old US 40 Hwy, P.O. Box 160
" 950 x Grain Valley, Missouri 64029
* (816) 847-7050 phone
(816) 847-7051 fax
MEMORANDUM
TO: John Konon, Finance and Purchasing Department
FROM: Matt Willier, Assistant Road and Bridge Administrator, Public Works Department
DATE: June 6, 2023

SUBJECT: Recommendation for Vendors: Medline Industries LP, Anixter Inc, and
Controlled Environmental Products LLC

Please consider bid No. 23-030 Safety Equipment & Supplies be split and awarded to Medline
Industries LP, Anixter Inc, and Controlled Environmental Products LLC.

One single vendor does not accommodate every part needed for County equipment. Also, one
vendor may have a cheaper price than the other for certain parts.

It is estimated that Road & Bridge Public Works could spend approximately $20,000.00 annually
between these 3 vendors.

For the reasons above, it has been requested that bid No. 23-030 Safety Equipment & Supplies
be split and awarded to Medline Industries LP, Anixter Inc, and Controlled Environmental
Products LLC.

Thank you for your consideration,

Thank you,

Matt Willier, Assistant Road & Bridge Administrator



23-030 - Safety Equipment & Supplies

Medline Industries, LP

Scoring Summary

Evaluation Group 1 - Purchasing Evaluation

A-6 - Greater Kansas
A-3 - Copy of A-4 - Statement of A-5 - City Metropolitan
A-2 - Affidavit Certificate of Contractors Acknowledgment of ~ Area Information
Compliance Qualificati Receipt of Addenda Memo (on Company
Letterhead)

A-7 - Bidders A-8 - Exhibit F -
Quotation Sheet Bidders Exceptions

A-1 - Term and Supply Contract
Page

A - Purchasing Evaluation

Reviewer Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail

P P P P

Average:

Calculated: 0

Evaluation Group 2 - Department Evaluation

B-2 - Statement of

Total B - Department Evaluation B-1 - Bidders Quotation Sheet Contractors .B-3 =BG F J
N Bidders Exceptions
Qualifications
Reviewer /100 pts /100 pts / 50 pts |/ 35 pts /15 pts
Matt Willier 100 100 50 35 15
Greg Addison 70 70 35 25 10

Average:

Calculated: 85

Scoring Comments

A-1 - Term and Supply Contract Page - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer Reason Comments

John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass

A-2 - Affidavit - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer Reason Comments

John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass

A-3 - Copy of Certificate of Compliance - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer Reason Comments

John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass
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A-4 - Statement of Contractors Qualifications - Reviewer Scores
Reviewer Score Reason Comments

John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass

A-5 - Acknowledgment of Receipt of Addenda - Reviewer Scores
Reviewer Score Reason Comments

John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass

A-6 - Greater Kansas City Metropolitan Area Information Memo (on Company Letterhead) - Reviewer Scores
Reviewer Score Reason Comments

John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass

A-7 - Bidders Quotation Sheet - Reviewer Scores
Reviewer Score Reason Comments

John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass

A-8 - Exhibit F - Bidders Exceptions - Reviewer Scores
Reviewer Score Reason Comments

John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass

B-1 - Bidders Quotation Sheet - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer Score Reason Comments
Many prices are below some
other bidders. Some are also
higher but the overall prices are
competitive.

Matt Willier 50 Strongly fits desired attribute(s)

Aggressive pricing, largest
discount on misc. items, not quite
as good a fit with respect to
packaging. Tend to package in
larger bulk quantities which may
not work as well for the county.

Greg Addison 35 Other

B-2 - Statement of Contractors Qualifications - Reviewer Scores
Reviewer Score Reason Comments

Matt Willier 35 Well-supported claim(s) Qualifications meet

Appears to be an experienced
Greg Addison 25 Other vendor; however, several
responses provided no detail.

B-3 - Exhibit F - Bidders Exceptions - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer Score Reason Comments
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Matt Willier 15 Strongly fits desired attribute(s) Meets expectations

Greg Addison 10 Other Exceptions noted regarding vests
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23-030 - Safety Equipment & Supplies

Anixter Inc.

Scoring Summary
Evaluation Group 1 - Purchasing Evaluation

A-6 - Greater Kansas
A-3 - Copy of A-4 - Statement of A-5 - City Metropolitan
A-2 - Affidavit Certificate of Contractors Acknowledgment of ~ Area Information
Compliance Qualificati Receipt of Addenda Memo (on Company
Letterhead)

A-7 - Bidders A-8 - Exhibit F -
Quotation Sheet Bidders Exceptions

A-1 - Term and Supply Contract
Page

A - Purchasing Evaluation

Reviewer Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail

P P P P

Average:

Calculated: 0

Evaluation Group 2 - Department Evaluation

B-2 - Statement of

Total B - Department Evaluation B-1 - Bidders Quotation Sheet Contractors .B-3 =BG F J
N Bidders Exceptions
Qualifications
Reviewer /100 pts /100 pts / 50 pts |/ 35 pts /15 pts
Matt Willier 100 100 50 35 15
Greg Addison 45 45 45 0 0

Average:

Calculated: 3 72.5

Scoring Comments

A-1 - Term and Supply Contract Page - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer Reason Comments

John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass

A-2 - Affidavit - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer Reason Comments

John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass

A-3 - Copy of Certificate of Compliance - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer Reason Comments

John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass
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A-4 - Statement of Contractors Qualifications - Reviewer Scores
Reviewer Score Reason Comments
John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass
A-5 - Acknowledgment of Receipt of Addenda - Reviewer Scores
Reviewer Score Reason Comments
John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass
A-6 - Greater Kansas City Metropolitan Area Information Memo (on Company Letterhead) - Reviewer Scores
Reviewer Score Reason Comments
John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass
A-7 - Bidders Quotation Sheet - Reviewer Scores
Reviewer Score Reason Comments
John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass
A-8 - Exhibit F - Bidders Exceptions - Reviewer Scores
Reviewer Score Reason Comments
John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass
Comments
Many prices are below some

B-1 - Bidders Quotation Sheet - Reviewer Scores

Score

Reason

Strongly fits desired attribute(s)

other bidders. Some are also
higher but the overall prices are
competitive.

Reviewer
Matt Willier 50
Every item was bid, and appears
. y . . that they have a lower price on a
Greg Addison 45 Strongly fits desired attribute(s) number of the most heavily used
supplies.
Comments

B-2 - Statement of Contractors Qualifications - Reviewer Scores
Reason

Qualifications meet

Reviewer Score
Matt Willier 35 Well-supported claim(s)
Greg Addison 0 Incomplete response Not submitted
B-3 - Exhibit F - Bidders Exceptions - Reviewer Scores
Reviewer Score Reason Comments
Matt Willier 15 Meets or excgeds my Expectations meet
expectations
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Greg Addison 0 Incomplete response Nothing submitted
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23-030 - Safety Equipment & Supplies

Controlled Environment Products, LLC

Scoring Summary

Evaluation Group 1 - Purchasing Evaluation

A-6 - Greater Kansas
A-3 - Copy of A-4 - Statement of A-5 - City Metropolitan
A-2 - Affidavit Certificate of Contractors Acknowledgment of ~ Area Information
Compliance Qualificati Receipt of Addenda Memo (on Company
Letterhead)

A-7 - Bidders A-8 - Exhibit F -
Quotation Sheet Bidders Exceptions

A-1 - Term and Supply Contract
Page

A - Purchasing Evaluation

Reviewer Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail

P P P P

Average:

Calculated: 0

Evaluation Group 2 - Department Evaluation

B-2 - Statement of

Total B - Department Evaluation B-1 - Bidders Quotation Sheet Contractors .B-3 =BG F J
N Bidders Exceptions
Qualifications
Reviewer /100 pts /100 pts / 50 pts |/ 35 pts /15 pts
Matt Willier 100 100 50 35 15
Greg Addison 90 90 40 35 15

Average:

Calculated: 95

Scoring Comments

A-1 - Term and Supply Contract Page - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer Reason Comments

John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass

A-2 - Affidavit - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer Reason Comments

John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass

A-3 - Copy of Certificate of Compliance - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer Reason Comments

John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass
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A-4 - Statement of Contractors Qualifications - Reviewer Scores
Reviewer Score Reason Comments

John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass

A-5 - Acknowledgment of Receipt of Addenda - Reviewer Scores
Reviewer Score Reason Comments

John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass

A-6 - Greater Kansas City Metropolitan Area Information Memo (on Company Letterhead) - Reviewer Scores
Reviewer Score Reason Comments

John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass

A-7 - Bidders Quotation Sheet - Reviewer Scores
Reviewer Score Reason Comments

John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass

A-8 - Exhibit F - Bidders Exceptions - Reviewer Scores
Reviewer Score Reason Comments

John Konon Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass

B-1 - Bidders Quotation Sheet - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer Score Reason Comments
Many prices are below some
other bidders. Some are also

Matt Willier 50 Strongly fits desired attribute(s) higher but the overall prices are
competitive.
Greg Addison 40 Strongly fits desired attribute(s) | -O"eSt Price in some categories

though not all items were bid.

B-2 - Statement of Contractors Qualifications - Reviewer Scores
Reviewer Score Reason Comments

Matt Willier 35 Well-supported claim(s) Qualifications meet

Years of industry experience,
Current Term & Supply Vendor
Greg Addison 35 Strongly fits desired attribute(s) with strong track record of
performance, minority owned

business

B-3 - Exhibit F - Bidders Exceptions - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer Score Reason Comments

Meets or exceeds my

Matt Willier 15 y
expectations

Qualifications meet
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Meets or exceeds my

Greg Addison 15 expectations

No exceptions noted
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Jackson County, Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 23-030

Page 1 of 2
Bidders Quotation Sheet
Safety Equipment & Supplies

NO. DESCRIPTION U/M g,f,;r( MANUFACTURER BID UNIT PRICE
1. Safety Glasses, workers grade w/ side shield, black

plastic frame w/ single piece polycarbonate lens Bex 125 I-éozréesxlv;/(epll UVEX, $ 11.75/EA

that is available in several tints, 10/box Each 1250
2. Silicone Lens Station, large disposable lens

cleaning station w/ large tissues and 16-ounce anti- | Each 24 Radians, LCS161200 $ 10.75/EA

fog, anti-static silicone cleaning solution

Dozen

3 Jersey Gloves, brown, 9-ounce Pair %1979 Cordova, 1400P $ 6.00/DZ PR
4 Predaflex Industrial Strength Rubber Gloves, 14” Pair 50 MCR, 9794L $ 5.65/PR
5. .

ﬁ(&:}t{ex Disposable Gloves, powder free, 100 per Box 75 Direct Safety, 81581 $ 4.25/BX
6. Rain Overalls, yellow, plain front, elastic

suspenders Each 50 MCR, 200BP $ 5.00/EA
7. Coveralls, dlsposable., white, zipper front, Case 50 DuPont, TY120SWHLG002500 | $ 130.50/CS

spunbonded olefin, sizes 1 —4X, 25 per cases
8. Earmuffs, hearing protection, wire headband and

pivoting cups, wide softly padded headband and Each 50 3M. X1A $ 15.25/EA

vinyl covered cushions '
9. Safety Vests — required sizes M — 5XL, breathable

nylon fluorescent lime with 2-inch extra-wide 3

wraparound sewn silver reflective 3M Scotch lite | Each 100 :DQIEO’tS 302850 Zo?izn%fude $ 4.50/EA

striping for 360-degree visibility, ANSI approved, any logo(s))

ISEA-107-1999, Class 2, Level 2, and zipper front
10. Saw Wrap Chaps — required sizes 327, 36” and

407, 1000 denier Cordura nylon outer shell;

SwedePro/EngTex jamming protective pads; outer

fabric to be water, oil, snake and snap resistant; Each 10 Delta Pllus, _JE'902XXa $ 82.00/EA

wrap to be small fiber; adjustable fit at legs; Comes in sizes 33, 36 & 39

Orange: OSHA approved for leg protection and

launderable
. Lumbar Braces, various sizes Each 50 Ergodyne, 20185 $ 23.75/EA
12. Direct Safety, 64031,

Hard Hats Each 25 (No logo(s) included in quote) $ 8.50/EA
13. Standard Assortment, 36-unit First Aid Kit Each 5 First Aid Only, 243-AN $ 86.50/EA
14. Federal Aviation, 24-unit First Aid Kit Each 5 First Aid Only, 242-AN $ 65.00/EA
15. Johnson & Johnson, 50-unit, 15%” x 14%5” x 5- ) .

9/16" First Aid Kit Each 5 First Aid Only, 91419 | § 105.50/EA
16. Advil, 50 individual packets of 2, 200 mg Box 50 Medique, 40933 $ 25.00/BX
17. Tylenol, 50 individual packets of 2 500 mg Box 50 Medique, 49733 $ 22.25/BX
18. Hanq Lotlon, greaseless, non-smudging, skin Case 5 Medique, 22418 $ 29 50/CS

conditioner, 24 tubes per case
19. Ointment, Triple Antibiotic, 10-ounce tube Each 24 Medique, 22335 $ 12.25/BX

1 Box = 144 each| Box 1

20 Hydrogen Peroxide Solution, 16 fluid ounces Each 100 Medique, 25711 $ 2.95/EA
21 Eye Drops, 15ml Each 100 Medique, 49566 $ 3.25/EA




Jackson County, Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 23-030

Page 1 of 2
NO. DESCRIPTION UM g,f,;r( MANUFACTURER BID UNIT PRICE
22. Ivy Block Lotion, 4-ounce bottle Each 48 Medique, 8360 $ 7.00/EA
23. . _
Tecnu Outdoor Cleanser, Poison Ivy \K{ag(})lx - 4 each %g()e(h 1‘? Medique, 23202 $ 5.25/BX
24. Calagel Anti-Itch Gel, 6-ounce bottle Each 24 First Aid Only, 90953 $ 10.50/EA
25. Dust Masks, disposable, soft flexible, lightweight, Box 25 Honeywell, 14110094CC S 6.50/BX
50 per box
26. Knuckle Bandages, 100 per box Box 100 First Aid Only, H125 $ 9.25/BX
27 Fingertip Bandages, 500 per box Box 100 First Aid Only, G127 $ 9.00/BX
28. Adhesive Bandages, 100 per box, 17 x 3147 Box 100 First Aid Only, G122 $ 5.00/BX
GRAND TOTAL | §  33387.00
29. Miscellaneous Catalog Order, state discount off manufacturer’s suggested list price for each Discount Offered
manufacturer or category, use additional pages if necessary, to complete your bid
A.
All Manufacturers on our website conney.com 10 %
B.
%
C.
%

NOTE: To be considered for award of miscellaneous catalog items, the Successful Bidder(s) must complete Item No. 29. If no
discount is offered, you must indicate a zero (0) or NONE. If you are offering different discounts by manufacturer, category, or price
list, use additional pages as necessary to complete your bid.

Delivery Time after receipt of order: 2-10 days

Minimum Order for delivery (if applicable):

Webpage for Miscellaneous Catalog Items (ifapplicable):

www.conney.com

CERTIFICATION

SIGNATURE: 7%5@[# }V’a,wlu,m

DATE: 5/5/2023

NAME: Holly Hawkins (Print or Type) | PHONE: ~ 913-928-2033
TITLE: Inside Sales Representative (Print or Type) | MOBILE:
COMPANY NAME: Anixter Inc. (Print or Type) | FAX:

EMAIL ADDRESS:  Holly.Hawkins@anixter.com

(Print or Type)




Jackson County, Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 23-030

Page 1 of 2
Bidders Quotation Sheet
Safety Equipment & Supplies
NO. DESCRIPTION UM g,f,;r( MANUFACTURER BID UNIT PRICE
1. Safety Glasses, workers grade w/ side shield, black 206.26
plastic frame w/ single piece polycarbonate lens Box 125 $ 144EA/CS
that is available in several tints, 10/box Medline Item NON24770
2. Silicone Lens Station, large disposable lens
. . 3 . 26.35
cleaning station w/ large tissues and 16-ounce anti- | Each 24 $ EACH
fog, anti-static silicone cleaning solution Medline Item SPVS483
3. . 193.23
Jersey Gloves, brown, 9-ounce Pair 200 Medline Item WCH750 $ 300PR/CS
4. . ” . 22.58
Predaflex Industrial Strength Rubber Gloves, 14 Pair 50 Medline Ttem CS16LH $ 50EA/BX
> Latex Disposable Gloves, powder free, 100 per $119.07
Box 75 $
box ) 1000EA/BX
Medline Item CUR8105
6. Rain Overalls, yellow, plain front, elastic
suspenders Fach >0 No Bid 25EA/CS
- — Medline Ttem NONCVISUL, NONCVISUXI [ 47,73, XL-48.36,
7. Coveralls, dlsposablq, white, zipper front, Case 50 |NONCVISOXXL. NONCVIS0XXXL. $;XL7-Z;2)(§,L3XL-SO.55,
spunbonded olefin, sizes 1 —4X, 25 per cases NONCV150XXXXL 4X1-5571
8. Earmuffs, hearing protection, wire headband and 379.50
pivoting cups, wide softly padded headband and Each 50 $ 10EA/CS
vinyl covered cushions Medline Item MMMH6FVCS
9. Safety Vests — required sizes M — 5XL, breathable Medline Items: LGAFR16002GM 9.73 FOR ALL SIZES
. . . . LGAFR16002G, LGAFR16002GXL
nylon fluorescent lime with 2-inch extra-wide LGAR16002G2XL EACH
wraparound sewn silver reflective 3M Scotch lite Each 100 |LGARI16002G3XL $
striping for 360-degree visibility, ANSI approved, LGAR16002G4XL
ISEA-107-1999, Class 2, Level 2, and zipper front EGARIG002GSAT
10. Saw Wrap Chaps — required sizes 327, 36” and
407, 1000 denier Cordura nylon outer shell;
SwedePro/EngTex jamming protective pads; outer
fabric to be water, oil, snake and snap resistant; Each 10 $
wrap to be small fiber; adjustable fit at legs;
Orange: OSHA approved for leg protection and
launderable NO BID
11. Lumbar B . . Each 50 $ 12.19
umbar Braces, various sizes ac Medline Item ORT22000 EACH
12. 542.15
Hard Hats Bach | 25 | \tediine Item EDB3OWHR S 20earcs
13. Standard Assortment, 36-unit First Aid Kit Each 5 ) $ 30.07
Medline Item NONFAK200 EACH
14. .. e . . 30.07
Federal Aviation, 24-unit First Aid Kit Each 5 Medline Item NONFAK200 $ EACH
15. Johnson & Johnson, 50-unit, 15%” x 14%4” x 5- Each 5 S 107.00
9/16” First Aid Kit Medline Item NONFAK300 EACH
16. . C g 28.08
Advil, 50 individual packets of 2, 200 mg Box 50 Medline item OTC10013 $ 250 PK/BOX
17. T 27.17
Tylenol, 50 individual packets of 2 500 mg Box 50 Medline Ttem OTC 17513 $550 PK/BX
18. Hand Lotion, greaseless, non-smudging, skin C 5 $ 27.96
conditioner, 24 tubes per case ase Medline Item MSC095330 12EA/CS
19. . . e 18.96
Ointment, Triple Antibiotic, 10-ounce tube Each 24 Medline Ttem CUR001231 $ 12EA/CS
20. . . . 7.95
Hydrogen Peroxide Solution, 16 fluid ounces Each 100 | \fedline Ttem MDS0980017 $ 12EA/BOX
21. 16.35
Eye Drops, 15ml Each 100 $EACH

Medline Item 0023-3240-15




Jackson County, Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 23-030

Page 1 of 2
NO. DESCRIPTION UM S%T( MANUFACTURER BID UNIT PRICE
22. Ivy Block Lotion, 4-ounce bottle Each 48 NO BID $
23. Tecnu Outdoor Cleanser, Poison Ivy Wash Each 48 NO BID $
24. . 29.39
Calagel Anti-Itch Gel, 6-ounce bottle Each 24 Medline Item TEBFG10012Z $ 144EA/BOX
25. Dust Masks, disposable, soft flexible, lightweight, Box 25 $ 9.15
50 per box © Medline Item NON27381Z S0EA/BOX
26. 2.30
Knuckle Bandages, 100 per box Box 100 Medline Ttem NON255027 $ 1 00EA/BOX
27. . . 44.56
Fingertip Bandages, 500 per box Box 100 Medline Item NON25524 $ 600EA/CS
2.07
28. Adhesive Bandages, 100 per box, 17 x 35" Box 100 Medline Ttem PRM25600H $ 100EA/BOX
GRAND TOTAL | §
29. Miscellaneous Catalog Order, state discount off manufacturer’s suggested list price for each Discount Offered
manufacturer or category, use additional pages if necessary, to complete your bid
A.
Medline Brand Items 30 %
B.
Non-Medline Brand Items 25 %
C.
%

NOTE: To be considered for award of miscellaneous catalog items, the Successful Bidder(s) must complete Item No. 29. If no
discount is offered, you must indicate a zero (0) or NONE. If you are offering different discounts by manufacturer, category, or price
list, use additional pages as necessary to complete your bid.

Delivery Time after receipt of order: __ 2 days for in stock items

Minimum Order for delivery (if applicable): N/A

Webpage for Miscellaneous Catalog Items (ifapplicable): WWW.MEDLINE.COM

CERTIFICATION

=1
SIGNATURE: / } ) DATE:  05/02/2023
N
NAME: Chris Powers (Print or Type) | PHONE:  800-633-5463
TITLE: VP of Government Sales (Print or Type) | MOBILE:
COMPANY NAME: Medline Industries, LP (Print or Type) | FAX:
EMAIL ADDRESS:  govbids@medline.com (Print or Type)




Jackson County, Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 23-030

Page 1 of 2
Bidders Quotation Sheet
Safety Equipment & Supplies
NO. DESCRIPTION UM S%T( MANUFACTURER BID UNIT PRICE
1. Safety Glasses, workers grade w/ side shield, black
plastic frame w/ single piece polycarbonate lens Box 125 | R e R R ke =Y | $.97 EA
that is available in several tints, 10/box
2. Silicone Lens Station, large disposable lens
cleaning station w/ large tissues and 16-ounce anti- | Each 24 gf&ﬁ?ﬁégﬁk%%ﬁ“s $ 10.78 EA
fog, anti-static silicone cleaning solution
3. Jersey Gloves, brown, 9-ounce Pair 200 #groNggéLBMRp,‘\lN JgéggEY $ .76 PR
4 Predaflex Industrial Strength Rubber Gloves, 14” | Pair 50 | MR oNTED NTRILE G aRONYLET | $ 6.18 PR
5. .
SHOWA BEST GLOVE INC (S, M, L, XL
ﬁ(&:}t{ex Disposable Gloves, powder free, 100 per Box 75 SHOWA BEST CLOVEING |_d\(’EE ) $ 8.00 BX
6. Rain Overalls, yellow, plain front, elastic MCR SAFETY 200BPM BIB
suspenders Y P Each 50 OVERALLS M, L, XL $ 5.49 EA
i ite, zi ANSELL 817005 WH20-B-92-103-03,
7. Coveralls, dlsposablq, white, zipper front, Case 50 BOUND COLLARED CVRLL WHT; $5.92 EA
spunbonded olefin, sizes 1 —4X, 25 per cases M, L, XL, 2X, 3X, 4X, 25/CS
8. Earmuffs, hearing protection, wire headband and HONEYWELL SAFETY PRODUCTS
pivoting cups, wide softly padded headband and Each 50 QM24+ EAR MUEF NRR 25 QUIET $ 14.10 EA
vinyl covered cushions
9. Safety Vests — required sizes M — 5XL, breathable
nylon fluorescent lime with 2-inch extra-wide RADIANS MESH CLASS 2 LXL LIME
wraparound sewn silver reflective 3M Scotch lite Each 100 SVE1-2ZGM-M-5X ECONOMY VEST $ 436 EA
striping for 360-degree visibility, ANSI approved,
ISEA-107-1999, Class 2, Level 2, and zipper front
10. Saw Wrap Chaps — required sizes 327, 36” and
407, 1000 denier Cordura nylon outer shell;
SwedePro/EngTex jamming protective pads; outer
fabric to be water, oil, snake and snap resistant; Each 10 NO BID $
wrap to be small fiber; adjustable fit at legs;
Orange: OSHA approved for leg protection and
launderable
11. . . ERGODYNE 11103 - 11107 BACK
Lumbar Braces, various sizes Each 50 SUPPORTS, STANDARD $19.20 EA
(M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL)
12. BULLARD TROUGH WHITE 51WHP
Hard Hats Each 25 4PT PINLK CAP W/RAIN 51WHP $ 7.85EA
13. o o CERTIFIED SAFETY MANUFACTURING
Standard Assortment, 36-unit First Aid Kit Each 5 CLASS B WHITE PLASTIC, K615-017 $ 80.66 EA
36PW FIRST AID KIT
14. Federal Aviation, 24-unit First Aid Kit Each 5 NO BID $
15. Johnson & JOhnSOH, 50-unit, 15%” x 1457 x 5- FIRST AID ONLY, ANSI CI A+ First Aid
9/16” First Aid Kit Each S Kit for 50 People, 183 Pieces, Plastic Case | 5 07 -91 EA
ACME UNITED CORPORATION Aduvil
16. Advil, 50 individual packets of 2, 200 mg Box 50 Ibuprofen Tablets, Two-Pack, v $18.33 BX
50 Packs/Box MFG BXAVL50BX
17. . TYLENOL - MCNEIL JOHNSON&JOHNSON
Tylenol, 50 individual packets of 2 500 mg Box 50 Eétéa Slzr?ggth Caplets, Two-Pack, $23.20 BX
aCKS/BOoX
i - i i DIAL, TRANSMACRO AMENITIES
8. Hand. Lotlon, greaseless, non-smudging, skin Case 5 Hand and Body Lotion, 0.75 oz, Bottle, $149.70 CS
conditioner, 24 tubes per case 288/Carton 12190-71
19. Ointment, Triple Antibiotic, 10-ounce tube Each 24 ,J\ggs'\:)%ﬁr!\‘ ﬁ]i{gm\ésgmment, 1ozTube | $12.82 EA
20 Hydrogen Peroxide Solution, 16 fluid ounces Each 100 NO BID $
21| Eye Drops, 15ml Each | 100 | certified R521-003 10/cs $ 1.35EA
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NO. DESCRIPTION UM (l;"f‘;r{ MANUFACTURER BID UNIT PRICE
22. Ivy Block Lotion, 4-ounce bottle Each 48 NO BID $
23. Tecnu Outdoor Cleanser, Poison Ivy Wash Each 48 ;ﬁ?snoun?\fﬂ/?/grsﬁ leanser $ 4.24 EA
24 Calagel Anti-Itch Gel, 6-ounce bottle Each 24 NO BID $
25. Dust Masks, disposable, soft flexible, lightweight, LOUIS M GERSON CO INC
50 per box b s s Box 25 Nuisance Dust Mask 1501 50/BX $ 7.96 BX
26. CERTIFIED SAFETY MANUFACTURING
Knuckle Bandages, 100 per box Box 100  |R220-220 CERTI-STRIP WOVEN KNUCKLE $ 5.75 BX
COTTON STANDARD BROWN 50/BX
) . . CERTIFIED SAFETY MANUFACTURING
27 Fingertip Bandages, 500 per box Box 100 |R220-239 CERTI-STRIPS METAL DETECT] $ 5.75 BX
BLUE FINGERTIP BNDGE 10BX/50, 500/C8
28. . CERTIFIED SAFETY MANUFACTURING
Adhesive Bandages, 100 per box, 17 x 35" Box 100 R220-103 CERTI STRIPS BANDAGE $ 3.25BX
VINYL 1X3 TAN
GRAND TOTAL | $ 9404.61
29. Miscellaneous Catalog Order, state discount off manufacturer’s suggested list price for each Discount Offered
manufacturer or category, use additional pages if necessary, to complete your bid
A. . . . .
Discount is 30% off Catalog List Price 30 o
B.
%
C.
%

NOTE: To be considered for award of miscellaneous catalog items, the Successful Bidder(s) must complete Item No. 29. If no
discount is offered, you must indicate a zero (0) or NONE. If you are offering different discounts by manufacturer, category, or price
list, use additional pages as necessary to complete your bid.

Delivery Time after receipt of order: 3 Business Days from Receipt of Order

$0.00

Minimum Order for delivery (if applicable):

Webpage for Miscellaneous Catalog Items (ifapplicable): _https://netcep.com/

CERTIFICATION

ﬁ m /
SIGNATURE: / /M/l(%&—\ DATE: 5/8/2023
NAME: Courtné; Sullivan (Print or Type) | PHONE: 816-453-8900
TITLE: Director of Sales (Print or Type) | MOBILE: 816-648-4334
COMPANY NAME: RJ Kool Company of Missouri DBA Controlled Enviroment Products (Print or Type) | FAX: 816-453-7077

EMAIL ADDRESS: ¢-sullivan@netcep.com (Print or Type)
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