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Completed by County Counselor’s Office 

Action Requested: Resolution Res.Ord No.: 21282 

Sponsor(s): Charlie Franklin Legislature Meeting Date: 5/22/2023 

Introduction 

Action Items: ['Authorize', 'Award'] 

Project/Title: 

Awarding a Seven (7) Month Term and Supply Contract for the furnishing of Aggregate Materials (Sand) 
for use by Various County Departments to Capital Sand Company, Inc of Jefferson City, Missouri under 
the terms and conditions of Missouri Department of Transportation Contract No. IFB605KC23001300; an 
existing governmental contract. 

Request Summary 

Various County Departments require a Term and Supply Contract for the furnishing of Aggregate 
Material (Sand). Invitation to Bid 81-16 expired and The Purchasing Department issued Invitation to Bid 
No. 15-22 and No. 57-22 for this need but no award was given for several reasons. The use of the 
Missouri Department of Transportation Contract No. IFB605KC2223001300 is in response to the need 
for Aggregate Material (Sand) for the Parks + Rec Department as well as the Public Works Department. 
The requested term length of this contract is to run concurrent with the Missouri Department of 
Transportation Contract and is bid annually for solicitation. The Purchasing Department will look into 
the new Term and Supply contract in 2024 once it has been made public by MoDOT. The MoDOT 
contract is attached. 

The estimated annual usage of this contract is $70,000. This award is made on a “As Needed” basis and 
does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specific 
purchase(s) is subject to annual appropriations. 

Pursuant to Section 1030.4 of the Jackson County Code, the Purchasing Department and the using 
Departments recommend the utilization of Missouri Department of Transportation for the furnishing of 
Aggregate Material (Sand) for use by various County Departments to Capital Sand of Jefferson City, MO 
under the terms and conditions of Missouri Department of Transportation Contract No. 
IFB605KC223001300, an existing government contract. 

Compliance has been checked and the vendor is in compliance. 

Contact Information 

Department: Finance Submitted Date: 5/5/2023 

Name: Keith E. Allen Email: keallen@jacksongov.org 

Title: Senior Buyer Phone: 816-881-3465

Resolution No.: 21282
Sponsor:  Charlie Franklin
Date:  May 22, 2023
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Budget Information 

Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year: $   0 

Amount previously authorized this fiscal year: $   0 

Total amount authorized after this legislative action: $     

Is it transferring fund? No 

Single Source Funding: 

Fund: Department: Line Item Account: Amount: 

   !Unexpected End of 
Formula 

 

 

Prior Legislation 

Prior Ordinances 

Ordinance: Ordinance date: 

  

Prior Resolution 

Resolution: Resolution date: 

19470 May 1, 2017 

 

Purchasing 

Does this RLA include the purchase or lease of 
supplies, materials, equipment or services? 

Yes 

Chapter 10 Justification: Fixed Price Contract 

Core 4 Tax Clearance Completed: Not Applicable 

Certificate of Foreign Corporation Received: Yes 

Have all required attachments been included in 
this RLA? 

Yes 

 

Compliance 

Certificate of Compliance 

In Compliance 

Minority, Women and Veteran Owned Business Program 

Goals Not Applicable for following reason: Contract is with another government agency 

MBE:    .00%  

WBE:    .00%  

VBE:     .00%  

Prevailing Wage 

Not Applicable  
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Fiscal Information 

 This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific 
amount.  The availability of funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as each 
using agency places its order. 
 

 

History 

Submitted by Finance requestor: Keith E. Allen on 5/5/2023. Comments: 
 
Approved by Department Approver Bob Crutsinger on 5/9/2023 10:55:44 AM. Comments: 
 
 
Approved by Purchasing Office Approver Barbara J. Casamento on 5/9/2023 11:56:36 AM. Comments: 
 
 
Approved by Compliance Office Approver Jaime Guillen on 5/9/2023 1:21:15 PM. Comments: 
 
 
Approved by Budget Office Approver David B. Moyer on 5/9/2023 1:53:02 PM. Comments: 
 
 
Approved by Executive Office Approver Sylvya Stevenson on 5/10/2023 4:19:19 PM. Comments: 
 
 
Approved by Counselor's Office Approver Jamesia Manning on 5/18/2023 10:06:36 AM. Comments: 
 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Solicitation Number: IFB605KC23001300
Aggregate (Plant Pick-Up)

 

MoDOT Invitation to Bid (IFBR)

MoDOT - KC
 

December 01, 2022 - December 21, 2022



General Header Information

 

No. IFB605KC23001300
Title: Aggregate (Plant Pick-Up)
Type: Formal MoDOT Invitation to Bid (IFBR)
Who can see this bid?: Everyone
Start Date: Dec 01, 2022
End Date: Dec 21, 2022
Vendor Q&A Start Date:
Vendor Q&A End Date:
Estimated Total Value:
Who can respond to this bid? : All Vendors
Description: The Missouri Department of Transportation Kansas City District is

seeking vendors to supply plant pricing on various aggregate materials
for drainage, routine maintenance and pavement repairs. This is for pick
up only on as needed, if needed basis, NOT delivery. The bid will be
awarded on a firm fixed pricing "multiple award" basis. The contract
period extends from 01/01/2023 through 12/31/23.

Justification: Essential Maintenance purchase of Aggregates within the KC District on
as needed, when needed basis at quarries.

Delivery Terms: Free On Board Destination
Delivery Notes: Orders may be placed by various locations with the MODOT Kansas City

District. See attached documents. All costs for delivery (freight, handling,
etc.) shall be included in unit price bid.

Payment Terms: Net 30 Days
Payment Notes: Payment will be made in full after the completion of all deliveries and

receipt of a correct invoice. A single invoice is requested when all work is
finished. No partial payments will be made.

Contact Information: MoDOT - KC
MODOT Kansas City District
District Procurement
Preferred Contact by email to KCProcurement@modot.mo.gov
2050 NE Independence Ave
Lee's Summit MO, 64064 United States
Tel: 816-347-4113 Nancy Engelhart
Tel: 816-347-2236 Chance Fisher
Tel: 816-347-4103 Jody Jordan
Fax: 816-622-0070

Contact Details: If you have any questions, please contact:
MODOT Kansas City District
District Procurement
Preferred Contact by email to KCProcurement@modot.mo.gov
2050 NE Independence Ave
Lee's Summit MO, 64064 United States
Tel: 816-347-4113 Nancy Engelhart
Tel: 816-347-2236 Chance Fisher
Tel: 816-347-4103 Jody Jordan
Fax: 816-622-0070
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Solicitation Header Fields:

Section Title : NOTICE

Field Name Response

Vendor Responsibility -

Section Title : VENDOR'S INSTRUCTIONS

Field Name Response

Submission of Bids -

Section Title : MODOT Section Numbering

Field Name Response

Section Numbering -

IFB605KC23001300 State of Missouri
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Solicitation Requirements:

Section Title : MoDOT Instructions for Submitting a Response

Field Name Response

Instructions for Submitting a Response -

Section Title : MoDOT STANDARD SOLICITATION PROVISIONS

Field Name Response

1.1.  Solicitation Authority -

1.2  Bids / Quotes to be Submitted by

Officer or Employee

-

1.3  MHTC Rights Reserved -

1.4  Personal Privacy Protection Act

Notification

-

Section Title : MoDOT IFB GENERAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

Field Name Response

2.1 Definitions -

2.2 Nondiscrimination -

2.3 Contract/Purchase Order -

2.4 Applicable Laws and Regulations -

2.5 Open Competition and IFB Document -

2.6 Preparation of Bids -

2.7 Submission of Bids -

2.8 Bid Opening -

2.9 Evaluation and Award -

2.10 Executive Order -

2.11 Preferences -

2.12 Cancellation of Contract -

2.13 Bankruptcy or Insolvency -

2.14 Warranty -

2.15 Status of Independent Contractor -

2.16 Non-Waiver -

2.17 Indemnification -

2.18 Right of Acceptance and/or Rejection -

2.19 Inspection and Acceptance -

2.20 Invoicing and Payment -

IFB605KC23001300 State of Missouri
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2.21 Conflict of Interest -

2.22 Tax Exempt Status -

2.23 Anti-Discrimination Against Israel Act

Certification

-

2.24 The Domestic Products Procurement

Act

-

IFB605KC23001300 State of Missouri
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Solicitation Questionnaire:

Section Title : Cooperative Procurement

Is your firm willing to offer such

cooperative purchasing for Missouri

counties, cities or other political entities?

Y

If the price varies throughout the state

because of different delivery destinations,

please indicate the price FOB Shipping

Point.

Missouri City

Indicate the deadline date orders will be

accepted.

12/31/2023

Section Title : M/WBE Participation

List all certified M/WBE vendors utilized in

the fulfillment of this bid.  Include

percentage of participation for

subcontractors and identify the M/WBE

certifying agency.  If not applicable, enter

N/A in the required field.   

N/A

Section Title : SDV/E Preference

List the names and addresses of an SDV or

SDVE providing products or services in

relation to this bid.   If not applicable, enter

N/A in the required field.   

N/A

IFB605KC23001300 State of Missouri
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No. Item Supplier Alternati

ve

Prod.

No

Mfr.

Name

Mfr.

No

Delivery

Date

Unit

Bid

Total

Qty

Awarde

d Item

Qty

Item Total Evaluated

 Item

Total

1 Aggregate Bit Mat for

Bituminous Surfaces

(Spec 1)

AGGRE31200

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

2 Aggregate 5/16'

Screening

AGGRE31200

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

3 Aggregate 3/8"

Screening

AGGRE31200

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

4 Aggregate 1/4"

Maintenance Chips

AGGRE31200

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

5 Aggregate for Seal

Coats 1/2" or 3/8"

Chips (Spec. 4)

AGGRE31210

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

6 Aggregate for Seal

Coats 1/2" or 3/8"

Clean Chips Grade B

AGGRE31210

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

IFB605KC23001300 State of Missouri
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No. Item Supplier Alternati

ve

Prod.

No

Mfr.

Name

Mfr.

No

Delivery

Date

Unit

Bid

Total

Qty

Awarde

d Item

Qty

Item Total Evaluated

 Item

Total

7 Aggregate 1" Base -

Surface Stone (Spec

8) AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

8 Aggregate 1" Base -

Surface Stone

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

9 Aggregate 1" Base -

1" Minus

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

10 Aggregate 1"

Commercial Base

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

11 Aggregate 2" Base

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

12 Aggregate 2" Base /

2" Minus

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

13 Aggregate

Screenings

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

IFB605KC23001300 State of Missouri
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No. Item Supplier Alternati

ve

Prod.

No

Mfr.

Name

Mfr.

No

Delivery

Date

Unit

Bid

Total

Qty

Awarde

d Item

Qty

Item Total Evaluated

 Item

Total

14 Aggregate Coarse

Screenings

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

15 Aggregate Lime

Screenings

(Agricultural)

AGGRE31105

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

16 Aggregate Lime

Screenings (Not

Agricultural)

AGGRE31105

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

17 Aggregate Coarse

Lime Screenings

AGGRE31105

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

18 Aggregate Ag Lime

AGGRE31105

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

19 Aggregate Waste

Screenings (Crush

Run Fill Rock)

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

IFB605KC23001300 State of Missouri
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No. Item Supplier Alternati

ve

Prod.

No

Mfr.

Name

Mfr.

No

Delivery

Date

Unit

Bid

Total

Qty

Awarde

d Item

Qty

Item Total Evaluated

 Item

Total

20 Aggregate Clean

Coarse 3/8"

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

21 Aggregate Clean

Rock 1/2"

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

22 Aggregate Clean

Rock 5/8"

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

23 Aggregate Clean

Rock 3/4"

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

24 Aggregate Clean

Rock 1"

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

25 Aggregate Road

Rock 1"

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

26 Aggregate Dirty Rock

1" AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

IFB605KC23001300 State of Missouri



Page:12

No. Item Supplier Alternati

ve

Prod.

No

Mfr.

Name

Mfr.

No

Delivery

Date

Unit

Bid

Total

Qty

Awarde

d Item

Qty

Item Total Evaluated

 Item

Total

27 Aggregate Clean

Rock 1 1/2"

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

28 Aggregate Road

Rock 1 1/2"

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

29 Aggregate Clean

Rock 2"

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

30 Aggregate Clean

Rock 3"

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

31 Aggregate Clean

Rock 2-3"

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

32 Aggregate Clean

Rock 4-6"

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

33 Aggregate Clean

Rock 6-9"

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

IFB605KC23001300 State of Missouri
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No. Item Supplier Alternati

ve

Prod.

No

Mfr.

Name

Mfr.

No

Delivery

Date

Unit

Bid

Total

Qty

Awarde

d Item

Qty

Item Total Evaluated

 Item

Total

34 Aggregate 4" Base /

4" Minus

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

35 Aggregate Surface

Stone 1" Mailbox

Rock (Spec 3)

AGGRE31222

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

36 Aggregate Crushed

Stone 1" Road Rock

(Spec 3)

AGGRE31222

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

37 Aggregate Surface

Stone 1" (Gravel)

AGGRE31222

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

38 Aggregate Surface

Stone 1" (Crushed

Stone)

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

39 Aggregate Surface

Stone 1" (Chat)

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

IFB605KC23001300 State of Missouri
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No. Item Supplier Alternati

ve

Prod.

No

Mfr.

Name

Mfr.

No

Delivery

Date

Unit

Bid

Total

Qty

Awarde

d Item

Qty

Item Total Evaluated

 Item

Total

40 Sand, Natural Creek

Washed (Spec 6)

AGGRE31230

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company Inc

N/A $16.50

0000

1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$16.50000

0

$16.50000

0

41 Sand, Manufactured

(Fine Aggregate)

AGGRE31230

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

42 Aggregate Snow and

Ice Control Chips

(Spec 5)

AGGRE31255

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

43 Aggregate Rubble or

Shot Rock (All Sizes)

AGGRE31260

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

44 Quarry Run

AGGRE31260

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

45 Aggregate Box Rock

4"-6" AGGRE31260

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

46 Aggregate Box Rock

6"-9" AGGRE31260

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

IFB605KC23001300 State of Missouri
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No. Item Supplier Alternati

ve

Prod.

No

Mfr.

Name

Mfr.

No

Delivery

Date

Unit

Bid

Total

Qty

Awarde

d Item

Qty

Item Total Evaluated

 Item

Total

47 Aggregate Ditch Liner

AGGRE31260

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

48 Aggregate 1"-6" Rip

Rap predominately 3"

- Ditch Liner

AGGRE31260

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

49 Aggregate Ditch Liner

4" AGGRE31260

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

50 Aggregate 3-10" Rip

Rap predominately 6"

- Ditch Liner

AGGRE31260

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

51 Aggregate 4-20" Rip

Rap predominately

12" - Ditch Liner

AGGRE31260

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

52 Aggregate 18" Rip

Rap AGGRE31260

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

IFB605KC23001300 State of Missouri
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No. Item Supplier Alternati

ve

Prod.

No

Mfr.

Name

Mfr.

No

Delivery

Date

Unit

Bid

Total

Qty

Awarde

d Item

Qty

Item Total Evaluated

 Item

Total

53 Aggregate 6-28" Rip

Rap predominately

19" - Ditch Liner

AGGRE31260

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

54 Aggregate 19" Rip

Rap 24"

AGGRE31260

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

55 Aggregate Rock

Blanket

AGGRE31260

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

56 Aggregate Rock

Blanket (40%, 1 cubic

ft. or more)

AGGRE31260

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

57 Aggregate Rock

Blanket (60%, 1 cubic

ft. or more)

AGGRE31260

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

58 3-Foot Rock

predominately 3' with

0% < 2' and 0% > 4'

AGGRE31260

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

IFB605KC23001300 State of Missouri
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59 Aggregate Concrete

Stone AGGRE31260

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

60 Recycled Concrete 1

1/2 MINUS

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

61 Recycled Asphalt

Milling AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

62 Gabion

AGGRE31260

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

63 Missouri State Spec

(Natural Sand)

AGGRE31230

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company Inc

N/A $16.50

0000

1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$16.50000

0

$16.50000

0

64 Natural Sand For

Concrete

AGGRE31230

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company Inc

N/A $16.50

0000

1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$16.50000

0

$16.50000

0

65 Natural Sand For

Asphalt

AGGRE31230

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company Inc

N/A $16.50

0000

1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$16.50000

0

$16.50000

0

66 Aggregate 6" Base/6"

MINUS

AGGRE31260

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

IFB605KC23001300 State of Missouri
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67 Aggregate 3/4" rock -

1" X 1/8"

AGGRE31220

Specification Number:

 

Capital Sand

Company

Inc *

N/A 1.000

ton (us);

or short

ton

(uk/us);

$0.000000 $0.000000

* Intentional No Bid

IFB605KC23001300 State of Missouri


