
Jackson County Health Department 
                 June 29 – July 6, 2022 

 

COVID-19 
Data 
More in depth data can be 
found on the JACOHD 
dashboard. 

 

JACOHD 
• Total Cases –  71,846* 
• Total Deaths – 797* 

 
*Data not updated due to holiday week. 

Totals by Week: 
• Cases – * 
• Deaths – * 

 
**Note: Cases from Independence, MO have been removed 
from the Jackson County Health Department data dashboard. 
There has been a delay in data reporting from the state level. 
Therefore, these data are provisional and are subject to change.  

Current 
Outbreaks 

Blue Hills Rest Home – 33 
Hidden Lake Care Center – 17 
Ignite Medical Resort Blue Springs – 12 
John Knox Village Care Center – 33 
Oak Grove Nursing and Rehab – 11 
Polaris Health and Wellness of LS – 17 

**Outbreaks are considered concluded after two incubation 
periods (28 days) since the onset date of the last case of COVID-
19, and are thus removed from the list. 

JACOHD/ 
Jackson 
County 
Vaccine Data 
Jackson County vaccine data 
can be found here.  
 

JACOHD 
• Total doses administered – 89,163 

 
Jackson County  

• 71.2% of Jackson County residents have initiated vaccination; 58.1% have 
completed vaccination 

o Jackson County Population: 703,011 
• 500,694 people have received at least one dose; 408,109 people are fully 

vaccinated  
 
** On April 1, 2022, Missouri updated its data dashboard and removed COVID-19 vaccine data. The COVID-19 vaccine data 
reflected is from the CDC’s website, which encompasses all of Jackson County, including Kansas City and Independence. 

JACOHD/UH 
Sponsored 
Testing 

Thursday, July 7, 2022 
Friday, July 8, 2022 
Monday, July 11, 2022 
Tuesday, July 12, 2022 
Wednesday, July 13, 2022 
 
Symptomatic Testing: 

9 a.m. – 3 p.m. – 313 S Liberty St, Independence 
9 a.m. – 3 p.m. – 313 S Liberty St, Independence 
9 a.m. – 3 p.m. – 313 S Liberty St, Independence 
9 a.m. – 3 p.m. – 313 S Liberty St, Independence 
9 a.m. – 3 p.m. – 313 S Liberty St, Independence 
 
Call 816-404-2273 

JACOHD 
Vaccine 
Clinics 

Thursday, July 7, 2022 
Friday, July 8, 2022 
Monday, July 11, 2022 
Tuesday, July 12, 2022 
Wednesday, July 13, 2022 
 

9 a.m. – 6 p.m. – 313 S Liberty St, Independence 
9 a.m. – 4 p.m. – 313 S Liberty St, Independence  
9 a.m. – 4 p.m. – 313 S Liberty St, Independence 
9 a.m. – 4 p.m. – 313 S Liberty St, Independence 
9 a.m. – 4 p.m. – 313 S Liberty St, Independence 
 
Residents can visit jacohd.org/events to find clinic registration and walk-in hours. 

PPE Supply The supply rate meets the demand rate. 

JCDC Testing JACOHD is continually working with JCDC on reporting and investigation. 

Regional 
Coordination 
Meetings 

Health Care Coalition Steering Committee Meeting, Public Health Risk Communication 
Coordination Meeting, Hospitals & Public Health Meeting, Communicable Disease COVID-
19 Update Meeting, Missouri Center for Public Health Excellence Meeting, Public Health 
Coordination Meeting, Public Health Directors Meeting, Multi Agency Coordination 
Resource Section Support Meeting, Community Organizations Active in Disaster Meeting 

 

https://jacohd.org/data-dashboard/
https://jacohd.org/data-dashboard/
https://covidvaccine.mo.gov/data/
https://covidvaccine.mo.gov/data/
https://covid.cdc.gov/covid-data-tracker/#county-view?list_select_state=all_states&null=Vaccinations
https://covid.cdc.gov/covid-data-tracker/#county-view?list_select_state=all_states&null=Vaccinations
http://jacohd.org/events
http://jacohd.org/events


Posted:  7/7/2022 8:47 AM 

 

                                                       
COUNTY LEGISLATURE 

JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI 
 

MARY JO SPINO 
 
 

CLERK OF THE COUNTY LEGISLATURE           
415 East 12th Street     201 West Lexington, 2nd Floor 
Kansas City, MO 64106     Independence, MO 64050 
    
 
                                                                                         July 8 – July 14, 2022 
 

7-08-2022 Friday  NO MEETINGS –  
 

7-11-2022 Monday  NO ANTI-CRIME, BUDGET, FINANCE & AUDIT,   
INTER-GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS, JUSTICE & LAW 
ENFORCEMENT, LAND USE, RULES OR 911 
OVERSIGHT COMMITTEE 
 

 9:50 A.M. Health & Environment Committee Meeting – 
Jackson County Courthouse, 415 East 12th Street, 
2nd Floor, Kansas City Legislative Assembly Area 
 

  9:55 A.M. Public Works Committee Meeting – 
Jackson County Courthouse, 415 East 12th Street, 
2nd Floor, Kansas City Legislative Assembly Area 
 

 10:00 A.M. LEGISLATIVE MEETING - 
Jackson County Courthouse, 415 East 12th Street, 
2nd Floor, Kansas City Legislative Assembly Area 
 
Closed Meeting per Resolution #21005 
 

7-12-2022 Tuesday  NO MEETINGS –  
 

7-13-2022 Wednesday 4:00 P.M. 
 

Merit System Commission Quarterly Meeting – 
Meeting held via Zoom. Contact Michelle Chrisman at 
mchrisman@jacksongov.org – 816-881-1204 for more 
information. 
 

7-14-2022 Thursday 10:00 A.M. COMBAT Commission Meeting –  
The meeting will be held via Zoom.  
Meeting ID:  895 7309 8311 
Passcode:  492695 
 
 

Persons with disabilities wishing to participate in the above meetings and who require a reasonable accommodation may 
call the County Clerk’s Office at 881-3242 or 1-800-735-2466 (Missouri Relay).  Forty-eight (48) hour notice is required. 
To put information on Activity Calendar, please contact the County Clerk’s Office by NOON Wednesday of each week. 

 



IN THE COUNTY LEGISLATURE OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI 
 
A RESOLUTION awarding contracts for the replacement of roofs on park structures for 
use by the Parks + Rec Department to Construction Management Services of Olathe, KS, 
and Blue Chip Roofing of Kansas City, MO, under the terms and conditions of Invitation 
to Bid No. 52-22, at an actual aggregate cost to the County not to exceed $149,703.00. 
 
RESOLUTION NO. 21002, July 11, 2022 
 
INTRODUCED BY Tony Miller, County Legislator 
 
 
WHEREAS, the Parks + Rec Department has a need to re-roof several of its structures 

within Fleming Park; and, 

 

WHEREAS, the Director of Finance and Purchasing has solicited formal written bids on 

Bid No. 52-22 for the replacement of these roofs; and, 

 

WHEREAS, a total of fifty-eight notifications were distributed and three responses were 

received; and, 

 

WHEREAS, pursuant to section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, the Directors of 

Finance and Purchasing and Parks + Rec recommend the award of contracts for roof 

replacement to Construction Management Services of Olathe, KS, and Blue Chip Roofing 

of Kansas City (Jackson County), MO, for the reason that they have submitted the lowest 

and best bids; and, 

 

WHEREAS, a split award is recommended to allow for award to the vendor submitting 

the lowest and best bid for each item in the solicitation; now therefore, 

 

BE IT RESOLVED by the County Legislature of Jackson County, Missouri, that award be 



-2- 

made as recommended by the Directors of Finance and Purchasing and Parks + Rec, 

and that the Director of Finance and Purchasing be, and is hereby, authorized to execute 

for the County any documents necessary to the accomplishment of the award; and, 

 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Director of Finance and Purchasing is authorized 

to make all payments, including final payment on the contracts. 

  





Request for Legislative Action 

July 7, 2022 eRLA #556 Page 1 of 4 

Completed by County Counselor’s Office 

Action Requested: Resolution Res.Ord No.: 21002 

Sponsor(s): Tony Miller Legislature Meeting Date: 7/11/2022 

Introduction 

Action Items: ['Award'] 

Project/Title: 

Awarding contracts under Bid No. 52-22 Reroofing of Park Structures to Construction Management 
Services, Olathe, Kansas and Blue Chip Roofing, Kansas City, Missouri. 

Request Summary 

The Parks + Rec Department requires re-roofing of several park structures at Fleming Park. The 
Purchasing Department issued Invitation for Bid No. 52-22; Reroofing of Park Structures to meet those 
needs. A total of fifty-eight (58) notifications were sent out and three (3) responses were received. After 
reviewing the bid tabulation, pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, the Purchasing 
Department and Parks + Rec Department recommend  Construction Management Services of Olathe 
and Blue Chip Roofing, of Kansas City, Mo. as the best bids received.  We recommend splitting the 
award of bid # 52-22 between two bidders as follows: 
We recommend awarding Items#; 1-1, 1-2, 1-3 & 2-2, along with their unit pricing bid, to the apparent 
low bidder, Construction Management Services of Olathe.  We additionally request award of Bid Item 
#2-1; Jacomo Shelter #4, with their unit pricing bid, to the apparent low bidder, Blue Chip Roofing, of 
Kansas City, Mo.  
We also wish to include a Material Allowance for each contract.  We request the Parks Director be 
authorized to spend up to an additional $11,000.00 total to perform any additional work necessary due 
to unforeseen conditions encountered during construction to be split as follows:  A $6,000.00 allowance 
included on the Consrtuction Managment Services contract and $5,000.00 included on the Blue Chip 
Roofing contract. 
Total Bid for Construction Management Services  $ 111,732.00 
Material Allowance  $   6,000.00 
Total C.M.S. Award Amount  $ 117,732.00 
Total Bid for Blue Chip Roofing  $ 26,971.00 
Material Allowance  $   5,000.00 
Total Blue Chip Award Amount  $ 31,971.00 
Combined Total Award Amount  $149,703.00 
The Parks + Rec Department has $150,000.00 in account 003-1608-58020 in the 2022 Operating 
Budget for this expense. 

Contact Information 

Department: Parks + Rec Submitted Date: 6/7/2022 

Res. # 21002
Sponsor: Tony Miller
Date: July 11, 2022



Request for Legislative Action 

July 7, 2022 eRLA #556 Page 2 of 4 

Name: Bruce M. Wilke Email: BWilke@jacksongov.org 

Title: Landscape Architect Phone: 816-503-4802

Budget Information 

Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year: $149,703 

Amount previously authorized this fiscal year: $   0 

Total amount authorized after this legislative action: $149,703 

Is it transferring fund? No 

Single Source Funding: 

Fund: Department: Line Item Account: Amount: 

003 (Park Fund) 1608 (Construction 
Services) 

58020 (Buildings & 
Improvements) 

$149,703 

Prior Legislation 

Prior Ordinances 

Ordinance: Ordinance date: 

Prior Resolution 

Resolution: Resolution date: 

20911 April 4, 2022 

20662 May 3, 2021 

20427 May 18, 2020 

Purchasing 

Does this RLA include the purchase or lease of 
supplies, materials, equipment or services? 

Yes 

Chapter 10 Justification: Formal Bid 

Core 4 Tax Clearance Completed: Yes 

Certificate of Foreign Corporation Received: Yes 

Have all required attachments been included in 
this RLA? 

Yes 

Compliance 

Certificate of Compliance 

In Compliance 

Minority, Women and Veteran Owned Business Program 

Reviewed for Goals: 

MBE:   9.50% 



Request for Legislative Action 

July 7, 2022 eRLA #556 Page 3 of 4 

WBE:  11.70% 

VBE:   .00% Voluntary 

Prevailing Wage 

Construction projects over $75000 ['Separate bid'] 

Fiscal Information 

 There is a balance otherwise unencumbered to the credit of the appropriation to which the
expenditure is chargeable and there is a cash balance otherwise unencumbered.



Request for Legislative Action 

July 7, 2022 eRLA #556 Page 5 o
 

Submitted by Parks + Rec requestor: Bruce M. Wilke on 6/7/2022. Comments: 

Approved by Department Approver Michele Newman on 6/7/2022 3:37:43 PM. Comments: 

Approved by Purchasing Office Approver Barbara J. Casamento on 6/9/2022 12:04:52 PM. Comments: 

Approved by Compliance Office Approver Katie M. Bartle on 6/9/2022 1:24:43 PM. Comments:  Goals 
are waived for Blue Chip Roofing due to their contract having a value of less than $50,000.  KMB 

Returned for more information by Budget Office Approver Mark Lang on 6/9/2022 3:31:47 PM. 
Comments:  On the "Budget Info" tab, please for the $150,000 amount to the top line labeled, "Amount 
authorized by this legislation this fiscal year:" and the second line to 0. 

Submitted by Requestor Bruce M. Wilke on 6/10/2022 7:00:43 AM. Comments:  Corrected as requested 

Approved by Department Approver Michele Newman on 6/15/2022 12:25:40 PM. Comments: 

Approved by Purchasing Office Approver Barbara J. Casamento on 6/15/2022 12:48:37 PM. Comments: 

Approved by Compliance Office Approver Katie M. Bartle on 6/15/2022 2:51:50 PM. Comments: 

Returned for more information by Budget Office Approver Mark Lang on 6/15/2022 3:38:45 PM. 
Comments:  I noticed one other thing.  The total amount requested in the request summary is $149,703, 
but the amounts in the budget section is asking for $1150,000.  Please make these numbers match. 

Submitted by Requestor Bruce M. Wilke on 6/16/2022 8:30:06 AM. Comments:  Budget amount 
corrected. 

Approved by Department Approver Michele Newman on 6/19/2022 2:49:47 PM. Comments: 

Approved by Purchasing Office Approver Barbara J. Casamento on 6/21/2022 11:14:56 AM. Comments: 

Approved by Compliance Office Approver Katie M. Bartle on 6/21/2022 11:50:47 AM. Comments: 

Returned for more information by Budget Office Approver Mark Lang on 6/21/2022 12:24:12 PM. 
Comments:  There were two parts in the Budget Information section where the number needed to be

Page 4 of 4

corrected.  You did the one a the top of the budget info section.  Right below in the "Single Source 
Funding" box, must also match. 



PC#

Date: June 22, 2022 RES #
eRLA ID #: 556 

Org Code/Description Object Code/Description Not to Exceed

003 Park Fund

1608 Construction Services 58020 Buildings & Improvements 149,703$          

149,703$          

Budget Office

Fiscal Note:
This expenditure was included in the Annual Budget.

160822003 000

Page 1 of 1

21002

mlang
Approved







Total Cost

Selected #

Selected ($)

# Selected Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost

1

#1-1 Missouri Town - Riffie House $46,190.00 No Bid No Bid $46,190.00 $46,190.00 $104,317.51 $ 104,317.51

#1-2 Missouri Town - Church $33,392.00 No Bid No Bid $33,392.00 $33,392.00 $ 64,977.46 $ 64,977.46

#1-3 Missouri Town - Settler's Cabin $19,250.00 No Bid No Bid $19,250.00 $19,250.00 $ 46,551.53 $ 46,551.53

2

#2-1 Jacomo Shelter # 4 $26,971.00 $26,971.00 $26,971.00 $43,126.00 $43,126.00 $ 62,532.83 $ 62,532.83

#2-2 Fleming Meeting Hall $12,900.00 $17,583.00 $17,583.00 $12,900.00 $12,900.00 $ 49,379.86 $ 49,379.86

#2-3 Jacomo Marina Parking Lot Restroom $0.00 $15,667.00 $15,667.00 $12,040.00 $12,040.00 $ 37,549.83 $ 37,549.83

#2-4 Jacomo Shelter # 6 $0.00 $34,005.00 $34,005.00 $21,900.00 $21,900.00 $ 88,239.69 $ 88,239.69

#2-5 Jacomo Shelter # 7 $0.00 $23,103.00 $23,103.00 $13,700.00 $13,700.00 $56,951.50 $56,951.50

#2-6 Jacomo Shelter # 10 $0.00 $31,440.00 $31,440.00 $21,900.00 $21,900.00 $ 88,239.69 $ 88,239.69

#0-1 $3.96 $3.96 $7.50 $7.50 $15.17 $15.17

#0-2 $2.10 $2.10 $35.00 $35.00 $11.18 $11.18

Wood Sheathing Tear-Off and Replacement

Wood Fascia Tear-Off and Replacement

Group A - Base Bid Facilities: (3)

Group B - Alternate Bid Facilities: (6)

Kansas City, MO Gardner, KS Kansas City, MO

1 4 0

$ 26,971.0 $ 111,732.0 $0.00

Blue Chip Roofing and 

Waterproofing LLC

Construction 

Management Services, D & S International LLC

$ 44,554.0 $ 154,858.0 $ 327,759.19
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52-22 - Re-Roofing of Park Structures 

 

Project Overview 

Project Details  

Reference ID 52-22 

Project Name Re-Roofing of Park Structures 

Project Owner Katelyn Edgar 

Project Type ITB 

Department Parks + Rec 

Budget $0.00 - $0.00 

Project Description 
Jackson County, Missouri is seeking bids from qualified Contractors to 

Re-Roof Park Structures for the Parks + Rec Department.  

Open Date Apr 25, 2022 10:00 AM CDT 

Close Date May 24, 2022 2:00 PM CDT 
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Seal status 

Requested Information Unsealed on Unsealed by 

Background of Contractor, Item 

5.1.9 
May 24, 2022 2:06 PM CDT Katelyn Edgar 

Information on Contractor's 

Personnel, Item 5.1.10 
May 24, 2022 2:06 PM CDT Katelyn Edgar 

References, Item 5.1.11 May 24, 2022 2:06 PM CDT Katelyn Edgar 

Manufacturer's Specifications, 

Item 5.1.12 
May 24, 2022 2:06 PM CDT Katelyn Edgar 

Warranty Information, Item 

5.1.13 
May 24, 2022 2:06 PM CDT Katelyn Edgar 

Standard Contract May 24, 2022 2:06 PM CDT Katelyn Edgar 

Affidavit May 24, 2022 2:06 PM CDT Katelyn Edgar 

Certificate of Compliance May 24, 2022 2:06 PM CDT Katelyn Edgar 

Statement of Contractor's 

Qualifications 
May 24, 2022 2:06 PM CDT Katelyn Edgar 

Acknowledgment of Receipt of 

Addenda 
May 24, 2022 2:06 PM CDT Katelyn Edgar 

Exhibit F, Bidder's Exceptions May 24, 2022 2:06 PM CDT Katelyn Edgar 

Contractor's Utilization Plan May 24, 2022 2:06 PM CDT Katelyn Edgar 

BidTable for Invitation to Bid No. 

52-22 Group A + B (BT-28QY) 
May 24, 2022 2:06 PM CDT Katelyn Edgar 

BidTable for Invitation to Bid No. 

52-22 Unit Price Schedule (BT-

23QV) 

May 24, 2022 2:06 PM CDT Katelyn Edgar 
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Questions and Answers 

 

Blue Chip Roofing and Waterproofing LLC 

Missing Requested Information 

Katelyn Edgar, May 24, 2022 3:20 PM CDT 

Good Afternoon,   In review of your submitted bid for ITB No. 52-22, there is some missing 

information that needs to be cleared up before consideration:  Item 5.1.4; Statement of Contractor's 

Qualifications, Please complete the attached form and return.  Item 5.1.11; References, Please 

send your References including Contact Person's email address.  If this information is in your 

submitted bid, please indicate where the information can be found. if not, please have this 

information submitted to me (attach to your response here in Bonfire) by 5:00pm CDT on 

Thursday, May 26, 2022. If you have any questions, please feel free to reach out to me.  Thank 

you 

LaTanya Scott, May 24, 2022 4:39 PM CDT 

Hello Katelyn,  I apologize for the oversites and appreciate the opportunity to submit the 

outstanding information.  Please let me know if you have any questions or need anything else.  

Thanks, LaTanya Scott, CEO, President Blue Chip Roofing & Waterproofing, LLC 

LaTanya Scott, May 24, 2022 5:03 PM CDT 

Hello,  Attached are my M/W/D/SLBE Certs as well.  Thanks, LaTanya Scott 

Katelyn Edgar, May 25, 2022 8:47 AM CDT 

Good Morning,   Your submitted documents have been received and accepted. Thank you 

LaTanya Scott, May 25, 2022 9:15 AM CDT 

Good morning Katelyn, Thanks for confirming receipt.  Have a good day!  LaTanya Scott 
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Public Notices 

Pre-Bid Meeting 

Katelyn Edgar, May 10, 2022 11:21 AM CDT 

The Attendance Sheet for the Pre-Bid Meeting held on May 10, 2022 at 9:00am has been 

uploaded under Public Files. 
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Submissions 

Supplier Date Submitted Name Email Confirmation Code 

D & S International LLC 
May 24, 2022 1:44 PM 

CDT 
Sholanda Edwards sholanda@dandsinternationalllc.com MjE1NDYx 

Construction 

Management Services, 

Inc. 

May 24, 2022 11:15 AM 

CDT 
Mike Brock mike@cmsincusa.com MjE1Mzc1 

Blue Chip Roofing and 

Waterproofing LLC 

May 24, 2022 1:46 PM 

CDT 
LaTanya Scott TanyaS@BlueChipRoofingKC.com MjE1NDYz 



 

Generated on May 26, 2022 10:51 AM CDT - Katelyn Edgar 

Page 10 of 39 

Project Criteria 

Criteria Points Description 

A - Proposal 0 pts  

A-1 - Contractor's Background Pass/Fail Including detailed experience in the filed of Roofing.  

A-2 - Contractor's Information Pass/Fail 
Information on Contractor's personnel that will be performing under any resulting 

contract.  

A-3 - References Pass/Fail 
Contractor shall provide three (3) references for similar projects; references to 

include the name of the company, point of contact, and email address.  

A-4 - Manufacturer's Specifications Pass/Fail Manufacturer's detailed specifications on the roofing products being bid.  

A-5 - Warranty Information Pass/Fail Warranty information on the roofing products being bid.  

B - Forms 0 pts  

B-1 - Standard Contract Pass/Fail   

B-2 - Affidavit Pass/Fail   

B-3 - Certificate of Compliance Pass/Fail   
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B-4 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications Pass/Fail   

B-5 - Addenda Pass/Fail   

B-6 - Exhibit F, Bidder's Exceptions Pass/Fail   

B-7 - Contractor's Utilization Plan Pass/Fail   

Total 0 pts  
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Scoring Summary 

 

Active Submissions 

 Total A - Proposal 
A-1 - Contractor's 

Background 

A-2 - Contractor's 

Information 
A-3 - References 

Supplier / 0 pts / 0 pts Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail 

D & S International 

LLC 
0 pts 0 pts Pass Pass Pass 

Construction 

Management 

Services, Inc. 

0 pts 0 pts Pass Pass Pass 

Blue Chip Roofing and 

Waterproofing LLC 
0 pts 0 pts Pass Pass Pass 
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A-4 - Manufacturer's 

Specifications 

A-5 - Warranty 

Information 
B - Forms 

B-1 - Standard 

Contract 
B-2 - Affidavit 

Supplier Pass/Fail Pass/Fail / 0 pts Pass/Fail Pass/Fail 

D & S International 

LLC 
Pass Pass 0 pts Pass Pass 

Construction 

Management 

Services, Inc. 

Pass Pass 0 pts Pass Pass 

Blue Chip Roofing and 

Waterproofing LLC 
Pass Pass 0 pts Pass Pass 
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B-3 - Certificate of 

Compliance 

B-4 - Statement of 

Contractor's 

Qualifications 

B-5 - Addenda 
B-6 - Exhibit F, 

Bidder's Exceptions 

B-7 - Contractor's 

Utilization Plan 

Supplier Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail 

D & S International 

LLC 
Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Construction 

Management 

Services, Inc. 

Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Blue Chip Roofing and 

Waterproofing LLC 
Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass 
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Proposal Scores 

 

D & S International LLC - Scoring Summary 

 

Evaluation Group 1 - Purchasing Evaluation 

 A - Proposal 
A-1 - Contractor's 

Background 

A-2 - Contractor's 

Information 
A-3 - References 

A-4 - Manufacturer's 

Specifications 

Reviewer / 0 pts Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail 

Katelyn Edgar 0 pts Pass Pass Pass Pass 

 Average: Pass Pass Pass Pass 

  ↓ ↓ ↓ ↓ 

Calculated: 0 pts Pass Pass Pass Pass 
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A-5 - Warranty 

Information 
B - Forms 

B-1 - Standard 

Contract 
B-2 - Affidavit 

B-3 - Certificate of 

Compliance 

Reviewer Pass/Fail / 0 pts Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail 

Katelyn Edgar Pass 0 pts Pass Pass Pass 

 Pass Average: Pass Pass Pass 

 ↓  ↓ ↓ ↓ 

Calculated: Pass 0 pts Pass Pass Pass 
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B-4 - Statement of 

Contractor's 

Qualifications 

B-5 - Addenda 
B-6 - Exhibit F, 

Bidder's Exceptions 

B-7 - Contractor's 

Utilization Plan 

Reviewer Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Pass Pass Pass 

 Pass Pass Pass Pass 

 ↓ ↓ ↓ ↓ 

Calculated: Pass Pass Pass Pass 
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Evaluation Group 2 - Department Evaluation 

 

 

Reviewer 

Katelyn Edgar 

Evaluator 1 

 

 

Calculated: 
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Construction Management Services, Inc. - Scoring Summary 

 

Evaluation Group 1 - Purchasing Evaluation 

 A - Proposal 
A-1 - Contractor's 

Background 

A-2 - Contractor's 

Information 
A-3 - References 

A-4 - Manufacturer's 

Specifications 

Reviewer / 0 pts Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail 

Katelyn Edgar 0 pts Pass Pass Pass Pass 

 Average: Pass Pass Pass Pass 

  ↓ ↓ ↓ ↓ 

Calculated: 0 pts Pass Pass Pass Pass 
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A-5 - Warranty 

Information 
B - Forms 

B-1 - Standard 

Contract 
B-2 - Affidavit 

B-3 - Certificate of 

Compliance 

Reviewer Pass/Fail / 0 pts Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail 

Katelyn Edgar Pass 0 pts Pass Pass Pass 

 Pass Average: Pass Pass Pass 

 ↓  ↓ ↓ ↓ 

Calculated: Pass 0 pts Pass Pass Pass 
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B-4 - Statement of 

Contractor's 

Qualifications 

B-5 - Addenda 
B-6 - Exhibit F, 

Bidder's Exceptions 

B-7 - Contractor's 

Utilization Plan 

Reviewer Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Pass Pass Pass 

 Pass Pass Pass Pass 

 ↓ ↓ ↓ ↓ 

Calculated: Pass Pass Pass Pass 
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Evaluation Group 2 - Department Evaluation 

 

 

Reviewer 

Katelyn Edgar 

Evaluator 1 

 

 

Calculated: 
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Blue Chip Roofing and Waterproofing LLC - Scoring Summary 

 

Evaluation Group 1 - Purchasing Evaluation 

 A - Proposal 
A-1 - Contractor's 

Background 

A-2 - Contractor's 

Information 
A-3 - References 

A-4 - Manufacturer's 

Specifications 

Reviewer / 0 pts Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail 

Katelyn Edgar 0 pts Pass Pass Pass Pass 

 Average: Pass Pass Pass Pass 

  ↓ ↓ ↓ ↓ 

Calculated: 0 pts Pass Pass Pass Pass 
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A-5 - Warranty 

Information 
B - Forms 

B-1 - Standard 

Contract 
B-2 - Affidavit 

B-3 - Certificate of 

Compliance 

Reviewer Pass/Fail / 0 pts Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail 

Katelyn Edgar Pass 0 pts Pass Pass Pass 

 Pass Average: Pass Pass Pass 

 ↓  ↓ ↓ ↓ 

Calculated: Pass 0 pts Pass Pass Pass 
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B-4 - Statement of 

Contractor's 

Qualifications 

B-5 - Addenda 
B-6 - Exhibit F, 

Bidder's Exceptions 

B-7 - Contractor's 

Utilization Plan 

Reviewer Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail Pass/Fail 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Pass Pass Pass 

 Pass Pass Pass Pass 

 ↓ ↓ ↓ ↓ 

Calculated: Pass Pass Pass Pass 
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Evaluation Group 2 - Department Evaluation 

 

 

Reviewer 

Katelyn Edgar 

Evaluator 1 

 

 

Calculated: 
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Proposal Score Comments 

 

D & S International LLC - Scoring Comments 

A-1 - Contractor's Background - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

A-2 - Contractor's Information - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

A-3 - References - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 
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A-4 - Manufacturer's Specifications - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

A-5 - Warranty Information - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

B-1 - Standard Contract - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 
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B-2 - Affidavit - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

B-3 - Certificate of Compliance - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

B-4 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 
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B-5 - Addenda - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

B-6 - Exhibit F, Bidder's Exceptions - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

B-7 - Contractor's Utilization Plan - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 
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Construction Management Services, Inc. - Scoring Comments 

A-1 - Contractor's Background - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

A-2 - Contractor's Information - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

A-3 - References - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 
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A-4 - Manufacturer's Specifications - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

A-5 - Warranty Information - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

B-1 - Standard Contract - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 
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B-2 - Affidavit - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

B-3 - Certificate of Compliance - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

B-4 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 
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B-5 - Addenda - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

B-6 - Exhibit F, Bidder's Exceptions - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

B-7 - Contractor's Utilization Plan - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 
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Blue Chip Roofing and Waterproofing LLC - Scoring Comments 

A-1 - Contractor's Background - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

A-2 - Contractor's Information - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

A-3 - References - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) 
Revised References have been 

uploaded to Internal Files 
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A-4 - Manufacturer's Specifications - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

A-5 - Warranty Information - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

B-1 - Standard Contract - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

 

 

 



 

Generated on May 26, 2022 10:51 AM CDT - Katelyn Edgar 

Page 37 of 39 

B-2 - Affidavit - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

B-3 - Certificate of Compliance - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

B-4 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) 
Form has been uploaded to 

Internal Files 
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B-5 - Addenda - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

B-6 - Exhibit F, Bidder's Exceptions - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 

 

B-7 - Contractor's Utilization Plan - Reviewer Scores 

Reviewer Score Reason Comments 

Katelyn Edgar Pass Meets the requirement(s) Pass 



IN THE COUNTY LEGISLATURE OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI 
 
A RESOLUTION awarding a thirty-four month term and supply contract for the 
maintenance and repair of fire suppression systems for use by the Facilities Management 
Division of the Public Works Department, to Johnson Controls of Lenexa, KS, under the 
terms and conditions set forth in Sourcewell Contract No. 030421-JHN, an existing 
competitively-bid contract. 
 
 
RESOLUTION NO. 21003, July 11, 2022 
 
INTRODUCED BY Jalen Anderson, County Legislator 
 
 
WHEREAS, the Facilities Management Division of the Public Works Department has a 

need for the maintenance and repair of its fire suppression systems; and, 

 

WHEREAS, the Directors of Finance and Purchasing and Public Works recommend the 

award of a thirty-four month term and supply contract for these services to Johnson 

Controls (formerly Simplex Grinnell) of Lenexa, KS, under the terms and conditions set 

forth in Sourcewell (formerly NJPA) Contract No. 030421-JHN, an existing competitively-

bid government contract; and,  

 

WHEREAS, the Director of Finance and Purchasing recommends award under section 

1030.4, Jackson County Code, 1984, for the reason that this will allow the County to take 

advantage of discounts offered to large entities; and, 

 

WHEREAS, this award is made on an as needed basis and does not obligate Jackson 

County to pay any amount, with the availability of funds for specific purchases remaining 

subject to annual appropriation; now therefore,  



 

-2- 

BE IT RESOLVED by the County Legislature of Jackson County, Missouri, that award be 

made under the existing competitively-bid contract as recommended by the Directors of 

Finance and Purchasing and Public Works and that the Director of Finance and 

Purchasing be, and is hereby, authorized to execute for the County any documents 

necessary for the accomplishment of the award; and, 

 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Director of Finance and Purchasing be and hereby 

is authorized to make all payments, including final payment on the contract, to the extent 

that sufficient appropriations to the using spending agency are available in the then 

current Jackson County budget.  





Request for Legislative Action 

July 7, 2022 eRLA #559 Page 1 of 4 

Completed by County Counselor’s Office 

Action Requested: Resolution Res.Ord No.: 21003 

Sponsor(s): Jalen Anderson Legislature Meeting Date: 7/11/2022 

Introduction 

Action Items: ['Award'] 

Project/Title: 

Awarding a Thirty-Four (34) Month Term and Supply Contract for the furnishing of Fire Suppression 
System Services for use by Public Works to Johnson Controls of Staples, MN under the Terms and 
Conditions of the Sourcewell Contract No. 030421-JHN.  Contract No. 030421-JHN was made effective 
June 30, 2022 with the initial term ending on April 30, 2025. 

Request Summary 

Public Works requires a Term and Supply Contract for the furnishing of Fire Suppression System 
Services. This Term and Supply contract will be used to provide software and hardware maintenance 
and repair for the fire suppression systems in multiple County locations. The requested term of thirty-
four months will run concurrently with the Sourcewell contract. Public Works estimates to spend 
$250,000.00 annually.  

The request to have a Thirty-Four (34) Month term will allow the Purchasing Department to have the 
Jackson County contract terms run concurrent with the Sourcewell contract terms which will also allow 
the County to provide the continuous services necessary to keep the County Department fire 
suppression systems properly functioning during this time. 

Sourcewell is a State of Minnesota local government agency and service cooperative created under the 
laws of the State of Minnesota (Minnesota Statutes Section 123A.21) that offers cooperative 
procurement solutions to government entities. Participation is open to federal, state/province, and 
municipal governmental entities, higher education, K-12 education, nonprofit, tribal government, and 
other public entities located in the United States and Canada. Sourcewell issued a public solicitation for 
Facility Security Systems, Equipment, and Software with Related Services from which Vendor was 
awarded a contract.  

Per Chapter 1030.4 - Fixed Price Contractual Documents- Competive bidding shall not be required when 
the items purchased are the subject of existing and current federal, state, or local government fixed 
price contractual documents, if the prices quoted in those documents are more advantageous to the 
County than local market prices for like items. Bfore a purchase is made pursuant to this subsection 
which has a purchase price in excess of twenty-five thousand dollars ($25,000,) the Director of Fiance 
and Purchasing shall submit the purchase to the County Legislature for approval and the purchase shall 
only be effective upon legislative approval. In the recommendation to the Legislature, the director shall 
set out the reason for decision not to seek competitive bids.  

Res. #21003
Sponsor: Jalen Anderson
Date: July 11, 2022



Request for Legislative Action 

July 7, 2022 eRLA #559 Page 2 of 4 

Contact Information 

Department: Public Works Submitted Date: 6/9/2022 

Name: Courtney L. Jester Email: CJester@jacksongov.org 

Title: Administrative Supervisor Phone: 816-881-4418

Budget Information 

Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year: $   0 

Amount previously authorized this fiscal year: $   0 

Total amount authorized after this legislative action: $  

Is it transferring fund? No 

Single Source Funding: 

Fund: Department: Line Item Account: Amount: 

!Unexpected End of
Formula 

Prior Legislation 

Prior Ordinances 

Ordinance: Ordinance date: 

Prior Resolution 

Resolution: Resolution date: 

19934 July 30, 2018 

Purchasing 

Does this RLA include the purchase or lease of 
supplies, materials, equipment or services? 

Yes 

Chapter 10 Justification: Fixed Price Contract 

Core 4 Tax Clearance Completed: Yes 

Certificate of Foreign Corporation Received: Yes 

Have all required attachments been included in 
this RLA? 

Yes 

Compliance 

Certificate of Compliance 

In Compliance 

Minority, Women and Veteran Owned Business Program 

Goals Not Applicable for following reason: Contract is with another government agency 



Request for Legislative Action 

July 7, 2022 eRLA #559 Page 3 of 4 

MBE:   .00% 

WBE:   .00% 

VBE:   .00% 

Prevailing Wage 

Approval of a Term and Supply contract which may 
include construction project(s) over $75000 

Fiscal Information 

 This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific
amount.  The availability of funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as each
using agency places its order.
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Submitted by Public Works requestor: Courtney L. Jester on 6/9/2022. Comments: 

Approved by Department Approver Brian Gaddie on 6/9/2022 4:45:40 PM. Comments: 

Returned for more information by Purchasing Office Approver Barbara J. Casamento on 6/10/2022 
9:46:34 AM. Comments:  Please use Chapter 10 justification in Request Summary 
Dates requested do not match the contract expiration dates 
Justification for 44 month contract needs to be stronger 

Submitted by Requestor Courtney L. Jester on 6/13/2022 10:00:13 AM. Comments: 

Approved by Department Approver Brian Gaddie on 6/13/2022 3:35:19 PM. Comments: 

Returned for more information by Purchasing Office Approver Barbara J. Casamento on 6/14/2022 
9:17:48 AM. Comments:  1030.2 is incorrect; the correct reference is 1030.4 please change; 
your timeline is still incorrect - from 6/30/22 to 4/30/25 is 34 months - if the contract expires in 4/2025 
you cannot have a 12 month extension 

Submitted by Requestor Courtney L. Jester on 6/14/2022 10:38:20 AM. Comments: 

Approved by Department Approver Brian Gaddie on 6/16/2022 2:28:47 PM. Comments: 

Returned for more information by Purchasing Office Approver Barbara J. Casamento on 6/16/2022 
2:50:29 PM. Comments:  Please correct the first line under Project/Title 

Submitted by Requestor Courtney L. Jester on 6/21/2022 7:33:06 AM. Comments: 

Approved by Department Approver Brian Gaddie on 6/27/2022 10:20:45 AM. Comments: 

Returned for more information by Purchasing Office Approver Barbara J. Casamento on 6/28/2022 
9:29:44 AM. Comments:  Please add annual spend amount 

Submitted by Requestor Courtney L. Jester on 6/28/2022 1:11:54 PM. Comments: 

Approved by Department Approver Brian Gaddie on 6/28/2022 1:44:22 PM. Comments: 

 
Approved by Purchasing Office Approver Barbara J. Casamento on 6/29/2022 8:28:56 AM. Comments: 

Approved by Compliance Office Approver Katie M. Bartle on 6/29/2022 9:22:25 AM. Comments:

































































IN THE COUNTY LEGISLATURE OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI 
 
A RESOLUTION transferring $130,000.00 within the 2022 Anti-Crime Sales Tax Fund to 
cover the increased cost of gasoline for use by the Jackson County Drug Task Force. 
 
 
RESOLUTION NO. 21004, July 11, 2022 
 
INTRODUCED BY Theresa Cass Galvin, County Legislator 

 

WHEREAS, the Jackson County Drug Task Force anticipates a need for additional funds 

for fuel for the remainder of 2022, due to the increased cost of gasoline; and, 

 

WHEREAS, a transfer is needed to place the funds necessary for the purchase of 

gasoline in the proper spending account; now therefore, 

 

BE IT RESOLVED by the County Legislature of Jackson County, Missouri, that the 

following transfer within the 2022 Anti-Crime Sales Tax Fund be and hereby is made: 

DEPARTMENT/DIVISION CHARACTER/DESCRIPTION FROM TO 
    

Anti-Crime Sales Tax Fund    
Jackson County  
Drug Task Force 

 
  

008-4151 56790-  
Other Contractual Services $130,000  

008-4151 57110- Gasoline  $130,000 





Request for Legislative Action 

July 7, 2022 eRLA #572 Page 1 of 3 

Completed by County Counselor’s Office 

Action Requested: Resolution Res.Ord No.: 21004 

Sponsor(s): Theresa Galvin Legislature Meeting Date: 7/11/2022 

Introduction 

Action Items: ['Transfer'] 

Project/Title: 

Requesting a transfer within the Jackson County Drug Task Force 2022 budget to cover the increase cost 
of gasoline. 

Request Summary 

Due to the drastic increase in the cost of gasoline, the Jackson County Drug Task Force is requesting a 
transfer of $130,000 from within the Task Force approved 2022 budget. 

Transfer $130,000 From: 008-4151-56790  - Other Contractual Services 
Transfer To: 008-4151-57110 - Gasoline 

Contact Information 

Department: Jackson County Drug Task 
Force 

Submitted Date: 6/30/2022 

Name: Cari Beeman Email: CBEEMAN@JCDTF.COM 

Title: Operations Administrator Phone: 816-503-4713

Resolution No.: 21004
Sponsor:  Theresa Cass Galvin
Date:  July 11, 2022



Request for Legislative Action 

July 7, 2022 eRLA #572 Page 2 of 3 
 

Budget Information 

Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year: $130,000 

Amount previously authorized this fiscal year: $62,000 

Total amount authorized after this legislative action: $192,000 

Is it transferring fund? Yes 

Transferring Fund From: 

Fund: Department: Line Item Account: Amount: 

008 (Anti-Crime Sales 
Tax Fund) 

4151 (Jackson County 
Drug Task Force) 

56790 (Other 
Contractual Services) 

$130,000 

 

Transferring Fund To: 

Fund: Department: Line Item Account: Amount: 

008 (Anti-Crime Sales 
Tax Fund) 

4151 (Jackson County 
Drug Task Force) 

57110 (Gasoline) $130,000 

 

 

Prior Legislation 

Prior Ordinances 

Ordinance: Ordinance date: 

  

Prior Resolution 

Resolution: Resolution date: 

  

 

Purchasing 

Does this RLA include the purchase or lease of 
supplies, materials, equipment or services? 

No 

Chapter 10 Justification:  

Core 4 Tax Clearance Completed:  

Certificate of Foreign Corporation Received:  

Have all required attachments been included in 
this RLA? 

 

 

Compliance 

Certificate of Compliance 

Not Applicable 

Minority, Women and Veteran Owned Business Program 

Goals Not Applicable for following reason: Not spending money 

MBE:    .00%  

WBE:    .00%  

VBE:     .00%  



Request for Legislative Action 

July 7, 2022 eRLA #572 Page 3 of 3 
 

Prevailing Wage 

Not Applicable  

 

Fiscal Information 

 Funds sufficient for this appropriation and/or transfer are available from the source indicated on 
the budget information tab. 
 

 

History 

Submitted by Jackson County Drug Task Force requestor: Cari Beeman on 6/30/2022. Comments: 
 
Approved by Department Approver Dan Cummings on 6/30/2022 12:33:59 PM. Comments: 
 
 
Not applicable by Purchasing Office Approver Barbara J. Casamento on 6/30/2022 1:56:02 PM. 
Comments: 
 
 
Approved by Compliance Office Approver Katie M. Bartle on 6/30/2022 3:04:22 PM. Comments: 
 
 
Approved by Budget Office Approver Mark Lang on 7/5/2022 9:49:20 AM. Comments:  The fiscal note 
has been attached. 
 
 
Approved by Executive Office Approver Sylvya Stevenson on 7/5/2022 12:19:09 PM. Comments: 
 
 
Approved by Counselor's Office Approver Elizabeth Freeland on 7/7/2022 11:04:33 AM. Comments: 
 

 



PC#

Date: July 5, 2022 RES #
eRLA ID #: 572 

Org Code/Description Object Code/Description From To

008 Anti-Crime Sales Tax Fund

4151 Jackson County Drug Task Force 56790 Other Contractual Services 130,000$      -$  

4151 Jackson County Drug Task Force 57110 Gasoline - 130,000 

130,000$      130,000$      

Budget Office

Fiscal Note:
Funds sufficient for this transfer are available from the sources indicated below.   

415122003 000

Page 1 of 1

21004

mlang
Approved



IN THE COUNTY LEGISLATURE OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI 
 
A RESOLUTION authorizing the Jackson County Legislature to hold a closed meeting on 
Monday, July 11, 2022, for the purpose of conducting privileged and confidential 
communications between itself and the Jackson County Counselor under section 
610.021(1) of the Revised Statutes of Missouri, and closing all records prepared for 
discussion at said meeting. 
 
 
RESOLUTION NO. 21005, July 11, 2022 
 
INTRODUCED BY Charlie Franklin, County Legislator 
 
 
WHEREAS, the Jackson County Legislature desires to hold a closed meeting on Monday, 

July 11, 2022, during the regularly scheduled meeting of the Legislature; and, 

 

WHEREAS, public notice of such closed meeting has been given by inclusion of this 

Resolution on the published agenda for said meeting; and, 

 

WHEREAS, the purpose of such closed meeting is to conduct privileged and confidential 

communications between the Legislature and the Jackson County Counselor concerning 

the status of legal actions, causes of action, and/or litigation; and, 

 

WHEREAS, such closed meeting is allowable under section 610.021(1) of the Revised 

Statutes of Missouri; now therefore, 

  



-2- 

BE IT RESOLVED by the County Legislature of Jackson County, Missouri, that the 

Legislature be authorized to hold a closed meeting during the regularly scheduled 

meeting of the Legislature on Monday, July 11, 2022, pursuant to section 610.021(1), 

RSMo, and closing all records prepared in connection therewith. 
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