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Bidders Quotation Sheet 
Mattresses, Bedding & Linens Specifications 

Unit Price entered where U/M is DZ is for one (1) dozen 

NO DESCRIPTION 
EST 
QTY U/M 

MIN ORDER 
QTY, IF ANY 

UNIT PRICE 

1.0 

Mattress; Size 30" x 75" x 4.5” with attached 
pillow; l 00% polyester dense batting; certified fire 
resistant, moisture and mildew resistant; resistant to 
common cleaning materials; hypoallergenic and 
odor free; heavy duty, two layers of vinyl bonded 
to a tough nylon scrim minimum. 

192 EA $ 

2.0 

Mattress; Size 36" x 75" x 4.5” with attached 
pillow; l 00% polyester dense batting; certified fire 
resistant, moisture and mildew resistant; resistant to 
common cleaning materials; hypoallergenic and 
odor free; heavy duty, two layers of vinyl bonded 

  to a tough nylon scrim minimum. 

12 EA $ 

3.0 

Towel; Minimum Size 22" x 44" cotton terry, color in 
dark hues including brown; minimum 6 pound per 
dozen; durable to hold up under numerous industrial 
machine washings; domestic, NO IRREGULARS. 

348 DZ $ 

4.0 
Wash Cloth; Size 12" x 12" cotton terry; color in dark 
Hues including brown; minimum 1 pound per 
dozen; durable to hold up under numerous 
industrial machine washings; domestic NO 
IRREGULARS. 

552 DZ $ 

5.0 
Sheet: Size to fit 30" x 75" x 4.5" mattress; fitted; 
colors in white and dark hues; poly-cotton blend; 
machine washable in hot water; sides hemmed or 
surged; preshrunk to fit. 

192 DZ $ 

6.0 
Sheet; Size 54" x 90"; flat white unbleached poly-cotton 
blend; machine washable in hot water; colors in white 
and dark hues; sides hemmed or surged; preshrunk to 
fit. 

192 DZ $ 

7.0 

Standard size pillow flame-retardant cotton batting 
and anti-bacterial outer cover material; tear resistant; 
all seams to be double needle stitched with heavy 
gauge nylon thread. 

12 DZ $ 

8.0 
Pillowcase: cotton/poly blend unbleached white; 
machine washable in hot water; standard size; 
colors in white and dark hues. 

192 DZ $ 

9.0 
Blanket; Minimum Size 62" x 80" 70% Wool, 30% 
Man-made Fiber; fire resistant; whip stitched on all 
four sides heavy duty loom woven; color: gray. 

24 DZ $ 

Victory Supply LLC

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

$16.64 5,790.72

$3.24
1,788.48

$45.08 8,655.36

$26.44 5,076.48

$15.44 2,964.48

$67.44 1,618.56
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NO 
 

DESCRIPTION 
EST 
QTY 

 
U/M 

MIN ORDER 
QTY, IF ANY 

UNIT PRICE 

 
   10.0 

Blanket; 100% Cotton White; thermal; minimum 2 
pound; Size: 66” x 90” bound/hemmed edges. 

 
 

24 

 
DZ 

  
 

$ 

 
11.0 

Shower Curtain; Size 72" x 82" top & bottom view, 
loop closure white; sani-suede; 10-gauge plastic; NO 
METAL. 

 
12 

 
DZ 

  
$ 

 
 12.0 

Shower Curtain Hooks; all plastic, open end; l00 per 
package. 

 
48 

 
PKG 

  
$ 

 
 

         Grand Total of Items 1 to 12 $: __________________ 
 

 
Miscellaneous Catalog Items:  Percentage (%) discount off manufacturer’s suggested retail price on items not 
listed above.  If more than one discount is offered, attach additional pages with that % discount: _____________% 
 

Delivery Time After Receipt of Order:  Weeks 

 
 
 

SIGNATURE: 
 

DATE: 
 

NAME (Print or Type): 
 

PHONE: 
 

TITLE (Print of Type): 
 

MOBILE: 
 

COMPANY NAME (Print or Type): 
 

FAX: 
 

EMAIL ADDRESS (Print or Type): 
 

 
 

 

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

Victory Supply LLC

15

1-2

4/28/2025

Evan Trommer

Owner/VP of Sales

888-376-1205

615-815-9518

931-325-5521Victory Supply LLC

bids@victorysupplyinc.com

$68.88
1,653.12

27,547.20




