

ATTACHMENTS	Abstract of Bids, Recap of Bids Received, Award Recommendation from Cpt. Scott Goodman, Sheriff's Office, and the pertinent pages of the bid from GearZone Tactical.	
REVIEW	Department Director:	Date: 1/11/18
	Finance (Budget Approval): <i>If applicable</i>	Date: 2/1/18
	Division Manager:	Date:
	County Counselor's Office:	Date:

Fiscal Information (to be verified by Budget Office in Finance Department)

- This expenditure was included in the annual budget.
- Funds for this were encumbered from the _____ Fund in _____.
- There is a balance otherwise unencumbered to the credit of the appropriation to which the expenditure is chargeable and there is a cash balance otherwise unencumbered in the treasury to the credit of the fund from which payment is to be made each sufficient to provide for the obligation herein authorized.
- Funds sufficient for this expenditure will be/were appropriated by Ordinance # _____
- Funds sufficient for this appropriation are available from the source indicated below.

Account Number:	Account Title:	Amount Not to Exceed:

- This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as each using agency places its order.
- This legislative action does not impact the County financially and does not require Finance/Budget approval.



OFFICE OF THE
JACKSON COUNTY
SHERIFF

TO: Katie Bartle

FROM: Captain Scott Goodman

DATE: 04-11-18

SUBJECT: Uniform / Equipment Bid

Katie,

Although Gall's was the lowest bidder, Sheriff Sharp is requesting that you award Gear Zone Tactical the Uniform and Equipment contract.

- **Questioning Accuracy of Bid for Item #6 Elbeco #E8149** – The initial bid of \$51.00 for the uniform trousers was uncommonly low. I requested confirmation on the bid item and received a bid of **\$61.00 for Elbeco #SR512**. Not only did the bid amount change, it is also not the same model number. This leads to a lack of confidence in their knowledge of our equipment needs and a lack of knowledge to their initial bid. *Further, if models are not exact, mismatching uniforms would display a lack of professionalism in the eye of the public.*
- **Communication during the bid process.** - When communicating with the Jackson County Purchasing, Gall's displayed an inability to follow directions.
- **Customer Service** - Upon my call to Gall's, it took some time to locate their bid for us and get me to the right customer service representative. Questions such as; "What is your name?" "What agency?" "What state?" "Which zip code?" "Is it under your name?" etc. This leads us to question the level of customer service that we will receive.
- **90 Day Contingency** - We do not wish to pursue any type of contingency with the bid, due to the level of inconvenience to our operations that could occur for inaccurate orders and having to repeat the bid process.

Thank you,

Captain Scott Goodman
Jackson County Sheriff's Office
Staff Services Commander

ABSTRACT OF BIDS

ITB: 1-18															
Date: 2/6/18															
COMMODITY: Sheriff's Uniforms															
NO	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	QTY	LE Upfitter	The Armory	GearZone Tactical	GT Distributors	Baysinger Police Supply	Galls						
				AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT						
1.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Pant, Sizes XS - XL	Each	1	44.67	44.95	43.49	NB	42.99	38.00						
2.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Long Sleeve Shirt, Sizes XS - XL	Each	1	44.00	49.95	43.49		42.99	40.00						
3.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Short Sleeve Shirt, Sizes XS - XL	Each	1	44.00	49.95	43.49		42.99	38.00						
4.0	Elbeco #4238N Short Sleeve Shirt, Sizes XS - XL	Each	1	56.07	see bid	53.49		60.99	49.00						
5.0	Elbeco #436N Long Sleeve Shirt, Sizes: XS - XL, Neck 14 - 22	Each	1	96.64	89.95	87.95		105.99	57.00						
6.0	Elbeco #E8149, LA County Sheriff's Prestige Trousers for Men, Sizes: 28 - 42	Each	1	80.14	75.95	73.95		87.99	57.00						
7.0	Elbeco #E8150, LA County Sheriff's Prestige Trousers for Women, Sizes 6 - 14	Each	1	80.14	75.95	73.95		87.99	57.00						
8.0	Neece Rain Suit - Jacket, Hood, Pants	Each	1	see bid	239.90	249.99		182.98	9.50						
9.0	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Clip-on, 18"	Each	1	4.17	6.50	5.99		4.50	4.00						
10.0	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Velcro, 18"	Each	1	6.58	6.50	7.99		6.95	5.85						
11.0	Stratton #S-42CG, Straw Sheriff's Hat	Each	1	83.00	75.95	84.99		82.99	85.00						
12.0	Spiewak Style #S3182 Soft Shell, Spiewak Style #SH3466 Outer, Sizes: S - XL	Each	1	see bid	231.90	170.00		274.99	251.00						
13.0	Don Hume, #B125, Black, Velcro Belt, Basket Weave, Sizes: 24 - 42	Each	1	20.00	35.95	27.99	25.51	65.99	31.50						
14.0	Safariland #146-XX-4B, Black with Brass Buckle, Border Patrol Belt, Sizes: 24 - 42	Each	1	56.67	78.95	66.99	46.49	62.50	59.00						
15.0	Safariland #6280-83-61 R/H, Right Hand Holster	Each	1	137.44	165.95	129.95	109.15	149.99	149.00						
16.0	Safariland #6280-83-61 L/H, Left Hand Holster	Each	1	137.44	165.95	129.95	109.15	149.99	149.00						
17.0	Safariland #38 w/Flap, Closed Top Chemical Holder,	Each	1	24.19	29.95	23.49	19.84	26.75	25.00						
18.0	Safariland #90-4B, Open Top Handcuff Pouch for Hinged Handcuffs,	Each	1	24.19	27.95	25.49	19.84	26.75	25.00						
19.0	Safariland #65, Belt Keeper 4 Pack	Each	1	10.03	14.95	12.99	8.51	11.00	10.50						

ITB: 1-18		Date: 2/6/18		COMMODITY: Sheriff's Uniforms		LE Upfitter		The Armory		GearZone Tactical		GT Distributors		Baysinger Police Supply		Galls	
NO	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	QTY	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT
20.0	Sergeant Stripes, Gold on Green	Each	1	7.00/set	4.00/set	3.00											2.29
21.0	Back Patch "Sheriff", 11" x 4", Gold on Black	Each	1	4.00	3.00	4.99											4.00
22.0	Sewing Services to attach Shoulder Patch (Item 3.3.1) to uniform	Each	1	4.00	3.00	3.00											see bid
23.0	Sewing Services to attach Badge Patch	Each	1	4.00	2.00	2.00											see bid
24.0	Sewing Services to attach Sergeant Stripes	Each	1	4.00	4.00	3.00											see bid
25.0	Sewing Services to attach Back Patch	Each	1	4.00	2.00	2.00											see bid
26.0	Sewing Services to attach one pair of Black Stripes	Each	1	10.00	7.00	10.00											6.00
27.0	Sewing Services to alter shirts as necessary for proper fit for Officer	Each	1	15.00		10.00											see bid
28.0	Sewing Services to alter pants/trousers as necessary for proper fit for Officer	Each	1	10.00		10.00											see bid

CERTIFICATION OF BID OPENING
 BIDS WERE PUBLICLY
 OPENED AND RECORDED
 ON: February 6, 2018 BY
[Signature]
 CLERK OF THE LEGISLATURE
[Signature]
 PURCHASING

Bid No: 1-18

Commodity: Sheriff's Uniforms

Vendor: GearZone Tactical

Bid Recap		Quote						
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS	Yes/No	Item #	Item Name	QTY	Unit	Manufacturer	Amount	
Contract Signed	Y	1.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Pant, Sizes XS - XL	1	Each	5.11 Tactical	\$ 43.49	
Affidavit	Y		Size 2XL	1	Each	5.11 Tactical	\$ 43.49	
Compliance Review	Y		Size 3XL	1	Each	5.11 Tactical	\$ 49.99	
Certificate of Compliance	N		Size 4XL	1	Each	5.11 Tactical	\$ 49.99	
Statement of Contractor's Qualification	Y	2.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Long Sleeve Shirt, Sizes XS - XL	1	Each	5.11 Tactical	\$ 43.49	
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda	Y		Size 2XL	1	Each	5.11 Tactical	\$ 43.49	
Bidder's Quote	Y		Size 3XL	1	Each	5.11 Tactical	\$ 49.99	
Bidder's Exceptions	Y		Size 4XL	1	Each	5.11 Tactical	\$ 49.99	
Contractor's Utilization Plan	Y	3.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Short Sleeve Shirt, Sizes: XS - XL	1	Each	5.11 Tactical	\$ 43.49	
Greater KC Metro Area Memo	NA		Size 2XL	1	Each	5.11 Tactical	\$ 43.49	
			Size 3XL	1	Each	5.11 Tactical	\$ 49.99	
			Size 4XL	1	Each	5.11 Tactical	\$ 49.99	
		4.0	Elbeco #4238N Short Sleeve Shirt, Sizes XS - XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 53.49	
			Size 2XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 53.49	
			Size 3XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 61.86	
			Size 4XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 70.22	
		5.0	Elbeco #436N Long Sleeve Shirt, Sizes: XS - XL, Neck 14-22	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 87.95	
			Size 2XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 87.95	
			Size 3XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 105.95	
			Size 4XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 115.80	
		6.0	Elbeco #E8149, L.A County Sheriff's Prestige Trousers for Men, Sizes: 28 - 42	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 73.95	
			Size 44-46	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 81.99	
			Size 48-52	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 89.99	

			Size 54-58	1	Each	Elbeco	\$	97.89
			Elbeco #E8150, L.A County Sheriff's Prestige Trousers for Women, Sizes 6 - 14	1	Each	Elbeco	\$	73.95
			Size 16-18	1	Each	Elbeco	\$	73.95
			Size 20-24	1	Each	Elbeco	\$	81.99
			Size 26-28	1	Each	Elbeco	\$	89.99
			Neece Rain Suit - Jacket, Hood, Pants	1	Each		\$	249.99
			Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Clip- on, 18"	1	Each	Rothco	\$	5.99
			Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Clip- on, 20"	1	Each	Rothco	\$	5.99
			Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Velcro, 18"	1	Each	Rothco	\$	7.99
			Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Velcro, 20"	1	Each	Rothco	\$	7.99
			Stratton #S-42CG, Straw Sheriff's Hat	1	Each	Stratton	\$	84.99
			Spiewak Style #S3182 Soft Shell, Spiewak Style #SH3466 Outer, Sizes: S - XL	1	Each	Tact Squad	\$	170.00
			Size 2XL	1	Each	Tact Squad	\$	170.00
			Size 3XL	1	Each	Tact Squad	\$	175.00
			Size 4XL	1	Each	Tact Squad	\$	175.00
			Size 5XL	1	Each	Tact Squad	\$	185.00
			Don Hume, #B125, Black, Velcro Belt, Basket Weave, Sizes: 24 - 42	1	Each	Safariland	\$	27.99
			Size 44-46	1	Each	Safariland	\$	29.99
			Size 48-52	1	Each	Safariland	\$	31.99
			Size 54-60	1	Each	Safariland	\$	34.99
			Safariland #146-XX-4B, Black with Brass Buckle, Border Patrol Belt, Sizes: 24 - 42	1	Each	Safariland	\$	66.99
			Size 44-46	1	Each	Safariland	\$	68.99

Bid No: 1-18

Commodity: Sheriff's Uniforms

Vendor: Galls

Bid Recap		Quote						
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS	Yes/No	Item #	Item Name	QTY	Unit	Manufacturer	Amount	
Contract Signed	Y	1.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Pant, Sizes XS - XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 38.00	
Affidavit	Y		Size 2XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 38.00	
Compliance Review	Y		Size 3XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 43.00	
Certificate of Compliance	N		Size 4XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 43.00	
Statement of Contractor's Qualification	Y	2.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Long Sleeve Shirt, Sizes XS - XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 40.00	
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda	Y		Size 2XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 40.00	
Bidder's Quote	Y		Size 3XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 46.00	
Bidder's Exceptions	Y		Size 4XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 46.00	
Contractor's Utilization Plan	Y	3.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Short Sleeve Shirt, Sizes: XS - XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 38.00	
Greater KC Metro Area Memo	NA		Size 2XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 38.00	
			Size 3XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 43.00	
			Size 4XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 43.00	
		4.0	Elbeco #4238N Short Sleeve Shirt, Sizes XS - XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 47.00	
			Size 2XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 47.00	
			Size 3XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 47.00	
			Size 4XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 47.00	
		5.0	Elbeco #436N Long Sleeve Shirt, Sizes: XS - XL, Neck 14-22	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 51.00	
			Size 2XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 51.00	
			Size 3XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 51.00	
			Size 4XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 51.00	
		6.0	Elbeco #E8149, LA County Sheriff's Prestige Trousers for Men, Sizes: 28 - 42	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 51.00	
			Size 44-46	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 51.00	

				Size 48-52	1	Each	Elbeco	\$	51.00
				Size 54-58	1	Each	Elbeco	\$	51.00
			7.0	Elbeco #E8150, L.A County Sheriff's Prestige Trousers for Women, Sizes 6 – 14	1	Each	Elbeco	\$	51.00
				Size 16-18	1	Each	Elbeco	\$	51.00
				Size 20-24	1	Each	Elbeco	\$	51.00
				Size 26-28	1	Each	Elbeco	\$	51.00
			8.0	Neece Rain Suit – Jacket, Hood, Pants	1	Each	Neese	\$	9.50
			9.0	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Clip-on, 18"	1	Each	Samuel Broome	\$	4.00
				Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Clip-on, 20"	1	Each	Samuel Broome	\$	4.10
			10.0	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Velcro, 18"	1	Each	Samuel Broome	\$	5.85
				Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Velcro, 20"	1	Each	Samuel Broome	\$	6.00
			11.0	Stratton #S-42CG, Straw Sheriff's Hat	1	Each	Stratton	\$	85.00
			12.0	Spiewak Style #S3182 Soft Shell, Spiewak Style #SH3466 Outer, Sizes: S – XL	1	Each	Spiewak	\$	251.00
				Size 2XL	1	Each	Spiewak	\$	251.00
				Size 3XL	1	Each	Spiewak	\$	251.00
				Size 4XL	1	Each	Spiewak	\$	251.00
				Size 5XL	1	Each	Spiewak	\$	269.00
			13.0	Don Hume, #B125, Black, Velcro Belt, Basket Weave, Sizes: 24 – 42	1	Each	Safariland	\$	31.50
				Size 44-46	1	Each	Safariland	\$	31.50
				Size 48-52	1	Each	Safariland	\$	31.50
				Size 54-60	1	Each	Safariland	\$	31.50

14.0	Safariland #146-XX-4B, Black with Brass Buckle, Border Patrol Belt, Sizes: 24-42	1	Each	Safariland	\$	59.00
	Size 44-46	1	Each	Safariland	\$	59.00
	Size 48-52	1	Each	Safariland	\$	59.00
	Size 54-60	1	Each	Safariland	\$	59.00
15.0	Safariland #6280-83-61 R/H, Right Hand Holster	1	Each	Safariland	\$	149.00
16.0	Safariland #6280-83-61 L/H, Left Hand Holster	1	Each	Safariland	\$	149.00
17.0	Safariland #38 w/Flap, Closed Top Chemical Holder,	1	Each	Safariland	\$	25.00
18.0	Safariland #90-4B, Open Top Handcuff Pouch for Hinged Handcuffs,	1	Each	Safariland	\$	25.00
19.0	Safariland #65, Belt Keeper 4 Pack	1	Each	Safariland	\$	10.50
20.0	Sergeant Stripes, Gold on Green	1	Each		\$	2.29
21.0	Back Patch "Sheriff", 11" x 4", Gold on Black	1	Each		\$	4.00
22.0	Sewing Services to attach Shoulder Patch (Item 3.3.1) to uniform	1	Each			
23.0	Sewing Services to attach Badge Patch	1	Each		\$	-
24.0	Sewing Services to attach Sergeant Stripes	1	Each		\$	-
25.0	Sewing Services to attach Back Patch	1	Each		\$	-
26.0	Sewing Services to attach one pair of Black Stripes	1	Each		\$	6.00
27.0	Sewing Services to alter shirts as necessary for proper fit for Officer	1	Each		\$	-

Bid No: 1-18

**Commodity: Sheriff's Uniforms
Vendor: Baysinger Police Supply**

Bid Recap		Quote						
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS	Yes/No	Item #	Item Name	QTY	Unit	Manufacturer	Amount	
Contract Signed	Y	1.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Pant, Sizes XS - XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 42.99	
Affidavit	Y		Size 2XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 42.99	
Compliance Review	Y		Size 3XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 49.99	
Certificate of Compliance	N		Size 4XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 49.99	
Statement of Contractor's Qualification	Y	2.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Long Sleeve Shirt, Sizes XS - XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 42.99	
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda	Y		Size 2XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 42.99	
Bidder's Quote	Y		Size 3XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 48.99	
Bidder's Exceptions	Y		Size 4XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 48.99	
Contractor's Utilization Plan	N	3.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Short Sleeve Shirt, Sizes: XS - XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 42.99	
Greater KC Metro Area Memo	Y		Size 2XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 42.99	
			Size 3XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 48.99	
			Size 4XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 48.99	
		4.0	Elbeco #4238N Short Sleeve Shirt, Sizes XS - XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 60.99	
			Size 2XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 60.99	
			Size 3XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 60.99	
			Size 4XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 60.99	
		5.0	Elbeco #436N Long Sleeve Shirt, Sizes: XS - XL, Neck 14-22	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 105.99	
			Size 2XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 105.99	
			Size 3XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 105.99	
			Size 4XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 105.99	
		6.0	Elbeco #E8149, LA County Sheriff's Prestige Trousers for Men, Sizes: 28 - 42	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 87.99	
			Size 44-46	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 87.99	
			Size 48-52	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 87.99	
			Size 54-58	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 87.99	
		7.0	Elbeco #E8150, LA County Sheriff's Prestige Trousers for Women, Sizes 6 - 14	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 87.99	
			Size 16-18	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 87.99	
			Size 20-24	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 87.99	
			Size 26-28	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 87.99	
		8.0	Neece Rain Suit - Jacket, Hood, Pants	1	Each	Neece	\$ 182.98	
		9.0	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Clip-on, 18"	1	Each	Sam Broome	\$ 4.50	

Contracts: See attached

References: See attached.

		Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Clip-on, 20"	1	Each	Sam Broome	\$	4.75
10.0		Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Velcro, 18"	1	Each	Sam Broome	\$	6.95
		Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Velcro, 20"	1	Each	Sam Broome	\$	7.15
11.0		Stratton #S-42CG, Straw Sheriff's Hat	1	Each	Stratton	\$	96.48
12.0		Spiewak Style #S3182 Soft Shell, Spiewak Style #SH3466 Outer, Sizes: S - XL	1	Each	Spiewak	\$	274.99
		Size 2XL	1	Each	Spiewak	\$	274.99
		Size 3XL	1	Each	Spiewak	\$	274.99
		Size 4XL	1	Each	Spiewak	\$	274.99
		Size 5XL	1	Each	Spiewak	\$	274.99
13.0		Don Hume, #B125, Black, Velcro Belt, Basket Weave, Sizes: 24 - 42	1	Each	Safariland	\$	65.99
		Size 44-46	1	Each	Safariland	\$	65.99
		Size 48-52	1	Each	Safariland	\$	65.99
		Size 54-60	1	Each	Safariland	\$	65.99
14.0		Safariland #146-XX-4B, Black with Brass Buckle, Border Patrol Belt, Sizes: 24 - 42	1	Each	Safariland	\$	62.50
		Size 44-46	1	Each	Safariland	\$	62.50
		Size 48-52	1	Each	Safariland	\$	62.50
		Size 54-60	1	Each	Safariland	\$	62.50
15.0		Safariland #6280-83-61 R/H, Right Hand Holster	1	Each	Safariland	\$	149.99
16.0		Safariland #6280-83-61 L/H, Left Hand Holster	1	Each	Safariland	\$	149.99
17.0		Safariland #38 w/Flap, Closed Top Chemical Holder,	1	Each	Safariland	\$	26.75
18.0		Safariland #90-4B, Open Top Handcuff Pouch for Hinged Handcuffs,	1	Each	Safariland	\$	26.75
19.0		Safariland #65, Belt Keeper 4 Pack	1	Each	Safariland	\$	11.00
20.0		Sergeant Stripes, Gold on Green	1	Each	NA	\$	3.00
21.0		Back Patch "Sheriff", 11" x 4", Gold on Black	1	Each	NA	\$	3.00
22.0		Sewing Services to attach Shoulder Patch (Item 3.3.1) to uniform	1	Each	NA	\$	3.00
23.0		Sewing Services to attach Badge Patch	1	Each	NA	\$	3.00
24.0		Sewing Services to attach Sergeant Stripes	1	Each	NA	\$	3.00
25.0		Sewing Services to attach Back Patch	1	Each	NA	\$	3.00
26.0		Sewing Services to attach one pair of Black Stripes	1	Each	NA	\$	8.00
27.0		Sewing Services to alter shirts as necessary for proper fit for Officer	1	Each	NA	\$	8.00
28.0		Sewing Services D57:D66 to alter pants/trousers as necessary for proper fit for Officer	1	Each	NA	\$	6.50

	29.0	Miscellaneous Catalog Items - percentage off MSRP					

Comments: Please note alternate items bid.

Bid No: 1-18

Commodity: Sheriff's Uniforms

Vendor: GT Distributors

Bid Recap		Quote					
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS	Y/N	Item #	Item Name	QTY	Unit	Manufacturer	Amount
Contract Signed	Y	1.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Pant, Sizes XS - XL	1	Each		NO BID
Affidavit	Y		Size 2XL	1	Each		NO BID
Compliance Review	Y		Size 3XL	1	Each		NO BID
Certificate of Compliance	Y		Size 4XL	1	Each		NO BID
Statement of Contractor's Qualification	Y	2.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Long Sleeve Shirt, Sizes XS - XL	1	Each		NO BID
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda	N		Size 2XL	1	Each		NO BID
Bidder's Quote	Y		Size 3XL	1	Each		NO BID
Bidder's Exceptions	NONE		Size 4XL	1	Each		NO BID
Contractor's Utilization Plan	Y	3.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Short Sleeve Shirt, Sizes: XS - XL	1	Each		NO BID
Greater KC Metro Area Memo			Size 2XL	1	Each		NO BID
			Size 3XL	1	Each		NO BID
			Size 4XL	1	Each		NO BID
Contracts: See attached.		4.0	XS - XL	1	Each		NO BID
			Size 2XL	1	Each		NO BID
			Size 3XL	1	Each		NO BID
			Size 4XL	1	Each		NO BID
References: See attached.		5.0	Elbeco #436N Long Sleeve Shirt, Sizes: XS - XL, Neck 14-22	1	Each		NO BID
			Size 2XL	1	Each		NO BID
			Size 3XL	1	Each		NO BID
			Size 4XL	1	Each		NO BID
		6.0	Elbeco #E8149, LA County Sheriff's Prestige Trousers for Men, Sizes: 28 - 42	1	Each		NO BID
			Size 44-46	1	Each		NO BID
			Size 48-52	1	Each		NO BID

		Size 54-58	1	Each		NO BID
7.0		Elbeco #E8150, LA County Sheriff's Prestige Trousers for Women, Sizes 6 – 14	1	Each		NO BID
		Size 16-18	1	Each		NO BID
		Size 20-24	1	Each		NO BID
		Size 26-28	1	Each		NO BID
8.0		Neece Rain Suit – Jacket, Hood, Pants	1	Each		NO BID
9.0		Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Clip-on, 18"	1	Each		NO BID
		Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Clip-on, 20"	1	Each		NO BID
10.0		Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Velcro, 18"	1	Each		NO BID
		Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Velcro, 20"	1	Each		NO BID
11.0		Stratton #S-42CG, Straw Sheriff's Hat	1	Each		NO BID
12.0		Spiewak Style #S3182 Soft Shell, Spiewak Style #SH3466 Outer, Sizes: S – XL	1	Each		NO BID
		Size 2XL	1	Each		NO BID
		Size 3XL	1	Each		NO BID
		Size 4XL	1	Each		NO BID
		Size 5XL	1	Each		NO BID
13.0		Don Hume, #B125, Black, Velcro Belt, Basket Weave, Sizes: 24 – 42	1	Each	Safariland	\$ 25.51
		Size 44-46	1	Each	Safariland	\$ 25.94
		Size 48-52	1	Each	Safariland	\$ 26.64
		Size 54-60	1	Each	Safariland	\$ 27.09
14.0		Safariland #146-XX-4B, Black with Brass Buckle, Border Patrol Belt, Sizes: 24 – 42	1	Each	Safariland	\$ 46.49
		Size 44-46	1	Each	Safariland	\$ 47.62
		Size 48-52	1	Each	Safariland	\$ 51.02

		Size 54-60	1	Each	Safariland	\$	55.56
15.0		Safariland #6280-83-61 R/H, Right Hand Holster	1	Each	Safariland	\$	109.15
16.0		Safariland #6280-83-61 L/H, Left Hand Holster	1	Each	Safariland	\$	109.15
17.0		Safariland #38 w/Flap, Closed Top Chemical Holder,	1	Each	Safariland	\$	19.84
18.0		Safariland #90-4B, Open Top Handcuff Pouch for Hinged Handcuffs,	1	Each	Safariland	\$	19.84
19.0		Safariland #65, Belt Keeper 4 Pack	1	Each	Safariland	\$	8.51
20.0		Sergeant Stripes, Gold on Green	1	Each			NO BID
21.0		Back Patch "Sheriff", 11" x 4", Gold on Black	1	Each			NO BID
22.0		Sewing Services to attach Shoulder Patch (Item 3.3.1) to uniform	1	Each			NO BID
23.0		Sewing Services to attach Badge Patch	1	Each			NO BID
24.0		Sewing Services to attach Sergeant Stripes	1	Each			NO BID
25.0		Sewing Services to attach Back Patch	1	Each			NO BID
26.0		Sewing Services to attach one pair of Black Stripes	1	Each			NO BID
27.0		Sewing Services to alter shirts as necessary for proper fit for Officer	1	Each			NO BID
28.0		Sewing Services D57:D66 to alter pants/trousers as necessary for proper fit for Officer	1	Each			NO BID
29.0		Miscellaneous Catalog Items - percentage off MSRP					10%

Comments:

Bid No: 1-18

Commodity: Sheriff's Uniforms

Vendor: The Armory

Bid Recap		Quote					
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS	Yes/No	Item #	Item Name	QTY	Unit	Manufacturer	Amount
Contract Signed	Y	1.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Pant, Sizes XS - XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 44.95
Affidavit	Y		Size 2XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 44.95
Compliance Review	Y		Size 3XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 54.95
Certificate of Compliance	N		Size 4XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 54.95
Statement of Contractor's Qualification	Y	2.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Long Sleeve Shirt, Sizes XS - XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 49.95
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda	N		Size 2XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 49.95
Bidder's Quote	Y		Size 3XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 54.95
Bidder's Exceptions	Y		Size 4XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 54.95
Contractor's Utilization Plan	Y	3.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Short Sleeve Shirt, Sizes: XS - XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 49.95
Greater KC Metro Area Memo	NA		Size 2XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 49.95
			Size 3XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 54.95
			Size 4XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 54.95
		4.0	Elbeco #4238N Short Sleeve Shirt, Sizes XS - XL	1	Each		SEE EXCEPTIONS
			Size 2XL	1	Each		SEE EXCEPTIONS
			Size 3XL	1	Each		SEE EXCEPTIONS
			Size 4XL	1	Each		SEE EXCEPTIONS
		5.0	Elbeco #436N Long Sleeve Shirt, Sizes: XS - XL, Neck 14+22	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 89.95
			Size 2XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 98.95
			Size 3XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 107.95
			Size 4XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 116.94
		6.0	Elbeco #E8149, LA County Sheriff's Prestige Trousers for Men, Sizes: 28 - 42	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 75.95
			Size 44-46	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 83.55
			Size 48-52	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 91.14
			Size 54-58	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 98.74
		7.0	Elbeco #E8150, LA County Sheriff's Prestige Trousers for Women, Sizes 6 - 14	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 78.95
			Size 16-18	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 83.55
			Size 20-24	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 91.14

			Size 26-28	1	Each	Elbeco	\$	98.74
8.0			Neece Rain Suit - Jacket, Hood, Pants	1	Each	Neese	\$	239.90
9.0			Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Clip-on, 18"	1	Each	Samuel Broome	\$	6.50
			Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Clip-on, 20"	1	Each	Samuel Broome	\$	7.00
10.0			Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Velcro, 18"	1	Each	Samuel Broome	\$	6.50
			Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Velcro, 20"	1	Each	Samuel Broome	\$	7.00
11.0			Stratton #S-42CG, Straw Sheriff's Hat	1	Each	Stratton	\$	75.95
12.0			Spiewak Style #S3182 Soft Shell, Spiewak Style #SH3466 Outer, Sizes: S - XL	1	Each	Spiewak	\$	231.90
			Size 2XL	1	Each	Spiewak	\$	255.10
			Size 3XL	1	Each	Spiewak	\$	278.25
			Size 4XL	1	Each	Spiewak	\$	301.47
			Size 5XL	1	Each	Spiewak	\$	324.65
13.0			Don Hume, #B125, Black, Velcro Belt, Basket Weave, Sizes: 24 - 42	1	Each	Don Hume	\$	35.95
			Size 44-46	1	Each	Don Hume	\$	39.55
			Size 48-52	1	Each	Don Hume	\$	43.15
			Size 54-60	1	Each	Don Hume	\$	50.30
14.0			Safariland #146-XX-4B, Black with Brass Buckle, Border Patrol Belt, Sizes: 24 - 42	1	Each	Safariland	\$	78.95
			Size 44-46	1	Each	Safariland	\$	78.95
			Size 48-52	1	Each	Safariland	\$	86.85
			Size 54-60	1	Each	Safariland	\$	102.60
15.0			Safariland #6280-83-61 R/H, Right Hand Holster	1	Each	Safariland	\$	165.95
16.0			Safariland #6280-83-61 L/H, Left Hand Holster	1	Each	Safariland	\$	165.95
17.0			Safariland #38 w/Flap, Closed Top Chemical Holder,	1	Each	Safariland	\$	29.95
18.0			Safariland #90-4B, Open Top Handcuff Pouch for Hinged Handcuffs,	1	Each	Safariland	\$	27.95
19.0			Safariland #65, Belt Keeper 4 Pack	1	Each	Safariland	\$	14.95
20.0			Sergeant Stripes, Gold on Green	1	Each		\$	4.00

Bid No: 1-18

Commodity: Sheriff's Uniforms

Vendor: LE Upfitter

Bid Recap		Quote					
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS	Yes/No	Item #	Item Name	QTY	Unit	Manufacturer	Amount
Contract Signed	Y	1.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Pant, Sizes XS - XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 44.67
Affidavit	Y		Size 2XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 44.67
Compliance Review	Y		Size 3XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 51.33
Certificate of Compliance	N		Size 4XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 51.33
Statement of Contractor's Qualification	Y	2.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Long Sleeve Shirt, Sizes XS - XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 44.00
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda	Y		Size 2XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 44.00
Bidder's Quote	Y		Size 3XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 50.67
Bidder's Exceptions	Y		Size 4XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 50.67
Contractor's Utilization Plan	N	3.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Short Sleeve Shirt, Sizes: XS - XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 44.00
Greater KC Metro Area Memo	NA		Size 2XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 44.00
			Size 3XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 50.67
			Size 4XL	1	Each	5.11	\$ 50.67
		4.0	Elbeco #4238N Short Sleeve Shirt, Sizes XS - XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 56.07
			Size 2XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 67.29
			Size 3XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 67.29
			Size 4XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 78.50
		5.0	Elbeco #436N Long Sleeve Shirt, Sizes: XS - XL, Neck 14-22	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 96.64
			Size 2XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 115.97
			Size 3XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 115.97
			Size 4XL	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 135.30
		6.0	Elbeco #E8149, L.A County Sheriff's Prestige Trousers for Men, Sizes: 28 - 42	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 80.14
			Size 44-46	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 88.16
			Size 48-52	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 96.17
			Size 54-58	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 104.19
		7.0	Elbeco #E8150, L.A County Sheriff's Prestige Trousers for Women, Sizes 6 - 14	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 80.14
			Size 16-18	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 80.14
			Size 20-24	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 88.16
			Size 26-28	1	Each	Elbeco	\$ 96.17

8.0	Neece Rain Suit – Jacket, Hood, Pants	1	Each	Neese	See Exceptions
9.0	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Clip-on, 18"	1	Each	Samuel Broome	\$ 4.17
	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Clip-on, 20"	1	Each	Samuel Broome	\$ 4.33
10.0	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Velcro, 18"	1	Each	Samuel Broome	\$ 6.58
	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Velcro, 20"	1	Each	Samuel Broome	\$ 6.75
11.0	Stratton #S-42CG, Straw Sheriff's Hat	1	Each	Stratton	\$ 83.00
12.0	Spiewak Style #S3182 Soft Shell, Spiewak Style #SH3466 Outer, Sizes: S – XL	1	Each		See Exceptions
	Size 2XL	1	Each		See Exceptions
	Size 3XL	1	Each		See Exceptions
	Size 4XL	1	Each		See Exceptions
	Size 5XL	1	Each		See Exceptions
13.0	Don Hume, #BI25, Black, Velcro Belt, Basket Weave, Sizes: 24 – 42	1	Each	Duty Man	\$ 20.00
	Size 44-46	1	Each	Duty Man	\$ 24.00
	Size 48-52	1	Each	Duty Man	\$ 26.00
	Size 54-60	1	Each	Duty Man	n/a
14.0	Safariland #146-XX-4B, Black with Brass Buckle, Border Patrol Belt, Sizes: 24 – 42	1	Each	Safariland	\$ 56.67
	Size 44-46	1	Each	Safariland	\$ 62.19
	Size 48-52	1	Each	Safariland	\$ 62.19
	Size 54-60	1	Each	Safariland	\$ 64.96
15.0	Safariland #6280-83-61 R/H, Right Hand Holster	1	Each	Safariland	\$ 137.44
16.0	Safariland #6280-83-61 L/H, Left Hand Holster	1	Each	Safariland	\$ 137.44
17.0	Safariland #38 w/Flap, Closed Top Chemical Holder,	1	Each	Safariland	\$ 24.19
18.0	Safariland #90-4B, Open Top Handcuff Pouch for Hinged Handcuffs,	1	Each	Safariland	\$ 24.19
19.0	Safariland #65, Belt Keeper 4 Pack	1	Each	Safariland	\$ 10.03
20.0	Sergeant Stripes, Gold on Green	1	Each		\$ 7.00
21.0	Back Patch "Sheriff", 11" x 4", Gold on Black	1	Each		\$ 4.00

STATEMENT OF CONTRACTOR'S QUALIFICATIONS
(Complete in full, Use attachments if necessary)

Name of Bidder: GearZone Tactical	
Address with Zip Code: 805 SE 3rd St Suite C	
Federal Tax I.D. Number: 81-3900917	
Check One: Corporation <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Partnership <input type="checkbox"/> Sole Proprietorship <input type="checkbox"/>	
If SOLE PROPRIETORSHIP , state name, address and phone number of owner:	
IF CORPORATION:	
Date of Incorporation: Sept 2016	Name of State(s) in which incorporated: Mo
President's Name: Tracy Rinehart	Vice-President's Name:
Secretary's Name: Tracy Rinehart	Treasurer's Name: Tracy Rinehart
IF PARTNERSHIP:	
Is the Partnership: General <input type="checkbox"/> Limited <input type="checkbox"/> Association <input type="checkbox"/> (Check one)	
Date of Organization:	
Name and addresses of all partners:	
1.	
2.	
3.	
GENERAL INFORMATION:	
Percent of work to be done under the proposed contract by your own staff:	
No. of Permanent Employees: 4	Geographical Limits of Operation: none - in City limit of Lee's Summit
No. of years in business: 1 yr 6 mo's	
Have you ever done business under a different name: Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No <input type="checkbox"/> (Check one)	
If Yes, give Name and Location: Currently in business as Gear Zone LLC 7901 E State Rte W Freeman MO 64746 Length of business in the industry 12 yrs.	
Has contractor ever withdrawn or defaulted on a contractual obligation: Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> (Check one)	
If Yes, state where and why:	

STATEMENT OF CONTRACTOR'S QUALIFICATIONS - Continued

Has Contractor ever been sued for breach of any contract? Yes No <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> (Check one)			
If Yes, Explain:			
List Completed Contracts within the Past Three Years, Including Amount of Each: Truman Pres Library - Deco Totaling \$41,000 approx to date State of Kansas Dept of Corrections - \$250,000 to date			
List of Current Contracts, Including Amount of Each: Truman Pres Library ongoing contract per Deco			
Customer Reference (state name, address, and phone number): Belton Police Dept Lt Travis George 816-726-4562 Fire Marshal Randy Powers 816-223-6896 Truman Pres Library Keith Rosewaren 816-268-8251			
List each subcontractor you plan to use if awarded the contract. If no, so state.			
SUBCONTRACTOR'S NAME & PHONE #	ITEM OF WORK	\$ AMOUNT OF CONTRACT	MBE/WBE
NA			
State any other relevant information concerning Contractor's history, credentials, responsibility and capabilities (If none, so state): Contractor has been fulfilling contracts for agencies for Gear Zone LLC for 12.5 yrs. with extensive experience in this type of contractual business			
DBE STATUS Indicate status claimed:			
1. Minority Owned Business (MBE) YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/> <i>Not Certified</i> African American ___ Latino ___ Native American ___ Asian ___ Pacific Islander ___			
2. Woman Owned Business (WBE) YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/> Not certified			
3. Small Business YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/>			
For consideration as an MBE, WBE or Small Business, a copy of any governmental entity or Minority Supplier Council certification must be attached.			
Prepared by (print or type): Tracy Rinehart		Title: Member/Owner	
Signature: <i>Tracy Rinehart</i>		Date: 1/26/2018	

11.0 QUOTATION

NO.	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER BID	UNIT PRICE
	Uniform Apparel		
1.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Pant – Green (190) 65% Poly, 35% Cotton Sizes: XS – XL	5.11 Tactical 74003	\$ 43.49
	Size 2XL	5.11 Tactical 74003	\$ 43.49
	Size 3XL	5.11 Tactical 74003	\$ 49.99
	Size 4XL	5.11 Tactical 74003	\$ 49.99
2.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Long Sleeve Shirt – Green (190) 65% Poly, 35% Cotton Sizes: XS – XL	5.11 Tactical 72002	\$ 43.49
	Size 2XL	5.11 Tactical 72002	\$ 43.49
	Size 3XL	5.11 Tactical 72002	\$ 49.99
	Size 4XL	5.11 Tactical 72002	\$ 49.99
3.0	5.11 TDU Ripstop Short Sleeve Shirt Green (190) 65% Poly, 35% Cotton Sizes: XS – XL	5.11 Tactical 71339	\$ 43.49
	Size 2XL	5.11 Tactical 71339	\$ 43.49
	Size 3XL	5.11 Tactical 71339	\$ 49.99
	Size 4XL	5.11 Tactical 71339	\$ 49.99
4.0	Elbeco #4238N Short Sleeve Shirt LA County Sheriff's Department, Tan New Style # is 5030 Sizes: XS – XL	Elbeco #5030	\$ 53.49
	Size 2XL 17.5 - 18 neck	Elbeco #5030	\$ 53.49
	Size 3XL 18.5 - 20 neck	Elbeco #5030	\$ 61.86
	Size 4XL 22 neck	Elbeco #5030	\$ 70.22
5.0	Elbeco #436N Long Sleeve Shirt California Highway Patrol, Silvertan Sizes: XS – XL, Neck 14 – 22	Elbeco	\$ 87.95
	Size 2XL 17.5 - 18 neck	Elbeco	\$ 87.95
	Size 3XL 18.5 - 20 neck	Elbeco	\$ 105.95
	Size 4XL 22 neck	Elbeco	\$ 115.80
6.0	Elbeco #E8149 LA County Sheriff's Prestige Trousers for Men	Elbeco	\$

NO.	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER BID	UNIT PRICE
	Sizes: 28 – 42	Elbeco	73.95
	Sizes: 44 – 46 (44-50)	Elbeco	\$ 81.99
	Sizes: 48 - 52 (52-54)	Elbeco	\$ 89.99
	Sizes: 54 - 58 (56-58)	Elbeco	\$ 97.89
7.0	Elbeco #E8150 LA County Sheriff's Prestige Trousers for Women Sizes 6 – 14	Elbeco	\$ 73.95
	Sizes: 16 – 18	Elbeco	\$ 73.95
	Sizes: 20 – 24	Elbeco	\$ 81.99
	Sizes: 26 – 28	Elbeco	\$ 89.99
	ACCESSORIES		
8.0	Neece Rain Suit – Jacket, Hood, Pants Sizes: S – XL		\$ 249.99
9.0	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Clip-on, 18"	Rothco	\$ 5.99
	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Clip-on, 20"	Rothco	\$ 5.99
10.0	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Velcro, 18"	Rothco	\$ 7.99
	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Velcro, 20"	Rothco	\$ 7.99
11.0	Stratton #S-42CG, Straw Sheriff's Hat, Conservation Green with CD-GD Cords with Black 3-piece Leather Chin Strap and Stratton Gold Cords with Acorns, with Rain Cap	Stratton Hats	\$ 84.99
12.0	Spiewak Style #S3182 Soft Shell Spiewak Style #SH3466 Outer Sizes: S – XL	Tact Squad style F1006GN	\$ 170.00
	Size 2XL	Tact Squad F1006GN	\$ 170.00
	Size 3XL	Tact Squad F1006GN	\$ 175.00
	Size 4XL	Tact Squad F1006GN	\$ 175.00
	Size 5XL	Tact Squad F1006GN	\$ 185.00
13.0	Don Hume, #B125, Black, Velcro Belt, Basket Weave Sizes: 24 – 42	Safariland Model 99-XX-4	\$ 27.99
	Sizes: 44 – 46	Safariland Model 99-XX-4	\$ 29.99
	Sizes: 48 - 52	Safariland Model 99-XX-4	\$ 31.99
	Sizes: 54 – 60	Safariland Model 99-XX-4	\$ 34.99
14.0	Safariland #146-XX-4B, Black with Brass Buckle, Border Patrol Belt,	Safariland	\$

NO.	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER BID	UNIT PRICE
	Basket Weave Sizes: 24 – 42	Safariland	66.99
	Sizes: 44 – 46	Safariland	\$ 68.99
	Sizes: 48 – 52	Safariland	\$ 70.99
	Sizes: 54 – 60	Safariland	\$ 72.99
15.0	Safariland #6280-83-61 R/H, Right Hand Holster, Basket Weave, Mid-Level II Glock 17/22	Safariland	\$ 129.95
16.0	Safariland #6280-83-61 L/H, Left Hand Holster, Basket Weave, Mid-Level II Glock 17/22	Safariland	\$ 129.95
17.0	Safariland #38 w/Flap, Closed Top Chemical Holder, Black, Basket Weave, Brass Snap	Safariland	\$ 23.49
18.0	Safariland #90-4B, Open Top Handcuff Pouch for Hinged Handcuffs, Black, Basket Weave, Brass Snap	Safariland	\$ 25.49
19.0	Safariland #65, Belt Keeper 4 Pack, Black Basket Weave, Brass Snap	Safariland	\$ 12.99
	PATCHES		
20.0	Sergeant Stripes, Gold on Green	N/A	\$ 3.00
21.0	Back Patch "Sheriff", 11" x 4", Gold on Black	N/A	\$ 4.99
	SEWING/ALTERATION SERVICES		
22.0	Sewing Services to attach Shoulder Patch (Item 3.3.1) to uniform	N/A	\$ 3.00 Set
23.0	Sewing Services to attach Badge Patch (Item 3.3.2) to uniform	N/A	\$ 2.00
24.0	Sewing Services to attach Sergeant Stripes (Item 3.3.3) to uniform	N/A	\$ 3.00 Set
25.0	Sewing Services to attach Back Patch (Item 3.3.4) to uniform	N/A	\$ 2.00
26.0	Sewing Services to attach one pair of Black Stripes (Item 3.3.5) onto Trousers	N/A	\$ 10.00
27.0	Sewing Services to alter shirts as necessary for proper fit for Officer	N/A	\$ 10.00
28.0	Sewing Services to alter pants/trousers as necessary for proper fit for Officer	N/A	\$ 10.00 other than hemming Hemming \$5.00
	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS		DISCOUNT OFFERED
29.0	Miscellaneous Catalog Items – list percentage discount off Manufacturer's List Price for miscellaneous catalog orders. If you are offering more than one discount, include on your letterhead sheets as necessary to make your bid complete.		10 %

EXHIBIT A, INSURANCE

Contractor shall procure and maintain in effect throughout this duration of the contract insurance coverages not less than the types and amounts specified in this section. If due to the nature of the goods and/or services provided by the contractor are such that they may be excluded from coverage listed below, an addendum shall be made to the contract requesting coverage and limits required (Professional Liability, Work on bodies of water, Garage or tow services, Liquor liability are some examples).

All subcontractors of the contractor are required to carry the same coverages and limits as the contractor. All Liability policies required are to be written on an "occurrence" basis unless an agreement, in writing, is made with Jackson County.

1. COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY

Commercial General Liability Insurance: with limits of not less than \$1,000,000 per occurrence and \$2,000,000 Annual Aggregate (both General and Products-Completed Operations). Aggregate shall be on a "per project" basis where more than one project is to be performed by the contractor under this contract. Policy shall include Severability of Interests coverage applying to Additional Insureds and also include Contractual Liability with no limitation endorsements. Policy shall include \$100,000 limit each occurrence for Damage to Rented Premises, \$1,000,000 limit each occurrence for Personal & Advertising injury liability, \$5,000 Medical Expense (any one person), and Employee Benefits Liability coverage with a \$1,000,000 limit.

2. COMMERCIAL AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY

Commercial Automobile Liability Insurance: with a limit not less than \$1,000,000 Combined Single Limit for Bodily Injury and Property Damage Limit (each accident), covering owned, hired, borrowed, and non owned vehicles. Coverage shall be provided on a "any auto" basis and be on a Commercial Business Auto form, or acceptable equivalent, and will protect against claims arising out of the operation of motor vehicles in connection with this contract.

3. WORKERS COMPENSATION AND EMPLOYERS LIABILITY COVERAGE

Contractor shall provide coverage for Workers Compensation and Employers Liability for all claims by employees of the contractor or by anyone for whose acts it may be liable under the statutes of the State of Missouri with limits of:

-Workers Compensation	Statutory
-Employers Liability	\$500,000 each accident
	\$500,000 Disease-each employee
	\$500,000 Disease-Policy limit

4. EXCESS/UMBRELLA LIABILITY COVERAGE

Contractor shall provide Excess/Umbrella liability, on an occurrence basis, with \$10,000 Retention, to provide coverage limits over all liability coverages listed above, at a limit not less than \$1,000,000 each occurrence and \$1,000,000 Aggregate.

5. ADDITIONAL INSURED & CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

The Commercial General and Automobile Liability Insurance specified above shall provide that Jackson County Missouri and its agencies, officials, officers, and employees, while acting within the scope of their authority, will be named as additional insured for the services performed under this contract.

A Certificate of Insurance shall be filed with the County's Director of Finance and Purchasing within 10 calendar days of the date when requested or before commencement of the work that are acceptable to the Director that the insurance requirements have been satisfied. Should any of the required insurances be cancelled before the expiration date, a notice shall be filed with the County's Director of Finance and Purchasing in accordance with policy provisions. In the case of multi-year, renewable, or extended term on the contract; Contractor must supply the Director with current Certificate(s) on any coverage mentioned above within Thirty (30) days prior to the expiration date of coverage(s). The Director of Finance and Purchasing may request copies of the Contractor's insurance policies for verification of coverage(s).

6. QUALIFICATIONS INSURANCE CARRIERS

All insurance coverage must be written by companies that have an A. M. Best's rating of "B+ V" or better or Lloyd's of London, and are licensed and approved by the State of Missouri to do business in Missouri.

7. FAILURE TO MAINTAIN INSURANCE COVERAGE

Regardless of any approval by Jackson County, it is the responsibility of the contractor to maintain the required insurance coverage in force at all times; its failure to do so will not relieve it of any contractual obligation or responsibility. In the event of Contractor's failure to maintain the required insurance in effect, Jackson County may order Contractor to stop work immediately and, upon 10 days notice and an opportunity to cure, may pursue its remedies for breach of this contract as provided for herein and by law.

