

REQUEST FOR LEGISLATIVE ACTION

Completed by County Counselor's Office:

Res/Ord No.: 19007

Sponsor(s): Alfred Jordan

Date: November 23, 2015

<p>SUBJECT</p>	<p>Action Requested <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Resolution <input type="checkbox"/> Ordinance</p> <p>Project/Title: <u>Awarding a Twenty-Four Month Term and Supply Contract with three Twelve-Month extension options for the furnishing of Inmate Clothing for the Department of Corrections to Bob Barker Co. Inc. of Fuquay Varina, NC; Victory Supply Inc. of Lexington, KY; and O.D. Taragin & Bros, LLC of Baltimore, MD under the Terms and Conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 41-15.</u></p>																		
<p>BUDGET INFORMATION <i>To be completed By Requesting Department and Finance</i></p>	<table border="1"> <tr> <td>Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year:</td> <td></td> <td>\$</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Amount previously authorized this fiscal year:</td> <td></td> <td>\$</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Total amount authorized after this legislative action:</td> <td></td> <td>\$</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Amount budgeted for this item * (including transfers):</td> <td></td> <td>\$</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Source of funding (name of fund) and account code number; FROM / TO</td> <td>FROM ACCT</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td></td> <td>TO ACCT</td> <td></td> </tr> </table> <p>* If account includes additional funds for other expenses, total budgeted in the account is: \$</p> <p>OTHER FINANCIAL INFORMATION:</p> <p><input type="checkbox"/> No budget impact (no fiscal note required) <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Term and Supply Contract (funds approved in the annual budget); estimated value and use of contract: Department: Corrections Estimated Use: \$60,000.00</p> <p>The RLA only approves the term and supply contract; funds were already appropriated through the annual budget adoption. Figures included in the background section are for informational purposes to provide an estimate of contract value.</p> <p>Prior Year Budget (if applicable): \$60,000.00 Prior Year Actual Amount Spent (if applicable): \$73,726.85</p>	Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year:		\$	Amount previously authorized this fiscal year:		\$	Total amount authorized after this legislative action:		\$	Amount budgeted for this item * (including transfers):		\$	Source of funding (name of fund) and account code number; FROM / TO	FROM ACCT			TO ACCT	
Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year:		\$																	
Amount previously authorized this fiscal year:		\$																	
Total amount authorized after this legislative action:		\$																	
Amount budgeted for this item * (including transfers):		\$																	
Source of funding (name of fund) and account code number; FROM / TO	FROM ACCT																		
	TO ACCT																		
<p>PRIOR LEGISLATION</p>	<p>Prior ordinances and (date): N/A Prior resolutions and (date): 17644, August 8, 2011</p>																		
<p>CONTACT INFORMATION</p>	<p>RLA drafted by (name, title, & phone): Jessica Johnson, Senior Buyer, 881-3465</p>																		
<p>REQUEST SUMMARY</p>	<p>The Department of Corrections requires a term and supply contract for inmate clothing. Purchasing issued Invitation to Bid No. 41-15.</p> <p>A total of 51 notifications were distributed and eight (8) responses received.</p> <p>The Department of Corrections reviewed samples of each item and recommends the awards as follows:</p> <table> <tr> <td>BIDDER</td> <td>ITEMS RECOMMENDED</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Bob Barker Co., Fuquay Varina, NC</td> <td>4.1 thru 4.3 and 4.7 thru 4.12</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Victory Supply Inc., Lexington, KY</td> <td>4.4 and 4.6</td> </tr> <tr> <td>O.D. Taragin & Bros, LLC, Baltimore, MD</td> <td>4.5</td> </tr> </table>	BIDDER	ITEMS RECOMMENDED	Bob Barker Co., Fuquay Varina, NC	4.1 thru 4.3 and 4.7 thru 4.12	Victory Supply Inc., Lexington, KY	4.4 and 4.6	O.D. Taragin & Bros, LLC, Baltimore, MD	4.5										
BIDDER	ITEMS RECOMMENDED																		
Bob Barker Co., Fuquay Varina, NC	4.1 thru 4.3 and 4.7 thru 4.12																		
Victory Supply Inc., Lexington, KY	4.4 and 4.6																		
O.D. Taragin & Bros, LLC, Baltimore, MD	4.5																		

	<p>The Department of Corrections evaluated samples of each item for durability and recommended the lowest and best bid for each on quality as well as pricing.</p> <p>Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, 1984, the Director of Finance and Purchasing recommends the award for the furnishing of Inmate Clothing for the Department of Corrections to Bob Barker Co. Inc. of Fuquay Varina, NC; Victory Supply Inc. of Lexington, KY and O.D. Taragin & Bros, LLC of Baltimore, MD; under the Terms and Conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 41-15; as the lowest and best bidder for each item.</p> <p>This award is made on an "As Needed" basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specified purchases is subject to annual appropriations.</p>	
CLEARANCE	<input type="checkbox"/> Tax Clearance Completed (Purchasing & Department) <input type="checkbox"/> Business License Verified (Purchasing & Department) <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Chapter 6 Compliance - Affirmative Action/Prevailing Wage (County Auditor's Office)	
ATTACHMENTS	Abstract of Bids; Recap of Prices; and Evaluation Memo from Ms. Laura Scott, Corrections Department	
REVIEW	Department Director: <i>Joe Rasmussen</i>	Date: 11-12-15
	Finance (Budget Approval): <i>If applicable</i> <i>Mary Rasmussen</i>	Date: 11/12/15
	Division Manager: <i>Mary Lou Brown</i>	Date: 11/17/15
	County Counselor's Office.	Date:

Fiscal Information (to be verified by Budget Office in Finance Department)

- This expenditure was included in the annual budget.
- Funds for this were encumbered from the _____ Fund in _____.
- There is a balance otherwise unencumbered to the credit of the appropriation to which the expenditure is chargeable and there is a cash balance otherwise unencumbered in the treasury to the credit of the fund from which payment is to be made each sufficient to provide for the obligation herein authorized.
- Funds sufficient for this expenditure will be/were appropriated by Ordinance # _____
- Funds sufficient for this appropriation are available from the source indicated below.

Account Number:	Account Title:	Amount Not to Exceed:

- This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as each using agency places its order.
- This legislative action does not impact the County financially and does not require Finance/Budget approval.

BID NO: 41-15 DATE: 7/28/2015 COMMODITY: Inmate Clothing		Uniforms MFG Inc.	VSI	OD Taragin	Bob Barker
NO	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT
NO	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	QTY	AMOUNT	AMOUNT
1	Sports Bras			No bid	19.20
2	Total for Sizes 4.2			No bid	See bid
3	Night Shirts			80.76	69.85
4	Total for Sizes 4.4			55,890.00	See bid
5	Total for Sizes 4.5			25,709.50	See bid
6	Total for all Sizes 4.6			8,187.90	See bid
7	Total for Sizes 4.7			2,199.60	See bid
8	Shower Shoes 4.8			No bid	6.79
9	Total for Size 4.9			7,054.50	See bid
10	Socks 4.10			7.34	5.11
11	Total for All Sizes & Colors 4.11			105,359.40	See bid
12	Total for Sizes 4.12			No bid	See bid

CERTIFICATION OF BID OPENING
 BIDS WERE PUBLICLY
 OPENED AND RECORDED

ON: July 28, 2015 BY

CLERK OF THE LEGISLATURE

 PURCHASING

BID NO: 41-15		DATE: 7/28/2015		COMMODITY: Inmate Clothing		Gold Water Industries, Inc.		Carolina Textiles		ICS Jails Supplies Inc		Acme Supply Co., LTD	
NO	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	QTY	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT
1	Sports Bras			No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
2	Total for Sizes 4.2			No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
3	Night Shirts			No bid	84.76	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
4	Total for Sizes 4.4			No bid	see bid	No bid	56,797.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
5	Total for Sizes 4.5			No bid	see bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
6	Total for all Sizes 4.6			8,327.15	No bid	No bid	18,150.60	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
7	Total for Sizes 4.7			1,938.30	No bid	No bid	2,784.60	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
8	Shower Shoes			No bid	No bid	No bid	734.50	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
9	Total for Size 4.9			No bid	No bid	No bid	291.10	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
10	Socks			No bid	6.92	No bid	6.36	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	5.25	No bid
11	Total for All Sizes & Colors 4.11			No bid	No bid	No bid	175,324.75	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	111,050.00	No bid
12	Total for Sizes 4.12			No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid

CERTIFICATION OF BID OPENING
 BIDS WERE PUBLICLY
 OPENED AND RECORDED

ON: July 28, 2015 BY

CLERK OF THE LEGISLATURE

[Signature]
 PURCHASING

Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.	VSI - Victory Supply Inc.	O.D. Taragin & Bros., LLC	Bob Barker Company, Inc.	Gold Water Industries	Carolina Textiles	ICS Jail Supplies	ACME
-----------------------------	---------------------------	---------------------------	--------------------------	-----------------------	-------------------	-------------------	------

4.6 Tennis Shoes, Slip On: Men	Pair Price	Pair Price	Pair Price	Pair Price	Pair Price	Pair Price	Pair Price
Size Men 7	\$ 4.12	\$ 2.94	\$ 5.57	\$ 4.71	\$ 2.99	no bid	\$ 6.76
Size Men 8	\$ 4.12	\$ 2.94	\$ 5.57	\$ 4.71	\$ 2.99	no bid	\$ 6.76
Size Men 9	\$ 4.12	\$ 2.94	\$ 5.57	\$ 4.71	\$ 2.99	no bid	\$ 6.76
Size Men 10	\$ 4.12	\$ 2.94	\$ 5.57	\$ 4.71	\$ 2.99	no bid	\$ 6.76
Size Men 11	\$ 4.12	\$ 2.94	\$ 5.57	\$ 4.71	\$ 2.99	no bid	\$ 6.76
Size Men 12	\$ 4.12	\$ 2.94	\$ 5.57	\$ 4.71	\$ 2.99	no bid	\$ 6.76
Size Men 13	\$ 4.12	\$ 2.94	\$ 5.57	\$ 4.71	\$ 2.99	no bid	\$ 6.76
Size Men 14	\$ 4.12	\$ 2.94	\$ 5.57	\$ 4.71	\$ 2.99	no bid	\$ 6.76
Size Men 15	\$ 4.12	\$ 2.94	\$ 5.57	\$ 4.71	\$ 2.99	no bid	\$ 6.76
Size Men 16	\$ 4.14	\$ 2.94	\$ 6.65	\$ 4.71	\$ 2.99	no bid	\$ 6.76
Size Men 17	no bid	\$ 2.94	\$ 6.65	\$ 4.71	\$ 2.99	no bid	\$ 6.76
Size Men 18	no bid	\$ 2.94	\$ 6.65	\$ 4.71	\$ 2.99	no bid	\$ 6.76
Size Men 19	no bid	\$ 2.94	\$ 6.65	\$ 4.71	\$ 2.99	no bid	\$ 6.76
Size Men 20	no bid	\$ 2.94	no bid	\$ 4.71	\$ 2.99	no bid	\$ 6.76
Tennis Shoes, Slip On, Women	Pair Price	Pair Price	Pair Price	Pair Price	Pair Price	Pair Price	Pair Price
Size Women 5	\$ 4.12	\$ 2.94	\$ 5.57	\$ 4.71	\$ 2.99	no bid	\$ 6.76
Size Women 6	\$ 4.12	\$ 2.94	\$ 5.57	\$ 4.71	\$ 2.99	no bid	\$ 6.76
Size Women 7	\$ 4.12	\$ 2.94	\$ 5.57	\$ 4.71	\$ 2.99	no bid	\$ 6.76
Size Women 8	\$ 4.12	\$ 2.94	\$ 5.57	\$ 4.71	\$ 2.99	no bid	\$ 6.76
Size Women 9	\$ 4.12	\$ 2.94	\$ 5.57	\$ 4.71	\$ 2.99	no bid	\$ 6.76
Size Women 10	\$ 4.12	\$ 2.94	\$ 5.57	\$ 4.71	\$ 2.99	no bid	\$ 6.76

4.7 Tennis Shoes, Velcro Closures, Men	Pair Price	Pair Price	Pair Price	Pair Price	Pair Price	Pair Price	Pair Price
Size Men 5	\$ 5.27	\$ 5.64	\$ 7.97	\$ 5.96	\$ 4.97	no bid	\$ 7.14
Size Men 6	\$ 5.27	\$ 5.64	\$ 7.97	\$ 5.96	\$ 4.97	no bid	\$ 7.14
Size Men 7	\$ 5.27	\$ 5.64	\$ 7.97	\$ 5.96	\$ 4.97	no bid	\$ 7.14
Size Men 8	\$ 5.27	\$ 5.64	\$ 7.97	\$ 5.96	\$ 4.97	no bid	\$ 7.14
Size Men 9	\$ 5.27	\$ 5.64	\$ 7.97	\$ 5.96	\$ 4.97	no bid	\$ 7.14
Size Men 10	\$ 5.27	\$ 5.64	\$ 7.97	\$ 5.96	\$ 4.97	no bid	\$ 7.14
Size Men 11	\$ 5.27	\$ 5.64	\$ 7.97	\$ 5.96	\$ 4.97	no bid	\$ 7.14
Size Men 12	\$ 5.27	\$ 5.64	\$ 7.97	\$ 5.96	\$ 4.97	no bid	\$ 7.14
Size Men 13	\$ 5.27	\$ 5.64	\$ 7.97	\$ 5.96	\$ 4.97	no bid	\$ 7.14
Size Men 14	\$ 5.27	\$ 5.64	\$ 7.97	\$ 5.96	\$ 4.97	no bid	\$ 7.14
Size Men 15	\$ 5.27	\$ 5.64	\$ 7.97	\$ 5.96	\$ 4.97	no bid	\$ 7.14
Size Men 16	\$ 5.27	\$ 5.64	\$ 9.05	\$ 5.96	\$ 4.97	no bid	\$ 7.14
Size Men 17	\$ 5.27	\$ 5.64	\$ 9.05	\$ 5.96	\$ 4.97	no bid	\$ 7.14
Size Men 18	no bid	\$ 5.64	\$ 8.82	no bid	\$ 4.97	no bid	\$ 7.14
Size Men 19	no bid	\$ 5.64	\$ 8.82	no bid	\$ 4.97	no bid	\$ 7.14
Size Men 20	no bid	\$ 5.64	no bid	no bid	\$ 4.97	no bid	\$ 7.14

4.8 Shower Shoes, Size X-Large	Dozen Price	Dozen Price	Dozen Price	Dozen Price	Dozen Price	Dozen Price	Dozen Price
	\$ 10.92	no bid	\$ 14.16	\$ 6.79	no bid	no bid	\$ 13.56

Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.	VSI - Victory Supply Inc.	O.D. Taragin & Bros., LLC	Bob Barker Company, Inc.	Gold Water Industries	Carolina Textiles	ICS Jail Supplies	ACME
-----------------------------	---------------------------	---------------------------	--------------------------	-----------------------	-------------------	-------------------	------

4.9 Molded Shoes	Dozen Price	Dozen Price	Dozen Price	Dozen Price	Dozen Price	Dozen Price	Dozen Price
Size Men 5-6	\$ 31.56	\$ 49.68	\$ 39.60	\$ 30.96	no bid	\$ 24.60	no bid
Size Men 7-8	\$ 31.56	\$ 49.68	\$ 39.60	\$ 30.96	no bid	\$ 24.60	no bid
Size Men 9-10	\$ 31.56	\$ 49.68	\$ 39.60	\$ 30.96	no bid	\$ 24.60	no bid
Size Men 11-12	\$ 31.56	\$ 49.68	\$ 39.60	\$ 30.96	no bid	\$ 24.60	no bid
Size Men 13-14	\$ 31.56	\$ 49.68	\$ 39.60	\$ 30.96	no bid	\$ 24.60	no bid
Size Men 15-16	\$ 31.56	\$ 49.68	\$ 39.60	\$ 30.96	no bid	\$ 24.60	no bid

4.10 Socks	Dozen Price	Dozen Price	Dozen Price	Dozen Price	Dozen Price	Dozen Price	Dozen Price
	\$ 5.49	\$ 7.34	\$ 8.58	\$ 5.11	no bid	\$ 6.92	\$ 6.36

4.1 Jumpsuits - Orange Coverall	Each Price	Each Price	Each Price	Each Price	Each Price	Each Price	Each Price
Size Small	\$ 10.66	\$ 10.49	\$ 15.36	\$ 10.86	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size Medium	\$ 10.66	\$ 10.49	\$ 15.36	\$ 10.86	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size Large	\$ 10.66	\$ 10.49	\$ 15.36	\$ 10.86	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size X Large	\$ 10.66	\$ 10.49	\$ 15.61	\$ 10.86	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 2X Large	\$ 11.55	\$ 10.97	\$ 15.61	\$ 10.86	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 3X Large	\$ 11.55	\$ 10.97	\$ 16.90	\$ 10.86	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 4X Large	\$ 11.55	\$ 11.44	\$ 16.90	\$ 10.86	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 5X Large	\$ 12.13	\$ 11.44	\$ 17.98	\$ 13.59	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 6X Large	\$ 12.70	\$ 12.87	\$ 18.20	\$ 13.59	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 7X Large	\$ 12.90	\$ 12.87	\$ 19.28	\$ 13.59	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 8X Large	\$ 13.27	\$ 12.87	\$ 20.59	\$ 13.59	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 9X Large	\$ 13.80	\$ 13.59	\$ 21.89	\$ 13.59	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 10X Large	\$ 14.50	\$ 13.59	\$ 21.89	\$ 13.59	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00

Jumpsuits - Blue Coveralls	Each Price	Each Price	Each Price	Each Price	Each Price	Each Price	Each Price
Size Small	\$ 9.60	\$ 10.49	\$ 15.36	\$ 10.86	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size Medium	\$ 9.60	\$ 10.49	\$ 15.36	\$ 10.86	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size Large	\$ 9.60	\$ 10.49	\$ 15.36	\$ 11.21	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size X Large	\$ 10.40	\$ 10.49	\$ 15.61	\$ 11.81	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 2X Large	\$ 10.84	\$ 10.97	\$ 15.61	\$ 12.31	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 3X Large	\$ 10.85	\$ 10.97	\$ 16.90	\$ 12.65	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 4X Large	\$ 11.50	\$ 11.44	\$ 16.90	\$ 13.33	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 5X Large	\$ 12.00	\$ 11.44	\$ 17.98	\$ 14.18	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 6X Large	\$ 12.50	\$ 12.87	\$ 18.20	\$ 14.98	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 7X Large	\$ 12.90	\$ 12.87	\$ 19.28	\$ 15.26	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 8X Large	\$ 13.00	\$ 12.87	\$ 20.59	\$ 15.54	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 9X Large	\$ 13.75	\$ 13.59	\$ 21.89	\$ 16.36	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 10X Large	\$ 14.10	\$ 13.59	\$ 21.89	\$ 16.92	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00

Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.		VSI - Victory Supply Inc.	O.D. Taragin & Bros., LLC	Bob Barker Company, Inc.	Gold Water Industries	Carolina Textiles	ICS Jail Supplies	ACME
Jumpsuits – Green Coverall								
	\$ 10.66	\$ 10.49	\$ 15.36	\$ 10.55	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size Small	\$ 10.66	\$ 10.49	\$ 15.36	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size Medium	\$ 10.66	\$ 10.49	\$ 15.36	\$ 11.21	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size Large	\$ 10.66	\$ 10.49	\$ 15.61	\$ 11.81	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size X Large	\$ 11.55	\$ 10.97	\$ 15.61	\$ 12.31	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 2X Large	\$ 11.55	\$ 10.97	\$ 16.90	\$ 12.65	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 3X Large	\$ 11.55	\$ 11.44	\$ 16.90	\$ 13.33	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 4X Large	\$ 12.13	\$ 11.44	\$ 17.98	\$ 14.18	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 5X Large	\$ 12.70	\$ 12.87	\$ 18.20	\$ 14.98	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 6X Large	\$ 12.90	\$ 12.87	\$ 19.28	\$ 15.28	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 7X Large	\$ 13.27	\$ 12.87	\$ 20.59	\$ 15.54	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 8X Large	\$ 13.80	\$ 13.59	\$ 21.89	\$ 16.36	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 9X Large	\$ 14.50	\$ 13.59	\$ 21.89	\$ 16.92	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 10X Large								
Jumpsuits – Khaki Coverall								
	\$ 9.60	\$ 10.49	\$ 15.36	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size Small	\$ 9.60	\$ 10.49	\$ 15.36	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size Medium	\$ 9.60	\$ 10.49	\$ 15.36	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size Large	\$ 10.40	\$ 10.49	\$ 15.61	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size X Large	\$ 10.84	\$ 10.97	\$ 15.61	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 2X Large	\$ 10.85	\$ 10.97	\$ 16.90	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 3X Large	\$ 11.50	\$ 11.44	\$ 16.90	\$ 10.86	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 4X Large	\$ 12.00	\$ 11.44	\$ 17.98	\$ 13.59	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 5X Large	\$ 12.50	\$ 12.87	\$ 18.20	\$ 13.59	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 6X Large	\$ 12.90	\$ 12.87	\$ 19.28	\$ 13.59	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 7X Large	\$ 13.00	\$ 12.87	\$ 20.59	\$ 13.59	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 8X Large	\$ 13.75	\$ 13.59	\$ 21.89	\$ 13.59	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 9X Large	\$ 14.10	\$ 13.59	\$ 21.89	\$ 13.59	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.61	\$ 11.00
Size 10X Large								

4.1 Jackets	Each Price	Each Price	Each Price	Each Price	Each Price	Each Price	Each Price
	\$ 22.00	no bid	\$ 32.47	\$ 20.58	no bid	no bid	no bid
Size Medium	\$ 22.00	no bid	\$ 32.47	\$ 21.41	no bid	no bid	no bid
Size Large	\$ 22.00	no bid	\$ 32.74	\$ 21.81	no bid	no bid	no bid
Size X Large	\$ 22.00	no bid	\$ 32.96	\$ 22.01	no bid	no bid	no bid
Size 2X Large							

**Jackson County Department of Corrections
MEMO**



To: Jessica Johnson, Senior Buyer, Purchasing
CC: Joseph Piccinini, Acting Director; Marvin Walker, SS Supervisor; Wanda Graham, Support Services Specialist
Date: 11/4/15
From: L.J. Scott, Asst Director of Administration
Subject: Inmate Clothing Bid 41-15 – Evaluation and Selection

Inmate clothing samples and prices were evaluated by: Laura Scott, Asst Dir of Administration; Marvin Walker, Support Services Supervisor; and Wanda Graham, Support Services Specialist over clothing and laundry operations. Selections are based on the lowest price and best choices related to the quality of items.

- No. 4.1 Sports Bras, sizes 32-46 is awarded to Bob Barker Company Inc.
- No. 4.2 Women's Briefs, sizes 6-20 is awarded to Bob Barker Company Inc.
- No. 4.3 Women's Night Shirts is awarded to Bob Barker Company Inc.
- No. 4.4 Men's Undershirts, sizes small to 10X Large is awarded to Victory Supply Inc.
- No. 4.5 Men's Undershorts, sizes 32 to 10X Large is awarded to O.D. Taragin & Bros, LLC
- No. 4.6 Slip on Tennis Shoes for Men & Women is awarded to Victory Supply Inc.
- No. 4.7 Tennis Shoes with Velcro Closures for Men is awarded to Bob Barker Company Inc.
- No. 4.8 Shower Shoes for Men & Women is awarded to Bob Barker Company Inc.
- No. 4.9 Molded Shoes sizes 5 to 16 is awarded to Bob Barker Company Inc.
- No. 4.10 Socks is awarded to Bob Barker Company Inc.
- No. 4.11 Jumpsuits sizes small to 10 X Large is awarded to Bob Barker Company Inc.
- No. 4.12 Jackets size medium to 2 X Large is awarded to Bob Barker Company Inc.