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TITLE: A RESOLUTION awarding a twenty-four-month term and supply contracts, with two twelve-
month options to extend, for the furnishing of office furniture for use by various County departments,
as a split award to Encompas Corporation, Kansas City Office Design, LLC, K&M Office Products
dba Office Products Alliance, Color Art Integrated Interiors of Kansas City, LLC, dba Scott Rice Office
Works, all of Kansas City, MO and Rangle Distributing of Kansas City, KS, under the terms and
conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 24-091.

SUMMARY: WHEREAS, various County departments have need for office furniture and furnishings;
and,  WHEREAS, the Director of Finance and Purchasing has solicited bids on Invitation to Bid No.
24-091, for the furnishing of office furniture for use by various County departments; and,  WHEREAS,
a total of eleven responses were received and evaluated from the following: BIDDER Amiglia
Design Group, LLC Lenexa, KS  Color Art Integrated Interiors of Kansas City, LLC dba Scott Rice
Office Works Lenexa, KS  Commercial Concepts & Furnishings Independence, MO  Encompas
Corporation Kansas City (Jackson County), MO   Global Equipment Company, Inc Port Washington,
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NY  Kansas City Office Design, LLC Kansas City (Jackson County), MO  K&M Office Products dba 
Office Products Alliance Kansas City (Jackson County), MO  Lakeshore Learning Materials, LLC 
Merriam, KS  Neutral Posture, Inc. Bryan, TX  Rangle Distributing Kansas City, KS  Staples 
Framingham, MA   and,   WHEREAS, pursuant to section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, the 
Director of Finance and Purchasing recommends a split award of twenty-four-month term and supply 
contracts, with two twelve-month options to extend, to Encompas Corporation, Kansas City Office 
Design, LLC, K&M Office Products dba Office Products Alliance, Color Art Integrated Interiors of 
Kansas City, LLC, MO dba Scott Rice Office Works, all of Kansas City, MO, and Rangle Distributing 
of Kansas City, KS under the terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 24-091; and,  WHEREAS, 
a split award to the five lowest and best bidders is recommended to give the various County 
departments flexibility and convenience to obtain needed items and services in various locations; 
and, WHEREAS, this award is made on an as needed basis and does not obligate Jackson County 
to pay any specific amount, with the availability of funds for specific purchases subject to annual 
appropriation; now therefore,  BE IT RESOLVED by the County Legislature of Jackson County, 
Missouri, that award be made as recommended by the Director of Finance and Purchasing, and that 
the Director be, and is hereby, authorized to execute for the County any documents necessary to the 
accomplishment of the award; and,  BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Director of Finance and 
Purchasing is authorized to make all payments, including final payment on the contract, to the extent 
sufficient appropriations to the using spending agencies have been made in the current Jackson 
County budget, with an estimated annual usage of $360,000.00. THIS IS A RESUBMISSION OF 
RESOLUTION 21854 THAT WAS DROPPED ON 3-31-2025. 

FINANCIAL IMPACT:

NO ☐
Amount Fund Department Line-Item Detail

 YES ☐

ACTION NEEDED: Choose an item.

ATTACHMENTS:

Click or tap here to enter text.

Jackson County Missouri Printed on 7/15/2025Page 2 of 2

powered by Legistar™

http://www.legistar.com/

