

JUL 24 2018

REQUEST FOR LEGISLATIVE ACTION

Completed by County Counselor's Office:
 Res/Ord No.: 19932
 Sponsor(s): Tony Miller
 Date: July 30, 2018

SUBJECT	Action Requested <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Resolution <input type="checkbox"/> Ordinance Project/Title: <u>Awarding a Twelve Month Term and Supply Contract with Four One Year Options to Extend for the furnishing of Turf Chemicals for use by Parks + Rec to Reinders, Inc. of Olathe, KS and Grass Pad, Inc. of Olathe, KS under the terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid 31-18.</u>										
BUDGET INFORMATION <i>To be completed By Requesting Department and Finance</i>	<table border="1" style="width:100%; border-collapse: collapse;"> <tr> <td style="width:70%;">Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year:</td> <td style="width:30%;"></td> </tr> <tr> <td>Amount previously authorized this fiscal year:</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>Total amount authorized after this legislative action:</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>Amount budgeted for this item * (including transfers):</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>Source of funding (name of fund) and account code number:</td> <td></td> </tr> </table> <p>* If account includes additional funds for other expenses, total budgeted in the account is: \$</p> <p>OTHER FINANCIAL INFORMATION:</p> <p><input type="checkbox"/> No budget impact (no fiscal note required) <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Term and Supply Contract (funds approved in the annual budget); estimated value and use of contract: Department: Parks + Rec Estimated Use: \$65,000.00</p> <p>Requesting approval by the Legislature of the term and supply contract; the funds were already appropriated through the annual budget adoption. Estimated usage figures are for informational purposes only.</p> <p>Prior Year Budget (if applicable): Prior Year Actual Amount Spent (if applicable):</p>	Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year:		Amount previously authorized this fiscal year:		Total amount authorized after this legislative action:		Amount budgeted for this item * (including transfers):		Source of funding (name of fund) and account code number:	
Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year:											
Amount previously authorized this fiscal year:											
Total amount authorized after this legislative action:											
Amount budgeted for this item * (including transfers):											
Source of funding (name of fund) and account code number:											
PRIOR LEGISLATION	Prior ordinances and (date): Prior resolutions and (date): 19507 (June 12, 2017)										
CONTACT INFORMATION	RLA drafted by (name, title, & phone): Katie Bartle, Senior Buyer, 816-881-3465										
REQUEST SUMMARY	<p>Parks + Rec requires a term and supply contract for the furnishing of Turf Chemicals for use by Park Operations. The Purchasing Department issued Invitation to Bid 31-18 Turf Chemicals in response to those requirements.</p> <p>A total of twenty-eight notifications were distributed with six responses received and evaluated. Attached is a Recap of Bids Received. The following split award is recommended for the lowest and best bidder meeting specifications:</p> <table border="1" style="width:100%; border-collapse: collapse;"> <thead> <tr> <th style="width:50%;">BIDDER</th> <th style="width:50%;">ITEMS RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Reinders, Inc. of Olathe, KS</td> <td>#1, #2, #3, #7, #8, #9, #13, #14, #15, #16, #17, #19, #20, #21, #22, #23, #24, #25, #27, #28, #29, #30, #31, #32, #34, #37, #38</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Grass Pad, Inc of Olathe, KS</td> <td>#4, #5, #6, 10, #11, #22, #26, #33, #35, #36</td> </tr> </tbody> </table> <p>Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, the Director of Finance and Purchasing recommends the award of a Twelve Month Term and Supply Contract with Four One Year Options to Extend for the furnishing of Turf Chemicals for use by Parks + Rec to Reinders, Inc. of Olathe, KS and Grass Pad, Inc. of Olathe, KS under the terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid 31-18 as the lowest and best bidders meeting specifications for each item.</p> <p>This award is made on an "as needed" basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual appropriations.</p>	BIDDER	ITEMS RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD	Reinders, Inc. of Olathe, KS	#1, #2, #3, #7, #8, #9, #13, #14, #15, #16, #17, #19, #20, #21, #22, #23, #24, #25, #27, #28, #29, #30, #31, #32, #34, #37, #38	Grass Pad, Inc of Olathe, KS	#4, #5, #6, 10, #11, #22, #26, #33, #35, #36				
BIDDER	ITEMS RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD										
Reinders, Inc. of Olathe, KS	#1, #2, #3, #7, #8, #9, #13, #14, #15, #16, #17, #19, #20, #21, #22, #23, #24, #25, #27, #28, #29, #30, #31, #32, #34, #37, #38										
Grass Pad, Inc of Olathe, KS	#4, #5, #6, 10, #11, #22, #26, #33, #35, #36										

CLEARANCE	<input type="checkbox"/> Tax Clearance Completed (Purchasing & Department) N/A <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Business License Verified (Purchasing & Department) <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Chapter 6 Compliance - Affirmative Action/Prevailing Wage (County Auditor's Office)	
COMPLIANCE	<input type="checkbox"/> MBE Goals <input type="checkbox"/> WBE Goals No Goals Assigned. <input type="checkbox"/> VBE Goals	
ATTACHMENTS	Abstract of Bids Received, Award Recommendation from Parks + Rec, and the pertinent pages of each recommended vendor's bid.	
REVIEW	Department Director:	Date:
	<i>Michael D. Perry</i>	7-23-18
	Finance (Budget Approval): If applicable	Date:
	<i>[Signature]</i>	7/24/18
Division Manager:	Date:	7.24.18
<i>[Signature]</i>	Date:	
County Counselor's Office:	Date:	

Fiscal Information (to be verified by Budget Office in Finance Department)

- This expenditure was included in the annual budget.
- Funds for this were encumbered from the _____ Fund in _____.
- There is a balance otherwise unencumbered to the credit of the appropriation to which the expenditure is chargeable and there is a cash balance otherwise unencumbered in the treasury to the credit of the fund from which payment is to be made each sufficient to provide for the obligation herein authorized.
- Funds sufficient for this expenditure will be/were appropriated by Ordinance # _____
- Funds sufficient for this appropriation are available from the source indicated below.

Account Number:	Account Title:	Amount Not to Exceed:

- This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as each using agency places its order.
- This legislative action does not impact the County financially and does not require Finance/Budget approval.



JACKSON COUNTY
Parks + Recreation
22807 Woods Chapel Road
Blue Springs, Missouri 64015
www.jacksongov.org

*Administration
Historic Sites
Ranger Station
Leisure Services
(816) 503-4800
Fax (816) 795-1234*

*Kemper Outdoor
Education Center
(816) 229-8980*

*Fred Arbanas
Golf Course at
Longview Lake
(816) 761-9445*

*Blue Springs Marina
(816) 795-1112*

*Jacomo Marina
(816) 795-8888*

*Longview Marina
(816) 966-0131*

*Special Population
Services
(816) 763-5130*

MEMORANDUM

TO: Katie Bartle, Senior Buyer
FROM: John Johnson, Superintendent-Park Operations
DATE: July 17, 2018
SUBJECT: Invitation to bid 31-18: Turf Chemicals

The Parks Department recommendation is to award the bid to the following companies based on being the lowest bidders that responded with a bid as specified in the request for bids.

Our **projected usage** during the next twelve months is \$ 31,000.

003 - 1624 - 57220 - \$55,000
003 - 1654 - 57220 - \$10,000
003 - 1682 - 57220 - \$6,000

Reinders - \$53,000

Items 1-2; 7-9; 13-17; 19-25; 27-32; 34; 37-38.

Grass Pad - \$12,000

Items 4-6; 10-11; 22; 26; 33; 35; 36.

Bid No: 31-18

Commodity: Turf Chemicals

Vendor: Reinders

		Quote					
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS		Item #	Item Name	QTY	Unit	Manufacturer	Amount
Contract Signed	Y	1.0	14-0-4 43% Barracade which contains 50% RXN - n - slow release	50	LB	EC Grow	\$ 13.80
Affidavit	Y	2.0	16-0-8 19% Dimension which contains 50% Nutrisphere - n - slow release	50	LB	EC Grow	\$ 19.05
Compliance Review	N	3.0	15-0-0 2% Merit and contains 50% RXN - n - slow release	50	LB	EC Grow	\$ 15.35
Certificate of Compliance	Y	4.0	18-12-6 w/Avail Contains Nutrisphere - n - AVAIL / slow release	50	LB	EC Grow	\$ 14.92
Statement of Contractor's Qualification	Y	5.0	32-0-8 Contains 50% Nitrogen from 50% RXN - n - slow release	50	LB	EC Grow	\$ 13.85
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda	Y	6.0	Acelepryn 0-0-7 Fertilizer Plus .067	50	LB	EC Grow	\$ 26.62
Bidder's Quote	Y	7.0	Aquathol K	2.5	GAL	United Phosphorus	\$ 192.26
Bidder's Exceptions	Y	8.0	Barracade 4FL	1	GAL	Sygenta	\$ 143.00
		9.0	Cutrine Plus	2.5	GAL	Applied Biochemists	\$ 58.95
		10.0	Dimension	2.5	GAL	Dow AgriScience	\$ 525.00
		11.0	Dismiss	6	OZ	FMC	\$ 66.16
		12.0	Embark Growth Regulator	1	GAL		NO BID
		13.0	Field Marking Chalk, Plus 5 Chalk	50	LB	Imery's	\$ 6.40
Contracts: See Attached		14.0	Freehand	50	LB	BASF	\$ 93.50
		15.0	Ranger Pro	2.5	GAL	Monsanto/Bayer	\$ 30.90
		16.0	Hyvar XL	1	GAL	Bayer	\$ 108.00
		17.0	Induce-Aquatic Sticker	2.5	GAL	Quest	\$ 53.00
		18.0	Merit 75wp	6.4	OZ	ProKoz	\$ 19.15
		19.0	Pathfinder II	2.5	GAL	Dow AgriScience	\$ 131.92
		20.0	Pathway	2.5	GAL	Dow AgriScience	\$ 106.18
		21.0	Remedy	1	GAL	Dow AgriScience	\$ 80.00
		22.0	Sedge Hammer	1	CASE	NuForm	\$ 646.00
		23.0	Seven 4L	2.5	GAL	Bayer	\$ 102.50
		24.0	Snapshot	50	LB	Dow AgriScience	\$ 68.00
		25.0	Sonar 1	20	LB	SePro	\$ 649.40
		26.0	Speed Zone	2.5	GAL	PBI Gordon	\$ 175.00
		27.0	SureGuard	0.5	GAL	NuForm	\$ 461.05
		28.0	Talstar	1	GAL	ProKoz	\$ 24.68
		29.0	Tempo 2	240	mL	Bayer	\$ 34.85
		30.0	Treflan 5g	40	LB	Anderson	\$ 28.90
		31.0	Carlton 4A	2.5	GAL	Dow AgriScience	\$ 235.00
		32.0	Reward	2.5	GAL	Sygenta	\$ 197.50
		33.0	Dylox	2.5	GAL	Bayer	\$ 179.50
		34.0	Clipper	1	LB	NuForm	\$ 122.00
		35.0	Specticle	18	OZ	Bayer	\$ 241.00
		36.0	Sahara DC	5	LB	Alligare	\$ 58.40
References: See Attached							

37.0	Podium	1	GAL	Sygenta	\$	103.50
38.0	Divron 4L	2.5	GAL		\$	55.89
39.0	Headway G	30	LB	Sygenta	\$	59.00
40.0	20-0-10 90% Dur; 19% Dimension; .58%Acelepryn	50	LB			NO BID
41.0	24-0-5 80% D45 50P; 19% Dimension; .58% Acelepryn	50	LB			NO BID
42.0	5-0-20 19% Dimension; .058% Acelepryn	50	LB			NO BID

Comments: See attached Exceptions Page for alternate items bid. Quantities and Units where the bid is different from the quote request are in **BOLD**.

Bid No: 31-18

Commodity: Turf Chemicals

Vendor: Grass Pad

Bid Recap

		Quote						
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS	Y/N	Item #	Item Name	QTY	Unit	Manufacturer	Amount	
Contract Signed	Y	1.0	14-0-4 43% Barracade which contains 50% RXN - n - slow release	50	LB	EC Grow	\$ 15.50	
Affidavit	Y	2.0	16-0-8 19% Dimension which contains 50% Nutrisphere - n - slow release	50	LB	EC Grow	\$ 20.30	
Compliance Review	N	3.0	15-0-0 2% Merit and contains 50% RXN - n - slow release	50	LB	EC Grow	\$ 17.30	
Certificate of Compliance	Y	4.0	18-12-6 w/Avail Contains Nutrisphere - n - AVAIL / slow release	50	LB	EC Grow	\$ 14.55	
Statement of Contractor's Qualification	Y	5.0	32-0-8 Contains 50% Nitrogen from 50% RXN - n - slow release	50	LB	EC Grow	\$ 13.40	
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda	Y	6.0	Acelepryn 0-0-7 Fertilizer Plus .067	50	LB	EC Grow	\$ 25.55	
Bidder's Quote	Y	7.0	Aquathol K	2.5	GAL	United Phosphorus	NO BID	
Bidder's Exceptions	N	8.0	Barracade 4FL	1	GAL	QP Proviamine 4L	\$ 84.92	
		9.0	Cutrine Plus	2.5	GAL	Alligare - Arsas	\$ 62.67	
		10.0	Dimension	2.5	GAL	Quali-Pro	\$ 495.00	
		11.0	Dismiss	1	PINT	FMC	\$ 172.00	
		12.0	Embark Growth Regulator	1	GAL		NO BID	
Contracts: See attached.		13.0	Field Marking Chalk, Plus 5 Chalk	50	LB	Plus 5 Athletic	\$ 6.20	
		14.0	Freehand	50	LB	BASF	\$ 102.00	
		15.0	Ranger Pro	2.5	GAL	Albough	\$ 34.50	
		16.0	Hyvar XL	1	GAL		NO BID	
		17.0	Induce-Aquatic Sticker	2.5	GAL		NO BID	
References: See attached.		18.0	Merit 75wp	6.4	OZ		NO BID	
		19.0	Pathfinder II	2.5	GAL		NO BID	
		20.0	Pathway	2.5	GAL		NO BID	
		21.0	Remedy	1	GAL		NO BID	
		22.0	Sedge Hammer	1.33	OZ	NuForm	\$ 53.00	

23.0	Seven 4L	2.5	GAL				NO BID
24.0	Snapshot	50	LB	Quali-Pro T/I		\$	74.00
25.0	Sonar 1	20	LB				NO BID
26.0	Speed Zone	2.5	GAL	PBI Gordon		\$	167.00
27.0	SureGuard	1	LB	NuForm		\$	124.00
28.0	Talstar	1	GAL	Quali-Pro		\$	34.00
29.0	Tempo 2	240	mL				NO BID
30.0	Treflan 5g	50	LB	Dow AgriScience		\$	37.95
31.0	Carlton 4A	2.5	GAL				NO BID
32.0	Reward	2.5	GAL	NuForm		\$	169.00
33.0	Dylox	2.5	GAL	Bayer		\$	169.00
34.0	Clipper	1	LB				NO BID
35.0	Specticle	18	OZ	Bayer		\$	236.08
36.0	Sahara DC	10	LB	Alligare - Mojave		\$	101.90
37.0	Podium	1	GAL				NO BID
38.0	Divron 4L	2.5	GAL				NO BID
39.0	Headway G	30	LB				NO BID
40.0	20-0-10 90% Dur; 19% Dimension; .58%Acelepryn	50	LB	EC Grow		\$	64.80
41.0	24-0-5 80% D45 50P; 19% Dimension; .58% Acelepryn	50	LB	EC Grow		\$	63.40
42.0	5-0-20 19% Dimension; .058% Acelepryn	50	LB				NO BID

Comments:

Bid No: 31-18

Commodity: Turf Chemicals

Vendor: Helena Agri Enterprises

Bid Recap		Quote						
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS	Yes/No	Item #	Item Name	QTY	Unit	Manufacturer	Amount	
Contract Signed	Y	1.0	14-0-4 43% Barracade which contains 50% RXN - n - slow release	50	LB	Helena	\$ 13.20	
Affidavit	Y	2.0	16-0-8 19% Dimension which contains 50% Nutrisphere - n - slow release	50	LB	Helena	\$ 18.47	
Compliance Review	Y	3.0	15-0-0 2% Merit and contains 50% RXN - n - slow release	50	LB	Helena	\$ 16.42	
Certificate of Compliance	N	4.0	18-12-6 w/Avail Contains Nutrisphere - n - AVAIL / slow release	50	LB		NO BID	
Statement of Contractor's Qualification	Y	5.0	32-0-8 Contains 50% Nitrogen from 50% RXN - n - slow release	50	LB	Helena	\$ 12.92	
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda	Y	6.0	Acelepryn 0-0-7 Fertilizer Plus .067	50	LB		NO BID	
Bidder's Quote	Y	7.0	Aquathol K	2.5	GAL	UPI	\$ 176.25	
Bidder's Exceptions	Y	8.0	Barracade 4FL	1	GAL	Syngenta	\$ 143.00	
		9.0	Citrine Plus	1	GAL	Applied Bio	\$ 22.90	
		10.0	Dimension	2.5	GAL	Dow/Corteva	\$ 525.00	
		11.0	Dismiss	6	OZ	FMC	\$ 66.69	
		12.0	Embark Growth Regulator	1	GAL		NO BID	
		13.0	Field Marking Chalk, Plus 5 Chalk	50	LB		NO BID	
		14.0	Freehand	50	LB	BASF	\$ 86.00	
		15.0	Ranger Pro	2.5	GAL	Monsanto	\$ 29.75	
		16.0	Hyvar XL	1	GAL	Bayer	\$ 94.18	
		17.0	Induce-Aquatic Sticker	1	GAL	Helena	\$ 24.00	
		18.0	Merit 75wp	6.4	OZ	Bayer	\$ 19.80	
		19.0	Pathfinder II	2.5	GAL	Dow	\$ 123.75	
		20.0	Pathway	2.5	GAL	Dow	\$ 96.75	
		21.0	Remedy	1	GAL	Dow	\$ 68.00	
		22.0	Sedge Hammer	1.33	OZ	Atticus	\$ 50.00	
		23.0	Seven 4L	2.5	GAL	Bayer	\$ 98.65	
Contracts: None Given								

24.0	Snapshot		50	LB	Dow	\$ 70.00
25.0	Sonar 1		20	LB	SePro	\$ 649.40
26.0	Speed Zone		2.5	GAL	PBI Gordon	\$ 172.25
27.0	SureGuard		1	LB	Nuform	\$ 136.61
28.0	Talstar		1	GAL	FMC	\$ 36.00
29.0	Tempo 2		240	mL	Bayer	\$ 44.00
30.0	Treflan 5g		40	LB		NO BID
31.0	Carlton 4A		2.5	GAL	Dow	\$ 225.00
32.0	Reward		2.5	GAL	Syngenta	\$ 197.50
33.0	Dylox		2.5	GAL	Bayer	\$ 165.00
34.0	Clipper		1	LB	Atticus	\$ 72.62
35.0	Specticle		18	OZ	Bayer	\$ 241.00
36.0	Sahara DC		1	LB	Alligare - Mojave	\$ 10.00
37.0	Podium		1	GAL	Quali-Pro	\$ 120.00
38.0	Divron 4L		2.5	GAL		NO BID
39.0	Headway G		30	LB	Syngenta	\$ 60.00
40.0	20-0-10 90% Dur; 19% Dimension; .58%Acelepryn		50	LB		NO BID
41.0	24-0-5 80% D45 50P; 19% Dimension; .58% Acelepryn		50	LB		NO BID
42.0	5-0-20 19% Dimension; .058% Acelepryn		50	LB		NO BID

Comments: Quantities and Units where the bid is different from the quote request are in **BOLD**. The Manufacturer and Prices in **BOLD** have quantity discounts offered. See bid for specifics.

Bid No: 31-18

Commodity: Turf Chemicals

Vendor: SiteOne Landscape Supply

Bid Recap		Quote					
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS	Yes/No	Item #	Item Name	QTY	Unit	Manufacturer	Amount
Contract Signed	Y	1.0	14-0-4 43% Barracade which contains 50% RXN - n - slow release	50	LB		NO BID
Affidavit	Y	2.0	16-0-8 19% Dimension which contains 50% Nutrisphere - n - slow release	50	LB		NO BID
Compliance Review	N	3.0	15-0-0 2% Merit and contains 50% RXN - n - slow release	50	LB		NO BID
Certificate of Compliance	N	4.0	18-12-6 w/Avail Contains Nutrisphere - n - AVAIL / slow release	50	LB		NO BID
Statement of Contractor's Qualification	Y	5.0	32-0-8 Contains 50% Nitrogen from 50% RXN - n - slow release	50	LB		NO BID
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda	Y	6.0	Acelepryn 0-0-7 Fertilizer Plus .067	50	LB	Lesco	\$ 26.95
Bidder's Quote	Y	7.0	Aquathol K	2.5	GAL		\$ 212.50
Bidder's Exceptions	Y	8.0	Barracade 4FL	1	GAL	Makhteshim Agan	\$ 81.53
Manufacturer's Specifications	Y	9.0	Cutrine Plus	2.5	GAL	Applied Biochemist	\$ 66.76
		10.0	Dimension	2.5	GAL	Dow	\$ 578.75
		11.0	Dismiss	1	PINT	FMC	\$ 197.79
		12.0	Embark Growth Regulator	1	GAL	Syngenta	\$ 161.07
		13.0	Field Marking Chalk, Plus 5 Chalk	50	LB	Imerys	\$ 6.78
		14.0	Freehand	50	LB	BASF	\$ 93.50
		15.0	Ranger Pro	2.5	GAL	Lesco	\$ 39.29
		16.0	Hyvar XL	1	GAL		NO BID
		17.0	Induce-Aquatic Sticker	2.5	GAL		NO BID
		18.0	Merit 75wp	6.4	OZ	Lesco	\$ 18.75
		19.0	Pathfinder II	2.5	GAL	Dow	\$ 157.69
		20.0	Pathway	2.5	GAL		NO BID
		21.0	Remedy	1	GAL	Lesco	\$ 66.23
		22.0	Sedge Hammer	1	CASE	Gowan	\$ 694.70
		23.0	Seven 4L	2.5	GAL	Lesco	\$ 103.59
		24.0	Snapshot	50	LB	Dow	\$ 72.01
		25.0	Sonar 1	20	LB	SePro	\$ 649.40
		26.0	Speed Zone	2.5	GAL	Red Gordons	\$ 188.69
		27.0	SureGuard	1	LB	Nuform	\$ 160.00
		28.0	Talstar	1	GAL	FMC	\$ 53.54

		29.0	Tempo 2	240	mL	Bayer	\$	45.15
		30.0	Treflan 5g	40	LB			NO BID
		31.0	Carlton 4A	2.5	GAL			NO BID
		32.0	Reward	2.5	GAL	Syngenta	\$	197.50
		33.0	Dylox	2.5	GAL	Bayer	\$	196.09
		34.0	Clipper	1	LB	Nuform	\$	160.00
		35.0	Specticle	18	OZ	Bayer	\$	241.00
		36.0	Sahara DC	5	LB			NO BID
		37.0	Podium	1	GAL	Syngenta	\$	161.07
		38.0	Divron 4L	2.5	GAL	Alligare	\$	62.50
		39.0	Headway G	30	LB	Syngenta	\$	60.00
		40.0	20-0-10 90% Dur; 19% Dimension; .58%Acelepryn	50	LB			NO BID
		41.0	24-0-5 80% D45 50P; 19% Dimension; .58% Acelepryn	50	LB			NO BID
		42.0	5-0-20 19% Dimension; .058% Acelepryn	50	LB			NO BID

Contracts: See attached

References: See attached

Comments: Please review Exceptions. Quantities and Units where the bid is different from the quote request are in BOLD.

Bid No: 31-15

Commodity: Turf Chemicals

Vendor: Sims Fertilizer and Chemical Co.

Bid Recap		Quote					
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS	Yes/No	Item #	Item Name	QTY	Unit	Manufacturer	Amount
Contract Signed	Y	1.0	14-0-4 43% Barracade which contains 50% RXN - n - slow release	50	LB		NO BID
Affidavit	Y	2.0	16-0-8 19% Dimension which contains 50% Nutrisphere - n - slow release	50	LB		NO BID
Compliance Review	Y	3.0	15-0-0 2% Merit and contains 50% RXN - n - slow release	50	LB		NO BID
Certificate of Compliance	N	4.0	18-12-6 w/Avail Contains Nutrisphere - n - AVAIL / slow release	50	LB		NO BID
Statement of Contractor's Qualification	Y	5.0	32-0-8 Contains 50% Nitrogen from 50% RXN - n - slow release	50	LB		NO BID
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda	Y	6.0	Acelepryn 0-0-7 Fertilizer Plus .067	50	LB		NO BID
Bidder's Quote	Y	7.0	Aquathol K	1	GAL	UPI	\$ 77.50
Bidder's Exceptions	NONE	8.0	Barracade 4FL	1	GAL	Syngenta	\$ 145.00
		9.0	Cutrine Plus	1	GAL	Applied Biochemists	\$ 32.50
		10.0	Dimension	1	GAL	Dow	\$ 245.00
		11.0	Dismiss	6	OZ		NO BID
		12.0	Embark Growth Regulator	1	GAL		NO BID
		13.0	Field Marking Chalk, Plus 5 Chalk	50	LB		NO BID
		14.0	Freehand	1	LB	BASF	\$ 2.45
		15.0	Ranger Pro	1	GAL	Monsanto	\$ 16.25
		16.0	Hyvar XL	1	GAL	Dupont	\$ 101.00
Contracts: None given		17.0	Induce-Aquatic Sticker	2.5	GAL		NO BID
		18.0	Merit 75wp	6.4	OZ		NO BID
		19.0	Pathfinder II	1	GAL	Dow	\$ 52.00
		20.0	Pathway	1	GAL	Dow	\$ 42.50
		21.0	Remedy	1	GAL	Dow	\$ 60.00
		22.0	Sedge Hammer	1.33	OZ	Gowan	\$ 71.00
		23.0	Seven 4L	1	GAL	Bayer	\$ 48.00
		24.0	Snapshot	1	LB	Dow	\$ 2.50
		25.0	Sonar 1	1	LB	SePro	\$ 36.75
References: See attached.							

26.0	Speed Zone	1	GAL	PBI Gordon	\$	77.50
27.0	SureGuard	0.5	GAL			NO BID
28.0	Talstar	1	GAL	FMC	\$	43.00
29.0	Tempo 2	240	mL	Bayer	\$	47.00
30.0	Treflan 5g	1	LB	Andersons	\$	1.05
31.0	Carlton 4A	1	GAL	Dow	\$	90.00
32.0	Reward	1	GAL	Syngenta	\$	81.00
33.0	Dylox	1	GAL	Bayer	\$	76.75
34.0	Clipper	1	LB	Valent or Nufarm	\$	140.00
35.0	Specticle	18	OZ	Bayer	\$	246.00
36.0	Sahara DC	1	LB	Alligare- Mojave	\$	10.00
37.0	Podium	1	GAL	Syngenta	\$	300.00
38.0	Divron 4L	2.5	GAL			NO BID
39.0	Headway G	1	LB	Syngenta		NO BID
40.0	20-0-10 90% Dur; 19% Dimension; .58%Acelepryn	50	LB			NO BID
41.0	24-0-5 80% D45 50P; 19% Dimension; .58% Acelepryn	50	LB			NO BID
42.0	5-0-20 19% Dimension; .058% Acelepryn	50	LB			NO BID

Comments: Manufacturer's Specifications included. Quantities and Units where the bid is different from the quote request are in BOLD.

Bid No: 31-18

Commodity: Turf Chemicals

Vendor: Supreme Turf Products

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS		Quote						
	Bid Recap	Yes/No	Item #	Item Name	QTY	Unit	Manufacturer	Amount
Contract Signed		Y	1.0	14-0-4 43% Barracade which contains 50% RXN - n - slow release	50	LB	EC Grow	\$ 14.50
Affidavit		Y	2.0	16-0-8 19% Dimension which contains 50% Nutrisphere - n - slow release	50	LB	EC Grow	\$ 19.50
Compliance Review		Y	3.0	15-0-0 2% Merit and contains 50% RXN - n - slow release	50	LB	EC Grow	\$ 17.50
Certificate of Compliance		N	4.0	18-12-6 w/Avail Contains Nutrisphere - n - AVAIL / slow release	50	LB	Anderson's	\$ 16.50
Statement of Contractor's Qualification		Y	5.0	32-0-8 Contains 50% Nitrogen from 50% RXN - n - slow release	50	LB	Mears	\$ 13.75
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda		Y	6.0	Acelepryn 0-0-7 Fertilizer Plus .067	50	LB	EC Grow	\$ 26.25
Bidder's Quote		Y	7.0	Aquathol K	2.5	GAL	Cygnat	\$ 210.00
Bidder's Exceptions		N	8.0	Barracade 4FL	1	GAL	Syngenta	\$ 137.00
			9.0	Citrine Plus	2.5	GAL	Applied Biochemist	\$ 64.00
			10.0	Dimension	2.5	GAL	Dow	\$ 525.00
			11.0	Dismiss	64	OZ	FMC	\$ 605.00
			12.0	Embark Growth Regulator	1	GAL		NO BID
			13.0	Field Marking Chalk, Plus 5 Chalk	50	LB	Louisville Slugger	\$ 5.50
			14.0	Freehand	50	LB	BASF	\$ 93.50
			15.0	Ranger Pro	2.5	GAL	Monsanto	\$ 31.00
			16.0	Hyvar XL	1	GAL		NO BID
			17.0	Induce-Aquatic Sticker	1	GAL	Cygnat	\$ 23.00
			18.0	Merit 75wp	6.4	OZ	Proloz	\$ 18.75
			19.0	Pathfinder II	2.5	GAL	Dow	\$ 125.00
			20.0	Pathway	2.5	GAL	Dow	\$ 110.00
			21.0	Remedy	1	GAL	Dow	\$ 80.00
			22.0	Sedge Hammer	1	CASE	Nufarm	\$ 600.00
			23.0	Seven 4L	2.5	GAL	Bayer	\$ 87.25
			24.0	Snapshot	50	LB	Dow	\$ 92.00
			25.0	Sonar 1	20	LB	SePro	\$ 765.00
			26.0	Speed Zone	2.5	GAL	PBI Gordon	\$ 175.00
			27.0	SureGuard	1	LB	Nufarm	\$ 145.00
			28.0	Talstar	1	GAL	FMC	\$ 42.00
Contracts: None given								
References: None given								

29.0	Tempo 2	240	mL	Bayer	\$	39.00
30.0	Treflan 5g	40	LB	Lebanon	\$	27.00
31.0	Carlton 4A	2.5	GAL			NO BID
32.0	Reward	2.5	GAL	Syngenta	\$	197.50
33.0	Dylox	2.5	GAL	Bayer	\$	165.00
34.0	Clipper	1	LB	Nufarm	\$	139.00
35.0	Specticle	18	OZ	Bayer	\$	241.00
36.0	Sahara DC	5	LB	Alligare	\$	46.00
37.0	Podium	1	GAL	Qualipro	\$	140.00
38.0	Divron 4L	2.5	GAL			NO BID
39.0	Headway G	30	LB	Syngenta	\$	55.00
40.0	20-0-10 90% Dur; 19% Dimension; .58%Acelepryn	50	LB	EC Grow	\$	64.80
41.0	24-0-5 80% D45 50P; 19% Dimension; .58% Acelepryn	50	LB	EC Grow	\$	63.40
42.0	5-0-20 19% Dimension; .058% Acelepryn	50	LB			NO BID

Comments: Please see Exceptions Page. Quantities and Units where the bid is different from the quote request are in BOLD. The Manufacturer and Prices in BOLD have quantity discounts offered. See bid for specifics.

STATEMENT OF CONTRACTOR'S QUALIFICATIONS
 (Complete in full. Use attachments if necessary)

Name of Bidder: GRASS PAD INC.	
Address with Zip Code: 425 N. Pawhide Olathe KS. 66061	
Federal Tax I.D. Number: 48-1010751	
Check One: Corporation <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Partnership <input type="checkbox"/> Sole Proprietorship <input type="checkbox"/>	
If SOLE PROPRIETORSHIP , state name, address and phone number of owner:	
If CORPORATION:	
Date of Incorporation: 1986	Name of State(s) in which incorporated:
President's Name: Jerry Moore	Vice-President's Name:
Secretary's Name:	Treasurer's Name: Nic Nelson
If PARTNERSHIP:	
Is the Partnership: General Limited Association (Check one)	
Date of Organization:	
Name and addresses of all partners:	
1.	
2.	
3.	
GENERAL INFORMATION:	
Percent of work to be done under the proposed contract by your own staff: 100%	
No. of Permanent Employees: 149	Geographical Limits of Operation: MO, KS, NE, IA.
No. of years in business: 50+	
Have you ever done business under a different name: Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> (Check one)	
If Yes, give Name and Location:	
Has contractor ever withdrawn or defaulted on a contractual obligation: Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> (Check one)	
If Yes, state where and why:	

STATEMENT OF CONTRACTOR'S QUALIFICATIONS - Continued

Has Contractor ever been sued for breach of any contract? Yes No (Check one)

If Yes, Explain:

List Completed Contracts within the Past Three Years, Including Amount of Each:

Jackson Co. Parks & Rec \$ 70,000.00
 Jackson Parks & Rec \$ 30,000.00
 Platte Co. Public Works \$ 40,000.00

List of Current Contracts, Including Amount of Each:

Shawn Co KS \$ 150,000.00
 MoCo \$ 30,000.00
 Platte Co Public Works \$ 40,000.00

Customer Reference (state name, address, and phone number):

KCMO Water Gladys 4800 E 63RD Street KC MO 816-513-0711
 Jackson Parks & Rec 7900 Renner Road 913-438-7275
 Wichita State Un. 1845 N. Fairmount Wichita KS 316-978-2570

List each subcontractor you plan to use if awarded the contract. If no, so state.

SUBCONTRACTOR'S NAME & PHONE #	ITEM OF WORK	\$ AMOUNT OF CONTRACT	MBE/WBE
N/A			

State any other relevant information concerning Contractor's history, credentials, responsibility and capabilities (If none, so state):

DBE STATUS Indicate status claimed:

1. Minority Owned Business (MBE) YES ___ NO
- African American ___ Latino ___ Native American ___ Asian ___ Pacific Islander
2. Woman Owned Business (WBE) YES ___ NO
3. Small Business YES ___ NO

For consideration as an MBF, WBE or Small Business, a copy of any governmental entity or Minority Supplier Council certification must be attached.

Prepared by (print or type): Todd Lee Winkelman

Title: Manager

Signature: 

Date: 2-18-18

7.0 QUOTATION

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
1.	14-0-4 43% Barracade which contains 50% RXN - n - slow release Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>50 Bag</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>15.⁵⁰</u>	Yes.
2.	16-0-8 19% Dimension which contains 50% Nutrisphere - n - slow release Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>50 Bag</u>	50 pounds	600 bags	\$ <u>20.³⁰</u>	Yes.
3.	15-0-0 2% Merit and contains 50% RXN - n - slow release Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>50 Bag</u>	50 pounds	600 bags	\$ <u>17.³⁰</u>	Yes
4.	18-12-6 w/Avail Contains Nutrisphere - n - AVAIL / slow release <u>18-12-12</u> Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>50 Bag</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>14.⁵⁵</u>	NO
5.	32-0-8 Contains 50% Nitrogen from 50% RXN - n - slow release Manufacturer: <u>EG Grow</u> Container Size: <u>50 Bag</u>	50 pounds	200 bags	\$ <u>13.⁴⁰</u>	Yes
6.	Acelepryn 0-0-7 Fertilizer Plus .067 Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>50 Bag</u>	50 pound	600 bags	\$ <u>25.⁵⁵</u>	Yes
7.	Aquathol K Manufacturer: Container Size:	2.5 gallon	40 gallon	\$ <u>N/B</u>	
8.	Barracade 4FL <u>Quali Pro</u> Manufacturer: <u>QP Potomac 4L</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 gal</u>	1 gallon	20 gallon	\$ <u>84.⁹² gal</u>	Yes
9.	Citrine Plus Manufacturer: <u>Alligare - Arsas</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 gal</u>	2.5 gallon	5 gallon	\$ <u>62.⁶⁷ 2.5gal</u>	Yes

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
10.	Dimension Manufacturer: <u>Quat-Pro</u> Container Size: <u>1 gal</u>	2.5 gallon	40 gallon	\$ <u>495.⁰⁰</u> <u>per/2.5</u>	<u>Yes</u>
11.	Dismiss Manufacturer: <u>FMC</u> Container Size: <u>64 oz / 6oz</u> <u>or 1 pint</u>	1 pint	10 pint	\$ <u>172.⁰⁰</u> <u>pint</u>	<u>Yes</u>
12.	Embark Growth Regulator Manufacturer: Container Size:	1 gallon	8 gallon	\$ <u>N/B</u>	
13.	Field Marking Chalk, Plus Five Chalk Manufacturer: <u>Plus 5 Athletic</u> Container Size: <u>50 Bags</u>	50 pounds	1,500 bags	\$ <u>6.²⁰</u>	<u>Yes</u>
14.	Freehand Manufacturer: <u>BASF</u> Container Size: <u>50 Bags</u>	50 pounds	10 bags	\$ <u>102.⁰⁰</u>	<u>Yes</u>
15.	Ranger Pro Manufacturer: <u>Albaush</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 gal</u>	2.5 gallon	400 gallon	\$ <u>34.⁵⁰</u>	<u>Yes</u>
16.	Hyvar XL Manufacturer: Container Size:	1 gallon	80 gallon	\$ <u>N/B</u>	
17.	Induce-Aquatic Sticker Manufacturer: Container Size:	1 gallon	10 gallon	\$ <u>N/B</u>	
18.	Merit 75wp Manufacturer: Container Size:	4 x 1.6 oz per container	2 boxes	\$ <u>N/B</u>	

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
19.	Pathfinder II Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	2.5 gallon	10 gallon	\$ <u>N/B</u>	
20.	Pathway Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	2.5 gallon	10 gallon	\$ <u>N/B</u>	
21.	Remedy Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	1 gallon	10 gallon	\$ <u>N/B</u>	
22.	Sedge Hammer Manufacturer: <u>Nufarm</u> Container Size: <u>1.33 oz.</u>	10 x 1.33 oz per container	3 cases	\$ <u>53.⁰⁰ 1.33 oz.</u>	<u>Yes</u>
23.	Seven 4L Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	2.5 gallon	5 gallon	\$ <u>N/B</u>	
24.	Snapshot Manufacturer: <u>Quali-Pro T/I</u> Container Size: <u>50 Bag</u>	50 pounds	4 bags	\$ <u>74.⁰⁰</u>	<u>Yes</u>
25.	Sonar 1 Manufacturer: <u>SePro</u> Container Size: _____	20 pounds	12 pounds	\$ <u>N/B</u>	
26.	Speed Zone Manufacturer: <u>PBT / Grodan</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 gal</u>	2.5 gallon	55 gallon	\$ <u>167.⁰⁰</u>	<u>Yes</u>
27.	SureGuard Manufacturer: <u>Nufarm</u> Container Size: <u>5 pounds</u>	1 pound	30 pounds	\$ <u>124.⁰⁰ pound</u>	<u>Yes</u>
28.	Talstar Manufacturer: <u>Bifenxim 74 79</u> Container Size: <u>1 gal</u>	1 gallon	20 gallon	\$ <u>34.⁰⁰</u>	<u>Yes</u>

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
29.	Tempo 2 Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	240 ml	10 bottles	\$ N/B	
30.	Treflan 5g Manufacturer: <u>Dow</u> Container Size: <u>50 pounds.</u>	50 pounds	4 bags	\$ 37.95	Yes
31.	Carlton 4A Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	2.5 gallon	25 gallon	\$ N/B	
32.	Reward Manufacturer: <u>NuForm Special 8.1</u> <u>NuForm</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 gal</u>	2.5 gallon	100 gallon	\$ 169.00 2.5 gal	Yes
33.	Dylox Manufacturer: <u>Bayer</u> Container Size: <u>2.5</u>	2.5 gallon	50 gallon	\$ 169.00 2.5 gal	Yes
34.	Clipper Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	1 pound	15 pounds	\$ N/B	
35.	Specticle Manufacturer: <u>Bayer</u> Container Size: <u>18 oz.</u>	18 oz	15 bottles	\$ 236.00 18 oz.	Yes
36.	Sahara DC Manufacturer: <u>Algor - Major</u> <u>70 EG.</u> Container Size: <u>#5 Bag.</u>	10 pounds	50 pounds	\$ 101.90 10 pounds	Yes.
37.	Podium Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	1 gallon	4 gallons	\$ N/B	
38.	Divron 4L Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	2.5 gallon	25 gallons	\$ N/B	
39.	Headway G Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	30 pounds	100 pounds	\$ N/B	

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
40.	20-0-10 90% Dur; <u>.15%</u> Dimension; .58% Acelepryn Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>50 Bag</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>64.⁸⁰</u>	<u>Yes</u>
41.	24-0-5 80% D45 50P; 19% Dimension; .58% Acelepryn Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>50 Bag</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>63.⁴⁰</u>	<u>Yes</u>
42.	5-0-20 19% Dimension; .058% Acelepryn Manufacturer: Container Size:	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>N/B</u>	
GRAND TOTAL, ITEMS 1-42				\$	

Shop Location(s): Barry Road Kansas City MO., Lee's Summit MO., Olathe KS., Stilwell KS., Bonner Springs KS., Omaha NE.

Days & Hours of Operation: M-F(8:00-6:00), S(8:00-5:00), S(10:00-4:00)

Point of Contact: Name: Todd Lee Winkelman Phone: 913-764-4100

SIGNATURE: <u>Todd L</u>	DATE: <u>2-18-18</u>
NAME (PRINT): <u>Todd Lee Winkelman</u>	PHONE: <u>913-764-4100</u>
TITLE (PRINT): <u>Manager</u>	CELL: <u>913-660-3429</u>
COMPANY NAME (PRINT): <u>GRASS PAD INC.</u>	FAX: <u>913-764-9200</u>
E-MAIL ADDRESS (PRINT): <u>todd@grosspad.com</u>	
E-MAIL ADDRESS FOR PO'S (PRINT): <u>todd@grosspad.com</u>	
URL (PRINT): <u>Grosspad.com</u>	

STATEMENT OF CONTRACTOR'S QUALIFICATIONS
 (Complete in full, Use attachments if necessary)

Name of Bidder: <u>Reinders, Inc</u>	
Address with Zip Code: <u>W227 N6225 Sussex Rd Sussex, WI 53089</u>	
Federal Tax I.D. Number: <u>39-0762349</u>	
Check One: <input checked="" type="radio"/> Corporation <input type="radio"/> Partnership <input type="radio"/> Sole Proprietorship	
If SOLE PROPRIETORSHIP , state name, address and phone number of owner:	
If CORPORATION:	
Date of Incorporation: <u>Sept 1946</u>	Name of State(s) in which incorporated: <u>WI</u>
President's Name: <u>Craig Reinders</u>	Vice-President's Name: <u>Mary Reinders</u>
Secretary's Name: <u>Lynn Hajdu</u>	Treasurer's Name: <u>Lynn Hajdu</u>
If PARTNERSHIP:	
Is the Partnership: <input type="checkbox"/> General <input type="checkbox"/> Limited <input type="checkbox"/> Association (Check one)	
Date of Organization:	
Name and addresses of all partners: <u>NA</u>	
1.	
2.	
3.	
GENERAL INFORMATION:	
Percent of work to be done under the proposed contract by your own staff: <u>100%</u>	
No. of Permanent Employees: <u>200</u>	Geographical Limits of Operation:
No. of years in business: <u>152 yrs</u>	
Have you ever done business under a different name: Yes <input type="checkbox"/> <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No (Check one)	
If Yes, give Name and Location:	
Has contractor ever withdrawn or defaulted on a contractual obligation: Yes <input type="checkbox"/> <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No (Check one)	
If Yes, state where and why:	

STATEMENT OF CONTRACTOR'S QUALIFICATIONS - Continued

Has Contractor ever been sued for breach of any contract? Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> (Check one)			
If Yes, Explain:			
List Completed Contracts within the Past Three Years, Including Amount of Each: Jackson County Parks 60,000 Jackson County Parks 60,000 City of Overland Park 59,000			
List of Current Contracts, Including Amount of Each: Same			
Customer Reference (state name, address, and phone number): Same			
List each subcontractor you plan to use if awarded the contract. If no, so state.			
SUBCONTRACTOR'S NAME & PHONE #	ITEM OF WORK	\$ AMOUNT OF CONTRACT	MBE/WBE
State any other relevant information concerning Contractor's history, credentials, responsibility and capabilities (If none, so state):			
DBE STATUS Indicate status claimed:			
1. Minority Owned Business (MBE) YES ___ NO <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>			
African American ___ Latino ___ Native American ___ Asian ___ Pacific Islander ___			
2. Woman Owned Business (WBE) YES ___ NO <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>			
3. Small Business YES ___ NO <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>			
For consideration as an MBE, WBE or Small Business, a copy of any governmental entity or Minority Supplier Council certification must be attached.			
Prepared by (print or type): Lynn Hajden		Title: CFO	
Signature: <i>Lynn Hajden</i>		Date: 6-7-18	

7.0 QUOTATION

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
1.	14-0-4 43% Barracade which contains 50% RXN - n - slow release Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>50# Bag</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>13.80/Bag</u>	Yes
2.	16-0-8 19% Dimension which contains 50% Nutrisphere - n - slow release Manufacturer: <u>E.C. Grow</u> Container Size: <u>50# Bag</u>	50 pounds	600 bags	\$ <u>19.05/Bag</u> 16-0-4, 50%RXN, - 19 Dimension	No
3.	15-0-0 2% Merit and contains 50% RXN - n - slow release Manufacturer: <u>EC GROW</u> Container Size: <u>50# Bag</u>	50 pounds	600 bags	\$ <u>15.35/Bag</u>	Yes
4.	18-12-6 w/Avail Containts Nutrisphere - n - AVAIL / slow release Manufacturer: <u>EC GROW</u> Container Size: <u>50# Bag</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>14.92/Bag</u> 18-12-6, 25% PESC, w/Avail	No
5.	32-0-8 Contains 50% Nitrogen from 50% RXN - n - slow release Manufacturer: <u>EC GROW</u> Container Size: <u>50# Bag</u>	50 pounds	200 bags	\$ <u>13.85/Bag</u> 32-0-8, 50%RXN, 2Fe	No
6.	Acelepryn 0-0-7 Fertilizer Plus .067 Manufacturer: <u>EC GROW</u> Container Size: <u>50# Bag</u>	50 pound	600 bags	\$ <u>26.62/Bag</u>	Yes
7.	Aquathol K Manufacturer: <u>United Phosphorus</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 Gallon</u>	2.5 gallon	40 gallon	\$ <u>192.26/2.5gal</u>	Yes
8.	Barracade 4FL Manufacturer: <u>Sygenta</u> Container Size: <u>Gallon</u>	1 gallon	20 gallon	\$ <u>143⁰⁰/Gallon</u>	Yes
9.	Citrine Plus Manufacturer: <u>Applied Biochemists</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 Gallon</u>	2.5 gallon	5 gallon	\$ <u>58.95/2.5Gallon</u>	Yes

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
10.	Dimension Manufacturer: <u>Dow Agro Science</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 Gallon</u>	2.5 gallon	40 gallon	\$ <u>525⁰⁰ / 2.5 Gallon</u> Dimension 2EW	No
11.	Dismiss Manufacturer: <u>FMC</u> Container Size: <u>6oz</u>	1 pint	10 pint	\$ <u>66¹⁶ / 6oz.</u> Dismiss- 6oz/Bottle	No
12.	Embark Growth Regulator Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	1 gallon	8 gallon	\$ <u>No Bid</u>	No Bid
13.	Field Marking Chalk, Plus Five Chalk Manufacturer: <u>Imery's</u> Container Size: <u>50# Bag</u>	50 pounds	1,500 bags	\$ <u>6.40 / 50# Bag</u>	Yes
14.	Freehand Manufacturer: <u>BASF</u> Container Size: <u>50# Bag</u>	50 pounds	10 bags	\$ <u>93⁵⁰ / 50# Bag</u>	Yes
15.	Ranger Pro Manufacturer: <u>Monsanto / Bayer</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 Gallon</u>	2.5 gallon	400 gallon	\$ <u>30⁹² / 2.5 Gallon</u>	Yes
16.	Hyvar XL Manufacturer: <u>Bayer</u> Container Size: <u>Gallon</u>	1 gallon	80 gallon	\$ <u>168⁰⁰ / Gallon</u>	Yes
17.	Induce-Aquatic Sticker Manufacturer: <u>Quest Products</u> Container Size: <u>2 1/2 Gallon</u>	1 gallon	10 gallon	\$ <u>53⁰⁰ / 2.5 Gallon</u> Misty 2.5 Gallon	No
18.	Merit 75wp Manufacturer: <u>PROKoz</u> Container Size: <u>4 x 1.6 oz</u>	4 x 1.6 oz per container	2 boxes	\$ <u>19.15 / 64oz</u> Zenith 75WSP	No

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
19.	Pathfinder II Manufacturer: <u>Dow Agri Science</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 Gallon</u>	2.5 gallon	10 gallon	\$ <u>131.92/2.5Gallon</u>	Yes
20.	Pathway Manufacturer: <u>Dow Agri Science</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 Gallon</u>	2.5 gallon	10 gallon	\$ <u>106.18/2.5Gal</u>	Yes
21.	Remedy Manufacturer: <u>Dow Agri Science</u> Container Size: <u>Gallon</u>	1 gallon	10 gallon	\$ <u>80.00/Gallon</u>	Yes
22.	Sedge Hammer Manufacturer: <u>Nu Farm</u> Container Size: <u>10 x 1.3oz Case</u>	10 x 1.33 oz per container	3 cases	\$ <u>646.00/Case</u> Pro Sedge	No
23.	Seven 4L Manufacturer: <u>Bayer</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 Gallon</u>	2.5 gallon	5 gallon	\$ <u>102.50/2.5Gal.</u> Seven 4L	Yes
24.	Snapshot Manufacturer: <u>Dow Agri Science</u> Container Size: <u>50# Bag</u>	50 pounds	4 bags	\$ <u>6800/50#Bag</u>	Yes
25.	Sonar 1 Manufacturer: <u>SePro</u> Container Size: <u>20# Bag</u>	20 pounds	12 pounds	\$ <u>649⁴⁰</u> Sonar One	Yes
26.	Speed Zone Manufacturer: <u>PBI Gordon</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 Gallon</u>	2.5 gallon	55 gallon	\$ <u>175⁰⁰/2.5 Gal.</u>	Yes
27.	SureGuard Manufacturer: <u>Nu Farm</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 Gallon</u>	1 pound	30 pounds	\$ <u>461.05/.5 Gallon</u> Sure Guard 5/c	No
28.	Talstar Manufacturer: <u>PROK02</u> Container Size: <u>Gallon</u>	1 gallon	20 gallon	\$ <u>24.68/Gallon</u> Avalon	No

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
29.	Tempo 2 Manufacturer: <u>Bayer</u> Container Size: <u>240 ml</u>	240 ml	10 bottles	\$ <u>34.85/240ml</u> Tempo SC ULTRA	No
30.	Treflan 5g Manufacturer: <u>Anderson</u> Container Size: <u>40# Bag</u>	50 pounds	4 bags	\$ <u>28.90/40# Bag</u> Trammel 5G	No
31.	Carlton 4A Manufacturer: <u>Pow Agri Science</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 Gallon</u>	2.5 gallon	25 gallon	\$ <u>235.00/2.5Gallon</u> CARLTON 4 ULTRA	No
32.	Reward Manufacturer: <u>Sygenta</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 Gallon</u>	2.5 gallon	100 gallon	\$ <u>192.50/2.5Gallon</u> Agency	Yes
33.	Dylox Manufacturer: <u>Bayer</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 Gallon</u>	2.5 gallon	50 gallon	\$ <u>179.50/2.5Gal</u> Dylox 420SL	No
34.	Clipper Manufacturer: <u>Nufarm / Valent</u> Container Size: <u>1 Pound</u>	1 pound	15 pounds	\$ <u>122.00/1 Pound</u>	Yes Being Discontinued Limited Quantities
35.	Specticle Manufacturer: <u>Bayer</u> Container Size: <u>18oz Sug</u>	18 oz	15 bottles	\$ <u>241.00/18oz</u>	Yes
36.	Sahara DC Manufacturer: <u>Alligare</u> Container Size: <u>5# Bag</u>	10 pounds	50 pounds	\$ <u>58.00/5# Bag</u> MOSAOC 5# Bag	No
37.	Podium Manufacturer: <u>Sygenta</u> Container Size: <u>Gallon</u>	1 gallon	4 gallons	\$ <u>103.50/Gallon</u>	Yes
38.	Divron 4L Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: <u>2.5 Gallon</u>	2.5 gallon	25 gallons	\$ <u>55.89/2.5gal</u>	Yes
39.	Headway G Manufacturer: <u>Sygenta</u> Container Size: <u>30# Bag</u>	30 pounds	100 pounds	\$ <u>59.00/30# B</u>	Yes

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
40.	20-0-10 90% Dur; 19% Dimension; .58% Acelepryn Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>No Bid</u>	\$0
41.	24-0-5 80% D45 50P; 19% Dimension; .58% Acelepryn Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>No Bid</u>	\$0
42.	5-0-20 19% Dimension; .058% Acelepryn Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>No Bid</u>	\$0
GRAND TOTAL, ITEMS 1-42				\$	

Shop Location(s): Reinders Inc 19942 W. 162nd Suite D Olathe, KS. 66062

Days & Hours of Operation: M - Friday 7:00 AM - 5:00 PM

Point of Contact: Name: Bill Norris Phone: 913.904-6843
Ryan Benson 816-679-1992

SIGNATURE: <u>William S Norris</u>	DATE: <u>06-13-2018</u>
NAME (PRINT): <u>William J. Norris</u>	PHONE: <u>913-904-6843</u>
TITLE (PRINT): <u>Territory Sales Manager</u>	CELL: <u>913-904-6843</u>
COMPANY NAME (PRINT) <u>Reinders Inc</u>	FAX: <u>913 397-0085</u>
E-MAIL ADDRESS (PRINT) <u>bnorris@reinders.com</u>	
E-MAIL ADDRESS FOR PO'S (PRINT) <u>bnorris@reinders.com</u>	
URL (PRINT):	