

REQUEST FOR LEGISLATIVE ACTION




Completed by County Counselor's Office:

Res/Ord. No.: 19143

Sponsor(s): Tony Miller

Date: May 10, 2016

<p>SUBJECT</p>	<p>Action Requested <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Resolution <input type="checkbox"/> Ordinance</p> <p>Project/Title: <u>Awarding a Twelve Month Term and Supply Contract for the furnishing of Chemicals and Fertilizers for the Parks + Rec Department to Grass Pad, Inc. of Olathe, KS; Reinders, Inc. of Olathe, KS; and Supreme Turf Products, Inc. of Olathe, KS; under the terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 19-16.</u></p>										
<p>BUDGET INFORMATION <i>To be completed By Requesting Department and Finance</i></p>	<table border="1" data-bbox="313 552 1406 743"> <tr> <td>Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year:</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Amount previously authorized this fiscal year:</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>Total amount authorized after this legislative action:</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Amount budgeted for this item * (including transfers):</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>Source of funding (name of fund) and account code number:</td> <td></td> </tr> </table> <p>* If account includes additional funds for other expenses, total budgeted in the account is: \$</p> <p>OTHER FINANCIAL INFORMATION:</p> <p><input type="checkbox"/> No budget impact (no fiscal note required) <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Term and Supply Contract (funds approved in the annual budget); estimated value and use of contract: Department: Estimated Use: \$72,000.00</p> <p>Requesting approval by the Legislature of the term and supply contract; the funds were already appropriated through the annual budget adoption. Estimated usage figures are for informational purposes only.</p> <p>Prior Year Budget (if applicable): \$66,000.00 Prior Year Actual Amount Spent (if applicable): \$52,317.82</p>	Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year:	\$	Amount previously authorized this fiscal year:		Total amount authorized after this legislative action:	\$	Amount budgeted for this item * (including transfers):		Source of funding (name of fund) and account code number:	
Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year:	\$										
Amount previously authorized this fiscal year:											
Total amount authorized after this legislative action:	\$										
Amount budgeted for this item * (including transfers):											
Source of funding (name of fund) and account code number:											
<p>PRIOR LEGISLATION</p>	<p>Prior ordinances and (date): Prior resolutions and (date): 18788, April 13, 2015</p>										
<p>CONTACT INFORMATION</p>	<p>RLA drafted by (name, title, & phone): Jessica Johnson, Senior Buyer, 881-3465</p>										
<p>REQUEST SUMMARY</p>	<p>The Parks + Rec Department requires a term and supply contract for the furnishing of Chemicals and Fertilizers. The Purchasing Department issued Invitation to Bid No. 19-16 in response to those requirements.</p> <p>A total of thirty-six notifications were distributed with five responses received and evaluated. The following split award is recommended for the lowest and best bidder meeting specifications:</p> <table data-bbox="305 1444 1494 1604"> <tr> <td>BIDDER:</td> <td>ITEMS RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD:</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Grass Pad of Olathe, KS</td> <td>2, 4, 6, 15, 34</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Reinders Inc of Olathe, KS</td> <td>1, 3, 7, 9, 11, 13, 16, 21, 22, 24, 25, 26, 27, 30, 32, 35, 36, 37, 39, 40, 41</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Supreme Turf, Olathe, KS</td> <td>17, 29, 31, 32, 33</td> </tr> </table> <p>Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, the Director of Finance and Purchasing recommends the award of a Twelve Month Term and Supply Contract for the furnishing of Chemicals and Fertilizers for the Parks + Rec Department to Grass Pad, Inc. of Olathe, KS; Reinders, Inc. of Olathe, KS; and Supreme Turf Products of Olathe, KS under the terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 19-16 as the lowest and best bidders meeting specifications for each item.</p> <p>This award is made on an "as needed" basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual appropriations.</p>	BIDDER:	ITEMS RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD:	Grass Pad of Olathe, KS	2, 4, 6, 15, 34	Reinders Inc of Olathe, KS	1, 3, 7, 9, 11, 13, 16, 21, 22, 24, 25, 26, 27, 30, 32, 35, 36, 37, 39, 40, 41	Supreme Turf, Olathe, KS	17, 29, 31, 32, 33		
BIDDER:	ITEMS RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD:										
Grass Pad of Olathe, KS	2, 4, 6, 15, 34										
Reinders Inc of Olathe, KS	1, 3, 7, 9, 11, 13, 16, 21, 22, 24, 25, 26, 27, 30, 32, 35, 36, 37, 39, 40, 41										
Supreme Turf, Olathe, KS	17, 29, 31, 32, 33										
<p>CLEARANCE</p>	<p><input type="checkbox"/> Tax Clearance Completed (Purchasing & Department) N/A <input type="checkbox"/> Business License Verified (Purchasing & Department) N/A</p>										

	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Chapter 6 Compliance - Affirmative Action/Prevailing Wage (County Auditor's Office)	
ATTACHMENTS	Abstract of Bids, Recap of Bids Received, a Memorandum from Mr. Wayne Shipley, Parks + Rec Department Utilities & Special Project Coordinator, and the pertinent pages of each recommended vendor's bid.	
REVIEW	Department Director: 	Date: 5-2-16
	Finance (Budget Approval): If applicable 	Date: 5/3/16
	Division Manager: 	Date: 5/4/16
	County Counselor's Office:	Date:

Fiscal Information (to be verified by Budget Office in Finance Department)

- This expenditure was included in the annual budget.
- Funds for this were encumbered from the _____ Fund in _____.
- There is a balance otherwise unencumbered to the credit of the appropriation to which the expenditure is chargeable and there is a cash balance otherwise unencumbered in the treasury to the credit of the fund from which payment is to be made each sufficient to provide for the obligation herein authorized.
- Funds sufficient for this expenditure will be/were appropriated by Ordinance # _____
- Funds sufficient for this appropriation are available from the source indicated below.

Account Number:	Account Title:	Amount Not to Exceed:

- This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as each using agency places its order.
- This legislative action does not impact the County financially and does not require Finance/Budget approval.

ABSTRACT OF BIDS

ITB: 19-16
 DATE: 04/05/16
 COMMODITY: Chemicals & Fertilizers

NO	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	QTY	Grass Pad Inc.	CWC Chemical Inc.	SiteOne Landscape Supply	Reinders	Supreme Turf Products, Inc.
				AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT
	Grand Total, Items 1-41			159,580.66	see bid	5,284.46	see bid	3,781.55

Res. 19143

CERTIFICATION OF BID OPENING
 BIDS WERE PUBLICLY
 OPENED AND RECORDED

ON: April 5, 2016 BY
 Clerk of the Legislature
 PURCHASING

Vendor: Supreme Turf Products, Inc. of Olathe, KS

Bid Recap		Quote				
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS						
	Yes/No	Item #	Item Name	Container Size	Unit Price	Bid as Spec
Signed Contract Affidavit	YES	1	14-0-4 43% Barricade	50#	\$ 14.75	No
Compliance Review Form or Certificate	YES	2	16-0-8 19% Dimension	50#	\$ 18.75	No
Contractor's Qualifications	YES	3	15-0-0 2% Merit	50#	\$ 16.75	No
Acknowledgement of Addenda	YES	4	18-12-6 w/ Avail Contains Nutrisphere	50#	\$ 14.25	No
Quotation	YES	5	32-0-8 50% Nitrogen	50#	\$ 13.25	No
Exceptions	YES	6	Acelepryn 0-0-7 Fertilizer	50#	\$ 25.75	Yes
CUP (0% requirements)	YES	7	Aquathol K	2.5 gal		No Bid
POCs & Contact Info	YES	8	Barricade 4FL	1 gal	\$ 137.00	Yes
How do bid if not in KCMO area memo (if applicable)	N/A	9	Citrine Plus	2.5 gal	\$ 64.00	Yes
		10	Dimension	2.5 gal	\$ 525.00	Yes
		11	Dismiss	1 pint	\$ 66.00	No-6oz bid
		12	Embark Growth Regulator	1 gal	\$ 71.00	Yes
		13	Field Marking Chalk	50#	\$ 5.00	No
		14	Freehand	50#	\$ 91.50	Yes
		15	Ranger Pro	2.5 gal	\$ 30.75	Yes
		16	Hyvar XL	1 gal		No Bid
		17	Induce-Aquatic Sticker	1 gal	\$ 22.50	No
		18	Merit 75wp	4 x 1.6 oz	\$ 17.50	No
		19	Pathfinder II	2.5 gal		No Bid
		20	Pathway	2.5 gal		No Bid
		21	Remedy	1 gal		No Bid
		22	Sedge Hammer	10 x 1.33 oz	\$ 700.00	Yes
		23	Seven 4L	2.5 gal	\$ 91.00	Yes
		24	Snapshot	50#	\$ 90.00	Yes
		25	Speed Zone	2.5 gal	\$ 177.00	Yes
		26	SureGuard	1#	\$ 161.00	Yes
		27	Talstar	1 gal	\$ 36.50	Yes
		28	Tempo 2	240ml	\$ 38.00	Yes
		29	Trflan 5g	50#	\$ 25.00	No
		30	Carlton 4A	2.5 gal	\$ 260.00	Yes
		31	Reward	2.5 gal	\$ 197.50	Yes
		32	Dylox	2.5 gal	\$ 155.00	Yes
		33	Clipper	1#	\$ 139.30	Yes
		34	Specticle	18 oz	\$ 227.00	Yes
		35	Sahara DC	10#	\$ 117.50	Yes
		36	Podium	1 gal		No Bid
		37	Divron 4L	2.5 gal		No Bid
		38	Headway G	30#	\$ 52.00	Yes
		39	20-0-10 90% Dur; 19% Dimension	50#	\$ 64.30	Yes
		40	24-0-5 80% D45 50P	50#	\$ 61.30	Yes
		41	5-0-20 19% Dimension	50#	\$ 55.40	Yes

COMMENTS:

Exceptions: Requested and/or Item Comments: Item 1: EC Grow 14-0-4, 43% Barricade, 50% STN; Item 2: EC Grow 16-0-4, 19% Dimension, 50% STN; Item 3: EC Grow 15-0-0, .2% Merit, 50% STN, Item 4: EC Grow 18-12-6 w STN and Avail; Item 5: EC Grow 32-0-8, 50% STN; Item 8: Agency Price, 20 gallon minimum; Item 10: Agency Price; Item 11: Alternate package size of 6oz; Item 13: Louisville Slugger Game Time Marking Powder (Specs attached); Item 14: Agency Price; Item 17: Cide Kick II (Specs attached); Item 18: Proloz Zenith 75 WSP (Specs attached); Item 29: Alternate package size of 40 lbs.; Item 31: Agency Price; Item 33: Agency Price; Item 34: Agency Price; Item 39: manufacturer Minimum 280 bags purchase; Item 40: manufacturer Minimum 280 bags purchase; Item 41: Manufacturer Minimum 280 bags purchase.

Vendor: Reinders, Inc. of Olathe, KS

Bid Recap		Quote				
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS	Yes/No	Item #	Item Name	Container Size	Unit Price	Bid as Spec
Signed Contract	YES	1	14-0-4 43% Barracade	50#	\$ 14.60	Yes
Affidavit	YES	2	16-0-8 19% Dimension	50#	\$ 18.97	Yes
Compliance Review Form or Certificate	YES	3	15-0-0 2% Merit	50#	\$ 16.36	Yes
Contractor's Qualifications	YES	4	18-12-6 w/ Avail Containts Nutrisphere	50#	\$ 14.69	Yes
Acknowledgement of Addenda	NO	5	32-0-8 50% Nitrogen	50#	\$ 13.87	Yes
Quotation	YES	6	Acelepryn 0-0-7 Fertilizer	50#	\$ 25.80	Yes
Exceptions	NO	7	Aquathol K	2.5 gal	\$ 177.94	Yes
CUP (0% requirements)	NO	8	Barracade 4FL	1 gal	\$ 143.00	Yes
POCs & Contact Info	YES	9	Cutrine Plus	2.5 gal	\$ 56.00	Yes
How do bid if not in KCMO area memo (if applicable)	N/A	10	Dimension	2.5 gal	\$ 525.00	Yes
		11	Dismiss	1 pint	\$ 63.16	No-6oz bid
		12	Embark Growth Regulator	1 gal	\$ 63.14	Yes
		13	Field Marking Chalk	50#	\$ 6.15	Yes
		14	Freehand	50#	\$ 91.50	Yes
		15	Ranger Pro	2.5 gal	\$ 27.65	Yes
		16	Hyvar XL	1 gal	\$ 97.30	Yes
		17	Induce-Aquatic Sticker	1 gal	\$ 24.00	No-2.5 gal bid
		18	Merit 75wp	4 x 1.6 oz	\$ 15.23	Yes
		19	Pathfinder II	2.5 gal	\$ 120.27	Yes
		20	Pathway	2.5 gal	\$ 94.08	Yes
		21	Remedy	1 gal	\$ 74.50	Yes
		22	Sedge Hammer	10 x 1.33 oz	\$ 502.00	No
		23	Seven 4L	2.5 gal	\$ 71.85	Yes
		24	Snapshot	50#	\$ 65.20	Yes
		25	Speed Zone	2.5 gal	\$ 156.52	Yes
		26	SureGuard	1#	\$ 141.55	Yes
		27	Talstar	1 gal	\$ 19.45	No-75 gal bid
		28	Tempo 2	240ml	\$ 31.35	Yes
		29	Trflan 5g	50#	\$ 25.77	Yes
		30	Carlion 4A	2.5 gal	\$ 210.26	Yes
		31	Reward	2.5 gal	\$ 197.50	Yes
		32	Dylox	2.5 gal	\$ 154.65	Yes
		33	Clipper	1#	\$ 139.30	Yes
		34	Specticle	18 oz	\$ 227.00	Yes
		35	Sahara DC	10#	\$ 89.14	Yes
		36	Podium	1 gal	\$ 102.15	Yes
		37	Divron 4L	2.5 gal	\$ 56.22	Yes
		38	Headway G	30#	\$ 43.84	Yes
		39	20-0-10 90% Dur; 19% Dimension	50#	\$ 64.30	Yes
		40	24-0-5 80% D45 50P	50#	\$ 61.30	Yes
		41	5-0-20 19% Dimension	50#	\$ 55.40	Yes

COMMENTS:

No Exceptions Requested. Item 22 & 27 spec attached for items bid.

Commodity: Chemicals & Fertilizers

Vendor: SiteOne Landscape Supply of Cleveland, OH

Bid Recap		Quote				
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS	Yes/No	Item #	Item Name	Container Size	Unit Price	Bid as Spec
Signed Contract	Yes	1	14-0-4 43% Barracade	50#	\$ 16.48	No
Affidavit	Yes	2	16-0-8 19% Dimension	50#	\$ 22.86	No
Compliance Review Form or Certificate	Yes	3	15-0-0 2% Merit	50#	\$ 17.99	No
Contractor's Qualifications	Yes	4	18-12-6 w/ Avail Contains Nutrisphere	50#		No Bid
Acknowledgement of Addenda	Yes	5	32-0-8 50% Nitrogen	50#	\$ 19.92	No
Quotation		6	Acelepryn 0-0-7 Fertilizer	50#	\$ 24.26	No
Exceptions		7	Aquathol K	2.5 gal		No bid
CUP (0% requirements)		8	Barracade 4FL	1 gal	\$ 137.00	Yes
POCs & Contact Info		9	Citrine Plus	2.5 gal	\$ 67.23	Yes
How do bid if not in KCMO area memo (if applicable)		10	Dimension	2.5 gal	\$ 525.00	Yes
		11	Dismiss	1 pint	\$ 729.96	No - 64oz bid
		12	Embark Growth Regulator	1 gal	\$ 289.14	Yes
		13	Field Marking Chalk	50#	\$ 3.72	Yes
		14	Freehand	50#	\$ 91.50	Yes
		15	Ranger Pro	2.5 gal	\$ 51.88	No
		16	Hyvar XL	1 gal		No Bid
		17	Induce-Aquatic Sticker	1 gal	\$ 42.13	No-2.5 gal bid
		18	Merit 75wp	4 x 1.6 oz	\$ 77.69	No
		19	Pathfinder II	2.5 gal		No Bid
		20	Pathway	2.5 gal		No Bid
		21	Remedy	1 gal	\$ 156.57	No
		22	Sedge Hammer	10 x 1.33 oz	\$ 689.00	No
		23	Seven 4L	2.5 gal	\$ 149.90	No
		24	Snapshot	50#	\$ 80.32	Yes
		25	Speed Zone	2.5 gal	\$ 227.42	Yes
		26	SureGuard	1#	\$ 141.55	Yes
		27	Talstar	1 gal	\$ 41.69	No
		28	Tempo 2	240ml	\$ 52.02	No
		29	Triflan 5g	50#	\$ 31.10	No-40 lb bid
		30	Carlton 4A	2.5 gal	\$ 156.57	No-1 gal bid
		31	Reward	2.5 gal	\$ 197.50	Yes
		32	Dylox	2.5 gal	\$ 199.71	Yes
		33	Clipper	1#	\$ 139.30	Yes
		34	Specticle	18 oz	\$ 227.00	Yes
		35	Sahara DC	10#		No Bid
		36	Podium	1 gal	\$ 147.75	Yes
		37	Divron 4L	2.5 gal	\$ 233.69	No
		38	Headway G	30#	\$ 70.61	Yes
		39	20-0-10 90% Dur, 19% Dimension	50#	\$ 80.00	No
		40	24-0-5 80% D45 50P	50#	\$ 80.00	No
		41	5-0-20 19% Dimension	50#	\$ 60.00	No

COMMENTS:

Exceptions Requested and comments: Item 1: Stonewall .43%, 30% polyplus, 14-0-7; Item 2: Dimension .21%, 50% polyplus, 18-0-10; Item 3: Merit .2%, 30% Polyplus, 14-0-0; Item 5: 32-5-7, 50% crn Thrive; Item 6: Acelepryn .67%, 8-0-0M; Item 8: Agency Item (discount if purchase 20+ gallons per order); Item 11: alternate container size, 64oz; Item 14: Agency Item; Item 15: Prosecutor Pro; Item 17: alternate size 2.5 gal; 90-10 non-ionic surfactant; Item 18: Bandit 75 wsp 4x4x1.6oz; Item 21: Confront; Item 22: Prosedge 2; Item 23: Sevin S; Item 27: Bifenthrine Golf/Nurs Insecticide 7.9%; Item 28: Tempo SC Ultra 240ml; Item 30: Confront, 1 gal; Item 31: Agency Item; Item 34: Agency Item; Item 37: Prodiamin 4L; Item 39: 30-0-10 Proscape, 100% methex .067% acelepryn, .253% dimension; Item 40: Proscape, 30-0-0 100% meth ex .067% acelepryn, .253% dimension; Item 41: Proscape 8-0-0 all mineral .067% acelepryn, .167% dimension.

Vendor: CWC Chemical, Inc. of Cloverdale, VA

Bid Recap

Quote

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS	Yes/No	Item #	Item Name	Container Size	Unit Price	Bid as Spec
Signed Contract	Yes	1	14-0-4 43% Barracade	50#		No Bid
Affidavit	Yes	2	16-0-8 19% Dimension	50#		No Bid
Compliance Review Form or Certificate	Yes	3	15-0-0 2% Merit	50#		No bid
Contractor's Qualifications	Yes	4	18-12-6 w/ Avail Containts Nutrisphere	50#		No bid
Acknowledgement of Addenda	NO	5	32-0-8 50% Nitrogen	50#		No bid
Quotation	Yes	6	Acelepryn 0-0-7 Fertilizer	50#		No Bid
Exceptions	NO	7	Aquathol K	2.5 gal		No Bid
CUP (0% requirements)	Yes	8	Barracade 4FL	1 gal		No Bid
POCs & Contact Info	Yes	9	Cutrine Plus	2.5 gal		No Bid
How do bid if not in KCMO area memo (if applicable)	No	10	Dimension	2.5 gal		No Bid
		11	Dismiss	1 pint		No Bid
		12	Embark Growth Regulator	1 gal	\$ 412.00	No
		13	Field Marking Chalk	50#		No Bid
		14	Freehand	50#		No Bid
		15	Ranger Pro	2.5 gal	\$ 15.00	Yes
		16	Hyvar XL	1 gal	\$ 93.95	Yes
		17	Induce-Aquatic Sticker	1 gal		No Bid
		18	Merit 75wp	4 x 1.6 oz		No Bid
		19	Pathfinder II	2.5 gal	\$ 48.88	
		20	Pathway	2.5 gal	\$ 38.20	
		21	Remedy	1 gal		No Bid
		22	Sedge Hammer	10 x 1.33 oz		No Bid
		23	Seven 4L	2.5 gal		No Bid
		24	Snapshot	50#		No Bid
		25	Speed Zone	2.5 gal		No Bid
		26	SureGuard	1#		No Bid
		27	Talstar	1 gal		No Bid
		28	Tempo 2	240ml		No Bid
		29	Trflan 5g	50#		No Bid
		30	Carlon 4A	2.5 gal		No Bid
		31	Reward	2.5 gal	\$ 79.00	No - 1 gal cont bid
		32	Dylox	2.5 gal		No Bid
		33	Clipper	1#		No Bid
		34	Specticle	18 oz		No Bid
		35	Sahara DC	10#		No Bid
		36	Podium	1 gal		No Bid
		37	Divron 4L	2.5 gal		No Bid
		38	Headway G	30#		No Bid
		39	20-0-10 90% Dur; 19% Dimension	50#		No Bid
		40	24-0-5 80% D45 50P	50#		No Bid
		41	5-0-20 19% Dimension	50#		No Bid

COMMENTS:

Exceptions Requested and comments: Item 12: Stronghold; Item 16: container size = 4 x 1 gal; Item 19: container size = 2 x 2 1/2; Item 20: container size = 2 x 2 1/2; Item 31: container size = 2 x 2 1/2.

Vendor located outside local area; no documentation included with bid on how they will perform the contract.

Vendor: Grass Pad Inc.

Bid Recap		Quote				
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS	Yes/No	Item #	Item Name	Container Size	Unit Price	Bid as Spec
Signed Contract	Yes	1	14-0-4 43% Barracade	50#	\$ 14.88	Yes
Affidavit	Yes	2	16-0-8 19% Dimension	50#	\$ 18.58	No
Compliance Review Form or Certificate	Yes	3	15-0-0 2% Merit	50#	\$ 16.65	Yes
Contractor's Qualifications	Yes	4	18-12-6 w/ Avail Containts Nutrisphere	50#	\$ 14.60	No
Acknowledgement of Addenda	Yes	5	32-0-8 50% Nitrogen	50#	\$ 13.47	Yes
Quotation	Yes	6	Acelepryn 0-0-7 Fertilizer	50#	\$ 24.58	Yes
Exceptions	Yes	7	Aquathol K	2.5 gal		No Bid
CUP (0% requirements)	Yes	8	Barracade 4FL	1 gal	\$ 137.00	Yes
POCs & Contact Info	Yes	9	Cutrine Plus	2.5 gal	\$ 24.50	No - 1 gal bid
How do bid if not in KCMO area memo (if applicable)	N/A	10	Dimension	2.5 gal	\$ 570.00	Yes
		11	Dismiss	1 pint	\$ 589.00	No - 64oz bid
		12	Embank Growth Regulator	1 gal	\$ 69.00	Yes
		13	Field Marking Chalk	50#	\$ 6.25	Yes
		14	Freehand	50#	\$ 70.20	No - 37.5lb bid
		15	Ranger Pro	2.5 gal	\$ 27.40	No
		16	Hyvar XL	1 gal		No Bid
		17	Induce-Aquatic Sticker	1 gal		No Bid
		18	Merit 75swp	4 x 1.6 oz	\$ 19.00	No
		19	Pathfinder II	2.5 gal		No Bid
		20	Pathway	2.5 gal		No Bid
		21	Remedy	1 gal		No Bid
		22	Sedge Hammer	10 x 1.33 oz	\$ 670.00	Yes
		23	Seven 4L	2.5 gal		No Bid
		24	Snapshot	50#	\$ 79.00	Yes
		25	Speed Zone	2.5 gal	\$ 169.00	Yes
		26	SureGuard	1#	\$ 148.00	Yes
		27	Talstar	1 gal	\$ 39.00	Yes
		28	Tempo 2	240ml		No Bid
		29	Trflan 5g	50#	\$ 33.95	Yes
		30	Carlton 4A	2.5 gal		No Bid
		31	Reward	2.5 gal	\$ 197.50	Yes
		32	Dylox	2.5 gal	\$ 167.90	Yes
		33	Clipper	1#	\$ 149.20	Yes
		34	Specticle	18 oz	\$ 227.00	Yes
		35	Sahara DC	10#		No Bid
		36	Podium	1 gal	\$ 132.00	No
		37	Divron 4L	2.5 gal		No Bid
		38	Headway G	30#	\$ 58.12	Yes
		39	20-0-10 90% Dur, 19% Dimension	50#	\$ 64.30	Yes
		40	24-0-5 80% D45 50P	50#	\$ 61.30	Yes
		41	5-0-20 19% Dimension	50#	\$ 55.40	Yes

COMMENTS:

Exceptions Requested: Item 9: sub U/M to 1 gallon; Item 11: Sub U/M to 64oz or 6 oz; Item 15: Albaugh Gly Slav Plus (specs attached); Item 18: Sub PrimeraOne Imidoclopid 75 WSB; Item 36: sub Quali-Pro/T-NEX 1 AQ; Item 1: Sub STN Brand Name; Item 2: Sub 16-0-4; Item 3: Sub STN Brand Name; Item 4 Sub 18-12-12; Item 5: Sub STN Brand Name.

19-16 PRICING SUMMARY

Red Items indicate container size bid differs from requested container size.

Item #	Item Name	Supreme Turf Products	Reinders, Inc.	SiteOne Landscape Supply	CWC Chemical	Grass Pad	Price
		Price	Price	Price	Price	Price	Price
1	14-0-4 43% Barracade	\$ 14.75	\$ 14.60	\$ 16.48	No Bid	\$ 14.88	
2	16-0-8 19% Dimension	\$ 18.75	\$ 18.97	\$ 22.86	No Bid	\$ 18.58	
3	15-0-0 2% Merit	\$ 16.75	\$ 16.36	\$ 17.99	No bid	\$ 16.65	
4	18-12-6 w/ Avail Contains Nutrispher	\$ 14.25	\$ 14.69	No Bid	No bid	\$ 14.60	
5	32-0-8 50% Nitrogen	\$ 13.25	\$ 13.87	\$ 19.92	No bid	\$ 13.47	
6	Acelepryn 0-0-7 Fertilizer	\$ 25.75	\$ 25.80	\$ 24.26	No Bid	\$ 24.58	
7	Aquathol K	No Bid	\$ 177.94	No bid	No Bid	No Bid	
8	Barracade 4FL	\$ 137.00	\$ 143.00	\$ 137.00	No Bid	\$ 137.00	
9	Cutrine Plus	\$ 64.00	\$ 56.00	\$ 67.23	No Bid	\$ 24.50	
10	Dimension	\$ 525.00	\$ 525.00	\$ 525.00	No Bid	\$ 570.00	
11	Dismiss	\$ 66.00	\$ 63.16	\$ 729.96	No Bid	\$ 589.00	
12	Embark Growth Regulator	\$ 71.00	\$ 63.14	\$ 289.14	\$ 412.00	\$ 69.00	
13	Field Marking Chalk	\$ 5.00	\$ 6.15	\$ 3.72	No Bid	\$ 6.25	
14	Freehand	\$ 91.50	\$ 91.50	\$ 91.50	No Bid	\$ 70.20	
15	Ranger Pro	\$ 30.75	\$ 27.65	\$ 51.88	\$ 15.00	\$ 27.40	
16	Hyvar XL	No Bid	\$ 97.30	No Bid	\$ 93.95	No Bid	
17	Induce-Aquatic Sticker	\$ 22.50	\$ 24.00	\$ 42.13	No Bid	No Bid	
18	Merit 75wp	\$ 17.50	\$ 15.23	\$ 77.69	No Bid	\$ 19.00	
19	Pathfinder II	No Bid	\$ 120.27	No Bid	\$ 48.88	No Bid	
20	Pathway	No Bid	\$ 94.08	No Bid	\$ 38.20	No Bid	
21	Remedy	No Bid	\$ 74.50	\$ 156.57	No Bid	No Bid	
22	Sedge Hammer	\$ 700.00	\$ 502.00	\$ 689.00	No Bid	\$ 670.00	
23	Seven 4L	\$ 91.00	\$ 71.85	\$ 149.90	No Bid	No Bid	
24	Snapshot	\$ 90.00	\$ 65.20	\$ 80.32	No Bid	\$ 79.00	
25	Speed Zone	\$ 177.00	\$ 156.52	\$ 227.42	No Bid	\$ 169.00	
26	SureGuard	\$ 161.00	\$ 141.55	\$ 141.55	No Bid	\$ 148.00	
27	Talstar	\$ 36.50	\$ 19.45	\$ 41.69	No Bid	\$ 39.00	
28	Tempo 2	\$ 38.00	\$ 31.35	\$ 52.02	No Bid	No Bid	
29	Trflan 5g	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.77	\$ 31.10	No Bid	\$ 33.95	
30	Carlton 4A	\$ 260.00	\$ 210.26	\$ 156.57	No Bid	No Bid	
31	Reward	\$ 197.50	\$ 197.50	\$ 197.50	\$ 79.00	\$ 197.50	
32	Dylox	\$ 155.00	\$ 154.65	\$ 199.71	No Bid	\$ 167.90	
33	Clipper	\$ 139.30	\$ 139.30	\$ 139.30	No Bid	\$ 149.20	
34	Specticle	\$ 227.00	\$ 227.00	\$ 227.00	No Bid	\$ 227.00	
35	Sahara DC	\$ 117.50	\$ 89.14	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
36	Podium	No Bid	\$ 102.15	\$ 147.75	No Bid	\$ 132.00	
37	Divron 4L	No Bid	\$ 56.22	\$ 233.69	No Bid	No Bid	
38	Headway G	\$ 52.00	\$ 43.84	\$ 70.61	No Bid	\$ 58.12	
39	20-0-10 90% Dur; 19% Dimension	\$ 64.30	\$ 64.30	\$ 80.00	No Bid	\$ 64.30	
40	24-0-5 80% D45 50P	\$ 61.30	\$ 61.30	\$ 80.00	No Bid	\$ 61.30	
41	5-0-20 19% Dimension	\$ 55.40	\$ 55.40	\$ 60.00	No Bid	\$ 55.40	



**JACKSON COUNTY
Parks + Recreation**

22807 Woods Chapel Road
Blue Springs, Missouri 64015
www.jacksongov.org

Res. 19143

*Administration
Historic Sites
Ranger Station
Leisure Services
(816) 503-4800
Fax (816) 795-1234*

*Kemper Outdoor
Education Center
(816) 229-8980*

*Fred Arbanas
Golf Course at
Longview Lake
(816) 761-9445*

*Blue Springs Marina
(816) 795-1112*

*Jacomo Marina
(816) 795-8888*

*Longview Marina
(816) 966-0131*

*Special Population
Services
(816) 763-5130*

MEMORANDUM

TO: Jessica M. Johnson, Purchasing, Senior Buyer
FROM: Wayne Shipley, Utilities & Special Project Coordinator
DATE: May 2, 2016
SUBJECT: Invitation to bid 2-14: Chemicals & Fertilizers

The Parks Department recommendation is to award the bid to Reinders, Supreme Turf, and Grass Pad as the lowest and best bid.

Our **projected usage** during the next twelve months is \$ 72,000.00

003 – 1624 - 57220 - \$59,000
300 – 1654 – 57220 - \$6,000
300 – 1682 – 57220 - \$7,000

Reinders - \$53,700

Item # 1, 3, 7, 9, 11, 13, 16, 21, 22, 24, 25, 26, 27,
30, 32, 35, 36, 37, 39, 40, 41

Supreme Turf - \$4,800

Item # 17, 29,31,32,33

Grass Pad - \$13,500

Item # 2, 4, 6, 15, 34

The follow items are NOT recommended for award: 5, 8, 10, 12, 14, 18, 19, 20, 23, 28, and 38. They are not needed for this season.

ATTACHMENT 1
RESPONDENT'S QUOTATION for
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 19-16

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
1.	14-0-4 43% Barracade which contains 50% RXN - n - slow release Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>* 50</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>14.⁸⁸</u> Total = 4,464. ⁰⁰	Y
2.	16-0-8 19% Dimension which contains 50% Nutrisphere - n - slow release 16-0-4 Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>* 50</u>	50 pounds	600 bags	\$ <u>18.⁵⁸</u> T = 11,148. ⁰⁰	N
3.	15-0-0 2% Merit and contains 50% RXN - n - slow release Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>* 50</u>	50 pounds	600 bags	\$ <u>16.⁶⁵</u> T = 9,990. ⁰⁰	Y
4.	18-12-6 w/Avail Containts Nutrisphere - n - AVAIL / slow release 18-12-12 Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>* 50</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>14.⁶⁰</u> T = 4,380. ⁰⁰	N
5.	32-0-8 Contains 50% Nitrogen from 50% RXN - n - slow release Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>* 50</u>	50 pounds	200 bags	\$ <u>13.⁴⁷</u> T = 2,694. ⁰⁰	Y
6.	Acelepryn 0-0-7 Fertilizer Plus .067 Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>* 50</u>	50 pound	600 bags	\$ <u>24.⁵⁸</u> T = 14,748. ⁰⁰	Y
7.	Aquathol K Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	2.5 gallon	40 gallon	\$ <u>NIB</u>	
8.	Barracade 4FL Manufacturer: <u>Synsenta</u> Container Size: <u>1 gallon</u>	1 gallon	20 gallon	\$ <u>137.⁰⁰</u> T = 2,740. ⁰⁰	Y

ATTACHMENT 1 continued
RESPONDENT'S QUOTATION for
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 19-16

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
9.	Citrine Plus Manufacturer: <u>Applied Biochemists</u> Container Size: <u>1 gal</u>	2.5 gallon	5 gallon	\$ <u>24.⁵⁰</u> per/gal <u>5 gal / \$122.⁰⁰</u>	Y
10.	Dimension Manufacturer: <u>Dow</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 gallon</u>	2.5 gallon	40 gallon	\$ <u>570.⁰⁰</u> T- <u>9,120.⁰⁰</u>	Y
11.	Dismiss Manufacturer: <u>FMC</u> Container Size: <u>64oz / 6oz</u>	1 pint	10 pint	\$ <u>64oz - 589.⁰⁰</u> <u>6oz - 68.⁰⁰</u> T- <u>44oz - 1,178.⁰⁰</u> 6- <u>6oz - 408.⁰⁰</u>	N Size
12.	Embark Growth Regulator Manufacturer: <u>PBT / Gordon</u> Container Size: <u>1 gallon</u>	1 gallon	8 gallon	\$ <u>69.⁰⁰</u> T- <u>552.⁰⁰</u>	Y
13.	Field Marking Chalk, Plus Five Chalk Manufacturer: <u>Imerys Performance</u> Container Size: <u>\$ 50</u>	50 pounds	1,500 bags	\$ <u>6.²⁵</u> T- <u>9,375.⁰⁰</u>	Y
14.	Freehand Manufacturer: <u>BASF</u> Container Size: <u>37.5 lb</u>	50 pounds	10 bags	\$ <u>70.⁰⁰</u> <u>1.872.⁰⁰ / lb.</u> T- <u>936.⁰⁰</u>	N Size
15.	Ranger Pro <u>Gly Star Plus</u> Manufacturer: <u>Nbough</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 gallon</u>	2.5 gallon	400 gallon	\$ <u>27.⁴⁰</u> T- <u>4,384.⁰⁰</u>	N
16.	Hyvar XL Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	1 gallon	80 gallon	\$ <u>N/B</u>	
17.	Induce-Aquatic Sticker Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	1 gallon	10 gallon	\$ <u>N/B</u>	

ATTACHMENT 1 continued
RESPONDENT'S QUOTATION for
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 19-16

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
18.	Merit 75wp Manufacturer: <u>Spectem Advan</u> Container Size: <u>4 x 1.6 oz</u>	4 x 1.6 oz per container	2 boxes	\$ <u>19.⁰⁰</u> T-# <u>38.⁰⁰</u>	N
19.	Pathfinder II Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	2.5 gallon	10 gallon	\$ <u>N/B</u>	
20.	Pathway Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	2.5 gallon	10 gallon	\$ <u>N/B</u>	
21.	Remedy Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	1 gallon	10 gallon	\$ <u>N/B</u>	
22.	Sedge Hammer Manufacturer: <u>NuFarm</u> Container Size: <u>1.33 oz</u>	10 x 1.33 oz per container	3 cases	\$ <u>67.⁰⁰</u> case * <u>67.⁰⁰ - 1.33 oz</u> T-# <u>2000⁰⁰</u>	Y
23.	Seven 4L Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	2.5 gallon	5 gallon	\$ <u>N/B</u>	
24.	Snapshot Manufacturer: <u>Dow</u> Container Size: <u>#50</u>	50 pounds	4 bags	\$ <u>79.⁰⁰</u> T-# <u>36.⁰⁰</u>	Y
25.	Speed Zone Manufacturer: <u>PBI/Gordon</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 gal</u>	2.5 gallon	55 gallon	\$ <u>169.⁰⁰</u> T-# <u>3718.⁰⁰</u>	Y
26.	SureGuard Manufacturer: <u>Valent</u> Container Size: <u>1 lb.</u>	1 pound	30 pounds	\$ <u>148.⁰⁰</u> T-# <u>4,440.⁰⁰</u>	Y

ATTACHMENT 1 continued
RESPONDENT'S QUOTATION for
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 19-16

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
27.	Talstar Manufacturer: <u>FMC</u> Container Size: <u>1 gal</u>	1 gallon	20 gallon	\$ <u>39.⁰⁰</u> T- <u>780.⁰⁰</u>	Y
28.	Tempo 2 Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	240 ml	10 bottles	\$ <u>N/B</u>	
29.	Treflan 5g Manufacturer: <u>Dow</u> Container Size: <u>50</u>	50 pounds	4 bags	\$ <u>33.⁹⁵</u> T- <u>135.⁰⁰</u>	Y
30.	Carlton 4A Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	2.5 gallon	25 gallon	\$ <u>N/B</u>	
31.	Reward Manufacturer: <u>Syngenta</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 gal</u>	2.5 gallon	100 gallon	\$ <u>197.⁵⁰</u> T- <u>7,900.⁰⁰</u>	Y
32.	Dylox Manufacturer: <u>Bayer</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 gal</u>	2.5 gallon	50 gallon	\$ <u>167.⁹⁰</u> T- <u>3,258.⁰⁰</u>	Y
33.	Clipper Manufacturer: <u>Valent</u> Container Size: <u>1 lb.</u>	1 pound	15 pounds	\$ <u>149.²⁰</u> T- <u>2,238.⁰⁰</u>	Y
34.	Specticle Manufacturer: <u>Bayer</u> Container Size: <u>18 oz</u>	18 oz	15 bottles	\$ <u>227.⁰⁰</u> T- <u>3,405.⁰⁰</u>	Y
35.	Sahara DC Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	10 pounds	50 pounds	\$ <u>N/B</u>	

ATTACHMENT 1 continued
RESPONDENT'S QUOTATION for
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 19-16

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
36.	Podium <u>T-NIX 1AQ</u> Manufacturer: <u>Quali-Pro</u> Container Size: <u>1 gal</u>	1 gallon	4 gallons	\$ <u>132.⁰⁰</u> <u>T-528.⁰⁰</u>	NO
37.	Divron 4L Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	2.5 gallon	25 gallons	\$ <u>N/B</u>	
38.	Headway G Manufacturer: <u>Syngenta</u> Container Size: <u>30 lb</u>	30 pounds	100 pounds	\$ <u>58.¹⁰</u> <u>T-174.³⁴</u>	Y
39.	20-0-10 90% Dur; 19% Dimension; .58% Acelepryn Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>* 50</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>64.³⁰</u> <u>T-300. 19,290.⁰⁰</u>	Y
40.	24-0-5 80% D45 50P; 19% Dimension; .58% Acelepryn Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>* 50</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>61.³⁰</u> <u>T-18,390.⁰⁰</u>	Y
41.	5-0-20 19% Dimension; .058% Acelepryn Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>* 50</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>55.⁴⁰</u> <u>T-16,620.⁰⁰</u>	Y
GRAND TOTAL, ITEMS 1-41				\$ <u>159,580.⁶⁶</u>	
EST QTY					

CERTIFICATION

SIGNATURE: <u>Todd Lee Winkelman</u>	DATE: <u>3-17-16</u>
NAME: <u>Todd Lee Winkelman</u> (Print or Type)	PHONE: <u>913-764-4100</u>
TITLE: <u>Manager</u> (Print or Type)	MOBILE: <u>913-660-3429</u>
COMPANY NAME: <u>GRASS PAD INC.</u> (Print or Type)	FAX: <u>913-764-9200</u>
EMAIL ADDRESS: <u>todd@grasspad.com</u> (Print or Type)	

EXHIBIT F
BIDDER'S EXCEPTIONS
TO
SPECIFICATIONS
OF
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 19-16

Respondent's attention is directed to Paragraph 4 of the General Conditions of this Invitation to Bid. **READ THIS PARAGRAPH CAREFULLY.**

The following exceptions to the Specifications of Invitation to Bid No. 19-16 are requested by the undersigned Respondent: (Use additional pages as necessary.)

REFERENCE PARA # & PAGE #	EXCEPTION REQUESTED
* 9, 18	U/M 2.5 gallon > 1 gallon
* 11, 18	U/M 1 Pint > 64oz / or 6oz.
* 15, 18	Albaugh Gly Star Plus.
* 18, 19	Misc 75 WP > Primavera One Imidaclopid 75 WP
* 36, 21	Podium > Quali-Pro / F NEX 1 AQ
* 1, 17	RXN - Trade Name / STN Brand Name
* 2, 17	16-0-8 → 16-0-4 rest the same
* 3, 17	RXN - Trade Name / STN Brand Name
* 4, 17	18-12-6 → 18-12-12 rest the same
* 5, 17	RXN - Trade Name / STN Brand Name

Name of Firm: GRASS PAD INC.

Signature of Bidder: 

ATTACHMENT 1
RESPONDENT'S QUOTATION for
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 19-16

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
1.	14-0-4 43% Barracade which contains 50% RXN - n - slow release Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>50 LB</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>14.60/BAG</u>	YES
2.	16-0-8 19% Dimension which contains 50% Nutrisphere - n - slow release Manufacturer: <u>EC GROW</u> Container Size: <u>50 LB</u>	50 pounds	600 bags	\$ <u>18.97/BAG</u>	YES
3.	15-0-0 2% Merit and contains 50% RXN - n - slow release Manufacturer: <u>EC GROW</u> Container Size: <u>50 LB</u>	50 pounds	600 bags	\$ <u>16.36/BAG</u>	YES
4.	18-12-6 w/Avail Containts Nutrisphere - n - AVAIL / slow release Manufacturer: <u>EC GROW</u> Container Size: <u>50 LB</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>14.69/BAG</u>	YES
5.	32-0-8 Contains 50% Nitrogen from 50% RXN - n - slow release Manufacturer: <u>EC GROW</u> Container Size: <u>50 LB</u>	50 pounds	200 bags	\$ <u>13.87/BAG</u>	YES
6.	Acelepryn 0-0-7 Fertilizer Plus .067 Manufacturer: <u>EC GROW</u> Container Size: <u>50 LB</u>	50 pound	600 bags	\$ <u>25.80/BAG</u>	YES
7.	Aquathol K Manufacturer: <u>CYGNET</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 GAL</u>	2.5 gallon	40 gallon	\$ <u>177.94</u>	YES
8.	Barracade 4FL Manufacturer: <u>SYNGENTA</u> Container Size: <u>1 GAL</u>	1 gallon	20 gallon	\$ <u>137.00 - 20 GAL OR OVER</u> <u>143.00 LESS THAN 20 GAL</u>	YES

ATTACHMENT 1 continued
RESPONDENT'S QUOTATION for
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 19-16

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
9.	Citrine Plus Manufacturer: <u>CYGNET</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 GAL</u>	2.5 gallon	5 gallon	\$ <u>56.00</u>	YES
10.	Dimension Manufacturer: <u>DOW</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 GAL</u>	2.5 gallon	40 gallon	\$ <u>525.00</u>	YES
11.	Dismiss Manufacturer: <u>FMC</u> Container Size: <u>6 OZ</u>	1 pint	10 pint	\$ <u>63.16</u>	YES
12.	Embark Growth Regulator Manufacturer: <u>PBI-GORDON</u> Container Size: <u>1 GAL</u>	1 gallon	8 gallon	\$ <u>63.14</u>	YES
13.	Field Marking Chalk, Plus Five Chalk Manufacturer: <u>PLUS 5</u> Container Size: <u>50 LB</u>	50 pounds	1,500 bags	\$ <u>6.15</u>	YES
14.	Freehand Manufacturer: <u>BASF</u> Container Size: <u>50 LB</u>	50 pounds	10 bags	\$ <u>91.50</u>	YES
15.	Ranger Pro Manufacturer: <u>MONSANTO</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 GAL</u>	2.5 gallon	400 gallon	\$ <u>27.65</u>	YES
16.	Hyvar XL Manufacturer: <u>DUPONT</u> Container Size: <u>1 GAL</u>	1 gallon	80 gallon	\$ <u>97.30</u>	YES
17.	Induce-Aquatic Sticker Manufacturer: <u>QUEST - INDUCE</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 GAL</u>	1 gallon	10 gallon	\$ <u>24.00</u>	NO

ATTACHMENT 1 continued
RESPONDENT'S QUOTATION for
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 19-16

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
18.	Merit 75wp Manufacturer: <u>PROKOZ - ZENITH</u> Container Size: <u>4 x 1.6 oz</u>	4 x 1.6 oz per container	2 boxes	\$ <u>15.23</u>	YES
19.	Pathfinder II Manufacturer: <u>DOW</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 GAL</u>	2.5 gallon	10 gallon	\$ <u>120.27</u>	YES
20.	Pathway Manufacturer: <u>DOW</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 GAL</u>	2.5 gallon	10 gallon	\$ <u>94.08</u>	YES
21.	Remedy Manufacturer: <u>DOW</u> Container Size: <u>1 GAL</u>	1 gallon	10 gallon	\$ <u>74.50</u>	YES
22.	Sedge Hammer Manufacturer: <u>NUFARM - PROSEGE</u> Container Size: <u>10 x 1.33 oz</u>	10 x 1.33 oz per container	3 cases	\$ <u>502.00</u>	NO
23.	Seven 4L Manufacturer: <u>PROKOZ</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 GAL</u>	2.5 gallon	5 gallon	\$ <u>71.85</u>	YES
24.	Snapshot Manufacturer: <u>DOW</u> Container Size: <u>50 LB</u>	50 pounds	4 bags	\$ <u>65.20</u>	YES
25.	Speed Zone Manufacturer: <u>PBI - GORDON</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 GAL</u>	2.5 gallon	55 gallon	\$ <u>156.52</u>	YES
26.	SureGuard Manufacturer: <u>NUFARM</u> Container Size: <u>1 LB</u>	1 pound	30 pounds	\$ <u>141.55</u>	YES

ATTACHMENT 1 continued
RESPONDENT'S QUOTATION for
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 19-16

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
27.	Talstar Manufacturer: <u>APP - WISDOM</u> Container Size: <u>.75 GAL</u>	1 gallon	20 gallon	\$ <u>19.45</u>	NO
28.	Tempo 2 Manufacturer: <u>BAYER</u> Container Size: <u>240 ML</u>	240 ml	10 bottles	\$ <u>31.35</u>	YES
29.	Treflan 5g Manufacturer: <u>ANDERSONS</u> Container Size: <u>50 LB</u>	50 pounds	4 bags	\$ <u>25.77</u>	YES
30.	Carlton 4A Manufacturer: <u>DOW</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 GAL</u>	2.5 gallon	25 gallon	\$ <u>210.26</u>	YES
31.	Reward Manufacturer: <u>SYNGENTA</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 GAL.</u>	2.5 gallon	100 gallon	\$ <u>197.50</u>	YES
32.	Dylox Manufacturer: <u>BAYER</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 GAL</u>	2.5 gallon	50 gallon	\$ <u>154.65</u>	YES
33.	Clipper Manufacturer: <u>NUFARM</u> Container Size: <u>1 LB</u>	1 pound	15 pounds	\$ <u>139.30</u>	YES
34.	Specticle Manufacturer: <u>BAYER</u> Container Size: <u>18 OZ.</u>	18 oz	15 bottles	\$ <u>227.00</u>	YES
35.	Sahara DC Manufacturer: <u>BASF</u> Container Size: <u>10 LB</u>	10 pounds	50 pounds	\$ <u>89.14</u>	YES

ATTACHMENT 1 continued
RESPONDENT'S QUOTATION for
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 19-16

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
36.	Podium Manufacturer: <u>SYNGENTA</u> Container Size: <u>1 GAL</u>	1 gallon	4 gallons	\$ <u>102.15</u>	YES
37.	Divron 4L Manufacturer: <u>DUPONT</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 GAL</u>	2.5 gallon	25 gallons	\$ <u>56.22</u>	YES
38.	Headway G Manufacturer: <u>SYNGENTA</u> Container Size: <u>30 LB</u>	30 pounds	100 pounds	\$ <u>43.84</u>	YES
39.	20-0-10 90% Dur; 19% Dimension; .58% Acelepryn Manufacturer: <u>EC GROW</u> Container Size: <u>50 LB</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>64.30</u> 68.25	YES
40.	24-0-5 80% D45 50P; 19% Dimension; .58% Acelepryn Manufacturer: <u>EC GROW</u> Container Size: <u>50 LB</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>61.30</u>	YES
41.	5-0-20 19% Dimension; .058% Acelepryn Manufacturer: <u>EC GROW</u> Container Size: <u>50 LB</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>55.40</u>	YES
GRAND TOTAL, ITEMS 1-41				\$	

CERTIFICATION

SIGNATURE: <u>Dennis Whiteford</u>	DATE: <u>3/29/16</u>
NAME: <u>DENNIS WHITEFORD</u> (Print or Type)	PHONE: <u>913.397.0080</u>
TITLE: <u>TERRITORY MANAGER</u> (Print or Type)	MOBILE: <u>913.238.0869</u>
COMPANY NAME: <u>REINDERS, INC</u> (Print or Type)	FAX: <u>913.397.0085</u>
EMAIL ADDRESS: <u>dwhiteford@reinders.com</u> (Print or Type)	

ATTACHMENT 1
RESPONDENT'S QUOTATION for
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 19-16

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
1.	14-0-4 43% Barracade which contains 50% RXN - n - slow release Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>50 LBS</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>147⁵</u>	NO: EC Grow 14-0-4, 43% BARRACADE 50% STN
2.	16-0-8 19% Dimension which contains 50% Nutrisphere - n - slow release Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>50 LBS.</u>	50 pounds	600 bags	\$ <u>18⁷⁵</u>	NO: EC Grow 16-0-4, 19% DIMENSION 50% STN
3.	15-0-0 2% Merit and contains 50% RXN - n - slow release Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>50 LBS.</u>	50 pounds	600 bags	\$ <u>16⁷⁵</u>	NO: EC Grow 15-0-0, 2% MERIT 50% STN
4.	18-12-6 w/Avail Contains Nutrisphere - n - AVAIL / slow release Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>50 LBS</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>14²⁵</u>	NO: EC Grow 18-12-6 w STN AND AVAIL
5.	32-0-8 Contains 50% Nitrogen from 50% RXN - n - slow release Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>50 LBS</u>	50 pounds	200 bags	\$ <u>13²⁵</u>	NO: EC Grow 32-0-8, 50% STN
6.	Acelepryn 0-0-7 Fertilizer Plus .067 Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow</u> Container Size: <u>50 LBS.</u>	50 pound	600 bags	\$ <u>25⁷⁵</u>	YES
7.	Aquathol K Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	2.5 gallon	40 gallon	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	
8.	Barracade 4FL Manufacturer: <u>SYNGENTA</u> Container Size: <u>1 GALLON OR 10 GALLON LINE PRICE</u>	1 gallon	20 gallon	\$ <u>137⁰⁰/gal (20 gal Min)</u> \$ <u>1247⁵⁰/10 gal (20 Gal. Minimum)</u>	YES - AGENCY PRICE

ATTACHMENT 1 continued
RESPONDENT'S QUOTATION for
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 19-16

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
9.	Citrine Plus Manufacturer: <u>APPLIED BIOSCIENCE</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 GAL</u>	2.5 gallon	5 gallon	\$ <u>61⁰⁰</u>	YES
10.	Dimension Manufacturer: <u>DOW</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 gal.</u>	2.5 gallon	40 gallon	\$ <u>525⁰⁰</u>	YES AGENCY PRICE
11.	Dismiss Manufacturer: <u>FMC</u> Container Size: <u>60Z</u>	1 pint	10 pint	\$ <u>66⁰⁰ / 60Z.</u>	YES; ALT. PACKAGE SIZE
12.	Embark Growth Regulator Manufacturer: <u>PBI GORDON</u> Container Size: <u>1 GAL.</u>	1 gallon	8 gallon	\$ <u>71⁰⁰</u>	YES; EMERGENCY T ₁ 0
13.	Field Marking Chalk, Plus Five Chalk Manufacturer: <u>LOUISVILLE SLUGGER / GAME TIME</u> Container Size: <u>50 LBS</u>	50 pounds	1,500 bags	\$ <u>5⁰⁰</u>	NO; LOUISVILLE SLUGGER GAME TIME MARKING POWDER; SDS ATTACHED
14.	Freehand Manufacturer: <u>BASF</u> Container Size: <u>50 LBS</u>	50 pounds	10 bags	\$ <u>91⁵⁰</u>	YES AGENCY PRICE
15.	Ranger Pro Manufacturer: <u>MONSANTO</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 GAL</u>	2.5 gallon	400 gallon	\$ <u>30⁷⁵</u>	YES
16.	Hyvar XL Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	1 gallon	80 gallon	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	
17.	Induce-Aquatic Sticker Manufacturer: <u>CYLINE</u> Container Size: <u>1 GALLON</u>	1 gallon	10 gallon	\$ <u>22⁵⁰</u>	NO; CIDE KICK II LABEL ATTACHED

ATTACHMENT 1 continued
RESPONDENT'S QUOTATION for
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 19-16

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
18.	Merit 75wp Manufacturer: <u>PROLOZ</u> Container Size: <u>4x1.6oz</u>	4 x 1.6 oz per container	2 boxes	\$ <u>17⁵⁰</u>	NO PROLOZ ZENITH 75 WSP LABEL ATTACHED
19.	Pathfinder II Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	2.5 gallon	10 gallon	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	
20.	Pathway Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	2.5 gallon	10 gallon	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	
21.	Remedy Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	1 gallon	10 gallon	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	
22.	Sedge Hammer Manufacturer: <u>NUFARM</u> Container Size: <u>1.33oz</u>	10 x 1.33 oz per container	3 cases	\$ <u>700⁰⁰ / CASE OF 10</u>	YES: NUFARM PROSENE
23.	Seven 4L Manufacturer: <u>BAYER</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 GAL</u>	2.5 gallon	5 gallon	\$ <u>91⁰⁰</u>	YES
24.	Snapshot Manufacturer: <u>DOW</u> Container Size: <u>50 LBS</u>	50 pounds	4 bags	\$ <u>90⁰⁰</u>	YES
25.	Speed Zone Manufacturer: <u>FBI GORDON</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 GAL</u>	2.5 gallon	55 gallon	\$ <u>177⁰⁰</u>	YES
26.	SureGuard Manufacturer: <u>NUFARM</u> Container Size: <u>1 LBS.</u>	1 pound	30 pounds	\$ <u>161⁰⁰</u>	YES

ATTACHMENT 1 continued
RESPONDENT'S QUOTATION for
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 19-16

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
27.	Talstar Manufacturer: <u>FMC</u> Container Size: <u>1 GALLON</u>	1 gallon	20 gallon	\$ <u>36⁵⁰</u>	YES
28.	Tempo 2 Manufacturer: <u>BOYER</u> Container Size: <u>240 ml</u>	240 ml	10 bottles	\$ <u>38⁰⁰</u>	YES
29.	Treflan 5g Manufacturer: <u>LEBANON</u> Container Size: <u>40 LBS.</u>	50 pounds	4 bags	\$ <u>25⁰⁰ / 40^{lb}</u>	NO; ACT. PACKAGE SIZE
30.	Carlton 4A Manufacturer: <u>DOW</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 GAL</u>	2.5 gallon	25 gallon	\$ <u>260⁰⁰</u>	YES
31.	Reward Manufacturer: <u>SYNGENTA</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 GAL.</u>	2.5 gallon	100 gallon	\$ <u>197⁵⁰</u>	YES AGENCY PRICE
32.	Dylox Manufacturer: <u>BOYER</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 GAL.</u>	2.5 gallon	50 gallon	\$ <u>155⁰⁰</u>	YES
33.	Clipper Manufacturer: <u>NUFARM</u> Container Size: <u>1 LBS.</u>	1 pound	15 pounds	\$ <u>139³⁰</u>	YES AGENCY PRICE
34.	Specticle Manufacturer: <u>BOYER</u> Container Size: <u>18oz</u>	18 oz	15 bottles	\$ <u>227⁰⁰</u>	YES AGENCY PRICE
35.	Sahara DC Manufacturer: <u>BASF</u> Container Size: <u>10 LBS</u>	10 pounds	50 pounds	\$ <u>117⁵⁰</u>	YES

ATTACHMENT 1 continued
RESPONDENT'S QUOTATION for
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 19-16

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
36.	Podium Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	1 gallon	4 gallons	\$ <u>No Bid</u>	
37.	Divron 4L Manufacturer: _____ Container Size: _____	2.5 gallon	25 gallons	\$ <u>No Bid</u>	
38.	Headway G Manufacturer: <u>SYNBENTA</u> Container Size: <u>30 LBS</u>	30 pounds	100 pounds	\$ <u>52⁰⁰</u>	YES
39.	20-0-10 90% Dur; 19% Dimension; .58% Acelepryn Manufacturer: <u>EL GROW</u> Container Size: <u>50 LBS</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>64³⁰</u>	YES MINIMUM PURCHASE 280 BAGS
40.	24-0-5 80% D45 50P; 19% Dimension; .58% Acelepryn Manufacturer: <u>EL GROW</u> Container Size: <u>50 LBS</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>61³⁰</u>	YES MINIMUM PURCHASE 280 BAGS
41.	5-0-20 19% Dimension; .058% Acelepryn Manufacturer: <u>EL GROW</u> Container Size: <u>50 LBS</u>	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ <u>55⁴⁰</u>	YES MINIMUM PURCHASE 280 BAGS
GRAND TOTAL, ITEMS 1-41				\$ <u>3781⁵⁵</u>	

CERTIFICATION

SIGNATURE: <u>John M. Dixon</u>	DATE: <u>3/31/16</u>
NAME: <u>John M. Dixon</u> (Print or Type)	PHONE: <u>913 829-3611</u>
TITLE: <u>Sales Rep</u> (Print or Type)	MOBILE: <u>816 210-0071</u>
COMPANY NAME: <u>Supreme Turf Products Inc.</u> (Print or Type)	FAX: <u>913 829-3611</u>
EMAIL ADDRESS: <u>supremeturfke@shglobal.net</u> (Print or Type)	

EXHIBIT F
BIDDER'S EXCEPTIONS
TO
SPECIFICATIONS
OF
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 19-16

Respondent's attention is directed to Paragraph 4 of the General Conditions of this Invitation to Bid. **READ THIS PARAGRAPH CAREFULLY.**

The following exceptions to the Specifications of Invitation to Bid No. 19-16 are requested by the undersigned Respondent: (Use additional pages as necessary.)

REFERENCE PARA # & PAGE #	EXCEPTION REQUESTED
ITEM #'S 8, 10, 14, 31 33 & 34	THESE ITEMS ARE AGENCY POILED, PRICES ARE SET BY MANUFACTURER AND ARE SUBJECT TO CHANGE.
ITEMS 11 & 29	THESE ARE ALTERNATE PACKAGE SIZES
ITEM 13	BIDDING, LOUISVILLE SLUGGER GAME TIME WHITE MARKING POWDER SDS SHEET ATTACHED
ITEM 17	BIDDING, CINE KICK II - LABEL ATTACHED
ITEM 18	BIDDING, PROPOZ ZENITH 75 WSP - LABEL ATTACHED
ITEMS 39, 40 & 41	THESE ITEMS ALL HAVE A MANUFACTURER'S MINIMUM PRICE AND MINIMUM PURCHASE AMOUNT

Name of Firm: Supreme Turf Products, Inc
Signature of Bidder: 