Res: #20744
Request for Legislative Action Sponsor: Theresa Cass Galvin
Date: August 30, 2021

Completed by County Counselor’s Office

Action Requested: | Resolution Res.Ord No.: 20744
Sponsor(s): Theresa Galvin Legislature Meeting Date: 8/30/2021
Introduction

Action Items: ['Award']

Project/Title:

Awarding a Twleve Month Term and Supply Contract, with One Twelve Month Option to Extend, for the
furnishing of Heavy Equipment Maintenance for the Road & Bridge Division of Public Works Department
to the following companies: Amercian Equipment,Kansas City, Kansas, Romaine Electric, Kansas City,
Missouri.,KC Wholesale,0Oak Grove, Missouri.,Viking-Cives, Grain Valley, Missouri. and Summit Truck,
Kansas City , Missouri under the terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 13-21.

Request Summary

The Road & Bridge Division of the Public Works Department requires a Term and Supply Contract for
Heavy Equipment Maintenance for their fleet of Heavy Equipment. The Purchasing Department issued
Invitation to Bid No. 13-21 to meet those requirements.

Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, The Public Works Department the Purchasing
Department recommend a Spilt Award of Heavy Equipment Maintenance to the following companies:
American Equipment,Kansas City, Kansas, Romaine Electric, Kansas City, Missouri, KC Wholesale, Oak
Grove, Missouri, Viking-Cives, Grain Valley, Missouri, Summit Truck, Kansas City, Missouri. The split
award will assure that the Public

Works Department fleet of Heavy Equipment will be maintained and repaired as needed.

This award is made on an "as needed" basis and does not obligate Jackson County, Missouri to pay any
specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual appropriations.
The Public Works Department will spend approximately $180,000.00.

Contact Information

Department: Public Works Submitted Date: | 5/20/2021

Name: Matt Willier Email: MWillier@jacksongov.org

Title: Assistant Road & Bridge Phone: 816-847-7083
Administrator

Budget Information

Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year: SO0
Amount previously authorized this fiscal year: lUnexpected End of

Formula
Total amount authorized after this legislative action: S
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Request for Legislative Action

Is it transferring fund? No
Single Source Funding:
Fund: Department: Line Item Account: Amount:
lUnexpected End of
Formula
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Request for Legislative Action

Prior Legislation

Prior Ordinances

Ordinance:

Ordinance date:

Prior Resolution

Resolution: Resolution date:
R 20135 April 8, 2019
Purchasing

Does this RLA include the purchase or lease of Yes

supplies, materials, equipment or services?

Chapter 10 Justification: Formal Bid

Core 4 Tax Clearance Completed:

Not Applicable

Certificate of Foreign Corporation Received:

Yes

Have all required attachments been included in
this RLA?

Yes

Compliance

Certificate of Compliance

In Compliance

Minority, Women and Veteran Owned Business Program

Goals are waived - insufficient MBE or WBE firms available

MBE: | .00%
WBE: | .00%
VBE: | .00%

Prevailing Wage

Not Applicable

Fiscal Information

e This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific
amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as each

using agency places its order.
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Request for Legislative Action

History

Matt Willier at 5/20/2021 10:00:01 AM - [Submitted | ]

Department Director: Brian Gaddie at 7/14/2021 3:49:20 PM - [ Approved | ]

Finance (Purchasing): Barbara J. Casamento at 7/15/2021 8:51:30 AM - [ Returned for more information
| Please make the following changes:(1) The term of the contract is 12 Months with 1/12 Month Option
to Extend(2) In the Request Summary, 2nd paragraph remove "The Director of Finance and Purchasing"
and replace with "The Public Works Department and the Purchasing Department recommend the split
award"(3) Add the estimated annual amount your department will spend in this section(4) Attachments:
you must attached the Bid Abstract for this bid ]

Submitter: Caroline Deihl at 7/15/2021 10:50:21 AM - [ Submitted | ]

Department Director: Brian Gaddie at 7/15/2021 12:08:04 PM - [ Returned for more information |
Revisions 1 and 2 not complete. ]

Submitter: Caroline Deihl at 7/15/2021 2:19:38 PM - [ Submitted | ]

Department Director: Brian Gaddie at 7/15/2021 2:56:54 PM - [ Returned for more information |
Revision required. ]

Submitter: Matt E. Willier at 7/19/2021 7:09:10 AM - [ Submitted | ]

Department Director: Brian Gaddie at 7/19/2021 9:30:14 AM - [ Approved | ]

Finance (Purchasing): Barbara J. Casamento at 7/21/2021 9:44:11 AM - [ Approved | ]

Compliance: Katie M. Bartle at 7/21/2021 10:54:51 AM - [ Approved | eRLA 98 ]

Finance (Budget): Mark Lang at 7/21/2021 11:32:19 AM - [ Returned for more information | Since this is
for a Term & Supply, please remove the dollar amounts on the "Budget Info" tab, under the "Budget
Information" sections. ]

Submitter: Matt E. Willier at 7/26/2021 10:46:44 AM - [ Submitted | ]

Department Director: Brian Gaddie at 7/26/2021 11:09:52 AM - [ Approved | ]

Finance (Purchasing): Barbara J. Casamento at 7/26/2021 11:59:03 AM - [ Approved | ]

Compliance: Katie M. Bartle at 7/27/2021 3:24:10 PM - [ Approved | ]

Finance (Budget): Mary Rasmussen at 7/30/2021 7:51:16 AM - [ Approved | Term & Supply; no fiscal
note is required. ]

Executive: Sylvya Stevenson at 7/30/2021 9:46:08 AM - [ Approved | ]

Legal: Elizabeth Freeland at 8/9/2021 8:59:45 AM - [ Returned for more information | Please list
previous legislation. Thx! ]

Submitter: Matt E. Willier at 8/9/2021 9:27:02 AM - [ Submitted | ]

Department Director: Brian Gaddie at 8/9/2021 3:14:25 PM - [ Approved | ]

Finance (Purchasing): Barbara J. Casamento at 8/9/2021 3:24:54 PM - [ Approved | ]

Compliance: Katie M. Bartle at 8/9/2021 3:33:24 PM - [ Approved | ]

Finance (Budget): Mark Lang at 8/10/2021 8:56:24 AM - [ Approved | ]

Executive: Sylvya Stevenson at 8/10/2021 1:10:28 PM - [ Approved | ]

Legal: Elizabeth Freeland at 8/18/2021 12:23:43 PM - [ Returned for more information | check date for
previous legislation. Thanks! ]

Submitter: Matt E. Willier at 8/19/2021 9:29:40 AM - [ Submitted | ]

Department Director: Brian Gaddie at 8/19/2021 11:35:58 AM - [ Approved | ]

Finance (Purchasing): Barbara J. Casamento at 8/19/2021 12:28:35 PM - [ Approved | ]

Compliance: Katie M. Bartle at 8/19/2021 12:44:53 PM - [ Approved | ]

Finance (Budget): Mark Lang at 8/19/2021 3:55:51 PM - [ Approved | ]

Executive: Troy Schulte at 8/19/2021 4:40:42 PM - [ Approved | ]

Legal: Elizabeth Freeland at 8/26/2021 9:53:32 AM - [ Approved | ]
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Jackson County
Public Works Department

Q/ * ROAD MAINTENANCE 34900 E. Old US 40 Hwy, P.O. Box 160
Grain Valley, Missouri 64029

* w7 (816) 847-7050 phone
(816) 847-7051 fax
MEMORANDUM
TO: Keith Allen, Finance and Purchasing Department
FROM: Matt Willier, Assistant Road and Bridge Administrator, Public Works Department
DATE: May 18, 2021

SUBJECT: Recommendation for Vendors: American Equipment, Romaine Electric, KC
Wholesale, Viking-Cives, and Summit Truck

Please consider bid No. 13-21 Heavy Equipment Maintenance be split and awarded to American
Equipment, Romaine Electric, KC Wholesale, Viking-Cives, and Summit Truck.

One single vendor does not accommodate every equipment manufacturer needed for repair of
County equipment. Also, one vendor may have a cheaper price than the other for certain parts.
In addition, these vendors have extensive previous experience working on County Equipment

and are located within close proximity here in the KC Metro area as well.

It is estimated that Road & Bridge Public Works could spend approximately $180,000.00
annually between these 5 vendors.

For the reasons above, it has been requested that bid No. 13-21 Heavy Equipment Maintenance
be split and awarded to American Equipment, Romaine Electric, KC Wholesale, Viking-Cives,

and Summit Truck.

Thank you for your consideration,

Thank you,

Matt Willier, Assistant Road & Bridge Administrator



ABSTRACT OF BIDS

ITB: 13-21
|Date: April 20, 2021 American Equipment Romaine Electric KC Wholesale Viking-Cives Midwest | Summit Truck Group
COMMODITY: Heavy Equipment Maintenance Kansas City, KS Kent, WA Oak Grove, MO Grain Valley, MO Kansas City, MO
NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTyY ANMOUNT _ AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT
1 |Section 1 - Maintenance & Repair Service Hour Seeo BMOP K B\ See &mon See Al a Mn , &MOP
Section 2 - Equipment Manufacturer's i .
2 |Maintenance & Repair Services Offered See Bid See Bidk See Qid See Bid Seo Aid
3 |Section 3 - New Parts (% Discount Offered) No @B\ Seeo F.o» St Bid fmwn.n\hbpo‘ﬁ See ARid
Sectlon 4 - Parts (Remanufactured, Rebuilt or -
4 After-Market (% Discount Offered) ZG m»mf KWPD\EOP QD mmoﬁ- \KC mxop 20 wm.n Of.
5 |Section 5 - Pick Up Service No [/ Ne pia No m\nhﬁ\ Jeo Aol No Rid.
CERTIFICATION OF BID OPENING
BIDS WERE PUBLICLY
OPENED AND RECORDED
CLERK TH GISLATURE
"PURCHASING
APR 20 PM2:00
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Bid No: 13-21

Commodity: Heavy Equipment Maintenance

Vendor: American Equipment

Bid Recap Quote

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS Yes/No | Item # Item Name Amount
Contract Signed Y 1.0 |Section 1 See Bid
Affidavit Y 2.0 |Section2 See Bid
Compliance Review Y 3.0 |Section 3 No Bid
Certificate of Compliance Y 4.0 |Section 4 No Bid
Statement of Contractor's Qualification Y 5.0 |Section 5 No Bid
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda N/A

Bidder's Quote Y

Bidder's Exceptions N

Contractor's Utilization Plan N/A

Contracts: See attached

References: See attached.

Comments: See quote for additional details.




Jackson County Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 13-21
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ATTACHMENT 1
BIDDER’S QUOTATION
For
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 13-21

Jackson County, Missouri would like to have quotes and information the following Maintenance & Repair Service Labor
Rates, Maintenance & Repair Services Offered, New Parts, Remanufactured, Rebuilt or After Market Parts and Pick-Up

Service. If you provide additional services not listed below, please submit on your company’s letterhead and indicate the
additional services you have available and pricing for the additional services.

Section 1 — MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICE
‘Quote pricing on hourly rate for labor during regular work hours and overtime work hours. Include days of operation and travel time,
if applicable. Quote pricing for work to be completed in the Successful Contractor’s Shop and/or at Jackson County Locations for
‘those times when heavy construction equipment requires field service.

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT COSTS

Labor rate (shop), Regular work hours

o
Shop Days of Operation, regular work hours: /ymg_:g v/ ZM-g;g Fgmny Hourly $ ’ oo
1 Shop Hours of Operation, regular work hours: 3 O Am 7o S.coPm

Labor rate (shop), Overtime work hours
Shop Days of Operation, regular work hours: /f//ﬁ'
Hourly /V /?

o9

Shop Days of Operation, overtime work hours: /{/ /ﬂ Hourly

2 Shop Hours of Operation, overtime work hours: 4/ _/”

Labor rate (County Location), Regular work hours

5

¥
Shop Hours of Operation, regular work hours:. 'A_/IA!?

3 Response time to County’s request for service at a County Location: hrs

Labor rate (County Location), Overtime work hours

Shop Days of Operation, overtime work hours: /f/ / ﬁ’ p /”

Hourly

&

[
Shop Hours of Operation, overtime work hours: A / ﬂ

4 Response time to County’s request for service at a County Location: hrs

Travel Charge (if applicable) for service call to a County Location for field 1 mile

service, Regular work hours /V //r,

Travel Charge (if applicable) for service call to a County Location for field 1 mile
service, Overtime work hours A / ﬂ-

=]

-]

n/a $

7 Estimate Fee for Repair (if applicable)

A.) List all Shop locations including Point of Contact, complete address, phone number, and cell phone number (if applicable)
for each location (add additional sheets on your company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete):

. MEAT 4 &

isins Voevrss &7~ 32-2455

0{77 So %mr':?z-f éﬁo

Laysos ﬁz’g/. b s




Jackson County Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 13-21
Page 20 of 29

Section 2 — EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER’S & MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICE OFFERED

A.) List All equipment manufacturers you offer parts, maintenance, and repair services on (add additional sheets on your
company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete): :

Please see attached list on letterhead

B.) List additional services and/or items (menu of additional services and/or items) and pricing for any additional services and/or
items you offer the County (add additional sheets on your company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete):

N/A

C.) List number of qualified technicians available for work to be performed in the Successful Contractor’s Shop: / /

D.) List number of qualified technicians available for work to be performed at a Jackson County Location: /!/, / #




Jackson County Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 13-21
Page 21 of 29

Section 3 — PARTS, NEW

List manufacturer and percentage discount off manufacturers suggested list price you offer the County. If you need additional space,
on your company’s letterhead submit any additional manufacturers and discounts you are offering the County for New parts. NOTE:
If offering no discount, enter a zero or N/A. Leaving a blank indicates a “no bid”.

Pat:ts ord;rs must include freight/shipping on estimate and invoice as separate line item, if any, and may be grouped into one fee for
entire grder.

NO MANUFACTURER | DISCOUNT OFFERED
8 0o %
9 0o "%
10 0 %
11 7
12 o %
13 g 7
14 g »
15 g %
16 0o %
17 0o %
18 0~
19 0 %
20 0 "
DESCRIPTION QUOTE
21 | Delivery of Parts Available (circle one) YES gr
22 | Delivery charge, if applicable $ A/ Ag
93 | Minimum Order for delivery of parts, if applicable ), /ﬂ
24 | Delivery time after receipt of request from the County for parts delivery A // hours

Section 4 — PARTS, REMANUFACTURED, REBUILT, OR AFTER-MARKET

List manufacturer and percentage discount off manufacturer’s suggested list price you offer the County for remanufactured, rebuilt or
after-market parts. Prior approval by the County is REQURED for the use of Remanufactured, Rebuilt or After-Market Parts. If you
need additional space, on your company’s letterhead submit any additional manufacturers and discounts you are offering the County
for remanufactured, rebuilt or after-market parts. NOTE: If offering no discount, enter a zero or N/A. Leaving a blank indicates a

“no bid”.

NO MANUFACTURER DISCOUNT OFFERED
8 N/A %
9 %

%
10

%

1




Jackson County Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 13-21
Page 22 of 29

12

%

13 .

%

14

%

15

%

16

%

17

%

18

%

19

%

20

%

Section S — PICK UP SERVICE

The Successful Contractor may be required to pick up different styles and types of equipment for repair. Indicate what type of Pick
Up Services you can offer the County and include pricing for those pick up services (If you need additional space, on your company’s

letterhead submit with your bid response any additional information to make your bid complete):

N/A

|
SIGNATURE: Q\/ (‘U’M\

DATE: I‘fl//A\‘/a l

PHONE: /4 3¢47- )2/S

I
NAME: D\?Jy\_ XLQ M _y (Print or Type)

TITLE: U \k(_.ua \?‘?‘Q S |g€)r\, \' (Print or Type)

CELL:

FAX: P53 54t-A377

COMPANY NAME: ,%@éid/ 4.-;_;_3059 PAAI T /g (Print or Type)

EMAIL ADDRESS: Sa L@S £ American e?y/nmmf.gs(lﬁrint or Type)

' 7/
| WEB ADDRESS: ML) - AmMe ng@n@éﬂ{pﬁmfus (Print or Type)




3250 Harvester Road
Kansas City, KS 66115
Phone 913-342-1450
800-487-1450

Fax 913-342-1377
www.americanequipment.us

EQUIPMENT CO.
SPECIALIZING IN CUSTOM TRUCK EQUIPMENT FOR THE

CONTRACTING » MUNICIPAL « REFUSE INDUSTRIES

Jackson County Missouri Invitation to Bid No., 13-21
Section 2 — EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER’S & MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICE OFFERED

A.) List all equipment manufacturers you offer parts, maintenance, and repair services on.

Aero Industries, Inc.

BOSS Snowplow

Buyers Products, Inc.

Cadet Manufacturing, Inc.
Certified Power, Inc.
Chandler Equipment

CM Truck Beds

Crysteel Manufacturing, Inc
CW Mill Equipment

Dakota Bodies LLC
Deerskin MFG.

Apex Tool Group, LLC
Dimensions / Magnum Inverters
Diversified Products Mfg.
DuraTech Industries

EZ Stack LLC

Economy Manufacturing
Fleet Engineers

Flink Snow Plows & Spreaders
Force America Distributing LLC
Galfab, LLC

H.D. Industries, inc.
Hannay Reels

Henke Manufacturing
Corporation

Highway Products Inc.
Hillsboro Industries, Inc.
HOL-MAC Corporation
Holtz Industries, Inc.
Kalmar USA Inc.

Kaye Corporation
Kennametal Inc.

Kinedyne LLC

Lemco Hydraulics Inc

LIFT-A-LOT CORPORATION
Liftmoore, Inc.

Luverne Truck Equipment
Marathon Equipment Co.
Mason Dynamics, Inc.
Masterack, LLC

Maxon Lift Corp

Metal Pless

Meyer Distributing

Miller Electric

Minimizer LLC

Monroe Truck Equipment, Inc.

Muncie Power Products, Inc.
North American Signal Co.
O'Brian Manufacturing
Omaha Standard, LLC
OneSource Parts

Onspot of North America, Inc.
Otto Environmental Systems
Palfinger Liftgates, LLC
Perkins Manufacturing Co.
Pioneer / Mountain Tarp
Premier Manufacturing Co.
Pro-Vision, Inc.

Pulltarps Manufacturing

RC industries, Inc.

Reading Truck Body, LLC
Reelcraft Industries, Inc.
Ridewell Corporation

Rigid Hitch Inc.

RKI, Inc.

Roll Rite, LLC

Rosco, Inc.

Rugby Manufacturing Co.
Shur-Co, LLC

Southco Industries, Inc.
Stellar Industries, Inc.

Stepp Manufacturing Co., Inc.
Superior Signals, Inc.
Swaploader U.S.A,, Ltd.

Tafco Equipment Co

Tarping Systems, Inc.
Thieman Tailgates, Inc.
Timbren Industries Inc.
Toter, LLC c¢/o Wastequip, LLC
UsS Tarp

VanAir Manufacturing Inc
VariTech Industries Inc

Vibco Products

Warren, Inc.

Whelen Engineering Co, Inc.
Zip's Truck Equipment, inc.



Bid No: 13-21

Commodity: Heavy Equipment Maintenance

Vendor: Romaine Electric

Bid Recap Quote

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS Yes/No | Item # Item Name Amount
Contract Signed Y 1.0 |Section 1 See Bid
Affidavit Y 2.0 |Section2 See Bid
Compliance Review Y 3.0 |Section 3 See Bid
Certificate of Compliance N 4.0 |[Section 4 See Bid
Statement of Contractor's Qualification Y 5.0 |Section 5 No Bid
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda N/A

Bidder's Quote Y

Bidder's Exceptions N

Contractor's Utilization Plan N/A

Contracts: See attached

References: See attached.

Comments: See quote for additional details.
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ATTACHMENT 1

BIDDER’S QUOTATION

For

JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 13-21

Jackson County, Missouri would like to have quotes and information the following Maintenance & Repair Service Labor
Rates, Maintenance & Repair Services Offered, New Parts, Remanufactured, Rebuilt or After Market Parts and Pick-Up

Service. If you provide additional services not listed below, please submit on your company’s letterhead and indicate the
additional services you have available and pricing for the additional services.

Section 1 — MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICE

Quote pricing on hourly rate for labor during regular work hours and overtime work hours. Include days of operation and travel time,
if applicable. Quote pricing for work to be completed in the Successful Contractor’s Shop and/or at Jackson County Locations for
those times when heavy construction equipment requires field service.

NO

DESCRIPTION

UNIT

COSTS

Labor rate (shop), Regular work hours

Shop Days of Operation, regular work hours: M_'li

Shop Hours of Operation, regular work hours: 8-5

Hourly

$ 100.00

Labor rate (shop), Overtime work hours

Shop Days of Operation, overtime work hours: N/A

N/A

Shop Hours of Operation, overtime work hours:

Hourly

Labor rate (County Location), Regular work hours

Shop Days of Operation, regular work hours: SEE#1

SEE#1

Shop Hours of Operation, regular work hours:

Response time to County’s request for service at a County Location:

hrs

Hourly

Labor rate (County Location), Overtime work hours

SEE #2

Shop Days of Operation, overtime work hours:

SEE #2

Shop Hours of Operation, overtime work hours:

Response time to County’s request for service at a County Location:

hrs

Hourly

Travel Charge (if applicable) for service call to a County Location for field

service, Regular work hours

1 mile

Travel Charge (if applicable) for service call to a County Location for field

service, Overtime work hours

1 mile

Estimate Fee for Repair (if applicable)

n/a

A.) List all Shop locations including Point of Contact, complete address, phone number, and cell phone number (if applicable)
for each location (add additional sheets on your company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete):

Will add as an attachment.
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Section 2 ~ EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER’S & MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICE OFFERED

A.) List All equipment manufacturers you offer parts, maintenance, and repair services on (add additional sheets on your
company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete): :

Will add as an attachment.

B.) List additional services and/or items (menu of additional services and/or items) and pricing for any additional services and/or
items you offer the County (add additional sheets on your company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete):

N/A

C.) List number of qualified technicians available for work to be performed in the Successful Contractor’s Shop: 1

D.) List number of qualified technicians available for work to be performed at a Jackson County Location: 1




Jackson County Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 13-21
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Section 3 — PARTS, NEW
List manufacturer and percentage discount off manufacturers suggested list price you offer the County. If you need additional space,
on your company’s letterhead submit any additional manufacturers and discounts you are offering the County for New parts. NOTE:
If offering no discount, enter a zero or N/A. Leaving a blank indicates a “no bid”.

Parts orders must include freight/shipping on estimate and invoice as separate line item, if any, and may be grouped into one fee for
entire order.

NO = MANUFACTURER DISCOUNT OFFERED
8 Will add as an attachment. %
9 %
10 %
11 %
12 %
13 %
14 %
15 %
16 4]
17 %
8 %
19 *
20 %
DESCRIPTION QUOTE
21 | Delivery of Parts Available (circle one) YESYES or NO
27 | Delivery charge, if applicable $ 0
23 | Minimum Order for delivery of parts, if applicable $ 25.00
24 | Delivery time after receipt of request from the County for parts delivery 2-4 hours

Section 4 — PARTS, REMANUFACTURED, REBUILT, OR AFTER-MARKET

List manufacturer and percentage discount off manufacturer’s suggested list price you offer the County for remanufactured, rebuilt or
after-market parts. Prior approval by the County is REQURED for the use of Remanufactured, Rebuilt or After-Market Parts. If you
need additional space, on your company’s letterhead submit any additional manufacturers and discounts you are offering the County
for remanufactured, rebuilt or after-market parts. NOTE: If offering no discount, enter a zero or N/A. Leaving a blank indicates a
“no bid”.

NO MANUFACTURER DISCOUNT OFFERED
g Will add as an attachment. %
9 %
o,
10 2
0,
11 - %
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%
12

%
13

14 %

5 %

16 %

17 %

18 %

19 %

20 %

Section 5 — PICK UP SERVICE

The Successful Contractor may be required to pick up different styles and types of equipment for repair. Indicate what type of Pick
Up Services you can offer the County and include pricing for those pick up services (If you need additional space, on your company’s
letterhead submit with your bid response any additional information to make your bid complete):

N/A

SIGNATURE: CM%M DATE: 4/16/2021

NAME: Casey Haskin (Print or Type) | PHONE: 800-426-5005
TITLE: Transit, Bids & Contracts Manager (Print or Type) | CELL:

COMPANY NAME: Romaine Electric Corporation (Print or Type) | FAX:  206-374-2114
EMAIL ADDRESS: rexcobid@romaineelectric.com (Print or Type)

WEB ADDRESS: www.romaineelectric.com (Print or Type)




. Romaine Headguarters Kent; Store 1

8811 S. 208" st., P.O. Box 5069

Kent WA. 98031-1203 (98064-5069) (King County)

PH. 800-426-5005, 425-264-1700

Fax 425-264-0488

Nick Staub, President 877-295-2712 nickstaub@romaineelectric.com
Shawn Bray, Director of Operations 800-529-3955
shawnbray@romaineelectric.com

Casey Haskin, Transit & Bid Manager 800-426-5005 x 0135
caseyvhaskin@romaineelectric.com

rexcobid@romaineelectric.com (Rexcobid email goes to Shawn & Casey)

Shelly Cash, Accounts Receivable/Credit Dept. 800-529-2118 x 0126

Romaine Electric Salt Lake City: Rexco SLC Store 4

3696 W. 2100 S.

Salt Lake City UT. 84120

PH. 800-294-3664, 801-819-7566
Fax 801-819-7572

David Johnson
davejohnson@romaineelectric.com

Romaine Electric Kansas City; Store 11

1451 N. Topping

KKansas City MO. 64120

PH. 866-770-8688, 816-241-8688
Fax 816-241-8699

Kevin Stone Manger
kevinstone@romaineelectric.com
Kevin Stone Sr. Sales Manager
kstone@romaineelectric.com




— .___ —— _f_{”

Rorrmainmne Ellecttrice
¥ =4 = =, il = b Ly g ' (14 = e 23 = T =

Line Name % Off List | | Reman Units [ New Parts

Almott ' | 20% X
Ametek _ | 56% X
Bosch 56% X
Borg Warner/Delco Remy Units 62% X 68% 56%
C.E. Niehoff Units : 71% W& 5X 56% 68%
Cole Hersee/LittleFuse =~ | 56% | X
Denso 56% [ X
Ecco _ 56% X
EMP . 20% | X
Kussmaul | 56% X
Mahle _ : 56% X
Mitsubishi | 56% X
PennTex - 40% X
Prestolite/Leece Neville . 62% X
Romaine Electric . 62% X
Vanner - 27% X
4/7/2021|

Online Account @ http://www.romaineelectric.com/



Romaine Electric

PRECIS I ON P RO DUCTS

Romaine Transit Customer References

Los Angeles Metropolitan Transit Authority
One Gateway Plaza, Los Angeles CA. 90012
Richard Bonino Sr. Buyer, PH: 213-922-1026
honinor@metro.net

Tri Met

4400 S. E. 17" Ave. Portland OR. 97202
Mike Rushfeldt Sr. Buyer, PH: 503-962-4869
rushfelm@trimet.org

Sun Tran

3920 N. Sun Tran Bv. Tucson AZ.85705

Rene Guillen Sr. Buyer, PH: 520-206-8833
Rene.guillen@tucsonaz.gov

OmniTrans

1700 West 5% St. San Bernardino CA. 92411
Rick Barone Buyer, PH: 909-379-7204
Rick.barone@omnitrans.org

Community Transit

7100 Hardeson Road Everett WA. 98203
Bob Hintz Buyer, PH: 425-348-7180
bob.hintz@comtrans.org

Pierce County Transit

3701 96 St. S.W. Lakewood WA. 98499
Cary Huber Buyer, PH: 253-593-4529
c.hubbard@piercetransit.org

King County (Metro)

401 5™ Av. Seattle WA. 98104

Tom Mulvihill Buyer, PH: 206-684-2203
TOM.MULVIHILL@KINGCOUNTY.GOV




1. Current Contracts;

e King County WA., Furnish Niehoff Replacement Alternators and Repair Parts (As
Requested By King County Personnel, During the Period July 11, 2016, Through July
10, 2021, in Accordance with King County ITB 1189-16-JAS and the Responding Bid
#1 From Romaine Electric Corporation, Both Incorporated By Reference. Estimated
Annual Contract Value: $100,000.00)

e Los Angeles Metropolitan Transit Authority; SODN New Alternators, 11/7/2015-
11/6/2016, IFE 14-0028 in the amount of $1,060,160.00.

e OmniTrans California, Contract MINT17-01 from 11/10/2016-11/30/2019 in the
amount of $235,000.00 for supply and rebuilding of Alternators and Starters.

e Sun Tran Tucson AZ., Rebuild New Bus Alternators & Starters #16-17-01 from -
08/10/2016-08/31/2017, in the amount of $37,380.24,

e Tri Met Supply Electric Starters & Repair Lots 1-2, BI170291LC, from 6/9/2017-
6/8/2022 $163,709.75.

2. Romaine Electric Corporation is a 96+ year old family owned, multi-level
Manufacturer/Distributor Company of Rotating Electrical products for the
Automotive, Marine, Transits, Emergency Services, and Agricultural industries.
Romaine HQ and Distribution center is located in Kent Washington. Romaine Electric
has 7 locations in Washington, along with locations in California, Oregon, Utah and
Kansas City MO.

3. Key Contacts;

e Nick Staub, President nickstaub@romaineelectric.com PH. 877-295-2712

e Shawn Bray, Director of Operations, shawnbray@romaineelectric.com PH. 800-
529-3955

e Casey Haskin, Manager of Bids, Transits, caseyhaskin@romaineelectric.com PH.
800-426-5005

@ Cxé?j\ﬂbl—cm%v;\




Romaine Electric

PRECISION FRODUCTS

. Current Contracts;

King County WA; ITB 1189-16-JAS, Furnish Niehoff Replacement Alternators and

Repair Parts, from 7/11/2016-7/10/2021, $100,000.00.

Los Angeles Metropolitan Transit Authority; IFB 14-0028, 50DN New Alternators,
11/7/2015-11/6/2016, $1,060,160.00. Over.

Los Angeles Metropolitan Transit Authority; IFB MA48271000, Supply New Spark

Plug Kits, 4/27/2018-4/26/2020, $1,402,317.36. Over.

Los Angeles Metropolitan Transit Authority; MA55513, Supply New Niehoff
Regulators, 10/1/2018-10/1/2019, $306,901.13. Over.

Los Angeles Metropolitan Transit Authority; MM59694000, Supply Starters, from
12/26/2018-12/25/2019, $34,624.80. Over.

Los Angeles Metropolitan Transit Authority; MA38857000, Supply EMP
Alternators, from 5/30/2017-5/30/2019, $61,309.00. Over.

Los Angeles Metropolitan Transit Authority; MA70604000, Supply EMP Fans, from
6/29/2020-6/28/2021, $61,320.00

Los Angeles Metropolitan Transit Authority; MM71483000, Supply 8200435
Starters from 8/11/2020-8/10-2021, $26,910.00

OmniTrans California; Contract MNT17-01C, for supply and rebuilding of
Alternators and Starters, from 11/10/2016-11/30/2019, 2020, 2021,
$235,000.00.

OmniTrans California; MNT18-15-|, for supply of Turbo Chargers, from 3/1/2018-
2/2/2021, in the amount of $57,731.28.

Sun Tran Tucson AZ. 16-17-01, Rebuild New Bus Alternators & Starters, from
08/10/2016-08/31/2020, 2021, in the amount of $37,380.24.

Tri Met; Supply Electric Starters & Repair Lots 1-2, BI170291LC, from 6/9/2017-
6/8/2022 $163,709.75.

Tri Met; Supply Niehoff Alternators & Parts, BI180133LC, from 1/17/2018-
1/16/2023, $1,221,551.95.

Tri Met; Supply Niehoff RPM Units, BI200117SJ, From 1/22/2020-1/21/2025,

$573,525.00

COTA, Central Ohio Transit; RFB#2017-19 & RFB#2018-10, for supply of 50DN
Alternators, from 8/1/2017- 7/31/2019, $64,078.70. Over.




COTA, Central Ohio Transit; RFB#2017-30, for supply of SODN Alternators, from
1/1/2018-12/31/2018, $32, 171.40. Over.

COTA, Central Ohio Transit; RFB#2018-05, for supply of Starters, Regulators, from
6/1/2018-5/31/2019, $9,776.24. Over.

COTA, Central Ohio Transit; RFB#2018-18 for supply of S0DN Alternators, from
1/1/2019-12/31/2019 $26,634.32. Over.

COTA, Central Ohio Transit; RFB#2019-32 for supply of Bus Parts from 1/1/2020-
12/31/2020 $17,250.28. Over.

COTA, Central Ohio Transit; RFB#2020-10 for supply of Bus Parts from 7/1/2020-
6/30/2021 $22,689.12

Houston Metro; 7018000094, for Supply of Niehoff Alternators & Regulators, From
4/16/2018-4/15/2020, $100,681.60. Over.

Houston Metro 7018000283; for Supply of Delco Regulators, from 12/1/2018-
11/30/2020, $7973.28

Chapel Hill N. C.; P18-104, for Supply of Alternators, from 9/11/2017-10/31/2018,
$34,061.00. Over.

11/2/2017-10/31/2018, $13,386.65. Over.

Pace Suburban Bus; 226463, for Supply of Alternators, from 11/9/2017-11/8/2019,
$5,651.40. Over.

Pace Suburban Bus; 227653 B, for Supply of Alternators, from 8/1/2018-
7/31/2020, $55,608.29. Over.

Santa Monica Big Blue Bus; 11901613, for Supply of Alternators & Starters, from

6/4/2018-6/30/2020, 2021, $52,010.00.

Santa Monica Big Blue Bus; 12001123, for Supply of Alternators & Starters, from
6/4/2018-6/30/2020, 2021, $353,985.00.

Riverside Transit; RFQ 18-010, for Supply of Niehoff Regulators, from 4/1/2018-
3/30/2019, $10,050.59. Over.

Riverside Transit; RFQ 19-038, for Supply of Niehoff Regulators, from 4/1/2019-
3/30/2020, $10,050.59. Over.

VIA Transit; 17-210, for supply of regulators & Bearings, from 8/1/2017-
9/30/2018, $11,259.50. Over.

City of El Paso: 2018-1088, for Supply of Alternators, Starters, & Related Parts,
from 11/8/2018-11/7/2021, $134,599.00.

City of El Paso: 2016-411, For Supply of New Alternators, from 8/4/2020-2/8/2021,
$49,260.00

COPTA —City of Oklahoma-Embark Transit; 2018008, for Supply of Parts For Buses,
from 7/1/2017-6/30/2021, @50% off List.

Utah State DOT; 30539, DOT18-717PT, for Aftermarket Heavy Truck/Equipment
Replacement Parts, from 8/29/2018-8/2018-2023, @ 57% off List.

City of San Jose; OP56615, Automotive Equipment & Parts, From 11/10/2018-
11/9/2019, 2020, 2021, @ $40,000.00.




Capitol DISTrict 1.A..

Suburban Mobility SMART: 20-3109 Rebuild of Starters & Alternators, From -
6/1/2020-5/31/2023, $180,000.00

Romaine Electric Corporation is a 96+ year old family owned, multi-level
Manufacturer/Distributor Company of Rotating Electrical products for the
Automotive, Marine, Transits, Emergency Services, and Agricultural industries.
Romaine HQ and Distribution center is located in Kent Washington. Romaine Electric
has 7 locations in Washington, along with locations in California, Oregon, Utah and
Kansas City MO., Texas & Virginia.

Key Contacts;

Nick Staub, President nickstaub@romaineelectric.com PH. 877-295-2712
Shawn Bray, Director of Operations, shawnbray@romaineelectric.com PH. 800-
529-3955

Casey Haskin, Manager of Bids, Transits, caseyhaskin@romaineelectric.com PH.
800-426-5005

2018 Total Contracts as of 10/16/2018, $3,286,180.08. Average Contract size is
$298,743.64.

12/26/2018: $4,220,170.59

12/17/2019:
7/2/2020:



Bid No: 13-21

Commodity: Heavy Equipment Maintenance

Vendor: KC Wholesale

Bid Recap Quote

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS Yes/No | ltem # Item Name Amount
Contract Signed Y 1.0 |Section I See Bid
Affidavit Y 2.0 |Section2 See Bid
Compliance Review Y 3.0 |Section3 See Bid
Certificate of Compliance Y 4.0 |Section 4 See Bid
Statement of Contractor's Qualification Y 5.0 |Section5 No Bid
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda N/A

Bidder's Quote Y

Bidder's Exceptions N

Contractor’s Utilization Plan N/A

Contracts: See attached

References: See attached.

Comments: See quote for additional details.
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ATTACHMENT 1
BIDDER’S QUOTATION
For

JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 13-21

Jackson County, Missouri would like to have quotes and information the following Maintenance & Repair Service Labor
Rates, Maintenance & Repair Services Offered, New Parts, Remanufactured, Rebuilt or After Market Parts and Pick-Up

Service. If you provide additional services not listed below, please submit on your company’s letterhead and indicate the
additional services you have available and pricing for the additional services.

Section 1 — MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICE

Quote pricing on hourly rate for labor during regular work hours and overtime work hours. Include days of operation and travel time,
if applicable. Quote pricing for work to be completed in the Successful Contractor’s Shop and/or at Jackson County Locations for
those times when heavy construction equipment requires field service.

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT COSTS
Labor rate (shop), Regular work hours
- D
Shop Days of Operation, regular work hours: MD n— ? ¢ Hourly |§ g 5 M
’ 20
1 | Shop Hours of Operation, regular work hours: BAm - I7L J)WL_
Labor rate (shop), Overtime work hours
Shop Days of Operation, overtime work hours: I\/ / .A Hourly $ A / !;'_/]‘
2 Shop Hours of Operation, overtime work hours:
Labor rate (County Location), Regular work hours
Shop Days of Operation, regular work hours: ﬂ/ 1 o - 'F’;\( g 5’ &
. o/ Hourly $ - J i
Shop Hours of Operation, regular work hours: <) r'\ W - L‘/ 3¢ L\ [ L‘p
I
3 Response time to County’s request for service at a County Location:  /  hrs
Labor rate (County Location), Overtime work hours
Shop Days of Operation, overtime work hours: ,\} / 74
Hourly g A 4
Shop Hours of Operation, overtime work hours: ’
4 Response time to County’s request for service at a County Location: hrs
Travel Charge (if applicable) for service call to a County Location for field . 2 '
4 1 mile 3
5 service, Regular work hours
Travel Charge (if applicable) for service call to a County Location for field . . y
. g 1 mile 3 /\ :
6 service, Overtime work hours 7
7 Estimate Fee for Repair (if applicable) n/a $ “asty I’l’(&dﬁz

»_._’}

A.) List all Shop locations including Point of Contact, complete address, phone number, and cell phone number (if applicable)
for each location (add additional sheets on your company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete):

KO Ihinlesale

o/ Sw /ST St

Dok Grove, IO (H6T75

Sl —lp 20~ lele OO
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]

Section 2 - EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER’S & MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICE OFFERED ;) Gj'ul -

A.) List All equipment manufacturers you offer parts, maintenance, and repair services on (add additional sheets on your
company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete): :

/// /)f//z @' )L/é’c:kl/l-/ ﬁichq T[';ZL/er

[\I')Lllf’c‘h—/ﬁ(“/ L0 L

B.) List additional services and/or items (menu of additional services and/or items) and pricing for any additional services and/or
items you offer the County (add additional sheets on your company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete):

]Mt‘(/lrké'-ﬂ{&n b,e.m. ‘*f'/ﬁf/‘ CE@-[ZESFM
rBCZi\L ?mpau/

C.) List number of qualified technicians available for work to be performed in the Successful Contractor’s Shop: / éf

D.) List number of qualifted technicians available for work to be performed at a Jackson County Location: ﬁz




Jackson County Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 13-21
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Section 3 - PARTS, NEW
List manufacturer and percentage discount off manufacturers suggested list price you offer the County. If you need additional space,

on your company’s letterhead submit any additional manufacturers and discounts you are offering the County for New parts. NOTE:
If offering no discount, enter a zero or N/A. Leaving a blank indicates a “no bid”.

Parts orders must include freight/shipping on estimate and invoice as separate line item, if any, and may be grouped into one fee for
entire order.

NO MANUFACTURER DISCOUNT OFFERED
8 U )&? are A WAs/eSale Dl Zb L %
/ &7 o
0 é@m%/c/ Morvy 07 ”
10 %
11 %
12 %
13 %
14 %
15 ”
16 %
17 %
18 %
19 .
20 %
DESCRIPTION QUOTE
21 | Delivery of Parts Available (circle one) ﬁ{ @r NO
22 | Delivery charge, if applicable $ A0
23 | Minimum Order for delivery of parts, if applicable $ /0%
24 | Delivery time after receipt of request from the County for parts delivery . 6’ /7 //’/lLf(,i hours

Scction 4 — PARTS, REMANUFACTURED, REBUILT, OR AFTER-MARKET

List manufacturer and percentage discount off manufacturer’s suggested list price you offer the County for remanufactured, rebuilt or
after-market parts. Prior approval by the County is REQURED for the use of Remanufactured, Rebuilt or After-Market Parts. If you
need additional space, on your company’s letterhead submit any additional manufacturers and discounts you are offering the County
for remanufactured, rebuilt or after-market parts. NOTE: If offering no discount, enter a zero or N/A. Leaving a blank indicates a

“no bid”.

NO MANUFACTURER DISCOUNT OFFERED

s | We ore a wholosste %Wl, %
9 (’@wufg, arbiyzr 2D T "

%

10

%

11
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%

13

%

14

%

15

%

16

%

17

%

18

%

19

%

20

%

Section 5 — PICK UP SERVICE

The Successful Contractor may be required to pick up different styles and types of equipment for repair. Indicate what type of Pick

Up Services you can offer the County and include pricing for those pick up services (If you need
letterhead submit with your bid response any additional information to make your bid complete):

additional space, on your company’s

NIk

DATE: @¢/ 0 7/=2ﬂ97/

SIGNATURE:
nave: L 3.0 Zefdﬁ e Yard (Print or Type) | PHONE: 0 | (oo o0 A pl/ 1D
TITLE: 40 Llomer (Print or Type) | CELL:

COMPANY NAME: K(’, ZOho/ £ §/’?/€ (Print or Type)

bax: S o 425/ o8

EMAIL ADDRESS: / ane &) %@ WH O/ e S 'dL/é’, NeApint or Type)

WEB ADDRESS: |V WV - KCJ,OhD/ €s &/ ¢« C DHo— (Print or Type)




Bid No: 13-21

Commodity: Heavy Equipment Maintenance

Vendor: Viking-Cives Midwest

Bid Recap Quote
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS Yes/No | Item # Item Name Amount
Contract Signed Y 1.0 |Section 1 See Bid
Affidavit Y 2.0 [Section2 See Bid
Compliance Review Y 3.0 |Section3 See Bid
Certificate of Compliance Y 4.0 |[Section4 No Bid
Statement of Contractor's Qualification Y 5.0 |Section 5 See Bid
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda N/A
Bidder's Quote Y
Bidder's Exceptions Y
Contractor's Utilization Plan N/A

Contracts: See attached

References: See attached.

Comments: See quote for additional details.
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ATTACHMENT 1
BIDDER’S QUOTATION
For
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 13-21

Jackson County, Missouri would like to have quotes and information the following Maintenance & Repair Service Labor
Rates, Maintenance & Repair Services Offered, New Parts, Remanufactured, Rebuilt or After Market Parts and Pick-Up

Service. If you provide additional services not listed below, please submit on your company’s letterhead and indicate the
additional services you have available and pricing for the additional services.

Section 1 - MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICE
Quote pricing on hourly rate for labor during regular work hours and overtime work hours. Include days of operation and travel time,
if applicable. Quote pricing for work to be completed in the Successful Contractor’s Shop and/or at Jackson County Locations for
those times when heavy construction equipment requires field service.

NO DESCRIPTION - UNIT COSTS

Labor rate (shop), Regular work hours

monday-friday Hourly s 100.00

Shop Days of Operation, regular work hours:

1 Shop Hours of Operation, regular work hours: 8am'4__30pm

Labor rate (shop), Overtime work hours

Shop Days of Operation, overtime work hours: @S needed - Hourly $ 150.00

2 Shop Hours of Operation, overtime work hours: gs_needed

Labor rate (County Location), Regular work hours

Shop Days of Operation, regular work hours: monday-friday

Hourly | $ 115.00

Shop Hours of Operation, regular work hours: 8 am to 430pm

3 Response time to County’s request for service at a County Location: 24 hrs

Labor rate (County Location), Overtime work hours

Shop Days of Operation, overtime work hours: _as needed

165.00

&2

Hourly
Shop Hours of Operation, overtime work hours; aS Needed

4 Response time to County’s request for service at a County Location: hrs

Travel Charge (if applicable) for service call to a County Location for field
service, Regular work hours

&

AV

1 mile

1.65 per milg

Travel Charge (if applicable) for service call to a County Location for field

service, Overtime work hours lmile |3 1.65 per milg

n/a $  nocharge

7 Estimate Fee for Repair (if applicable)

A.) List all Shop locations including Point of Contact, complete address, phone number, and cell phone number (if applicable)
for each location (add additional sheets on your company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete):

Viking Cives Midwest 1200 nw Pamela Blvd ,Grain Valley, Mo 64029 ph 816-625-0144

contact Dale Willis 816-556-6851

Viking Cives Midwest( corporate facility) 22956 us 61, Oran, Mo 63721 ph 573-262-3545

_c_:o_r_1tact Dan \_/_\/heeler 573-263-3545
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Section 2 —~ EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER'S & MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICE OFFERED

A.) List All equipment manufacturers you offer parts, maintenance, and repair services on (add additional sheets on your
company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete): :

see attached

B.) List additional services and/or items (menu of additional services and/or items) and pricing for any additional services and/or
items you offer the County (add additional sheets on your company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete):

see attached

C.) List number of qualified technicians available for work to be performed in the Successful Contractor’s Shop:  1-2

1-2

D.) List number of qualified technicians available for work to be performed at a Jackson County Location:



“VIKINE.CIVES
MIDWEST

Attachment-section 2;A.
Equipment Manufactures, maintenance
and repair service offered

Viking Bodies

Viking plows

Viking spreaders

Viking hitches and related components
Beau-roc Bodies

Force America hydraulics
Certified Power hydraulics
VariTech pre wet sytems
Henke equipment

Eaton hydraulic fittings and hoses
Swenson Spreaders

Flink Spreaders

Monroe Spreaders

Boss Plows

Buyers Spreaders

Warren Spreaders
Western plows

Rugby Bodies

Tbei Bodies

Dakota Bodies

Aero tarps

Mountain Tarps

Snow Wheels

Cougar vibrators

Insta chain

P.O. Box 295 ¢ 22956 Highway 61 ¢ Morley, MO 63767 ¢ Phone (573) 262-3545 ¢ Fax (573) 262-3369



Section 2, Part B.( Addition services)

Spreader repairs

Plow repairs

Dump body repair

Hydraulic repair

Hydraulic hoses

Electrical/wiring repair related to snow and ice equipment

Service and repair of most major brands of snow and ice equipment
Welding

Body replacements

Snow and ice Equipment upgrades

Labor rate for repairs is standard shop rate as previously listed. Quotes will be
provided upon request prior to any work being completed

P.O. Box 295 ¢ 22956 Highway 61 + Morley, MO 63767 ¢ Phone (573) 262-3545 ¢ Fax (573) 262-3369
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Section 3— PARTS, NEW

List manufacturer and percentage discount off manufacturers suggested list price you offer the County. 1f you need additional space,
on your company’s letterhead submit any additional manufacturers and discounts you are offering the County for New parts. NOTE:
If offering no discount, enter a zero or N/A. Leaving a blank indicates a “no bid”.

Parts orders must include freight/shipping on estimate and invoice as separate line iten1, if any, and may be grouped into one fee for
entire order.

NO MANUFACTURER DISCOUNT OFFERED

8 see attached o %

9 %

10 N - % -

11 | %

12 ‘ N %

13 %

14 %

15 ) % |

16_ - B - %

17 ) ) %

18 %

19 %

20 B ‘ %
B DESCRIPTION _ QUOTE

21 Delivery of Parts Available (circle one) - _-_ j- _ G’ES Q NO

22 | Delivery charge, if applicable $ no charge

23 | Minimum Order for delivery of parts, if applicable b none

24 | Delivery time aft-er receipt of request from the County for parts delivery 8 hours hours

Section 4 — PARTS, REMANUFACTURED, REBUILT, OR AFTER-MARKET

List manufacturer and percentage discount off manufacturer’s suggested list price you offer the County for remanufactured, rebuilt or
after-market parts. Prior approval by the County is REQURED for the use of Remanufactured, Rebuilt or After-Market Parts. If you
need additional space, on your company’s letterhead submit any additional manufacturers and discounts you are offering the County
for remanufactured, rebuilt or after-market parts. NOTE: If offering no discount, enter a zero or N/A. Leaving a blank indicates a
“no bid”.

NO ___ MANUFACTURER _ - DISCOUNT OFFERED
g N/A %
o %
%

10 . ’
%

BRI - -




Section 3, Parts, New

section 3, parts, new

manufacture discount
Viking dump bodies 25%
Viking plows, hitches and components 25%
Viking Spreaders and components 25%
Force America Hydraulics 20%
Certified hydraulics 20%
Varitec Industries 20%
Pro Vision USA 10%
Henke snow plows and equipment 15%
Warren and Monroe spreaders 15%
Whelen -Emergency and warning lighting 30%
North American Signal- Emergency and warning
Lighting 20%
Truck-lite- oem vehicle lighting 20%
Grote -oem vehicle lighting 20%
Ecco- lighting and equipment 20%
Maxxima- Oem lighting 20%
20%
Cougar vibrators 20%
Aero tarps 20%
Mountain tarps 20%
Shure-co tarps 20%
Banjo sprayer-liquid handling equipment and parts 20%
Insta chain 20%
On spot chain systems 20%
Snow- Wheels 15%
John henry foster-Eaton hydraulics and hoses 20%
Kr Johnson hydraulics 20%
Winter equipment 15%
Kueper Blades 20%
Valk blades 25%
Sabre/Evolution Blades 20%
Boss products 15%
Buyers products 20%

P.O. Box 295 ¢ 22956 Highway 61 ¢ Morley, MO 63767 ¢ Phone (573) 262-3545 ¢ Fax (573) 262-3369



“VIKING.CIVES

MIDWEST
Section 3, Parts, new cont’d
Direkt force cylinders 20%
Roadwatch 15%
Premier mfg -Safe-Tite 25%
Redneck trailer supplies 15%
Crest hardware 30%

P.O. Box 295 ¢ 22956 Highway 61 ¢ Morley, MO 63767 ¢ Phone (573) 262-3545 ¢ Fax (573) 262-3369
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12 - e %
13 i
;4 %
15 _ o B %
16 %
17 - B %
18 - %
19 - o
20 _ _ %

Section 5 — PICK UP SERVICE

The Successful Contractor may be required to pick up different styles and types of equipment for repair. Indicate what type of Pick
Up Services you can offer the County and include pricing for those pick up services (If you need additional space, on your company’s
letterhead submit with your bid response any additional information to make your bid complete):

Drive away vehicles- per mile

paTE: 411912021

EMAIL ADDRESS: dwillis@vikingcives.com

(Print or Type)

SIGNATURE: B
Namg:  Dale Willis (Print or Type) | PHONE: 816-625-0144
TiTLE:  Sales rep o (Printor Type) | CELL:  816-556-6851
compaNY NAME: YiKing Cives Midwest (Print or Type) | FAX. 816-625-0151

| WEB ADDRESS: V|k|n90|ves.qom

(Print or Type)




Bid No: 13-21

Commodity: Heavy Equipment Maintenance

Vendor: Summit Truck Group

Bid Recap Quote

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS Yes/No | Item # Iltem Name Amount
Contract Signed Y 1.0 |[Section 1 See Bid
Affidavit Y 2.0 |Section2 See Bid
Compliance Review Y 3.0 |[Section3 See Bid
Certificate of Compliance Y 4.0 |Section 4 No Bid
Statement of Contractor's Qualification Y 5.0 |Section 5 No Bid
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda N/A

Bidder's Quote Y

Bidder's Exceptions N

Contractor's Utilization Plan N/A

Contracts: See attached

References: See attached.

Comments: See quote for additional details.
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ATTACHMENT 1
BIDDER’S QUOTATION

For

JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 13-21

Jackson County, Missouri would like to have quotes and information the following Maintenance & Repair Service Labor
Rates, Maintenance & Repair Services Offered, New Parts, Remanufactured, Rebuilt or After Market Parts and Pick-Up
Service. If you provide additional services not listed below, please submit on your company’s letterhead and indicate the

additional services you have available and pricing for the additional services.

Section 1 — MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICE

Quote pricing on hourly rate for labor during regular work hours and overtime work hours. Include days of operation and travel time,
if applicable. Quote pricing for work to be completed in the Successful Contractor’s Shop and/or at Jackson County Locations for
those times when heavy construction equipment requires field service.

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT COSTS
Labor rate (shop), Regular work hours F & "/;7 V)
4 I it IClf
Shop Days of Operation, regular work hours: /M[ﬂ/(/ - ¢ A / Hourly $f§£§f’ /4% 7 ,V /f/ é 5.
1 Shop Hours of Operation, regular work hours:W/f/f' 7/)/;7 /M ”—/I: 7«3:‘ _ﬁ?_fj 7 7 ﬁ KEAT F apATY é’,}:ﬁ
Labor rate (shop), Overtime work hours 7514, /32 /f (’
Shop Days of Operation, overtime work hours: = Hourly $
2 Shop Hours of Operation, overtime work hours: ————
Labor rate (County Location), Regular work hours
Shop Days of Operation, regular work hours: -
Hourly $ —
Shop Hours of Operation, regular work hours:
3 Response time to County’s request for service at a County Location: hrs
Labor rate (County Location), Overtime work hours
Shop Days of Operation, overtime work hours;
Hourly 5§ —
Shop Hours of Operation, overtime work hours: '
4 Response time to County’s request for service at a County Location: hrs
Travel Charge (if applicable) for service call to a County Location for field 1 mile $
5 | service, Regular work hours —
Travel Charge (if applicable) for service call to a County Location for field .
. . 1 mile b —_—
6 service, Overtime work hours
7 Estimate Fee for Repair (if applicable) n/a 8 A/L{j’w}

A.) List all Shop locations including Point of Contact, complete address, phone number, and cell phone number (if applicable)
for each location (add additional sheets on your company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete):

Syt - JRUCK (6706

7700 A 2 L

K 270 £ /7L

£/t JF33
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Section 2 — EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER’S & MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICE OFFERED

A.) List All equipment manufacturers you offer parts, maintenance, and repair services on (add additional sheets on your
company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete): :

AT e A TRG CEC

C UM J= A b= S

ALL) S AV TRV A1 S/ oA S

B.) List additional services and/or items (menu of additional services and/or items) and pricing for any additional services and/or
items you offer the County (add additional sheets on your company’s letterhead if necessary to make bid complete):

C.) List number of qualified technicians available for work to be performed in the Successful Contractor’s Shop:

D.) List number of qualified technicians available for work to be performed at a Jackson County Location:
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Section 3 — PARTS. NEW

List manufacturer and percentage discount off manufacturers suggested list price you offer the County. If you need additional space,
on your company’s letterhead submit any additional manufacturers and discounts you are offering the County for New parts. NOTE:

If offering no discount, enter a zero or N/A. Leaving a blank indicates a “no bid”.

Parts orders must include freight/shipping on estimate and invoice as separate line item, if any, and may be grouped into one fee for

entire order.

=Y.

8 Ics

AU e

NO MANUFACTURER DISCOUNT OFFERED
’ P . . " NATCT LA
8 l‘/ﬁ/ffﬁ/éﬁ]ﬁ/{y"ﬂf’/{ Vi /ézx&/(# IS J$=20%Z O 5 /;/7;‘- %
= ; : : AL " g} /‘:4/'550'0
o | it prs S [l 1S Je-26 8 BN ies d
P JC A . X i, Y HAIC /7 L EAE
0 | ALL LSSV / lped 16 )25 U5 el 5d
11 %
12 =
13 %
14 %
15 %
16 %
17 %
18 %
19 %
20 %
DESCRIPTION QUOTE
21 Delivery of Parts Available (circle one) / ¥y or NO
L =
99 | Delivery charge, if applicable $ Wﬂfﬂf
23 | Minimum Order for delivery of parts, if applicable 5 WM
24 | Delivery time after receipt of request from the County for parts delivery f hours

Section 4 — PARTS, REMANUFACTURED, REBUILT, OR AFTER-MARKET

List manufacturer and percentage discount off manufacturer’s suggested Iist price you offer the County for remanufactured, rebuilt or
after-market parts. Prior approval by the County is REQURED for the use of Remanufactured, Rebuilt or After-Market Parts. If you
need additional space, on your company’s letterhead submit any additional manufacturers and discounts you are offering the County
for remanufactured, rebuilt or after-market parts. NOTE: If offering no discount, enter a zero or N/A. Leaving a blank indicates a

“no bid”.
NO MANUFACTURER DISCOUNT OFFERED
8 /l/ / /7’ %

7
9 /W/ ’ : °
10 /A %
u A
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12

%

13

%

14

%

15

%

16

%

17

%

18

%

19

%

20

%

Section 5 — PICK UP SERVICE

The Successful Contractor may be required to pick up different styles and types of equipment for repair. Indicate what type of Pick
Up Services you can offer the County and include pricing for those pick up services (If you need additional space, on your company’s
letterhead submit with your bid response any additional information to make your bid complete):

Nowp

SIGNATURE: /Z//f,z /“%

DATE; Z/:/z 0 ‘72 /

NAME: ﬂ/ ¢ //7[ 7( y (Print or Type)

PHONEK/ { »V;‘? —/ ﬁ j;

TITLE: &/?‘g f /C(‘ /%c/l"ﬂ'bﬂfﬁf/éﬁ(ﬁmt or Type)

ceu: £ /4 -Z4 5403

COMPANY NAME: S Unti)] THK L(’f 7 5/@&’/ (Print or Type)

rax. 76 - Y55 277

EMAIL ADDRESS: /4 §.$ /ﬁf/y @S’a/yw’; fy?’bfqgrrﬁ"?ﬁa

L o2

WEB ADDRESS: &/, £t Fivky f'f' )’fw A /)ﬂﬂM, &2 #Print or Type)
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