REQUEST FOR LEGISLATIVE ACTION

Completed by County Counselor’s Office:

Rest®rd No.: 18789
Sponsor(s): Frank White Jr.
Date: April 13, 2015

SUBJECT Action Requested
Xl Resolution
[ Ordinance .
Project/Title: Authorizing the Purchase of Five 24’ Pontoon Boats for the Blue Springs Marina & the Lake
Jacomo Marina located in the Parks + Rec Department to PlayCraft Boats of Richland, MO under the term and
conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 15-15.
BUDGET
INFORMATION Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year: $91.025.00
To be completed Amount previously authorized this fiscal year:
By Requesting Total amount authorized after this legislative action: $91,025.00
Department and Amount budgeted for this item * (including transfers): $91,025.00
Finance Source of funding (name of fund) and account code number:
300-1653-58165 Park Enterprise, Marinas, Boats & Motors $91,025.00

* [f account includes additional funds for other expenses, total budgeted in the account is: $

OTHER FINANCIAL INFORMATION:

[[] No budget impact (no fiscal note required)
[J Term and Supply Contract (funds approved in the annual budget); estimated value and use of contract;
Department: Estimated Use: $

Prior Year Budget (if applicable):
Prior Year Actual Amount Spent (if applicable):

PRIOR Prior ordinances and (date):

LEGISLATION Prior resolutions and (date):

CONTACT

INFORMATION | RLA drafted by (name, title, & phone): Cassandra Cheek, Senior Buyer, 881-3265

REQUEST

SUMMARY The Blue Springs Marina, and Lake Jacoma Marina located in the Parks + Rec Department requested the

Purchase of Five 24’ Pontoon Boats. The Purchasing Department issued Invitation to Bid No. 15-15 in response
to that request.

A total of 23 notifications were distributed and three responses were received and evaluated as follows:

Quotes for 24° Pontoon w/Convertible Top — Bimini w/canvas top including overhead straps & braces

Vendor ALL OR
Playcraft Boats Cabela’s NOTHING
Waco Manufacturing
Prices Each $18,205.00 $19,300 $29,664.00
Manufacturer & Model No. PlayCraft Clipper 2400 | 2015 Lowe SS250 | Aloha Mahalo
Bid w/ Yamaha 25LE Model MS240
Delivery Date ARO 90 Days 8 — 10 Weeks 30 Days
Total Cost for 5 $91,025.00 $96,500.00 $148,320.00
Quotes for 24’ Pontoon w/ 10° aluminum top w/ rear shelf
Vendor ALL OR
Playcraft Boats Cabela’s NOTHING
Waco Manufacturing |
Prices Each $18,500.00 NO BID $32,539.00
Manufacturer & Model No. PlayCraft Clipper NO BID Aloha Mahalo
Bid 2400 Model MS240
Delivery Date ARO 90 Days NO BID 30 Days
Total Cost for 5 $92,500.00 NO BID $162,695.00

Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, the Director of Finance and Purchasing recommends the

1




[ award for the Purchase of Three 24’ Pontoon Boats for the Blue Springs Marina, and Lake Jacomoa Marina
located in the Parks + Rec Department to PlayCraft Boats of Richland, Missouri as the lowest and best bid
received.

CLEARANCE
| Tax Clearance Completed (Purchasing & Department) N/A

DX Business License Verified (Purchasing & Department)

DX Chapter 6 Compliance - Affirmative Action/Prevailing Wage (County Auditor’s Office)

ATTACHMENTS | Memo from Bob McMillin, Superintendent of Golf & Marina’s, Recap of Bids and pertinent pages of PlayCraft

Boats bid document
REVIEW Departmcﬂtﬁlregtor Date: i
'1‘-‘,5{ (E_/f /p 6’/’/1/5’?.74/‘_\\_ 3-48 =Sl
ce udget Appr. Date:
[f applicable ?{5 7/ ZWM,/ //"? 422702041 3/0e/ss”
Division Manager: / Date:
}JW 3{.{.{1‘{’;\) '"a"/ 3”//&)
County Counselor’s Office:  ".[{ Date:




Fiscal Information (to be verified by Budget Office in Finance Department)

X

]

X

[

This expenditure was included in the annual budget.

Funds for this were encumbered from the Fund in

There is a balance otherwise unencumbered to the credit of the appropriation to which the expenditure

is chargeable and there is a cash balance otherwise unencumbered in the treasury to the credit of the fund from which
payment is to be made each sufficient to provide for the obligation herein authorized.

Funds sufficient for this expenditure will be/were appropriated by Ordinance #

Funds sufficient for this appropriation are available from the source indicated below.

Account Number: Account Title: Amount Not to Exceed:

This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of
funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as each using agency places its order.

This legislative action does not impact the County financially and does not require Finance/Budget approval.



Fiscal Note:
This expenditure was included in the Annual Budget.

PC#
Date: March 26, 2015 RES #18789
Department / Division Character/Description Not to Exceed
Park Enterprise Fund - 300
1653 - Marinas 58165 - Boats & Motors 91,025

91,025

%M



JACKSON COUNTY Res. 18789
Parks + Rec

T &l 22807 Woods Chapel Road Michele Newman, Director
HITLIA S Blue Springs, Missouri 64015 (816) 503-4800
it MakeYourDayHere com Fax: (816) 795-1234

March 23, 2015

Cassandra,

The Marina staff & | recommend Playcraft Boats out of Richland Missouri for Bid No. 15-15 Pontoon
Boats. We like the 24’ Playcraft Clipper 2400 w/10’ Bimini w/ canvas top including overhead straps &
braces for a total of $91,025. Also, the transfer to add to requisition RE321158090028170000 has just
been approved & I'll update the requisition.

Thanks,

Bob

Bob McMillin

Superintendent of Golf & Marina'’s
Jackson County Parks + Rec
11100View High Drive

Kansas City, Missouri 64134

Office: 816-765-8405

Email: bmemillin@jacksongov.org
Web:  www.MakeYourDayHere.com

i @ .

Michael D. Sana’er;, County Executive



RECAP BID NO. 15-15 PONTOON BOATS

Res. 18789

Playcraft Boats | Cabela’s Waco Manufacturing
Required Submittals
Literature X X X
Warranty Info X NO X

Quotes for 24’ Pontoon w/Convertible Top — Bimini w/canvas top including overhead straps & braces

Vendor ALL OR NOTHING
Playcraft Boats Cabela’s Waco Manufacturing
Prices Each $18,205.00 $19,300 $29,664.00
Manufacturer & Model No. Bid | PlayCraft Clipper 2400 | 2015 Lowe S5250 w/ | Aloha Mahalo
Yamaha 25LE Model MS240
Delivery Date ARO 90 Days 8 — 10 Weeks 30 Days
Total Cost for 5 $91,025.00 $96,500.00 $148,320.00
Quotes for 24’ Pontoon w/ 10’ aluminum top w/ rear shelf
Vendor ALL OR NOTHING
Playcraft Boats Cabela’s Waco Manufacturing
Prices Each $18,500.00 NO BID $32,539.00
Manufacturer & Model No. Bid | PlayCraft Clipper 2400 NO BID Aloha Mahalo
Model MS240
Delivery Date ARO 90 Days NO BID 30 Days
Total Cost for 5 $92,500.00 NO BID $162,695.00




Res. 18789

Jackson County Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 15-15
Page 2 of 18

A CONTRACT for Purchase of Five 24’ Pontoon Boats for the Parks + Rec Department.

A Contract between Jackson County Missouri ("County") and the undersigned ("Contractor"), collectively referred
to as the "parties". The term "offer” as used herein refers to Contractor's offer made in response to this Bid
Number. The parties agree as follows in consideration of the mutual covenants contained herein.

This Contract shall be binding when it is signed by the County's Purchasing Officer and/or Accounting Officer as
required by SEC. 50.660 RSMo., and shall run from such date until all parties are satisfied unless it is sooner
terminated as provided elsewhere herein

This Contract consists of: (1) Contractor's offer, including those papers which Contractor submitted with or
expressly incorporated in its offer as a part thereof, to the extent the terms of such papers were expressly or
impliedly accepted by the County, or were modified in writing with the express or implied consent of the
parties; (2) written modification to this Contract signed by the County's Purchasing Officer and consented to
expressly or impliedly by Contractor. This Contract represents the entire agreement between the parties in
regard to this Bid Number. A1l modifications to this Contract must be in writing signed by the County's
Purchasing Officer.

The laws of the State of Missouri and Jackson County, Missouri govern this Contract. This Contract shall be
binding upon and to the benefit of the successer and assigneas of the parties. The Contractor shall not assign
this Contract or any monies payable hereunder without the prior written consent of the County. Contractor is an
independent contractor of the County and shall indemnify the County for loss, damage or liability which the
County incurs o the extent that such results proximately from the ncgligence or violation of Contractor or ils
employees, agents or subcontractors.

In regard to any goods which are included in the sale hereunder, Contractor makes to the County the warranties

provided in Article Two of the Uniform Commercial Code of the State of Missouri to the extent that they apply by
the terms thereof.

The County gives each of its employees an employee identification card having thereon a photograph of the
employee. The County will not pay for any goods and/or services delivered by Contractor to any persons who did
not present to Contractor at the time of delivery their County Identification Cards and who were not in fact
authorized to receive delivery.

The County will pay to Contractor the applicable pricing quoted by Contractor in its offer for any goods and/or
services whose purchase was ordered by the County's Purchasing Officer in consequence of the County's acceptance
of Contractor's offer. The County will make good faith effort to make payment within thirty (30) days after the
latest of: (1) the date of proper delivery to the County; (2) the date of acceptance by the County; (3) the
date when the receiving department has received from the Contractor a correct and complete invoice showing the
pertinent County Purchase Order Number(s). Payment may be withheld by the County to protect itself from actual
or potential loss whigh has resultsd or may result from the Cantractor's non-performance of any of its duties
required hereunder.

Contractor warrants that no officer or employee of the County, whether elected or appointed, shall in any manner
whatsoever be interested in or receive any benefit from the profits or emoluments of this contract.

If the County awarded this Contract, would the Contractor sell under the prices and terms of this Contract to
any Municipal, County, Public Utility, Hospital, or Educational Institution having membership in the Mid-America
Council of Public Purchasing and located within the greater Kansas City Metropolitan Trade Area? (A1l
deliveries are to be F.0.B. Destination and there shall be no obligation on the part of any member of such
Council to utilize this Contract).

(Check one) Yes X No Initials . Minimum order, if applicable$

ALT, PAGES OF THIS INVITATION TO BID ARE EXPRESSLY MADE A PART OF THIS CONTRACT. The format of this Contract has
been approved by the County Counselor’s Office. Signature of vendor as indicated below MUST BE COMPLETED before
contract can be awarded:

PlayCraft Boats 573-765-3265
CONTRACTOR'S NAME: o - PHONE NO:
18999 S. State Hwy. 7, Richland, MO 65556 573-765-3202
ADDRESS : - FAX NO: ~
NAME OF AUTHORIZED AGENT (print or typel# Kent Kays DATE: 2/10/15
T .
STGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED AGENT: /Z % é.ﬁ-’f’ rrrLp: | Sales Coordlnator;_
7= 7
EMAIT ADDRESS OF AUTHORIZED I-\GENTi/ Kent(%laycraft_boats.com
FEDERAL ID NO: -1021032 ) and/or SOCIAL SECURITY NO:
SPECIFY: MINORITY OWNED (MBE) : WOMAN OWNED (WBE) : (Check If Applicabla)

LA A A A A A A R A R EEE EEEEREEEEE R E
JACKSON COUNTY MISSOURI BY Q. TROY THOMAS, DIRECTOR OF FINANCE AND PURCHASING

SIGNATURE OF Q. TROY THOMAS: ] ____ DaATE:




Jackson County Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 15-15
Page 16 of 18

7.0 QUOTATIONS

Res. 18789

Quote for 24’ Pontoon w/ Convertible Top - Bimini
w/canvas top including overhead straps & braces

$ $91,025.00 ($18,205.00 ea.)

Manufacturer & Model No. Bid

PlayCraft - Clipper 2400

Delivery Date after Receipt of Order

90 Days

Quote for 24’ Pontoon w/10° aluminum top w/rear
shelf

$ $92,500.00 ($18,500.00 ea.)

Manufacturer & Model No. Bid

PlayCraft - Clipper 2400

Delivery Date after Receipt of Order

90 Days

Y

DATE: 2/10/15

y ,f/) - ‘ﬁ/ .‘f’ I
= ,
SIGNATURE: ¢ // (,/
7=

Joe Dorris

NAME: (Print or Type) | PHONE: 273-765-3265
TITLE:  Vice President (Print or Type) | CELL:

COMPANY NAME: PlayCraft Boats (Print or Type) | FAX: 573-765-3202
EMAIL ADDRESs: 1 °°®Playcrafthoats. com (Print or Type)

| WEB ADDRESS: www.playcraftboats.com

(Print or Type)




MAIL THIS FORM Fﬁﬁﬁﬁﬂﬂﬁf : B mRiss' :?789
“.-ﬁ ontoo erial

Please Print or Type Leava It BH Behind, Registration Number:
The Serial Number will be recorded in our files for future reference

Name

Address City State Zip
Name of Dealer where purchased Date
Address City State Zip

Name and model of boat purchased

Have you more than one boat:

Your answers to the following will help us to serve you better: Olyes [ ~o
: Brand name
How well do you like your boat? How did you hear about your dealer: Type of bost
(Wiﬁ being the best) Sign out front of dealer [] .
1 e Tv Is this your first boat? ClYes [JNoO
2 [ pvispapets {[5] m If NO, please check type of previously
e Magazine [] AFhend [] owned boat
4 0 Radio [0 Direct mail [] Runabout [ ] Deck Craft []
5 [ Pontoon [] Fishing  []

RETAIN THIS FORM

Address City

Name and model of boat purchased

Dealer where purchased Date of Purchase

WARRANTY

PLAY CRAFT WARRANTIES THEIR HULL DESIGN AND MATERIALS FOR A PERIOD OF TWENTY YEARS AGAINST DETERIORATION
UNDER NORMAL USE TO THE ORIGINAL PURCHASER. ALSO, PLAY CRAFT WARRANTIES THE DECK FOR A PERIOD OF SIXTY YEARS
COVERED SPECIFICALLY BY THE DECK MANUFACTURERS WARRANTY TO THE ORIGINAL PURCHASER.

LIMITED ONE YEARWARRANTY
PlayCraft warrants each boat it has manufactured to be free from defects in materials or workmanship for a period of one (1) year from
the date of delivery to the original purchaser.

Theextension and enforcement of this warranty is limited to the original consumer purchaserand is not transferrable. Return of a praperly
completed Warranty Registration Card withinten (10)days fromthe date of purchase, to PlayCraft, P.O. Box 708, Richland, MO 65556. Eailure
toretum the card will void yourrights arising either under this warranty or understate law: andwill alsone gate yourright to "Defect Notificarion”
under the Federal Boating Safety Act of 1971.

This limited one (1) year warranty shall be in LIEU OF any other warranties, implied or expressed. PlayCraft shall not be liable for any
damages resulting from misuse, accident, improper trailering, improper maintenance and storage, commercial usage, or corrosion caused by
electralysis. Thiswarranty doesnotapply to products notinstalled by PlayCraft, i.c., installation of engines oraccessories by parties other than
PlayCraft. Products, including engines, out-drives, controls, batteries, stereosand otheraccessories orother equipment or component parts thereof
warranted by parties other than PlayCraft. :

Any component part covered by this warranty which, under normal and proper use, is proved to be defective within the warranty period
is either in material or workmanship, upon inspection by an authorized PlayCraft representative, and with written approval confaining an
authorization numberwill berepaired atthe factory, unless authorized by the PlayCraft factory representative, withall freight charges to be bome
by the owner. The boat will be repaired or replaced at the sale option of PlayCratt.

This warranty is automatically void if the boat has been operated in excess of the maximum engine horsepower specifications furnished.
PlayCraft does not assume and does not authorize any other party, whether being individual or dealer, to assume for itany obligation or liability
that has not been stated in this warranty.

THIS WARRANTY GIVES YOU SPECIFIC LEGAL RIGHTS, AND YOU ALSO HAVE OTHER RIGHTS WHICH VARY FROM
STATE TO STATE.




