IN THE COUNTY LEGISLATURE OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI

A RESOLUTION awarding twelve (12) month term and supply contracts for the furnishing of golf course chemicals and fertilizers for use by the Parks and Recreation Department to Helena Chemical Co. of Shawnee, KS, Floratine Midwest of Raymore, MO, Supreme Turf Products, Inc. of Olathe, KS, John Deere Landscapes of Cleveland, OH, and Reinders, Inc., of Elm Grove, WI, under the terms and conditions of Electronic Solicitation No. BB201025.

RESOLUTION #17523, February 28, 2011

INTRODUCED BY Fred Arbanas, County Legislator

WHEREAS, the Director of Finance and Purchasing has solicited bids on Electronic Solicitation No. BB201025 for the furnishing of golf course chemicals and fertilizers for use by the Parks and Recreation Department; and,

WHEREAS, a total of eighteen (22) notifications were distributed and seven (7) responses were received; and,

WHEREAS, following evaluation of the bids submitted, the Director of Finance and Purchasing recommends that the contract be divided and awarded to the vendors submitting the lowest bid for each item; and,

WHEREAS, award as recommended would result in awards to the following vendors:

<u>BIDDER</u>

Helena Chemical
Shawnee, KS
Floratine Midwest
Raymore, MO
Supreme Turf
Olathe, KS
John Deere Landscapes
Cleveland, OH
Reinders

Elm Grove, WI

ITEMS RECOMMENDED

1, 3, 7, 9, 10, 25, 28, 30, 37, 38, & 40

2, 4, 5, 12, 14, 16, 21, 22, 23, 24, 26, & 27

6, 9, 35, 39, & 41

8, 13, 15, 18, 34, & 36

11, 17, 20, 29, 31, 32, & 33

now therefore,

BE IT RESOLVED by the County Legislature of Jackson County, Missouri, that award be made as recommended by the Director of Finance and Purchasing and that the Director be, and is hereby, authorized to execute for the County any documents necessary to the accomplishment of the award; and,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Director of Finance and Purchasing is authorized to make all payments, including final payment on the contracts, to the extent that sufficient appropriations to the using spending agency are contained in the then current Jackson County budget.

Effective Date: This Resolution shall be effective immediately upon its passage by a majority of the Legislature.

APPROVED AS TO FORM:	. ^ //
Chief Deputy County Counselor	County Counselor
Certificate of Passage	•
I hereby certify that the attace 2011, was duly passed on County Legislature. The votes there	hed resolution, Resolution #17523 of February 28, <i>Elocusty 28</i> , 2011 by the Jackson on were as follows:
Yeas9	Nays
Abstaining	Absent O
2.28·11 Date	Mary Jo Spino
	Clerk of Legislature

This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual appropriation.

Pubuncy 23,2011

Director of Finance and Purchasing

REQUEST FOR LEGISLATIVE ACTION

Completed by County Counselor's Office:

Res**/Ord:** No.: 17523

Sponsor(s):
Date:

Fred Arbanas Feb. 28, 2011

SUBJECT Action Requested Resolution Ordinance Project/Title: Awarding a Twelve-Month Term and Supply Contract for the furnishing of CHEMICALS & FERTILIZERS FOR THE GOLF COURSE for the Parks & Recreation Department to Helena Chemical Co. of Shawnee, Kansas; Floratine Midwest of Raymore, Missouri; Supreme Turf Products Inc. of Olathe, Kansas; John Deere Landscapes of Cleveland, Ohio; and Reinders Inc. of Elm Grove, Wisconsin; under the term and conditions of Electronic Solicitation No. BB201025. BUDGET \$ N/A INFORMATION Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year: \$ N/A Amount previously authorized this fiscal year: To be completed \$ N/A Total amount authorized after this legislative action: By Requesting \$ N/A Department and Amount budgeted for this item * (including Finance transfers): Source of funding (name of fund) and account code FROM ACCT number: FROM / TO TO ACCT * If account includes additional funds for other expenses, total budgeted in the account is: \$ OTHER FINANCIAL INFORMATION: No budget impact (no fiscal note required) ☐ Term and Supply Contract (funds approved in the annual budget); estimated value and use of contract: Estimated Use: \$108,000.00 Department: Parks Prior Year Budget (if applicable): \$98,000.00 Prior Year Actual Amount Spent (if applicable): \$ 88,500.00 PRIOR Prior ordinances and (date): N/A LEGISLATION Prior resolutions and (date): 17179, 2/22/10 CONTACT RLA drafted by (name, title, & phone): Teddy Ballard, Senior Buyer, 881-3465 INFORMATION REQUEST The Parks Department requested a bid for chemicals and fertilizers for maintaining the golf course. Purchasing **SUMMARY** issued Electronic Solicitation No. BB201025. A total of 22 notifications were distributed with seven responses received. The following split of award is recommended to the low bidder on each item: LOW BID/ITEMS RECOMMENDED BIDDER 1, 3, 7, 9, 10, 25, 28, 30, 37, 38, & 40 Helena Chemical, Shawnee, KS 2, 4, 5, 12, 14, 16, 21, 22, 23, 24, 26, & 27 Floratine Midwest, Raymore, MO 6, 9, 35, 39, & 41 Supreme Turf, Olathe, KS 8, 13, 15, 18, 34, & 36 John Deere Landscapes, Cleveland, OH 11, 17, 20, 29, 31, 32, & 33 Reinders, Elm Grove, WI

	Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, 1984, the Director of Finance recommends the award of a Twelve Month Term and Supply Contract for the furnishing FERTILIZERS FOR THE GOLF COURSE for the Parks & Recreation Department to Shawnee, Kansas; Floratine Midwest of Raymore, Missouri; Supreme Turf Products I John Deere Landscapes of Cleveland, Ohio; and Reinders Inc. of Elm Grove, Wiscons conditions of Electronic Solicitation No. BB201025 to the lowest and best bidder for each thing award is made on an "as needed" basis and does not obligate Jackson County to part the availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual appropriations.	ng of CHEMICALS & Helena Chemical Co. of onc. of Olathe, Kansas; sin; under the term and each item.
CLEARANCE	☐ Tax Clearance Completed (Purchasing & Department) ☐ Business License Verified (Purchasing & Department) ☐ Chapter 6 Compliance - Affirmative Action/Prevailing Wage (County Auditor's County A	Office)
ATTACHMENTS	Electronic Recap of Bids Received, Recap of Prices, and Memo from Mr. Bob McMil Department	lin of the Parks
REVIEW	Department Director: Comparison of the Compar	Date: 2 2 -// Date: 2 - 22 - 11 Date: 2 / 2 3 / 11
	County Counselor's Office:	Date:

П This expenditure was included in the annual budget. П Funds for this were encumbered from the _____ Fund in ____. There is a balance otherwise unencumbered to the credit of the appropriation to which the expenditure is chargeable and there is a cash balance otherwise unencumbered in the treasury to the credit of the fund from which payment is to be made each sufficient to provide for the obligation herein authorized. Funds sufficient for this expenditure will be/were appropriated by Ordinance # Funds sufficient for this appropriation are available from the source indicated below. Account Number: Account Title: Amount Not to Exceed: This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as each using agency places its order.

This legislative action does not impact the County financially and does not require Finance/Budget approval.

Fiscal Information (to be verified by Budget Office in Finance Department)

Award /

CERTIFICATION OF BID OPENING BIDS WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND Jecember 7, 2010 Jackson County Missouri RECORDED AN: **Purchasing Department** CLER 415 East 12th Street, Room G1



LUMP SUM Abstract of Responses for Solicitation #BB201025 - 01 Click here to attach a post award file to this solicitations header. This file will be viewable by vendors from the abstract solicitation view after award. Solicitation Optional Title: Chemicals and Fertilizers for the Golf Course Abbreviated Desc: CHEMICALS AND FERTILIZERS FOR THE GOLF NIGP Nbr: 33500 COURSE. Jackson County, Missouri is seek Start of Requisition Nbr **Email Date Due Date** Solicitation Line Items Service Date Wed Jan 12 Tue Nov 23 Tue Dec 07 1 TOTAL RR201025 2011 2010 2010 14:00:00 00:00:00 14:37:08 **Estimated Price: 0** Line Item View Agency Attachments Federal Excluded Parties List Assign/Manage pCard **Bottom Of Page** Vendor Response Tracking Toggle All **Switches** Discount LABP Price Price Award / **Trans Date Trans Time Price Pymt Terms** Pymt Text NLAB: +0 O Zero dollars response to Item(s): 001 Mon Dec 06 Net 30 days 0.00 0.00 10:28:04 \$0.00 Award: C 2010 FedID: XX-XXXX517 Vendor: LESCO INC P00000026322 IP Addr: 199.178.201.11 Response 001: 01 Version: Line Item 001: 0 (0.00) Prices: Recycle 001: Not applicable Status: <u>Vendor</u> Comments: Attached Item: 001 Jackson County Spreadsheet bb201025.xls JACKSON COUNTY LABELS.pdf Buyer Comments: Solicitation: BB201025

Kansas City, MO 64106

Trans Time

Trans Date

LABP Price

Pymt Text

Pymt Terms

Price

Discount

Price

				0	NLAB: +0		
Zero dollars i	response to Ite	em(s): 001	<u></u>			<u>'</u>	
Award: O	\$0.00	0	30 net	0.00	0.00	Mon Dec 06 2010	15:09:34
L	GRASS PAD	WAREHOUSE	P0000003946	<u> </u>		FedID: IP Addr:	
Response Version:		1					
Line Item Prices:	001: 0 (0.00)						
Recycle Status:	001: Environ	mentally Friend	lly				
Vendor Comments:	Item #001 Cm	int:					
Attached							nein y man enimie ally osciolososine enim
Files:	Item: 001	<u>f</u> <u>f</u> f odf	alsfertil <u>lizers</u> B	idPriceSchedu	le.xls		
	Alternate 9.pd Alternate 9.pd Alternate 9.pd Alternate 9A.p RONSTAR Ide	<u>f</u> <u>f</u> <u>f</u> odf .					
<u>Buyer</u> Comments:							
					· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	Solicit	ation: BB201025
Award /	Price	Pymt Terms	Pymt Text	Discount Price C	LABP Price NLAB: +0	Trans Date	Trans Time
Zero dollars r	esponse to Iter	m(s): 001	<u></u>				
Award: O	\$0.00	0		0.00	0.00	Mon Dec 06 2010	14:19:07
	FLORATINE M	NIDWEST POO	000042148				XXX-XX-4929 208.188.199.132
Response Version:		<u>.</u>					
Prices.	001: 0 (0.00)					· 	
	001: Not appli	cable			····		
<u>Vendor</u> <u>Comments:</u>							
	Item: 001 Copy of BB20	1025_chemica	lsfertilizers_Bi	dPriceSchedu	e.xls		
Buyer Comments:							,, =======
						Solicita	ation: BB201025
				Discount	LABP Price		

Award /	Price	Pymt Terms	Pymt Text	Price	NLAB: +0	Trans Date	Trans Time
Zara dallara	esponse to Ite	<u> Li</u>	1,1,11,1,1,1,1	<u> </u>	<u> </u>		
Award: C	\$0.00	0	<u> </u>	0.00	0.00	Mon Dec 06 2010	12:15:15
Vendor:	HELENA CHE	MICAL COMPA	ANY P000000	58853		FedID: IP Addr:	XX-XXXX688 65.83.65.34
Response Version:	001: 01				· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		
<u>Line Item</u> <u>Prices:</u>	001: 0 (0.00)						
Recycle Status:	001: Not appli	cable					
<u>Vendor</u> <u>Comments:</u>	t.						·
Attached Files:	Item: 001 Copy of BB20	1025_chemica	Isfertilizers_B	idPriceSchedu	ıle.xis		
Buyer Comments:						Solicit	ation: BB201025
Award /	Price	Pymt Terms	Pymt Text	Discount Price	LABP Price NLAB: +0	Trans Date	Trans Time
Zero dollars r	esponse to Iter	n(s): 001		-			
Award: O	\$0.00	0		0.00	0.00	Mon Dec 06 2010	11:06:11
	SUPREME TU	RF PRODUCTS	S, INC. P0000	0068611		FedID: IP Addr:	XX-XXXX580 70.243.255.240
Response Version:			- 4-				
<u>Line Item</u> <u>Prices:</u>	001: 0 (0.00)					_ 	·
Recycle Status:	001: Not appli	cable					·
<u>Vendor</u> <u>Comments:</u>	Item #001 Cmr guaranteed fo	nt: Due to insta r 60 days after	bility at this ti bid opening.	me with pricin	g of fertilizers	the prices bid	can only be
•	Item: 001 Jackson Coun Affirm Label.p AdmiralLabel.	df	11.xls				
Buyer	Sixteen90Labe MillenniumUlt Glyphosate Pr	el.pdf aLabel.pdf	<u></u>				·
Comments:	··					Solicit	ation: BB201025
Award /	Price	Pymt Terms	Pymt Text	Discount Price	LABP Price NLAB: +0	Trans Date	Trans Time
					•		

Zero dollars ı	esponse to Ite	m(s): 001		·			·
Award: O	\$0.00	0		0.00	0.00	Mon Dec 06 2010	11:06:02
Vendor:	AMERICAN N	IIDWEST DIST 074468	RIBUTORS,			FedID:	
Response Version:	001: 01						
	/ <u></u>			·			
	001: Not appl				* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *		
<u>Vendor</u> <u>Comments:</u>		nt: American I	Vlidwest Distril	outors, LLC Bi	d 	·	and the second second
Attached Files:	ltem: 001 BB201025 ch	emicalsfertiliz ler_MSDS.pdf	ers_BidPriceS	chedule.xls			ndilandilandine endure menerakan menerakan menerak
Buyer Comments:		•					
						Solicit	ation: BB20102
Award /	Price	Pymt Terms	Pymt Text	Discount Price C	LABP Price NLAB: +0	Trans Date	Trans Time
ero dollars r	esponse to Ite	m(s): 001			-		
Award: C	\$0.00	0	60 net 61	0.00	0.00	Wed Dec 01 2010	14:05:31
		IIES INC POOD	00090381			FedID: IP Addr:	XX-XXXX544 64.134.161.18
Response Version:			·	·			
	001: 0 (0.00)	·	····	<u> </u>			
	001: Not appli	cable		· ·			
<u>Vendor</u> <u>Comments:</u>			·				·
	item: 001 Fred Arbana 1	1-18-10 quote.	<u>xis</u>	manaro — ur la sub tita — titi annararo s a			
Buyer Comments:							- DD00400
	 i		<u> </u>	Discount		Solicita	ation: BB20102
Award /	Price	Pymt Terms	Pymt Text	Price	LABP Price NLAB: +0	Trans Date	Trans Time
ero dollars re	sponse to Iter	n(s): 001					
Award: C	\$0.00	0	net 30 days	0.00	0.00	Mon Dec 06 2010	15:35:03
		C P00000090	524			FedID: IP Addr:	XX-XXXX349 99.109.184.25
Response	001: 01						

Version:	·					i	
<u>Line Item</u> <u>Prices:</u>	001: 0 (0.00)						
Recycle Status:	001: Not appli	icable					
<u>Vendor</u> <u>Comments:</u>							
Attached Files:	THE STATE OF THE S		O COLUMN TO THE REAL PROPERTY OF THE PARTY O		in the second state of the second		gge page may - grid stall William 17 Marie (Mar 17 Marie).
	ltem: 001 <u>Jackson CO E</u>	3B201025 GC o	<u>:hemicalsfertil</u>	izers BidPrice	Schedule.xls		
<u>Buyer</u> Comments:							
						Solicit	ation: BB201025
Award /	Price	Pymt Terms	Pymt Text	Discount Price C	LABP Price NLAB: +0	Trans Date	Trans Time
Zero dollars re	esponse to Iter	m(s): 001	·				
Award: O	\$0.00	0	net 30	0.00	0.00	Tue Nov 23 2010	13:00:33
Vendor:	JOHN DEERE	LANDSCAPES	P000000941	83		FedID: , IP Addr:	
Response Version:	001: 00						
<u>Line Item</u> <u>Prices:</u>	001: 0 (0.00)						
Recycle Status:	001: Not appli	cable			·		
<u>Vendor</u> Comments:	Item #001 Cm	nt: 7 - 10 days <i>i</i>	A.R.O.				
Attached Files:			The second of th				
	Item: 001 Jackson Cour PRODUCT SP	nty Spreadshee ECIFICATIONS	t bb201025.xls	<u> </u>		·	
<u>Buyer</u> Comments:				·	·	,	
						Solicit	ation: BB201025
	•	No Vendor	Submitted A R	esponse to th	is Solicitation		

A temporary Excel format document has been written. Click here to access it.

Line Item View	Front Bac	Top Of Page
----------------	-----------	-------------

© 1996-2010 SicommNet, Inc. All Rights Reserved.
- agency_buyer_AbstractLS Machine: prodappv5a IP: 67.52.252.218 - Tue, 07 Dec 2010 Agency ID: A00000000004 Dept ID: AGENCY User ID: tgroat

RECAP FOR ELECTRONIC SOLICITATION NO. BB201025 CHEMICALS AND FERTILIZERS FOR THE GOLF COURSE

	GRASS	FLORATINE	HELENA	SUPREME	AMERICAN MIDWEST,	REINDERS,	JOHN DEERE
	KS KS		Chemical, Lenexa, KS	Olathe, KS	City, MO	EIM Grove, WI	Cleveland, OH
NO DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
1 ANDERSON'S 18-9-18, greens grade	30.47	No Bid	46.70	46.80	No Bid	46.80	No Bid
2 ASTRON	No Bid	2,184.00	80.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3 BAYLETON 50	No Bid	No Bid	4.96	500.00	No Bid	5.18	5.40
4 CALPHLEX	114.00	940.00	31.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5 CARBON K	No Bid	612.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6 DACONILULTREX	70.00	No Bid	7.75	56.50	No Bid	09'99	7.75
7 DIMENSION .10, 19-5-19	18.87	No Bid	14.20	19.25	19.96	19.27	0.34
8 DIMENSION .10, 5-10-17	16.98	No Bid	14.50		17.84	17.27	0.25
9 18-24-12	16.43	No Bid	15.55	16.75	19.29	17.84	0.28
10 ENDORSE	No Bid	No Bid	176.90	630.00	No Bid	87.50	20.45
11 EPSOM SALT	18.00	No Bid	No Bid	40.00	No Bid	19.50	No Bid
12 FLORADOX PRO	No Bid	2,725.00	73.00	No E	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13 Helena Lake Colorant	No Bid	No Bid	35.00	•	No Bid	30.79	24.75
14 KNIFE	No Bid	1,225.00	8.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10.36
15 LESCOWET	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	00'09	No Bid	24.00	25.29
16 MAXIPLEX	No Bid	1,020.00	24.00	No E		No Bid	No Bid
17 MERIDIAN	No Bid	No Bid	1.40		'	1.35	No Bid
18 MOMENTUM	118.00		48.00		No B	9	37.36
19 19-0-19	13.90		14.15				No Bid
20 19-0-19 w/lron	14.42	Z	14.80	13.90	13.66	13.24	0.34
21 PERK UP	89.00	2,		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
22 PHLEXIMAG	55.00				No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23 PHLEXMAN	No Bid	100.00	60.00		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24 P.K. FIGHT	No Bid	2,480.00	35.00	S	No Bid	26.84	No Bid
25 PROSTAR 70	No Bid	No Bid	45.71		No Bid	47.72	96.65
26 PROTOSYN	No Bid	1,500.00	60.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
27 RENAISSANCE	No Bid	1,200.00	8.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
28 REQUEST	No Bid	No Bid	20.00	No Bid	No Bid	22.44	No B
29 REVOLVER	No Bid	No Bid	525.00	525.00	No Bid	173.06	525.00

Page 1 of 2

RECAP FOR ELECTRONIC SOLICITATION NO. BB201025 CHEMICALS AND FERTILIZERS FOR THE GOLF COURSE

I								
		GRASS	FLORATINE	HELENA	SUPREME	AMERICAN MIDWEST,	REINDERS,	JOHN DEERE
		PAD, Olathe,	MIDWEST,	CHEMICAL,	TURF,	North Kansas	Elm Grove,	LANDSCAPES,
		KS	Raymore, MO	Lenexa, KS	Olathe, KS	City, MO	M	Cleveland, OH
2	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
ಣ	30 RONSTAR	20.13	No Bid	18.80	210.00	No Bid	1.17	23.18
က်	31 ROUND-UP	34.00	No Bid	20.00	17.00	34.25	11.40	14.03
જ	32 Scimitar	No Bid	No Bid	115.90	128.00	No Bid	135.00	141.38
က်	33 SCOTTS 8614	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	70.30	No Bid	1.88	No Bid
જ	34 SIGNATURE	92.95	No Bid	21.85	545.00	No Bid	20.89	20.60
ઌૼ	35 32-03-08	15.79	No Bid	14.95	13.85	15.29	14.49	0.28
ಸ	36 Trimec Plus	97.28	No Bid	37.50	40.00	No Bid	36.00	25.25
က	37 UREA	17.40	No Bid	13.80	14.25	12.95	14.80	0.30
ઌ	38 Heritage	No Bid	No Bid	309.00	309.00	No Bid	309.00	309.00
က်	39 Spotrete	No Bid	No Bid	37.80	34.00	No Bid	36.00	No Bid
4	40 Daconil ZN	No Bid	No Bid	46.00	46.00	No Bid	46.00	46.00
4	41 Protect	No Bid	No Bid	7.70	215.00	No Bid	7.35	4.41
							í	
				,			1	
	NON-RESPONSIVE BIDS:							
	BWI Companies Inc non-responsive, failure to complete compliance.	ailure to comple	ete compliance.					

Teddy Ballard

From:

Bob McMillin

Sent:

Thursday, January 27, 2011 9:06 AM

To:

Teddy Ballard

Subject:

2011 Chemical Bid

Attachments: 2011 chemicle bid.xls

Teddy,

The attached document is the final chemical/fertilizer recommendation from the golf course staff for the 2011 season. If you have any questions please call me at 816-765-8405.

Thanks,

Bob

				-		_		
_						,		
	Low bid as specified	1490.00	250 pounds	Supreme	pound	5.96	Florect	<u>+</u>
	Low bid as specified	1380.00	30 gallons	Helena	gallon	46.00	Daconil Zn	İ
	l ow hid as specified	1020.00	30 gallons	Supreme	gallon	34.00	Spotrete	
	Low bid as specified	7725.00	25 pounds	Helena	pound	309.00	Heritage	
	Low bid as specified	1858 00	6000 lbs	Helena	50 lbs	13.80	Urea	
	Low bid as specified	1010 00	40 gallons	JD.	gallon	25:25	Trimec Plus	36
	Low bid as specified	1662 00	6000 lbs	Supreme	50 lbs	13.85	32-3-8	35
	Low bid as specified	9064.00	440 pounds	JDL	pound	20.60	Signature	4
-	low bid as specified	7520.00	3996 pounds	Reinders	bag/37lb	70.30	Scotts 8614	33
	l ow hid as specified	914 32	8 quarts	Reinders	quart	114.29	Scimitar	8
	Low bid as specified	171.00	15 gallons	Reinders	gallon	11.40	Round Up	<u>~</u>
	low hid as specified	3760 00	200 lbs	Helena	pound	18.80	Ronstar	8
	Low bid as specified	1730 60	10 gallons	Reinders	gallon	173.06	Revolver	29
	low hid as specified	400.00	20 gallons	Helena	gallon	20.00	Request	28
	Only hid as specified	1200.00	25 gallons	Floratine	gallon	48.00	Renaissance	27
	Low bid as specified	1500.00	30 gallons	Floratine	gallon	50.00	Protosyn	26
	City bid as specified	7313 60	160 pounds	Helena	pound	45.71	Prostar 70	25
	Only bid as specified	2/80.00	40 gallons	Floratine	gallon	62.00	PK Fight	24
	Only bid as specified	100.00	2.5 gallons	Floratine	gallon	40.00	Phlexman	23
	Only bid as specified	2250.00	25 Gallons	Floratine	gallon	40.00	Phlexmag	23
		1588.80	25 gallons	Floratine	gallon	90.00	Perk Up	22
	+-	1530.00	eggo ibs	Beinders	50 lbs	13.24	19-0-19 w/iron	20
	-	1868.00	SOOD INS	Sinreme	50 lbs	12.75	19-0-19	39
	Low bid as specified	10800.00	50 callans	.ID	gallon	37.36	Momentum	[
	Unly bid as specified	1020.00	SOUD IPS	Reindere	40 nounds	67.50	Meridian .	ľ
	Only bid as specified	505.80	20 gallons	Eloratina	gallon	34 00	Maxiplex	6
	Only bid as specified	1225.00	25 gallons	rioraurie	gallon	25.00	lescowet	5
	Lowest acceptable bid	891.00	36 gallons	JUL	gallon	40.00	Knife	4
	Only bid as specified	2725.00	25 gallons	Floratine	gallon	24.75	l ake Colorant	ᇷ
		195.00	500 lbs	Reinders	50 lbs	19.50	Eloradox Dro	3 =
		2122.80	132 pounds	Helena	11 pounds	176.90	Endorse	1
	-	3421.00	11000 lbs	Helena	50 lbs	15.55	18-24-12	ြင
	Lowest acceptable hid	6000.00	24000 lbs	קסר	50 lbs	12.50	Dimesion 0-0-7M 0.10	0
	Lowest accentable hid	6816.00	24000 lbs	Helena	50 lbs	14.20	Dimension 19-3-6 0.10	7
		3672 50	65 gallons	Supreme	gallon	56.50	Daconil Ultrex	6
		612.50	17.5 gallons	Floratine	1 gallon	35.00	Carbon K	G
		940.00	20 gallons	Floratine	1 gallon	47.00	Calphlex	4
	l ow hid as specified	793 60	160 ounces	Helena	ounce	4.96	Bayleton 50	ယ
	Only hid as specified	2184.00	25 gallons	Floratine	1 gallon	87.63	Astron	2
	Low bid as specified	4670.00	4000 lbs	Helena	40 lbs	46.70	18-9-18 greens	
	Reason for this Vendor	Total Price	Quantity	Vendor	AZIC JIIIO	Ollit Oool		