REQUEST FOR LEGISLATIVE ACTION

Res/1911 No: 16630

Sponsor: Fred Arbanas Date: 1 May 5, 2008

SUBJECT	Action Requested: Resolution X Ordinance
	Project: Awarding a Eight (8) Year Term & Supply Contract for the furnishing of Hay/Crop Harvesting for the Parks and Recreation Department to Thomas Bruce Mershon (Jackson County) of Lees Summit, MO; Clinton Sapp (Jackson County) of Lone Jack, MO; and Dan and Tom Stack (Jackson County) of Buckner, MO; under the terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 13-08. Need for Agenda of: April 28, 2008
BUDGET INFORMATION	Amount authorized by this legislation: \$\frac{Term and Supply Contract}{Amount previously authorized: \$\frac{Revenue Producing Contract}{Revenue Of Funding (account code): \frac{Vendor Pays County}{Vendor Pays County}
PRIOR LEGISLATION	Prior ordinances: Date: Date: Date:
CONTRACT INFORMATION	Drafted by: N/A
REQUEST SUMMARY	RLA drafted by: Teddy Ballard Phone: 881-3465
	A total of 38 notifications were distributed; 11 responses were received; two (2) were considered non-responsive for failure to meet minimum specifications. The following high bidders are recommended:
	LOCATION Blue/Gray Park, Hay Monkey Mountain, Hay Landahl Park, Hay Landahl Park, Crops HIGH BIDDER Clinton Sapp (Jackson), Lone Jack \$2,212.00 \$3,645.00 \$3,645.00 \$3,645.00 \$3,000 \$3,953.00
	This Invitation to Bid is based upon the bidder paying a fee to the County for Hay/Crop Harvest in Various Park Locations.
	Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the <u>Jackson County Code</u> , 1984, the Director of Finance and Purchasing recommends the award of an Eight (8) Year Term and Supply Contract for the furnishing of Hay/Crop Harvesting for the Parks and Recreation Department to Thomas Bruce Mershon (Jackson County) of Lees Summit, MO; Clinton Sapp (Jackson County) of Lone Jack, MO; and Dan and Tom Stack (Jackson County) of Buckner, MO; under the terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 13-08 as the highest and best bidders.
	Rogge Custom Farming and CFS are considered non-responsive for failure to meet minimum specifications.
	Attached are copies of the Abstract of Bids, a Recap of Bids Received, pertinent pages of the recommended bids, recommendation of the Parks Department, Tax and Compliance Status of the recommended bidders.
Rec'd County Counselor's Office by:	Date:
REVIEW	Request made by: Date: Date: Date: Date: Finance (Budget Approval): Chusting Mand Date: 4/25/08
SPONSOR	Land Use Committee

ABSTRACT OF BIDS

	BID NO: 13-08		T. Bruce Mershan	Troque Farms	Dale Richard	Jackson	Clinton Sann
	OPENING DATE: April 15, 2008					Campbell	L.
	Confor					Farms	
19	Cellier	- 1		1/4			
2	DESCRIPTION	DNIT IQ	QTY AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT
	1 Blue and Gray Park Reservs 72 Acres				\$ 201.80		2212.00
2	Monkey Mountain Natur Reserve 135 2 Acres		3,645.00	2,295.00		1,350.02	. 0 1. 1. 1.
က	3 Fleming Park (Lake Jacomo) 54 Acres		-		=		
4	4 Fleming Park(Blue Spgs Lake) 40 Acres	34				#1	
Ω.	5 Landahi Park Reserve 32 Acres Hay			8 480.0D			
9	6 Landahl Park Reserve 59 Acres Crop		34 3				
			Λ.				
			(3)				
					2		
			37				
					Đ		
	The common operator of common section (

ABSTRACT \neq OF =

PAGE 1 DEZ page 1 061

	BID NO: 13-08		Max Swisegood	Barker Farms	Dan & Tom	Chad Martin	Steve Czechin
	OPENING DATE: April 15, 2008)		Stock		
	COMMODITY: 8-Year Hay Crop Lease						
2	-	TOLL		H	FIGURE		
			AMOONI	AMOUNI	AMOONI	AMOUNT	AMOUNT
	1 Blue and Gray Park Reservs 72 Acres		936.00	\$ 2,030.E		161.0D	175.00
2	Monkey Mountain Natur Reserve 135 2 Acres		1020 0E11				3110,00
, co							8000
4	4 Fleming Park(Blue Spgs Lake) 40 Acres				30		
5	5 Landahi Park Reserve 32 Acres Hay				8 833.00		575 00
9	6 Landahl Park Reserve 59 Acres Crop					8 259.00	3/00.00
	2		Ti Ti				
	ă)						
		27					
			æ				
						0	
		¥	X	45			
	٢					,	1

ABSTRACT 2 OF 3

PAGE 2053 page 141

		s							
\$ 2160.00	865.40	865.00 640.09 515.00	865.00 640.00 515.00 3150.00			865.00 1640.03 515.00 3150.00	865.69 515.09 3150.09	865.69 120.03 2150.02 2150.03	865.69 515.09 3150.09
Monkey Mountain Natur Reserve 135 Acres	Fleming Park (Lake Jacomo) 54 Acres	3 Fleming Park (Lake Jacomo) 54 Acres 4 Fleming Park(Blue Spgs Lake) 40 Acres 5 Landahl Park Reserve 32 Acres Hay	3 Fleming Park (Lake Jacomo) 54 Acres 4 Fleming Park(Blue Spgs Lake) 40 Acres 5 Landahl Park Reserve 32 Acres Hay 6 Landahl Park Reserve 59 Acres Crop	Fleming Park (Lake Jacomo) 54 Acres Fleming Park (Blue Spgs Lake) 40 Acres andahl Park Reserve 32 Acres Hay andahl Park Reserve 59 Acres Crop CERTIFICATION OF BID OPENING	Fleming Park (Lake Jacomo) 54 Acres Fleming Park (Blue Spgs Lake) 40 Acres andahi Park Reserve 32 Acres Hay andahi Park Reserve 59 Acres Crop BIDS WERE PUBLICLY OPENING BIDS WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND RECORDED ON:	Teming Park (Lake Jacomo) 54 Acres Teming Park (Blue Spgs Lake) 40 Acres andahl Park Reserve 32 Acres Hay andahl Park Reserve 59 Acres Crop BIDS WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND RECORDED ON: CERTIFICATION OF BID OPENING BIDS WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND RECORDED ON: CLERK OF THE LEGISLATURE CLERK OF THE LEGISLATURE CLERK OF THE LEGISLATURE PURCHASING MANAGER	Teming Park (Lake Jacomo) 54 Acres Teming Park (Blue Spgs Lake) 40 Acres Tandahi Park Reserve 32 Acres Hay Tandahi Park Reserve 59 Acres Crop The Corpus OF BID OPENING BIDS WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND THE CORPUS ON: THE LEGISLATURE THE LEGISLATURE PURCHASING MANAGER	ileming Park (Lake Jacomo) 54 Acres ileming Park (Blue Spgs Lake) 40 Acres andahl Park Reserve 32 Acres Hay andahl Park Reserve 59 Acres Crop RECORDED ON: RECORDED ON:	Teming Park (Lake Jacomo) 54 Acres Teming Park (Blue Spgs Lake) 40 Acres Teming Park Reserve 32 Acres Hay The Carlon OF BID OPENING BIDS WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND THE CORDER ON THE LEGISLALURE CLERK OF THE LEGISLALURE PURCHASING MANAGER

ABSTRACT 3 OF 3

PAGE JOF 3 page 181

RECAP 13-08 EIGHT (8) YEAR HAY/CROP LEASE

		*									
*		BESSIE MARTIN (Jackson), Oak	AARTIN (r), Oak	DAN STOCK (Jackson),	DAN STOCK (Jackson),	BARKER FARMS (Jackson),	FARMS	MAS	SEGOOD n), Oak	CLINTON SAPP (Jackson), Lone	I SAPP), Lone
Z		Grove, MO	Z C	Buckn	Buckner, MO	Greenwood, MO	od, MO	Grove, MO	, MO	Jack, MO	<u>Q</u>
ŽĮ.	-1	НАУ	CORP	HAY	CORP	НАУ	CORP	HAY	CORP	HAY	CORP
	I Blue and Gray Park Reserve, 72 Acres	401.00	ı	N/B	1	2,030.00	1	936.00	1	2 212 00	1
	2 Monkey Mountain Nature Reserve, 135 Acres	801.00	1	N/B	1	N/B	1	1,620,00	1	N/B	
	3 Fleming Park (Lake Jacomo), 54 Acres	3	N/B	ı	NB	1	N/B	1	a/N	2	I Q/N
1	4 Fleming Park (Blue Springs Lake), 40 Acres	N/B	1	N/B	1	N/B	1	N/B	ן ב	a/N	Q/N
	5 Landahl Park Reserve, 32 Acres, Hay	N/B	1	832.00	ı	N/B	ı	N/B	1		1
	6 Landahl Park Reserve, 59 Acres, Crops	1	259.00	1	3,953.00	1	N/B	1	N/B	<u>2</u> 1	ı M
											2
	TOTAL BID PER YEAR 1,202.00	1,202.00	259.00	832.00	3,953.00	2,030.00	00.0	2,556.00	0.00	2.212.00	000
	REJECTED BIDS:										
	Rogge Custom Farming, Lafayette County, MO -										
	does not meet minimum specs, requesting 1 exception to insurance requirements										
	CFS, Lafayette County, MO - does not meet								==		
	minimum specs, requesting exception to										
	2 insurance requirements.										

RECAP 13-08 EIGHT (8) YEAR HAY/CROP LEASE

3.4.2	JACKSON CAMPBELL FARM	SON L FARM	DALE RICHARD	HARD	TORQUE FARMS	FARMS	THOMAS BRUCE MERSHON	BRUCE
	(Jackson), Grain Valley, MO	, Grain , MO	(Jackson), Oak Grove, MO), Oak MO	(Jackson), Buckner, MO	son), r, MO	(Jackson), Lees Summit, MO), Lees t. MO
NO LOCATION	HAY	CORP	НАУ	CORP	HAY	CORP	НАУ	CORP
1 Blue and Gray Park Reserve, 72 Acres	N/B	ŀ	501.00	1	N/B	ı	N/B	1
2 Monkey Mountain Nature Reserve, 135 Acres	1,350.00	1	851.00	ŀ	2,295.00	1	3,645.00	ŀ
3 Fleming Park (Lake Jacomo), 54 Acres	1	N/B	1	NB	1	N/B	1	N/B
4 Fleming Park (Blue Springs Lake), 40 Acres	N/B	1	N/B	1	N/B	1	N/B	1
5 Landahl Park Reserve, 32 Acres, Hay	N/B	1	N/B	1	480.00	1	N/B	1
6 Landahl Park Reserve, 59 Acres, Crops	1	N/B	1	N/B	1	N/B	:	N/B
TOTAL BID PER YEAR	1,350.00	0.00	1,352.00	00.00	2,775.00	0.00	0.00 3,645.00	0.00
REJECTED BIDS:				12				
Rogge Custom Farming, Lafayette County, MO - does not meet minimum specs, requesting 1 exception to insurance requirements.								
CFS, Lafayette County, MO - does not meet minimum specs, requesting exception to 2 insurance requirements.								



JACKSON COUNTY Parks and Recreation

22807 Woods Chapel Road Blue Springs, Missouri 64015 www.jacksongov.org

Administration Historic Sites Ranger Station Leisure Services (816) 503-4800 Fax (816) 795-1234

Kemper Outdoor Education Center (816) 229-8980

Fred Arbanas Golf Course at Longview Lake (816) 761-9445

Blue Springs Marina (816) 795-1112

Jacomo Marina (816) 795-8888

Longview Marina (816) 966-0131

Special Population Services (816) 763-5130

MEMORANDUM

TO:

Teddy Ballard, Purchasing

FROM:

Misti Duncan, Parks and Recreation

DATE:

April 22, 2008

SUBJECT: Invitation to Bid No. 13-08 - Eight (8) Year Hay/Crop Lease

The Parks Department has evaluated the recap of the bid and concurs with your recommendation that;

Clinton Sapp is the best bidder for Blue/Grey Park hay lease, Thomas Mershon is the best bidder for Monkey Mountain hay lease, Dan Stock is the best bidder for Landahl Park hay/crop lease. A CONTRACT for an EIGHT (8) YEAR HAY/CORP LEASE for the Parks & Recreation Department.

A Contract between Jackson County Missouri ("County") and the undersigned ("Contractor"), collectively referred to as the "parties". The term "offer" as used herein refers to Contractor's offer made in response to this Bid Number. The parties agree as follows in consideration of the mutual covenants contained herein.

This Contract shall be binding when it is signed by the County's Purchasing Officer and shall run from such date until December 31, 2015, unless sooner terminated in accord herewith.

This Contract consist of: (1) Contractor's offer, including those papers which Contractor submitted with or expressly incorporated in its offer as a part thereof, to the extent the terms of such papers were expressly or impliedly accepted by the County, or were modified in writing with the express or implied consent of the parties; (2) written modification to this Contract signed by the County's Purchasing Officer and consented to expressly or impliedly by Contractor. This Contract represents the entire agreement between the parties in regard to this Bid Number. All modifications to this Contract must be in writing signed by the County's Purchasing Officer.

The laws of the State of Missouri and Jackson County, Missouri govern this Contract. This Contract shall be binding upon and to the benefit of the successor and assignees of the parties. The Contractor shall not assign this Contract or any monies payable hereunder without the prior written consent of the County. Contractor is an independent contractor of the County and shall indemnify the County for loss, damage or liability which the County incurs to the extent that such results proximately from the negligence or violation of Contractor or its employees, agents or subcontractors.

In regard to any goods which are included in the sale hereunder, Contractor makes to the County the warranties provided in Article Two of the Uniform Commercial Code of the State of Missouri to the extent that they apply by the terms thereof.

The County gives each of its employees an employee identification card having thereon a photograph of the employee. The County will not pay for any goods and/or services delivered by Contractor to any persons who did not present to Contractor at the time of delivery their County Identification Cards and who were not in fact authorized to receive delivery.

The County reserves the right to terminate this Contract for any reason upon at least 14 days written notice to Contractor.

The parties may not extend this Contract beyond its original term.

The County will pay to Contractor the applicable pricing quoted by Contractor in its offer for any goods and/or services whose purchase was ordered by the County's Purchasing Officer in consequence of the County's acceptance of Contractor's offer. The County will make good faith effort to make payment within thirty (30) days after the latest of: (1) the date of proper delivery to the County; (2) the date of acceptance by the County; (3) the date when the receiving department has received from the Contractor a correct and complete invoice showing the pertinent County Purchase Order Number(s). Payment may be withheld by the County to protect itself from actual or potential loss which has resulted or may result from the Contractor's non-performance of any of its duties required hereunder.

Contractor warrants that no officer or employee of the County, whether elected or appointed, shall in any manner whatsoever be interested in or receive any benefit from the profits or emoluments of this contract.

If the County awarded this Contract, would the Contractor sell under the prices and terms of this Contract to any Municipal, County, Public Utility, Hospital, or Educational Institution having membership in the Mid-America Council of Public Purchasing and located within the greater Kansas City Metropolitan Trade Area? (All deliveries are to be F.O.B. Destination and there shall be no obligation on the part of any member of such Council to utilize this Contract).

(Check one) Yes No X Initials Minimum order, if	applicable\$
ALL PAGES OF THIS INVITATION TO BID ARE EXPRESSLY MADE A PART OF T	THIS CONTRACT. The format of this Contract has
been approved by the County Counselor's Office. Signature of vendo	or as indicated below MUST BE COMPLETED before
CONTRACT CAN be awarded: Clinton SAPP CONTRACTOR'S NAME: CLINTON SAPP ADDRESS: 34804 DEINK WARCE Long JACK Mo 640 NAME OF AUTHORIZED AGENT (print or type): Clinton Sapp	PHONE NO: 816 694-8059
ADDRESS: 34804 Drink Water Lone Jack mo 640	70 FAX NO:
NAME OF AUTHORIZED AGENT (print or type): Choton SAPA	DATE: 4-10-08
SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED AGENT:	TITLE: OWNEC
NAME OF AUTHORIZED AGENT (print or type): SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED AGENT: SPECIFY: MINORITY OWNED (MBE): WOMAN OWNED (WBE):	NO: 492 56 3373
SPECIFY: MINORITY OWNED (MBE): WOMAN OWNED (WBE): ((Check If Applicable)
· * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *	
JACKSON COUNTY MISSOURI BY Q. TROY THOMAS, DIRECTOR OF FINANCE AND	PURCHASING
SIGNATURE OF Q. TROY THOMAS:	DATE:

QUOTATION

NO	LOCATION	HAY	CROP
1	Blue and Gray Park Reserve, 72 Acres	s 2212°°	N/A
2	Monkey Mountain Nature Reserve, 135 Acres	\$	N/A
3	Fleming Park (Lake Jacomo), 54 Acres	N/A	\$
4	Fleming Park (Blue Springs Lake), 40 Acres	\$	N/A
5	Landahl Park Reserve, 32 Acres, Hay	\$	N/A
6	Landahl Park Reserve, 59 Acres, Crops	N/A	\$

NOTE: A separate amount $\underline{MUST\ BE}$ quoted for each item. Lump sum bids covering several items or all items will be $\underline{REJECTED}$.

SIGNATURE: Clerter Says		DATE:	4-10-08
NAME: CLINTON SAPP	(Print or Type)	PHONE:	816 694 8059 816 697 2578
TITLE: OWN-C	(Print or Type)	FAX:	
COMPANY NAME: FARM	(Print or Type)		
E-MAIL: SmuRF 137 B yAhoo, com	(Print or Type)	(4)	#c

Jackson County Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 13-08 Page 7 of 22

A CONTRACT for an EIGHT (8) YEAR HAY/CORP LEASE for the Parks & Recreation Department.

A Contract between Jackson County Missouri ("County") and the undersigned ("Contractor"), collectively referred to as the "parties". The term "offer" as used herein refers to Contractor's offer made in response to this Bid Number. The parties agree as follows in consideration of the mutual covenants contained herein.

This Contract shall be binding when it is signed by the County's Purchasing Officer and shall run from such date until December 31, 2015, unless sooner terminated in accord herewith.

This Contract consist of: (1) Contractor's offer, including those papers which Contractor submitted with or expressly incorporated in its offer as a part thereof, to the extent the terms of such papers were expressly or impliedly accepted by the County, or were modified in writing with the express or implied consent of the parties; (2) written modification to this Contract signed by the County's Purchasing Officer and consented to expressly or impliedly by Contractor. This Contract represents the entire agreement between the parties in regard to this Bid Number. All modifications to this Contract must be in writing signed by the County's Purchasing Officer.

The laws of the State of Missouri and Jackson County, Missouri govern this Contract. This Contract shall be binding upon and to the benefit of the successor and assignees of the parties. The Contractor shall not assign this Contract or any monies payable hereunder without the prior written consent of the County. Contractor is an independent contractor of the County and shall indemnify the County for loss, damage or liability which the County incurs to the extent that such results proximately from the negligence or violation of Contractor or its employees, agents or subcontractors.

In regard to any goods which are included in the sale hereunder, Contractor makes to the County the warranties provided in Article Two of the Uniform Commercial Code of the State of Missouri to the extent that they apply by the terms thereof.

The County gives each of its employees an employee identification card having thereon a photograph of the employee. The County will not pay for any goods and/or services delivered by Contractor to any persons who did not present to Contractor at the time of delivery their County Identification Cards and who were not in fact authorized to receive delivery.

The County reserves the right to terminate this Contract for any reason upon at least 14 days written notice to Contractor.

The parties may not extend this Contract beyond its original term.

(Check one) Yes

The County will pay to Contractor the applicable pricing quoted by Contractor in its offer for any goods and/or services whose purchase was ordered by the County's Purchasing Officer in consequence of the County's acceptance of Contractor's offer. The County will make good faith effort to make payment within thirty (30) days after the latest of: (1) the date of proper delivery to the County; (2) the date of acceptance by the County; (3) the date when the receiving department has received from the Contractor a correct and complete invoice showing the pertinent County Purchase Order Number(s). Payment may be withheld by the County to protect itself from actual or potential loss which has resulted or may result from the Contractor's non-performance of any of its duties required hereunder.

Contractor warrants that no officer or employee of the County, whether elected or appointed, shall in any manner whatsoever be interested in or receive any benefit from the profits or emoluments of this contract.

If the County awarded this Contract, would the Contractor sell under the prices and terms of this Contract to any Municipal, County, Public Utility, Hospital, or Educational Institution having membership in the Mid-America Council of Public Purchasing and located within the greater Kansas City Metropolitan Trade Area? (All deliveries are to be F.O.B. Destination and there shall be no obligation on the part of any member of such Council to utilize this Contract).

(Check one) YesNo Initials Minimum order, if applicable\$
ALL PAGES OF THIS INVITATION TO BID ARE EXPRESSLY MADE A PART OF THIS CONTRACT. The format of this Contract has
been approved by the County Counselor's Office. Signature of vendor as indicated below MUST BE COMPLETED before
CONTRACTOR'S NAME: Day T Jon Stock CONTRACTOR'S NAME: Day T Jon Stock ADDRESS: Wallate C. J. Valle Rd, Buckey MO 64016 FAX NO: 816-650-6179
ADDRESS: 1000 Late C. 4 Valley Rd, BUCCE MO 64016 FAX NO: 816-650-6179
DATE:
SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED AGENT: Vinally TITLE: Ourse
FEDERAL ID NO: and/or SOCIAL SECURITY NO: 45-58-9154
SPECIFY: MINORITY OWNED (MBE): WOMAN OWNED (WBE): (Check If Applicable)
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *
JACKSON COUNTY MISSOURI BY Q. TROY THOMAS, DIRECTOR OF FINANCE AND PURCHASING
SIGNATURE OF Q. TROY THOMAS: DATE:

QUOTATION

NO	LOCATION	HAY	CROP
1	Blue and Gray Park Reserve, 72 Acres	s No Bid	N/A
2	Monkey Mountain Nature Reserve, 135 Acres	s No Bid	N/A
3	Fleming Park (Lake Jacomo), 54 Acres	N/A	s No Bid
4	Fleming Park (Blue Springs Lake), 40 Acres	s No Bid	N/A
5	Landahl Park Reserve, 32 Acres, Hay	s 832.00	N/A
6	Landahl Park Reserve, 59 Acres, Crops	N/A	\$ 3953.00

NOTE: A separate amount <u>MUST BE</u> quoted for each item. Lump sum bids covering several items or all items will be <u>REJECTED</u>.

SIGNATURE: Dan Stort		DATE: 4/15/08
NAME: Dan Stock	(Print or Type)	PHONE: 8/10-392-5219
TITLE: Owner	(Print or Type)	FAX: 816-650-6179
COMPANY NAME: Dan an Tom Stock	(Print or Type)	
E-MAIL: STOCK DJ STOCK @ AOL. COM	(Print or Type)	

Jackson County Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 13-08 Page 7 of 22

A CONTRACT for an EIGHT (8) YEAR HAY/CORP LEASE for the Parks & Recreation Department.

A Contract between Jackson County Missouri ("County") and the undersigned ("Contractor"), collectively referred to as the "parties". The term "offer" as used herein refers to Contractor's offer made in response to this Bid Number. The parties agree as follows in consideration of the mutual covenants contained herein.

This Contract shall be binding when it is signed by the County's Purchasing Officer and shall run from such date until December 31, 2015, unless sooner terminated in accord herewith.

This Contract consist of: (1) Contractor's offer, including those papers which Contractor submitted with or expressly incorporated in its offer as a part thereof, to the extent the terms of such papers were expressly or impliedly accepted by the County, or were modified in writing with the express or implied consent of the parties; (2) written modification to this Contract signed by the County's Purchasing Officer and consented to expressly or impliedly by Contractor. This Contract represents the entire agreement between the parties in regard to this Bid Number. All modifications to this Contract must be in writing signed by the County's Purchasing Officer.

The laws of the State of Missouri and Jackson County, Missouri govern this Contract. This Contract shall be binding upon and to the benefit of the successor and assignees of the parties. The Contractor shall not assign this Contract or any monies payable hereunder without the prior written consent of the County. Contractor is an independent contractor of the County and shall indemnify the County for loss, damage or liability which the County incurs to the extent that such results proximately from the negligence or violation of Contractor or its employees, agents or subcontractors.

In regard to any goods which are included in the sale hereunder, Contractor makes to the County the warranties provided in Article Two of the Uniform Commercial Code of the State of Missouri to the extent that they apply by the terms thereof.

The County gives each of its employees an employee identification card having thereon a photograph of the employee. The County will not pay for any goods and/or services delivered by Contractor to any persons who did not present to Contractor at the time of delivery their County Identification Cards and who were not in fact authorized to receive delivery.

The County reserves the right to terminate this Contract for any reason upon at least 14 days written notice to Contractor.

The parties may not extend this Contract beyond its original term.

The County will pay to Contractor the applicable pricing quoted by Contractor in its offer for any goods and/or services whose purchase was ordered by the County's Purchasing Officer in consequence of the County's acceptance of Contractor's offer. The County will make good faith effort to make payment within thirty (30) days after the latest of: (1) the date of proper delivery to the County; (2) the date of acceptance by the County; (3) the date when the receiving department has received from the Contractor a correct and complete invoice showing the pertinent County Purchase Order Number(s). Payment may be withheld by the County to protect itself from actual or potential loss which has resulted or may result from the Contractor's non-performance of any of its duties required hereunder.

Contractor warrants that no officer or employee of the County, whether elected or appointed, shall in any manner whatsoever be interested in or receive any benefit from the profits or emoluments of this contract.

If the County awarded this Contract, would the Contractor sell under the prices and terms of this Contract to any Municipal, County, Public Utility, Hospital, or Educational Institution having membership in the Mid-America Council of Public Purchasing and located within the greater Kansas City Metropolitan Trade Area? (All deliveries are to be F.O.B. Destination and there shall be no obligation on the part of any member of such Council to utilize this Contract).

(Check one) Yes No Initials Minimum order, if applicable\$
ALL PAGES OF THIS INVITATION TO BID ARE EXPRESSLY MADE A PART OF THIS CONTRACT. The format of this Contract has
been approved by the County Counselor's Office. Signature of vendor as indicated below MUST BE COMPLETED before
contract can be awarded: Thomas Bruce Metshon PHONE NO: 816-478-6275 ADDRESS: 3620 M Blue Jacker Drive Lees Summitted FAX NO: 816-478-4267
ADDRESS: 3620 NW Blue acterbrice Lee's Summit LAP FAX NO: 816-478-4267
NAME OF AUTHORIZED AGENT (Drint or type): Thomas & Breec / NC (SG) a DATE:
SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED AGENT: Thomas Que Mersha TITLE: ownet
FEDERAL ID NO: and/or SOCIAL SECURITY NO: 495-78-6698
SPECIFY: MINORITY OWNED (MBE): WOMAN OWNED (WBE): (Check If Applicable)
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *
JACKSON COUNTY MISSOURI BY Q. TROY THOMAS, DIRECTOR OF FINANCE AND PURCHASING
SIGNATURE OF Q. TROY THOMAS: DATE:

QUOTATION

NO	LOCATION	HAY	CROP
1	Blue and Gray Park Reserve, 72 Acres	\$	N/A
2	Monkey Mountain Nature Reserve, 135 Acres	\$ 3,645/	yest N/A
3	Fleming Park (Lake Jacomo), 54 Acres	N/A	\$
4	Fleming Park (Blue Springs Lake), 40 Acres	\$	N/A
5	Landahl Park Reserve, 32 Acres, Hay	\$	N/A
6	Landahl Park Reserve, 59 Acres, Crops	N/A	\$

NOTE: A separate amount <u>MUST BE</u> quoted for each item. Lump sum bids covering several items or all items will be <u>REJECTED</u>.

SIGNATURE: Thomas Buce Mushon		DATE: 4/1/08
NAME: Thomas Bruce Metshan	(Print or Type)	PHONE: 816-478-6275
TITLE: Ownet	(Print or Type)	FAX: 816-478-4267
COMPANY NAME: Thomas Bruce Metshop	(Print or Type)	cell 816-289-3765
E-MAIL: Tracey @mershon and medonald. com	(Print or Type)	



PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

415 East 12th Street Kansas City, Missouri 64106 816-881-3267

Fax

816-881-3268

MEMORANDUM

TO: FROM: DATE: RE:	Teddy April	Wyrsch, Compliance I Ballard, Senior Buye 18, 2008 est for Compliance Sta	r, Purchasing Departm	ent A	
Please indicate attention:	te belov	the current Complian	nce Status of the firm s	shown below and return thi	s form to my
Bid Number:		13-08	Estimated Amount:	Vendor pays County	
Name of Firm Address: City, State, Zi Contact Perso Phone Number	ip: on:	Clinton Sapp 34804 E. Drinkwat Lone Jack, MO 640 (816) 694-8059	. 	RECEIVED APR 1 & 2008	
I have attache	ed copie	s of the items checked	l below:	COMPLIANCE REVIEW OFFICE JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI	
		ty Certificate of Comp eport Form	liance		
Please return			*****	: * * * * * * * * * * * * * *	: * * *
TO: PURC	CHASIN	G DEPARTMENT			
In Complia Exempt	oliance ince Per	•	Suspension/E Forms Sent T Other	olished eeded from to xpiration Date o Company	
Signed:	76	nuyul	Date:	-22-08	



PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

415 East 12th Street Kansas City, Missouri 64106 816-881-3267

Fax

816-881-3268

MEMORANDUM

		MEMORITOCH
TO: FROM: DATE: RE:	Tom Wyrsch, Compliand Teddy Ballard, Senior B April 18, 2008 Request for Compliance	uyer, Purchasing Department
Please indicat attention:	e below the current Comp	liance Status of the firm shown below and return this form to my
Bid Number:	13-08	Estimated Amount: Vendor pays County
Name of Firm Address: City, State, Zi Contact Perso Phone Numbe	p: Lees Summit, M	cket Drive
Jackson_x Compli	d copies of the items check n County Certificate of Co lance Report Form	JACKSON COUNTY
	o me by: ASAP	*********
TO: PURC	HASING DEPARTMENT	Γ
The firm show	n above is currently:	
In Comp Complian Exempt	liance nce Pending	Not In ComplianceFile Not EstablishedPaperwork Needed fromto Suspension/Expiration Date Forms Sent To Company Other
Signed: 16	m wys l	Date: 4-22-08



PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 415 East 12th Street

Kansas City, Missouri 64106

816-881-3267

Fax

816-881-3268

MEMORANDUM

			141 12 141	O RETAIN D UNI	
TO: FROM: DATE: RE:	Teddy l April 1	Vyrsch, Compliance R Ballard, Senior Buyer 8, 2008 at for Compliance Stat	, Purchasing		
Please indica attention:	te below	the current Complian	ce Status of	the firm shown below and re	turn this form to my
Bid Number:		13-08	Estimated .	Amount: Vendor pays Cou	ınty
Name of Firm Address: City, State, Zi Contact Perso	ip:	Dan and Tom Stack 1620 Lake City Vall Buckner, MO 64016	ey Road	RECEIVED	1
Phone Number	er:	(816) 392-5219		APR 1 8-2008	
	-	of the items checked		COMPLIANCE REVIEW OFFICE JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI	
	-	Certificate of Compl port Form	iance		_
Please return * * * * * * *			* * * * * * *	*****	****
TO: PURC	HASING	DEPARTMENT			
The firm show	vn above	is currently:			
	ince Pend		File	In Compliance Not Established	
Exempt Signed:	b	ntta sendore	Susp Form Othe	erwork Needed from pension/Expiration Date ns Sent To Company er e:	1176

David Davis, Delinquent Business Section, Collections Department

ŢÖ:

Teddy Ballard, CPPB, Senior Buyer, Purchasing Department FROM:

DATE: April 18, 2008

RE: Tax Clearance (Year 2007)

In accordance with County Ordinance #11, revised Ordinance #366, Paragraph 3.184, the Director of Finance and Purchasing requests the following companies and/or individual(s) be verified as being listed and assessed on the County tax rolls, and is no way delinquent on any taxes payable to the County.

Information needed: Type of tax due, amount of tax, and if account is paid or unpaid. (If account is unpaid, please include a printout of statement.) Place amount paid/amount due under type that applies.

NAME	ADDRESS	PD	BUSINESS DOLLARS	MERCHANT DOLLARS	INDIV. DOLLARS	REAL ESTATE DOLLARS
Thomas Bruce Mershon	3620 NW Bluejacket Lees Summit, MO 64064	7				8t C67 35
Clinton Sapp	34808 E Drinkwater Lone Jack, MO 64070	×			27 to 2	
Dan and Tom Stack	1620 Lake City Valley Road Buckner, MO 64016		\$ 922.42			
					[#	
/						

ľ