REQUEST FOR LEGISLATIVE ACTION

Version 6/10/19
Completed by County Counselor’s Office:
Res/@ml No.: 20639

Sponsor(s):  Theresa Cass Galvin
Date: IMaiRch®22s i
T Action Requested
X Resolution
1 Ordinance
and the Parks + Recreation Demn_nents fo J&A Traffic Signs of Blue Springs, MO; Newman Sx ns of
Jamestown, ND and Vulcan Signs of Foley, AL: under the Terms and Conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 53-20.
BUDGET
INFORMATION Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year: N/A
To be completed Amount previously authorized this fiscal year: N/A
By Requesting Total amount authorized after this legislative action: N/A
Department and Amount budgeted for this item * (including transfers): N/A
Finance Source of funding (name of fund) and account code number:
N/A

* If account includes additional funds for other expenses, total budgeted in the account is: §
OTHER FINANCIAL INFORMATION:

The award is on an “as needed” basis and does not obligate Jackson County, Missouri to pay any specific
amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual appropriations.

(] No budget impact (no fiscal note required)
X Term and Supply Contract (funds approved in the annual budget); estimated value and use of contract;

Department: Estimated Use:
Public Works — Road & Bridge $100,000
Parks + Recreation ‘ $17,000
Total $117,000

Prior Year Budget (if applicable): N/A
Prior Year Actual Amount Spent (if applicable): N/A

PRIOR Prior ordinances and (date): N/A

LEGISLATION Prior resolutions and (date): 18812 (April 27, 2015)

CONTACT

INFORMATION | RLA drafted by (name, title, & phone): Keith E. Allen, Senior Buyer, 816-881-3465

REQUEST Public Works and Parks + Rec requires a Term and Supply Contract to obtain Traffic Signs and Supplies on a as
SUMMARY needed basis. The Purchasing Department issued Invitation to Bid No. 53-20 to meet those requirements.

A total of 39 notifications were distributed with six responses received and the three best lowest bids are as
follows:

Item | Description J&A
No. Traffic | Newman | Vulcan
. Products | Signs Signs |

1% Fresh Oil Sign, 36” x 36”, W21-2AH $55.00 $31.92 | $31.95
2% No Parking Sign, 12” x 18”, R7-1A $12.00 $6.75 $6.26
3 Stop Sign, 36” x 36”, R1-1 $55.00 .| $32.53 | $33.26
4. No Passing Zone, 36” x 48” x 487, W14-3 $40.00 | $21.20 | $36.64
5 Large Arrow, 24” x 487, W1-7 $50.00 | $32.45 | $28.40
6. Road Closed, 48” x 30”, R11-2 $57.50 $34.80 | $35.50
T Men Working, 36” x 36", W21-1AH $55.00 $32.96 | $31.95
8. Speed Plate, 18” x 187, W13-1 $14.50 $11.46 | $9.15




9. Orange Sign w/ Black Boards, 36” x 36”7, W41-2 $55.00 $32.96 | $31.95
10. Do Not Pass, 24” x 30”, R4-1 $35.00 $19.74 | $17.75
11. Speed Limit, 24” x 307, R2-1 $35.00 $19.74 | $17.75
12 Street Name Signs, 9” x 30”, blanks, covered on

one side with High Intensity grade sheeting, no

border. Sheeting Color: White $14.00 $8.37 | $8.24
13. Street Name Signs, 9” x 48”, blanks, covered on

one side with High Intensity grade sheeting, no

border. Sheeting Color: White $18.95 $11.75 | $13.15
14. Yellow Signs w/ Black Border, 36” x 36”7, W41-1 $55.00 | $31.82 | $31.95
JiS; White Signs w/ Black Border, 36” x 36” $55.00 $31.82 | $31.95
16. Type 1 Barricade, 36” x 127, Plastic $37.50 $48.74 | No Bid
57k Type A Flashers $16.00 $13.50 | No Bid
18. 6 Volt Batteries for Flashers $4.50 $15.22 | NoBid
19. Road Closed, 48” x 48”, Leave 3" Line Blank,

MO State Code Number, W020-3 $87.50 $64.66 | $56.80
20. Road Closed Ahead, 48” x 48”, MO State Code

Number, W025-1 $87.50 $64.66 | $56.80
21k Tubing, 2” x 2” x 12’, 14-gauge square perforated

tubing_,_galvanized, hot dipped $22.50 $25.39 $30.42
293 Base (anchor), 2 /47 x 2 %4” x 3°, 12-gauge base,

galvanized, hot dipped $9.90 $10.40 | $11.04
780 Corner bolt for item 26 base $0.50 $0.40 | NoBid
24. Traffic Cone, 287, 7 Ib., solid orange, one piece

with one 6” reflective 3M collar and one 4”

reflective 3M collar $17.95 $14.10 | $16.73
25. Angle Tron Type III Barricades with 3-4” striped

boards and angle iron uprights and feet, boards

with orange/white reflective sheeting $225.00 | $217.35 | NoBid
26. Angle Iron Type III Barricades with 3-6 striped

boards and angle iron uprights and feet, boards

with orange/white reflective sheeting $225.00 | $261.33 | NoBid
27. Catalog Discount j 50% N/A N/A

Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, the Public Works Department and the Parks +

Recreation Department recommend a split award of the furnishing of Traffic Signs & Supplies to J & A Traffic
Products of Blue Springs, MO; Newman Signs of Jamestown, ND and Vulcan Signs of Foley, AL under the

terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 55-20 as the lowest and best bids received.

This award is made on an “as needed” basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount.
The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual appropriations.

CLEARANCE

X Tax Clearance Completed (Purchasing & Department)

[C] Business License Verified (Purchasing & Department)

X Chapter 6 Compliance - Affirmative Action/Prevailing Wage (County Auditor’s Office)
COMPLIANCE

[] MBE Goals

[] WBE Goals No Goals Assigned

(] VBE Goals
ATTACHMENTS

The Abstract of Bids, the Award Recommendations from Jim Evans, Public Works Road & Bridge

Administrator; John Johnson, Superintendent Park Operations, Parks + Recreation Department and the pertinent

pages of the recommended Bidder’s bid documents.




REVIEW

Department Director: B Ob C rutsin g er Digitally signed by Bob Crutsinger Date:

Date: 2021.03.03 16:23:22 -06'00"
Finance (Budget Approval): APPROVED Date:
If applicable By Mark Lang at 9:56 am, Mar 12, 2021
Division Manager: R rmiyee Date:

Sylvya J. Stevenson smetentom i "
Seen s s oo

County Counselor’s Office: (\ MA/Q Date:
ﬁm\\w; B4 ) 3/19/0‘19&(

Fiscal Information (to be verified by Budget Office in Finance Department)

O
O

This expenditure was included in the annual budget.

Funds for this were encumbered from the Fund in

There is a balance otherwise unencumbered to the credit of the appropriation to which the expenditure

is chargeable and there is a cash balance otherwise unencumbered in the treasury to the credit of the fund from which
payment is to be made each sufficient to provide for the obligation herein authorized.

Funds sufficient for this expenditure will be/were appropriated by Ordinance #

Funds sufficient for this appropriation are available from the source indicated below.

Account Number: Account Title: Amount Not to Exceéd:

This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of
funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as each using agency places its order.

This legislative action does not impact the County financially and does not require Finance/Budget approval.




Bid No: 53-20

no:.:.onfuq_.m.ﬁnupm:u%a
Vendor: J&A 43%@._"8@:3

Bid Recap Quote
{REQUIRED SUBMITTALS Yes/No Item # Item Name Amount
Contract Signed Yes 1.0 Fresh Oil Sign, 36” x 36, W21-2AH $55.00
Affidavit Yes 2.0 No Parking Sign, 12” x 187, R7-1A $12.00
Compliance Review Yes 3.0 Stop Sign, 36” x 36", R1-1 $55.00
Certificate of Compliance Yes 4.0 No Passing Zone, 36” x 48” x 48”, W14-3 $40.00
Statement of Contractor's Qualification Yes 5.0 Large Arrow, 24” x 487, W1-7 550.00
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda Yes 6.0 Road Closed., 48” x 30”, R11-2 $57.50
Bidder's Quote Yes 7.0 Men Working, 36” x 36", W21-1AH $55.00
Bidder's Exceptions N/A 8.0 Speed Plate, 18” x 18”, W13-1 $14.50
9.0 Orange Sign w/ Black Boards, 36” x 367, W41-2 $55.00
10.0  {Do Not Pass, 24” x 30”, R4-1 $35.00
11.0 Speed Limit, 24” x 30”, R2-1 $35.00
12.0 _|Strect Name Signs, 9” x 30", blanks, covered on one side with High I ity grade sheeting. no border. Sheeting Color: White $14.00
13.0 |Street Name Signs, 9" x 48", blanks, covered on one side with High I ity grade sheeting, no border. Sheeting Color: White $18.95
Contracts: See attachment 14.0 _ |Yellow Signs w/ Black Border. 36” x 367, W4l-1 $55.00
15.0 | White Signs w/ Black Border, 36” x 36” $55.00
16.0  |Type 1 Bamicade, 36” x 127, Plastic $37.50
17.0 _ {Type A Flashers $16.00
18.0 |6 Volt Batteries for Flashers $4.50
References: See attachment 19.0 |Road Closed, 48” x 48", Leave 3" Line Blank, MO State Code Number, W020-3 $87.50
20.0 |Road Closed Ahead, 48” x 48, MO State Code Number, W025-1 $87.50
21.0  |Tubing, 27 x 2" x 12’, 14-gauge square perforated tubing, galvanized, hot dipped $22.50
22.0  |Base (anchor), 2 '4” x 2 %" x 3°, 12-gauge base, galvanized, hot dipped $9.90
23.0  |Comner bolt for item 26 base $0.50
24.0  |Traffic Cone, 28", 7 Ib., solid orange, one piece with one 6” reflective 3M collar and one 4” reflective 3M collar $17.95
25.0 _ |Angle Iron Type IIl Barricades with 3-4” striped boards and angle iron uprights and feet, boards with orange/white reflective sheeting $225.00
26.0  |Angle Iron Type I1I Barricades with 3-6° striped boards and angle iron uprights and feet, boards with orange/white reflective sheeting $225.00
27.0  |Catalog Discount 50%

Comments:




Bid No: 53-20

Commodity: Traffic Signs & Supplies

Vendor: Newman Signs
Bid Recap Quote

IREQUIRED SUBMITTALS Yes/No Item # Item Name Amount
Contract Signed Yes 1.0 Fresh Oil Sign, 36” x 367, W21-2AH $31.92
Affidavit Yes 2.0 No Parking Sign. 12”7 x 18", R7-1A 56.75
Compliance Review Yes 3.0 Stop Sign, 36” x 36”, R1-1 $32.53
Certificate of Compliance No 4.0 No Passing Zone, 36” x 48" x 48", W14-3 $21.20
Statement of Contractor's Qualification Yes 5.0 Large Arrow, 24” x 487, W1-7 $32.45
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda Yes 6.0 Road Closed, 487 x 30", R11-2 $34.80
Bidder's Quote Yes 7.0 Men Working, 36™ x 36”7, W21-1AH $32.96
—.W der's Exceptions No 8.0 Speed Plate, 18" x 18”7, W13-1 $11.46
9.0 |Orange Sign w/ Black Boards, 36” x 36", W41-2 $32.96

10.0 Do Not Pass, 24” x 30", R4-1 $19.74

110 |Speed Limit, 24" x 30", R2-1 $19.74
12.0 _ fStreet Name Signs, 9" x 30", blanks, covered on one side with High Intensity grade sheeting. no border. Sheeting Color: White $8.37

13.0  |Street Name Signs, 9" x 48", blanks, covered on one side with High Intensity grade sheeting, no border. Sheeting Color: White $11.75

Contracts: See attachment 14.0 | Yellow Signs w/ Black Border, 36” x 36”, W41-1 $31.82
15.0 |White mmh.:w w/ Black Border, 36” x 36” 31.82

16.0 |Type | Barricade, 36” x 12", Plastic $48.74

17,0 |Type A Flashers $13.50

18.0 |6 Volt Batteries for Flashers $15.22

References: See attachment 19.0  |Road Closed, 48” x 48", Leave 3" Line Blank, MO State Code Number, W020-3 $64.66
20,0 |Road Closed Ahead, 48" x 48”, MO State Code Number, W025-1 $64.66

210 |Tubing, 2" x 2" x 12°; 14-gauge square perforated tubing, galvanized, hot dipped $25.38

22,0 |Base (anchor), 2 V4" x 2 /4" x 3°, 12-gauge base, mm?w:ioa. hot dipped $10.40
23.0 |Corner bolt for item 26 base $0.40

24.0 |Traffic Cone, 28", 7 Ib.. solid orange, one piece with one 6” reflective 3M collar and one 4” reflective 3M collar 514.10

25.0 _|Angle Iron Type 1] Barricades with 3-4" striped boards and angle iron uprights and feet, boards with orange/white reflective sheetin; $217.35

26.0 |Angle Iron Type 111 Barricades with 3-6’ striped boards and angle iron uprights and feet, boards with orange/white reflective sheetin, $261.33

27.0 |Caralog Discount No Bid

Comments:




Bid No: 53-20

Commodity: Traffic Signs & Supplies

Vendor: Vulcan Signs
Bid Recap Quote
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS Yes/No Item # Item Name Amount
Contract Signed Yes 1.0 Fresh Oil Sign, 36” x 36", W21-2AH $31.95
Affidavit Yes 2.0 No Parking Sign, 12” x 18”, R7-1A $6.26
Compliance Review No 3.0 Stop Sign, 36” x 36", R1-1 $33.26
Certificate of Compliance No 4.0 No Passing Zone, 36” x 48” x 48”. W14-3 $36.64
Statement of Contractor's Qualification Yes 5.0 Large Arrow, 24 x 487, W1-7 $28.40
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda Yes 6.0 Road Closed, 48" x 30”, R11-2 $35.50
Bidder's Quote Yes 7.0 Men Working, 36” x 36", W21-1AH $31.95
Bidder's Exceptions Yes 8.0 Speed Plate, 18” x 187, W13-1 $9.15
9.0 Orange Sign w/ Black Boards, 36” x 367, W41-2 $31.95
10.0 Do Not Pass, 24” x 30”, R4-1 $17.75
11.0  |Speed Limit, 24” x 30", R2-1 $17.75
12.0  |Street Name Signs, 9” x 30”, blanks, covered on one side with High [ntensity grade sheeting, no border. Sheeting Color: White $8.24
13.0  |Street Name Signs, 9" x 48”, blanks, covered on one side with High Intensity grade sheeting, no border. Sheeting Color: White $13.15
Contracts: See attachment 14.0 | Yellow Signs w/ Black Border, 36" x 367, W41-1 $31.95
15.0 | White Signs w/ Black Border, 36” x 36 $31.95
16.0  |Type 1 Barricade, 36” x 127, Plastic No Bid
17.0  |Type A Flashers No Bid
18.0 |6 Volt Batteries for Flashers No Bid
References: See attachment 19.0  |Road Closed, 48” x 48”, Leave 3" Line Blank, MO State Code Number, W020-3 $56.80
20.0 Road Closed Ahead, 48" x 48”, MO State Code Number, W025-1 $56.80
21.0  |Tubing, 2” x 2 x 12°, 14-gauge square perforated tubing, galvanized, hot dipped $30.42
22.0 _ |Base (anchor), 2 4 x 2 ' x 3°, 12-gauge base, galvanized, hot dipped $11.04
23.0  |Comer bolt for item 26 base No Bid
24.0 |Traffic Cone, 287, 7 Ib,, solid orange, one piece with one 6” reflective 3M collar and one 4” reflective 3M collar $16.73
25.0  |Angle Iron Type [1I Barricades with 3-4° striped boards and angle iron uprights and feet, boards with orange/white reflective sheeting No Bid
26.0  |Angle Iron Type I1I Barricades with 3-6” striped boards and angle iron uprights and feet, boards with orange/white reflective sheeting No Bid
27.0 |Catalog Discount 0%

Comments:




N/ * ROAD MAINTENANCE 34900 E. Old US 40 Hwy, P.O. Box 160
* 41/85 O\)@ Wy

x Grain Valley, Missouri 64029
o (816) 847-7050 phone
MEMORANDEM (816) 847-7051 fax
TO: Keith E. Allen, Finance and Purchasing Department

FROM: Jim Evans Road & Bridge Administrator
DATE: February 23, 2021

Subject: ITB-#53-20 Traffic Signs & Supplies

Please consider J& A Traffic Signs & Supplies, Vulcan Signs and Newman Signs as a term and supply
vendors to provide sign supplies for the County.

J & A Traffic Signs & Supplies, Vulcan Signs and Newman Signs have the sign materials the Road & Bridge
Division needs to fulfill statuary obligations.

It is estimated that the County could spend approximately $100,000.00 annually.

For the reasons above it has been requested that ) & A Signs & Supplies, Vulcan Signs and Newman Signs
be awarded the term and supply for Bid No ITB #53-20 for Sign and supplies.

X2 T
\x@ns, Road & Bridge Administrator




*

Administration
Historic Sites
Ranger Station
Leisure Services
(816) 503-4800
Fax (816) 795-1234

Kemper Outdoor
Education Center
(816) 229-8980

Fred Arbanas

Golf Course at
Longview Lake
(816) 761-9445

Blue Springs Marina
(816) 795-1112

Jacomo Marina
(816) 795-8888

Longview Marina
(816) 966-0131

Special Population
Services
(816) 763-5130

JACKSON COUNTY

Parks + Rec

22807 Woods Chapel Road
Blue Springs, Missouri 64015
Wwww jacksongov.org

MEMORANDUM

TO: Keith Allen, Senior Buyer
FROM: John Johnson, Superintendent Park Operations
DATE: February 4, 2021

SUBJECT: Bid No. 53-20 — “Traffic Signs and Supplies”

The Parks Department recommendation is to award the bid to multiple
vendors. They are: J&A Traffic Signs, Vulcan Signs and Newman Signs.
This allows Parks to use the vendor that is lowest and/or that can provide what
is needed the quickest, if time is of the essence. Having multiple suppliers also
helps protect against a sole provider not having what is needed available to
ship.

Our projected usage during the next twelve months is $ 17,000.

003 — 1602 - 57420 - $10,000

003 —-3601 — 57420 - $1,000

003 — 1609 — 57420 - $1,000

003 - 1608 — 57420 - $5,000 (dependent upon budget approval)

Frank White Jr., County Executive



ABSTRACT OF BIDS

Invitation to Bid No. 53-20 Kansas City Tim George | Vuican i'!gps | J&A Igﬁg ‘Chase Win Winegar | Kurt Barkus
_ Traffic Signs and Supplies Sign Co. “Custom Foley, AL Producs Lightle Newman Signs
Opons 2:00 PM, CDT on 11/10/2020 - Products Corp | | Biue Springs | Enterprises Jamestown, ND
e = ‘Flowood, MS MO | Frankfort, OH |
NO | DESCRIPTION AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT_ AMOUNT _ | AMOUNT

1|Fresh Ol Sign, 36" x 36", W21-2AH__
2\No Parking Sign, 12" x 18", R7-1A _
3iStopS|gn 36" x 36", R1-1
4 No Passing Zone, 36" x 48" x 48", W14-3
_5iLarge Amow, 24" x 48", W1-7
__6/Road Closed, 48" x 30", R11-2

__7{Men Working, 36" x 36", W21-1AH

8 Speed Plate, 18" x 18", W13-1

9Orange Sign w/ Black Boards, 36" x 36", W41-2
~10{00 Not Pass, 24" x 307, R4-1

i

11, Speed Limit, 24" x 30", R2-1

Street Name Signs, 9" x 30", blanks, covered on one |
12|side with High Intensity grade sheeting, no border.
Sheeting Color: White

!Street Name Signs, 9" x 48", bianks, covered on one
13, side with High Intensity grade sheeting, no border.
Sheetmg Color: White

__14 Yellow Signs w/ Black Border, 36" x 36", W41-1

195,38

R332

éiooi

| 10438
/ 7510 |

|
15 White Signs w/ Black Border, 36" x 36"

16 Type 1 Barricade, 36" x 12", Plastic
¥

17 Type AFlashers
- 18 6 Vit Batteries for Flashers

|Road Closed, 48" x 48", Leave ard Line Blank, MO |

19‘Shtesedwgm99r; W020-3 -

Road Closed Ahead, 48" x 48", MO State Code
20 Number, W025-1

Tubing, 2" x 2" x 12, 14-gauge square perforated
21 tubing, galvanized, hot dipped

'Base (anchor), 2 14" x 2 1/4" x 3', 12-gauge base,
‘n‘ngan&ed hot dipped

23/Corner bolt for itern 26 base }
{Traffic Cone, 28", 7 Ib., solid orange, one piece with
one 6" reflective 3M collar and one 4" reflective 3M

24 collar
Angle Iron Type Il Barricade with 3-4' striped boards
and angle iron uprights and feet, boards with

25 orangelwhite reflective sheeting
Angle Iron Tupe 3-6' striped boards and angle iron
uprights and feet, boards with orange/white reflective

26 sheeting

27 Catalog Discount
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Jackson County Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 53-20

Page 15 of 22

Item | Description Unit Price
No.
1. Fresh Qil Sign, 36” x 36”, W21-2AH $§ 55.e0
2. No Parking Sign, 12” x 187, R7-1A $ (2.00
3. Stop Sign, 36” x 36”, R1-1 $ §6.00
4, No Passing Zone, 36” x 48” x 48”, W14-3 $ HO.©°
5. Large Arrow, 24” x 48”7, W1-7 $ S0.°°
6. Road Closed, 48” x 30”, R11-2 $ S.5°
7. Men Working, 36 x 367, W21-1AH $§ SS.00
8. Speed Plate, 18” x 18”, W13-1 $ 1¢.80
9. Orange Sign w/ Black Boards, 36” x 36”, W41-2 $ Ss.0°
10. Do Not Pass, 24” x 30”, R4-1 § 26.¢0
11. Speed Limit, 24” x 307, R2-1 § BS.e°
12. Street Name Signs, 9” x 307, blanks, covered on one side with High Intensity $
grade sheeting, no border. Sheeting Color: White \Y.o®
13. Street Name Signs, 9” x 48”, blanks, covered on one side with High Intensity $
grade sheeting, no border. Sheeting Color: White 18.95
14, Yellow Signs w/ Black Border, 36” x 36”, W41-1 $ SSoe
15. White Signs w/ Black Border, 36” x 36” § SS.0°
16. Type 1 Barricade, 36” x 12”, Plastic $ 37.52
17. Type A Flashers $ Lb.o°
18. 6 Volt Batteries for Flashers $ 4.s5o
19. Road Closed, 48 x 48”, Leave 3™ Line Blank, MO State Code Number, W020-3 [ § ®%.S®
20. Road Closed Ahead, 48” x 48”, MO State Code Number, W025-1 $§ &7.So
21. Tubing, 2” x 2” x 12°, 14-gauge square perforated tubing, galvanized, hot dipped | § 2.2..8®
22. Base (anchor), 2 %" x 2 ¥ x 3°, 12-gauge base, galvanized, hot dipped $ 940
23. Corner bolt for item 26 base $§ S0
24. Traffic Cone, 28”, 7 Ib., solid orange, one piece with one 6” reflective 3M collar | §
and one 4” reflective 3M collar 11.85
25. Angle Iron Type III Barricades with 3-4” striped boards and angle iron uprights $
and feet, boards with orange/white reflective sheeting 125,00
26. Angle Iron Type III Barricades with 3-6’ striped boards and angle iron uprights | §
and feet, boards with orange/white reflective sheeting Z2s.e
27. Catalog Discount So %
8.1 The County will require a published Catalog with pricing for its reference; the price shall be a net price calculated
by taking the quoted percentage form the Contractor’s catalog price.
8.2 Percentage Discount cannot change over the course of the contract or any of its extensions.
8.3 If the bidder’s catalog is on-line; bidder must provide website address with the bid.
8.4

All Catalogs must have pﬁciyf be accompanied by pricing sheets to be considered for award.

¥ ]

SIGNATUR;%AM— pate: [0 LI loro

NAME:  JZF fMnwtrren (Print or Type) | PHONE: ¥ -2 20~ O/

trte:  YE PW 5‘/%44 4 (Print or Type) | CELL. S/ €-392 -6 725
COMPANY NAME- T ) ﬂ /%M < /%J‘& C(/{i)ﬁ (Print or Tyne) | FAX: /ﬁl/ fA ,724 ’K/ 77
EMAIL ADDRESS: //W//‘C%Q/’/? {‘ll/% f/’J "l (Print or Type)

WEB ADDRESS: Lyt ﬁ’& /. €y nn ) (Print or Type)
174




Jackson County Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 53-20

Page 15 of 22
Item | Description Unit Price
No.
1. Fresh Qil Sign, 36” x 36”, W21-2AH $ 3195
2. No Parking Sign, 12” x 18”, R7-1A $ 6.26
3. Stop Sign, 36” x 36”, R1-1 $ 13376
4, No Passing Zone, 36” x 48” x 48", W14-3 $ 13664
5. Large Arrow, 24” x 487, W1-7 $ 2840
6. Road Closed, 48” x 30”, R11-2 $ 3550
7. Men Working, 36” x 36”, W21-1AH $ 3195
8. Speed Plate, 18” x 18, W13-1 $§ 0915
9. Orange Sign w/ Black Boards, 36” x 36”, W41-2 $ 3195
10. Do Not Pass, 24 x 30”, R4-1 $ 17275
11. Speed Limit, 24” x 30”, R2-1 $ 1775
12, Street Name Signs, 9” x 30”, blanks, covered on one side with High Intensity $
grade sheeting, no border. Sheeting Color: White 8.24
13. Street Name Signs, 9” x 48”, blanks, covered on one side with High Intensity $
grade sheeting, no border. Sheeting Color: White 13.15
14. Yellow Signs w/ Black Border, 36” x 367, W41-1 $ 3195
15. White Signs w/ Black Border, 36” x 36” $ 13105
16. Tvpe 1 Barricade, 36” x 127, Plastic $ Ay
17. Type A Flashers $ N'I%
18. 6 Volt Batteries for Flashers $ N/B
19. Road Closed, 48” x 48”, Leave 3™ Line Blank, MO State Code Number, W020-3 | §  56.80
20. Road Closed Ahead, 48” x 48”, MO State Code Number, W025-1 $ 56.80
21. Tubing, 2” x 2” x 12°, 14-gauge square perforated tubing, galvanized, hotdipped | §  30.42
22. Base (anchor), 2 '4” x 2 4™ x 3°, 12-pauge base, palvanized, hot dipped $ 11.04
23. Comer bolt for item 26 base $ NIB
24, Traffic Cone, 28", 7 1b., solid orange, one piece with one 6” reflective 3M collar | $
and one 4” reflective 3M collar 16.73
25. Angle Iron Type III Barricades with 3-4 striped boards and angle iron uprights | $
and feet, boards with orange/white reflective sheeting N/B
26. Angle Iron Type III Barricades with 3-6’ striped boards and angle iron uprights | §
and feet, boards with orange/white reflective sheeting N/B
27. Catalog Discount 0 %
8.1 The County will require a published Catalog with pricing for its reference; the price shall be a net price calculated
by taking the quoted percentage form the Contractor’s catalog price.
8.2 Percentage Discount cannot change over the course of the contract or any of its extensions.
8.3 If the bidder’s catalog is on-line; bidder must provide website address with the bid.
8.4 All Catalogs must have pricing or be accompanied by pricing sheets to be considered for award.
TN /
W\ DATE: 10/13/2020
| NAME: David B. Beviacqua % (Print or Type) | PHONE: 800-633-6845
' TITLE: General Manager & (Print or Type) | CELL: o »
__COMPANY NAME: Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan Signs (Print or Type) | FAX: 251-943-1544

_EMAIL ADDRESS: vulcan3@vulcaninc.com

WEB ADDRESS: www.vuicaninc.com (Print or Type)
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Item | Description Unit Price
No. R
1. Fresh Oil Sign, 36” x 36, W21-2AH $ 372
2, No Parking Sign, 12” x 18”, R7-1A $ 675
3. Stop Sign, 36” x 36”, R1-1 § BRes3
4, No Passing Zone, 36” x 48” x 48”, W14-3 $ 2,20
5. Large Arrow, 24” x 48”, W1-7 $ 3a.y5
6. Road Closed, 48” x 30”, R11-2 $ Y30
7. Men Working, 36” x 36”, W21-1AH $ 3292
8. Speed Plate, 18” x 187, W13-1 $ /LY.L
9. Orange Sign w/ Black Boards, 36” x 367, W41-2 $ 3a.7L
10. Do Not Pass, 24” x 30”, R4-1 $ /2.2Y
1L Speed Limit, 24” x 30”, R2-1 $ 17924
12. Street Name Signs, 9” x 30”, blanks, covered on one side with High Intensity $

grade sheeting, no border. Sheeting Color: White <. 27
13. Street Name Signs, 9” x 48”, blanks, covered on one side with High Intensity $

ade sheeting, no border. Sheeting Color: White I 25

14. Yellow Signs w/ Black Border, 36” x 36”, W41-1 $ 382
15. White Signs w/ Black Border, 36” x 36” $§3)Fa
16. Type 1 Barricade, 36” x 12”, Plastic $ yy 7Y
17. Type A Flashers $ }3,50
18. 6 Volt Batteries for Flashers $/s.aa
19. Road Closed, 48” x 48”, Leave 3" Line Blank, MO State Code Number, W020-3 | $ bYl L
20. Road Closed Ahead, 48” x 48”, MO State Code Number, W025-1 $ Lyl
21, Tubing, 2” x 2” x 12°, 14-gauge square perforated tubing, galvanized, hot dipped | $ 25,39
22. Base (anchor), 2 %" x 2 14” x 3°, 12-gauge base, galvanized, hot dipped $ /o.yo
23, Corner bolt for item 26 base $§ Y40
24, Traffic Cone, 28”, 7 Ib., solid orange, one piece with one 6” reflective 3M collar | $

and one 4” reflective 3M collar / %70
25. Angle Iron Type III Barricades with 3-4’ striped boards and angle iron uprights | $

and feet, boards with orange/white reflective sheeting 2 / Z ;5
26. Angle Iron Type II Barricades with 3-6” striped boards and angle iron uprights | $ z 4 / 7 3

and feet, boards with orange/white reflective sheeting .
27. Catalog Discount NIA %

8.1 The County will require a published Catalog with pricing for its reference; the price shall be a net price calculated

by taking the quoted percentage form the Contractor’s catalog price.

8.2 Percentage Discount cannot change over the course of the contract or any of its extensions.

8.3 If the bidder’s catalog is on-line; bidder must provide website address with the bid.

84 All Catalogs must have pricing or be accompanied by pricing sheets to be considered for award.
SIGNATURE: ‘m Ao / M DATE: // / b/o'l 0
nave: Marea 3 /Au 501 (Print or Type) | PHONE: R00)-Y37- 772720
mme. Sqles RQ,#fes-ard“a,"'; ve (Printor Type) | CELL: W/A
COMPANY NAME:  Nwman Smxs, T & (Print or Type) | FAX: 70/-254- 9413
EMAIL ADDRESS:  S2/eS¥ € Netwmanssens. /om (Print or Type)

WEB ADDRESS: \Ayuoud, NewmLAsen S, {0 mM (Print or Type)




