### IN THE COUNTY LEGISLATURE OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI

**AN ORDINANCE** appropriating \$33,718.00 from the fund balance of the 2010 General Fund for use by the Circuit Court to cover special prosecutor's fees.

**ORDINANCE #4280,** December 13, 2010

INTRODUCED BY James D. Tindall, County Legislator

WHEREAS, by order of the Circuit Court, special prosecutors are appointed to handle the prosecution of particular cases, most often when the Prosecuting Attorney's Office has a conflict of interest in the matter; and,

WHEREAS, special prosecutor Charles H. McKenzie has submitted an invoice in the amount of \$52,000.00 for special prosecutor fees which have been found to be reasonable and necessary by order of the Circuit Court; and,

WHEREAS, the budget line item for Special Prosecution has a current balance of \$18,282.00 and an appropriation is necessary to cover the costs in excess of that amount; and,

WHEREAS, the County Executive recommends said appropriation; now therefore,

BE IT ORDAINED by the County Legislature of Jackson County, Missouri, that the following appropriation be and hereby is made:

DEPARTMENT/DIVISION	CHARACTER/DESCRIPTION	FROM	<u>TO</u>
General Fund Special Prosecution			
•	Undesignated Fund Balance	\$33,718	
001-8004	56020 - Legal Services	•	\$33,718

Effective Date: This ordinance shall be effective immediately upon its signature by the County Executive.

APPROVED AS TO FOR	RM:	_
JMD. Hulln Cflief Deputy County Cou	unselor	Acting County Counselor
I hereby certify th December 13, 2010, wa Jackson County Legislatu	as duly passed on	dinance, Ordinance #4280 introduced on <u>Pleember 3</u> , 2010 by the on were as follows:
Yeas	_	Nays
Abstaining	)	Absent 3
This Ordinance is hereby	transmitted to the Co	ounty Executive for his signature.
12.13.10		MarypSpino
Date		Mary Jo Spino, Clerk of Legislature
hereby approve the attac	ched Ordinance #428	80.
12 13 2010 Date (13 2010		Michael D. Sanders, County Executive
Funds sufficient for this ap	opropriation are avail	lable from the source indicated below.
ACCOUNT NUMBER: ACCOUNT TITLE:	001 2810 General Fund	N Palanaa
NOT TO EXCEED: Desimber 820	Undesignated Fund \$33,718.00	Dalance ( ) ( ) ( ) ( ) ( ) ( ) ( ) ( ) ( ) (
Date	<b>₹</b> 0.	Director of Finance and Purchasing

# REQUEST FOR LEGISLATIVE ACTION

Sponsor(s): Date:

James D. Tindall

December 13, 2010

SUBJECT	Action Requested Resolution Ordinance  Project/Title: Appropriating \$33,718 from the general five Prosecutor fees pay a special prosecutor fee to Charles H								
BUDGET INFORMATION To be completed By Requesting Department and Finance	Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year: Amount previously authorized this fiscal year: Total amount authorized after this legislative action: Amount budgeted for this item * (including transfers): Source of funding (name of fund) and account code number; FROM / TO 001 2810 General Fund Undesignated Fund Balance	\$33,718 \$40,000 \$73,718 FROM ACCT 001 2810 General Fund Undesignated Fund Balance TO ACCT 001 8004 Special Prosecutor Fund							
	* If account includes additional funds for other expenses, total budgete OTHER FINANCIAL INFORMATION:  No budget impact (no fiscal note required) Term and Supply Contract (funds approved in the an Department: Estimated Use: \$  Prior Year Budget (if applicable): \$0.00 Prior Year Actual Amount Spent (if applicable): \$35,512	nnual budget); estimated value and use of contract:							
PRIOR LEGISLATION	Prior ordinances and (date):  Prior resolutions and (date):								
CONTACT INFORMATION	RLA drafted by (name, title, & phone): Shelley Kneuvea	an, Deputy Chief Administrative Officer							
REQUEST SUMMARY	Per court order, the county is directed to pay the special prosecutor fees to Charles McKenzie for handling the prosecution of a case in which the Jackson County Prosecutor's Office had a conflict of interest.								
CLEARANCE	☐ Tax Clearance Completed (Purchasing & Departmen ☐ Business License Verified (Purchasing & Departmen ☐ Chapter 6 Compliance - Affirmative Action/Prevailing	nt)							
ATTACHMENTS	Court Order								

REVIE	W	Department Director:			Date:
		Finance (Budget Approv If applicable	val): Valv Ball,		Date: 17-6-2010
	i	Division Manager:			Date: 12/8/10
		County Counselor's Off	ice:		Date:
<u>Fiscal</u>	Informatio	on (to be verified by B	Sudget Office in Finance Depar	rtment)	
	This expend	diture was included in the	annual budget.		
	Funds for the	nis were encumbered from	the	_Fund in	
	is chargeab	le and there is a cash balar	nbered to the credit of the appropriat nce otherwise unencumbered in the t t to provide for the obligation herein	reasury to the credit of the	
	Funds suffic	cient for this expenditure	will be/were appropriated by Ordina	nce #	
$\boxtimes$	Funds suffic	cient for this appropriation	n are available from the source indica	ated below.	
	Account N	lumber:	Account Title:	Amount Not to Exceed:	
	001 2810 Balance	Undesignated Fund	Undesignated Fund Balance, General Fund	\$33,718	
			nd does not obligate Jackson County ecessity, be determined as each usin		t. The availability of

This legislative action does not impact the County financially and does not require Finance/Budget approval.

# Supplemental Appropriation Request Jackson County, Missouri

Funds sufficient for this transfer and appropriation are available from the source indicated below.

Date: December 6, 2010		xxRes/Ord I	No. <u>4280</u>
Department / Division	Character/Description	From	То
General Fund - 001			
2810	Undesignated Fund Balance	33,718.00	
8004 - Special Prosecution	56020 - Legal Services		33,718.00
·			
	<del>-,</del>		
			-
		<del></del>	
Netrah Ball 12-1 Budgeting	6-2010 Total		33,718.00

# Supplemental Appropriation Request Jackson County, Missouri

Funds sufficient for this transfer and appropriation are available from the source indicated below.

Date:	December 6, 2010		<sup>x</sup> <del>Res</del> ÿOrd No.	4280
Dep	partment / Division	Character/Description	From	То
General F	und - 001			
2810	<u> </u>	Undesignated Fund Balance	33,718.00	
8004 - Spe	cial Prosecution	56020 - Legal Services		33,718.00
	<u>.                                    </u>			
			<del></del>	
Aloka	196 Ball 12-7.	2010 Total		33,718.00

Budgeting

# IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI AT KANSAS CITY, MISSOURI

STATE OF MISSOURI

Plaintiff,

ADMIN. ORDER NO. 2010- icc

(Appting Admin Order No. 2008-016)

VS.

Case No: 0616-CR04880-01

Division 5, Presiding Judge

LARRY JONES

Defendant.

### ORDER FOR SPECIAL PROSECUTOR FEES

Now on this day, upon consideration of the Special Prosecutor's Invoice for special prosecutor fees in the above-captioned cause in the amount of \$52,000.00, and the Court finding that the fees are reasonable and necessary,

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that payment shall be made to Charles H. McKenzie, Special Prosecutor, in the amount of \$52,000.00 for special prosecutor fees.

IT IS SO ORDERED.

Dated: DECEMBER 3, 2010

W. STEPHEN NIXON,

Presiding Judge

Copies mailed/faxed December 3, 2009 to the following:

COURT ADMINISTRATOR

CHARLES H. MCKENZIE 4646 ROANOKE PARKWAY KANSAS CITY, MO 64112

/s/ Jessie James

Jessie James, Law Clerk, Division 5

## SPECIAL PROSECUTOR FEES APPROVAL FORM

Please review the attached invoice for special prosecutor fees and approve as submitted or modify.
Please return this form and any attached documents to Division 5.

Thank you.

CASE:

STATE OF MISSOURI v. LARRY JONES

0616-CR04880-01

TRIAL JUDGE:

Judge Daugherty

SPECIAL PROSECUTOR: Charles H. McKenzie

**REQUESTED FEE:** 

\$52,000.00

APPROVED AS SUBMITTED

MODIFIED FEE AMOUNT

The Honorable Jay A. Daugher

# IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI

STATE OF MISSO	URI	) DIVISION 13
	Plaintiff	)
		) Admin. Order #2008-016
	VS.	) CASE NO. 0616-CR04880-01
Larry Jones		)
	Defendant	)

# CIRCUIT COURT

## **MOTION FOR ATTORNEY FEES**

COMES NOW Special Prosecuting Attorney Charles H. McKenzie and pursuant to §56.130 R.S.Mo. requests payment of a reasonable fee for his services and the service of Special Investigator James Hess and a reimbursement of necessary expenses in the above-entitled cause. In support of this motion the Special Prosecuting Attorney provides the Court with the following suggestions in support thereof:

- 1. On February 15, 2008, the Court appointed Charles H. McKenzie as the Special Prosecuting Attorney pursuant to §56.110 R.S.Mo. on the above-entitled cause.
- 2. On April 16, 2008 James Hess was appointed an investigator for the Special Prosecutor.
- 3. In furtherance of his duties as Special Prosecutor, Charles. H. McKenzie and Special Investigator James Hess have spent numerous hours and advanced expenses in preparation for the prosecution of this case. A more detailed description of the time spent and expenses incurred is set out in Exhibit A attached.

- 4. Defendant has been found guilty in a trial of this case and was sentenced to 25 years in the Missouri Department of Corrections on September 2, 2010.
- 5. A fee of \$150.00 an hour while in trial and \$125.00 for all other time spent for the services provided by Special Prosecutor Charles H. McKenzie and \$60.00 an hour for the services of Special Investigator James Hess are reasonable and customary.

WHEREFORE for the following reasons Special Prosecuting Attorney Charles H. McKenzie hereby requests this Court grant this motion and enter judgment against Jackson County, Missouri in the amount of \$48,091.00 for services rendered and \$8,120.82 to reimburse expenses pursuant to \$56.130 R.S.Mo.

Respectfully submitted,

THE ACCURSO LAW FIRM A Professional Corporation

Charles H. McKenzie

#38647

4646 Roanoke Parkway Kansas City, MO 64112 816/561-3900 FAX/561-2992

SPECIAL PROSECUTING ATTORNEY

# Tabs3 Detail Work-In-Process Report The Accurso Law Firm, A Professional Corporation

imary Attorney: 2 Charles H. McKenzie

Contact: Opp. counsel Rober Calbi Office: 816-221-2400

Date	Atty	Cat Src	HTBR PXCC T	code _	Ref #	Rate	Units	Hours Worked	Hours to Bill	Write-Up/ Down Hrs	Amount	Write-Up/ Down Amt D	escription
es 02/07/2008	2 CHM	3		95	6	125.00		1.25	1.25		156.25		ravel to & from court, review court file, to w/
02/08/2008 02/13/2008	2 CHM 2 CHM	3 3		95 95	7 8	125.00 125.00		0.50 0.50	0.50 0.50		62.50 62.50	Я Т	uy. Review file 'C w/ Div. 13, Defen. attorney, draft case not. conference notice
02/21/2008 02/22/2008	2 CHM 2 CHM	3 3		95 95	9 10	125.00 125.00		2,50 1,25	2,50 1,25		312.50 156,25	R	igt. conference notice leview Police Report ravel to and from court and attended case
02/27/2008	2 CHM	3		95	11	125.00		0.50	0.50		62.50	Т	nanagement conference. C w/ Edward Gonzales and memo regarding onversation w/ him.
03/13/2008 03/28/2008	2 CHM 2 CHM	3 3		95 95	12 13	125.00 125.00		1.50 0.75	1.50 0.75		187.50 93.75	R	eviewed the file eview file
34/10/2008	2 CHM	3		95	14	125.00		1.50 2.00	1.50 2.00		187.50 250.00	R	eview File eview file, Tc w/ Mike Bradley travel to and
)4/14/2008	2 CHM 2 CHM	3 3		95 95	15 16	125.00 125.00		2.00	2.00		250.00	fro R	om courthouse, meet with Dustrina Smith eviewed file
)5/06/2008	2 CHM	3	,	95	17	125.00		1.00	1.00		125.00		c w/ Kawana S. West, TC w/ Det. Alane
)5/07/2008 )5/08/2008	2 CHM 2 CHM	3 3		95 95	18 19	125.00 125.00		0.25 0.25	0.25 0,25		31.25 31.25	TO TO	C w/ Det Everett Babcock & Bob Calbi C w/ Div. 13 & Det. Babcock, attempted TC / Kawanna West, TC w/ K. West
5/09/2008	2 CHM	3		95	20	125.00		2.00	2.00		250,00	Re	eview File
15/21/2008 16/09/2008	2 CHM 2 CHM	3 3		95 95	21 22	125.00 125.00		0.50 2.50	0.50 2.50		62.50 312,50	M	C w/ Dustrina Smith eet w/ victims family travel to and from ourthouse
6/09/2008 6/28/2008	2 CHM 2 CHM	3 3		95 95	23 24	125.00 125.00		0.25 0.25	0.25 0.25		31.25 31.25		etter to Bob Calbi JC's w/ Jamle Hess
6/30/2008	2 CHM	3	9	95	25	125.00		0.25	0,25		31.25	Er	nail from Hess, TC w/ Calbi
8/05/2008 8/05/2008	2 CHM 2 CHM	3		95 95	26 27	125.00 125.00		2.50 0.50	2.50 0.50		312.50 62.50	w/	tter to Calbi review file & new reports, conf.  Jamie Hess tter to Calbi, review file and new reports,
												co	nf. w/ Jamie Hess
3/13/2008 3/19/2008	2 CHM 2 CHM	3 3		95 95	1 2	125.00 125.00		0.50 1.00	0.50 1.00		62.50 125.00	TC De	eview of Marcus Stepheson Statement  & Email w/ Det Backcock, Review ot fendant's Statement , TCW/Det Kirtley & mie Hess
3/19/2008	2 CHM	3		)5	3	125.00		0.25	0.25		31.25	TO	w/ Bill Jackson
8/2 <b>0/2008</b> 8/ <b>27/2008</b>	2 CHM 2 CHM	3		15 15	4 5	125.00 125.00		0.25 1.75	0,25 1.75		31.25 218.75	Vie De bui	tter to Olmsead at Juvenile Court  wed Statements of Stephenson and the fendant, TC w/ Dr. Laboy, letter to Laboy, med CD of Morgue photos, reviewed
-/24/2008	2 CHM	3	9	5	29	125.00		2.25	2.25		281.25	Mo Tra We	orgue Photos. avel to & From, and meeting w/ Kawanna est
25/2008	2 CHM	3	9	5	28	125.00		1.00	1.00		125.00	Re	viewed Statement of Kawanna West & TC Calbi
/30/2008	2 CHM	3	98	5	31	125.00		1.75	1.75		218.75	TC crir	w/ Pros Nicole Mudd, travel to & from ne scene, inspect crime scene w/ Det. lley
2/03/2008	2 CHM	3	95	5	33	125,00		0.75	0.75		93.75	TC	w/ Dr. Laboy & Dr. Sharp's office conf w/ nie Hess, review medical records
2/08/2008 2/10/2008	2 CHM 2 CHM	3 3	95 95		34 35	125.00 125.00		0,25 0.25	0.25 0.25		31.25 31.25		ter to Dr. Laboy w/ Dr. Sharp
/22/2008	2 CHM	3	95	5 ;	36	125.00		1.00	1.00		125.00	2 T 2 T	C's w/ Div. 13, Draft App for continuance, C's w/ Bob Calbi
/05 <b>/2009</b> /1 <b>6/200</b> 9	2 CHM 2 CHM	3 3	95 95		37 38	125.00 125,00		0.25 0.25	0.25 0.25		31,25 31,25		w/ Div. 13, cont. w/ James Hess w/ Chase Higinbotham
20/2009	2 CHM	3	95	5 3	39	125.00		0.25	0.25		31.25	Lett	ter to Higinbothorn
/2 <b>7/20</b> 09 /29 <b>/2009</b>	2 CHM 2 CHM	3	95 95		40 41	125,00 125.00		0.50 0.75	0.50 0.75		62.50 93.75	Rev Ste	of w/ Jamie Hess & TC w/ Paige Bellamy view file & statement of Marcus phenson TC w/ Calbi
30/2009	2 CHM	3	95	5 4	12	125.00		0.50	0.50		62.50		riew statement of Jasmine Deggs, TC w/ use Higinbotham
05/2009		3	95			125.00		1.75	1.75		218.75	Pre <sub>l</sub> TC :	p for & interview Kawanna West w/ Bob Calbi
06/2009 09/2009		3 3	95 95			125.00 125.00		0.25 0.50	0.25 0.50		31.25 62.50	Con coni	w/ Dr. Laboy f. w/ James Hess, Coordinating witness tacts subpoenas to be served w/ Jess re; subpoena on Jasmine Deggs
	2 CHM	3	95	5		125.00		1.00	1.00		125.00	Trav J/Da	vel to & from courthouse, conf. w/ augherty on trial date
		3 3	95 95			125.00 125.00		0.25 1.00	0.25 1.00		31.25 125.00	TC	w/ Chase Higinbothom w/ Bellamy's office, Calbi, Bellamy travel from court
		3 3	95 95			125.00 125.00		0.25 0.25	0.25 0.25		31.25 31.25	in co Revi	ourt for conf. w/ Jay Daugherty & Calbl lewed letter from Higinbotham, letter to amy, TC w/ Div. 13
		3	95	5		125.00		0.25	0.25		31.25	TC v	v/ Palge Bellamy
		3 3	95 95	5: 5-		125.00 125.00		1.00 0.25	1.00 0.25		125.00 31.25	Conf	ting w/ Page Bellamy f w/ James Hess, TC w/ Page Bellamy
10/2009	~ Other												w of Hess emails

rimary Attorney: 2 Charles H. McKenzie

ient 2644.01M Jones/Larry State of MO v. (Continued)

Date	Atty	Cat Src	H T B R P X C C	Tcode	Ref #	Rate	Units	Hours Worked	Hours to Bill	Write-Up <i>i</i> Down Hrs	Amount	Write-Up/ Down Amt Description
04/15/2009 04/16/2009	2 CHM 2 CHM	3 3		95 95	56 57	125.00 125.00		0,10 0.50	0.10 0.50		12.50 62.50	Conf. w/ Hess, Review Email Conf. w/ Hess, Review Email, Draft Motion to Take Depo of Alice Dearing
04/20/2009	2 CHM	3		95	58	125.00		0.10	0.10		12.50	Conf. w/ Hess
04/29/2009	2 CHM	3		95	60	125.00		0.25	0.25		31.25	TC w/ Div. 13 Draft Notice for Depo of Alice Dearing, Review Ct Order Conf. w/ James Hess
05/15/2009	2 CHM	3		95	213	125.00		0.75	0.75		93.75	TCW/CALBI & O'CONNOR, TCW/BELLAMY, DRAFTED LETTER TO COUNSEL
06/15/2009 06/17/2009	2 CHM 2 CHM	3 3		95 95	61 62	125.00 125.00		0,25 0.50	0.25 0.50		31,25 62.50	Emails to Page Bellamy Conf. w/ James Hess Email to him T/C w/ Dr. Sharps office, letter to Dr. Sharp
8/20/2009	2 CHM	3		95	63	125.00		0.25	0,25		31.25	Email to Page Bellamy
0/13/2009 0/19/2009	2 CHM 2 CHM	3 3		95 95	66 67	125.00 125.00		0.25 4.00	0,25 4.00		31.25 500,00	TC Re: Meetings Set for 10/19 & 10/20 Travel to and from Crime Lab meet w/ witnesses
0/20/2009	2 CHM	3		95	68	125.00		4.00	4.00		500.00	Travel to and from Crime Lab meet w/ witnesses (2nd day)
1/06/2009	2 CHM	3		95	71	125.00		0.50	0.50		62.50	TC W/ Bellamy & Calbi
1/13/2009 1/17/2009	2 CHM 2 CHM	3		95 95	72 73	125.00 125.00		0.10 1.25	0.10 1,25		12.50 156.25	TC W/ Calbl Review file, draft supp answers to discovery tc w/ Bellamy X2, email to Dresselhaus, email
1/19/2009	2 CHM	3		95	74	125.00		0.50	0.50		62.50	to Bellamy TC w/ Bellamy, review file, email Bellamy & Dresselhaus
1/20/2009	2 CHM	3		95	75	125.00		0.25	0.25		31.25	Email w/ Bellamy review, new report review & sign supp ans to discovery
/30/2009	2 CHM	3		95	76	125.00		0.75	0.75		93.75	Review file - New RC lab reports, tc w/ Bellamy
2/01/2009	2 CHM	3		95	77	125.00		5.50 0.25	5.50 0.25		687.50	Review file w/ Page Bellamy create witness, Exhibit & "to do" lists Review Marcus Stephenson statement
/02/2009 /25/2010	2 CHM 2 CHM	3 3		95 95	78 79	125.00 125.00		0.25	0.25		31.25 31.25	TC w/ Jennifer at RCL
/16/2010	2 CHM	3		95	80	125.00		0.25	0,25		31.25	TC w/ Jennifer @ RCL
/18/2010	2 CHM	3		95	81	125.00		0.50	0.50		62.50	TC w/ Page Bellamy
05/2010	2 CHM	3		95	98	125.00		3.50	3,50		437.50	Reviewed & responded to mith to w/draw response to noitice of other crims, response other crimses, mith to amend info.
08/2010	2 CHM	3		95	99	125.00		1.50	1.50		187.50	To & from court attend hearing on mtn to w/draw
16/2010 20/2010	2 CHM 2 CHM	3 3		95 95	82 83	125.00 125.00		0.25 1.75	0.25 1.75		31.25 218.75	TC's w/ Jamie Hess TC's w/ Hess (4), Rives (2), West (1), Review
21/2010	2 CHM	3		95	84	125.00		0.25	0.25		31.25	file, Hunt (1) TC w/ Bellamy, Rives
22/2010	2 CHM	ა ვ		95	85	125.00		0.25	0.25		93.75	TC w/ Calbi, Hess (2), Bellamy
23/2010	2 CHM	3		95	86	125.00		0.75	0.75		93.75	To & from court, meet w/ J Daugherty, TC's Calibl (2), Div. 13 (2) Hess
25/2010	2 CHM	3		95	87	125.00		4.50	4.50		562.50	To RCL & back meet w/ Patrick Jones, Scott Hummell, Tonya Lee, VanAckeran review new reports, conf. w/ Hess conf. w/ Calbi
26/2010 28/2010	2 CHM 2 CHM	3 3		95 95	88 89	125.00 125.00		2.50 4.50	2.50 4.50		312.50 562.50	TC w/ Calbi, Bellamy, review photos & report To & from office, meet w/ Hess Lisa Murray &
29/2010	2 CHM	3	!	95	90	125.00		4.50	4.50		562,50	Dynelsha Murray Ernail to Rose, checked casenet for Shantia
30/2010	2 CHM	3	•	95	91	125.00		2.50	2.50		312.50	Gonzales, review statement of Gonzales to court & back and meet w/ J. Daughtery conf. w/ hess, research wilness tampering to & from court, to's w/ Lisa Murray & Dustrina
												Smith
		3		95 95	92 93	125.00 125.00		0,25 0.25	0.25 0.25		31.25 31.25	Emails to & from Dr. Sharps office & Bellamy TC w/ Calbl
		3		35	94	125.00		1.50	1.50		187.50	TC to Div. 13 research, write mtn to clarify, pos duties
		3		95	95	125.00		0.75	0.75		93.75	Further drafting of motion to clarify, tow must personnell
		3 3		9 <b>5</b> 9 <b>5</b>		125.00 125.00		0.50 0.50	0.50 0.50		62.50 62.50	Conf. w/ Hess X 2 TC w/ Page Bellamy, conf. w/ Hess, TC to Div. 13
7/2010	2 CHM	3	9	)5 ·	100	125.00		0.75	0.75		93.75	Draft research, review notice & subpoena record
		3 3	9			125,00 125.00		1.25 7.00	1.25 7.00		156.25 875.00	To Div. 13 & back, TC w/ Calbi Interview witnesses to prepare for trial, TC w/ Calbi, draft motion for immunity for
3/2010	2 CHM	3	9	5 1	103	125.00		7.00	7.00		875.00	Stephenson  To crime lab & back interview witnesses to prep for trial
)/2010 2	2 CHM	3	9	5 1	04	125.00		7.00	7.00		875.00	To crime lab & back, TC w/ Calbi, to Div. 5 & back, prep witnesses for trial
)/2010 2	2 CHM :	3	98	5 1	05	125.00		2.50	2.50		312.50	TC w/ Calbi, Steve Patton, Page Bellamy x2, conf. w/ Hess, To & from Jasmine Deggs &
1/2010 2	2 CHM S	3	98	5 1	06	125,00		2.50	2.50		312.50	conf. w/ Deggs, Jamie Smith 2 TC's w/ Steve Patton, Conf. w/ Hess, listen to tape recordings TC w/ Page Bellamy, Bob Calbi
5/2010 2	2 CHM 3	3	95	5 1	<b>07</b> 1	125.00		4.50	4.50		562.50	Prepare supp. disclosures organize file, TC w/ Julie Hamilson, TC w/ Page Bellamy, Bob Calbi, Steve Patton, review part of Shawntia Gonzalez statement, review file research on

rimary Attorney: 2 Charles H. McKenzie

lent 2644.01M Jones/Larry State of MO.y. (Continued)

	Date Atty	Cat Src	HTBR PXCC Tc	ode Ref	# Rate	Units	Hours Worked	Hours to Bill	Write-Up/ Down Hrs	Amount	Write-Up/ Down Amt Description
2027/8/19/19   2 CHM   3	05/26/2010 2 CHM	3	9	95 10	3 125.00						Review Shawntia transcript, further
Control   Cont											preparation of disclosure pleading, to w/ Page
Column   C	05/27/2010 2 CHM	. 3	9	95 109	125.00		8.00	8.00		1.000.00	To & from Jax Cty jall, ocnf. w/ Steve Patton,
Control   Cont										,,	Tc w/ Calbi, Interview shawntla Gonzales, to
Control   Cont											& from crime scene, conf. w/ Bellamy of
Septembro   2 CHM   3											Koster, TC w/ Patton x2, TC w/ Bellamy, conf. w/ Hess, TC final prep of disclosure
Sepon   Sepo											pleading & signed to & from Calbi's office
September   Sept	05/28/2010 2 CHM	3	9.	5 110	125.00		4.00	4.00		500.00	Researched, drafted & signed motion
Septiminary											pursuant to :492,303 RSMO working on
1980  1980											
2009/2010   2 CHM   3   95   112   125.00   3.00   3.00   3.75.00   T. C. W. Dr. Sharps office.   1.00	06/01/2010 2 CHM	3	9:	5 111	125.00		3.50	3.50		437.50	Working on witness list, TC to Calbi, w/
Septimization	06/02/2010 2 CHM	3	95	5 112	125.00		3.00	3.00		375.00	Bellamy, conf. w/ Hess review file, trial prep TC w/ Dr. Sharp's office, TC w/ Calbi, conf. w/
Selfamon							0.00	0.50		070.00	Hess, TC w/ Bellamy, REview larry Jones
Page	06/03/2010 2 CUM	2	0.5	= 440	405.00			0.00			Statement
Page Bellamy, review at Mexicander Zippfer, traved Children's bleery, traved Children's Chil	00/03/2010 2 CAIVI	3	95	113	125.00		8.00	8.00		1,000.00	REview statement of Shawntla G, review
Aleksander Zigeler, trews to brown from the programme of											Page Bellamy, review statement of
											Aleksandar Zdjelar, travel to & from
											Children's Mercy, travel to & from Zdelar's
											horne in Grain Valley, Meet w/ Zdjelar work on opening
September   Sept	)6/04/2010 2 CHM	3	95	i 114	125.00		3.50	3.50		437.50	Prepare research & file motion to appoint
September   Sept											spec pros Page Bellamy, review file work on
Self-Victor   2 CHM   3   95   116   125.00   3.00   3.00   375.00   670.00   775.00   670.											opening, TC w/ Bellamy & Calbi, fisten to jail
Scriber	6/07/2010 2 CHM	3	95	115	125.00		3.00	3.00		375.00	RC w/ Div. 13, 2 Tc's w/ Calbi, work on
Ground   Company   Compa											opening, schedule pretrial conferences w/
## Cally 3 TOS W Felson Freely Representation   1.75 w Felson   1.75 w Felson	6/08/2010 2 CHM	3	95	116	125.00		4.00	4 00		500.00	
Foreign   Fore			-		120.00		4.00	4.00		300.00	w/ Calbi, 3 TC's w/ Bellamy, TC w/ Patton,
											review suppression hearing transcript,
## Priority   2 CHM   3   95   118   125.00   3.50   3.50   3.50   437.50   Go to Jack Cy Chrise, mee High property   118   125.00   2.	6/09/2010 2 CHM	3	95	117	125.00		4.00	4.00		E00.00	research trial brief, review file
SPICE   Chim   3   95   118   125.00   3.50   3.50   437.50   Co to Jax Cly Critise, mere 2/11/2010   2 CHM   3   95   119   125.00   8.00   8.00   1,000.00   Trial prep. depot of Jasmine Kawanan Water 1   174.00   1.		•	55		120.00		4.00	4.00		900,000	TC w/ JOs Allen, 2 TC's w/ Bellamy, work on trial brief & voir dire
	6/10/2010 2 CHM	3	95	118	125.00		3.50	3.50		437.50	Go to Jax Cty Crthse, meet w/ Steve Patton,
#14/2010	6/11/2010 2 CHM	3	95	119	125.00		8.00	8 00	4	000.00	
## 27/2010   2 CHM   3   95   120   125.00   2.00   2.00   250.00   Trial prep, TCS w Jasmine & Hess   Hess			-		120.00		0,00	0.00	''	,000.00	
2 CHM	6/13/2010 2 CHM	3	95	120	125.00		2.00	2.00		250.00	Trial prep, TC's w/ Jasmine Deggs, Bellamy
	E/14/2010 2 CHM	3	95	121	125.00		4.50	4.50		562 50	
## 175/2010			55	121	120.00		4.00	4.50		302,30	
	3/15/2010 2 CHM	3	95	122	125.00		7.25	7.25		906,25	Meet w/ Tammy Payne trial prep, meet w/
Wilest & back   West & back   Wilest & back											Deggs & Kawanna West, Profuce them for
	6/16/2010 2 CHM	3	95	123	125.00		5.50	5.50	(	687.50	meet w/ Jeremy Dukes, Vonn Burns, Chad
											Rives for pretrial prep listen to jailhouse
177/2010   2 CHM   3   95   124   125.00   4.50   4.50   562.50   Meet W wilnesses, Rogers prep for Ital   178/2010   2 CHM   3   95   125   125.00   9.00   9.00   1,125.00   Go to 8 from jail review shaw   178/2010   2 CHM   3   95   126   125.00   10.00   10.00   1,250.00   Meet W wilnesses, Rogers prep for Ital   West statement prepare for West statement prepare for Ital   125.00   10.00   1,250.00   Meet W wilnesses, Rogers prep for Ital   1,250.00   Meet W wilnesses, Proper for Ital											
	/17/2010 2 CHM	3	95	124	125.00		4.50	4.50	5	562.50	Meet w/ witnesses, Rogers & Dillenkoffer
1/9/2010   2 CHM   3   95   128   125.00   10.00   10.00   1,250.00   Meet w/ witnesses prepare for   1/20/2010   2 CHM   3   95   128   125.00   13.00   13.00   1,625.00   Prepare for frial   1/20/2010   2 CHM   3   95   128   125.00   8.00   8.00   1,200.00   Trial   1/20/2010   2 CHM   3   95   128   125.00   4.00   4.00   500.00   Prepare for frial   1/20/2010   2 CHM   3   95   128   125.00   4.00   4.00   500.00   Prepare for frial   1/20/2010   2 CHM   3   95   128   125.00   5.00   8.00   8.00   1,200.00   Trial   1/20/2010   2 CHM   3   95   130   150.00   8.00   8.00   1,200.00   Trial   1/20/2010   2 CHM   3   95   131   150.00   8.00   8.00   1,200.00   Trial   1/20/2010   2 CHM   3   95   131   150.00   8.00   8.00   1,200.00   Trial   1/20/2010   2 CHM   3   95   131   150.00   8.00   8.00   1,200.00   Trial   1/20/2010   2 CHM   3   95   131   150.00   8.00   8.00   1,200.00   Trial   1/20/2010   2 CHM   3   95   132   150.00   8.00   8.00   1,200.00   Trial   1/20/2010   2 CHM   3   95   132   150.00   8.00   8.00   1,200.00   Trial   1/20/2000   1/20/	/18/2010 2 CHM	3	95	125	125.00		9.00	9.00	1.1	125.00	
1/19/2016   2 CHM   3   95   126   125.00   10.00   10.00   1,250.00   Meet w witnesses prepare for formal control of the folial c				0	120100		0,50	5.00	1,1	123.00	
											Meet w/ witnesses prepare for trial
22/2016   2 CHM   3   95   130   150.00   8.00   8.00   1,200.00   Trial	21/2010 2 CHM										
22/2010   2 CHM   3   95   131   150.00   8.00   1,200.00   750.									1,2	00.00	
123/2010   2 CHM   3   95   215   125.00   8.00   8.00   1.200.00   750.00   Prepare for trial.											
24/2010   2 CHM   3   95   132   150.00   8.00   8.00   1,200.00   1,200.00   Trial											
12008   5   PAR   3   95   134   60.00   0.20   0.20   0.20   12.00   Contact victim's familles - ma	24/2010 2 CHM :	3	95	132	150.00						
04/2008 5 PAR 3 95 135 60.00 0.20 0.20 12.00 Contact victim's families re: s meeting.  14/2008 5 PAR 3 95 136 60.00 3.00 3.00 180.00 Travel to court/met with Dust discussed case.  15/2008 5 PAR 3 95 137 60.00 1.15 1.15 69.00 Prepare Motion, letter, contact Counsel Office re: assistance prosecution of case.  16/2008 5 PAR 3 95 138 60.00 0.45 0.45 27.00 File Motion (Appt. Special Inv. Department and Missouri DOC conviction and pen pack on D. Jones.  4/2008 5 PAR 3 95 140 60.00 0.35 0.35 21.00 Review file and prepare request to Jackson County Crim and pen pack on D. Jones.  6/2008 5 PAR 3 95 141 60.00 2.30 2.30 138.00 Met victim family and review c	able Total; 2 (	Charles H. N	/IcKenzie			288	8.40 2	288.40	36,8	50.00	
04/2008 5 PAR 3 95 135 60.00 0.20 0.20 12.00 Contact victim's families re: s meeting.  14/2008 5 PAR 3 95 136 60.00 3.00 3.00 180.00 Travel to court/met with Dust discussed case.  15/2008 5 PAR 3 95 137 60.00 1.15 1.15 69.00 Prepare Motion, letter, contact Counsel Office re: assistance prosecution of case.  16/2008 5 PAR 3 95 138 60.00 0.45 0.45 27.00 File Motion (Appt. Special Inv. Department and Missouri DOC conviction and pen pack on D. Jones.  4/2008 5 PAR 3 95 140 60.00 0.35 0.35 21.00 Review file and prepare request to Jackson County Crim and pen pack on D. Jones.  6/2008 5 PAR 3 95 141 60.00 2.30 2.30 138.00 Met victim family and review c	02/2008 5 PAR 5	1	05	124	60.00		2.00	0.00			<u>.</u>
14/2008 5 PAR 3 95 136 60.00 3.00 3.00 180.00 Travel to court/met with Dusting discussed case.  5/2008 5 PAR 3 95 137 60.00 1.15 1.15 69.00 Prepare Motion, letter, contact Counsel Office re: assistance prosecution of case.  16/2008 5 PAR 3 95 138 60.00 0.45 0.45 27.00 File Motion (Appt. Special Investigation and per pack on Discussion and per											Contact victim's families - make introductions,
14/2008 5 PAR 3 95 136 60.00 3.00 3.00 180.00 Travel to court/met with Dusti discussed case.  15/2008 5 PAR 3 95 137 60.00 1.15 1.15 69.00 Prepare Moltion, letter, contact Counsel Office re: assistance prosecution of case.  16/2008 5 PAR 3 95 138 60.00 0.45 0.45 27.00 File Moltion (Appt. Special Inverse of Counsel Office and per pack on Dispartment and Missouri DOC conviction and pen pack on Dispartment and Missouri DOC conviction and pen pack on Dispartment; complete forms a request to Jackson County Crim and Packson County Cri						`		0,20		12.00	
1.15	14/2008 5 PAR 3	3	95	136	60.00	3	3.00	3.00	18	30.00	Travel to court/met with Dustrina Smith and
6/2008   5 PAR   3   95   138   60.00   0.45   0.45   27.00   File Motion (Appt. Special Investigation of case.   6/2008   5 PAR   3   95   139   60.00   0.30   0.30   0.30   18.00   Contact Jackson County Crim Department and Missouri DOC conviction and pen pack on Docardidation and Pen pack on Docardid	5/2008 5 PAR 3	1	95	137	60.00	1	115	1 15	_	30 00	
16/2008   5 PAR   3   95   138   60.00   0.45   0.45   27.00   File Motion (Appt. Special Investigation of Country Characteristics of Country Characterist	,				55,55			1.10	,	J3.00	Counsel Office re: assistance/help with
2/2008 5 PAR 3 95 139 60.00 0.30 0.30 18.00 Contact Jackson County Crim Department and Missouri DOC conviction and pen pack on Di Jones.  4/2008 5 PAR 3 95 140 60.00 0.35 0.35 21.00 Review file and prepare reque department; complete forms a request to Jackson County Cri Dept.  6/2008 5 PAR 3 95 141 60.00 2.30 2.30 138.00 Met victim family and review c	6/2008 5 040 0		05	400	00.00	_					prosecution of case.
### Application of the company of the control of th											File Motion (Appt. Special Investigator).
Conviction and pen pack on Display   Conviction and pen pack on Display			00	100	00.00	· ·	.50	0,30	'	0.00	
#/2008 5 PAR 3 95 140 60.00 0.35 0.35 21.00 Review file and prepare reque department; complete forms a request to Jackson County Cri Dept.  6/2008 5 PAR 3 95 141 60.00 2.30 2.30 138.00 Met victim family and review c											conviction and pen pack on Defendant Larry
department; complete forms a request to Jackson County Cri Dept.  6/2008 5 PAR 3 95 141 60.00 2.30 2.30 138.00 Met victim family and review c	4/2008 5 PAP 2		05	140	60.00	_	26	0.35	_	4.00	Jones,
request to Jackson County Cri Dept. 6/2008 5 PAR 3 95 141 60.00 2.30 2.30 138.00 Met victim family and review c	U PAR 3		90	140	UU.UU	0	.30	U.30	2	00, F	Review file and prepare request to police
Dept. 6/2008 5 PAR 3 95 141 60.00 2.30 2.30 138.00 Met victim family and review c	•										request to Jackson County Criminal Records
2.50 2.50 Met vicum ramily and review C	6/2009 E DAD ^		0.5	444	CO 00	_					Dept.
DIPA Offers and options	3 AAA G 00020		90	141	6U.UU	2.	.JU	2.30	138	8.00	Met victim family and review case status re:
pica oriera anu optiona.											plea offers and options.

rimary Attorney: 2 Charles H. McKenzle

ient 2644.01M Jones/Larry State of MO v (Continued)

Date	Atty	Cat Sre	HTBR PXCC	Tcode Re	of# Rate	Units	Hours Worked	Hours to Bill	Write-Up/ Down Hrs	Amount	Write-Up/ Down Amt Description
06/30/2008					42 60.00		1.40	1.40		84.00	Continue review of police file; conference call with Joe Dresselhaus (co-defendant special
07/03/2008	5 PA	₹ 3		95 1	43 60,00		1.50	1.50		90.00	investigator); prepare case memo. Prepare coples of reports, prepare letter and recelpt; deliver same to Defense Attorney Office.
08/12/2008 08/19/2008	5 PAI 5 PAI				44 60.00 45 60.00		0.45 2.00	0.45 2.00		27.00 120.00	Make coples of Master File (KCPD). Went to crime scene (apartments) and met
8/23/2008	5 PAF	₹ 3		95 14	46 60.00		1.00	1.00		60.00	manager re: view scene. Continue review police reports and reading of statements.
9/09/2008	5 PAF			95 14			0.50	0.50		30.00	Contact multiple witnesses (Introduction for case).
9/11/2008	5 PAF			95 14			1.15	1.15		69.00	File notice with court; organize meeting; conduct conference call.
9/12/2008 9/15/2008	5 PAR			95 14 95 15			1.10 1.00	1.10		66.00 60.00	Contact court re: order; pick up jail records (def. visitation). Prepare subpoena; serve same on records
/16/2008	5 PAR			95 15			2.30	2.30		138.00	custodian. Serve subpoenas and interview witnesses at
/24/2008	5 PAR	3		95 15	2 60,00		1.20	1.20		72.00	two jalis.  File subpoena returns; contact several doctors re: testify; arranged meeting with
/25/2008	5 PAR	3	!	95 15	3 60,00		2.25	2.25		135,00	detective at apartments.  Met with witness, Interview and serve
/25/2008	5 PAR	3	!	95 15	4 60.00		0.15	0.15		9.00	subpoena. Contact detective twice re: review schedules
/26/2008 /30/2008	5 PAR 5 PAR	3 3		95 156 95 156			0.45 1.45	0.45 1.45		27.00 87.00	for crime scene view. Serve subpoena and pick up medical records. Met with detective, attorney and apartment
19/2008	5 PAR	3	9	95 157	7 60.00		3.10	3.10		186.00	manager re: view crime scene. Prepare employer, several attempts and then serve subpoena on witness.
30/2008	5 PAR	3	9	95 156	60.00		1.10	1.10		66,00	Met with investigator and review computer/projection operation.
30/2008 13/2009	5 PAR 5 PAR	3 3		95 159 95 160			1.30 1.00	1.30 1.00		78.00 60.00	Went to crime scene and took photos. Contact KCPD General Counsel Office re: photocopy request; deliver copy of witness
26/2009	5 PAR	3	9	5 161	60.00		0.50	0.50		30.00	list. Pick up photo contact strip from police
27/2009	5 PAR	3	9	5 162	60,00		1.10	1.10		66.00	department. Contact witnesses and set up meetings; contact co-defendant Special Prosecutor's Investigator re: medical records information;
05/2009 0/2009	5 PAR 5 PAR	3 3	9: 9:				1.30 2,20	1.30 2.20		78.00 132.00	make copies of medical records.  Met with witnesses re: review testimony.  Notify witnesses of trial setting; prepare
5/2009	5 PAR	,3	98	5 165	60.00		1.30	1.30		78.00	subpoena and serve same on witness. Pick up file from court. Contacted by witness re: depo dates; review same with investigator
9/2009	5 PAR	3	95	5 166	60,00		4.00	4.00		240.00	and prepare memo.  Meeting with co-defendant prosecutor at crime lab and interview several witnesses.
0/2009	5 PAR	3	95		60,00		8.00	8,00		480.00	Meeting with co-defendant prosecutor at crime lab and interview multiple witnesses.
9/2009 5/2009	5 PAR 5 PAR	3 3	95 95	169	60.00 60.00		1.00 1.00	1.00 1.00		60.00 60.00	Serve subpoena on doctor.  Prepare return of service of subpoena and file with court.
)/2009	5 PAR	3	95		60.00		1.20	1.20		72.00	Attempt to serve subpoena on witness (Kiwanna West).
3/2009	5 PAR	3	95	5 171	60.00		2.30	2.30		138.00	Serve subpoena on Kiwanna West and attempt to serve subpoenas on D. West and M. Stephenson.
5/2009	5 PAR	3	95	172	60.00		0.35	0.35		21.00	Deliver discovery packet to defense attomey office.
/2009	5 PAR	3	95	173	60,00		2.30	2.30		138.00	Meeting with prosecutor re; review evidence and witness testimony re; pre-trial preparation.
/2009	5 PAR	3	95	174	60.00		3.00	3.00		180.00	Contact multiple witnesses re; trial notification and prepare several subpoenas.
/2010 /2010	5 PAR 5 PAR	3 3	95 95		60.00 60.00		1.10 2.50	1.10 2.50		66.00 150.00	Locate witnesses and review trial status. Contact multiple witnesses and review trial
2010	5 PAR	3	95	177	60.00		3.15	3.15		189.00	dates and testimony needs. Contact witnesses and schedule pre-trial meetings; prepare and serve multiple
2010	5 PAR	3	95	178	60.00		5.10	5.10		306.00	subpoenas.  Met with multiple witnesses re: pre-trial, make copies of documents; review reports and
2010	5 PAR	3	95	179	60,00		1.35	1.35		81.00	schedule meelings. Contact several witnesses re: schedule meetings, arrange evidence with videographer.
2010	5 PAR	3	95	180	60.00		3.00	3.00		180.00	Met with property room re: property reports; attempt to serve subpoenas several times; schedule pre-trial meetings.
2010	5 PAR	3	95	181	60.00		2.15	2.15		129.00	Pick up photos, compare to police contact strip, create list of same; contact detectives and witnesses re: pre-trial meetings.
2010	5 PAR	3	95	182	60,00		1.50	1.50		90.00	Prepare copies of discovery and deliver to

imary Attorney: 2 Charles H. McKenzie

ent 2644.01M Jones/Larry State of MO v (Continued)

ent::2644:01.0	M=nou62/F9/	TY State of MC		mineo/ ::		#*************************************		Hours	Hours	Write-Up/		Write-Up/	
Date	Atty		T B R X C C	Tcode	Ref #	Rate	Units	Worked	to Bill	Down Hrs	Amount	Down Amt	Description  defense attorney; contacted by witnesses re:
03/18/2010	5 PAR	3		95	183	60,00		1.30	1.30		78.00		trial testimony.  Contact expert witness re: available trial dates; arrange travel itinerary; contact court
03/20/2010	5 PAR	3		95	184	60.00		2.10	2.10		126,00		administrator re: same. Contacted by witness re: threats and bribes;
03/22/2010	5 PAR	3		95	185	60.00		0.30	0.30		18.00		contact police and prosecutor re: same.  Contact witnesses re: postpone meetings and re-schedule.
03/24/2010 03/25/2010	5 PAR 5 PAR	3 3		95 95	186 187	60.00 60.00		0,30 3.50	0.30 3.50		18.00 210.00		Locate witness statements and police files. Met with crime lab witnesses re: pre-trial; pick up witness history and review; get new
03/26/2010	5 PAR	3		95	188	60.00		1.30	1.30		78.00		reports. Prepare discovery packet; take same to defense attorney; contact witnesses re: meetings and depos.
03/27/2010	5 PAR	3		95	189	60.00		1.00	1.00		60.00		Contact detective re: arrange to obtain copy of video disk; pick up same from KCPD.
03/28/2010	5 PAR	3		95	190	60.00		3.20	3.20		192.00		Met with victim and witnesses re: pre-trial preparation and review of testimony.
)3/29/2010	5 PAR	3		95	191	60.00		1.30	1.30		78.00		Contact all State witnesses re: notify of trial continuance.
)4/02/2010	5 PAR	3		95	192	60.00		1.00	1.00		60.00		Prepare discovery packet for defense attorney; take same to defense attorney.
)5/18/2010	5 PAR	3		95	193	60,00		6.30	6.30		378.00		Pick up jail inmate telephone recordings and begin review of same.
)5/19/2010 )5/27/2010	5 PAR 5 PAR	3 3		95 95	194 195	60,00 60,00		1,00 2,00	1.00 2.00		60.00 120.00		Pick up transcript from court. Met with witness at jall and conducted
6/01/2010	5 PAR	3		95	196	60,00		2.00	2.00		120.00		interview. Met with witness at jail and conducted
6/03/2010	5 PAR	3		95	197	60,00		3.30	3.30		198.00		Interview. Prepare discovery and deliver to defense attorney; met witnesses for pre-trial and serve subpoenas.
6/05/2010	5 PAR	3		95	198	60.00		4.00	4.00		240.00	1	Review tape-recorded phone calls and
6/10/2010	5 PAR	3		95	199	60.00		4.00	4.00		240.00	1	prepare list for trial.  Check out evidence from property room;  organize and review same; contact multiple  police wiinesses re: evidence and testimony;  lsten to tape-recordings e: prepare for
<del>3</del> /11/2010	5 PAR	3		95	200	60.00		6.00	6.00		360.00	1	wilness interview. Met with witnesses er: review depositions and evidence; locate and transport witnesses re: same.
3/ <b>14/2010</b>	5 PAR	3		95	201	60.00		2.10	2.10		126.00	(	Get photos arranged for trial; locate/interview vitnesses; assist in video preparation.
3/15/2010	5 PAR	3		95	202	60.00		7.00	7.00		420,00	. t	Pick up witness for deposition; pre-deposition preparation with witness; transport witness tome; schedule per-trial meetings.
3/16/2010	5 PAR	3		95	203	60.00		3.00	3.00		180.00	9 8	Serve subpoena on Jail; delivery to defense attorney; met with witness re: per-trial; delivery to crime lab.
¥/17/2010	5 PAR	3		95	204	60.00		2.00	2.00		120.00		Net witness re: per-trial meeting; delivery to rime lab.
3/18/2010	5 PAR	3		95	205	60.00		3.30	3,30		198.00		nterview witness at jail; check out evidence rom crime lab.
/19/2010	5 PAR	3		95	206	60.00		3.30	3.30		198.00	р	Delivery to defense attorney; continue to repare case file for trial.
/20/2010	5 PAR	3		95	207	60.00		6.00	6,00		360.00	b	eliveries to witnesses for trial; get photos lown up at store; continue to prepare case le for trial.
/21/2010	5 PAR	3		95	208	60.00		8.00	8.00		480,00	T	ie tor tnai. ransport wilnesses to/from trial; assist at ial with witnesses and case file.
/22/2010	5 PAR	3		95	209	60.00		8.00	8.00		480.00	Ť	ransport witnesses to/from trial; assist at ial with witnesses and case file.
/23/2010	5 PAR	3		95	210	60.00		8,00	8.00		480.00	Ť	ransport witnesses to/from trial; assist at italian with witnesses and case file.
/24/2010	5 PAR	3		95	211	60.00		8,00	8.00		480,00	e,	ssist at trial with witnesses; remove vidence/case file from court and transport to ffice.
'30/2010	5 PAR	3		95	212	60,00		3,00	3.00		180.00		rganize case file; retum evidence to roperty room and crime lab.
able Total:		5 Paralegais						187.35	187.35	11	,241.00		
Billable Fees	i						_	475.75	475.75	48	,091.00		
15/2008 15/2009 15/2009 17/2010	2 CHM 2 CHM 2 CHM 2 CHM	A A A		13 13 16 6	5 20 21 31	0,250 0,250	1.00 1.00				26.93 37.70 18.27 40.00	PI FI M	HOTOCOPIES RSI HOTOCOPIES RSI EDERAL EXPRESS EDICAL RECORDS CHILDREN'S MERCY
31/2010	2 CHM	A		20	33						10.76	H¢ M	OSPITAL ISCELLANEOUS CHRISTOPHER
15/2010	2 CHM	A		11	34						313.39	A(	CCURSO FOR DVDS RAVEL EXPENSES AMERICAN EXPRESS
30/2010 19/2010	2 CHM 2 CHM	A A	7	7	35 39	1.200	8.13				9.76 168.00	RE DE	ESEARCH WEST PUBLISHING EPOSITION COSTS REBECCA RAMSEY OR TRANSCRIPT OF SUPPRESSION

rimary Attorney: 2 Charles H. McKenzie

lient 2644,01M Jones/Larry State of MO.V. (Continued)

Date	Atty	Cat Src	HTBR PXCC	Tcode	Ref #	Rate	Units	Hours Worked	Hours to Bill	Write-Up/ Down Hrs	Amount	Write-Up/ Down Amt	Description
													HEARING INVOLVING POLICE OFFICER
06/30/2010	2 CHM	Α	7	13	42	0.250	1.00				252,08		PHOTOCOPIES RSI
06/30/2010	2 CHM	Α		1	43						716.00		DEPOSITION COSTS NATIONAL DEPO FOR DEPOS OF KAWANNA WEST AND JASMINE DEGGS
7/14/2010	2 CHM	Α	7	13	52	0.250	1.00				336,10		PHOTOCOPIES RSI
7/15/2010	2 CHM	Α		1	45					•	612.45		DEPOSITION COSTS SET DEPO, LLC FOR DEPOS OF JASMINE DEGGS AND KAWANNA WEST
7/15/2010	2 CHM	Α		11	50						1,979.75		TRAVEL EXPENSES AMERICAN EXPRESS
8/13/2010	2 CHM	Α		4	56						109.01		EXPERT FEE JAIMIE SMITH FOR EXPENSES
9/15/2010	2 CHM	Α		5	57						3,490.62		VIDEO SERVICE JUDICIAL VIDEO LLC, PREP, PRESENTATION AND APPEARANCE AT LARRY JONES' TRIAL.
i Billable Ex	penses									_	8,120.82		
ments				•									
7/16/2008				99	1						-35.00		Payment for expenses/ST, V. JONES
7/27/2009				99	2						-25.00		Payment for expenses/JONES, LARRY
l Billable Pay	ments/									_	-60.00		
				1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1	Q\$14£4\$4			RECA	P. TV SAFE	ne de la composición	44.20		
			Fees:		48,091.00								
			Expenses:		8,120,82		Previous B	alance:		0.00			
			Advances:		0.00		Payments/			-60.00			
			Total WIP:		56,211.82		Balance D	ue:	-	-60.00	Total:	56,151	.82
			A/R:	0-3	0	31-6	0	61-90		91-120	121-180	- 1	81+
				-60.00		0.0		0.00		0.00	0.00		.00

# IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI AT KANSAS CITY

816 561 2992

STATE OF MISSOURI,

Plaintiff,

D. Parkers Case No. 0616-CR04880-01

Division 13

LARRY JONES,

٧.

Defendant.

ORDER

Now, on this W day of October, 2007, the Court considers the Motion for Appointment of a Special Prosecutor, and being fully advised in the premises,

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that the Motion for the Appointment of a Special Prosecutor is GRANTED.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that the joint motion for a continuance is GRANTED.

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that this case is specially set for trial on February 19, 2008, at 9:30 a.m.

IT IS SO ORDERED.

UGHERTY

I hereby certify that copies of the above and foregoing were sent on this 214 day of October 2007, to the following:

Robert Calbi Fax # 221-1708

Dawn Parsons- Prosecutor's office (interoffice mail)

Brett J. Coppage, Law Clerk Division 13

816 561 2992

FEB. 7. 2008 12:11PM

J'~"SON CTY DIV 6 &8

NO. 546 - P. 1

### IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF JACKSON, MISSOURI IN KANSAS CITY

STATE OF MISSOURI,

Plaintiff,

ADMIN. ORDER #2008-016

VS.

Case No. 0616-CR04880-01

10/20/2010 11:52

LARRY JONES,

Division 8

Defendant.

#### ORDER

Pursuant to the Motion for the appointment of Special Prosecutor heretofore filed by Robert N. Calbi, attorney for the defendant, the Court does on this date appoint Charles H. McKenzie as Special Prosecutor, for the review and disposition of the · above captioned case.

PRESIDING JUDGE

Mailed/faxed this May of Feb., 2008 to:

Charles H. McKenzie Kevin D. Harrell

(816)561-2992 x3821

Robert N. Calbi

(816)221-1708

#686 P.006/007

Sep. 30. 2008 11:31AM

No. 0190 P. 1/2

# IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI AT KANSAS CITY

STATE OF MISSOURI,

Plaintiff,

Case No. 0616-CR04880-01

10/20/2010 11.52

٧,

Division 13

LARRY JONES,

Defendant.

### ORDER

Now, on this \_\_\_\_\_day of September, 2008, the Court considers the Motion for Appointment of an Investigator for Special Prosecution, filed April 16, 2008, and being fully advised in the premises,

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that the Motion for the Appointment of an Investigator for Special Prosecution is GRANTED. James Hess shall be an investigator for the special prosecuting attorney in the above matter.

IT IS SO ORDERED.

A. PAUGHERT

No. 0190 P. 2/2

Sep. 30. 2008 11:31AM

I hereby certify that copies of the above and foregoing were sent on this 301 day of September 2008, to the following:

Robert N. Calbi Fax # 221-1708

Charles McKenzie Fax # 561-2992

Melissa Shealy, Law Clerk Division 13