

IN THE COUNTY LEGISLATURE OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI

A RESOLUTION awarding a twenty-four month term and supply contract with three twelve-month options to extend for the furnishing of uniforms for use by the Sheriff's Office to The Armory, LLC, of Kearney, MO, under the terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 84-14.

RESOLUTION NO. 18822, May 4, 2015

INTRODUCED BY Alfred Jordan, County Legislator

WHEREAS, pursuant to Invitation to Bid No. 84-14, the Director of Finance and Purchasing has solicited bids for the furnishing of uniforms for use by the Sheriff's Office; and,

WHEREAS, a total of twenty notifications were distributed and two responses were received from the following:

BIDDER

The Armory, LLC
Kearney, MO

Alamar Uniforms
North Kansas City, MO

and,

WHEREAS, following evaluation of bids submitted, the Director recommends the award of a twenty-four month term and supply contract, with three twelve-month options to extend, for the furnishing of uniforms for use by the Sheriff's Office to The Armory of Kearney, MO, under the terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 84-14, for the reason that it has submitted the lowest and best bid, as set forth in the attached recapitulation and analysis; and,

WHEREAS, this award is made on an as needed basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any amount, with the availability of funds for specific purchases remaining subject to annual appropriation; now therefore,

BE IT RESOLVED by the County Legislature of Jackson County, Missouri, that award be made as recommended by the Director of Finance and Purchasing, and that the Director be and hereby is authorized to execute for the County any documents necessary to the accomplishment of the award; and,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Director of Finance and Purchasing is authorized to make all payments, including final payment on the contract, to the extent sufficient appropriations to the using spending agency are contained in the then current Jackson County budget.

Effective Date: This Resolution shall be effective immediately upon its passage by a majority of the Legislature.

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

[Signature]
Chief Deputy County Counselor

[Signature]
County Counselor

Certificate of Passage

I hereby certify that the attached resolution, Resolution No. 18822 of May 4, 2015, was duly passed on May 11, 2015 by the Jackson County Legislature. The votes thereon were as follows:

Yeas 8

Nays 0

Abstaining 0

Absent 0

Excused 1

May 12, 2015
Date

[Signature]
Mary Jo Spino, Clerk of Legislature

This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual appropriations.

April 27, 2015
Date

[Signature]
Director of Finance and Purchasing

NO.	Description	Alamar Uniforms		The Armory	
		Manufacturer Bid	Unit Price	Manufacturer Bid	Unit Price
	Uniform Apparel				
4.1	5.11 TDU Ripstop Pant – Green (190) 65% Poly, 35% Cotton Sizes XS-XL	5.11	\$38.00 prices include sewing on patches	5.11	\$44.95
	Size 2XL	5.11	\$38.00 prices include sewing on patches	5.11	\$44.95
	Size 3XL	5.11	\$44.10 prices include sewing on patches	5.11	\$54.95
	Size 4XL	5.11	\$44.10 prices include sewing on patches	5.11	\$54.95
4.2	5.11 TDU Ripstop Long Sleeve Shirt – Green (190) 65% Poly, 35% Cotton Sizes XS-XL	5.11	\$40.40 prices include sewing on patches	5.11	\$49.95
	Size 2XL	5.11	\$40.40 prices include sewing on patches	5.11	\$49.95
	Size 3XL	5.11	\$44.10 prices include sewing on patches	5.11	\$54.95
	Size 4XL	5.11	\$44.10 prices include sewing on patches	5.11	\$54.95
4.3	5.11 TDU Ripstop Short Sleeve Shirt – Green (190) 65% Poly, 35% Cotton Sizes XS-XL	5.11	\$40.40 prices include sewing on patches	5.11	\$49.95
	Size 2XL	5.11	\$40.40 prices include sewing on patches	5.11	\$49.95
	Size 3XL	5.11	\$44.10 prices include sewing on patches	5.11	\$54.95
	Size 4XL	5.11	\$44.10 prices include sewing on patches	5.11	\$54.95
4.4	Elbeco #4238N Short Sleeve Shirt, LA County Sheriff's Dept, Tan Sizes XS-XL	New! Elbeco #5030	\$55.00 prices include sewing on patches	New! Elbeco #5582 14 ½"-18"	\$54.95
	Size 2XL	New! Elbeco #5030	\$55.00 prices include sewing on patches	New! Elbeco #5582 18 ½"	\$60.45
	Size 3XL	New! Elbeco #5030	\$55.00 prices include sewing on patches	New! Elbeco #5582 19" – 20"	\$65.94
	Size 4XL	New! Elbeco #5030	\$55.00 prices include sewing on patches	New! Elbeco #5582 22"	\$71.44

NO.	Description	Alamar Uniforms			The Armory	
		Manufacturer Bid	Unit Price	Unit Price	Manufacturer Bid	Unit Price
4.5	Elbeco #436N Long Sleeve Shirt, California Highway Patrol, Silvertan Sizes XS-XL Neck 14 thru 22	New! Elbeco #7064N	\$78.50 prices include sewing on patches	Elbeco	Elbeco	\$89.95
	Size 2XL	New! Elbeco #7064N	\$78.50 prices include sewing on patches	Elbeco	Elbeco	\$98.95
	Size 3XL	New! Elbeco #7064N	\$78.50 prices include sewing on patches	Elbeco	Elbeco	\$107.95
	Size 4XL	New! Elbeco #7064N	\$78.50 prices include sewing on patches	Elbeco	Elbeco	\$116.94
4.6	Elbeco #E8149, LA County Sheriff's Prestige Trousers for Men	Elbeco	\$75.50 prices include hem, waist alterations or short rise alteration	Elbeco	Elbeco	\$75.95
	Sizes: 44-46	Elbeco	\$75.50 prices include hem, waist alterations or short rise alteration	Elbeco	Elbeco	\$83.55
	Sizes: 48-52	Elbeco	\$75.50 prices include hem, waist alterations or short rise alteration	Elbeco	Elbeco	\$91.14
	Sizes: 54-58	Elbeco	\$75.50 prices include hem, waist alterations or short rise alteration	Elbeco	Elbeco	\$98.74
4.7	Elbeco #E8150, LA County Sheriff's Prestige Trousers for Women	Elbeco	\$75.50 prices include hem, waist alterations or short rise alteration	Elbeco	Elbeco	\$75.95
	Sizes: 16-18	Elbeco	\$75.50 prices include hem, waist alterations or short rise alteration	Elbeco	Elbeco	\$83.55
	Sizes: 20-24	Elbeco	\$75.50 prices include hem, waist alterations or short rise alteration	Elbeco	Elbeco	\$91.14
	Sizes: 26-28	Elbeco	\$75.50 prices include hem, waist alterations or short rise alteration	Elbeco	Elbeco	\$98.74
	ACCESSORIES					
4.8	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Clip-on 18"	Samuel Boone	\$6.50	Samuel Boone	Samuel Boone	\$6.50
	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Clip-on 20"	Samuel Boone	\$6.50	Samuel Boone	Samuel Boone	\$7.00

NO.	Description	Alamar Uniforms		The Armory	
		Manufacturer Bid	Unit Price	Manufacturer Bid	Unit Price
4.9	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Velcro, 18"	Samuel Boone	\$7.00	Samuel Boone	\$7.50
	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Velcro, 20"	Samuel Boone	\$7.00	Samuel Boone	\$8.00
4.10	Stratton #S-42CG, Straw Sheriff's Hat, Conservation Green with CD-GD Cords with Black 3-piece Leather Chin Strap and Stratton Gold Cords with Acorns	Stratton	\$75.00	Stratton	\$75.95
4.11	Elbeco #3920, Summit Duty Jacket, Black Sizes: Small thru XL	Discontinued New #SH3200/SH3500	\$245.00	5.11 Fleece Jacket #48038-019 Black	\$109.95
	Size 2XL	Discontinued New #SH3200/SH3500	\$245.00	5.11 Fleece Jacket #48038-019 Black	\$109.95
	Size 3XL	Discontinued New #SH3200/SH3500	\$245.00	5.11 Fleece Jacket #48038-019 Black	\$119.95
	Size 4XL	Discontinued New #SH3200/SH3500	\$245.00	5.11 Fleece Jacket #48038-019 Black	\$119.95
4.12	Don Hume #B125, Black, Velcro Belt, Basket Weave Sizes: 24- 42	Don Hume	\$42.75	Don Hume	\$35.95
	Sizes 44-46	Done Hume	\$42.75	Don Hume	\$40.95
	Sizes 48-52	Don Hume	\$42.75	Don Hume	\$44.95
	Sizes 54-60	Don Hume	\$42.75	Don Hume	\$49.95
4.13	Safariland #146-XX-4B, Black with Brass Buckle, Border Patrol Belt, Basket Weave Sizes: 24-42	Safariland	\$58.60	Safariland	\$78.95
	Sizes 44-46	Safariland	\$58.60	Safariland	\$80.95
	Sizes 48-52	Safariland	\$58.60	Safariland	\$84.95
	Sizes 54-60	Safariland	\$58.60	Safariland	\$86.95
4.14	Safariland #6280-83-81, Right Hand Holster, Basket Weave, Mid-Level II Glock 17/22	Safariland	\$131.50	No Bid	No Bid
4.15	Safariland #6280-83-82, Left Hand Holster, Basket Weave, Mid-Level II Glock 17/22	Safariland	\$131.50	No Bid	No Bid
4.16	Safariland #38 w/Flap, Closed Top Chemical Holder, Black, Basket Weave	Safariland	\$25.00	Safariland	\$29.95
4.17	Safariland #33, Surgical Glove Pouch, Black, Basket Weave	Safariland	\$15.55	Safariland	\$21.95

NO.	Description	Alamar Uniforms		The Armory	
		Manufacturer Bid	Unit Price	Manufacturer Bid	Unit Price
4.18	Safariland #090H-16, Open Top Handcuff Pouch for Hinged Handcuffs, Black, Basket Weave	Safariland	\$22.85	Safariland	\$27.95
4.19	Safariland #65, Belt Keeper 4 Pack, Black, Basket Weave	Safariland	\$10.40	Safariland	\$14.95
4.20	Safariland #168, Flap Style Key Ring, Black, Basket Weave	Safariland	\$12.85	Safariland	\$17.95
4.21	Safariland #730, Heavy Duty Flashlight Ring, Black, Basket Weave	Safariland	\$8.05	Safariland	\$12.95
4.22	5.11 Style #48038 Tactical Fleece Jacket Sizes: XS thru XL	5.11	\$87.00	5.11	\$109.95
	Size 2XL	5.11	\$87.00	5.11	\$109.95
	Size 3XL	5.11	\$93.05	5.11	\$119.95
	Size 4XL	5.11	\$93.05	5.11	\$119.95
	PATCHES				
4.23	Shoulder Patches – to be provided by Jackson County	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
4.24	Badge Patch – to be provided by Jackson County	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
4.25	Sergeant Stripes, Gold on Green	N/A	\$5.00/pair	N/A	\$4.00/set
4.26	Back Patch "Sheriff", 11" x 4", Gold on Black	N/A	\$7.00	N/A	\$3.00
4.27	Black Stripe, 1 inch, 100% polyester, must be sewn on trousers	N/A	\$included in 4.32	N/A	\$7.00
	SEWING/ALTERATION SERVICES				
4.28	Sewing Services to attach Shoulder Patch (Item 4.23) to uniform	N/A	\$2.75 prices reflect sewing services not with initial purchase or items purchase with vendor	N/A	\$3.00/set
4.29	Sewing Services to attach Badge Patch (Item 4.24) to uniform	N/A	\$2.75 prices reflect sewing services not with initial purchase or items purchase with vendor	N/A	\$2.00
4.30	Sewing Services to attach Sergeant Stripes (Item 4.25) to uniform	N/A	\$2.75 prices reflect sewing services not with initial purchase or items purchase with vendor	N/A	\$4.00

NO.	Description	Alamar Uniforms		The Armory	
		Manufacturer Bid	Unit Price	Manufacturer Bid	Unit Price
4.31	Sewing Services to attach Back Patch (Item 4.26) to uniform	N/A	\$2.75 prices reflect sewing services not with initial purchase or items purchase with vendor	N/A	\$2.00
4.32	Sewing Services to attach Stripes, one pair of Black Stripes (Item 4.27) on to Trousers	N/A	\$10.95 prices reflect sewing services not with initial purchase or items purchase with vendor	N/A	\$7.00
4.33	Sewing Services to alter shirts as necessary for proper fit for Officer	N/A	\$11.95 prices reflect sewing services not with initial purchase or items purchase with vendor	N/A	\$0.00
4.34	Sewing Services to alter pants/trousers as necessary for proper fit for Officer	N/A	\$10.45 prices reflect sewing services not with initial purchase or items purchase with vendor	N/A	\$0.00
	MISC. ITEMS		Discount Offered		Discount Offered
4.35	Misc. Catalog Orders – list percentage discount off manufacturer’s list pricing for misc. catalog orders. If you are offering more than one discount, include on your letterhead additional sheets as necessary to make your bid complete.		N/A%		10%
4.36	Rain Cover for Stratton Hats	No Bid	No Bid	Stratton	\$10.95
4.37	Safariland #90-4B, Handcuff Pouch, Top Flap, Basket Weave with Brass Snap	No Bid	No Bid	Safariland	\$29.95
4.38	Monadnock #MD3625 Front Draw Holder for Classic Friction Lock 16-21" Batons, 360, Basket Weave Black	No Bid	No Bid	Monadnock	\$34.95
4.39	Safariland Model 77 Double Magazine Pouch *Per Deputy Firearm Specs	No Bid	No Bid	Safariland	\$38.95
4.40	Safariland Model 295 Mid-Ride, Level II Retention Duty Holster *Per Deputy Firearm Specs	No Bid	No Bid	Safariland	\$181.95
4.41	Neese #5003RSJM Reversible Rain Jacket, with SHERIFF letter inside and out	No Bid	No Bid	Neese	\$149.95
4.42	Neese #5003RPTSM Reversible Police Trousers	No Bid	No Bid	Neese	\$89.95
4.43	Neese # 5003RHO Reversible Rain Hood	No Bid	No Bid	Neese	\$10.95

8.0 QUESTIONS

All questions regarding this Invitation to Bid must be in writing and emailed as detailed under the General conditions, Item Number Five on Page 10 of this Invitation to Bid by 5:00 PM, CST on January 22, 2015. Point of Contact for the Purchasing Department is Cassandra Cheek, email address: ccheek@jacksongov.org. All questions will be answered in the form of Addenda on the Jackson County, Missouri website. Failure to follow this procedure MAY result in the REJECTION OF YOUR BID.

9.0 QUOTATIONS

NO.	Description	Manufacturer Bid	Unit Price
	Uniform Apparel 74003-190		
4.1	5.11 TDU Ripstop Pant – Green (190) 65% Poly, 35% Cotton Sizes XS-XL	5.11	\$ 44.95
	Size 2XL	5.11	\$ 44.95
	Size 3XL	5.11	\$ 54.95
	Size 4XL	5.11	\$ 54.95
4.2	5.11 TDU Ripstop Long Sleeve Shirt – Green (190) 65% Poly, 35% Cotton 72002-190 Sizes XS-XL	5.11	\$ 49.95
	Size 2XL	5.11	\$ 49.95
	Size 3XL	5.11	\$ 54.95
	Size 4XL	5.11	\$ 54.95
4.3	5.11 TDU Ripstop Short Sleeve Shirt – Green (190) 65% Poly, 35% Cotton 71339-190 Sizes XS-XL	5.11	\$ 49.95
	Size 2XL	5.11	\$ 49.95
	Size 3XL	5.11	\$ 54.95
	Size 4XL	5.11	\$ 54.95
4.4	Elbeco #4238N Short Sleeve Shirt, LA County Sheriff's Dept, Tan Sizes XS-XL	See Exhibit "F"	\$
	Size 2XL	No longer Available	\$
	Size 3XL		\$
	Size 4XL		\$
			\$
4.5	Elbeco #436N Long Sleeve Shirt, California Highway Patrol, Silvertan Sizes XS-XL Neck 14 thru 22	Elbeco	\$ 89.95
	Size 2XL 100% 18 1/2	Elbeco	\$ 98.95

NO.	Description	Manufacturer Bid	Unit Price
	Size 3XL 20% 19-20	Elbeco	\$ 107.95
	Size 4XL 30% 22	Elbeco	\$ 116.94
4.6	Elbeco #E8149, LA County Sheriff's Prestige Trousers for Men		\$
	Sizes: 28 thru 42	Elbeco	75.95
	Sizes: 44-46 10%	Elbeco	\$ 83.55
	Sizes: 48-52 20%	Elbeco	\$ 91.14
	Sizes: 54-58 30%	Elbeco	\$ 98.74
4.7	Elbeco #E8150, LA County Sheriff's Prestige Trousers for Women		\$
	Sizes: 6 thru 14	Elbeco	75.95
	Sizes: 16-18	Elbeco	\$ 83.55
	Sizes: 20-24	Elbeco	\$ 91.14
	Sizes: 26-28	Elbeco	\$ 98.74
	ACCESSORIES		
4.8	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Clip-on 18"	Samuel Broome	\$ 6.50
	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Clip-on 20"	Samuel Broome	\$ 7.00
4.9	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Velcro, 18"	Samuel Broome	\$ 7.50
	Neckties, Samuel Boone, Black, Velcro, 20"	Samuel Broome	\$ 8.00
4.10	Stratton #S-42CG, Straw Sheriff's Hat, Conservation Green with CD-GD Cords with Black 3-piece Leather Chin Strap and Stratton Gold Cords with Acorns	Stratton	\$ 75.95
4.11	Elbeco #3920, Summit Duty Jacket, Black Sizes: Small thru XL	See Exhibit "F"	
	Size 2XL		\$
	Size 3XL		\$
	Size 4XL		\$
	<i>No longer Available</i>		
4.12	Don Hume #B125, Black, Velcro Belt, Basket Weave		\$
	Sizes: 24- 42	Don Hume	\$ 35.95
	Sizes 44-46	Don Hume	\$ 40.95
	Sizes 48-52	Don Hume	\$ 44.95

NO.	Description	Manufacturer Bid	Unit Price
	Sizes 54-60	Don Hume	\$49.95
4.13	Safariland #146-XX-4B, Black with Brass Buckle, Border Patrol Belt, Basket Weave Sizes: 24-42	Safariland	\$78.95
	Sizes 44-46	Safariland	\$80.95
	Sizes 48-52	Safariland	\$84.95
	Sizes 54-60	Safariland	\$86.95
4.14	Safariland #6280-83-81, Right Hand Holster, Basket Weave, Mid-Level II Glock 17/22	Safariland	\$ See Addendum No.1
4.15	Safariland #6280-83-82, Left Hand Holster, Basket Weave, Mid-Level II Glock 17/22	Safariland	\$ See Addendum No.1
4.16	Safariland #38 w/Flap, Closed Top Chemical Holder, Black, Basket Weave 34-4B	Safariland	\$29.95
4.17	Safariland #33, Surgical Glove Pouch, Black, Basket Weave 33-4V	Safariland	\$21.95
4.18	Safariland #090H-16, Open Top Handcuff Pouch for Hinged Handcuffs, Black, Basket Weave	Safariland	\$27.95
4.19	Safariland #65, Belt Keeper 4 Pack, Black, Basket Weave 65-4B	Safariland	\$14.95
4.20	Safariland #168, Flap Style Key Ring, Black, Basket Weave 168-4B	Safariland	\$17.95
4.21	Safariland #730, Heavy Duty Flashlight Ring, Black, Basket Weave 730-4B	Safariland	\$12.95
4.22	5.11 Style #48038 Tactical Fleece Jacket 48038-890* Sizes: XS thru XL	5.11	\$109.95
	*Sheriff Green Size 2XL	5.11	\$109.95
	Size 3XL	5.11	\$119.95
	Size 4XL	5.11	\$119.95
	PATCHES		
4.23	Shoulder Patches – to be provided by Jackson County	N/A	N/A
4.24	Badge Patch – to be provided by Jackson County	N/A	N/A
4.25	Sergeant Stripes, Gold on Green	N/A	\$4.00 Set
4.26	Back Patch "Sheriff", 11" x 4", Gold on Black	N/A	\$3.00

NO.	Description	Manufacturer Bid	Unit Price
4.27	Black Stripe, 1 inch, 100% polyester, must be sewn on trousers	N/A	\$ 7.00
SEWING/ALTERATION SERVICES			
4.28	Sewing Services to attach Shoulder Patch (Item 4.23) to uniform	N/A	\$ 3.00 Set
4.29	Sewing Services to attach Badge Patch (Item 4.24) to uniform	N/A	\$ 2.00
4.30	Sewing Services to attach Sergeant Stripes (Item 4.25) to uniform	N/A	\$ 4.00
4.31	Sewing Services to attach Back Patch (Item 4.26) to uniform	N/A	\$ 2.00
4.32	Sewing Services to attach Stripes, one pair of Black Stripes (Item 4.27) on to Trousers	N/A	\$ 7.00
4.33	Sewing Services to alter shirts as necessary for proper fit for Officer	N/A	\$ 0
4.34	Sewing Services to alter pants/trousers as necessary for proper fit for Officer	N/A	\$ 0
MISC. ITEMS			Discount Offered
4.35	Misc. Catalog Orders – list percentage discount off manufacturer’s list pricing for misc. catalog orders. If you are offering more than one discount, include on your letterhead additional sheets as necessary to make your bid complete.		10 %

For additional uniform items, pricing on additional sizes, and/or other services available that you offer, include pricing and all information on additional sheets as necessary to make your bid complete.

SIGNATURE: <i>Sharon R. Thomas</i>	DATE: 01-27-2015
NAME: <i>Sharon R. Thomas</i> (Print or Type)	PHONE: 816-903-0999
TITLE: <i>Majority Owner</i> (Print or Type)	CELL: 816-536-0750
COMPANY NAME: <i>The Armory, LLC</i> (Print or Type)	FAX: 816-903-0990
EMAIL ADDRESS: <i>the.armoryonline@msn.com</i> (Print or Type)	
WEB ADDRESS: <i>www.the.armoryonline.com</i> (Print or Type)	

10.0 ATTACHMENTS

Attachments can be viewed on the Jackson County Bid site under Addendums

10.1 Examples of Patches



PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

415 East 12th Street
Kansas City, Missouri 64106

Res. 18822

816-881-3267

Fax 816-881-3268

REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL NO. 84-14

ADDENDUM NO. 1

ISSUED: January 9, 2015

PAGE 1 of 1

This Addendum hereby changes, modified, and amends the previously issued Invitation to Bid as follows:

9.0 Quotations: Please add the following Items to be quoted.

NO.	Description	Manufacturer Bid	Unit Price
	Uniform Apparel		
4.36	Rain Cover for Stratton Hats	Stratton	10.95
4.37	Safariland #90-4B, Handcuff Pouch, Top Flap, Basket Weave with Brass Snap	Safariland	29.95
4.38	Monadnock #MD3625 Front Draw Holder for Classic Friction Lock 16-21" Batons, 360, Basket Weave Black	Monadnock	34.95
4.39	Safariland Model 77 Double Magazine Pouch *Per Deputy Firearm Specs	Safariland	38.95
4.40	Safariland Model 295 Mid-Ride, Level II Retention Duty Holster *Per Deputy Firearm Specs	Safariland	181.95
4.41	Neese #5003RSJ3M Reversible Rain Jacket, with SHERIFF letter inside and out	Neese	149.95
4.42	Neese #5003RPTSM Reversible Police Trouser	Neese	89.95
4.43	Neese # 5003RHO Reversible Rain Hood	Neese	10.95

Please Note: The Bid Closing Date and Time of **January 27, 2015, 2:00 PM, CST**, remains intact. If you have any questions concerning this Addendum, please email Cassandra Cheek at ccheek@jacksongov.org.

There are no further changes, modifications, or amendments.

Q. Troy Thomas
Director of Finance and Purchasing

EXHIBIT F
BIDDER'S EXCEPTIONS
TO
SPECIFICATIONS
OF
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 84-14

Respondent's attention is directed to Paragraph 4 of the General Conditions of this Invitation to Bid. **READ THIS PARAGRAPH CAREFULLY.**

The following exceptions to the Specifications of Invitation to Bid No. 84-14 are requested by the undersigned Respondent: (Use additional pages as necessary.)

REFERENCE PARA # & PAGE #	EXCEPTION REQUESTED
4.4 #18	Elbeco #3582 Duty Maxx Sk Shirt 14 1/2 - 18 = \$54.95 18 1/2 = \$60.45 19-20 = \$65.94 22 = \$71.44
4.11 #19	5.11 Fleece Jacket #48038-019 Black XS-2XL = \$109.95 3XL = \$119.95 4XL = \$119.95

Name of Firm: _____

Signature of Bidder: _____