### IN THE COUNTY LEGISLATURE OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI

A RESOLUTION awarding twelve (12) month term and supply contracts for the furnishing of chemicals and fertilizers for use by the Parks and Recreation Department to CWC Chemical, Inc. of Cloverdale, VA, John Deere Landscapes of Cleveland, OH, Grass Pad, Inc. of Olathe, KS, Vegetation Management Supply of Kansas City, KS, Helena Chemical Company of Shawnee, KS, Reinders, Inc. of Elm Grove, WI, under the terms and conditions of Electronic Solicitation No. BB200949.

**RESOLUTION #17187**, March 1, 2010

INTRODUCED BY Fred Arbanas, County Legislator

WHEREAS, the Director of Finance and Purchasing has solicited bids on Electronic Solicitation No. BB200949 for the furnishing of chemicals and fertilizers for use by the Parks and Recreation Department to provide for departmental needs for the upcoming one-year period; and,

WHEREAS, a total of eighteen (18) notifications were distributed and seven (7) responses were received; and,

WHEREAS, the Director of Finance and Purchasing recommends that the contract be divided and awarded to the vendors submitting the lowest bid for each item; and,

WHEREAS, award as recommended would result in awards to the following:

BIDDER	ITEMS RECOMMENDED
CWC Chemical Inc. Cloverdale, VA	5, 18, 19, & 27
John Deere Landscapes Cleveland, OH	6, 21, 25 & 26
Grass Pad Inc. Olathe, KS	1, 3, 4, 14, 22, 24, 29, 32, & 36
Vegetation Management Supply Kansas City, KS	17
Helena Chemical Co Shawnee, KS	8, 11, & 20
Reinders, Inc. Elm Grove, WI	2, 7, 9, 10, 12, 13, 15, 16, 23, 28, 30, 31, & 33-35

BE IT RESOLVED by the County Legislature of Jackson County, Missouri, that award be made as recommended by the Director of Finance and Purchasing, and that the Director be, and is hereby, authorized to execute for the County any documents necessary to the accomplishment of the award; and,

now therefore,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Director of Finance and Purchasing is authorized to make all payments, including final payment on the contracts, to the extent that sufficient appropriations to the using spending agency have been made in the then current Jackson County budget.

Effective Date: This Resolution shall be effective immediately upon its passage by a majority of the Legislature.

APPROVED AS TO FORM:	
Punela Jellin  Deputy/Assistant County Counselor	Acting County Counselor
Certificate of Passage	·
I hereby certify that the attached resolution was duly passed on	tion, Resolution #17187 of March 1, 2010, , 2010 by the Jackson County s:
Yeas	Nays
Abstaining	Absent
3.8.10 Date	Mary Jo Spino, Clerk of Legislature
This award is made on a need basis and does specific amount. The availability of funds fo appropriations.	s not obligate Jackson County to pay any r specific purchases is subject to annual
February 24,2010 Date	Director of Finance and Purchasing

## REQUEST FOR LEGISLATIVE ACTION

Completed by County Counselor's Office:
RestOrd No.: 17187
Sponsor(s): Fred Arbanas
Date: March 1, 2010

SUBJECT			
SODJECT	Action Requested		
†	Resolution		
1	☐ Ordinance		
	Project/Title: Awarding a Twelve-Month Term and Sur	only Contract for the furnishi	ng of PARK OPERATIONS
	CHEMICALS & FERTILIZERS for the Parks & Recrea	ation Department to CW <u>C</u> Ch	nemical Inc., Cloverdale,
	VA. John Deere Landscapes of Cleveland, OH: Grass P.	ad Inc. of Olathe, KS; Vegeta	ation Management Supply
	of Kansas City, KS; Helena Chemical Co. of Shawnee,	<u>KS; and Reinders Inc. of Elm</u>	<u>Grove, WI; under the term</u>
	and conditions of Electronic Solicitation No. BB200949	<b>±</b>	
BUDGET		0.314	
INFORMATION	Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year:	\$ N/A	•
To be completed	Amount previously authorized this fiscal year:	\$ N/A	
By Requesting	Total amount authorized after this legislative action:	\$ N/A	
Department and	Amount budgeted for this item * (including	\$ N/A	
Finance	transfers):	FROM ACCT	
	Source of funding (name of fund) and account code	FROM ACCI	
	number; FROM / TO		
•		TO ACCT	
		IO ACCI	
	* If account includes additional funds for other expenses, total budgete	ed in the account is: \$	
		•	
	OTHER FINANCIAL INFORMATION:		
	No budget impact (no fiscal note required)	1 hardward antimotod right	so and use of contract
	Term and Supply Contract (funds approved in the approved in th	muai oudget); estimated vait	le and use of contract.
	Department: Parks Estimated Use:	\$82,000.00	
	Prior Year Budget (if applicable): \$79,000.00		
	Prior Year Actual Amount Spent (if applicable): \$28,00	0.00	
	NOTE: Actual usage changes every year. The pests, di	seases, and weather are all fa	ctors that determine the
	amount and type of chemicals and fertilizers used each y	/ear.	
PRIOR			
LEGISLATION	Prior ordinances and (date): N/A		
	Prior resolutions and (date): 16941, 6/22/09		
CONTACT	Tradity Delland	Caniar Duyar 981 3/65	
INFORMATION	RLA drafted by (name, title, & phone): Teddy Ballard,	Sellor Buyer, 661-3403	
REQUEST	The Parks Department requested a bid for chemicals and	I fertilizers for Park Operatio	ns. Purchasing issued
SUMMARY	Electronic Solicitation No. BB200949. A total of 18 no	tifications were distributed w	ith seven responses
	received. The following split of award is recommended	to the low bidder on each ite	em except items 4, 6, 20, 21,
	24 where the low bidder was not an acceptable alternate	, the next low bid is recomme	ended:
	BIDDER	LOW BID/ITEMS RI	ECOMMENDED
	CWC Chemicals, Cloverdale, VA	5, 18, 19, & 27	
	John Deere Landscapes, Cleveland, OH	6, 21, 25 & 26	22 8-26
	Grass Pad, Olathe, KS	1, 3, 4, 14, 22, 24, 29,	, 32, 62 30
	Vegetation Management, Kansas City, KS	17 8, 11, & 20	
	Helena Chemical, Shawnee, KS	0, 11, 02 40	5, 16, 23, 28, 30, 31, & 33-35
	Reinders, Elm Grove, WI	4, 1, 9, 10, 12, 13, 13	10, 20, 20, 50, 51, 60 55.55

	Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, 1984, the Director of Finance recommends the award of a Twelve Month Term and Supply Contract for the furnishin OPERATIONS CHEMICALS & FERTILIZERS for the Parks & Recreation Departmed Inc., Cloverdale, VA; John Deere Landscapes of Cleveland, OH; Grass Pad Inc. of Ola Management Supply of Kansas City, KS; Helena Chemical Co. of Shawnee, KS; and R Grove, WI; under the term and conditions of Electronic Solicitation No. BB200949 to the for each item.  This award is made on an "as needed" basis and does not obligate Jackson County to part the availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual appropriations.	g of PARK ent to CWC Chemical the, KS; Vegetation leinders Inc. of Elm the lowest and best bidder
CLEARANCE	☐ Tax Clearance Completed (Purchasing & Department) ☐ Business License Verified (Purchasing & Department) ☐ Chapter 6 Compliance - Affirmative Action/Prevailing Wage (County Auditor's Office Recap of Bids Received, Recap of Prices, and Memo from Mr. JD Ingram of Prices and Memo from Mr. JD Ingram Office and Memo from Mr	
REVIEW	Department Director:	Date:
	Finance (Budget Approval):  If applicable  Division Manager:  County Counselor's Office:	Date: 2/22/10 Date: 2/22/10

.



Administration Historic Sites Ranger Station Leisure Services (816) 503-4800 Fax (816) 795-1234

Kemper Outdoor Education Center (816) 229-8980

Fred Arbanas Golf Course at Longview Lake (816) 761-9445

Blue Springs Marina (816) 795-1112

Jacomo Marina (816) 795-8888

Longview Marina (816) 966-0131

Special Population Services (816) 763-5130

### **MEMORANDUM**

TO:

Teddy Ballard, CPPB Senior Buyer, Purchasing

FROM:

JD Ingram, Superintendent of Park Operations

DATE:

February 10, 2010

SUBJECT: Bid Park Chemical and Fertilizer - BB200949

The Parks and Recreation Department recommends the following vendors and amounts for the term and supply Bid – BB200949 - Park Chemical and Fertilizer:

CWC Chemical

\$1,378.80

John Deere Landscape/Lesco

\$5,604.00

**Grass Pad** 

\$20,181.18

Vegetation Management

\$175.12

Helena

\$6,447.60

Reinders

\$48,011.67

Total

\$81,798.37

Page 1 of 4 CERTIFICATION OF BID OPENING



Jackson County Missouri

**Purchasing Department** 

415 East 12th Street, Room G1

Kansas City, MO 64106

THE LEGISLATURE

		1 11880 CUBA A4					
	(	Click here to at	tach a post awa	ard file to this	citation #BB200 solicitations he	ader.	*
	This file w	ill be viewable	by vendors fro	m the abstract	solicitation vie	ew after award.	
		Optional Title:				n and Consta	
<u> </u>	NGP Nbr: 3350	00	furnishing of P	ARK OPERA	12) Wonth Teri	n and Supply C	ontract for the
Start of Service Date	Email Date	Due Date	Solicit	ation Line iten	18	Requisiti	on Nbr
Mon Feb 15 2010 00:00:00	Mon Dec 14 2009 14:19:58	Tue Jan 12 2010 14:00:00	,	1 TOTAL		RR200	948
Estimated Pr	ice: 0						
	Line Item Vi	lew	Assign/Manage pCa	ard r Response Tracking	Federal Exclude	d Parties List	
Toggle All Switches							
Award /	Price	Pymt Terms	Pymt Text	Discount Price	LABP Price NLAB: +0	Trans Date	Trans Time
Zero dollars r	esponse to Ite	m(s): 001			1		<u> </u>
Award:	0.00	0		0.00	0.00	Fri Jan 08 2010	12:36:05
	i <b>L</b>	CALINC POOD	00025275			FedID: IP Addr:	XX-XXXX614 64.4.105.91
Line Item Prices:	001: 0				<b>4 L</b>		
<u>Recycle</u> Status:	001: Not appl	icable					
Vendor Comments:	1 2 2 2					*	.,
Attached Files:		kOPChemFertE	3idPriceSchedu	ıle.xls			
<u>Buyer</u> <u>Comments:</u>							
					<del></del>		
Award /	Price	Pymt Terms	Pymt Text	Discount Price	LABP Price NLAB: +0	Trans Date	Trans Time
ero dollars re	sponse to Iter	n(s): 001					
Award:	0.00	0	30 net	0.00	0.00	Fri Jan 08	12:32:02

I I	r: LESCO INC	P0000002632	2		100	FedII IP Add	D:   XX-XXXX517 r:  199.178.201.1
<del></del>							
Recyc Statu	le s: 001: Not app	licable					
Vendo Comments	or Item #1 Cmn s:	t: Delivery Tim	e: 7 - 10 days <i>A</i>	\.R.O.			
Attache Files	Item: 001 JacksonCoul Jackson Cnty	nty MO - Chem ∤ labels BB200	FertParks BB2 949.pdf	00 <u>949.xí</u> s			
Buye Comments		·					
Award /	Price	Pymt Terms	Pyint Text	Discount Price	LABP Price NLAB: +0	Trans Date	Trans Time
Zero dollars	response to Ite	m(s): 001					
Award:	0.00	0	net 30	0.00	0.00	Fri Jan 08 2010	10:49:05
	GRASS PAD	WAREHOUSE	P00000039469			FedID: IP Addr:	
Line Iten Prices							
Recycle Status	001: Not appli	cable					
Vendor Comments							
Attached Files:	Item: 001	OPChemFertB	idPriceSchedu	lle.xls			
Buyer Comments:							
Award /	Price	Pymt Terms	Pymt Text	Discount Price	LABP Price NLAB: +0	Trans Date	Trans Time
Zero dollars r	esponse to Item	(s): 001					
Award: C	0.00	0		0.00	0.00	Fri Jan 08 2010	09:02:14
	VEGETATION I INC. P0000003		SUP <u>PLY,</u>			FedID: IP Addr:	XX-XXXX358 66.83.100.26
Line Item <u>Prices:</u>	001: 0				<u> </u>		
Recycle Status:	001: Not applic	able			•		
Vendor Comments:							
					•		jį

Attached Files: Buyer	Item: 001 Glyphosate P Dimension 2E CideKick II La Halosulfuron Jackson Cour	W Label.pdf bel.pdf	10.xls	•			
Comments:							
Award /	Price	Pymt Terms	Pymt Text	Discount Price	LABP Price NLAB: +0	Trans Date	Trans Time
Zero dollars re	esponse to Iter	n(s): 001					
Award: C	0.00	0		0.00	0.00	Tue Jan 12 2010	13:33:13
Vendor:	REINDERS, IN	C P00000090	524				XX-XXXX349 173.118.27.156
Line Item Prices:	001: 0						
Recycle Status:	001: Not appli	cable					
Vendor Comments:			•			····	
Attached Files:	Item: 001	«OPChemFertB	<u>idPriceSchedu</u>	ıle.xlsx			
Bu <u>yer</u> Comments:							·

An temporary Excel formal document has been written. Click here to access it.

Line Item View

Print

Back

© 1996-2010 SicommNet, Inc. All Rights Reserved. - agency\_buyer\_AbstractLS - Tue, 12 Jan 2010 tgroat

# RECAP ELECTRONIC SOLICITATION BB200949 PARK OPERATIONS CHEMICALS AND FERTILIZERS

	CWC	JOHN DEERE	GRASS					
	CHEMICAL,	LANDSCAPES/	PAD,	VEGETATION	HELENA,	SUPREME		
	Cloverdale,	LESCO,	Olathe,	MANAGEMENT,	Lenexa,	TURF,	REINDERS,	
	VA	Cleveland, OH	KS	KCK	KS	Olathe, KS	Paola, KS	
			LIND		LIND			
NO DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PRICE	<b>UNIT PRICE</b>	PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	
1 Round Up Pro, Regulation # 524-475	37.40	92.50	37.00	00.09	71.75	108.75	86.25	
2 Super Trimec	149.90	195.00	159.35	No Bid	144.80	171.00	149.35	
3 Timec Plus	119.90		94.72	No Bid	91.80	No Bid	94.72	
4 Garlan 4	209.90	No B	134.50	93.08	236.50	No Bid	252.08	
5 Glyphosate-Aquatic	54.90	113.70	117.50	61.58	55.00	62.50	No Bid	
6 Delta Guard	No Bid	62.50	39.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
7 Dimension	657.40	510.00	No Bid	No Bid	508.98	630.00	496.83	
8 Merit 75wp	102.08	00.06		No Bid	71.80	78.75		
9 Tempo2	44.00			No Bid	32.45	34.00	29.50	
10 Cutrine Plus	27.96	38.65	No Bid	28.93	29.70	25.00		
11 Hyvar XL	76.95	No Bid	No Bid	17.08	75.80	No Bid	No Bid	
12 Mach II	329.87		No Bid	No Bid	256.80	290.00	226.45	
. 13 Navigate	247.50		No Bid	164.00	176.08	179.00		
14 Remedy	140.95	No B	65.98	70.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
15 Seven 4L	109.90		No Bid	No Bid	88.15	75.00	72.88	
16 Agauthol K	219.90	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	164.63	
17 24d Ester	47.40		109.88			No Bid	No Bid	
18 Pathfinder II	97.40		No Bid	115.00	`	No Bid	No Bid	
19 Pathway	76.25	No Bi	0N	83.35		No Bid	No Bid	
20 Induce-Aqautic Sticker	No Bid	50.00		No Bid	24.00	22.00	No Bid	
21 Dismiss	209.95		~		52.50		No Bid	
22 Sedge Hammer	1,109.95	1,0			840.00	780.00	831.10	
23 Snapshot	147.50	90.00	2		84.00	91.00	81.50	
24 Treflan 5g	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid		No Bid	
25 Baracade	No Bid	147.00	S		147.70	147.70	147.70	
26 Trimec Granular	No Bid	17.00			80.00	No	No Bid	
27 Embark Growth Regulator	30.63		4		44.15	49.00	44.21	
28 Field Marking Chalk, Plus Five Chalk	No Bid	5.00			4.64		3.97	
29 25-5-12 Fertilizer	No Bid	13.25			13.09	11.75	11.67	
30 24-4-8 Fertilizer Plus Dimension	No Bid	20.25	19.92	No Bid	18.60	20.75	17.15	

## RECAP ELECTRONIC SOLICITATION BB200949 PARK OPERATIONS CHEMICALS AND FERTILIZERS

		သလ	JOHN DEERE	GRASS					
		CHEMICAL,	LANDSCAPES/	PAD,	VEGETATION	HELENA,	SUPREME		
		Cloverdale,	LESCO,	Olathe,	MANAGEMENT,	Lenexa,	TURF,	REINDERS.	
		ΥA	Cleveland, OH	KS	KCK	KS KS	Olathe, KS	Paola, KS	
				UNIT		LIND			
일	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PRICE	UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	
સ	31 20-2-8 Fertilizer	No Bid	13.50	10.07	No Bid	12.92	9.85	9.24	
32	32 20-4-8 Fertilizer	No Bid	13.25	10.07	No Bid	12.92	11.70		
33	33 20-4-8 Fertilizer Plus Barricade	No Bid	17.50	13.80	No Bid	18.90	17.00		
34	34 20-27-5 Starter Fertilizer	No Bid	16.50	12.68	No Bid	14.55	14.35	11.37	
윉	35 15-0-5 Fertilizer Plus Merit	No Bid	19.50	19.40	No Bid	22.10	21.15	18 98	
36	36 19-0-6 Plus Barricade	No Bid	17.50	11.39	No Bid	15.62	15.10	13.19	
								700-	
			1						