Road Maintenace Asphalt Surface Products and Services Term and Supply Quote Sheet
Spec Section Item No.  Description Units Quantity Ordered Unit Price Comments
Modot 413.4 1 Fog Seal SY 0-50,000 $1.80 Installed Price
Fog Seal SY 50,000 to 100,000 $1.35 Installed Price
Fog Seal SY Over 100,000 $1.25 Installed Price
Modot 413.2 2 Scrub Seal Sy 0-50,000 $3.00 Installed Price
Scrub Seal SY 50,000 to 100,000 $2.55 Installed Price
Scrub Seal SY Over 100,000 $2.30 Installed Price
Modot 409 3 Chip Seal SY 0-50,000 $3.30 Installed Price
Chip Seal SY 50,000 to 100,000 $2.80 Installed Price
Chip Seal SY Over 100,000 $2.50 Installed Price
4 Asphalt Patching partial depth SY 25 NO BID Installed Price, 25 SY min. per order
5 Asphalt Patching full depth SY 25 NO BID Installed Price, 25 SY min. per order
6 Subgrade Replacement, 6 inch deep | SY 10 NO BID Installed Price, 10 SY min. per order
7 Crack fill and seal LB 3000 $5.10 Installed Price, 3000 LB min. per order.
8 Satu-rock plus Cold Mix Ton 20 NO BID Delivered to Road and Bridge
9 Surface Hot Mix Asphalt for patching  Ton 10 NO BID Picked up by JCPW Commercial Grade Surface Material
APWA 2204.3 10 Tack Oil for patching Gal 100 $695.00 Picked up by JCPW
11 Haydite Aggregate Ton 20 NO BID Delivered to Road and Bridge Stockpile
12 Crack Seal Material LB 1000 NO BID Delivered to Road and Bridge Building
APWA 2207 13 1.5 inch mill sy 15,000-30,000 NO BID Installed Price, min order of 15,000
1.5 inch mill Sy over 30,000 NO BID Installed Price
APWA 2205 14 1.5 inch asphalt overlay Ton 1,200-2,500 NO BID Installed Price, min order of 1,200
1.5 inch asphalt overlay Ton over 2,500 NO BID Installed Price
APWA 2205 15 3 inch asphalt overlay Ton 2,500-5,000 NO BID Installed Price, min order of 2,500
3 inch asphalt overlay over 5,000 NO BID Installed Price
APWA 2202.6 16 Slurry Seal Type | Sy 0-50,000 $4.90 Installed Price
50,000 to 100,000 $4.40 Installed Price
Over 100,000 $4.15 Installed Price
APWA 2206.7 17 Microsurfacing Type | Sy 0-50,000 $5.00 Installed Price
50,000 to 100,000 $4.50 Installed Price
Over 100,000 $4.25 Installed Price
APWA 2306 18 Double Pavement Marking LF 2,500 NO BID Yellow , Paint, solid, installed
APWA 2306 19 Single Solid PM LF 2,500 NO BID Yellow or white, Paint, installed
APWA 2306 20 Broken Single PM LF 2,500 NO BID Yellow or white, Paint, installed
APWA 2306 21 Left or Right Turn Arrow Each 1 NO BID Thermoplastic, installed
APWA 2306 22 2 ft wide Stop Bar LF 12 NO BID Paint, installed
Bidder may add a sheet covering any other items they supply with units, pricing and i ion info.
Bidder may bid an item with the intent to act that item.
Bidder may bid one or all of the items listed.
JC may award parts of this bid to iple bidders.
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