IN THE COUNTY LEGISLATURE OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI

A RESOLUTION awarding a twelve (12) month term and supply contract with a twenty-four
(24) month extension option for the furnishing of electrician service for use by the Parks
and Recreation and Public Works Departments to Infinite Energy dba Progress Electric of
Grandview, MO, under the terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 18-08.

RESOLUTION #16669, July 7, 2008

INTRODUCED BY Bob Spence, County Legislator

WHEREAS, the Director of Finance and Purchasing has solicited formal written bids on
Invitation to Bid No. 18-08 for the furnishing of electrician service for use by the Parks and

Recreation and Public Works Departments; and,

WHEREAS, a total of twenty-eight (28) solicitations were distributed and two (2) responses
was received from the following:
BIDDER
Infinite Energy dba Progress Electric
Grandview, MO
Capital Electric
Kansas City (Jackson), MO

and,

WHEREAS, the Director of Finance and Purchasing has recommended that awa_rd be
made to Infinite Energy dba Progress Electric, for the reason that it has submitted the

lowest and best bid as set forth in the attached recapitulation and analysis; now therefore,



BE IT RESOLVED by the County Legislature of Jackson County, Missouri, that award be
made as recommended by the Director of Finance and Purchasing, and that the Director
be and hereby is authorized to execute for the County any documents necessary to the

accomplishment of the award; and,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Director of Finance and Purchasing is authorized
to make all payments, including final payment on the contract, to the extent that sufficient
appropriations to the using spending agency are contained in the then current Jackson

County budget.



Effective Date: This Resolution shall be effective immediately upon its passage by a
majority of the Legislature.

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Chief [Deputy County Counselor County Counselor
Certificate of Passage

| hereby certify that the attached resolution, Resolution #16669 of July 7, 2008 was

duly passed on / , 2008 by the Jackson County
Legislature. The votes therebn were as follows:

Yeas ? Nays S

Abstaining @, Absent ]

7.15-0% '
Date Mary Jo Spino, Cléerk of the Legislature

This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any
specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual
appropriation.
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Da / ctorof Fjpance and Purchasmg




RECAP INVITATION TO BID NO 18-08 ELECTRIC SERVICE

INFINITE
ENERGY DBA
ALPHA PROGRESS CAPITAL
ENERGY*,| ELECTRIC*, | ELECTRIC,
KCMO |Grandview, MO KCMO
UNIT
NO DESCRIPTION um PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
1|Percentage mark-up above your cost on materials N/A 10% 10% 15%
Hourly rate, Journeyman Electrician w/fully equipped service
2|truck 1 hour 65.00 66.68 89.00
Overtime rate, Journeyman Electrician w/fully equipped service
3(truck 1 hour 82.00 85.84 116.00
4|Hourly rate, additional Journeyman Electrician 1 hour 59.85 63.17 75.50
5|Overtime rate, additional Journeyman Electrician 1 hour 76.75 84.33 104.30
6|Hourly rate, Working Forman w/fully equipped service truck 1 hour 67.00 7645/  89.00
7 |Overtime rate, Working Forman w/fully equipped service truck |1 hour 78.75 99.40 116.00
8|Hourly rate, Journeyman Lineman 1 hour |No Bid 63.25 89.00
9[Overtime rate, Journeyman Lineman 1 hour |No Bid 84.75 116.00
10|Hourly rate, Outside Apprentice, Year 1 1 hour 24.68 23.30 33.80
11|Overtime rate, Outside Apprentice, Year 1 1 hour 26.75 30.89 44.40
12 |Hourly rate, Outside Apprentice, Year 2 1 hour 27.44 27.22 36.50
13|Overtime rate, Outside Apprentice, Year 2 1 hour 35.50 36.71 48.40
14|Hourly rate, Outside Apprentice, Year 3 1 hour 38.67 38.52 54.50
15| Overtime rate, Outside Apprentice, Year 3 1 hour 48.50 49.92 70.40
16|Hourly rate, Outside Apprentice, Year 4 1 hour 43.26 43.06 60.80
17 |Overtime rate, Outside Apprentice, Year 4 1 hour 55.00 56.36 79.30
18|Hourly rate, Outside Apprentice, Year 5 1 hour 52.46 47.58 67.00
19|Overtime rate, Outside Apprentice, Year 5 1 hour 67.50 62.77 88.10
20|Hourly rate, Lift Truck w/35 foot reach and Operator 1 hour 365.00 86.17 108.00
21|Overtime rate, Lift Truck w/35 foot reach and Operator 1 hour 400.00 110.59 140.00
22|Hourly rate, Lift Truck w/65 foot reach and Operator 1 hour 780.00 135.03 108.00
23|Overtime rate, Lift Truck w/65 foot reach and Operator 1 hour 810.00 188.22 140.00
24 |Hourly rate, Lift Truck w/120 foot reach and Operator 1 hour| 2,535.00 278.73 108.00
25|Overtime rate, Lift Truck w/120 foot reach and Operator 1 hour 2,600.00 367.87 140.00
26|Hourly rate, Trencher w/Operator ' 1 hour |No Bid 95.63 108.00
27 |Overtime rate, Trencher w/Operator 1 hour [No Bid 129.64 140.00
28|Hourly rate, Boom Crane w/Operator 1 hour [No Bid 135.03 108.00
29|Overtime rate, Boom Crane w/Operator 1 hour |No Bid 188.22 140.00
30|Hourly rate, Backhoe w/Operator 1 hour |No Bid 135.03 108.00
31|Overtime rate, Backhoe w/Operator 1 hour |No Bid 159.92 140.00
32 |Hourly rate, Bobcat w/Operator 1 hour |No Bid 92.03 108.00
33|Overtime rate, Bobcat w/Operator 1 hour |No Bid 124.97 108.00
Percentage mark-up on sub-contractor's and/or additional
34|services not listed above N/A  |No Bid 10% 15%

* MBE

NO BIDS RECEIVED:

Walker Electric, Kansas City, KS
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RECAP OF COMPARABLE OF LIKE ITEMS
INVITATION TO BID NO 18-08 ELECTRIC SERVICE

INFINITE
ENERGY DBA
ALPHA PROGRESS CAPITAL
ENERGY*,| ELECTRIC*, | ELECTRIC,
KCMO |Grandview, MO KCMO
UNIT
NO DESCRIPTION u/m PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
Hourly rate, Journeyman Electrician w/fully equipped service
2|truck 1 hour 65.00 66.68 89.00
Overtime rate, Journeyman Electrician w/fully equipped service
3|truck 1 hour 82.00 85.84 116.00
4|Hourly rate, additional Journeyman Electrician 1 hour 59.85 63.17 75.50
5|/Overtime rate, additional Journeyman Electrician 1 hour 76.75 84.33 104.30
6|Hourly rate, Working Forman w/fully equipped service truck 1 hour 67.00 76.45 89.00
7|Overtime rate, Working Forman w/fully equipped service truck |1 hour 78.75 99.40 116.00
10|Hourly rate, Outside Apprentice, Year 1 1 hour 24.68 23.30 33.80
11 |Overtime rate, Outside Apprentice, Year 1 1 hour 26.75 30.89 44 .40
12|Hourly rate, Outside Apprentice, Year 2 1 hour 27.44 27.22 36.50
13|Overtime rate, Outside Apprentice, Year 2 1 hour 35.50 36.71 48.40
14 |Hourly rate, Outside Apprentice, Year 3 1 hour 38.67 38.52 54.50
15|Overtime rate, Outside Apprentice, Year 3 1 hour 48.50 49.92 70.40
16|Hourly rate, Outside Apprentice, Year 4 1 hour 43.26 43.06 60.80
17|Overtime rate, Outside Apprentice, Year 4 1 hour 55.00 56.36 79.30
18|Hourly rate, Outside Apprentice, Year 5 1 hour 52.46 47.58 67.00
19| Overtime rate, Outside Apprentice, Year 5 1 hour 67.50 62.77 88.10
20|Hourly rate, Lift Truck w/35 foot reach and Operator 1 hour 365.00 86.17 108.00
21|Overtime rate, Lift Truck w/35 foot reach and Operator .|1 hour 400.00 110.59 140.00
22|Hourly rate, Lift Truck w/65 foot reach and Operator 1 hour 780.00 135.03 108.00
23|Overtime rate, Lift Truck w/65 foot reach and Operator 1 hour 810.00 188.22 140.00
TOTAL OF LIKE ITEMS 3,204.11 1,412.21 1,669.00

* MBE
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