### IN THE COUNTY LEGISLATURE OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI

A RESOLUTION awarding twelve-month term and supply contracts for the furnishing of golf course chemicals and fertilizers for use by the Parks + Rec Department to Agrium Advanced Technologies of Loveland, CO, Helena Chemical Co., of Shawnee, KS, Reinders, Inc., of Olathe, KS, and Supreme Turf Products of Olathe, KS, under the terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 95-12.

**RESOLUTION NO. 18072**, January 28, 2013

INTRODUCED BY Fred Arbanas, County Legislator

WHEREAS, the Director of Finance and Purchasing has solicited bids on Invitation to Bid No. 95-12 for the furnishing of golf course chemicals and fertilizers for use by the Parks + Rec Department; and,

WHEREAS, a total of twenty-four notifications were distributed and eight responses were received; and,

WHEREAS, following evaluation of the bids submitted, the Director of Finance and Purchasing recommends that the contract be divided and awarded to the vendors submitting the lowest bid for each item; and,

WHEREAS, award as recommended would result in awards to the following vendors:

### **BIDDER**

Agrium Advance Technologies
Loveland, CO
Helena Chemical
Shawnee, KS
Reinders, Inc.
Olathe, KS
Supreme Turf Products
Olathe, KS

now therefore,

BE IT RESOLVED by the County Legislature of Jackson County, Missouri, that award be made as recommended by the Director of Finance and Purchasing and that the Director be, and is hereby, authorized to execute for the County any documents necessary to the accomplishment of the award; and,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Director of Finance and Purchasing is authorized to make all payments, including final payment on the contracts, to the extent that sufficient appropriations to the using spending agency are contained in the then current Jackson County budget.

Effective Date: This Resolution shall be effective immediately upon its passage by a majority of the Legislature.

APPROVED AS TO FORM:	$\frac{1}{2}$
Chef Deputy County Counselor Certificate of Passage	County Countelor
I hereby certify that the attached resolution 1 hereby certify that the attached resolution 2013, was duly passed on 2 hereby County Legislature. The votes thereon were	olution, Resolution No. 18072 of January 28, 2013 by the Jackson e as follows:
Yeas	Nays
Abstaining	Absent
<b>ス・4・13</b> Date	Mary Jo Spino Clerk of Legislature

This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual appropriation.

January 23, 2013

Director of Finance and Purchasing

## REQUEST FOR LEGISLATIVE ACTION

Completed by County Counselor's Office:

Res/Ord No.: 18072

Sponsor(s): Date:

Fred Arbanas Jan. 28, 2013

SUBJECT	Action Requested  Resolution Ordinance  Project/Title: Awarding a Twelve-Month Term and Supply Contra Chemicals & Fertilizers for the Parks + Rec Department to Agrium Helena Chemical Co. of Shawnee, KS; Reinders Inc. of Olathe, KS under the term and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 95-12.	Advanced Tecl	hnologies of Loveland, CO;										
BUDGET INFORMATION To be completed By Requesting Department and Finance	Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year: Amount previously authorized this fiscal year: Total amount authorized after this legislative action: Amount budgeted for this item * (including transfers): Source of funding (name of fund) and account code number; FRO	OM / TO	\$ N/A \$ N/A \$ N/A \$ N/A FROM ACCT										
	* If account includes additional funds for other expenses, total budgeted in the account	unt is: \$	TO ACCT										
	OTHER FINANCIAL INFORMATION:												
	☐ No budget impact (no fiscal note required)												
	Term and Supply Contract (funds approved in the annual budget); estimated value and use of contract:  Department: Parks Estimated Use: \$113,000.00  Prior Year Budget (if applicable): \$115,000.00												
	Prior Year Budget (if applicable): \$115,000.00												
	Prior Year Actual Amount Spent (if applicable): \$55,000.00*												
·	* In 2012, with the high temperatures and the drought conditions, the lowered the actual dollar amount spent.	he turf dieses w	here minimal which in turn										
PRIOR LEGISLATION	Prior ordinances and (date): N/A												
	Prior resolutions and (date): 17819, 02/21/12												
CONTACT INFORMATION	RLA drafted by (name, title, & phone): Teddy Ballard, Senior Bu	yer, 881-3465											
REQUEST SUMMARY	The Parks Department requires a bid for chemicals and fertilizers to Purchasing issued Invitation to Bid No. 95-12 in response to those	o use in maintai requirements.	ning the golf course.										
	A total of 24 notifications were distributed with eight responses recaward is recommended to the lowest and best bidder for each item.	eived and evalumeeting specific	nated. The following split of cations:										
	BIBBER		MMENDED FOR AWARD										
	Agrium Advance Technologies, Loveland, CO Helena Chemical Co., Shawnee, KS Reinders Inc., Olathe, KS Supreme Turf Products, Olathe, KS	12, 14, 15, 18,	, 25, 26, 28-31, 37, 38, & 41 20, 24, 27, 34, 35, & 42 6, 19, 22, 23, 36, 39, & 40 3										

	NOTE: The Golf Course determined the chemical content and recommended use for the meet minimum specifications so the next best bid is recommended for award on the fol 31, 33, 39, and 40.	ne alternate bids did not lowing items: 14, 15, 26,
	Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, the Director of Finance and Puaward of a Twelve Month Term and Supply Contract for the furnishing of Golf Course for the Parks + Rec Department to Agrium Advanced Technologies of Loveland, CO; I Shawnee, KS; Reinders Inc. of Olathe, KS; and, Supreme Turf Products of Olathe, KS, conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 95-12 and to the lowest and best bidder meeting spe	Chemicals & Fertilizers Helena Chemical Co. of under the term and cifications for each item.
	This award is made on an "as needed" basis and does not obligate Jackson County to particle availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual appropriations.	ay any specific amount.
CLEARANCE	<ul> <li>☐ Tax Clearance Completed (Purchasing &amp; Department)</li> <li>☐ Business License Verified (Purchasing &amp; Department)</li> <li>☐ Chapter 6 Compliance - Affirmative Action/Prevailing Wage (County Auditor's Only)</li> </ul>	ffice)
ATTACHMENTS		
	Abstract of Bids, Recap of Unit Prices, and Memo from Mr. Russell Bonneville, Golf C	
REVIEW	Department Director.	Date: /-/5-/3
	Finance (Budget Approval): If applicable Youran & Ball NA	Date: 1-22-13
	Division Manager:	Date: 1/23/15
	County Counselor's Office:	Date:

### This expenditure was included in the annual budget. Funds for this were encumbered from the \_\_\_\_\_\_ Fund in \_\_\_\_. There is a balance otherwise unencumbered to the credit of the appropriation to which the expenditure is chargeable and there is a cash balance otherwise unencumbered in the treasury to the credit of the fund from which payment is to be made each sufficient to provide for the obligation herein authorized. Funds sufficient for this expenditure will be/were appropriated by Ordinance # Funds sufficient for this appropriation are available from the source indicated below. Account Title: Account Number: Amount Not to Exceed: This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as each using agency places its order.

This legislative action does not impact the County financially and does not require Finance/Budget approval.

Fiscal Information (to be verified by Budget Office in Finance Department)

ABSTRACT \_\_\_ OF

				AMOUNT												
	Maas			AMOUNT	See bid											
	BWI	Companies		AMOUNT												
	Reinders			AMOUNT		i							,			
Helena	Chemical	Company		AMOUNT												
				αтУ												
				TIND												
BID NO: 95-12	<b>DATE</b> : 12/11/12	COMMODITY: Golf Course Chemicals &	Fertilizers	DESCRIPTION	Total Base Bid						ÓPENED AND REGORDED	ON VICTOR DE IN DONZ BY			SECTION OF STATE OF S	では、   には、   では、   には、   には、
				8												

<u> </u>	BID NO: 95-12 DATE: 12/11/12			Central Garden	John Deere	Grass Pad,	Supreme	Floratine
J	COMMODITY: Golf Course Chemicals &			100000	Laided	<u>:</u>		Midwest
H	Fertilizers							
<u>Q</u>	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	QTY	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT
<b>-</b>	Total Base Bid			Seebia	Š	Seebol	(V)	hidias
		_						1
-		i						
			!					
	OPENIED AND RECORDED							
	ON CHENDATIN							
	CLEXIX OF THE LEGISLATURE							
	NIGHT OF THE PROPERTY OF THE P							

## RECAP OF UNIT PRICES INVITATION TO BID NO. 95-12 GOLF COURSE CHEMICALS AND FERTILIZERS

	AGRIUM	BWI		GRASS	H		5	CIEDERME
	ADVANCED	COMPANIES,	FLORATINE	PAD,	CHEMICAL,	PENNINGTON	DEINDEBS	TURF
	Loveland, CO	MO MO	Raymore, MO	KS KS	Sildwilee, KS	SEED, Greenfield, MO	Olathe, KS	PRODUCIS, Olathe, KS
				TIND				
NO DESCRIPTION OR7 Acelepton 50% Lifexy SGN	UNII PRICE	UNII PRICE	UNII PRICE	PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
1 150	0.5844	No Bid	No Bid	0.6296	No Bid	No Bid	0.5296	0.557
2 18-24-12	0.365	0.3894	No Bid	0.3704	0.3526		0.3326	
3 19-0-19 with Iron (fairway fertilizer)	0.5398	0.3252	No Bid	0.518	0.3088		0.2936	0.3
4 32-0-8	0.35	0.4106	No Bid	0.3476	0.288		0.331	0.287
5 Admiral (pond die)	38.00	30.28	No Bid	36.18	34.00	No B	28.44	34.00
6 Alpha Nova	49.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7 Astron	26.00	No Bid	00.06	No Bid	80.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8 Barricade .28 41-0-0	0.347	0.4772	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.365	0.5316	0.3
9 Bayleton 50	5.50	5.86	No Bid	No Bid	5.25	No Bid	4.5783	6.023
10 BCMU 18-4-18 (greens grade)	0.79	0.643	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.68	0.5658	0.6
11 Bensumec	110.00	107.20	No Bid	97.752	93.76	No Bid	91.872	98.00
12 Calphlex	45.00	No Bid	48.00	No Bid	31.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13 Contec 20-0-10 (greens grade)	1.09	1.3375	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.2975	1.2975
14 Daconil Action	00.69	00.69	No Bid	No Bid	00.69	32.00	00.69	69.00
15 Daconil Zn	. 46.70	47.304	No Bid	62.25	46.70	28.80	46.70	46.70
16 Duration 45	0.551	No Bid	No Bid	0.562	No Bid	No Bid	0.5088	0.6
17 Headway	406.00	417.00	No Bid	No Bid	417.00	No Bid	417.00	417.00
18 Heritage	317.00	317.00	No Bid	No Bid	317.00		317.00	317.00
19 Honor	140.50	140.50	No Bid	No Bid	140.50		131.40	140.50
20 Kickstand	4.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.80	No Bid	No Bid	
21 Knife Plus	8.00	11.004	20.00	No Bid	9.00		33.872	No Bid
22 Manganese Edta	No Bid	16.52	No Bid	No Bid	60.00		24.95	No Bid
23 Milorganite Greens Grade	0.2875	0.22375	No Bid	0.1896	0.1914	No Bid	0.1676	0.19
24 Momentum	59.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	48.00	No Bid	48.69	No Bid
25 P-48	1.2720		8.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
26 Phacid	69.75	8	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	47.94	65.00
27 Power 0-0-22	19.75		35.00	28.992	14.00	No Bid	24.95	No Bid
28 Prospect	32.50		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
29 Protosyn	49.50	No Bid	51.00	No Bid	00.09	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

# RECAP OF UNIT PRICES INVITATION TO BID NO. 95-12 GOLF COURSE CHEMICALS AND FERTILIZERS

ME TS,	S E	7	-	6.207	000	40.12	512.00	27.73	7	7.	43.20	398.00	0.35	4.6875	Ţ		}			
SUPREME TURF PRODUCTS, Olathe, KS	UNIT PR	No Bid						2	No Bid					4.						
REINDERS, Olathe, KS	UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE	No Bid	44.00	6.207	No Bid		464.56	15.477	No Bid	40.98	4	၉	0.2938	5.281						
PENNINGTON SEED, Greenfield, MO	UNIT PRICE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.50	13.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	24.666	240.00		No Bid						
HELENA CHEMICAL, Shawnee, KS	UNIT PRICE	No Bid	No Bid	6.207	20.00		450.52	23.22	No Bid	35.00	No Bid	398.00	0.326	4.355						
GRASS PAD, Olathe, KS	PRICE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	43.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	239.00	0.392	4.47						
FLORATINE MIDWEST, Raymore, MO	UNIT PRICE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
BWI COMPANIES, Springfield, MO	UNIT PRICE	No Bid	No Bid	6.5971	20.00	36.11	489.52	25.78	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	432.60	0.37	No Bid						
AGRIUM ADVANCED TECH., Loveland, CO	UNIT PRICE	230.00	90.00	6.207	20.00	35.50	480.00	24.95	32.50	32.00	42.80	230.00	0.29	13.59						
	DESCRIPTION	30 Radiate	31 Revert	32 Revolver	33 Ronstar	34 Round Up	35 Scimitar	36 Signature (fungicide)	37 Sirius	38 Star Phite	39 Trimec Plus	40 Trimmit	41 Urea	42 Zylam						
	2	್∣	က	ကိ	က်	რ  <sup>გ</sup>	ಣ∣ಣ	ಗ್∖	'n	ಣ	ಗ	4	4	4					- 1	Į



### **MEMORANDUM**

To: Teddy Ballard, Purchasing Department

From: Russell Bonneville, Golf Course Supervisor

Date: 01/09/2013

Subject: Golf Course Chemicals & Fertilizers

The low bidder on the following items offered alternate chemicals and fertilizers to the items specified by Golf Course Maintenance:

Item 14-Daconil Action

Item 15-Daconil Zn

Item 26-PhAcid

Item 31-Revert

Item 33-Ronstar

Item 39-Trimec Plus

Item 40-Trimmit

Golf Course Maintenance determined the chemical content and recommended use for the alternate bids did not meet minimum specifications so the lowest acceptable bid is recommended for award.

List of recommended bidders with items recommended for award:

Agrium Advanced Technologies: Items-6, 7, 13, 17, 21, 25, 26, 28-31, 37, 38 and 41

Helena Chemical: Items-12, 14, 15, 18, 20, 24, 27, 34, 35 and 42 Reinders: Items-1, 3, 5, 9, 10, 11, 16, 19, 22, 23, 36, 39 and 40

Supreme Turf Products: Items-2, 4, 8, 32 and 33