21968 Backup

Bidder: Bob Barker Company' Inc. Jacksou County, Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 25.017
Page 1 of 5

Bidders Quotation Sheet Inmate Clothing

Price entered is (o be for one (1) dozen

No. |Description | Est Qty IUIM | Price Color Manufacturer Bid Bid as Spcceified?

‘'Women’s Wear

5.1 Sport Bra
Size 32 100 Dozen | $ 18.99 | White & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size 34 100 Dozen | $ 18.99 | White & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size 36 100 Dozen $ 18.99 | White & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size 38 100 Dozen $ 18.9% |White & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size 40 100 Dozen $ 18.99 | White & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size 42 100 Dozen | $ 18.99 | White & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size 44 100 Dozen $ 18.99 |White & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size 46 100 Dozen $ 18.95 |White & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size 48 100 Dozen $ {8.99 | White & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size 50 100 Dozen 3 18.99 | White & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size 52 100 Dozen | § 18.99 |White & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size 54 100 Dozen $ 18.9% |White & Orange | Bob Barker Company

Total for Sizes 5.1 $ 22,788.00

52 Briefs ORANGE WHITE
Size 6 100 Dozen $ 990| $ 9.71| Bob Barker Company
Size 8 100 Dozen 3 990) § 9,71 | Bob Barker Company
Size 10 100 Dozen $ 990| § 9,71 | Bob Barker Company
Size 12 100 Dozen $ 990| 8 971 | Bob Barker Company
Size 14 ORANGE ONLY 20 Dozen $ 12,09 $ 9.71| Bob Barker Company
Size 16 SIZES 14-20 20 Dozen 3 12.09| $ 971 | Bob Barker Company
Size 20 | Sold in cases of 300/ea 20 Dozen 3 1209] $ 9.71| Bob Barker Company

Total for Sizes 5.2{ $ 4,68540 § 4,466.60
5.3 |Night Shirt [ 40 | Dozen |5 5988 |  Grey | BobBarker Company

Men's Wear

54 Undershirt ORANGE WIITE
Size Small 100 Dozen No Bid 3 20.52 | Bob Barker Company
Size Medium 100 Dozen $ 26451 % 20.52 | Bob Barker Company
Size Large 200 Dozen $ 264518 20.52 | Bob Barker Company
Size X-Large 200 Dozen | § 264518 20.52 | Bob Barker Company
Size 2X-Large 200 Dozen $ 30951% 22.52 | Bob Barker Company
Size 3X-Large 200 Dozen $ 3095|% 25.52 | Bob Barker Company
Size 4X-Large 100 Dozen | § 3095 $ 28.52 | Bob Barker Company
Size 5X-Large 10 Dozen No Bid $ 28.52 | Bob Barker Company
Size 6X-Large 30 Dozen $ 30951 % 30.52 | Bob Barker Company
Size 7X-Larpe _ 20 Dozen No Bid $ 35.52 | Bob Barker Company
Size 8%-Large | WHITE ONLY 10 Dozen No Bid $ 5800 | Bob Barker Company
Size 9X-Large | SIZES 8XL-10XL 10 Dozent No Bid 3 58.00 | Bob Barker Company
Size 10X Large |Sold in cases of 72/ea) I0 Dozen No Bid $ 58.00 | Bob Barker Company

Totnl for Sizes 5.4] $ 29,628.50 | § 28,423.20

55 Under Shorts
Size 32 Small 100 Dozen |$ 22.95 Orange Bob Barker Company
Size 36 Mediam 100 Dozen |$ 2295 Orange Bob Barker Company
Size 40 Large 200 Dozen |3 22.95 Orange Bob Barker Company
Size 44 X-Large 200 Dozen |§ 2295 Orange Bob Barker Company
Size 48 2X-Large 200 Dozen |§ 22.95 Orange Bob Barker Company
Size 52 3X-Large 200 Dozen 3 2295 Orange Bob Barker Company
Size 56 4X-Large 100 Dozen |$ 2295 Orange Bob Barker Company
Size 58 6X-Large 50 Dozen |$ 22,95 Orange Bob Barker Company
Size 7X-Large 30 Dozen No Bid
Size 8X-Large 30 Dozen No Bid
Size 9X-Large 20 Dozer No Bid
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No. Deseription EstQty |UM Price Color Manufactorer Bid Bid as Specified?
Size 10X Lacpe 20 Dozen No Bid YES NO
Totzal for Sizes 5.5{ $ 26,392.50
5.6 T-shirts ORANGE WHITE
Size 32 Smali 100 Dozen |§ 4776 | $ 39,12 | Bob Barker Company
Size 36 Medium 100 Dozen |$ 4776 | § 39.12| Bob Barker Company
Size 40 Large 100 Dozen |3 4776 | $ 39.12| Bob Barker Company
Size 44 X-Large 100 Dozen |3 4776 | § 39.12| Bob Barker Company
Size 48 2X-Large 100 Dozen | $ 6096 | $ 52.68| Bob Barker Company
Size 52 3X-Large 100 Dozen 3 6096| 8§ 52.68| Bob Barker Company
Size 56 4X-Large 100 Dozen $ 6096 $ 52.68| Bob Barker Company
Size 58 6X-Large 100 Dozen 3 6096| $ 52.68| Bob Barker Company
Size 7X-Large 100 Dozen No Bid No Bid
Size 8X-Large 100 Dozen No Bid No Bid
Total for Sizes 5.6|3
5.7 T-shirts ORANGE WHITE
Size 32 Small 100 Dozen No Bid $ 35.78 | Bob Barker Company
Size 36 Medium 100 Dozen |$ 3648 | $ 3578 | Bob Barker Company
Size 40 Large 100 Dozen |$ 3648 | $ 3578 | Bob Barker Company
Size 44 X-Larpe 100 Dozen |$ 3648 | $ 3578 | Bob Barker Company
Size 48 2X-Laige 100 Dozen |$ 40.08 | $ 60.78 | Bob Barker Company
Size 52 3X-Large 100 Dozen |$ 4008 | $ 76.78 | Bob Barker Company
Size 56 4X-Large 100 Dozen |$ 5208 | § 76.78 | Bob Barker Company
Size 58 6X-Large 100 Dozen |$ 64.08 No Bid Bob Barker Company
Size 7X-Large 100 Dozen No Bid No Bid
Size 8X-Latge 100 Dozen No Bid No Bid
Total for Sizes 5.7| § 30,576.00 | S 35,746.00
Footwear
5.8 Tennis Shoes, Slip-on; Men
Size Men 7 200 Paicr | $ 5.47 |Navy & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size Men 8 350 Paic |$ 5.47 |Navy & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size Men 9 500 Paiv | § 5.47 |Navy & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size Men 10 500 Pair |3 5.47 |Navy & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size Men 11 500 Pair |$ 5.47 |Navy & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size Men 12 200 Pair |$% 5.47 |Navy & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size Men 13 200 Pair |$ 547 |Navy & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size Men 14 50 Pair |$ 547 |Navy & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size Men 15 50 Pair | $ 5.47 |Navy & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size Men 16 10 Pair |$ 5.47 |Navy & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size Men 17 10 Pair  |No Bid
Size Men 18 10 Pair |NoBid
Size Men 19 10 Pair  |NoBid
Size Men 20 10 Pair |No Bid
Tennis Shoes, Slip-On; Women
Size Women 5 20 Pair |$ 547 |Navy & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size Women 6 25 Pair |$ 5.47 |Navy & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size Women 7 40 Pair |$ 5.47 |Navy & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size Women 8 40 Pair |3 547 |Navy & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size Women 9 35 Pair | $ 547 |Navy & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size Women 10 25 Pair |$ 547 |Navy & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Total for Sizes 5.8| § 15,015.15
5.9 Tennis Shoes, Velero Closures; Men
Size Men 5 10 Pair | $ 5.78 | Orange & White| Bob Barker Company
Size Men 6 10 Pair | $ 5.78 | Orange & White| Bob Barker Company
|Size Men 7 25 Paic | § 5.78 | Orange & White| Bob Barker Company
Size Men 8 50 Pair $ 5.78 | Orange & White| Bob Barker Company | = YES: NO
Size Men 9 20 Pair $ 5.78 | Orange & White| Bob Barker Company YES NO
| Size Men 10 70 Pair $ 5.78 | Orange & White| BobBarker Company |:**YES::i| NO
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Size Men 11 50 Pair | $ 5.78 | Orange & White| Bob Barker Company
Size Men 12 50 Par |$ 5.78 | Orange & White| Bob Barker Company
Size Men 13 25 Pair $ 5.78 | Orange & White| Bob Barker Company
Size Men 14 10 Pair 3 5.78 | Orange & White| Bob Barker Company
Size Men 15 10 Pair 3 5.78 | Orange & White| Bob Barker Company
Size Men 16 12 Pair | § 5.78 | Orange & White| BobBarker Company
Size Men 17 12 Pair | $ 5.78 | Orange & White| Bob Barker Company
Size Men 18 12 Pair No Bid
Size Men 19 12 Pair No Bid
Size Men 20 12 Pair No Bid
Total for Sizes 59| $ 2,046.12
5.10 |Shower Shoes
Size Men 5-6 200 Dozen 3 523 ‘White Bob Barker Company
Size Men 7-8 200 Dozen |$ 923 White Bob Barker Company
Size Men 9-10 200 Dozen |$§ 9.23 White Bob Barker Company
Size Men 11-12 200 Dozen |$ 9.23 White Bob Barker Company
Size Men 13-14 200 Dozen |3 9.23 White Bob Barker Company
Size Men 15-16 200 Dozen No Bid
Total for Sizes 5.10|  9,230.008
5.11  |Molded Shoes
Size Men 5-6 9 Dozen |3 49.08 | Black & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size Men 7-8 9 Dozen |$ 49.08 | Black & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size Men 9-10 33 Dozen | § 49.08 | Black & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size Mea 11-12 33 Dozen |$ 49,08 | Black & Orange |* Bob Barker Company
Size Men 13-14 33 Dozen |$ 49.08 | Black & Orange | Bob Barker Company
Size Men 15-16 25 Dozen |$ 49.08 | Black & Orange | Bob Barker Compamy
Total for Sizes 5.11] $ 6,969.36
512  [Socks
Size 5-6 100 Dozen |$ 4.78 Orange Bob Barker Company
Size 7-8 100 Dozen |$ 4.78 Orange Bob Barker Company
Size 9-10 100 Dozen |$ 4,78 Qrange Bob Barker Company
Size 11-12 100 Dozen |§ 4.78 Orange Bob Barker Company
Size 13-14 100 Dozen No Bid
Size 15-16 100 Dozen No Bid
Total for Sizes 5.12|3
Inmate Uniform
5.13  |Shirts
Size Small 1000 Dozen |3 69.24 Tri Stitch
Size Medium 1000 Dozen |$ 69.24 Tri Stitch
Size Large 1000 Dozen |$ 69.24 Tri Stitch
Size X-Large 1000 Dozen |$ 69.24 All 4 Colors Tri Stitch
Size 2X-Large 1000 Dozen |3 73.80 KHAKI Tri Stitch
Size 3X-Large 1000 Dozen 3 73.80 ORANGE Tri Stitch
Size 4X-Large 1000 Dozen |3 73.80 NAVY Tri Stitch
Size SX-Large 1000 | Dozen [$ 80.04 GREEN Tri Stitch
Size 6X-Large 1000 Dozen |$ 80.04 Tri Stitch
Size 7X-Large 1000 Dozen |$ 80.04 Tri Stitch
Size 8X-Large 1000 Dozen |$ £0.04 Tri Stitch
Total for Sizes 5.13| $  818,520.00
5.14 |Pants
Size Small 1000 Dozen $ 96.36 Tri Stitch
Size Medium 1000 Dozen |$ 96.36 |  Al14 Colors Tri Stitch
Size Large 1000 Dozen |3 96.36 KHAKI Tri Stitch
Size X-Large 1000 Dozen |$ 96.36 ORANGE Tri Stitch
Size 2X-Large 1000 Dozen |3 96.36 NAVY Tri Stitch
Size 3X-Large 1000 Dozen |$ 96.36 GREEN Tri Stitch
Size 4X-Large 1000 Dozen |$ 98.76 Tri Stitch
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Size SX-Large 1000 Dozen |§ 98.76 Tri Stitch
Size 6X-Large 1000 Dozen |$ 9376 | All4 Colors Tri Stitch
Size 7X-Large | GREEN & KHAKI 1000 Dozen |$ 136.20 Olgﬁ\llf}ls Tri Stitch
Size 8X-Large | SIZES 7XL & 9XL 1000 Dozen $ 136.20 NAVY Tri Stitch
Size 9X-Large |Sold in cases of 6/ea 1000 Dozen $ 136.20 GREEN Td Stitch
Size 10X-Large 1000 Dozen |8 136.20 Tri Stitch

Total for Sizes 5.14] $ 1,419,240.00

Jumpsuits & Jaclets

5.15  |Jumpsuits — Orange Coverall
Size Small 250 Each $ 13.85 Orange Tri Stitch
Size Medium 300 Each $ 13.85 Orange Tri Stitch
Size Large 500 Each $ 13.85 Orange Tri Stitch
Size X-Large 1,000 Each $ 14.85 Orange Tri Stitch
Size 2X-Large 1,000 Bach $ 14.85 Orange Tri Stitch
Size 3X-Large 1,000 Bach § 14.85 Orange Tri Stitch
Size 4X-Large 1,000 Each $ 14.85 Orange Tri Stitch
Size 5X-Large 600 Each $ 14.85 Orange Tri Stitch
Size 6X-Large 400 Each $ 14.85 Orange Tri Stitch
Size 7X-Large 60 Each 3 15.85 Orange Tri Stitch
Size 8X-Large 60 Each 3 15.85 Orange Tri Stitch
Size 9XLarge *Sold in cases of 6/ea 60 Each 3 15.85 Orange Tri Stitch
Size 10X-Large 60 Each 3 15.85 Orange Tri Stitch
Jumpsuits — Blue Coverall
Size Small 50 Each $ 13.85| Blue/Navy Tri Stitch
Size Medium 100 Each $ 13.85 Blue / Navy T Stitch
Size Large 150 Each 3 13.85| Blue/Navy Tci Slitch
Size X-Large 150 Each $ 14.85 | Blue /Navy Tri Stitch
Size 2X-Large 200 Each 3 14.85 | Blue/Navy Tri Stitch
Size 3X-Large 100 Fach 3 14.85 | Blue/Navy Tri Stitch
Size 4X-Large 75 Each $ 14.85 | Blue/Navy Tri Stitch
Size 5X-Large 50 Each $ 14.85 | Blue/Navy Tri Stitch
Size 6X-Large 30 Each $ 14.85 Blue / Navy Tri Stitch
Size 7X-Large*Sold in cases of 6/ea 30 Each 3 15.85 | Blue/Navy Tri Stitch
Size 8X-Large 30 Each $ 15.85 | Blue/Navy Tri Stitch
Size 9X-Large*Sold in cases of 6/ea 25 Each $ 15.85 | Blue /Navy Tri Stitch
Size 10X-Large 25 Fach $ 15.85 Blue / Navy Tri Stitch
Jumpsuits — Green Coverall
Size Small 100 Each $ 13.85 Green Tri Stitch
Size Medium 100 Each $ 13.85 Green Tri Stitch
Size Large 125 Bach $ 13.85 Green Tri Stitch
Size X-Large 125 Each $ 14.85 Green T Stitch
Size 2X-Large 300 Each $ 14.85 Green Tri Stitch
Size 3X-Lazge 300 Each $ 14.85 Green Tri Stitch
Size 4X-Large 200 Each $ 14,85 Grecn Tri Stitch
Size SX-Large 100 Each $ 14.85 Green Tri Stitch
Size 6X-Large 40 Each 3 1485 Green Tri Stitch
Size 7X-Large*Sold in cases of 6/ea 20 Each 3 15.85 Green Tri Stitch
Size 8X-Large 20 Each $ 15.85 Green Tri Stitch
Size 9X-Large*Sold in cases of 6/ca 10 Each $ 15.85 Green Tri Stitch
Size 10X-Large 10 Each 3 15.85 Green Tri Stitch
Jumpsuits ~ Khaki Coverall
Size Small 50 Each $ 13.85 Khaki Tri Stitch
Size Medium 50 Each 3 13.85 Khaki Tri Stitch
Size Large 60 Each 3 13.85 Khaki Tri Stitch
Size X-Large 100 Each $ 14.85 Khaki Tri Stitch
Size 2X-L.arge 125 Each $ 14.85 Khaki Tri Stitch
Size 3X-Large 125 Each $ 14.85 Khaki - Tri Stitch
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Size 4X-Large 100 EBach |3 14.85 Khaki Tri Stitch
Size 5X-Large*Sold in cases of 6/ea 50 Each |$ 14.85 Khaki Tri Stitch
Size 6X-Large 20 Bach |$ 14.85 Khaki Tri Stitch
Size 7X-Large*Sold in cascs of 6/ea 10 Each |$ 15.85 Khaki Tri Stitch
Size 8X-Large to Fach |3 15.85 Khaki Tri Stitch
Size 9X-Large*Sold in cases of 6/ea 10 Fach |$ 15.85 Khaki Tri Stitch
Size 10X-Large 10 Bach |$ 15.85 Khaki Tri Stitch
Talal for Sizes & Colors 5.15 |$  131,905.25
5.16 |Jacketls
Size Medium 25 Each |$ 2600 | Neon Yellow | BobBarker Company
Size Large ALL SIZES 25 Each |$ 2600 | Neon Yellow | BobBarker Company
Size X-Large |Sold in a case of 25 EBach |3 26.00 | Neon Yellow Bob Barker Company
Size 2X-Large 6lea 30 Fach |$ 29,060 | WNeon Yellow | Bob Barker Company
Size 3X-Large 30 Each |$ 29.00 | Neon Yellow | Bob Barker Company
Total for Sizes 3 3,690.00

Miscellaneous Items and Catalog Ovders (ifems not specifically specified above)

Delivery Time After Reecipt of Order:

Percentage (%) Discount off List price: 15%, excluding Furnishings

1to 2

*NP Pocket Uniform Shirts - 2 to 7 Weeks

Weelks

S p VTV CR GO,

pate: 04/03/2025

NAME: Brenda Koester

proNE: 800-334-9880

e Bids Contract Administrator

CELL: N/A

comMpaNY NAME: Bob Barker Company, Inc. & MAwL ADpDEss: bidnotices@bobbarker.com

rax. 800-322-7537




EXHIBIT F
BIDDER'S EXCEPTIONS
TO
SPECIFICATIONS
OF
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID NO. 25-017

Inmate Clothing

Respondent's attention is directed to Paragraph 4 of the General Conditions of this Invitation to Bid.
READ THIS PARAGRAPH CAREFULLY.

The following exceptions to the Specifications of Invitation to Bid for No. 25-017 are requested by the undersigned Respondent:
(Use additional pages as necessary.)

REFERENCE
PARA # & PAGE # EXCEPTION REQUESTED
58 / Pg.3 8.850z. Canvas
510/ Pg. 3 Color: White w/ Black Straps
Please see each detailed spec for each item bid by Bob Barker Company.
Tariffs Submitted pricing may change if tariffs go into effect and our supplier

cost increase. *See Tariff Announcement Attached*

Name of Firm:  BOb Barker Company, inc.

Signature of Bidder: WM é’K &(M
LS Sy




