IN THE COUNTY LEGISLATURE OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI

A RESOLUTION awarding a contract for the furnishing of two (2) greens aerators to
Kansas Golf & Turf of Wichita, KS, and five (5) utility carts to Heritage Tractor of
Harrisonville, MO, for use by the Parks and Recreation Department under the terms and
conditions of Electronic Solicitation No. BB20101, in the actual amount of $50,783.30, and
declaring certain personal property as obsolete and unusable and authorizing its disposal
by way of trade-in.

RESOLUTION #17214, March 22, 2010

INTRODUCED BY Fred Arbanas, County Legislator

WHEREAS, the Director of Finance and Purchasing has solicited bids on Electronic
Solicitation No. BB20101 for the furnishing of two greens aerators and five utility carts for

use by the Parks and Recreation Department; and,

WHEREAS, a total of thirty-one (31) notifications were distributed and six (6) responsive

bids were received for Item No. 1 and five (5) responsive bids were received for Item No.

2 as follows:

 BIDDER TOTAL BID

ITEM No. 1 - Greens Aerators

Heritage Tractor, Harrisonville (Cass), MO No Bid
Redexim Turf, Fenton (St. Louis), MO $32,850.00
Rogers Mfg, RMI Golf Carts, Olathe (Johnson), KS No Bid
M & M Golf Cars, Lee's Summit (Jackson), MO No Bid
Van Wall Equipment, Olathe (Johnson), KS $29,750.00 -
Kansas Golf & Turf, Wichita (Sedgwick), KS $23,600.00
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ITEM No. 2 - Utility Carts

Heritage Tractor, Harrisonville (Cass), MO $31,133.30
Redexim Turf, Fenton (St. Louis), MO No Bid
Rogers Mig, RM| Golf Carts, Olathe {(Johnson), KS $40,745.00
M & M‘ Golf Cars, Lee’s Summit (Jackson), MO $47,250.00
Kansas Golf & Turf, Wichita (Sedgwick), KS $39,585.00
and,

WHEREAS, the Director of Finance and Purchasing recommends award to Kansas Golf
& Turf of Wichita, KS, and Heritage Tractor of Harrisonville, MO, as the lowest and best
bidders, and declares two (2) 1993 Ryan Greensaire 24, four (4) 2000 Toro Workman
utility carts, and one (1) 1994 Club Car utility cart, obsolete and unusable personal property

to be used as trade-ins on these purchases; and,

WHEREAS, pursuant to section 1134., Jackson County Code, 1984, the Director of

Finance and Purchasing has requested that he be authorized to dispose of this equipment

by way of trade-in; now therefore,

BE IT RESOLVED by the County Legislature of Jackson County, Missouri, that award be
made as recommended by the Director of Finance and Purchasing, and that the Director
be, and is hereby, authorized to execute for the County any documents necessary to the

accomplishment of the award; and,




BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Director of Finance and Purchasing is authorized

to make all payments, including final payment on the contract; and,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the specified existing equipment be and hereby is
declared surplus personal property and the Director of Finance and Purchasing be and

hereby is authorized to dispose of it by way of trade-in.




Effective Date: This Resolution shall be effective immediately upon its passage by a
majority of the Legislature.

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Deputy/Assistant County Counselor Acting Co unszlﬂr | N

Certificate of Passage

| hereby certify that the attached resoiutlon Resolution #17214 of March 22, 2010

was duly passed on L/(ﬁ/‘-:,dﬁ o? , 2010 by the Jackson County Legislature.
The votes thereon were as follows:

Yeas 9 Nays <,
Abstaining @ Absent O
329 /0 /L/Q’Z//‘Vﬂ/fv J& /éﬁzbm
Date Mary Jo Spino, Glerk of Legislature

There is a balance otherwise unencumbered to the credit of the appropriation to which the
expenditure is chargeable and there is a cash balance otherwise unencumbered in the
treasury to the credit of the fund from which payment is to be made each sulfficient to
provide for the obligation herein authorized.

ACCOUNT NUMBER: 300 1666 58110
ACCOUNT TITLE: Enterprise Fund

Fred Arbanas Golf Course
Heavy Machinery & Equipment

NOT TO EXCEED: $50,783.30
Ty /7 20 ( /( @Wf%
Date DLr/ tor of Finédnce and Purchasing




REQUEST FOR LEGISLATIVE ACTION

Completed by County Counselor’s Office:

Res/@midNo.: 17214
Sponsor(s): Fred Arbans
Date: March 22, 2010
SUBJECT Action Requested
BX Resolution
[] Ordinance
Project/Title: Awarding a Contract for the purchase of 2 Each Greens Areators in the amount of $21,800.00
from Kansas Golf & Turf of Wichita, KS; and the purchase of 5 Each Utility Carts in the amount of $28,983.30
from Heritage Tractor of Harrisonville, MO; for use by the Parks & Recreation Department; under the terms and
conditions of Electronic Solicitation No. BB20101 and declaring certain personat property obsolete and unusable
to be used as trade-ins gn these purchases.
BUDGET
INFORMATION Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year: $50,783.30
To be completed Amount previously authorized this fiscal year: $
By Requesting Total amount authorized after this legislative action: $50,783.30
Department and Amount budgeted for this item * {including transfers): $50,783.30
Finance Source of funding (name of fund) and account code number; FROM / TO FROM ACCT
TO ACCT
* If account includes additional funds for other expenses, total budgeted in the account is: §
OTHER FINANCIAL INFORMATION:
[} No budget impact (no fiscal note required)
[[] Term and Supply Contract (funds approved in the annual budget); estimated value and use of contract:
Departinent: Estimated Use: $
Prior Year Budget (if applicable): N/A
Prior Year Actual Amount Spent (if applicable): N/A
PRIOR
LEGISLATION Prior ordinances and (date): N/A
Prior resolutions and (date): N/A
CONTACT
INFORMATION | RLA drafted by (name, title, & phone): Teddy Ballard, Senior Buyer, 881-3465
REQUEST
SUMMARY Parks & Recreation requested to purchase greens aerators and utility carts using the following equipment as

trade-in options in the purchase: 2 each 1993 Ryan Greensaire 24; 4 each 2000 Toro Workman Utility Carts;
and 1 each 1994 Club Car Utility Cart. Electronic Solicitation No. 20101 was issued.

A total of 31 notifications were distributed and six (6) responses were received. The following bids were

received:
TRADE-IN TOTAL BID LESS

BIDDERS SUB-TOTAL AMOUNT TRADE-IN AMOUNT

Item No. | —~ 2 Each Greens Areators

Heritage Tractor (Cass County), Harrisonville, MO No Bid

Redexim Turf (St. Louis County), Fenton, MO $32,850.00 $2,000.00 $30,850.00
Rogers Mfg, RMI Golf Carts (Johnson

County}, Olathe, KS No Bid

M & M Golf Cars* (Jackson Couniy), Lees Summit No Bid

Van Wall Equipment (Johnson County), Olathe, KS $29,750.00 No Bid $29,750.00
Kansas Golf & Turf (Sedgwick County), Wichita, KS  $23,600.00 $1,800.00 $21,800.00




Item No. 2 — 5 Each Utility Carts

Heritage Tractor (Cass County), Harrisonville, MO $31,133.30 $2,150.00 $28,983.30
Redexim Turf (St. Louis County), Fenton, MO No Bid

Rogers Mfg, RMI Golf Carts (Johnson

County), Olathe, KS $40,745.00 $1,900.00 $38,845.00
M & M Golf Cars* (Jackson County}, Lees Summit $47,250,00 No Bid $47,250.00
Van Wall Equipment (Johnson County), Olathe, KS $25,000.00 $6,500.00 $18,500.00
Kansas Golf & Turf (Sedgwick County), Wichita, KS  $39,585.00 $2,500.00 $37,086.00

NOTE: Van Wall Equipment bid a 9.5 HP single cylinder engine Utility Cart which is underpowered for Park’s
needs and does not meet minimum specifications.

Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, 1984, the Director of Finance and Purchasing
recommends the award for the furnishing of 2 Each Greens Areators from Kansas Golf & Turf of Wichita, KS;
and 5 Each Utility Carts from Heritage Tractor of Harrisonville, MO; for use by the Parks & Recreations
Department; under the terms and conditions of Electronic Solicitation No. BB20101 as the lowest and best
bidders and declaring ceriain personal property obsolete and unusable to be used as trade-ins on these purchases.

CLEARANCE
[] Tax Clearance Completed (Purchasing & Departnient)
['] Business License Verified (Purchasing & Department)
P Chapter 6 Compliance - Affirmative Action/Prevailing Wage (County Auditor’s Office}
ATTACBMENTS | Electronic Abstract of Bids Received; Recap of Bids Received; Recommendation from Mr. Bob McMillin of the
Parks Dept Requisition Nos. RE321155470000 and RE321155476000; and Surplus Property Declaration Form
F"m’ & 3/ SO
ance (Budget Ap 10val) Date:
If applicable / /7 Z/ %?) /f{) LI FIAT T, 3/{5‘"'// o
Division Mapage % / Date: /
P ( /(4"’ R / o e / {//6: C)
County Com\sélor s Offibe:-- 4 Date:




Fiscal Information (to be verified by Budget Office in Finance Department)

O

ok

This expenditure was included in the annual budget.

Funds for this were encumbered from the Fund in .

There is a balance otherwise unencumbered to the credit of the appropriation fo which the expenditure

is chargeable and there is a cash balance otherwise unencumbered in the treasury to the credit of the fund from which
payment is to be made each sufficient to provide for the obligation herein anthorized.

Funds sufficient for this expenditure will be/were appropriated by Ordinance #

Funds sufficient for this appropriation are available from the source indicated below,

Account Number: | Account Title: Amount Not to Exceed:
300-1666-58110 Park Enterprise Fund, Parks-Fred Arbanas Golf Course, $50,783.30
Heavy Equipment & Machinery

This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of
funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as cach using agency places its order,

This legistative action does not impact the County financially and does not require Finance/Budget approval.




Fiscal Note:
This expenditure was included in the Annual Budget.

Date: March 15, 2010 RES# 17214

Department / Division Character/Description Not to Exceed

Enterprise Fund - 300

1666 - Fred Arbanas Golf Course 58110 - Heavy Machinery & Equip 50,783.30

1

Mﬂn,@ / %”wrme Total 50,783.30
Budéetillé !




Buyers Lump Sum Abstract CERTIFICATION OF EH})%SE]'_;%?J%

BIDS WLRE puje LY OPCHNED [ 8]
23998
K OF THE LEGISLATLRE /

C
(/" PURCHASING WANAGER

Jackson County Missouri
Purchasing Depariment

415 East 12th Sfreet, Room G1

Kansas City, MO 64106

LUMP SUM Abstract of Responses for Solicitation #8B20101 - !

Click here to attach a post award file to this solicitations header.
This file wil be viewable by vendors from the abstract solicitation view after award.

Salicitation Optional Title:|[BB20101 Two (2) Each Greens Aerators and Five (5) Each Utllity Carts |

Abbreviated Desc: Greens Aerator - 2 Each, Jacobsen GA-24 Greens
Aerator or comparable.

NIGP Nbr: 51505

Indicat

Dellvery Email Date

Date Due Date m Solicitation Line ltems Requisition Nbr |

Wed Mar 31i| Mon Jan 25 || Tue Feb 23
2010 2010 2010 2 TOTAL RR20101

00:00:00 14:46:05 14:00:00

[Estimated Price: 0

! Line ltem View I ~ AsslgnManage pCard Federal Excluded Parties List |

N Vendor Response Tracking I
B Toggle All Switches|l |
Discount LABF
Pyvmt I e Trans
Award / Price T etm ¢ |[Pymt Text Price Price Date Trans Time
« MNLAB: +0
invalid response: 1 received, 2 requirad. Award Button disabled.
J 31433.30] o " || 31133.30 | 31133.30 | MO0 Il . 10:50:43
Vendor:|[JERITAGE TRACTOR, FedID:|| XX-XXXX280
endoriilinG. P00000090902 1P Addr:|| 208.7.95.170

[ Line ltem Prices:]|002: 6226,66
Recycle Status:|[002: Not applicable
Item #1 Cmnt: Bidding an alternate John Deere TX Gator Delivery time will be i,

l Vendor Comments:||(asp) 2-3 weeks

Attached Files:i|item: 002

Ex.jpg
TX.docx

Buyer Comments:

| ltem:}[001 [ ___Name:]fyohn Deere |
Manufacturer||{Manuf Nbr:][TX I Retail:] ]
Infoifil  Part ID:] |l Part Nbr: ]

I URL:J johndeere.com

https://basec.sicomm.net/buyer/agency_buyer_AbstractLS.htmi?isAContract=0&idahoDP... 2/23/2010




Buyers Lump Sum Abstract Page 2 of 4
. Discount|| LABP
Pymt iy Trans
Award / Price Té!: ms  ||[Pymt Text Price Frice Date Trans Time
s € ||NLAB: 40
| Invalid response: 1 received, 2 required. Award Butlon disabled. !
Tue Feb a0,
l 32850.00 J 0 || 32850.00 32850.00 02 2010 15:32:57
Vendor: REDEXIM TURF FedID:][ XX-2XXX155
endorlipRODUCTS _P00000091038 IP Addr:|{ 70.245.238.50
[ Line ltem Prices:|{001: 16425
Recycle Status;||001: Not applicable
I ltem #1 Cmnt: Aiternate Bid Item: Verti-Drain 7007H Delivery Time: ARO 10 Days
Vendor Comnients:[[Trade In offer: $1,000 per each unit

Aftached Files

H|ltem: 001
7007H.pdf

Verti-Drain7007hydromanual.pdi

Buyer Comments:|

I I Item:|[001 Name:|[Redexim Charterhouse, Inc. |
Manufacturer||[Manuf Nbr:)[7007H Retail:|[16425.00 ]
Info:[il" Part1D:][7o07H _ |[ Part Nbr:||7007H
| URL:[lwww.redexim.com ’
! ! Discount|[ LABP
, Pymt ; Drine Trans
Award / Price T e):‘ms pymt Text|| Price Price Date Trans Time
! . NLAB: +0
Invalid response: 1 received, 2 required. Award Button disabled. |
. Mon Feb .
|, 40745.00 0 net 30 || 40745.00 (| 40745.00 if n+'on40 11:00:32
Vendor:[ROGERS MFG INC  P00000020953 || IPFzgld[:'il éflx'lg)ﬁfg%
| Line Item Prices;|[002: 8149

Recycle Status;||002: Not applicable

Vendor Commenis;

item #1 Cmnt: Delivery date will be 30-45 days for the above quote. E-Z-GO ST 480
We would like to submit an alternative bid. New 2010 E-Z-GO ST 400 @ $6592 per
unit. Or $6592 x 5 units = $32,960 Delivery date on these will also be 30 -45 days

Attached Files:

Buyer Comments:|

https://basec.sicomm.net/buyer/agency_buyer_AbstractLS htmi?isAContract=0&idahoDP...

[ item:[o01 [ Name:][E-Z-GO |
Manufacturer||[Manuf Nbr: Retail:][$8,149 |
Infos{il  Part ID:|[E-Z-GO ST 480 Part Nbr:|| |
[ URL:|jwww.ezgo.com |
|
Discount || LABP
Award / Price . || Torms |[PYMt Text Price Price Tg::\: Trans Time
1 NLAB: +0
| Invalid response: 1 received, 2 required, Award Button disabled. ]

212372010




Buyers Lump Sum Abstract Page 3 of 4

Mon Feb oA
" 47250.00 0 ” || 47250.00 “ 47250.00 ” 22 2010 " 15:24:18 I

Vendor:||M&M GOLF CARS LLC _P00000090936

iP Addr:||216.106.93.137

" " FedID:|[ XX-XXXX397

Line Item Prices:|[002: 9450

Regygle Status:"OOZ: Not applicable ]

Item #1 Cmnt: M&M Golf Cars LLC is bidding 2010 Club Car Gas 225's. 4-6 weeks
after award

Vendor Comments:

Attached Filess||

Buyer Comments:|

[ item:][o01 [ Name:][Club Car |

‘Manufacturer|jiManuf Nbr:][Carryall 205 [ Retail:][t0207 ]

Info:lil  Part ID:||295 [ Part Nbr:)[103179102 |

[ URLi[clubcar.com |

il Discount i LABP
Pymt : e Trans
Award / Price T e);m ¢ [[Pymt Text Price Price Date Trans Time
; - |INLAB: +0
Award: O 5475000 o 54750.00 || 54750.00 || MOnFeb il gg.08:41 |
ward: I | : ' 9 222010 oo

_ FedID:]] XX-XXXX256

Vendor:||Van-Wall Equipment P00000044919 I Addr:|l70.244.242.192

Line itemn Prices:|[001: 14875 002: 5000

Recycle Statug_:”{)m: Not applicable 002: Not applicable

Vendor Comments: Iltem #2 Cmnt: Altsj'rnate Bjd

Attached Files:| _ |

Buyer Comments:|

E | Item:[{001 Name:||[John Deere ]‘

[Manuf Nbrdf Retall:||
Part ID;|800 Aercore [[ Part Nbr:||
Manufacturer URL:] —— |
Info: ( item:][002 ]| Name:|{John Deere
[Manuf Nior:| [ Retail]
[ Part ID:|[Gator CX i Part Nbri
URL:
I
! || piscount]| LaBP
Pyt . Trans
Award { Price T e):'m o [[PymtText Price Price Date Trans Time
r NLAB: +0
Award: € 6318500 || © Net 10 " 63185.00 || 63185.00 || 200 FEP 1| 14:31:50
Vendor: KANSAS GOLF AND TURF, FedID:|[ XX-XXXX033 j
eNYOTliNG.  PO0000075053 IP Addr:[74.223.173.186
| Line ltem Prices:|{001: 11800 002: 7917 |
] Recycle Statusﬂ:HOO‘!: Not applicable 002; Not applicable I

https://basec.sicomm.net/buyer/agency buyer AbstractLS.html?isAContract=0&idahoDP... 2/23/2010




Buyers Lump Sum Abstract Page 4 of 4

ltem #'14 Cmnt: Jacobsen GA-24 Greens Aerator as specified Trade In Allowance of
$900 per unit will be subtracted from above price.

Item #2 Cmnt: Trade In's allowence of $500 per unit subfract from bld above.

(l Vendor Comments:

|
| Attached Flles:| ]

Il Buyer Comments:|

| | item:|[004 {  Name:|[Jacobsen ]
[Manuf Nbr:|[GA-24 [ Retail:]l | 1
{ PartID:| i Part Nbri|
Manufacturer; | URL:]
Info: 1
| Item:][002 [ Name:lE-Z-GO |
[Manuf Nbr:|[ST-480 [ Retail] ‘
| Partin:
URL;

An femporary Excel formal document has been writfen, Click here Lo access il

Back|

_Line item View

& 1996-2010 Sicommial. Inc. AY Rights Resenved.
-~ agency_buyer_AbsracltS - Tue, 23 Feb 2010 {groal

https://basec.sicomm.nct/buyer/agency_buyer_AbstractLS.hmﬂ?isAContract=0&idahoDP... 2/23/2010
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Administration

Historic Sites
Ranger Station
Recreation

(816} 503-4800
Fax: (816) 795-1234

Kemper Cutdoor
Education Center
(816) 229-8980

Fred Arbanas
Golf Course
(816) 761-9445

Blue Springs Marina
(816) 795-1112

Jacomoe Marina
(816} 795-8888

Longview Marina
(816) 966-0131

Special Population
Services

(816) 763-5130

JACKSON COUNTY

Parks & Recreation

22807 Woods Chapel Road
* Blue Springs, Missouri 64015

To: Teddy Ballard - Senior Buyer

From: Bob McMillin — Superintendent of Golf & Marina’s
cc: Dianne Kimzey - Deputy Director Enterprise
Date: 2/26/2010

RE: Golf Course Equipment Bid BB20101

The Parks Department recommends the following vendors:

ltem No. 1 -2 Each Greens Aerator, Jacobsen GA-24
Vendor: Kansas Golf & Turf (Sedgwick County), Wichita, KS. as the lowest and best bid
Total Less Trade-in Amount: $21,800.00

ltem No. 2 — 5 Each Utility Cart, EZ-GO ST — 480 or Comparable

Vendor: Van Wall Equipment (Johnson County), Olathe KS. was the lowest bid but does not
meet specifications with a 9.5 HP single cylinder engine, underpowered for our
needs

Vendor: Heritage Tractor {Cass County), Harrisonville, MO. as the 2™ lowest and best bid
and meets specifications with John Deere TX Gator, 19 HP two cylinder engine

Total Less Trade-In Amount: $28,983.30
Contact me at 816-765-8405 with any questions.

Bob

Michael D, Sanders, County Execufive




Header

Line Items

-Document Information

Doc ID: |5§_| 321155470000
Ref ID:I |
Date:[02/26/10 | Copy Only:[ |

Send: | |

~Vendor Information

ID: [HTI26060 ]

Name:|HERITAGE TRACTOR INC

nddress:[zeue ROCKHAVEN ROAD

Total Amount: r

Reguester:

~Shipping Information

Ship To: 0047

28,983.30]

-Requester Infarmation

Invoice Tu:ﬁJDUE\

MCMILLIN BOB

Name: [LONGVIEW LAKE GOLFCOURSE |

Address: [JACKSON CO, PARKS & RECREATIO|

|
| ] [11100 VIEW HIGH DRIVE ]
| | [KaNSAS CITY, MO 64134 |
Ija Docurnent 1 of 1 Ship Via: | |
T ] [Amrove] [ e | [ Defaus | [ Close |
_ll ) Header Line Items E
1
gI:H:ﬂ:umﬁnt ID: RE 321155470000 Date:02/26/10 Amount:| 28,9839 a k
- Item ID/Description uoM Quantity Price Amount I ‘w
[Loo-040 1 5 l5796.66 |lz8,983.30 |l | 5
[GROUNDSKEEFING EQUIPMENT | ncct:|3m::-1556-53110-999-9999-9999-10 3
[Five John Deere TX Gators, 4x2 Gas Bid#B|[POC:Russsll Bonnsville =
0
1]
B,
01 , Y]
p—— it ———— - T T T T 1 e prr——— =1 Fe=o=—==c——=<=% 1
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Header

Line Items

-Document Information

Doc ID: |[RE 321155469000

I | RefID: [

Date:|82;’25.f1l] i Copy Dnlf:EI
Buyer: send: | ]

~vendor Information

-Shipping Information

Total Amount: |

21,800.00

-Requester Information

Invoice Tu:[[:TDDQ

RequesteriMCMILLIN BOB

ID: [KGT57010 B Ship To: 0047
Name: [KANSAS GOLF & TURF | Name: LONGVIEW LAKE GOLFCOURSE |
Address: (5701 N CHUZY DRIVE | || Address: PACKSON CO. PARKS & RECREATIQ)|
B | -[11100 VIEW HIGH DRIVE |
| | KANSAS CITY, MO 64134 |
I; g Document 1 of 1 E EIEA Ship Yia: r J
" ok ] [Aemave L fowl ] fDefauis | [ Close
Header Line Items \
D]:vcument ID:RE 321155469000 Date:02/26/10 - Amount:l -21,800.0 & ‘ \
_ i_tern 1D /Description uom Quantity Price Amount I'
. )]
[L00-040 | | | I ||l21,800.00 | z
- E— ﬂ = -
[GROUNDSKEEPING EQUIPMENT | Acct:[5][300-1666-56110-999-9999-9999-10 3
‘ ﬁ'wo Jacobsen GA-24 Greens Asrator Bid#E [F‘OC:RusseEE Bonneville 816-668-2487 -
H
-
Q
2
R Tl




