
Responses
Success: All data is valid!

Numeric

Status Bid/No Bid 
Decision # Item Name Quantity 

Required Unit Price Total Cost

Success: All values provided Bid #0-1 Standard, monthly rate with service once per 
week $ 50.00 -

Success: All values provided Bid #0-2 Standard, monthly rate with service twice per 
week $ 100.00 -

Success: All values provided Bid #0-3 Standard, one day rate $ 50.00 -

Success: All values provided Bid #0-4 Standard, 2-day rate with service after day 1 $ 65.00 -

Success: All values provided Bid #0-5 Standard, 3-day rate with service after day 1, and 
day 2 $ 80.00 -

Success: All values provided Bid #0-6 Standard 4-day rate with service after day 1, day 
2 and day 3 $ 95.00 -

Success: All values provided Bid #0-7 Standard, move charge $ 30.00 -

Success: All values provided Bid #0-8 Standard, unscheduled service charge $ 15.00 -

Success: All values provided Bid #0-9 Handicapped Accessible (ADA), monthly rate 
with service once per week $ 95.00 -

Success: All values provided Bid #0-10 Handicapped Accessible (ADA), monthly rate 
with service twice per week $ 190.00 -

Success: All values provided Bid #0-11 Handicapped Accessible (ADA), 1-day rate $ 95.00 -

Success: All values provided Bid #0-12 Handicapped Accessible (ADA, 2-day rate with 
service after day1 $ 110.00 -

Success: All values provided Bid #0-13 Handicapped Accessible (ADA), 3-day rate with 
service after day 1 and day 2 $ 125.00 -

Success: All values provided Bid #0-14 Handicapped Accessible (ADA), 4-day rate with 
service after day 1, day 2, and day3 $ 145.00 -

Success: All values provided Bid #0-15 Handicapped Accessible (ADA), move charge $ 30.00 -

Success: All values provided Bid #0-16 Handicapped Accessible (ADA), unscheduled 
service charge $ 15.00 -

Success: All values provided Bid #0-17 Sink, 1-day rate $ 85.00 -

Success: All values provided Bid #0-18 Sink, unscheduled service charge $ 15.00 -

Basket Total $ 0.00 

Grand Total $ 0.00 



Instructions

25-008 Portable Toilet (BT-80AZ)

- When pasting content, please use Paste Special as Text without any formatting.

- You can only submit text based responses, please do not use special characters l ike emojis.

- Please do not change the structure of any of the worksheets. Changing the structure will invalidate your submission.

- Any additional information outside of the given structure of the worksheets will not be visible to the purchaser.

- Please do not save this fi le in a different format. Saving this fi le in a different format will invalidate your submission.

- Please follow the instructions provided along with this fi le to submit it back to Bonfire.

- By default, every item has `No Bid` selected for the `Bid/No Bid Decision` column.

- If you decide to bid on an item, then you must select `Bid` in the `Bid/No Bid Decision` column and all of the other 
editable cells for the item must contain a valid value.

- If you decide not to bid on an item, then you must select `No Bid` in the `Bid/No Bid Decision` column and all of the 
other editable cells for the item must be blank.

- Please do not use Excel formulas in your responses.

- If you have any questions regarding the content of this fi le, please contact the appropriate purchaser.

- If you have any technical problems, please contact Bonfire at Support@GoBonfire.com.
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