#### **Request for Legislative Action**

Res. #21364

Sponsor: Jeanie Lauer Date: August 14, 2023

Completed by County Counselor's Office				
Action Requested:	Resolution	Res.Ord No.:	21364	
Sponsor(s):	Jeanie Lauer	Legislature Meeting Date:	8/14/2023	

Introd	uction
11111100	uction

Action Items: ['Award']

#### Project/Title:

Awarding a Twenty-four (24) Month Term and Supply Contract with One (1) Twelve Month Option to Extend for the furnishing of Turf Chemicals and Fertilizers for use by the Parks + Rec Department under the terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 23-047.

#### **Request Summary**

The Parks + Rec Department requires a Term and Supply Contract for the furnishing of Turf Chemicals and Fertilizers. The Purchasing Department issued Invitation to Bid No. 23-047 in response to those requirements. A total of 430 notifications were distributed, 24 viewed and five responses were received and evaluated. An Executive Summary of the Invitation to Bid, including the Contractor's Quotation Sheet and the using County Department's Recommendation Memo is attached.

Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, the Purchasing Department and the Parks + Rec Department recommend the award of a Twenty-four (24) Month Term and Supply Contract with One (1) Twelve (12) Month Option to Extend for the furnishing of Turf Chemicals and Fertilizers for use by the Parks + Rec Department to be split between Van Diest Supply Company of Webster City, Iowa, Advanced Turf Solutions of Fishers, Indiana, and SiteOne Landscape Supply of Cleveland, Ohio as the lowest and best bids under the terms and conditions of Invitation to Bid No. 23-047.

Annual Estimated Usage: \$80,000.

This award is made on a "As Needed" basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchase(s) is subject to annual appropriations.

Contact Information				
Department:	Parks + Rec	Submitted Date:	7/31/2023	
Name:	Brian Nowotny	Email:	BPNowotny@jacksongov.org	
Title:	Deputy Director, Parks + Rec	Phone:	816-503-4803	

Budget Information	
Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year:	\$ 0
Amount previously authorized this fiscal year:	\$ 0

#### **Request for Legislative Action**

Total amount authorized	\$
Is it transferring fund?	No
Single Source Funding:	
Fund:	Amount:
	!Unexpected End of
	Formula

Prior Legislation				
Prior Ordinances				
Ordinance: Ordinance date:				
Prior Resolution				
Resolution:	Resolution date:			
19507	June 12, 2017			
19932	August 6, 2018			

Purchasing	
Does this RLA include the purchase or lease of	Yes
supplies, materials, equipment or services?	
Chapter 10 Justification:	Formal Bid
Core 4 Tax Clearance Completed:	Not Applicable
Certificate of Foreign Corporation Received:	Yes
Have all required attachments been included in this RLA?	Yes

Compliance	Compliance			
Certificate of Compliance				
In Compliance				
Minority, Women and Vete	Minority, Women and Veteran Owned Business Program			
Goals are waived - insufficie	Goals are waived - insufficient MBE or WBE firms available			
MBE: .00%				
WBE:	.00%			
VBE: .00%				
Prevailing Wage				
Not Applicable				

#### **Fiscal Information**

• This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as each

#### **Request for Legislative Action**

using agency places its order.

#### History

Submitted by Parks + Rec requestor: Brian Nowotny on 7/31/2023. Comments:

Approved by Department Approver Michele Newman on 8/1/2023 12:30:05 PM. Comments:

Approved by Purchasing Office Approver Barbara J. Casamento on 8/1/2023 1:12:12 PM. Comments:

Approved by Compliance Office Approver Jaime Guillen on 8/1/2023 1:49:01 PM. Comments:

Approved by Budget Office Approver David B. Moyer on 8/1/2023 1:58:10 PM. Comments:

Approved by Executive Office Approver Sylvya Stevenson on 8/1/2023 2:03:18 PM. Comments:

Approved by Counselor's Office Approver Jamesia Manning on 8/10/2023 12:23:21 PM. Comments:



22807 Woods Chapel Road Blue Springs, Missouri 64015 MakeYourDayHere.com Michele Newman, Director (816) 503-4800 Fax: (816) 795-1234

#### **MEMORANDUM**

TO: John Konon, Buyer

**FROM:** John Johnson, Superintendent-Park Operations

**DATE:** July 25, 2023

**SUBJECT:** Bid 23-047: Turf Chemicals

The Parks Department's recommendation is to award the bid to the following companies:

Van Diest Supply Company Site One Landscape Advanced Turf Solutions

Collectively, these three vendors were the lowest bids out of the five companies that were reviewed for the products used most frequently by the Parks + Rec Department.

Parks + Rec's needs from this T&S contract vary greatly, e.g. Arbanas Golf Course, Adair/Frank White Jr. Sports Complex and Natural Resources have specific different chemical needs, in addition to the needs that they do share. Using the three vendors allows Park's staff to use the vendor with lowest price while helping ensure products are available in a time of need.

Our **projected usage** during the next twelve months is \$80,000.



## 23-047 - Turf Chemicals Van Diest Supply Company

#### **Scoring Summary**

#### **Evaluation Group 1 - Main Evaluation**

	A - Purchasing Evaluation	A-1 - Affidavit	A-2 - Addenda	A-3 - Certificate of Compliance	A-4 - Greater KC Metro Area Memo	A-5 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications	A-6 - Term and Supply Contract Page	A-7 - Exhibit F - Exceptions	A-8 - Attachment 1 - Bidder's Quotation Sheet
Reviewer	/ 0 pts	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail
John Konon	0	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass
	Average:	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass
									<b>↓</b>
Calculated:	0	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass

#### **Evaluation Group 2 - Department Evaluation**

	Total	B - Department Evaluation	B-1 - Exhibit F - Exceptions	B-2 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications
Reviewer	/ 40 pts	/ 40 pts	/ 10 pts	/ 30 pts
John Johnson	34	34	9	25
		Average:	9	25
				$\downarrow$
Calculated:	34	34	9	25

#### **Evaluation Group 3 - Pricing Evaluation**

	Total	C - Pricing	C-1 - Attachment 1 - Bidder's Quotation Sheet
Reviewer	/ 60 pts	/ 60 pts	/ 60 pts
John Johnson	55	55	55
		Average:	55
			$\downarrow$
Calculated:	55	55	55



#### **Scoring Comments**

#### A-1 - Affidavit - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass

#### A-2 - Addenda - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments		
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass		

#### A-3 - Certificate of Compliance - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments		
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass		

#### A-4 - Greater KC Metro Area Memo - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer Score		Reason	Comments	
	John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Great response!

#### A-5 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments		
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass		

#### A-6 - Term and Supply Contract Page - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer Score		Reason	Comments	
	John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	\$750.00 minimum order charge

#### A-7 - Exhibit F - Exceptions - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments



John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass
------------	------	--------------------------	------

#### A-8 - Attachment 1 - Bidder's Quotation Sheet - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments		
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass		

#### B-1 - Exhibit F - Exceptions - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer Score		Reason	Comments		
John Johnson	9	Other	Noted appropriate substitutions for bid items.		

#### **B-2 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications - Reviewer Scores**

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments		
			Provided good references and		
		Meets or exceeds my expectations  Provided good references a pertinent contracts, currently by Arbanas Golf Course and Operations, excellent quality			
John Johnson	25				
		expectations	Operations, excellent quality of		
			chemicals and service.		

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments	
John Johnson	55	Meets or exceeds my expectations	Van Diest is low price on many of the chemicals that Parks uses.	



## 23-047 - Turf Chemicals SiteOne Landscape Supply

#### **Scoring Summary**

Evaluation Group 1 - Main Evaluation

	A - Purchasing Evaluation	A-1 - Affidavit	A-2 - Addenda	A-3 - Certificate of Compliance	A-4 - Greater KC Metro Area Memo	A-5 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications	A-6 - Term and Supply Contract Page	A-7 - Exhibit F - Exceptions	A-8 - Attachment 1 - Bidder's Quotation Sheet
Reviewer	/ 0 pts	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail
John Konon	0	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass
	Average:	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass
									↓ ↓
Calculated:	0	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass

#### **Evaluation Group 2 - Department Evaluation**

	Total	B - Department Evaluation	B-1 - Exhibit F - Exceptions	B-2 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications
Reviewer	/ 40 pts	/ 40 pts	/ 10 pts	/ 30 pts
John Johnson	34	34	9	25
		Average:	9	25
				$oxed{\downarrow}$
Calculated:	34	34	9	25

#### **Evaluation Group 3 - Pricing Evaluation**

	Total	C - Pricing	C-1 - Attachment 1 - Bidder's Quotation Sheet
Reviewer	/ 60 pts	/ 60 pts	/ 60 pts
John Johnson	50	50	50
		Average:	50
Calculated:	50	50	50

#### **Scoring Comments**

#### A-1 - Affidavit - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments



John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass
------------	------	--------------------------	------

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass

#### A-4 - Greater KC Metro Area Memo - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Corrected memo received

#### A-5 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass

#### A-6 - Term and Supply Contract Page - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass

#### A-7 - Exhibit F - Exceptions - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass

#### A-8 - Attachment 1 - Bidder's Quotation Sheet - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	At shop locations vendor stated "Please see attached but there was no attachment - amended attachment is their local location listing

#### B-1 - Exhibit F - Exceptions - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Johnson	9	Meets or exceeds my expectations	No exceptions listed.

#### B-2 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Johnson	25	Strongly fits desired attribute(s)	Vendor currently used by Arbanas Golf Course, excellent
			service and pricing.



Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Johnson	50	Strongly fits desired attribute(s)	Site One is low on many of the chemicals used specifically for Arbanas Golf Course.



## 23-047 - Turf Chemicals Advanced Turf Solutions

#### **Scoring Summary**

Evaluation Group 1 - Main Evaluation

	A - Purchasing Evaluation	A-1 - Affidavit	A-2 - Addenda	A-3 - Certificate of Compliance	A-4 - Greater KC Metro Area Memo	A-5 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications	A-6 - Term and Supply Contract Page	A-7 - Exhibit F - Exceptions	A-8 - Attachment 1 - Bidder's Quotation Sheet
Reviewer	/ 0 pts	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail
John Konon	0	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass
	Average:	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass
									<u> </u>
Calculated:	0	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass

#### **Evaluation Group 2 - Department Evaluation**

	Total	B - Department Evaluation	B-1 - Exhibit F - Exceptions	B-2 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications
Reviewer	/ 40 pts	/ 40 pts	/ 10 pts	/ 30 pts
John Johnson	34	34	9	25
		Average:	9	25
Calculated:	34	34	9	25

#### **Evaluation Group 3 - Pricing Evaluation**

	Total	C - Pricing	C-1 - Attachment 1 - Bidder's Quotation Sheet
Reviewer	/ 60 pts	/ 60 pts	/ 60 pts
John Johnson	50	50	50
		Average:	50
			ļ
Calculated:	50	50	50

#### **Scoring Comments**

#### A-1 - Affidavit - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Amended - everything now is filled out completely.

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments



John Konon Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	No Addenda issued however, the acknowledged receiving addenda
-----------------	--------------------------	---

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	returned our certificate of compliance notice I had to go to the portal to confirm

#### A-4 - Greater KC Metro Area Memo - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Amended

#### A-5 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass

#### A-6 - Term and Supply Contract Page - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Amended

#### A-7 - Exhibit F - Exceptions - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Many exceptions - included (14) labels?

#### A-8 - Attachment 1 - Bidder's Quotation Sheet - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass

#### B-1 - Exhibit F - Exceptions - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Johnson	9	Meets or exceeds my expectations	Listed substitutions.

#### B-2 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Johnson	25	Meets or exceeds my expectations	Used by Recreation Division, good service and products. Listed pertinent other contracts.



Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Johnson	50	Strongly fits desired attribute(s)	Advanced has best pricing for chemicals used specifically by Recreation division for sports complexes.



### 23-047 - Turf Chemicals GRASS PAD INC

#### **Scoring Summary**

#### Evaluation Group 1 - Main Evaluation

	A - Purchasing Evaluation	A-1 - Affidavit	A-2 - Addenda	A-3 - Certificate of Compliance	A-4 - Greater KC Metro Area Memo	A-5 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications	A-6 - Term and Supply Contract Page	A-7 - Exhibit F - Exceptions	A-8 - Attachment 1 - Bidder's Quotation Sheet
Reviewer	/ 0 pts	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail
John Konon	0	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass
	Average:	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass
									<u> </u>
Calculated:	0	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass

#### **Evaluation Group 2 - Department Evaluation**

	Total	B - Department Evaluation	B-1 - Exhibit F - Exceptions	B-2 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications
Reviewer	/ 40 pts	/ 40 pts	/ 10 pts	/ 30 pts
John Johnson	28	28	8	20
		Average:	8	20
				↓
Calculated:	28	28	8	20

#### **Evaluation Group 3 - Pricing Evaluation**

	Total	C - Pricing	C-1 - Attachment 1 - Bidder's Quotation Sheet
Reviewer	/ 60 pts	/ 60 pts	/ 60 pts
John Johnson	30	30	30
		Average:	30
Calculated:	30	30	30

#### **Scoring Comments**

#### A-1 - Affidavit - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments



John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass
------------	------	--------------------------	------

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass

#### A-4 - Greater KC Metro Area Memo - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass

#### A-5 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass

#### A-6 - Term and Supply Contract Page - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer Score		Reason	Comments		
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	\$1,000.00 minimum order charge		

#### A-7 - Exhibit F - Exceptions - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Original submission was not signed - this one is.

#### A-8 - Attachment 1 - Bidder's Quotation Sheet - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer Score		Reason	Comments	
	John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass

#### B-1 - Exhibit F - Exceptions - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Johnson	8	Other	Listed substitutions.

#### B-2 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Johnson	20	Other	Current vendor, limited availability for our needs. Listed pertinent.contracts.



Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Johnson	30	Partially meets my expectations	Was higher in pricing than other bidders in categories that Parks
			uses the most.



#### 23-047 - Turf Chemicals Heritage Landscape Supply Group, Inc.

#### **Scoring Summary**

Evaluation Group 1 - Main Evaluation

	A - Purchasing Evaluation	A-1 - Affidavit	A-2 - Addenda	A-3 - Certificate of Compliance	A-4 - Greater KC Metro Area Memo	A-5 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications	A-6 - Term and Supply Contract Page	A-7 - Exhibit F - Exceptions	A-8 - Attachment 1 - Bidder's Quotation Sheet
Reviewer	/ 0 pts	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail
John Konon	0	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass
	Average:	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass
									1
Calculated:	0	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass

#### **Evaluation Group 2 - Department Evaluation**

	Total	B - Department Evaluation	B-1 - Exhibit F - Exceptions	B-2 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications
Reviewer	/ 40 pts	/ 40 pts	/ 10 pts	/ 30 pts
John Johnson	14	14	9	5
		Average:	9	5
				↓
Calculated:	14	14	9	5

#### **Evaluation Group 3 - Pricing Evaluation**

	Total	C - Pricing	C-1 - Attachment 1 - Bidder's Quotation Sheet
Reviewer	/ 60 pts	/ 60 pts	/ 60 pts
John Johnson	30	30	30
		Average:	30
Calculated:	30	30	30

#### **Scoring Comments**

#### A-1 - Affidavit - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer Score		Reason	Comments		
	John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass	

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments	



John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass
------------	------	--------------------------	------

Reviewer		Score	Reason	Comments
	John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass

#### A-4 - Greater KC Metro Area Memo - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer		Score	Reason	Comments	
	John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Amended	

#### A-5 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Score Reason	
			Did not provide completed
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	contracts/current contracts or
			provide references

#### A-6 - Term and Supply Contract Page - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer Score		Reason	Comments	
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass	

#### A-7 - Exhibit F - Exceptions - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Reviewer Score Reason		Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Pass

#### A-8 - Attachment 1 - Bidder's Quotation Sheet - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score Reason		Comments
John Konon	Pass	Meets the requirement(s)	Did not include Shop Locations or Hour of Operation

#### B-1 - Exhibit F - Exceptions - Reviewer Scores

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments	
John Johnson	9	Meets or exceeds my expectations	No exceptions noted.	

#### **B-2 - Statement of Contractor's Qualifications - Reviewer Scores**

Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments	
John Johnson	5	Incomplete response	No references/contracts or other information listed.	



Reviewer	Score	Reason	Comments
John Johnson	30	Partially meets my expectations	Heritage higher pricing in categories that Parks uses most than other bidders.

# 1/1 Jackson County attachment 1 (#33287300)

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
1.	14-0-4 43% Barracade which contains 50% RXN-n-slow release 25% EPEC GO Manufacturer: EC Grow Container Size:	50 pounds	300 bags	s 18.50/Bay	No
2.	-16-0-8-19% Dimension which contains 50% -Nutrisphere - n - slow release 25% EPEC & Manufacturer: ECG vow  Container Size:	0 50 pounds	600 bags	s 24.00/8a	9 110
3.	15-0-0 2% Merit and contains 50% RXN- n-slow release Manufacturer:  Container Size:  ### Additional Contains 50% RXN-  ### Additional Contains	50 pounds	600 bags	\$ 19.90/Bag	NO
4.	18-12-6 w/Avail Containts Nutrisphere - n - AVAIL / slow release  Manufacturer:  Container Size:	50 pounds	300 bags	s No Bid	X
5.	32-0-8 Contains 50% Nitrogen from 50%  RXN - n - slow release  Manufacturer: ECGmw  Container Size:	50 pounds	200 bags	s 19.65/Bay	NO
6.	Acelepryn 0-0-7 Fertilizer Plus .067  Manufacturer: Andersons  Container Size:	50 pound	600 bags	s 31.20/Bag	Ves
7.	Aquathol K  Manufacturer: UPL  Container Size:	2.5 gallon	40 gallon	s_21.50/gal	4
8.	Barracade 4FL  Manufacturer: Syngenta  Container Size:	1 gallon * Must	20 gallon take C	s 158.00/gal U(20gal at 0	Y Y
9.	Cutrine Plus  Manufacturer: 50 Pro  Container Size:	2.5 gallon	5 gallon	s 27.65/gal	Y

NO	DESCRIPTION	TET CO. OF	EST	THE DOLON	BID AS SPECIFIED,
10.	Dimension  Manufacturer: Corte Va  Container Size:	U/M 2.5 gallon	QTY 40 gallon	\$ 245,20/gal	YES or NO
11.	Dismiss  Manufacturer: FMC  Container Size:	1 pint	10 pint	s 66,50/BH	4
12.	Embark Growth Regulator  Manufacturer:  Container Size:	l gallon	8 gallon	s_NoBid	X
13.	Field Marking Chalk, Plus Five Chalk  Manufacturer:  Container Size:	50 pounds	1,500 bags	s No Bid	X
14.	Freehand  Manufacturer: BASF  Container Size:	50 pounds	10 bags	\$ 2.19/LB OR \$109.50	Bag
15.	Ranger Pro  Manufacturer: Bayer  Container Size:	2.5 gallon	400 gallon	\$ 21.05/gal	7
16.	Hyvar XL  Manufacturer: Alligare  Container Size:	1 gallon	80 gallon	\$ 84.64ga1	4
17.	Induce-Aquatic Sticker Brewer 9c-1  Manufacturer: Brewer Int.  Container Size:	O 1 gallon	10 gallon	s 13.85/gal	N
18.	Merit 75wp  Manufacturer: Syngenta  Container Size:	4 x 1.6 oz per container	2 boxes	\$ 4.50/02	Y

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED YES or NO
19.	Pathfinder II  Manufacturer: Conte va  Container Size:	2.5 gallon	10 gallon	s 46.15/gal	4
20.	Pathway  Manufacturer: Corteva  Container Size:	2.5 gallon	10 gallon	\$ 37.25/ga(	4
21.	Remedy  Manufacturer: Corte Va  Container Size:	1 gallon	10 gallon	s_72.85/gal	4
22.	Sedge Hammer  Manufacturer: Gowan  Container Size:	10 x 1.33 oz per container	3 cases	s 49.45/BH	Y
23.	Seven 4L Carbary 1 4L  Manufacturer: Drexe (  Container Size:	2.5 gallon	5 gallon	s 60.85/gal	N
24.	Snapshot  Manufacturer: Conteva  Container Size:	50 pounds	4 bags	s 2.05/LB R \$102.50/B	4
25.	Sonar 1  Manufacturer: SePro  Container Size:	20 pounds	12	\$37.65/LB \$753.00/Bag	Y
1	Speed Zone EW  Manufacturer: PBI  Container Size:	2.5 gallon		\$101.20/gal	Y
occident and resident particular special speci	SureGuard  Manufacturer:  Container Size:	1 pound	30 pounds	s No Bid	×
annual participation and annual participation annual participati	Talstar  Manufacturer: FMC  Container Size:	1 gallon	20 gallon	s 49.80/gal	Y

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
29.	Tempo 2  Manufacturer: ENUL  Container Size:	240 ml	10 bottles	s 48.25/BH	4
30.	Treflan 5g  Manufacturer: Ander 50 n 5  Container Size:	50 pounds	4 bags	s = 80/LB OR \$40.00/BC	4
31.	Carlon 4A  Manufacturer: Conteva  Container Size:	2.5 gallon	25 gallon	\$ 58.30/gal	7
32.	Reward  Manufacturer: Syngenta  Container Size:	2.5 gallon	100 gallon	s 96.00/gal	4
33.	Dylox  Manufacturer:	2.5 gallon	50 gallon	s 92.15/gal	4
34.	Clipper  Manufacturer: Nufarm  Container Size:	pound	15 pounds	s 33.45/LB	N
35.	Specticle  Manufacturer: ENVU  Container Size:	18 oz	15 bottles	s 309.30/BH	4
36.	Sahara DC Mojave 70 EG  Manufacturer: Alligare	10 pounds	50 pounds	s 9.00/LB	N
37.	Podium T-Nex  Manufacturer: Quali-Pro  Container Size:	1 gallon	4 gallons	s/13.20/gal	N
38.	Divron 4L  Manufacturer: Alligare  Container Size:	2.5 gallon	25 gallons	s 21.95/gal	Y
39.	Headway G  Manufacturer:   Syngenta  Container Size:	30 pounds	100 pounds	s 1.90/LB	4

NO	DESCRIPTION  EPEC  20-0-10 90% Der; 19% Dimension;	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
40.	Manufacturer: ECGrow  Container Size:  24-0-5-80% D45-50P, 19% Dimension;	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ 74,90/Bag	N
41.	Manufacturer: ECGOW  Container Size:	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ 82.80/Bag	N
42.	5-0-20 19% Dimension; .058% Acelepryn  Manufacturer:  Container Size:  Eraser Max	50 pounds	300 bags	s_No Bid	X
	Manufacturer: Container Size:	2.5 gallon	25 gallons	s No Bid	X
	GRAND T	\$ 166 824.	70		

Shop Location(s): Marshall Mo-	
Days & Hours of Operation: Mon - Fv1. 7-4:30	
Point of Contact: Name: Milee Kapper Phone	: 913-208-5268
SIGNATURE: MIDT 1/h	DATE: 7/10/2023
NAME (PRINT): Nichael T Kipper	PHONE: 7/3 20 8 5268
NAME (PRINT): Michael T Kipper TITLE (PRINT): Avea Manager	CELL: 913 208 5268
COMPANY NAME (PRINT) Van Diost Supply Company	FAX: —
E-MAIL ADDRESS (PRINT) MIKE. KIPPER & Volsc. com	
E-MAIL ADDRESS FOR PO'S (PRINT) MIKE. LEPPOR @ Vdsc. com	
URL (PRINT): www. vasc. com	

## ATTACHMENT 1 BIDDER'S QUOTATION SHEET

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
1.	14-0-4 43% Barracade which contains 50% RXN - n - slow release Lesco stonewall Manufacturer: <u>EC Grow (4-0-0</u> Container Size: 50 lb.	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ 19.14	No
2.	16-0-8 19% Dimension which contains 50% Nutrisphere - n - slow release  Manufacturer: Lesco Dimension 15-0-5  Container Size: 50 16.	50 pounds	600 bags	\$ 25.96	NO
3.	15-0-0 2% Merit and contains 50% RXN - n - slow release  Manufacturer: Lesco Merit 14-0-0  Container Size: 506.	50 pounds	600 bags	\$ 21.64	NO
4.	18-12-6 w/Avail Containts Nutrisphere - n - AVAIL / slow release  Manufacturer: Lesco 14-20-4  Container Size: 5616.	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ 19.55	NO
5.	32-0-8 Contains 50% Nitrogen from 50% RXN - n - slow release  Manufacturer: Lesco 32-0-8 30% NOS  Container Size: 50 lb -	50 pounds	200 bags	\$ 21.29	NO
6.	Acelepryn 0-0-7 Fertilizer Plus .067  Manufacturer: Lesco Acelepryn 6-0-7  Container Size: 5016.	50 pound	600 bags	\$_33.91	NO
7.	Aquathol K  Manufacturer:  Container Size:     gal	2.5 gallon	40 gallon	\$ 109.23/gal	Yes
8.	Barracade 4FL  Manufacturer: Lesco Stonewall 4FL  Container Size: 2.5 gal	1 gallon	20 gallon	s 102.24/gal	NO
9.	Cutrine Plus  Manufacturer:  Container Size: 2.5 gal	2.5 gallon	5 gallon	\$ 83. 22	yes

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
10.	Dimension  Manufacturer:  Container Size: 2.5 gol	2.5 gallon	40 gallon	\$ 600.88	yes
11.	Dismiss  Manufacturer: Nine Source - Suffvention  Container Size: 492.	all pint	10 pint	\$ 164.00/640z.	NO
12.	Embark Growth Regulator  Manufacturer:  Container Size:	1 gallon	8 gallon	* NO BID	
13.	Field Marking Chalk, Plus Five Chalk Manufacturer: MI Chalk white Container Size:	50 pounds	1,500 bags	\$ 5.75	NO
14.	Freehand  Manufacturer:  Container Size: 50 lb.	50 pounds	10 bags	\$ 109.50	yes
15.	Ranger Pro Manufacturer: LISO Misecutor Pro Container Size: 2.5 gal	2.5 gallon	400 gallon	s_61.80	M
16.	Hyvar XL  Manufacturer:  Container Size:	1 gallon	80 gallon	s_NOBID	
17.	Induce-Aquatic Sticker  Manufacturer: Yardage acidifier  Container Size:	1 gallon	10 gallon	\$ 31.93	ND
18.	Merit 75wp  Manufacturer:  Container Size:   4x//602	4 x 1.6 oz per container	2 boxes	\$ 34.59	Yes



NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
19.	Pathfinder II  Manufacturer: Lesco Triclopy 4  Container Size: 2.5 gal	2.5 gallon	10 gallon	s_198.36	NÔ
20.	Pathway  Manufacturer:  Container Size:	2.5 gallon	10 gallon	s NOBID	
21.	Remedy  Manufacturer: Lesco Triclopyr 4  Container Size: 1 gal	1 gallon	10 gallon	s_79.30	NO
22.	Sedge Hammer  Manufacturer:  Container Size: /.3302.	10 x 1.33 oz per container	3 cases	s_616.20	yes
23.	Seven 4L  Manufacturer: Lesco Sevin SL  Container Size: 2. 55al	2.5 gallon	5 gallon	s_137, 20	NO NO
24.	Snapshot  Manufacturer:  Container Size: 50 lb.	50 pounds	4 bags	<u>\$ 96. 98</u>	yes
25.	Sonar 1  Manufacturer: SePro  Container Size: 20 16.	20 pounds	12 pounds	\$ 708.60	yes
26.	Speed Zone  Manufacturer:  Container Size: 2.5 gal	2.5 gallon	55 gallon	\$ 253.00	Yes
27.	SureGuard  Manufacturer:  Container Size: //e oz.	1 pound	30 pounds	s_171.45	Yes
28.	Talstar  Manufacturer: Lesco Cvosscheck  Container Size: Lgul	1 gallon	20 gallon	<u>\$</u> 46.13	N

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
29.	Tempo 2  Manufacturer: Tempo SC WHYA  Container Size: 240 ml	240 ml	10 bottles	\$ 52,33	ND
30.	Treflan 5g Manufacturer: Lebauon Container Size: 40 (b.	50 pounds	4 bags	\$ 36.80/401b.	NO
31.	Carlon 4A  Manufacturer: <u>hlsto Triclopyr Y</u> Container Size: <u>2.5 gul</u>	2.5 gallon	25 gallon	s_/98,36	ND
32.	Reward  Manufacturer:  Container Size: 2 - 5 gal	2.5 gallon	100 gallon	\$ 2 40.00	yes
33.	Dylox  Manufacturer:  Container Size: 2.5gol	2.5 gallon	50 gallon	\$_ <i>280</i> .27	yes
34.	Clipper  Manufacturer: Surguerd SC  Container Size: 1602.	1 pound	15 pounds	\$ 171.45	NO
35.	Specticle  Manufacturer:  Container Size: 1862 -	18 oz	15 bottles	\$ <u>309.30</u>	yes
36.	Sahara DC  Manufacturer: Lesco kalahan 70E6  Container Size: 516.	10 pounds	50 pounds	\$ 123.64/2×516	NO
37.	Podium  Manufacturer:  Container Size:	1 gallon	4 gallons	s_171.69	yes
38.	Divron 4L  Manufacturer:  Container Size:	2.5 gallon	25 gallons	s_NOBID_	
39.	Headway G  Manufacturer:  Container Size: 3016.	30 pounds	100 pounds	<u>\$ 73.03</u>	yes

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
40.	20-0-10 90% Dur; 19% Dimension; .58%Acelepryn  Manufacturer: Proscape 25-0-5  Container Size: 5016.	50 pounds	300 bags	s_70.69	NO
41.	24-0-5 80% D45 50P; 19% Dimension; .58% Acelepryn  Manufacturer: Proscope 25-0-5  Container Size: 50 lb.	50 pounds	300 bags	s_70.69	M
42.	5-0-20 19% Dimension; .058% Acelepryn  Manufacturer: M5cope 13-0-5  Container Size: 5016-	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ 61.19	NO
43.	Eraser Max  Manufacturer:  Container Size:	2.5 gallon	25 gallons	\$ NO BID	
	GRAND T	\$ 5611.29			

Shop Location(s): Please see attached	
Days & Hours of Operation: M-F Tam - 4pm	
Point of Contact: Name: Keith McGinty Phone	=: 216-704-9250 ext.2
SIGNATURE:	DATE: 07-11-2023
NAME (PRINT): Keith McGinty	PHONE 214-704-9250
TITLE (PRINT): Director	CELL:
COMPANY NAME (PRINT) SiteOne Landscape Supply	FAX: 248-581-1433
E-MAIL ADDRESS (PRINT) bids@SiteOne.com	
E-MAIL ADDRESS FOR PO'S (PRINT) bids@SiteOne.com	
URL (PRINT): www-siteone.com	

#### ATTACHMENT 1 BIDDER'S QUOTATION SHEET

			T		BID AS
			EST		SPECIFIED,
NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	QTY	UNIT PRICE	YES or NO
1.	14-0-4 43% Barracade which contains 50% RXN - n - slow release  Manufacturer: EC Grow BCA  Container Size: 50# Bag	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ 2100/Bag	AHERNATE  BID  BER-1010-50LB  15-0-2, 40%, -429802
2.	16-0-8 19% Dimension which contains 50% Nutrisphere - n - slow release  Manufacturer:  Lebanon - 125-125-125-125-125-125-125-125-125-125-	50 pounds	600 bags	\$_21.81/Bag_ \$13086.00	Alternate Bid 12-0-0, 40% ISN . 19 Dimension
3.	15-0-0 2% Merit and contains 50% RXN- n - slow release  Manufacturer: Le Landn - 1265  Container Size: 50# Baq	50 pounds	600 bags	\$_18,95/Bag_ \$11370.00	Alternate Bid 15-0-0-25921510 , 2 Merit
4.	18-12-6 w/Avail Containts Nutrisphere - n - AVAIL / slow release Modea 1  Manufacturer: ATS - MC1066-5018  Container Size: 50# Bag	50 pounds	300 bags	s_24.15/Bag 157245.00	Alternate Bid 16.28-12 3696xcu W/ARManeut
5.	32-0-8 Contains 50% Nitrogen from 50% RXN - n - slow release MC1672-66LB Manufacturer: MpRRal - ATS  Container Size: 50# Baq	50 pounds	200 bags	\$_20.46/Bag \$11,335,00	Alternate Bid 30-0-6 50%xcu WARMA Ment
6.	Acelepryn 0-0-7 Fertilizer Plus 067  Manufacturer: And elson  Container Size: 50# Bag	50 pound	600 bags	\$ 26,50/Bag \$15906.00	Anderson Product
7.	Aquathol K  Manufacturer: HQualic  Container Size: 2.5 Gallon	2.5 gallon	40 gallon	\$ 269.43/2.5 \$4310.88	A Duathol K
8.	Barracade 4FL AT/645-25GL  Manufacturer: flemorteCh  Container Size: 2.5Ga llvn	2.562. <del>1 gall</del> on	20 gallon	\$ <u>271,87/2.5</u> \$2174.96	Alternate Bid Armortech Kade 4L
9.	Cutrine Plus HC10342,5GL  Manufacturer: Sea PRo  Container Size: 25 Gallon	2.5 gallon	5 gallon	\$ 92.50/2.5 \$185.00	Sold only In 242.5gallon Case

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
10.	Dimension 2 Ew Dow 1615-2,562  Manufacturer: CoRteva  Container Size: 2,5 69/104	2.5 gallon	40 gallon	\$ 600,88 \$9414,08	Dimension 2EW
11.	Dismiss FMC 102p - 602  Manufacturer: FMC  Container Size: 602	1 pint	10 pint	\$ <u>87.46</u> \$2423,80	DISMISS GOZ Bottle
12.	Embark Growth Regulator - Nolonger M Manufacturer: Armor tech - PGR 113 Container Size: Gallon AT1060-164	ade 1 gallon	8 gallon	\$ 146,50/Gallon \$1172.00	Alternate Bid Armorteck PGR 113
13.	Field Marking Chalk, Plus Five Chalk IM, Manufacturer: Calour Foodsot 5 Container Size: 50#	1000-501B 50 pounds	1,500 bags	\$ 5,50/Baq \$8:250.00	AlternateBil Lime Marker Chalk 50#
14.	Freehand  Manufacturer: BASF AGENCY  Container Size: 50# Bag	50 pounds	10 bags	\$ 109.56	Freehand Agency Priced
15.	Ranger Pro MO 1000 - 2,5GC  Manufacturer: Bayer - FNu  Container Size: 2,5Ga/lon	2.5 gallon	400 gallon	\$ 61.46/2.5Gal \$9833,60	Ranger Pro
16.	Hyvar XL UH/6/2-GL  Manufacturer: Alligare  Container Size: Gallon	1 gallon	80 gallon	\$ 119.33/GL \$9544,40	Hyvar XL Gallon
17.	Induce-Aquatic Sticker  Manufacturer: PRECTSIDN  Container Size: 2,5Gallon	2,5 Gallon <del>Tgallon</del>	10 gallon	\$ 62.39/2.5	Alternate Bid Chem-StikhP 2.5 Gallon
18.	Merit 75wp  Manufacturer:  Almostech  Container Size: 4x4x1.60z	4 x 1.6 oz per container	2 boxes	\$ 56.75/4x4466 \$56.75	APMORTECE SES 4X4X163, IMD 75

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
19.	Pathfinder II  Manufacturer: HC/185- Z.56L  Container Size: 2.56allon	2.5 gallon	10 gallon	\$_{D1.75   2.56al	Path Finder
20.	Pathway  Manufacturer:  Container Size:	2.5 gallon	10 gallon	s NoBid	
21.	Remedy  Manufacturer:  Container Size:	1 gallon	10 gallon	s No Bid	
22.	Sedge Hammer RV/D85-1,330Z  Manufacturer: Nu-Sarm-PRoSedge  Container Size: 1,30Z	10 x 1.33 oz per container	3 cases	\$ 528.00 /1041.3 \$1584.00	AHernate Bid PROSESSE 10 XI. 3393
23.	Seven 4L  Manufacturer:  Container Size:	2.5 gallon	5 gallon	s No Bid	
24.	Snapshot  Manufacturer: Corteva  Container Size: 50# Bag	50 pounds	4 bags	\$ 101.65 \$406.60	
25.	Sonar 1 SE 10 80-10LB  Manufacturer: SePro  Container Size: 2 X 5# Bags	20 pounds	12 pounds	\$ 489.00/10#	
26.	Speed Zone EW PB/005-2.5GL  Manufacturer: PBI Box don  Container Size: 2,5 Gallon	2.5 gallon	55 gallon	\$ 253,00/2.5 \$5566.00	Alternate Bid Speed Zone Env
27.	SureGuard FS2005-6402  Manufacturer: Quali-PRO  Container Size: Gto2	1 pound	30 pounds	\$ 344.40 /6402	AHERNATE Sid Flumishield SC 6402
28.	Talstar Select FMClo5064  Manufacturer: FMC  Container Size: G9//64	1 gallon	20 gallon	\$ 166.78/GL \$1335.60	AHARNATE Bid Talstar Select RNP

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
29.	Tempo 2  Manufacturer:  Container Size:	240 ml	10 bottles	s No Bid	
30.	Treflan 5g  LFB/250~40LB  Manufacturer:  Lebanon  Container Size:  40 <sup>#</sup> Bag	50 pounds	4 bags	\$ 27,00 Bag	Teeflan Bay 40#Bag
31.	Carlon 4A Manufacturer: Container Size:	2.5 gallon	25 gallon	s No Bid	
32.	Reward  Manufacturer:  Container Size:	2.5 gallon	100 gallon	s_NoBid	
33.	Dylox 4205L BY/6402.56L  Manufacturer: Bayer  Container Size: 2,5 Gallon	2.5 gallon	50 gallon	\$ 255,2D #5104.00	Dylox 4205L 2.56L
34.	Clipper S/C VA1640-118  Manufacturer: SePRO  Container Size! 402 16802 - 118	640Z	15 pounds	\$ 224,55 #1812.40	Soldonly In 8x402
35.	Specticle Flo BY/100-1802  Manufacturer: Bayer  Container Size: 1802-Agency	18 oz	15 bottles	\$_309.30 \$4639.50	Agency
36.	Sahara DC A11/080-52B  Manufacturer: A/Isga Re  Container Size: 5# Basg	5 Dzund 19 Bag pyunds	50 pounds	\$ 51.16/5#	A HERNATE BILL MOSQUE 70E G
37.	Podium ATIO60256L  Manufacturer: ARMORTECK  Container Size: 2.5 Gallon	1 gallon	4 gallons	\$ 335,00 \$1690,00	Alternate Bid Armortech PBR 113
38.	Divron 4L  Manufacturer:  Container Size:	2.5 gallon	25 gallons	s No Bid	
39.	Headway G AT/121-30LB  Manufacturer: ARMOR tell  Container Size: 30# Bag	30 pounds	100 pounds	\$ 50.50/Bag #202.00	Alternate Bio Armosteck 20xy-PG

NO	DESCRIPTION	U/M	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE	BID AS SPECIFIED, YES or NO
40.	20-0-10 90% Dur; 19% Dimension; .58%Acelepryn EC/2009-5618  Manufacturer: Ellerow  Container Size: 50#Bag	50 pounds	300 bags	\$ 105,50/Bag #19,650.00	Alternate Bio 20-0-10 900UR 11500 Men 9102 1058 Acelegian
41.	24-0-5 80% D45 50P; 19% Dimension; .58% Acelepryn  Manufacturer:  Container Size:	50 pounds	300 bags	s No B7 d	
42.	5-0-20 19% Dimension; .058% Acelepryn  Manufacturer:  Container Size:	50 pounds	300 bags		
43.	Eraser Max  PLIGS-AT  Manufacturer: PROCISION  Container Size: QT.	QT 25 gallon	25 gallons	\$ 15,86/Q+ \$ 1580.00	A Hernate Bid Precision Eraser
	GRAND TOTAL, ITEMS 1-42			\$ 159,647.1	

Shop Location(s): 224 NW PARKWRY RIVERS	ide, Mo 64150
Days & Hours of Operation: $M-F$ 7:00 $AAA \rightarrow 4:0$	OPM
Point of Contact: Name: Bill Norris Phone	: 913-904-6843
SIGNATURE: Milliam S. Maris	DATE: 7/10/2023
NAME (PRINT): William J. NORRIS	PHONE: 913-904-6843
TITLE (PRINT): Salesman	CELL: 9/3-904-6843
COMPANY NAME (PRINT) Advanced Tupf Solution	FAX:
E-MAIL ADDRESS (PRINT) BNORRIS @ Advanced Type, Co	in
E-MAIL ADDRESS FOR PO'S (PRINT) DNORRIS @ Advanced Type.	Con
URL (PRINT):	