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Res. No. 21969 Backup

Bidders Quotation Sheet
Mattresses, Bedding & Linens Specifications

Unit Price entered where U/M is DZ is for one (1) dozen

NO

DESCRIPTION

EST
QTY

UM

MIN ORDER
QTY, IF ANY

UNIT PRICE

1.0

Matiress; Size 30" x 75" x 4,57 with attached
pillow; 1 00% polyester dense batting; certified fire
resistant, moisture and mildew resistant; resistant to
common cleaning materials; hypoallergenic and
odor free; heavy duty, two layers of vinyl bonded
to a tough nylon scrim minimum,.

152

EA

EA

$ T72.98/EA

2.0

Mattress; Size 36" x 75" x 4,5 with attached
pillow; 1 00% polyester dense batting; certified fire
resistant, moisture and mildew resistant; resistant to
common cleaning materials; hypoallergenic and
odor free; heavy duty, two layers of vinyl bonded
to a tough nylon scrim mininnum.

12

EA

NO BID

$ NOBID

3.0

Towei; Minimum Size 22" x 44" cotton tetry, color in
dark hues including brown; minimum 6 pouad per
dozen; durable to hold up under numerous industrial
machine washings; domestic, NO IRREGULARS.

348

D%

DZ

22.65/D7Z

4.0

Wash Cloth; Size 12" x 12" cotton terry; color in dark
Hues including brown; minimum | pound per

dozen; durable to hold up under numerous

industrial machine washings; domestic NO
IRREGULARS.

552

DZ

DZ

3.08/DZ

5.0

Sheet; Size to fit 30" x 75" x 4.5" mattress; fitted;
colors in white and dark hues; poly-coiton blend;
machine washable in hot water; sides hemmed or
surged; preshrunk o fit.

192

Dz

DZ
WHITE
BROWN

$  2372/DZ
27.72/DZ

6.0

Sheet; Size 54" x 90"; flat white unbleached poly-cotton
blend: machine washable in hot water: colors in white
and dark hues; sides hemmed or surged; preshrunk to
fit.

192

DZ

DZ
WHITE
BROWN

26.36/DZ
38.36/DZ

7.0

Standard size pillow flaime-retardant cotton batting
and anti-bacterial outer cover material; tear resistant;
all seams to be double needle stitched with heavy
gauge nylon thread.

12

DA

NO BID

$ NOBID

8.0

Pillowcase: cotton/poly blead unbleached white;
machine washable in hot water; standard size;
colors in white and dark hues,

152

DZ

DZ
WHITE
BROWN

$ 10.24/DZ
10.54/DZ

9.0

Blanket; Minimum Size 62" x 80" 70% Wool, 30%
Man-made Fiber; fire resistant; whip stitched on all
four sides heavy duty loom wovern; color: gray.

24

Dz

EA

6.18/EA
74.16/DZ2

==
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Bidder; Bob Barker Company, Inc. Jackson County, Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 25-018

Page 1 of 2
EST MIN ORDER UNIT PRICE
NO DESCRIPTION QTY UM | QTY, IF ANY
Blanket; 100% Cottonn White; thermal; minimum 2
10.0 | pound; Size: 66” x 90” bound/hemmed edges. EA 6.58/EA
24 DZ $ 78.96/DZ
Shower Curtain; Size 72" x 82" top & bottom view,
11.0 | loop closare white; sani-suede; 10-gauge plastic; NO 12 Dz NO BID 3 NO BID
METAL,
Shower Curtain Hooks; all plastic, open end; 100 per
12.0 | package. 48 PRG Dz g 4.12/DZ

Grand Total of Items 1 to 12 $: 392.88/ Added by Dozen

Miscellaneous Catalog Items: Percentage (%) discount off manufacturer’s suggested retail price on items not

listed above. If more than one discount is offered, attach additional pages with that % discount: 15 %
# Cotalpg Prices May Cho_mje, o\epmdlﬂg on MovKet Excluding Furnishings
Condt‘%j“

ovis.
Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: l +o 2—' Weeks

L ]

SIGNATURE: %g MM"M ) pate: 4 /'2-% /'2-02.5

NAME (Print or Type): Brenda Koester pHoNE: 800-334-9880

TITLE (Print of Type): Bids Contract Administrator MOBILE: N/A

COMPANY NAME (Print or Type): Bob Barker Company, Inc. | pax;  800-322-7537

EMAIL ADDRESS (Print or Type): Didnotices@bobbarker.com




Phone: 1-800-334-9880 e Fax: 1-800-322-7537 ¢ www,bobbarker.com

Clear Sealed Seam Polyester
Mattress w/ Scrim Cover
& With Optional Pillow,

# SSPM25754CLsP §{SSPM30754CLSP )

ITEM #S SSPM25754CLSP & S5PM30754CLSP
DESCRIPTION Maximum Security® Clear Sealed Seam Polyester Mattress w/ Scrim Cover
25" Wx 75" Lx4"H
SIZES
wemmady| 30" W x 75" Lx 4" H
Cover: Clear 3-Ply Polyvinyl Chloride {PVC) w/ bonded scrim
L
MATERIALS Core: 100% Polyester Fiber Pad
COLOR Clear vinyl
s Material: Clear 3-Ply Polyvinyl Chloride (PVC) w/ bonded serim
s Weight:11.5 0z.
»  Water/liquid resistant
COVER *  Antimicrobial
¢ Two layers of heavy-duty, flame-resistant vinyl laminate honded to a tough synthetic scrim
» Fabric and 100% sealed seams lock out odors and contaminants
¢ Flame Retardant: NFPA 701 2019 Test Method 1
s Vent location is concealed and designed to allow air to flow in and out of the mattress
without the penetration of fluids or solids. Concealed to minimize the potential of
tampering or damaging the vent.
s Material: 100% Polyester Fiber Pad
o  Weight: 10 0z.
¢ Description: Made of thermally bonded polyester fiber. No chemicals or additional
CORE ingredients are added during the processing of this product.
s Composition: Memory fiber core of densified polyester
s 5in core compressed to 4in finished height allows mattress to maintain shape for a longer
period of time
s Contains no hazardous material and is 100% recyclable
¢ Pillow Option: Integrated full-size pillow is fitted tightly to mattress core
STITCHING/SEAMS 100% Sealed Seam
PACKAGING Boxed
COUNTRY OF ORIGIN USA
BRAND Maximum Security®

CARE INSTRUCTIONS

Ordinary dirt and grime can be removed by using a clean, soft cloth or towel and warm water.
For more involved cleaning combine your clean, soft cloth along with a solution of mild liquid
soap like dish soap and water. Use approximately 2 thsp of soap to 1 gallon of clean, warm
water to create the cleaning solution. Avoid using powdered soaps, detergents, brushes, or
abrasive sponges.

FLAMABILITY TESTING

California Technical Bulletin 129
California Technical Bulletin 121
16 CFR 1633




16 CFR 1632

MASTER CASE PACK M2
MC WEIGHT s SSPM25754CLSP 30.0 Ibs
~—eel| o SSPM30754CLSP 335 lbs

PALLET QTY

12 Per Pallet

.0

2(o




P: 800-334-9880 e F:800-322-7537 e bobbarker.com

& 8.0
Economy Grade

Bath Towels
BT(size)(color)

[TEMS BT(size)(color)

DESCRIPTION Fconomy Grade Bath Towels

SIZES

24" x 50"

MATERIALS 100% cotton terry fabric
BT2040: Brown (BR), Navy (NV), Orange (OR), White

f1 BT2244: Brown (BR) Navy (NV), Orange (OR), White

BT2450: Brown {BR), Light Blue (LB)
BT8: White

PACKAGING Ships compressed. 25 cases per master case

CARE INSTRUCTIONS Machine wash. Tumble dry.

CASE PACK Standard Case: 12 EA Master Case: Varies

BT2040 20” x 40" White 5 lbs

BT2040BR 20" x 40" Brownh 5 Ibs 12 300
BT2040NV 20" x 40" Navy 5 lbs 12 300
BT2040-OR 20" x 40" Orange 5 lbs 12 300
BT2244 22" x 44" White 6 |bs 12 300
BT2244BR 22" x 44” Brown 6 lbs 12 300
BT2244NV . 22" X 44" Navy 6 lhs 12 3060
BT22440R 227 x 44" Orange 6 Ibs 12 300
BT2450BR 24" x 50” Brown 10.5 Ibs 12 180
BT2450LB 24" x 50" Light Blue 10.5 lbs 12 180
BT8 24" x 80" White 8 Ibs 12 240




Phone: 1-800-334-9880  Fax: 1-800-322-7537 ¢ www.bobbarker.com

®* 40

Economy Washcloths
WC1212

ITEM # WC1212, WC1212NV, WC12120R, WC1212BR
DESCRIPTION Economy Washcloths
SIZE 12in x 12in
MATERIAL 100% cotton terry fabric
COLOR White
PACKAGING Ships compressed. 100 cases per master case
WEIGHT 0.75 Ibs
CARE INSTRUCTIONS Machine wash. Tumble dry.
CASE PACK STANDARD CASE: 12 EA MASTER CASE: 1200 EA




& 6.0

P.O. Box 429
Fuquay-Varina, NC 27526
PH: 1-800-334-9880

Fax: 1-800-322-7537
www.bobbarker.com

Fitted Sheet

Style: FS3075BR

Specifications

30” x 75” Brown

Item
DESCRPTION
STYLE #
MATERIAL

SIZE
CONSTRUCTION

STITCHING
THREAD

WEIGHT

COLOR

THREAD
FABRIC WEIGHT
WASHING

PACKAGING
SELLING UNIT

Specification
Lightweight poly/cotton blended fitted sheet

FS3075BR
55% cotton/ 45% polyester
30” x 75" (Fits a 25”W or 30”W x 75”L x 4"Mattress)

All corners sewn with true safety stitch. 1/4” elastic is
set around the sheet using 3 needle overlock stitch

True safety stitch & three needle over lock stitch

High quality, heavy duty cotton wrapped polyester
thread

12 1bs / dz
Brown
T-130
2.8 or more ounces per square yard

Machine Washable & Dryable. Machine wash in hot
water and tumble dry

[ dozen per bag, 4 bags per master carton

Daozen

10-07-11



#* 5.0

P.O. Box 429
Fuquay-Varina, NC 27526

PH: 1-800-334-9880
Fax: 1-800-322-7537
www.bobbarker.com

30” x 75” White
Fitted Sheet

Style: FS62530L

Specifications

Item
DESCRPTION
STYLE #
MATERTAL

SIZE
CONSTRUCTION

STITCHING
THREAD

WEIGHT

COLOR

THREAD
FABRIC WEIGHT
WASHING

PACKAGING
SELLING UNIT

Specification
Lightweight poly/cotton blended fitted sheet

FS62530L
55% cotton/ 45% polyester
30" x 75” (Fits a 25”W or 30”W x 75”L x 6”Mattress)

All corners sewn with true safety stitch. 1/4” elastic is
set around the sheet using 3 needle overlock stitch

True safety stitch & three needle over lock stitch

High quality, heavy duty cotton wrapped polyester
thread

91bs/dz
White
T-130
2.8 or more ounces per square yard

Machine Washable & Dryable. Machine wash in hot
water and tumble dry

1 dozen per bag, 4 bags per master carton

Dozen

10-07-11




P: 800-334-9880 e F:800-322-7537 e  bobbarker.com

(.0

Bob Barker®
T-130 Flat Sheet

ITEM # SIZE COLOR WEIGHT/DZ CASEQTY MASTER CASE QTY
SH5430N 54” x 90" White 8.3lbs 12 48
SH54900RN 54”x 90" Orange 9.2 1lbs 12 48

ITEM #s SH5890NVN 58" x 90"  Navy 9 lbs 12 48
SH5890BWN 587 x90” Brown 8.9lbs 12 48
SH66104L 66" x 104" White  11.51lhs 12 36
SH66104BR 66" x 104" Brown 12.21lbs 12 36
SH66115L 66" x 115" White 13 lbs 12 36

DESCRIPTION T-130 Flat Sheet, Standard Size
SIZE See table. Tolerance: +/- 5%
MATERIALS Polyester/cotton blend
COLORS See table.

e 130 thread count
SPECIFICATIONS e 3/8” double turned hems
o High quality, heavy duty cotton wrapped polyester thread

CARE INSTRUCTIONS Machine wash in hot water. Tumble dry.

PRIMARY COUNTRY OF

ORIGIN Pakistan

CASE PACK Case Qty: 12 ea Master Case Qty: see table




Phone: 1-800-334-9880 e Fax: 1-800-322-7537 ¢ www.bobhbarker.com

#+38.0 T1.130 Pillowcase,
Standard Size

PC4234

ITEM #S ( CA234NY, PCAZIAOR
DESCRIPTION T-130 Pillowcase, Standard Size
SIZE 20in x 30in
MATERIAL Lightweight cotton/polyester blend
PC4234: White
covons e o
PCA42340R: Orange
CONSTRUCTION 1in hemmed opening—safety stitch construction
THREAD T-130
PRIMARY COUNTRY OF Pakistan
ORIGIN
WEIGHT Fabric weight: 2.8 oz per sq yd
PACKAGING 10 cases per master case
CARE INSTRUCTIONS Machine wash in hot water. Tumble dry.

CASE PACK

STANDARD CASE: 12 EA MASTER CASE: 120 EA




Phone: 1-800-334-9880 e Fax: 1-800-322-7537 e www,bobbarker.com

‘*q.o _. ooI Blanket
0J B6280NV/
W6690

ITEM #H#S NVBG2RONYV, W6690
DESCRIPTION Woven Wool Blanket
17k =l | \WB6280/WB6280NV: 62in x 80in
W6690: 66in x 90in
MATERIALS 70% woal, 30% synthetic blend

coloR ™= wB6280/W6690: Gray
WB6280NV: Navy
¢ Flame-resistant

SPECIFICATIONS e Durable, soft, and comfortable

e  Whip stitched ends

PRIMARY COUNTRY OF

ORIGIN India

BRAND Bob Barker®

CARE INSTRUCTIONS Machine wash in cold water. Tumble dry at low temperature.

TESTING Meets ASTM D 4151-92 Flammability Requirements

CASE PACK STANDARD CASE: EA ’ MASTER CASE: 12 EA




Phone: 1-800-334-9880 e Fax: 1-800-322-7537 e www.hobbarker.com

#10.0

Non-Allergenic Thermal
Blanket, Standard

2127

iTEM # 2127
DESCRIPTION Non-Allergenic Thermal Blanket, Standard
SIZE 66in x 90in
MATERIALS 100% cotton
COLORS White

SPECIFICATIONS

e Exceptional warmth and comfort year-round

e Honeycomb, open weave provides thermal properties and superior durability

PRIMARY COUNTRY OF

ORIGIN India
PACKAGING 12 blankets per master case
BRAND Bob Barker®

CARE INSTRUCTIONS

Machine wash in cold water. Tumble dry at low temperature.

CASE PACK

STANDARD CASE: EA

MASTER CASE: 12 EA




P: 800-334-9880

e F:800-322-7537 e hbhobbarker.com

% (2.0

Shower Curtain Rings

Item # RINGS

ITEM #(S) RINGS
DESCRIPTION Shower Curtain Rings
SIZE One size
FABRIC/MATERIAL Plastic
COLOR Clear
Other Easy snap on and off
CASE PACK Inner Pack: 12 Rings Per Pack {C12) MASTER CASE: 12 packs Per MC {(M12C12)




