

Jackson County, Missouri Request for Legislative Action

REQUESTED MEETING DATE:	03/04/2024	SPONSOR:	Megan L. Marsl	nall
To be completed by the County Counselor's Off NUMBER: 21581	ïce:	ASSIGNED	MEETING DATE	:: <u>03/18/2024</u>
STAFF CONTACT: Dianne Kir		PHONE: ⁸	316-503-4825	
EMAIL: dkimzey@jacksongov	.org			
DEPARTMENT : Parks + Rec				
TITLE: Awarding twelve-month term & furnishings for use by Parks+Re Equipment Company Inc. of Po 23-088.	ec Department to Fi	ry & Associates of	Kansas City, MO a	nd Global
SUMMARY: The Parks + Rec Department is re Site Furnishings to Fry & Associate Port Washington, NY. The Director of Finance and Purch the procurement of Park Site Furn throughout the County. A total of cresponses were received and eval Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the twelve-month term and supply con Associates of Kansas City, Mo, and	es, Kansas City, nasing has solici ishings for use b (12) twelve notifi uated. Jackson County tract with one ty	MO; and Glob ted formal writte by the Parks + F cations were d code, it's reco velve-month op	al Equipment Co en bids on Bid N Rec Department istributed and (3) mmended the av tion to extend to	o. 23-088 for at park sites three ward of one Fry &
FINANCIAL IMPACT: NO TYPES YES	Amount	Fund	Department	Line-Item Detail
ACTION NEEDED: AWARD A C	ONTRACT			
ATTACHMENT(S):				



23-088 - Park Site Furnishings

Project Overview

Project Details	
Reference ID	23-088
Project Name	Park Site Furnishings
Project Owner	John Konon
Project Type	ITB
Department	Parks + Rec
Budget	\$0.00 - \$0.00
Project Description	Jackson County, Missouri is seeking a Twenty-Four (24) Month Term and Supply Contract with One (1) Twelve (12) Month Options to Extend for the furnishing of Park Site Furnishings for use by Parks + Rec Department.
Open Date	Dec 28, 2023 2:00 PM CST
Intent to Bid Due	Jan 30, 2024 12:00 PM CST
Close Date	Jan 30, 2024 2:00 PM CST

Highest Scoring Supplier	Score
Fry & Associates	96 pts

Seal status



Requested Information	Unsealed on	Unsealed by
Acknowledged Receipt of Addenda	Jan 31, 2024 8:16 AM CST	John Konon
Affidavit	Jan 31, 2024 8:16 AM CST	John Konon
Attachment C – MBE/WBE/VBE Participation Affidavit	Jan 31, 2024 8:16 AM CST	John Konon
Bidders Quotation Sheet	Jan 31, 2024 8:16 AM CST	John Konon
Certificate of Compliance	Jan 31, 2024 8:16 AM CST	John Konon
Dedicated Email Addresses (per section 4.5 – on Company Letterhead)	Jan 31, 2024 8:16 AM CST	John Konon
Cut sheets and Specifications for each item bid, per section 5.6	Jan 31, 2024 8:16 AM CST	John Konon
Exhibit F – Bidders Exceptions	Jan 31, 2024 8:16 AM CST	John Konon
Greater KC Metro Area Information Memo (per section 3.0 - on Company Letterhead)	Jan 31, 2024 8:16 AM CST	John Konon
Statement of Contractors Qualifications	Jan 31, 2024 8:16 AM CST	John Konon
Term and supply Contract Page	Jan 31, 2024 8:16 AM CST	John Konon



Scoring Summary

Active Submissions

	Total	A - Purchasing Evaluation	A-1 - Term and Supply Contract Page	A-2 - Affidavit	A-3 - Certificate of Compliance
Supplier	/ 100 pts	/ 0 pts	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail
Fry & Associates	96 pts	0 pts	Pass	Pass	Pass
Global Equipment Company Inc	85 pts	0 pts	Pass	Pass	Pass
JGW Machine Ltd. dba Paris Site Furnishings and Outdoor Fitness	70 pts	0 pts	Pass	Pass	Pass



	A-4 - Statement of Contractors Qualifications	A-5 - Acknowledgment of Receipt of Addenda	A-6 - Greater Kansas City Metropolitan Area Information Memo (on Company Letterhead)	A-7 - Bidders Quotation Sheet	A-8 - Exhibit F - Bidders Exceptions
Supplier	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail
Fry & Associates	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass
Global Equipment Company Inc	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass
JGW Machine Ltd. dba Paris Site Furnishings and Outdoor Fitness	Pass	Pass	Pass	Pass	Fail



	A-9 - Dedicated Email Addresses (per section 4.5 – on Company Letterhead)	A-10 - Attachment C - MBE/WBE/VBE Participation Affidavit	B - Departement Evaluation	B-1 - Bidders Quotation Sheet	B-2 - Statement of Contractors Qualifications
Supplier	Pass/Fail	Pass/Fail	/ 100 pts	/ 50 pts	/ 25 pts
Fry & Associates	Pass	Pass	96 pts	47.5 pts	24 pts
Global Equipment Company Inc	Pass	Pass	85 pts	45 pts	20 pts
JGW Machine Ltd. dba Paris Site Furnishings and Outdoor Fitness	Pass	Pass	70 pts	40 pts	17.5 pts



	B-3 - Exhibit F – Bidders Exceptions	B-4 - Attachment C – MBE/WBE/VBE Participation Affidavit
Supplier	/ 15 pts	/ 10 pts
Fry & Associates	14.5 pts	10 pts
Global Equipment Company Inc	11.5 pts	8.5 pts
JGW Machine Ltd. dba Paris Site Furnishings and Outdoor Fitness	4 pts	8.5 pts

Jackson County, Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 23-088 Page 2 of 2

Bidders Quotation Sheet

Park Site Furnishings

All Prices must include packaging, freight, fuel, delivery, and all other miscellaneous charges.

NO. 5.1	Cantelever Style Picnic Tables Pilot Rock, Mfg. #T602/CB-8RB	UNIT	PRICE PER UNIT
	Qty. 1 to 9 Units	Each	\$1,350.00
	Oty, 10 to 19 Units	Each	\$1,350.00
	Qty. 20 to 29 Units	Each	\$1,289.00
	Qty. 30 to 39 Units	Each	\$1,289.00
	Qty. 40 to 49 Units	Each	\$1,289.00
NO. 5.2	Portable Rectangle Picnic Tables Pilot Rock, Mfg. #XT/CB-8RB	UNIT	PRICE PER UNIT
	Qty. 1 to 9 Units	Each	S 1,425.00
	Qty. 10 to 19 Units	Each	\$1,425.00
	Qty. 20 to 29 Units	Each	\$1,358.00
	Qty. 30 to 39 Units	Each	\$1,358.00
	Qty. 40 to 49 Units	Each	\$1,358.00
NO. 5.3	Perforated Steel Trash Receptacle Pilot Rock, Mfg. #CN-R/RB-55, T/CB-2710, CN/B-1829, CK-5 (Recept., Lid, Liner, Cable Kit	UNIT	PRICE PER UNIT
	Qty. 1 to 9 Units	Each	S 810.00
	Qty. 10 to 19 Units	Each	\$810.00
	Qty. 20 to 29 Units	Each	\$788.00
	Qty. 30 to 39 Units	Each	\$788.00
	Oty. 40 to 49 Units	Each	S 788.00
NO. 5.4	Premium Park Bench DuMor #58-60 with Plaque-QE9ZE Text to be determined prior to order	UNIT	PRICE PER UNIT
	Qty. 1 to 9 Units	Each	\$2,478.00
	Oty. 10 to 19 Units	Each	\$2,234.00
	Qty. 20 to 29 Units	Each	\$2,224.00
	Qty. 30 to 39 Units	Each	\$2,215.00
	Qty. 40 to 49 Units	Each	\$2,166.00
NO. 5.5	Standard Park Bench Pilot Rock, Mfg. #SCXB/CB-6HB12, ANC-3 anchors	UNIT	PRICE PER UNIT
	Qty. 1 to 9 Units	Each	\$796.00
	Qty. 10 to 19 Units	Each	\$796.00
	Qty. 20 to 29 Units	Each	\$769.00
	Qty. 30 to 39 Units	Each	\$769.00
	Qty. 40 to 49 Units	Each	\$769.00

Miscellaneous Items:

Percentage discount off Manufacturers Suggested Retail Price for Miscellaneous Catalog Items:

5 9

Company Name: Fry & Associates, Inc.

1

Jackson County, Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 23-088 Page 2 of 2

Bidders Quotation Sheet

Park Site Furnishings

All Prices must include packaging, freight, fuel, delivery, and all other miscellaneous charges.

NO. 5.1	Cantelever Style Picnic Tables	UNIT	PRICE PER UNIT
WB695289BK	Qty. 1 to 9 Units	Each	\$1,280.92
	Qty. 10 to 19 Units	Each	\$1,269.43
	Qty. 20 to 29 Units	Each	\$1,257.94
	Qty. 30 to 39 Units	Each	\$1,246.45
	Qty. 40 to 49 Units	Each	\$1,234.96
NO. 5.2	Portable Rectangle Picnic Tables	UNIT	PRICE PER UNIT
WB277153BK	Qty. 1 to 9 Units	Each	\$1,063.20
	Qty. 10 to 19 Units	Each	\$861.52
	Qty. 20 to 29 Units	Each	\$851.73
	Qty. 30 to 39 Units	Each	\$841.94
	Qty. 40 to 49 Units	Each	\$832.15
NO. 5.3	Perforated Steel Trash Receptacle	UNIT	PRICE PER UNIT
TEX-55	Qty. 1 to 9 Units	Each	\$439.87
	Qty. 10 to 19 Units	Each	\$435.70
	Qty. 20 to 29 Units	Each	\$431.53
	Qty. 30 to 39 Units	Each	\$427.36
	Qty. 40 to 49 Units	Each	\$423.19
NO. 5.4	Premium Park Bench	UNIT	PRICE PER UNIT
	Qty. 1 to 9 Units	Each	\$ NO BID
	Qty. 10 to 19 Units	Each	\$ NO BID
	Qty. 20 to 29 Units	Each	\$ No BID
	Qty. 30 to 39 Units	Each	\$NO BID
	Qty. 40 to 49 Units	Each	SNo BID
NO. 5.5	Standard Park Bench	UNIT	PRICE PER UNIT
WB2771548K	Qty. 1 to 9 Units	Each	\$901.28
	Qty. 10 to 19 Units	Each	\$856.55
	Qty. 20 to 29 Units	Each	\$850.16
	Qty. 30 to 39 Units	Each	\$843.38
	Qty. 40 to 49 Units	Each	\$830.99

Lead Times: 3-5 Days ARO

Miscellaneous Items:

Percentage discount off Manufacturers Suggested Retail Price for Miscellaneous Catalog Items:

10 %

Company Name: Global Equipment Company Inc.