IN THE COUNTY LEGISLATURE OF JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI

A RESOLUTION awarding twelve (12) month term and supply contracts for the
furnishing of turf chemicals and fertilizers for use by the Parks and Recreation
Department to Grass Pad of Olathe, KS, Helena Chemical Company of Shawnee, KS,
Supreme Turf Products, Inc., of Olathe, KS, Reinders Inc. of EIm Grove, WI, and Red
River of Shreveport, LA, under the terms and conditions of Electronic Solicitation No.
BB20111.

RESOLUTION #17565, April 11, 2011

INTRODUCED BY Fred Arbanas, County Legislator

WHEREAS, the Director of Finance and Purchasing has solicited bids on Electronic
Solicitation No. BB20111 for the furnishing of turf chemicals and fertilizers for use by the
Parks and Recreation Department to provide for departmental needs for the upcoming

one-year period; and,

WHEREAS, a total of nineteen notifications were distributed and eight responses were

received; and,

WHEREAS, the Director of Finance and Purchasing recommends that the contract be

divided and awarded to the vendors submitting the lowest bid for each item; and,

WHEREAS, award as recommended would result in awards to the following:




BIDDER ITEMS RECOMMENDED

Grass Pad
Olathe, KS \ 1,3, & 26
Helena Chemical Company
Shawnee, KS 4,8, 16, 20, 27, & 37
Supreme Turf Products, Inc. .
Olathe, KS 25
Reinders, Inc. 2,7,9,10,13, 15, 17, 21, 23, 24,
Elm Grove, Wi & 28-36
Red River
Shreveport, LA 5,11, 14, 18, 19, & 22

now therefore,

BE IT RESOLVED by the County Legislature of Jackson County, Missouri, that award
be made as recommended by the Director of Finance and Purchasing, and that the
Director be, and is hereby, authorized to execute for the County any documents

necessary to the accomplishment of the award; and,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Director of Finance and Purchasing is authorized
to make all payments, including final payment on the contracts, to the extent that
sufficient appropriations to the using spending agency have been made in the then

current Jackson County budget.




Effective Date: This Resolution shall be effective immediately upon its passage by a
majority of the Legislature.

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

County Coun

Certlficate of Passage

| hereby certify that the attached resolution, Resolution #17565 of April 11, 2011,

was duly passed on Aonrp // , 2011 by the Jackson County
Legislature. The votes thereoh were as follows:
Yeas (ﬂ Nays m
Abstaining O Absent 5
) \
L~ 1~1] w’w Mﬂ—&w(@
Date Mary Jo Spin@lé‘fk of Legislature

This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any
specific amount. The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual

appropriations.

/ é 27/

Dat




REQUEST FOR LEGISLATIVE ACTION

Completed by County Counselor’s Office:

Res/GNo.: 17565
Sponsor(s): Fred Arbanas
Date: April 11, 2011

SUBIJECT

Action Requested
X Resolution
[] Ordinance
Project/Title: Awarding a Twelve-Month Term and Supply Contract for the furnishing of Park Operations
Chemicals for the Parks & Recreation Department to Grass Pad of Olathe, Kansas; Helena Chemical Co. of
Shawnee, Kansas: Supreme Turf Products Inc. of Olathe, Kansas; Reinders Inc, of Elm Grove, Wisconsin; and
Red River of Shreveport, Louisiana; under the term and conditions of Electronic Solicitation No. BB20111.
BUDGET
INFORMATION Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year: $ N/A
To be completed Amount previously authorized this fiscal year: $ N/A
By Requesting Total amount authorized after this legislative action: $ N/A
Department and- Amount budgeted for this item * (including $ N/A
Finance transfers):
Source of funding (name of fund) and account code FROM ACCT
number; FROM / TO
TO ACCT

* If account includes additional funds for other expenses, total budgeted in the account is: $
OTHER FINANCIAL INFORMATION:
[] No budget impact (no fiscal note required)

[X] Term and Supply Contract (funds approved in the annual budget); estimated value and use of contract:
Department: Parks Estimated Use: $89,339.00

Prior Year Budget (if applicable): $83,850.00

Prior Year Actual Amount Spent (if applicable): $68,750.00

PRIOR
LEGISLATION Prior ordinances and (date): N/A
Prior resolutions and (date). 17187, 3/1/10
CONTACT
INFORMATION | RLA drafted by (name, title, & phone): Teddy Ballard, Senior Buyer, 881-3465
REQUEST
SUMMARY

The Parks Department requested a bid for chemicals and fertilizers for the Operations Division. Purchasing
issued Electronic Solicitation No. BB20111. A total of 19 notifications were distributed with eight responses
received. The following split of award is recommended to the low bidder on each item:

BIDDER LOW BID/ITEMS RECOMMENDED
Grass Pad, Olathe, KS 1,3,&26

Helena Chemical, Shawnee, KS 4,8, 16, 20, 27, & 37

Supreme Turf, Olathe, KS 25

Reinders, Elm Grove, W1 2,7,9,10,13, 15,17, 21,23, 24, & 28-36

Red River, Shreveport, LA 5,11, 14,18, 19 & 22




Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, 1984, the Director of Finance and Purchasing
recommends the award of a Twelve Month Term and Supply Contract for the furnishing of Park Operations
Chemicals for the Parks & Recreation Department to Grass Pad of Olathe, Kansas; Helena Chemical Co. of
Shawnee, Kansas; Supreme Turf Products Inc. of Olathe, Kansas; Reinders Inc. of Elm Grove, Wisconsin; and
Red River of Shreveport, Louisiana; under the term and conditions of Electronic Solicitation No. BB20111 to the
lowest and best bidder for each item.

NOTE: Not all alternates proposed by bidders have the same chemical content as items specified. The lowest
and best bid for each item is recommended for award by the Parks Department.

"This award is made on an “as needed” basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount.
The availability of funds for specific purchases is subject to annual appropriations.

CLEARANCE [] Tax Clearénce Completed (Purchasing & Departrment)
[] Business License Verified (Pirchasing & Department)
XJ Chapter 6 Compliance - Affirmative Action/Prevailing Wage (County Auditor’s Office)

ATTACHMENTS | Electronic Recap of Bids Received, Recap of Prices, and Memo from Mr. JD Ingram of the Parks Department

If applicable A7lp_ H-5-11

Division Manager: % — ' | Date: Lf /5'/! !

County Counselor’s Office: =~ © Date:

REVIEW Depgitfnent Djrector; Date:
7> 74.)-7/-\ - ‘ 4 C// - /,/
ance (Budgethp% &w Date:




Fiscal Information (to be verified by Budget Office in Finance Department)

] This expenditure was included in the annual budget.
J Funds for this were encumbered from the Fund in .
] There is a balance otherwise unencumbered to the credit of the appropriation to which the expenditure

is chargeable and there is a cash balance otherwise unencumbered in the treasury to the credit of the fund from which
payment is to be made each sufficient to provide for the obligation herein authorized.

] Funds sufficient for this expenditure will be/were appropriated by Ordinance #
1 Funds sufficient for this appropriation are available from the source indicated below.
Account Number: Account Title: Amount Not to Exceed:
[ﬂ This award is made on a need basis and does not obligate Jackson County to pay any specific amount. The availability of

funds for specific purchases will, of necessity, be determined as each using agency places its order.

[l This legislative action does not impact the County financially and does not require Finance/Budget approval.




. Buyers Lu-n{p Sum Abstract

Page 1 of 5

CERTIFICATION OF BID OPENING

BIDS WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND
‘ RECORDED ON: = ol \ BY
RO Jackson County Missouri S
b r . .
PR  Purchasing Department TETURE
o ] 415 East 12th Street, Room G}Wj
' * °  Kansas City, MO 64106 PURCHASING MANAGER
0 . .
| LUMP SUM Abstract of Responses for Solicitation #8B20111 - 00 |
Click here to attach a post award file to this solicitations header.
This file will be viewable by vendors from the abstract solicitation view after award.
| Solicitation Optional Title:||Park Operations Chemicals |
' Abbreviated Desc: CHEMICALS - Jackson County, Mlssourl is seeking
NIGI_: Nbr: 33500 bids for a Twelve (12) Month Ter .
Start of .
Service Email Date || Due Date Solicitation Line Items Requisition Nbr
Date
Fri Apr 15 |[ Tue Jan 25 || Tue Mar 01
2011 2011 2011 1 TOTAL RR20111
00:00:00 11.07:58 14:00:00
Estimated Price: 0
[ Agency Attachments | " Line ltem View |
i Assngn/Manage pCard ‘I ""Federal Excluded Parties List '
Vendor Response Tracklna ,__,._‘ ’ Bottom Of Page
Toggle All
Switches
Award f Discount |l LABP Price _
Price || PymtTerms || Pymt Text o NLAB: +0 Trans Date || Trans Time
[Zero dollars response to Item(s): 001 . B
Award: C $0.00 0 ) 0.00 0.00 Tue Mar0® il 11:40:38
FedID;|| XX-XXXX751
Vendor:||GRASS PAD WAREHOUSE P00000039469 1P Addr:|l 67.64.35.25
Response .
Version: 001: 00
Line ltem .
Pricos: 001: 0 (0.00)
Recyclel 41: Not applicable
Vendor|.
Comments:
Attached|[item: 001
Files:|[Jackson County Copy of BB20111_ParkOPChemBidPriceSchedule.xls
Imitator Plus 526 ASP-0810.pdf
Tahoe 4E Id7PH004.pdf -
Maliet WSP.pdf
TI_25G_SS.pdf
Tl.pdf
Buyer
Comments:
1 1
https://basec.sicomm.net/buyer/agency buyer AbstractLS.html?responses=1&isAContra... 03/01/2011




. Buyers Lump Sum Abstract Page 20of 5
l Solicitation: BB20111]|
Award Discount || LABP Price
ar Price Pymt Terms || Pymt Text ) Trans Date || Trans Time
o NLAB: +0 .
IZero dollars response to Item(s): 001 ]
Award: C || $0.00 0 0.00 0.00 Mon e 281 15:01:14
FedID: -XXXX
Vendor:||HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY P00000058853 IP :glir: %_83_65328
Response .
Version: 001: 00
Line item .
Prices: 001: 0 (0.00)
Recyclef| ... .
Status: 001: Not applicable
Vendor
Comments:
Aftached = -
Files:
item: 001
Copy of BB20111_ParkOPChemBidPriceSchedule.xls
Buyer|
Comments: _
| Solicitation: BB20111]
Award / Pri PymtT Pymt Text “Prics | LABEPrice Trans Date || Trans Tin
rice ymt Terms ymt Tex ] rans Date rans Time
o NLAB: +0
|Zero dollars response to ltem(s): 001 L l
Award: O $0.00 0 Net 30 0.00 0.00 WedFen 18| 105122
FedID:[| XX-XXXX580
Vendor:(|SUPREME TURF PRODUCTS, INC. P00000068611 IP Addr:l| 70.244.104.8
Response .
Version: 001: 00
Line Item .
" Prices: 001: 0 (0.00)
R ! .
s—i(;{ﬁ 001: Not applicable
Vendor
Comments:
Attached
Files:
Item: 001
Jackson County Park Bid 2011.xIs
CideKick 1l Label.pdf
Halosulfuron Pro Label.pdf
Buyer
Comments:
| Solicitation: BB20111]
Award ] _ Discount |l LABP Price _
war Price Pymt Terms || Pymt Text e NLAB: +0 Trans Date Trans Time
|Zero dollars response to ltem(s): 001 , |
I | Al |[ Mon Feb 28 || |

https://basec.sicomm.net/buyer/agency buyer AbstractLS html?responses=1&isAContra... ‘03/01/2011




Buyers Lump Sum Abstract

” Net 30 days ” 0.00 0.00 2011

Award: © $0.00 ” 0

Page 3 of 5

11:04:55

FedID:
IP Addr:

Vendor:||ALLIGARE, LLC P00000076850

XX-XXXX363
72.243.71.106

Response

Version: 001: 00

Line ltem

ocoa|1001: 0 (0.00)

Recycle

Status: 001: Not applicable

Vendor
Comments:

Aftached s —— I
Files: _
Item: 001 :
Copy of BB20111_ParkOPChemBidPriceSchedule.xls
Item 1 Label for Glyphosate 4Plus LABEL.pdf
Iltem 1 MSDS for Glyphosate 4Plus_MSDS.pdf

item 1 Supplemental Label for Glyphosate 4PlusSupplementallabel.pdf
liem 4 and 14 Label for Triclopyr 4 Specimen Label.pdf

Item 4 and 14 MSDS for Triclopyr 4 MSDS.pdf

item 5 Label for Glyphosate 5 4 Specimen.pdf

Item 5 MSDS for Glyphosate § 4 MSDS.pdf

Item 20 Label for Alligare 90 LABEL.pdf

litem 20 MSDS for Alligare 90 MSDS.pdf

Buyer
Comments:

[ ' Solicitation: BB20111|

Discount .
Price LABP Price

Pymt Text Py NLAB: +0

Award / Price Pymt Terms Trans Date

Trans Time

]Zero dollars response to Item(s): 001

Mon Feb 28
2011

" $0.00 0 0.00 0.00

Award: ("

12:24:46

FediD:

Vendor:IRED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC. P00000079861 . IP Addr:

XX-XXXX450
12.133.42.154

Response

Version: 001.: 00

Line Iltem

Pricas:|[001: 0.(0-00)

Recycle

Status: 001: Not applicable -

Vendor
Comments:

Attached
Files:

item: 001 :

Jackson County BB20111 Bid-Price Schedule-Final.xlsx

Element 4 Label.pdf
Element 4 MSDS.pdf

Imidacloprid 75 WSB Label.pdf
Imidacloprid 75 WSB MSDS.pdf
Ranger Pro Label.pdf

Ranger Pro MSDS.pdf

Red River 90 Label.pdf

Red River 90 MSDS.pdf

T-1 2.5G Lahel.pdf

T-1 2.5G MSDS.pdf

https://basec.sicomm.net/buyer/agency buyer AbstractLS.html?responses=1&isAContra...

03/01/2011




Buyers Lump Sum Abstract ' o Page 4 of 5

Buyer|
Comments:
l . ) Solicitation: BB20111|
Discount | LABP price
Award / Price Pymt Terms || Pymt Text . Trans Date || Trans Time
‘ c NLAB: +0
Zero dollars response to ltem(s): 001 ) , : 1
Award: O $0.00 0 net 30 days 0.00 0.00 || SunFeb27 || 4e.47:56
: 2011
. FedD:|| XX-XXXX349
Vendor:[REINDERS, INC P00000090524 IP Addr:|| 24.32.233.135
Response .
Version: 001: 00
Line ltem .
Prices:||001: 0 (0.00)
Recycle , .
Status: 001: Not applicable
Vendor|[ltem #001 Cmnt: Delivery 3-21 days ARO
Comments:; | e -
Aftached
Files: J
Item: 001

Jackson CO BB20111 ParkOPChemBldPrlceSchedule pdf
Jackson CO Forms completed.pdf

Jackson CO forms completed 2.pdf

Prosedge label.pdf
GLYPHOSATE _PRO 4 LABEL pdf
Acelepryn label.pdf

Provaunt label.pdf
Trammel Weedgrass Preventer.pdf -

Buyer|
Comments:
, , Solicitation: BB20111]
) D';(r:izznt LABP Price )
Award/ ([ Price Pymt Terms || Pymt Text o NLAB: +0 || Trans Date |[ Trans Time
[Zero dollars response to ltem(s): 001 ]
Award: © $0.00 0 30 0.00 - Thufeb24 I 13:38:25
; ' FedID: || XX-XXXX550
Vendor:|[JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES P00000094183 IP Addr:|1199.178.201.11

: 0.00
. o '
Response ) . .
Version: 001: 00 )Ag

Line ltem .
Prices: 001: 0 (0.00)

%‘;{3—5 001: Not applicable

Vendor
Comments:

Attached
Files:

Item: 001
0224143503 001.pdf

Buyer
Comments:

https://basec.sicomm.net/buyer/agency buyer_AbstractLS.html?responses=1&isAContra... 03/01/2011




Buyers Lump Sum Abstract

Solicitation: BB20111|

Page 5 of 5

Discount
Price

Award /
O

Price Pymt Terms || Pymt Text

LABP Price

NLAB: +0

Trans Date

Trans Time

500000.00

Award: ¢ || $500,000.00 0

500000.00

Mon Feb 28
2011

15:17:47

Vendor:|lcwc ENTERPRISES P00000064969

FediD:
IP Addr:

XX-XXXX614
66.207.91.8

Response

-Version: 001: 00

Line item

Prices: 001: 500000 (500000.00)

Recycle

Status: |°1: Not applicable

Vendor
Cominents:

Attached
Files:

Item: 001 '

BB20111_ParkOPChemBidPriceSchedule.xis

Aquaneatlabel:pdf
AquaneatMSDS.pdf
RANGERPRO.LABEL.pdf
RANGERPRO.MSDS.pdf
20110228160836915.pdf
20110228160821816.pdf
20110228160803757.pdf
|120110228160737284.pdf

Buyer
Comments:

Solicitation: BB20111|

A temporary Excel format document has been written. Click here fo access it.

" Line Item View |

B Back| |

“Top Of Page |

© 1996-2011 SicomimNet, Inc. All Rights Reserved.
- agency_buyer_AbstractL.S Machine: prodappvéa IP: 67.52.252,218 -
Agency [D: AOD000000004 Dept ID: AGENCY User ID: tgroat

Tue, 01 Mar 2011

https://basec.sicomm.net/buyer/agency_buyer_AbstractL'S.html?responses=1 &isAContra... 03/01/2011




RECAP FOR ELECTRONIC SOLICITATION
BB20111 PARK OPERATIONS CHEMICALS

HELENA CWC
- GRASS | CHEMICAL, | SUPREME CHEMICALS, | RED RIVER,
PAD, SHAWNEE, TUREF, ALLIGARE, | REINDERS, | Cloverdale, Shreveport,
Olathe, KS KS Olathe, KS | Opelika, AL | Olathe, KS VA LA
UNIT
NO DESCRIPTION PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE| UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
1|Razor Pro 30.50| 23.75 33.80 25.38 29.50 32.15 11.75
2|Super Trimec 155.90 156.90 157.00 No Bid 138.89 163.15|. No Bid
3|Timec Plus 94.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 106.20 No Bid
4|Garlan 4 137.00 220.00 No Bid 110.88 233.32 230.00 52.00
5|Glyphosate-Aquatic 38.25 33.75 55.00 32.45 36.34 44 .30 36.25
6|Delta Guard No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 47.44 No Bid No Bid
7|Dimension 489.00 443.00 560.00 No Bid 398.79 584.20 No Bid
8|Merit 75wp 92.00 72.10 76.25 No Bid 16.99 119.60 8.00
9|Tempo2 No Bid 33.90 35.50 No Bid 2514 No Bid No Bid
10{Cutrine Plus No Bid 19.81 25.00 No Bid 18.64 32.50 No Bid
11|Hyvar XL No Bid 77.34 No Bid No Bid 83.38 75.80 73.50
12|Mach Il No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 880.00 No Bid No Bid
13[Navigate No Bid No Bid 160.00 No Bid 138.05 163.56 No Bid
14|Remedy 124.75 No Bid No Bid 44.35 99.98 No Bid 64.00
15|Seven 4L No Bid 101.45 101.00 No Bid 61.60 93.57 No Bid
16 |Aqauthol K No Bid 157.00 190.00 No Bid 161.74 No Bid No Bid
17|24d Ester 44.75 50.00 No Bid No Bid 41.25 53.30 No Bid
18|Pathfinder Il 87.25 111.10 No Bid No Bid 112.10 100.00 95.00
19 Pathway No Bid 85.55 No Bid No Bid 86.32 77.00 70.00
20|Induce-Aqautic Sticker 28.00 20.00 20.25 7.90 44 85 No Bid 8.90
21 |Dismiss No Bid 55.73 No Bid No Bid 55.27| 160.90 No Bid
22|Sedge Hammer 74.79 83.00 750.00 No Bid 787.37 897.60 650.00
23|Snapshot 73.00 81.50 91.00 No Bid 72.20 99.00 85.00
24 (Treflan 5g 29.95 No Bid 23.00 No Bid 24.98 No Bid No Bid
25|Baracade 4FL No-Bid 140.00 135.00 No Bid 140.00 147.70 No Bid
26|Trimec Granular 13.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 |Embark Growth Regulator 49.75 43.75 49.00 No Bid 41.12 295.58 No Bid
28 |Field Marking Chalk, Plus Five Chalk 464 4.79 4.75 No Bid 4.39 No Bid No Bid
32-0-8 Catains 5% Nitrogen from .
29 |Nutrisphere - n - slow release 14.90 No Bid 18.00 No Bid 15.45 No Bid No Bid
21-0-10 Plus 0.25% Dimension which
30|contains nutrisphere - n - slow release 22.90 18.70 25.50 No Bid 21.21 No Bid No Bid
18-0-4 Barracade which contains
31|nutrisphere - n - slow release 14.80 16.20 18.75| - No Bid 17.09 No Bid No Bid

Page 1 of 2




RECAP FOR ELECTRONIC SOLICITATION
BB20111 PARK OPERATIONS CHEMICALS

HELENA CwC
GRASS | CHEMICAL, | SUPREME CHEMICALS, | RED RIVER,
_PAD, SHAWNEE, TURF, ALLIGARE, | REINDERS, | Cloverdale, Shreveport,
Olathe, KS KS Olathe, KS | Opelika, AL | Olathe, KS VA LA
UNIT
NO DESCRIPTION PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE| UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
21-14-7 contains nutrisphere - n - and
32|AVAIL / slow release No Bid No Bid 19.00 No Bid 16.98 No Bid No Bid
21-0-4 Plus 0.2% merit and contains
33 |nutrisphere slow release 22.90 18.65 22.90 No Bid 20.44 No Bid No Bid
34 |Heritage Fungicide 31.90 45.00 48.00 No Bid 44 .98 1,854.00 No Bid
35|Prophesy 0.72G No Bid No Bid 72.00 No Bid 39.99 No Bid No Bid
36|SureGuard No Bid 123.43 No Bid No Bid 124.89 144.00 No Bid
37|Cross Check No Bid 46.00 No Bid No Bid 17.69 No Bid 28.00

Page 2 of 2
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Teddy Ballard

From: JamesD. Ingram
Sent:  Thursday, March 24, 2011 10:58 AM
To: Teddy Ballard

Subject: BB20111 Park Operations Chemicals RLA Backup‘information :

Teddy, .
Regarding Bid BB20111 Park Operations Chemicals RLA

Not all alternates proposed by bidders have the same chemical content as items specified. The lowest and best
bid for each item is recommended for award by the Parks Department. ...... JD 03/24/11

03/24/2011




Teddy Ballard

From: Thomas J. Wyrsch

Sent: Friday, April 01, 2011 9:29 AM
To: Teddy Ballard

Subject: RE: compliance status request

Supreme Turf--already in compliance.
Helena Chemical Company——w1ll update and they will be in compllance
Grass Pad--already in compllance

Reinders, Inc.--already in compliance.
Red River Specialties, Inc.--will add data and they will be in compliance.

Thanks.

————— Original Message-----

From: Teddy Ballard

Sent: Thursday, March 31, 2011 1:44 PM
To: Thomas J. Wyrsch

Subject: compliance status request

Tom,
Please send compliance status for the following vendors:

Supreme Turf Products, Five Cassens Court, Fenton, MO 643026 Helena Chemical Company, 8215
Hedge Lane Terrace, Shawnee, KS 66227 Grass Pad, 425 North Rawhide, Olathe, KS 66061
Reinders Inc., 13400 Watertown Plank Road, Elm Grove, WI 53122 Red River Spec1alt1es Inc,

7545 Haygood Road Shreveport, LA 71107

Attached are completed reports for all vendors if anyone needs to be updated.
Note: Red River Specialties is a new vendor.
Thank you.

Teddy
Ext 13465




