Request for Legislative Action Res. #20936

Sponsor: Tony Miller
Date: April 25, 2022

Completed by County Counselor’s Office

Action Requested: | Resolution Res.Ord No.: 20936

Sponsor(s): Tony Miller Legislature Meeting Date: 4/25/2022

Introduction

Action Items: ['Award']

Project/Title:

Awarding a contract for the purchase of a Bookeye Color Scanner for the Recorder of Deeds to Image
Access of Boca Raton, FL in the amount of $33,316 under the terms and conditions of Request for
Proposal No. 21-22

Request Summary

The Recorder of Deeds needs to replace their aging Scanner that is beyond reasonable repair. The
Purchasing Department issued Request for Proposal No. 21-22 to meet those requirements.

Out of 139 notifications distributed, 5 responses (1 of which was a “No Bid”) were received; please
see the attached Submission Report and the Bid List for the respondents and pricing.

Pursuant to Section 1054.6 of the Jackson County Code, the Recorder of Deeds and the Purchasing
Department recommend award to Image Access of Boca Raton, Florida as the lowest and best bid
received.

Contact Information

Department: Recorder of Deeds Submitted Date: | 4/8/2022

Name: Amber Anderson Email: AAnderson@jacksongov.org
Title: Recorder of Deeds Supervisor | Phone: 816-881-4482

Budget Information

Amount authorized by this legislation this fiscal year: $33,316
Amount previously authorized this fiscal year: SO
Total amount authorized after this legislative action: $33,316
Is it transferring fund? No

Single Source Funding:

Fund: Department: Line Item Account: Amount:

042 (Recorder's 1801 (Records) 58172 (Printers & $33,316
Technology Fund) Scanners)
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Request for Legislative Action

Prior Legislation

Prior Ordinances

Ordinance: Ordinance date:

Prior Resolution

Resolution: Resolution date:
Purchasing

Does this RLA include the purchase or lease of Yes

supplies, materials, equipment or services?

Chapter 10 Justification: Formal Bid

Core 4 Tax Clearance Completed: Not Applicable
Certificate of Foreign Corporation Received: Yes

Have all required attachments been included in Yes

this RLA?

Compliance

Certificate of Compliance

In Compliance

Minority, Women and Veteran Owned Business Program

Goals Not Applicable for following reason: Less than $50000

MBE: .00%
WBE: .00%
VBE: .00%

Prevailing Wage

Not Applicable

Fiscal Information

o There is a balance otherwise unencumbered to the credit of the appropriation to which the

expenditure is chargeable and there is a cash balance otherwise unencumbered.
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Request for Legislative Action

History

Amber Anderson at 4/8/2022 12:13:58 PM - [Submitted | ]

Department Director: Diana M. Smith at 4/19/2022 2:29:17 PM - [ Approved | ]

Finance (Purchasing): Barbara J. Casamento at 4/19/2022 3:04:18 PM - [ Approved | ]
Compliance: Katie M. Bartle at 4/19/2022 4:28:01 PM - [ Approved | ]

Finance (Budget): Mark Lang at 4/19/2022 4:42:56 PM - [ Approved | ]

Executive: Sylvya Stevenson at 4/19/2022 7:29:59 PM - [ Approved | ]Legal: Elizabeth Freeland at
4/21/2022 10:36:40 AM - Approved.

April 21, 2022 eRLA #471 Page 3 of 3




Fiscal Note:

This expenditure was included in the Annual Budget.

PC#

Date:  April 11, 2022

Org Code/Description

180122001 000

RES #
eRLAID #:

Object Code/Description

20936

471

Not to Exceed

042 Recorder's Technology Fund

1801  Records 58172 Printers & Scanners $ 33,316
$ 33,316

APPROVED

By Mark Lang at 2:21 pm, Apr 11, 2022

Budget Office
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mlang
Approved


Submissions

Supplier

Image Access, Inc.

Analogue Imaging LLC

The Crowley Company

Universal Adaptive
Consulting Services

Mvation Worldwide Inc

Date Submitted

Mar 22, 2022 8:36 AM
CcOT

Mar 26, 2022 12:28 PM
CDT

Mar 28, 2022 10:49 AM
CDT

Mar 29, 2022 10:39 AM
CDT

Mar 29, 2022 11:50 AM
CDT

Name

Elaine Wotton

Jill Baldwin

Matt McCabe

Kim Talbert

Barry Weinstein

Email

elaine.wotton@imageaccess.com

jbaldwin@analogueimaging.com

bids@thecrowleycompany.com

sales@uacsi.com

biddesk@mvation.com

Confirmation Code

MTk4Njc3

MTk5Njg0

MTK5Nzk3

MjAwMDcx

MjAWMTEy



|Analogue Imaging LLC.  Image Access, Inc.

‘Mvation Worldwide In( The Crowley Company;al Adaptive Consulting

Total Cost $ 40,950.0 $33,316.0 $ 50,000.06 h $ 38,340.0 S0
Selected # 0 0 0 0
Selected ($) S0 $0 $0

QuantityRec UnitPrice TotalCost | UnitPrice TotalCost ' UnjtPrice TotalCost = UnitPrice TotalCost | UnitPrice TotalC

Bookeye 4 $0 $31,005.0 1 1$34,850.0 $34,850.0 NoBid  |'$44,555.6¢$ 44,555.6 > $31,005.0 $31,005.0 |NoBid  No Bid
#0-2 FALSE  Shipping& $0 $0 1 $700 $700 $0 $0° ' NoBid NoBid 1/$1,300.0 $1,300.0 |INoBid  NoBid
#0-3 FALSE 1yearof m$0 $3,135.0 1 1$3,4000 $3,400.0 1$4,547.0 $4547.0 | $3,135.0 $3,1350 NoBid NoBid
#0-4 FALSE  Onsite delir$ 0 $2,000.0 1 __ $2,0000 $2,0000 $2,200.0 $2,200.0 NoBid  No Bid
#0-5 FALSE  Alternate B$ 0 $26,569.0 1 'NoBid  NoBid |$26,569.0 $26,569.0 No Bid 'NoBid  No Bid

N



ACKNOWLEDGMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA

The undersigned acknowledges receipt of Addenda through and including numbers and that this Bid is submitted
in accordance with information, instructions, and stipulations set forth therein.

o oo 3(18 (22

Signature of Respondent Date

Tmagqe AULSS, Tine

Company Name

542 NIW TT7H Clvaet

Address

Boca Rodon  Flovida 33487 56(- 990 - 2953

City, State, and Zip Phone




AFFIDAVIT

STATEOF _FLORIDA )
) SS
COUNTY OF PALM BEACH )

P ATAICI A &00D SPEE D of the city of DolA BATOR

County ofPP(UV\ BEACH State of FRLoRID A being duly sworn on her or his oath, deposes and says;

I

ThatTamthe VP OPERATIONS (Title of Affiant) of | MAEGE ACLCESS, INC . (Name of Bidder)
and have been authorized by said Bidder to make this Affidavit upon my best information and belief, after reasonable inquiry
as to the representations herein.

No Officer, Agent or Employee of Jackson County, Missouri is financially interested directly or indirectly what Bidder is
offering to sell to the County pursuant to this Invitation (though no representation is made regarding potential ownership of
publicly traded stock of bidder).

If Bidder were awarded any contract, job, work or service for Jackson County, Missouri, no Officer, Agent or Employee of the
County would be interested in or receive any benefit from the profit or emolument of such.

Either Bidder is duly listed and assessed on the tax rolls of Jackson County, Missouri and is not delinquent in the payment of
any taxes due to the County or Bidder did not have on December 31, 2021, any property subject to taxation by the County and
if bidder is duly listed and assessed on the tax rolls of Jackson County, Missouri, bidder agrees to permit an audit of its records,
if requested by the Jackson County Director of Assessment, as they relate to the assessment of Business Personal Property.

Bidder has not participated in collusion or committed any act in restraint of trade, directly or indirectly, which bears upon
anyone's response or lack of response to the Invitation.

Bidder certifies and warrants that Bidder or Bidder's firm/organization is not listed on the General Services Administration's
Report of Debarred and/or Suspended Parties.

Bidder certifies and affirms its enrollment and participation in a federal work authorization program with respect to the
employees working in connection with the contracted services.

Bidder certifies and affirms that it does not knowingly employ any person who is an unauthorized alien in connection with the
contracted services.

IMAGE ACC.F/S S, INC . (Name of Bidder)

(Signature of Afhant)
VP OPERATIONS (Title of Affiant)

Subscribed and sworn to before me l:his\.g'“‘L day of M owtAn ,20_ O

NOTARY PUBLIC in and for the County of P‘Pavlw\ W (SEA] Commission Sxpires 11-14-2025

State of

7l e N ot

Elaine Wotton
Commissicn = mn 157519

Bonded Throug~ - Zynanctary
Florida - Notary Public

L e o o ]

HAovida

My Commission Expires: I /“{— / 25




BIDDER'S EXCEPTIONS
TO
SPECIFICATIONS/SCOPE OF SERVICES
OF
JACKSON COUNTY, MISSOURI INVITATION TO BID/REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL/REQUEST FOR QUALIFICATIONS NO.
21-22

Respondent's attention is directed to Paragraph 4 of the General Conditions of this Invitation to Bid/Request for Proposal or
Qualifications. READ THIS PARAGRAPH CAREFULLY. _~

The following exceptions to the Specifications of Invitation to Bid/Request for Proposal/Request for Qualifications No. 21-22 are
requested by the undersigned Respondent: (Use additional pages as necessary.)

REFERENCE
PARA # & PAGE # EXCEPTION REQUESTED 1@/

Name of Firm: | MMZ/ AWI [ Iy\&
Signature of Bidder: % Al Wotteom




1.0

2.0

3.0

Jackson County, Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 21-22
Page 1 of 3

INTRODUCTION

Jackson County, Missouri is seeking bids for the purchase of One (1) Bookeye Scanner
The terms of this contract will be a one-time purchase.
Jackson County reserves the right to waive any defect in the offer of any bidder and to reject any and all offers.

Jackson County, Missouri reserves the right to request clarifications on any bid.

AWARD REQUIREMENTS

2:1

2:2

INSURANCE AND IDEMNIFICATION: The Successful Bidder shall indemnify, defend, and save harmless the
County against all damages to person and property which may arise out of the work included in the performance of
this contract, including all claims for personal injuries and property damage and all losses, costs, and attorney’s fees
or judgments which may arise out of any claims against the County. The Successful Bidder shall purchase and
maintain as a minimum such insurance as described in Exhibit A of this Invitation to Bid. Successful Bidder shall
file with the County such a Certificate of Insurance as described in Exhibit A and within the time frame specified in
Exhibit A.

W-9 FORM: The Successful Bidder must provide a complete IRS W-9 Form for this contract.

SPECIFICATIONS

3.1

Bookeye 4 V1A Color 600 dpi Scanner, Neck, Monitor and Foot Pedal
3.1.1 25"X33.5” (635 x 850 mm) scan bed (8% > than DIN Al)
3.1.2  Maximum book thickness 200mm

3.1.3  High-res. CCD image sensors.

3.1.4  Auto Focus 150mm

3.1.5  Dynamic focusing with exclusive center of lens light path
3.1.6 100 - 600 DPI resolution

3.1.7  36/24-bit Color with ICC Color Profiling Test Targets

3.1.8 12/8-bit grayscale, bitonal, enhanced half tone

3.1.9  Two motorized light bars with high illumination LED lighting « Soft non-metallic surface for delicate
original materials

3.1.10 Integrated motor-driven book cradle with 4” vertical motion « Interface: Scan2Net - 1000-megabit TPC/IP
3.1.11 1400 book and flat mode with glass plate and foot pedal
3.1.12 Laser Check book curve correction, content location, deskew, page splitting, rotation, despeskle

3.1.13 Formats:

3.1.13.1 TIFF uncompressed

3:1.13.2 TIFF G4

3.1.133 TIFF Multipage

3.1.134 JPG

3.1.135 Jp2

3.1.13.6 PDF

3.1.13.7 PDF/A

3.1.13.8 PDF Searchable (ABBYY OCR)
3.1.13.9 BMP



4.0

5.0

6.0

3:2

33

34

33

Jackson County, Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 21-22

Page 2 of 3
3.1.13.10 PNM
3.1.13.11 PNG
3.1.13.12 PCX
3.1.13.13 IBG

3.1.14 2.1 sec/300 DPI Al Color scan speed (4.1 sec/600 DPI Al)
3.1.14.1 No infrared or ultraviolet emissions

3.1.15 Interface Scan2Net® 1 Gbit Fast Ethernet TCP/IP

3.1.16 Dimensions: 43.3 x 34.6 x 33.7 inches; Weight: 170 Ibs.
3.1.17 Telescopic rail system with 2-D adjustment of book cradles
Shipping & handling, and remote support (via WebEx)

| year of maintenance

Onsite delivery and training.

An alternate bid of a used or floor model device may be substituted or included in addition to the above bid.

REQUIRED SUBMITTALS AND SUBMISSION CRITERIA

4.1 The following information MUST BE submitted with your response to this Invitation to Bid:
4.1.1  Contractor’s Signature Portion
4.1.2  Affidavit
4.1.3  Certificate of Compliance
4.1.4  Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda
4.1.5  Pricing Sheet
4.1.6  Exhibit F, Bidder’s Exceptions

4.2 Submission of Bids: Bids must be submitted online through the Bonfire Portal at http://jacksongov.bonfirehub.com.
Submissions by any other method will not be accepted.

EVALUATION PROCESS

5.1 All bids received that are responsive to the General Conditions, Specifications, and other provisions of this
Invitation to Bid will be evaluated.

5.2 An Evaluation Committee, made up of Jackson County personnel, while evaluate all responses and make
recommendations. Jackson County, Missouri shall be the sole judge of the proposals submitted for this Invitation to
Bid and its decision shall be final.

QUESTIONS

6.1 All questions regarding this Invitation to Bid shall be communicated electronically through the Bonfire Portal via
the Opportunity Q&A on the Invitation to Bid. All questions must be received on the Bonfire Portal by 5:00pm
CDT/CST on March 18, 2022.

6.2 All questions will be answered via Addenda/Amendment to the Invitation to Bid on the Bonfire Portal.

6.3 Respondents and their agents (including subcontractors, employees, consultants, or anyone else acting on their
behalf) must follow this procedure. Respondents or their agents MAY NOT contact any other County employees
regarding the matters covered by this Invitation to Bid during the solicitation and evaluation process. Inappropriate
contact are grounds for REJECTION of the Respondent’s submission.

6.4 System Support for Bidders/Respondents: Click on “Technical Support” in the Procurement Portal.



Jackson County, Missouri Invitation to Bid No. 21-22
Page 3 of 3

7.0 POST AWARD INFORMATION

7.1 Award information, when available, will be publicly posted in the Bonfire Portal.

8.0 QUOTATION

No. Description Quantity Unit Quote Total Quote
Bookeye 4 V1A Color 600 dpi Scanner, 1
1. Neck, Monitor and Foot Pedal $ $
2. Shipping & handling, and remote support $ $
(via WebEx) ’6/ ’Q/
& 1 year of maintenance $ $ —
4,547 4, S47
4. Onsite delivery and training. $ 2, 200 $ ZI 200
5; Alternate Bid (Used or Floor Model) 1 $ 20, Sk q $ 2 ; Sb q
Company:

Image Aceess, Inc

Name:

cloine Wotton

Title:

Digitizahen Speciolist

Signature: 6( & W—

Phone Number: 5| — P8 bL —297373

Ell Elowne - WotHon—ma Imaﬂg,Awéés- con




A CONTRACT for Furnishing Bock Scanner for the Records Department.

A Contract between Jackson County Missouri ("County") and the undersigned ("Contracter"), collectively referred
to as the "parties". The term "cffer" as used herein refers to Contractor's offer made in response to this Bid
Number. The parties agree as follows in consideration of the mutual covenants contained herein.

This Contract shall be binding when it is signed by the County's Purchasing Officer and/or Accounting Officer as
required by SEC. 50.660 RSMo., and shall run from such date until all parties are satisfied unless it is sooner
terminated as provided elsewhere herein.

This Contract consists of: (1) Contractor's offer, including those papers which Contractor submitted with or
expressly incorporated in its offer as a part therecf, to the extent the terms of such papers were expressly or
impliedly accepted by the County, or were modified in writing with the express or implied consent of the parties;
(2) written modification to this Contract signed by the County's Purchasing Cfficer and consented to expressly or
impliedly by Contractor. This Contract represents the entire agreement between the parties in regard to this Bid
Number. All modifications to this Contract must be in writing signed by the County's Purchasing Officer.

The laws of the State of Missouri and Jackson County, Missouri govern this Contract. This Contract shall be
binding upon and to the benefit of the successor and assignees of the parties. The Contractor shall not assign
this Contract or any monies payable hereunder without the prior written consent of the County. Contractor is an
independent contractor of the County and shall indemnify the County fer loss, damage, or liability which the
County incurs to the extent that such results proximately from the negligence or vielation of Contractor or its
employees, agents, or subcontractors.

In regard to any goods which are included in the sale hereunder, Contractor makes to the County the warranties
provided in Article Two of the Uniform Commercial Code of the State of Missouri to the extent that they apply by
the terms thereof.

The County gives each of its employees an employee identification card having thereon a photograph of the employee.
The County will not pay for any goods and/or services delivered by Contractor to any persons who did not present
to Contractor at the time of delivery their County Identification Cards and who were not in fact authorized to
receive delivery.

The County will pay to Contractor the applicable pricing quoted by Contractor in its offer for any goods and/or
services whose purchase was ordered by the County's Purchasing Officer in consequence of the County's acceptance
of Contractor's offer. The County will make good faith effort to make payment within thirty (30) days after the
latest of: (1) the date of proper delivery to the County; (2) the date of acceptance by the County; (3) the date
when the receiving department has received from the Contractor a correct and complete invoice showing the pertinent
County Purchase Order Number (s). Payment may be withheld by the County to protect itself from actual or potential
loss which has resulted or may result from the Contractor's non-performance of any of its duties required hereunder.

Contractor warrants that no officer or employee of the County, whether elected or appointed, shall in any manner
whatsoever be interested in or receive any benefit from the profits or emoluments of this contract.

If the County awarded this Contract, would the Contractor sell under the prices and terms of this Contract to any
Municipal, County, Public Utility, Hospital, or Educational Institution having membership in the Mid-America
Council of Public Purchasing and located within the greater Kansas City Metropolitan Trade Area? (All deliveries
are to be F.0.B. Destination and there shall be no obligation on the part of any member of such Council to utilize
this Contract).

(Check one) Yes v No Initials . Minimum order, if applicable$ .

ALL PAGES OF THIS INVITATION TO BID ARE EXPRESSLY MADE A PART OF THIS CONTRACT. The format of this Contract has
been approved by the County Counselor’s Office. Signature of vendor as indicated below MUST BE COMPLETED before
contract can be awarded:

CONTRACTOR'S NAME: Jmﬁe A%;! :C;/\,Ca proNE No: Dl (-28b- Zﬁ o0
aopress: U 3 N ‘7'-11”‘ g+,BO%Mﬂfﬁg3%?7 FAX NO: S'bl—q’.i(-'mtab
NAME OF AUTHORIZED AGENT (print or type): El@dne WoFton DATE: 2 l\g\ 27

SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED AGENT: QLQM\_L WQ‘{'W rrrre: DGt 2ehon §pcc;m3‘f‘
EMAIL ADDRESS OF AUTHORIZED AGENT: L {a rne- WotHon & lmage Access - Conn

FEDERAL 1D NO: _ & O43 iﬂtlﬁ and/or SOCIAL SECURITY NO:

CHECK IF APPLICABLE: DISADVANTAGED BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (DBE): MINORITY BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (MBE):

WOMAN OWNED (WBE) :
k ok k k k ok k Kk Kk Kk *k * *x k Kk k Kk Kk k k k Kk Kk k Kk k *k k k k k k *k Kk Kk Kk Kk kK k k k k *k *k * *k k k ¥ k *k * *k * *x *

JACKSON COUNTY MISSOURI BY BOB CRUTSINGER, DIRECTOR OF FINANCE AND PURCHASING

SIGNATURE OF BOB CRUTSINGER: ) DATE:




GENERAL CONDITIONS W

The General Conditions which follow apply to and are a part of this Invitation to Bid unless otherwise specified herein. Subject to State
and County laws and all rules, regulations and limitations imposed by legislation of the Federal Government, bids on all advertisements,
and invitations issued by the Jackson County Purchasing Department will bind bidders to applicable conditions and requirements herein
set forth unless otherwise specified in the Invitation to Bid. Bidders or their authorized representatives are expected to fully inform
themselves as to the conditions, requirements, and specifications before submitting bids; failure to do so will be at the bidder's own risk
and he cannot secure relief on the plea of error.

1. Withdrawal of Response to Bid: A written request for the withdrawal of a bid or any part thereof may be granted if the request is
received in the Office of the Director of Purchasing prior to the response deadline.

2. Completeness: All information required by the Invitation to Bid must be supplied to constitute a proper bid. Bidders shall not alter
the Invitation to Bid documents except upon instruction by receipt of addendum. Bidders shall furnish information required by the bid
in the form requested. The County reserves the right to reject bids with incomplete information or which are presented in a form other
than that requested in this Invitation to Bid. Bids must be submitted on-line through the Bonfire Portal at
https://jacksoncounty.bonfire.com . Submissions by any other method will not be accepted

3. Bids Binding For 90 Days: Unless otherwise specified all bids submitted shall be binding for ninety (90) calendar days following
the response deadline, unless the Respondent(s), upon request of the Director of Finance and Purchasing, agrees to an extension.

4. Exceptions: Conditional or qualified bids are subject to rejection in whole or in part. All exceptions to the specifications of this
Invitation to Bid must be made in writing and attached as Exhibit F to the bid when it is submitted by the Respondent. The County will
consider minor exceptions to its specifications. A minor exception is one which is a matter of form, not substance. The minor exception
is considered immaterial and inconsequential when its significance to price, quantity, quality, or delivery is trivial or negligible when
contrasted with total scope of the Invitation to Bid (ex: comparable manufacturer or alternate bids where allowed by the Invitation to
Bid). The County will not consider exceptions to its General Conditions, Forms, or Insurance Requirements. The County reserves the
right in its sole discretion to accept or reject any exceptions included in Exhibit F. Exceptions made in any other manner or form whether
by omission or by inclusion in any other manner other than as specifically entered and described in full on Exhibit F shall not be made
a part of the resulting contract. Exceptions which are made by the Respondent and entered on Exhibit F and determined to be acceptable
to the County shall be made a part of the resulting contract by inclusion as a provision of a mutually executed Amendment to the contract.
Exceptions which are not made a part of said Amendment shall not be included in the contract nor be binding upon the County and the
specifications of the Invitation to Bid shall prevail.

5. Questions Regarding Specifications, Forms or General Conditions: Any information relative to the interpretation of Specifications,
Forms or General Conditions shall be communicated electronically through the Bonfire Portal via the Opportunity Q & A on the bid.
All Questions must be received on the Bonfire Portal by 5:00 PM CST/CDT on March 18th, 2022. Questions will be answered via
Addenda/Amendments to the Invitation to Bid on the Bonfire Portal. Oral answers will not be binding on the County.

6. Multiple Bids: No Respondent will be allowed to offer more than one price on each item requested even though he may feel that he
has two or more types or styles that will meet specifications. IF SAID BIDDER SHOULD SUBMIT MORE THAN ONE Bid ON ANY
ITEM REQUESTED, ALL BIDS FOR THAT ITEM MAY BE REJECTED AT THE DISCRETION OF THE DIRECTOR OF
PURCHASING.

7. The County reserves the right to split the award of the bid, reject any or parts of bids, to waive technical defects in bids, consider
administrative costs and to sclect the bid(s) deemed most advantageous to the County. The County shall consider bids submitted on an
"all or nothing™ basis only if the bid is clearly designated as such by the bidder affixing the words "ALL OR NOTHING" on the quotation
portion of the Invitation to Bid.

8. Applicable State Law: The contract shall be construed according to the laws of the State of Missouri. The Contractor must be
registered and maintain good standing with the Secretary of State, of the State of Missouri and other regulatory agencies as may be
required by law or regulation.



9. Communications and Notices: Any notice to the Contractor shall be deemed sufficient when deposited in the United States Mail
postage prepaid; faxed; e-mailed; delivered to a telegraph office fee prepaid; or hand-carried and presented to an authorized employee

of the Contractor at the Contractor’s address as listed on the signature page of the contract or at such address as the contractor may have
requested in writing.

10. Bankruptcy or Insolvency: Upon filing for any bankruptcy or insolvency proceedings by or against the Contractor, whether
voluntary or involuntary, or upon the appointment of a receiver, trustee, or assignee for the benefit of creditors, the Contractor must
notify Jackson County’s Director of Finance and Purchasing immediately in writing. Upon learning of the actions herein identified,
Jackson County reserves the right at its sole discretion to either affirm the contract or cancel the contract and hold the Contractor
responsible for damages.

11. Patents: Contractor agrees to defend, indemnify, protect, and save harmless, Jackson County, Missouri, against all claims for
royalties for patents or suit for infringement thereon which may be involved in the manufacture or use of the material to be furnished.

12. By virtue of statutory authority, the Director of Finance and Purchasing shall give preference to all commodities manufactured,
mined, produced, or grown within the State of Missouri and to all firms, corporations or individuals doing business as Missouri firms,
corporations, or individuals, when quality is equal or better and delivered price is same or less.

13. Material Standards: All material or equipment furnished shall meet the minimum requirements of the Occupational Safety & Health
Standard (OSHA) published in the Federal Register.

14. Tax Clearance Required: No person, firm or corporation, resident in Jackson County, or otherwise legally within the. taxing
jurisdiction of the County, shall be eligible to provide any goods, contractual services or anything covered by the County Purchasing
Ordinance, unless said person, firm or corporation is duly listed and assessed on the County tax rolls, and is in no way delinquent on
any taxes payable to the County. Further, no person, firm, or corporation, regardless of state of residency, shall be eligible to provide
any goods, contractual services, or anything covered by this chapter, of a cost in excess of $150,000 per annum, if that person, firm or
corporation is in any way delinquent on any taxes payable to any local government entity with which Jackson County has entered into
an “Intergovernmental Agreement for Tax Verification Information”.

Where any individual, firm or corporation is a resident of Jackson County, or it otherwise appears that such firm is legally within the
taxing jurisdiction of the County, and has made an offer, bid, or quotation for any County purchase, or has submitted an application to
be given an opportunity to make quotations for County purchases, the Director of Purchasing shall cause a search to be made of the
County tax rolls, and, if applicable, an inquiry to be made of the appropriate personnel of any other local government entity with which
Jackson County has entered into an “Intergovernmental Agreement for Tax Verification Information”, to determine the eligibility of
that person, firm or corporation under this section.

When the lowest/highest responsible bidder for a given Purchase Order or Contract is ineligible under this section, the Director of
Finance and Purchasing may, where time is not of the essence to the County, notify the bidder and allow three (3) days for the bidder to
correct the deficiency or pay up any delinquency involved. If the bidder fails, after such notice, to comply within three (3) days, or if
the Director of Finance and Purchasing deems time to be of the essence, he shall proceed as though the next lowest/highest responsible
bidder who is eligible under this section had entered the lowest/highest bid.

15. Insurance and Indemnification: The Successful Contractor shall defend, indemnify, and hold harmless Jackson County and any of
its agencies, officials, officers, or employees from and against all claims, damages, liability, losses, costs and expenses, including
reasonable attorney’s fees, arising out of or resulting from any acts or omissions in connection with the operations or work included or
undertaken in the performance of this contract, caused in whole or in part by Contractor, its employees, agents, or subcontractors, or
caused by others for whom Contractor is liable. Contractor’s obligations under this section with respect to indemnification for acts or
omissions shall be limited to the coverage and limits of insurance that Contractor is required to procure and maintain under this Contract.
Insurance shall be procured and maintained by Contractor as described in Exhibit A of this Invitation to Bid. Contractor shall file
Certificates of Insurance with Jackson County Purchasing Department in the form described in Exhibit A within the time limit also
described in the Exhibit.

16. The County is not responsible for articles or services furnished without a Purchase Order.

17. Inspection and Acceptance: Inspection and acceptance will be at destination. Prior to the time of delivery and acceptance by the
County, or after any rejection, risk or loss shall be the responsibility of the Contractor unless loss results from negligence of the County.



18. Equal Opportunity: The Contractor shall maintain policies of employment as follows: //W

a) The Contractor and the Contractor's Subcontractor(s) shall not discriminate against any employee or applicant for
employment because of race, religion, color, sex, disability, or national origin. The Contractor shall take affirmative action to ensure
that applicants are employed, and that employees are treated during employment without regard to their race, religion, color, sex,
disability, or national origin. Such action shall include, but not be limited to, the following: employment, upgrading, demotion or
transfer; recruitment or recruitment advertising; layoll or termination; rates of pay or other forms of compensation; and selection for
training, including apprenticeship. The Contractor agrees to post in conspicuous places, available to employees and applicants for
employment, notices setting forth the policies of non-discrimination.

b) The Contractor and the Contractor's Subcontractor(s) shall, in all solicitations or advertisements for employees placed by
them or on their behalf, state that all qualified applicants will receive consideration for employment without regard to race religion,
color, sex or national origin.

19. Foreign Corporations: Firms submitting bids as corporations which are not incorporated in the State of Missouri must include with
their bid a copy of a properly executed Certificate of Registration for Foreign Corporation authorizing the firm to do business in the
State of Missouri.

20. Errors in Bids: Respondent shall be bound by its bid even though the bid is based on an erroneous calculation, and Respondent
shall have no right to withdraw its bid after the Response Deadline on the basis of an error in calculation of its bid. Carelessness in
quoting prices, or in preparation of bid, will not relieve the Respondent in case of errors. Erasures or changes in bids must be initialed.

21. Omission in Bids: Omission in the bid of any provision herein prescribed shall not be construed as to relieve the contractor of any
responsibility or obligation requisite to the complete and satisfactory operation of any and all equipment and services. Any exception
to the bid must be in writing and not by omission.

22. No lowest/highest Respondent shall receive a business expectancy merely because his bid is the lowest/highest one received; until
the contract has been awarded, no business expectancy exists.

23. Conflict of Interest: Respondent warrants that no officer or employee of the County, whether elected or appointed, shall in any
manner whatsoever is interested in or receive any benefit from the profits or emoluments of this contract.

No official or employee of Jackson County or its governing body and no other public official in Jackson County who exercises any
functions or responsibilities in the review or approval of the undertaking or carrying out of the project covered by this contract shall
voluntarily acquire any personal interest, directly or indirectly, in this contract.

The Contractor covenants that he/she presently has no interest and shall not acquire any interest, directly or indirectly, which would
conflict in any manner or degree with the performance of the services hereunder. The Contractor further covenants that no person
having any such known interest shall be employed or conveyed an interest, directly or indirectly, in this contract.

24. It shall be the responsibility of all Respondents to warrant that all goods, services and/or work to be procured and/or performed
under this contract shall conform to and/or be performed in compliance with all applicable Federal, State and Local Statutes, Ordinance
and Codes including but not limited to the American with Disabilities Act of 1990. Failure to comply in any manner with applicable
Statues, Ordinances or Codes shall result in said Contractor replacing the goods, services and/or work performed in order to effect
compliance or in liquidated damages in the amount required to effect compliance with said Statues, Ordinance and Codes together with
any costs associated with collection of said damages.

25. Bidder certifies that all goods to be supplied to the County as a result of contracts awarded under this Invitation to Bid were produced
in compliance with all applicable requirements of sections 6, 7, and 12 of the Fair Labor Standards Act, as amended, and of regulations
and orders of the United States Department of Labor issued under section 14 thereof.

26. Fund Allocation: Continuance of any resulting agreement, contract, or issuance of purchase orders after December 31 of the current
calendar year is contingent upon the allocation of County funds for the next proceeding calendar year.
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27. Qualifications of Bidders: The County may make such reasonable investigations as deemed proper and necessary to determine the
ability of the bidder to perform the work and the bidder shall furnish to the County all such information and data for this purpose, as
may be requested. The County reserves the right to inspect bidder's physical plant prior to award to satisfy questions regarding the
bidder's capabilities. The County further reserves the right to reject any bid if the evidence submitted by or investigations of such bidder
fails to satisfy the County that such bidder is properly qualified to carry out the obligations of the contract and to complete the work
contemplated herein.

28. Except for the furnishing and transportation of materials, the Contractor shall not sublet, sell, transfer, assign, or otherwise dispose
of any portion of this contract to any individual, firm, or corporation without written consent of Jackson County. This consent of the
County will not be given unless, and until the Contractor has submitted satisfactory evidence that the proposed subcontractor is qualified
to execute the work and has an Affirmative Action Plan acceptable to the County, together with a complete copy of the subcontract if
s0, requested by the County. The subcontract shall bind the subcontractor to comply with all requirements of this contract including but
not limited to wage rates, equal employment opportunity regulations, submittal of payrolls, etc. Assignment of the entire contract may
be made only upon written consent of the County.

No assigning, transferring, or subletting, even though consented to, shall relieve the Contractor of his liabilities under this contract.

The Contractor shall give his personal attention to any portion of this contract which has been sublet and he shall be responsible for its
proper completion.

The Contractor, as a condition of this contract, is responsible for assuring submission of proof or documentation regarding Affirmative
Action Compliance by his subcontractors and for the subsequent Affirmative Action performance by such subcontractors.

Jackson County reserves the right to approve or reject the Bidder's proposed subcontractors in accordance with these and any other
requirements of this Invitation to Bid.

29. As a condition for the award of any contract or grant in excess of five thousand dollars by the County to a business entity, the
business entity shall, by sworn affidavit and provision of documentation, affirm its enrollment and participation in a federal work
authorization program with respect to the employees working in connection with the contracted services. Every such business entity
shall also sign an affidavit affirming that it does not knowingly employ any person who is an unauthorized alien in connection with the
contracted services. Any entity contracting with the state, or any political subdivision of the state shall only be required to provide the
affidavits required in this subsection to the state and any political subdivision of the state with which it contracts, on an annual basis.

30. This contract shall be construed according to the laws of the State of Missouri, including Missouri Revised Statute Chapter 610.111.1,
which requires that all records of Jackson County, Missouri will be open to the public, unless subject to statutory exception, as Jackson
County, Missouri is a public governmental body. Pursuant to Missouri Revised Statute Chapter 610.021(12), sealed bids, and related
documents, once the bid documents have been opened, along with any related documents, are considered public records subject to
disclosure upon request. Missouri Revised Statute Chapter 610.021(12) also requires, upon request, disclosure of any negotiated contract
and documents related to such contract once the contract has been executed or until all bids have been rejected.

31. If awarded a Contract as a result of this bid; you must have a hard copy of a purchase order issued by the Jackson County, Missouri
Finance and Purchasing Department BEFORE providing any goods and/or services. Failure to adhere to this policy will result in the
immediate termination of said contract.

32. All prices are to be FOB Destination to the delivery point; all shipping, packing and drayage charges are the responsibility of the
bidder. COD shipments will not be accepted.
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CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)
03/21/2022

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER CONTACT  Renée Bowman, ARM, CPIW
i PHONE N FAX R
Park & Associates Inc (AIC, No. Ext): (561) 994-0880 (AIC, No): (561) 994-1740
5255 North Federal Highway AL 5. rbowman@parkassociates.com
Suite 200 INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
Boca Raton FL 33487-4907 INSURER A : Pacific Indemnity Company 20346
INSURED INSURERB: Progressive Express Insurance Company 10193
Image Access Inc INSURER ¢ : Technology Insurance Company 42376
543 NW 77th Street INSURER D :
Suite 200 INSURERE :
Boca Raton FL 33487 INSURER F :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER:  21-22 Liab w 22-23 Auto REVISION NUMBER:
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.
INSR ADDL[SUBR POLICY EFF | POLICY EXP
LTR TYPE OF INSURANCE INSD | wvD POLICY NUMBER (MM/DD/YYYY) | (MM/DD/YYYY) LIMITS
><| COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE s 1,000,000
DAMAGE TO RENTED
| CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR PREMISES (Ea occurrence) $ 1,000,000
MED EXP (Any one person) $ 10,000
A Y 35855690ECE 08/31/2021 | 08/31/2022 | pERrsONAL & ADV INJURY s 1,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE s 2,000,000
X poLicy I:I S)ECOT' Loc PRODUCTS - COMP/OPAGG | § 2,000,000
OTHER: $
COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY £ acoident) $ 1,000,000
ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY (Per person) | $
OWNED SCHEDULED R .
B e ALY SCHED 03479950-7 01/27/2022 | 01/27/2023 | BODILY INJURY (Per accident) | $
>¢| HIRED ><| NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE 5
| ZN| AUTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY | (Per accident)
$
X| UMBRELLA LIAB X occur EACH OCCURRENCE s 4,000,000
A EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE 35855690ECE 08/31/2021 | 08/31/2022 | AcGREGATE § 4,000,000
DED | | RETENTION § $
WORKERS COMPENSATION ><| PER OTH-
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY YIN STATUTE ER 500000
C | OFMCERMEMBER EXOLUDEDA e N/A TWC3998449 08/21/2021 | 08/21/2022 | -E:L- EACHACCIDENT $ e sons
(Mandatory in NH) E.L. DISEASE - EAEMPLOYEE | § "+ VY
If yes, describe under 1.000.000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE - POLICYLIMIT | § P VY

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

As indicated by "Y" in the "ADD'L INSRD" column, certificate holder is added as additional insured by written contract or written agreement, subject to

terms, conditions and exclusions of the policy.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

Jackson County Courthouse
412 E 12 Street

Kansas City MO 64106

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

7L —
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Jackson County Missouri

Certificate of Compliance

In accordance with Jackson County Code Chapter(s) 6 and 10,
this Certificate of Compliance is hereby issued to:
Image Access, Inc
543 NW 77TH STREET
BOCA RATON, FL 33487
2022 Certificate: 20220303VC898

Issued: 2022-03-03
Expires: 2022-12-31

The above named firm/agency has met the following requirements:

Is duly listed and assessed on the tax rolls of Jackson County, Missouri and is not delinquent in the
payment of any taxes due to the County, or did not have on December 31st of the previous year
any property subject to taxation by the County

Attests and agrees to Chapter 6 of the Jackson County Code which prohibits discriminatory
employment practices and promotes equal employment opportunity by contractors doing business
with Jackson County.

Chief Compliance Review Officer
Jackson County Missouri
816-881-3302
compliance @jackonsongov.org
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